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SHRI H. N. BAHUGUNA: That
question does not arise but there is a 
lot of public debate and fear in the 
minds of the people about this parti-
cular question. Therefore may I 
inform the hon. Member that the re-
port o f the Expert Committee on En-
vironmental Impact of Mathura Re-
finery was received a few days also 
and it is being examined. As soon as 
we come to a conclusion on that we 
will come to the House and inform the 
House and w e may assure the House 
that we will see that nothing ham-
pers or mars of jeopardises Taj in any 
manner.

PROF. P. G. MAVALANKAR: I
entirely agree with the hon. Minister 
that this question .has to be looked 
at the national interest; the location 
may be Gujarat, Assam or anywhere. 
In view of the fact that around Gu-
jarat, Cambay, etc., and also in Bom-
bay High the latest findings are that 
oil is coming in abundance and will 
be so available for many years to 
come, there will be need for a refi-
nery in Gujarat or near about Gujarat. 
In view of this may I ask him whe-
ther proposals for an additional refi-
nery as well as petro-chemical comp-
lex are being discussed here by the 
officials of the Gujarat Government? 
They came to Delhi on the same air-
craft with me yesterday for a discus-
sion with the Planning Commission of 
the Gujarat plan. Are these propo-
sals being actively considered by this 
Ministry in consultation with the 
Planning Commission and the Guja-
rat Administration?

SHRI* H. N. BAHUGUNA: The
hon. Members has raised a question 
which is in two parts: one is whether 
the state government of Gujarat has

taken up any proposals regarding 
various types of industries connected 
with the Bombay High gas or petro-
leum. The second part is whether we 
are in touch with them or doing 
something about the whole thing. I 
may assure the hon. Member that we 
have constituted a working group for 
utilisation of the gas and oil from 
Bombay High and other regions. It 
is a bilateral group, that is, ministry 
of petroleum and chemicals, Govern-
ment of India, Planning Commission 
and the Government of Gujarat, their 
representatives. The details about 
feasibility, possibility for future set 
up, etc., are being worked. The 
whole matter is under discussion and 
the working group is yet to come out 
with its final views about the whole 
matter.
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SHRI H. N. BAHUGUNA: I am
not willing to disclose the contents of 
the report except to say, as 1 have 
said earlier that this government will 
not let the interest of Taj suffer in 
any manner.
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SHRI R. V. SWAMINATHAN: Be-
fore opening more branch lines, will 
the minister tell us how many acci-
dents are taking place per day on the 
railways and whether he will to try 
to minimise the accidents?

MR. SPEAKER How does it arise 
out of this?

PROF. MADHU DANDAVATE: I
would reply to it on an appropriate 
occasion when there is a question on 
railways.

MR. SPEAKER: The Question Hour 
is over.

SOME HON. MEMBERS: Still there 
are two minutes.

SHRI D. B. CHANDRE GOWDA: 
The next question can be taken up.

MR. SPEAKER: No, there is no
time for answering it.

WRITTEN ANSWERS TO QUES-
TIONS

Production of Industrial Alcohol
*496. SHRI D. B. CHANDRE GOW-

DA: Will the Minister of PETRO-
LEUM AND CHEMICALS AND FER-
TILIZERS be pleased to state:

(a) what is the annual production of 
industrial alcohol in the country and 
what are the names of the companies/ 
States who are its major producers;

(b) what are the names of the indus-
tries which are its main consumers;
and

(c) what steps are bing taken to in-
crease production of industrial alcohol 
in the country?




