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MOEARJI DESAI). (a) and (b). Yes 
Sir. The external beam is expected to 
be made available for experiments by 
the middle of this year

(c) An internal circulating beam 
wes first obtained in June, 1977 But 
further trials are necessary and will 
be undertaken m order to maximise 
the energy of the parties

(d) No, Sir

SHRI RAJ KRISHNA DAWN With-
out external been no research can be 
done and m this sense the machine is 
not yet operational It is also not-
able that though the cyclotron cons-
truction began in 1967, twelve years 
ago, there are still a lot of problems 
I would like to know from the hon 
Prime Minister (a) what is the ges-
tation period of this machine for full 
operation and (b) when the machine 
will be commissioned and made opera- 
tional’

SHRI MORARJI DESAI It is 
generally agreed that there is a period 
of about 18 months between the two 
and the time can be lessened if things 
are favourable But there are diffi-
culties in the availability of electricity 
Its supply fluctuates off and on and 
theiefore, there is delay

SHRI RAJ KRISHNA DAWN I 
would like to know from the hon 
Pnpae Minister how the Variable 
Energy Cyclotron at Salt Lake is up- 
todate in this particular field of Nu-
clear science and how Meghnad Saha 
Institute of Nuclear Physics 
at Calcutta is associated with 
this Project and 1* it a fact that the 
project was to be implemented b\ 
that Institute first >

SHRI MORARJI DESAI I do not 
know

MR SPEAKER He wants noticc foi 
that

SHRI SAUGATA ROY The main 
purpose of this Cyclotron was to 
manufacture radio-active isotopes foi 
medicinal and othei purposes I would

like to know from the hon Prime 
Minister as to how much money has 
been spent on this Variable Energy 
Cyclotron Project till date and what 
is the value of the radio-active iso-
topes produced through this cyclotron 
till date’

SHRI MORARJI DESAI I do not 
have the figures now and therefoer, I 
cannot give them now

SHRI HARI VISHNU KAMATH Mr 
Speaker, this question of mine t n z , Q  
No 309 has been transferred to a dibr 
tant date 1 e. 31st of this month I 
want to raise a point of order

MR SPEAKER This is question 
time Aftei the question hour is over, 
\ou can raise that

SHRI HARI VISHNU KAMATH 
Will you let me raise it after the 
question is over’

MR SPEAKER Yes let us utilise 
the full auestion hour for questions
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SHRI BEDABRATA BARUA Sir, 
for the last one year the Minister has 
made a lot of statements not only 
the Minister, but think the Home 
Minister as well, that a lot of pro-
ducts will be reserved foi the -mall- 
scale sector I know very well th»t 
nothing has been done m this legard 
except making the statement? The 
test of sincerity is whether the Gov-
ernment is prepaicd to start the 
production of these items produced 
by multi-nationals and big industries 
in the small-scale sector Where the 
small-scale mdustnes have been given 
the right to produce the items alone, 
I want to know whether the Govern-
ment would really start the pioduc- 
tion of those items now produced by 
large industries and multi-nationals

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: It is 
not correct to say that nothing has 
been done apart from expanding the 
list of reservations Very serious 
efforts are now on to see that items 
reserved for the small-scale sector 
are produced in the small-scale sector 
alone. Through the district industries 
centres that are now going up all over

the country efforts will be made to 
see that smallscale sector realy deve- 
lopes and grows in the rural areas. 
So far as multinationals or any large 
organised houses producing items that 
can be produced in the small-scale 
sector or that are reserved Tor the 
small-scale sector is concerned, phas- 
ing them out is going to take some 
tune These are not matters where 
one can, by the push of the button, 
say that whatever is produced today 
in a large house or m a big factory nr 
in a multinational concern shall be 
produced m the small-scale sector, 
and one cannot, by a fireman or 
dictat, get everything straightaway 
from the smalscale sector. It i$ not 
possible There are a large number o£ 
workers employed in these units It 
will take time, but we are discussing 
with the larger houses (Interruptions) 
to find out ways and means, and the 
modalities of phasing out their pro-
duction And I hope that the hoci 
Member of the Opposition who ovf- 
the years built the multinational'? into 
producing these items will give tis j 
little time to dismantle wTiatevei the, 
have built.
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SHRI VASANT SATHE: In keeping 
with his declared policy, the Minister 
knows that the main hurdle in the 
entire problem is the competition bet-
ween the consumer goods produced 
net only by the multinationals but 
also by the monopoly houses,, small 
scale sector and the cottage mdustiy 
set tor which he wants to encourage. 
This is the peimanent problem What 
i* the mechanism by which he will 
ei.sure supply of raw material to the 
small scale producer—as also techno-
logical know-how. finance and ale of 
the end-product? Unless these things 
are done, do what you may, you will 
7) ot be able to complete with even 
the tooth-paste or soap or oil produc-
ed by the monopoly houfe*. IIow 
does the Minister propose to do that’ 
What is the mechanism? Even m the 
industrial policy, that mechanism has 
not been spelt out. Will he tell us 
what mechanism of marketing and 
supply he has in mind?

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: I 
mentioned earlier that the district 
industry centres that are now coming 
up, are going to be the instruments 
through which the problems which 
the small-scale sector faces, are going

to be tackled—right down at the dis~ 
trict level. These district industry 
centres will be equipped to deal with 
problems of raw materials and of 
marketing; and we will, if necessary, 
set up raw material banks. Insofar 
as marketing is concerned, the exist-
ing marketing organizations, both the 
Central as well as State Governments, 
are being strengthened. And the 
district industry centres have been 
asked to set up whatever apparatus 
that may be necessary, to market the 
products of these small-scale units.

SHRI VASANT SATHE: I asked 
about technological assistance. Will 
that be given to the district industry 
centre?

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: It 
will also have a division which will 
look after research and develop-
ment, and will provide the necessary 
inputs in the technological areas also.
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Export of Indian Filnfe to Pakistan

*311. SHRI MUKHTIAR SINGH 
MALIK:

SHRI G. M. BANATWALLA:

Will the Minister of INFORMA-
TION AND BROADCASTING be 
pleased to state:

(a) whether Government have 
any proposal under consideration to 
export Indian Films to Pakistan 
through regular channels;

(b) if so, where the matter stands;




