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Cancellation of Permission Letters 
and No Objection Letters

*295. SHRI MOTIBHAI R. CHAU- 
DHARY: Will the Minister of
PETROLEUM AND CHEMICALS 
AND FERTILIZERS be pleased to 
state:

(a) whether Hathi Committee has 
stated that Permission Letters and 
No Objection letters do not have anv 
legal backing in terms of the provi-
sion of I (D&R'i Act:

(b) if so, why no action has so far 
been taken to cancel these letters* 
and

(c) whether foreign companies havf 
resorted to production of items cover 
ed under these letters, violating thr 
conditions subject to which these 
letters were granted and if so, what 
action Government have taken/pro-
pose to take to prevent such viola-
tions?
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THE MINISTER OF PETROLEUM 
AND CHEMICALS AND FERTILI-
ZERS (SHRI H. N. BAHUGUNA):
(a) to (c). A Statement is laid on 
the Table of the House.

Statement

(a) and (b). The majority view of 
the Hathi Committee was that Per-
mission Letters/No Objection Letters 
do not have any legal backing in 
terms of the provisions of the Indus-
tries (Development and Regulation) 
Act. Four members of the Commit-
tee, however, expressed their reser-
vations on the above interpretation 
and, conclusion.

The legal opinion however Is.that 
Permission Letters were issued subject 
to certain conditions. Most of these 
letters carried a condition that the 
manufacture of the drugs would be 
within the overall licensed capacity. 
The Permission Letters issued for the 
manufacture of drug formulations 
were more in the nature of clarifica-
tion that the applicant would require 
a licence if certain conditions were 
not satisfied.

(c) It is more than two years since 
the Hathi Committee recommenda-
tions were available to Government 
but no action was taken to find out 
what was being done by concerned 
foreign companies to function with-
in the conditions of the Permission 
Letter extended to them.

While keeping in mind the recom-
mendations No. 13 and 14 of Chap-
ter V of Hathi Committee Report in 
this regard, Government propose to 
make a full enquiry and prepare a 
consolidated account of the position 
as obtaining, so as to decide on the 
next course of action with regard to 
wilful violations if any of the para-
meters laid down in the said Letters 
of Permission.
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Issue of Wax in Delhi

* 296. SHRI KANWAR LAL 
GUPTA: Will the Minister of PET-
ROLEUM AND CHEMICALS AND 
FERTILIZERS be pleased to lay a 
statement showing:

(a) the names and addresses of the 
persons, firms and companies who* 
have been issued quota of wax it> 
Delhi during Emergency;

(b) what are the findings of the 
inquiry conducted by Delhi Adminis-
tration over this matter and wBat 
action has been taken by Government
thereon;




