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SHitI ANANT DAVE! In answer to 
part (D) the hon. Minister stated that 
a quantity of 7.28 lakh tonnes of ce· 
ment had been imported into the 
country during the perlM January to 
June, 19'71r,- import of One million 
tonnes had been permitted. 

~ lj~r -q-~)~ ~ lf~ ~rii ... r ~~r ~ 
fit; ~) ~ ~m:rl ;r W i;fii~rs ~T 

~~') ~ ~"t1: ~T mite q-q-o;: it tflfi iT i;fr"f ~ 
~n: (:fli" "~I~ctr iT tJt;;r g~ ~, ~mf 

f~~i iCfif1,'ii g'i;1'; ~ I 

~T 1 firf~.:r;; C'1 ~fn: tfr'i"e i;f:i=r 
~((:fr ~, <f~ m rtCfi it iiir Q(itl'ri. '1;ffc: 

~{ q.ii iT '1;filflfr. Cflir ~o:ii 'ffr{ ~~~I;r 
.- -a.- . = .::... "... 7':zr ~ ? 
~1',., ',',,<.., "I: 'ca ~ . 

SHRI G~RGE FERNANDES: I 
have absolutely no information about 
a single tonne of cement having gone 
waste because of any damage. 

~ ~ ri: ;r ~;pfr ~~ ~7 

~m ~, ~ttfir ~ I 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: Since 
the hon. Member has made a state-
ment I shall have it investigated 
immediately. So far I nave nO~ re-
ceived any such complaint. In regard 
to paper bags, they are sturdy and 
they come from across high seas and 
they are unloaded here. I have not 
heard any complaint thus far; this is 
the first time it is mentioned and I 
shall investigate it immediately. 

MR. SP'EAKER: Next question .... 
(Interr1tPtions) 

(I nterruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: Don't record. 
(Interruptions) • * 

M1DOrities COlDIDbaioa 

t 
·43. DR. VASANT KUMAR PAN-

DIT: 

SHRI F. H. MOHSIN: 

Will the Minister of HOME AFJr-
AIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) whether it is a fact that Shri 
M. R. Masani, the Chairman of 
Minorities commission has resigned 
his post, if so, the reasons therefor; 

(b) whether it is a fact that ano-
ther Member Shri V. V. John had also 
written to the Government about the 
treatment meted out t 0 the Commis-
sion; and 

(c) the reaction of Government to 
the above and the charges made in 
the letter of reSignation by Shri 
Masani and letters written to Gov· 
ernment by Shri V. V. John? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN 
THE MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS 
(SHRI DHANIK LAL MANDAL) : 
(a) to (c). In a le:1er of 9th May 
jointly signed by Shri M. R. Masani 
and Shri V. V. John, they referred to 
the announcement made On 4th May 
in Parliament by the Education Min-
ister about the introduction of a Bill 
to amend the Aligarh Muslim Univer-
sity Act before the end of session then 
in progress and their surprise of being 
ignored and bypassed on the suhject 
even after the Commission had made 
a request that they should be given 
an opportunity to make their recom-
mendations to Government before 
legislation was introauced in Parlia-
ment. They had also referred to the 
Chairman of the Commission's earlier 
letter of 27th April regarding the 
Commission not having office premi· 
ses, essential staff and its functioning 
as an attached office 01 the Ministry 
of Home Aftairs. On the same aay, 
however, Members of the Commission 

---' - -----------------_._--- ------
·~Not recorded. 
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had lonll discussion with the Educa-
tion Mmlstet in reprd to Al1garh 
Muslim University Bill. Copies of 
the Aligarh Muslim University (Am-
endment) Bill v,>ht~ had meanwhile 
been introduced in Parliament were 
IIlso furnished to the Commission. It 
was the considered view of the Gov-
ernment that their legislative propo-
sals in this regard could no longer be 
withheld from Parliament in the light 
of all other developments which had 
preceded the formulation Of Govern-
ment's views on the matter. The 
suggestions of the Commission on the 
Bill were however, welcome. In re-
gard to the other matters. such as 
accommodation, stall etc eiforts were 
being made to meet the requirements 
of the Commission. Considering Ell 
these aspects, Shri V. V. John decidea 
not to resign. Shri M. R. Masan i. 
however, did not withdraw his l"CR;g· 
nation. The Government regret thiS 
development. The Government behe\:£l' 
that the Minorities Commission have 
an important role to play and the 
misunderstanding with Shri Masani 
would not affect their attitude to the 
Commission. 

DR VASA:-lT KUMAR PANDa 
Will the hon. Minister state whether 
in the correspondence that ensued 
between Mr. Masani and the Govern-
ment-it is an unfortunate episode-
apart from what has been given in thE" 
statement, charges of repeated breacb 
Of faith on the part of the Government. 
charge about the high-handed attitude 
of the bureaucrats, that they were not 
very cooperative with the Commis:;ion 
and that the Commission was ~ett:!";g 

step~motherly treatment. The non-;m-
plementation of the assurance s:i\'en 
by the Government that an amendm:?nt 
to the Constitution would be introduc-
ed to make the Commission indepen-
dent, non-cooperation by the Fin'3nce-
Minister and the Home Minister who 
wanted to have this as an attachmer>t 
to their own department and lastly 
the selection which the Commission 
had made of one Central Pool OffiCI a! 
belonging to the Scheduled Caste was 

not ai ven to them and Mr. ShankllI an 
Nalr was foisted on them, are all tIleR 
things metltloned~ 

SHRI DHANIK LAL MAl'f"....... In 
regard to all these tbiRgS mentionej 
by the hon. member which had been 
the subject-matter of Mr. Massni'. 
statement, letter and discussion wlaich 
ultimately prompted him to reliin trQID 
the Minorities Commission, 1 want to 
urge that firstly the Government·s 
attitude has always been favourable 
and sympathetic to the Commission. 
Regarding the sanction of staff, tbe 
Commission requested for 93 persons 
including the Chairman. In the flrlt 
instance, they wanted a staff of 3P 
persons. That was sanctioned. Mo:t' 
over, the Commission was inform€'J 
that the Linguistic Minorities Com· 
missioner's office had a staff of 63 per-
sons and they can be availed of. The 
Commission certainly availed of 1be 
services of that office, which is ilppa-
rent from the TA and DA of the offi-
cers of that office, which is Rs. 10,000 
As regards the budget provision, ade 4 

quate budget provision was made. Rs. 
4 lakhs were made available to the 
Commission. In addition, Rs. 7 hkhs. 
which is for the Linguistic Minorities 
Commissioner's office was also !ni::de 
available. It was also agreed tlMt 
v..:henever funds are exhausted. more 
funds will be made available. (InteT-
TtLptions) . 

MR, SPEAKER: He is answerir,g 
point by point 

SHRI C. K. JAFFER SHARIEF: The 
question relates to the Minorities Co-
mission and he is answering about the 
Linguistic Minori ties Commission, 

MR. SPEAKER: You are not fo!low-
ing him. He said, the Minorities Co-
mission could use the'staff of the Lm-
guistic Minorities Commission also. 

SHRI DHANIK LAL MANDAL: As 
regards offiCe premises, this is the 
work of the ,Housing Ministry to make 
'available a building for that pu!1iO*e 
to the Commission. Of course, tile 
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Home Ministry always helps the Com-
uUssion to flnd out a suitable accom-
modation. In the begiDnina, the 
Director of EstateS indicated that there 
Was no building availble to them. So, 
a search was made for private ac-
commodation aDd a building was 
found out on FeJ1)zesbah Road. But 
subsequently the Housing Ministry 
made accommodation available ••.. 
(InteTfUption) . 

SHRI C. K. JAFFER SHARIEF: Sir, 
my submission is that the timing of 
the appointment of the MinoritLes 
Commission and the way it has been 
treated really shows that the Govern-
ment is not sincere in its intentions. 

(InterTll.ptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: Do not record. 
(Interruptions)" • 

MR. SPEAKER: He has to come to 
the supplementary. He has not ans-
wered the main question. How can 
a supplementary come in now? 

(Inter71lptions) 

SHRI C. K. JAFFER SHARIEF: 
How can you go on saying something 
to go on record and something not to 
go on record? We cannot understand 
this. I have been repeatedly saying 
this that we have come here to re-
present the people and express the 
opinion on thir behalf, not to keep 
quiet. But if you go on saying not tID 
record do you want to keep in yo ... 
period saying that nothing should go 
on record? 

MR. SPEAKER: Mr. Jaffer Sharief, 
all that I said is, supplementary .... 

(Interruptions ) 
SHRI C. K. JAFFER SHARIEF: 

Sir, yOU are here to prote~t our rights. 
(lnte1TUptions) 

THE PRIME MINISTER (SHRI 
MORARJ1 DESAI): I do not know 
why the hon. Members are excited 

"'Not recorded. .. -.. 

when reply is liven in detail on the 
points raised. 

AN HON. MEMBER: It is confus-
ing. 

SHRI MORARJI DESAI: How it 
is confusini? There are only facts 
given. There are no comments given. 
If you have no patience for them it, 
what can be done? They will not be 
given if you don't W'lnt them. 

(Interruptions ) 

MR. SPEAKER: WhethEr you like 
the reply or not, the Member has 
asked certain questi.Jns. He has a duty 
to answer those questions. SO!ne peo-
ple may answer briefly and some ceo-
pIe may answer elaburately. TnU is 
a different matter. Nl:!ither yOU nor 
I can decide that question. (Inter-
ruptions) Noone can dictate saying: 
"You must answer in a particular 
manner." It is not up to you to have 
the answer in a particular manner. 

<Interruptions) 

SHRI DHANIK LAL 1\IANDAL: As 
regards office premises, liS I told you, 
Sir, a hutment was offered to the 
Commission in 'H' Block. But the 
Commission did not like it and so the 
Commission searched for private ac-
commodation and found out a build-
in!!! in the Ferozeshah Road which 
was not sanctioned by the Housing 
Ministry. But now, that problem has 
been solved and two bungalows in 
Willingdon crescent have been offered 
to the Commission. 

As regards delay in bringing fot'-
w~rd the Constitution Amendment 
BIll to give the Commission an in-
dependent and autonomous status 
there .ha~ been Stlme delay, but w~ 
~re brIngIng forward this Amendment 
In this Session itself. 

As regards the Commission being 
bypa~sed in the matter ot the Aligarh 
~usbm University Amendment Bill 
Introduced in Parliament by the Bdu-
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cation Minister, Sir, as 1 have men-
tioned, the Education Minister and the 
Commislion had a d1acussion, the 
Education Ministry has made avail-
able to them the draft of the Bill, but 
then the Commission wanted that 
w hen the Commission is seized of the 
matter, Government should not come 
forward with the introduction of the 
Bill in Parliament. That was not ac-
cepted by the Government. 

MR. SPEAKER: Second supple-
mentarb'. 

DR. VASANT KUMAR PANDlT; 
I am .til! on my first supplementary. 
I want to know whether the Commis-
siun had chosen a particular officer 
belonging to the Scheduled Castes 
from the Central Secretariat Pool who 
was not given by the Government. 
They fOisted Mr. Sankaran Nair on 
the Commission. It is very surprising 

SHRI MORARJI DESAI: There is 
no question of foisting any Secretary 
on that, and it is not tOr the Com-
mission to say what Secretary should 
be given to them from the very begin-
ning. Afterwards, if there is any diffi-
culty, We would certainly change. 
But if the Commission wants m be 
completely independent of govern-
ment. that is not possible; but they 
have an independent status. I myself 
assured him, when he met me, that 
he will be treated as completely in-
dependent, and not as at.ched to the 
Home Ministry. That is what the 
Home Minister also told him. But 
Mr. Masani wanted-I don't know 
what he wanted. Therefore, it is 
difficult to S9tisfy him. (Interrup-
tions) It was difficult to satisfy him, 
and he ,esigned. 

SHRI VASANT SATHE: Did he 
want a ... ~abinet rank? 

SHRI \10RARJI DESAI: Well, I 
don't know if he wanted it. If he 
wanted it, he cannot lIet it. It is not 
possible to giVe Cabinet rank to ewry-
body, 11 boever asks for It. That Is 

not possible. That is not th'e ques-
tion. He has not mentioned that. He 
said it afterwards, not here. I assured 
him that he will be completely. in-
dependent, and there was no question 
of the Home Ministry I!l<ercising any 
supervision over them. But they have. 
to function through the Home Minla-
try. Whenever any question 'is to be 
replied in Parliament, it is the Home 
Ministry which has to reply, and, 
therefore, it is not that it is subordi-
nate to any Ministry. That Is what 
I made clear to him. 

MR. SPEAKER; Mr. Prime Minis-
ter, kindly don't answer other ques-
tions. It will create difficulties. 

(Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: The Member bill> 
not asked the second supplementary. 
I haVe gut to go by rules. He is en-
titled to ask it. 

DR. V ASANT KUMAR P ANDIT; 
Has the Commission submitted to the 
Government an interim report and 
also a report on the same Aligarh 
Muslim University Bill? And if so, 
will Government be prepared to place 
it on the Table of the HOUse? 

SHRI MORARJI DESAI: I~ will tNt 
laid 00 the Table of the HOUse. 

'11 '!~ m Frit : ~H ~ ... rn:tr 
~Ifhf'f "') f"ffi ~ ~. ~H '" iI'i,ltT 
~ft,f;;f~nn:~~~ 'li'r ~11l1<T, ~ 
~. 'l',"; 011,%, ~ f~ """I'<: '1ft 'I'm 
'l'1'fi ~i .ft I ~If<:t'r;;,' "'I ~T it 
<J:ii Hl~ ~ fiiQ; '5:'; ~Il['f~) ~I«T 
'1m lifT I 'H!T;f\' ~ '" ;;r) ~ 
'5:~A;r fun ~, ~~ it ",,.; f""-r~­
~ ~. ~f Of ff) 'n~Tf\'tt ~w; "') 
.o-;l "'"[ "'Tf ""'T~ ~f ~, 'I' f'i f.:f~ f, ...... 
~~" fun 'l1fr, 'I' ~~r ~imr ~ 
'1«1, 'I' ~'" t fiiQ; m<: ~<n: ~ it 
f~ "'Tf "",. fun '1m I ~" ~ ~ 
~ i,' ~ ..-'hi ~ ~ f~ ~~ ~ 
! f'qf<:1 fo;<;, ;;r) '5:" ~~ it ~ 'I'm 
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t, 'f~ 'Iff ~A"d',-{i!1 ~j ~;.,: ~I\i'~, lif{';i-
f"(~Ji' ;ij W~f i{ 'i~ .m;;if iri f~~ ~~ 
~T .q'~t q\ ~1·1iI" ~I \~ ~ I'l':r 
.~:;f f1ti '1':t.Jq~ JITOf ,,~1 ~ flfi ~~ ~r 
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~...,.' ~ ~i;;t1" ~r~ffT ~ fer. ~T ;;~i 
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.{6' cr;1r~., "ffi f!'f~i Y',":r-t ~1 ~i.~'H 
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SHRI BEOABRA'PA BARUA: The 
question i$ not only one of furniture 
Of accommodation. The allegation that 
has beert 111114e regMdilll the Maaani 
affair, is that t1Ie"Mino)lties CemmiJ-
sion was not given the respect that 
was due to it It is not just a qua-
tion of the Minonties Commission 
being independent<>f the Government; 
but it is also • queatiaD at the Gov-
ernmellt beinl independ"'at of the 
Minorities Commi&sion. Matters aftect-
ing the minorities have to be done 
after conB1.l!tlng the Minorities' Com-
mIssion. What is the reason then for 
the Government not consulting the 
Minorities' O>mmission on important 
matters? Would the Government res-
pect and consult the Commission? I 
8IlD referring to all other commissions 
and committees where the Govern-
ment have entrusted certain work to 
them. Would the Government treat 
them with respect, or leave it to tbe 
bureaucrats to treat the Commission 
in the way they like? 

SHRI MORARJI DESAI: It is not 
a question of bureaucrats dealing with 
the Commission. Of course, the cor-
respondence goe. on through the 
bureaucrats; that is the position under 
the Constitution. But the decisions 
are made by Ministers, and not by 
bureaucrats. Unnecessarily. why 
bring in bureaucrats for nothins? In 
this matter, it i. not a question of not 
respecting the Commission at all. T~ 
whole question of the Aligarh Unift.<-
sity Was under the consideration of 
the Government even before the Com-
miSSion was appointed. So, it was not 
referred to the O>mmi.sion. It was 
not nee4!S&al')7 to do .0 and. therefore, 
it was not ret.ned to it. We did Dot 
say anything about it They have 
sent their reports. Tbll,Y will be laid 
On the Table of the House. ETel'7-
thing can be considered. 

M R. sPEAJaR: Shr! Suant S!nih 
Khalsa. 

SHRI RAGAVALU MOHANARAN-
GAM: Question No. 46. 

MR. SPBAXB&: 1 CIUIllot. come to 
Quenion No. 46 betore the earJjer 
qufttions' are over. You see the mood 
of the Houae. There should be some 
responlibillty in this matter. 

SlUtI BALWANT ~GH R.Al4OQ... 
WAJ.IA: Mo.t at the minorities, in-
elvGln, Parsis, Cbristians Slld Mus-
lHnowere incJ.uded in the ColDlllissi9n. 
w~ Chairman has resigned. EveJ')'-
loGdy knows that an important C~ 
munity, like the Sikh community,was 
not included. Then the Punjab Chi.f 
Minister and the President of the 
Shiromani Gurudwara Prabandhak 
Committee wrote a letter to the Prime 
Minister, protesting against it. The 
Prime Minister in his reply stated that 
this time What has happened has hap-
pened but, in the future, if it is re-
constituted, the interests of the SikIr 
community would be taken into consi-
deration. 

14R. SPEAKER: It is not a ques-
tion. Please come to the question. 

SHRI BALWANT SINGH RAMOO-
WALIA: Would the Prime Minister 
assure the House that he will keep tbe 
word that he has given to the Sikh 
community? 

SHRI MORARJI DESAI: It is 
under consideration. 

Review of Indi.a.D Economy 

+ 
*44. SHRI D. AMAT: 

SHRI NIHAR LASKAR: 

Will the Minister of PLANNING be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether Planning Commiasion 
has decided to review Indian economy 
on its macro setting; 

(b) if so, tQe details thereof; and 

(el to _hat e,ctent th.!s will help 
the l'lanning in the country? 

;'1'Hl!: PRUtlE MINISTEl\ (S~ 
MOltA!tJI Dl!:SAJ): (a) Yea, Sir. 




