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Plan to set up a Petro-Chemical 
Complex on the basis of Mathura 

Refinery

*436. SHRI SATISH AG ARV/AL: 
Will the Minisier of PETROLEUM 
AND CHEMICALS AND FERTI­
LIZERS be pleased to state:

(a) whether there is a plan lo
up a fetro-chem ical complex on the 
basis oi the Mathura Oil Refinery; jf 
so, when will it be finalised;

(b ) how many such com plexes are 
running in the country at present, 
what is the extent of shortage of 
products being produced by them and 
how are they being met; and

(c) whether Government propose 
to locate the new com plex in the 
nearby areas o f Rajasthan?

THE MINISTER OF PETROLEUM, 
CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS 
(SHRI H. N. BAH U G U N A): (a)
There is no plan for the present to 
set up a Petrochemical Complex on 
the basis of Naphtha to be available 
from  Mathura Refinery.

(b ) At present the following major 
Petrochemical projects are in opera­
tion in the country:—

(i) Aromatics Project of IPCL at 
Baroda.

(ii) NOCIL's Naphtha Cracker at 
Bombay.

(iii) Union Carbide’s Napluha 
Cracker at Bombay.

(iv) PRC’s Kureha Cracker at 
Tirunelveli.

In addition, two m ajor petrochem i­
cal projects— IPCL’s Naphtha Cracker 
and its downstream units at Baroda 
and BRPL’s Petrochemical Complex 
at Bongaigaon, both in Public Sec- 
tf;r— are under implementation.

The demand for various petrochemi­
cal items suffered a set back due to 
price hike o f these products fo llow ­
ing the oil crises. Demand for tnese 
items is however, now gradully p ick- 
ng up. Pending the commissioning 

nf the Petrochemical units under cons­
truction particularly IPCL’s Naphtha 
Cracker and its downstream un;t‘ , 
the temporary shortages which are 
ir.arginal and vary from  time to time 
aro being met through imports.

(c) No, Sir.

Introduction of Rayalaseema Express 
from  Tirupathi to Hyderabad

*4;j7. SHRI P. RAJAGOPAL 
NAIDU: Will the Minister of R A IL­
W AYS be pleased to state;

(a) whether there is any proposal 
with the Government to introduce 
Rayalaseema Express on the broad 
gauge from Tirupathi to Hyderabad: 
and

fb) if so, when it is likely to be 
implemented?

T^iE MINISTER OF RAILW AYS 
(PROF. MADHU DANDAVATE):
(a) Yes, Sir.

(b ) The proposal is s^Hl under con­
sideration.

Oil exploration o f On-shore areas by 
Foreigm countries

♦438. SHRI G. Y. KRISHNAN: Will 
the Minister of PETROLEUM AND 
CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS be 
pleased to state:

(a) whether Government have allo­
cated certain on-shore areas for oil 
exploration to some foreign countries- 
during last six months; and




