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ly season ticket fares, have been kept 
low for socio-economic reasons. In 
order to make good the loss to some 
extent, the season ticket fares are 
slightly increased from time to time 
consistent with the social benefit as-
pect. 

Water utilization of the Godavari 
Barrage Project 

·478. SHRI ANNASAHEB GO-
THINDE: Will the Minister of IRRI-
GATION AND POWER be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the water utilization 
of the Godavari Barrage Project ac-
cepted in December, 1971, is going to 
affect the status quo, as to the com-
mitments of Krishna and Godavari 
waters, that was being maintained 
after the constitution of the Krishna 
and Godavari Water Disputes Tri-
bunals; and 

(b) if so, to what extent? 

THE MINISTER OF IRRIGATION 
AND POWER (DR. K. L. RAO): The 
Godavari Barrage Project, envisaging 
the construction of a barrage across 
Godavari river to replace the existing 
old anicut at Dow:aishwar3lIl which 
is in a dangerous condition has been 
approved subject to the condition that 
with the construction of the new bar-
rage in place. of tse old one, there 
would not be any increase in the 
water utilisation. 

SHRI ANNASAHEB GOTKIDNDE: 
I want to know from the hon. Minister 
whether the replacement of the exist-
ing old anicut contemplated in the 
Godavari Barrage project was brought 
to the notice of the concerned States, 
namely, Mysore and Maharashtra. 

Secondly, was there any concur-
rence or consensus regarding the im-
plementation of this project between 
the States concerned? 

DR K. L. RAO: I do not remember 
if that was done. But the main con-

sideration was the necessity of the 
replacement works as the old struc-
ture there was in a dangerous condi-
tion and the project was sanctioned. 
We have done the same thing with 
regard to the Bandadra dam in Maha-
rashtra. We allowed the repair work 
to be taken up. But I do not remember 
whether we consulted the other 
States or not. 
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