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l'urebaaeof MacbiJaerybyM/s. Maruti
Ltd.

"'656.SHRI JYOTIRMOY BOSU:
Willthe Minister ofINDUSTRY AND
CIVIL SUPPLIES bepleased torefer
if) thereply given to Unstarred Ques-
tion No. 2980on 12th March, 1975
regarding Machinery in Maruti Car
Factory, Gurgaon and state:

(a) the names, addresses and full
particulars ofthedealersinthecountry
from whom Mys. Maruti Ltd.haspur-
chased machinery etc.;

(b)full details of such purchases
including value ofeach category of
purchase;

.' (c) main line of business ofthe
dealers from whom such purchases
havebeen made;

(d)whether someofthosedealers are
alsoimporters of machinery; and

(e)ifso,the facts thereof?

THE MINISTER OFSTATEINTHE
:vIINISTRY OF INDUSTRY AND
CIVIL SUPPLIES (SHRI A. C.
GEORGE): (a)to(e) Government does
not collect nor isany industrial unit
required tofurnish detailed information
wlth regard to machines purchased
locally. Government has, as such, no
information.

SHRI JYOTIRMOY BOSU: Sir, I
have already given a notice under
Direction 115 alleging that the hon.
Minister, Shri A. C. George had mis-
ledthe Houseinthe matter ofgiving
information on Maruti's importation of
industrial hardware.

Inthat context, may Iaskthe hon.
Minister totelluscorrectly andtruth-
fully whether itisafactthatregarding
alimited company of Ring Road, Laj-
pat Nagar, Delhiandalsoof41-!/2, Vir
Savarkar Road, Prabha Devi, Bombay,
there was an arrangement between
Maruti andthesaidcompany tohand
overthe import documents toanother
company of Home Street, Bombay for
clearing such imported hardware and
whether Government isaware ofthis
fact ornot. Iamnowinpossession of
the full documentary evidence.

THE MINISTER OFINDUSTRY AND
CIVIL SUPPLIES (SHRI T. A.PAl).
Sofar as weknow,thelicence under
which the Maruticame into existence
was on a condition that the design
would beindigenous and no imports
would beallowed. The Ministry has
notbeenaskedforimports; nor have
we permitted any imports. If such
allegations are made, Iamunable to
verifythemandgivetheinformations.

SHRI JYOTIRMOY BOSU: My
question has notbeenanswered.

MR. SPEAKER: How doesit arise
from this? The Minister has replied
tothe question.

SHRI JYOTIRMOY BOSU: There
isinformation that Maruti usedindus-
trial hardware as dummy. I have
giveninformation abouttwofirms-one
having anofficein Delhiandtheother
at Bombay. Iamnotgivingthenames
just.nowbut Ishall givethat indue
course. Iamasking the hon. Minister
whether 'it isafact that the import
documents were handed over tothe
firmat HomeStreet, Bombay whilethe
,DE'lhifirm cleared the consignment
through their dummy office. That is
howtheconsignments to Maruti Limit-
ed at Gurgaon came by Black and
Berg andthecargo arrived in August
H173at Bombay.

Isthat correct or not? Becareful.
Ihave gotallthe documents.

SHRI T. A. PAl: Sofar asI am
concerned, whatever be my relations
with Government and the particular
company, Ican furnish the informa-
tion. What an individual party does
outside. howamIexpected tofurnish
mformation ifthe hon. Member wants
me to furnish the information?

MR.SPEAKER: Please donot make
it:J.debate. Askastraight question. I
think hehas given hisanswer.

SHRIJYOTIRMOY BOSU: There is
noshadow ofdoubt.Iamallegingthat
although the import licences were not
givenandtaken inthenameof Maruti,
the dummy firmsusedthat forimpor-
tation ofindustrial hardware solelyfor
the use of Maruti Ltd. That is how
theyhoodwink. Icangiveevidence on
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MR, SPBAX&Sfoi Ttwsre w no <*uestioh 
ot taking responsibility The Question 
asked i$ replied to by him  If there 
is anything else, that Is a different 
matter.

SHRI JYQTIRMOY BOSU  They 
are fully in the know how to bypass 
the rules and laws  They used the 
industrial hardware as dummy

ME SPEAKER, This cannot arise 
out of this

SHRI JYOTIRMOY BOSU  They 
used this as dummy They cannot tres­
pass the conditions m letter or m 
spirit.

SHRI T A PAI  So far as I am 
concerned, I strongly deny the allega­
tion that we have done anything wrong 
in helping the Maruti to get anything 
imported But, I am unable to answer 
every allegation because 't looks as if 
wo can furnish any information that 
is called for

SHRI JYOTIRMOY BOSU  I am 
sure the Minister is misleading the 
House

SHRI R S PANDEY  M-ay I know 
when is Maruti car coming m the 
mrrket ’ I have read about it m the 
newspapers

MR SPEAKER That docs not arise 
out of this

SHRI R S PANDEY  May I know 
when is it coming ’
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SHRI T*t A. PAI:  An industrial 
licence 1$ tivian to a company  Who 
manages  itftoo *esig«& and who tmm,
# Ss not toy affair. I am unable ‘to 
fitrofeh such information.
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