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[Shri Pataskar] 
money.  I do not know how far this 
will serve the purpose of bringing up 
the children in the proper way.

Situated as we are, we know that 
there are women who are in need of 
protection.  K there is no law of this 
nature the institutions are liable to 
be misused by unscrupulous people. 
The hon.  Members  have  already 
stated that there had been instances 
of that kind.  If it will not solve al­
together the problem of the care of 
destitute women and children, at least 
it will control the extisting institu­
tions which are being run in a bad 
way.  In India charity is very liberal 
and most of thesis institutions have 
been nm with the money collected 
from people who are charitable. This 
measure will regulate the conduct of 
these houses.

/ So far as the financial question is 
concerned, I am sure that the State 
Governments also will give the neces­
sary financial help.  It is not possible 
for us to make a provision here that 
the State Governments shall give so 
much money.  Considering  every­
thing, I think this is a step in  the 
right direction which will ultimately 
lead to the solution of this problem. 
I must join with the other Members 
of the House in complimenting  the 
hon. lady Member who had  moved 
this House, and also the other lady 
Members who had given  notice of 
3imi.\ar motions.  It can be said to the 
tr̂dit of the women Members here 
generally that they have been taking 
v̂ry keen interest in the solution of 
this problem relating to women and 
children.  It is a social problem of 
great importance.  I am glad at any 
rate that this Bill is being passed by 
this House and I am sure that it will 
go a long way in trying to set right 
ttie institutions.  Many things which 
Mre wrong are done in the name of 
charity and that has to be prevent­
ed.  I think such funds will hereafter 
be properly used.

Mr. Chairman: The question is: 

‘That the Bill as amended be 
passed.”

The motion was adopted.

MOTOR TRANSPORT LABOUR 
BILL

Shri A. K. Gopalan (Cannanore): 
Sir, I beg to move:

“That the Bill to regulate the 
conditions  of  motor  transport 
workers, be taken into considera­
tion.”

The  Deputy  Minister  of  Labour 
(Shri Abid Ali): Sir, on a point of 
order, may I submit  that this is a 
Financial Bill?  I understand that the 
hon. Member has not applied or ob­
tained the President’s  recommenda­
tion and so it cannot be  considered 
or passed.  If you so desire, it may 
be considered but why  waste  the 
time of the House.

Shri A. K. Gopalan: Sir, I have to 
say that another Bill, the Motor Vehi­
cles Amendment Bill, 1955 which is 
for the substitution of section 65 of 
Act IV of 1939 was there. Its clauses 
were the same as here.  I do not say 
that because it was not objected to 
then, it should not be  objected  to 
now.

I want to point out that this Motor 
Transport Labour Bill  contains  al­
most all the  clauses in the  Motor 
Vehicles  (Amendment) Bill  which 
sought to amend the section relating 
to labour.  In this Bill there are sec­
tions about weekly holidays,  com­
pensation day for  rest,  over-time, 
spread-over and other things. Even 
the Bill was voted out, I would like 
to point out that when the  Motor 
Vehicles  (Amendment)  Bill  was 
under  discussion  certain  remarks 
were made by the hon. Deputy Minis­
ter.  He said:

“The Bill which we  propose 
to bring forward will contain all 
these subjects mentioned in the 
Bills of these two hon. Members.”

Before that he said:

“I may submit that this matter 
has been under consideration of 
Government for more than  two 
3̂ars.  In 1944 there was a ques­
tion in Rajya  Sabha. also  and 
there I myself promised that we



were ourselves thinking of Bring­
ing forward a BiU which would 
contain  provisions with  regard 
to these  subjects  which  have 
been mentioned in the Bill  just 
under  consideration.  Much has 
been done since then. It is  not 
that the matter has been  taken 
up after the Bill was introduced 
by Shri A. K. Gopalan or after 
the present Bill which has been 
introduced by Shri T. B. Vittal 
Rao.”
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There was no objection then. The 
Minister said that they were bring­
ing out a Bill “not after Shri A. K. 
Gopalan introduced his Bill or  the 
present Bill was introduced by Shri 
T. B. Vittal Rao”.  He went on to 
say:,

“The Bill which we propose to 
bring forward will  contain  all 
these subjects mentioned in the 
Bills of these two hon. Members, 
and they are:  hours of  work,
rest period, spread-over, weekly 
day of rest,  overtime,  medical 
facilities, welfare amenities like 
canteen, rest houses,  recreation 
facilities and provision of  uni­
form, annual leave with pay, sick 
leave, minimum age for employ­
ment, medical  examination  of 
young persons and other provi­
sions for such persons.”

Then he said:

“An appeal has been made that 
workers should be given provi­
dent fund  benefits.  Of  course 
they should get them.  The wor­
kers in this industry should also 
get all the benefits  which  the 
workers in other industries are 
getting.  There is no doubt about 
it. There cannot be any question 
about it.”

Before concluding he *?ain said:

“Certainly the Bill which  we 
are proposing to bring  forward 
will not take care of these things, 
because these are matters of dis­
cipline and are connected  with 
what is mentioned in the main 
Motor Vehicles Act. Certainly, as

far as the discipline iide of the 
drivers and conductors is concern­
ed, we want it to be maintained.
I hope that after the assurance 
I have given, namely, that  we 
ourselves are thinking of bringing 
forward an amending Biil before 
long  containing the  provisions 
which have been mentioned by 
him, the hon. Member will not 
press for the  consideration  of 
this Bill.”

Therefore, as  far as  the  Motor 
Transport Labour Bill goes, my point 
is that it has been introduced, and 
after introduction also the Minister 
has mentioned about it and said that 
the Government is going to bring 
forward a Bill.  He also said  that 
they thought about bringing forward 
such a Bill not after the introduction 
of this Bill 'or the Bill of Shri T. B. 
Vittal Rao. The fiist thing I want to 
point out is that it was not objected 
then.  Secondly, in view of the as­
surance  discussion can  proceed on 
this Bill

Shri Abld All;  Was the assurance 
accepted?

Shri A. K. Gopalan: Because there 
was an assurance b> the Minister and 
I think this will be the iast session of 
this Parliament----

Mr. Chairman:  There is no ques­
tion whether the assurance was ac­
cepted or  not.  The only  question 
here is about the recomiheidation of 
the President.

Shri A. K. Go]ia!an:  I am coming
to that.  What I ;tm pointing out is 
that the sections ir. this Bill are the 
saine as contained in the other Bill. 
The Minister said that the Bill they 
are bringing  forv̂ard will  contain 
all these provisions After giving an 
assurance that the Grovemment will 
bring forward a Bill they  are  now 
going to oppose it.

Not only that,  /is far as the other 
question is concerned, namely,  the 
discipline of the motor drivers, con­
ductors, etc., the Motor Vehicles Act 
rame to this House and it was passed 
îter hearing the objections.
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Mr. Chairman:  I would request the 
hon. Member to come to the  point. 
The fact that an a?«urance was given 
to the effect tnat another Bill vrould 
come up thai another Bii< was pass­
ed and provisions were made in that 
Bin, etc., is all  extraneous to  the 
matter.  The real 4ues*ion is  whe­
ther the present Bill can be allowed 
to be discussed in this House and be 
passed and, if so,  article 117  (3)
stands in the way or not.  That  is 
the only question.  As it stands, it is 
quite clear that the Bill it  enacted 
and brought into operation,  would 
involve expenditure from the Conso­
lidated Fimd of India. So, such a Bill 
shall not be passed by either House 
of Parliament  unless the  President 
has recommended to that House the 
passing of the Bill. Of course,  two 
courses are open now. ^

Further only the motion for con­
sideration of this Bill is being  dis­
cussed now, and the Bill is not going 
to be passed now. The Bill cannot be 
passed  imless the  recommendntion 
of the President is obtair̂ed. S  as 
I said, there are two courses open 
to the  Member.  Either the  hon. 
Member may get the sanction of the 
President or̂ he might remove those 
provisions in the Bill which attract 
article 117 (3).  I have persued this 
Bill, and it appears to me that tliere 
are several clauses which must re­
quire expenditure from the Consoli­
dated Fimd of India. All the public 
vehicles and public transport system 
will come under the operation of this 
Bill, as it is, which means the Gov­
ernment shall have to spend money. 
If that is so, either such provisions 
may be taken away, or, the Presi­
dent’s  recommendation  must  be 
brought before this House for enab­
ling the Bill to be passed, if the hon. 
Member wants this Bill to be ulti­
mately passed.  Pending such recom­
mendation of the President, we can 
go on with the Bill up to a certain 
stage.

Shrl A. K. Gopahm:  May I make 
a submifsion?  As far as the Union 
territories are concerned, the expen­
diture may come to a very  small 
amoimt.  After  the  reorganisation

of the States, there are only a few 
Union  territories  such as  Delhi, 
Himachal  Pradesh,  Andaman  and 
Nicobar Islands, etc. So, the imple­
mentation of this Bill will involve 
only a very small expenditure.

Apart from that, may I request the 
Chair to allow me to discuss at least 
the part relating to the private motor 
transport?  While  considering  that 
aspect  of  the Bill, the other aspect 
namely,  the  President’s  sanction, 
may be thought of.  Either I  may 
write and get the  sanction of  the 
President or continue with this Bill 
in so far as it relates to private motor 
transport.  As I said, if this Bill is 
passed, the amount that will be in­
curred, so far as the Union territo­
ries are concerned, will be very lit­
tle.  Anyway, let me take up  the 
consideration of the Bill in so far as 
it relates to private motor transport 
in India.  At the time of considera­
tion, the  other question may be pro­
ceeded with separately.

Shri Abid AU:  I may be allowed
to say a few words for a minute or 
two with regard to the points raised 
by Shri A. K. Gopalan. It is true that 
I promised on the last occasion that 
we would be introducing a Bill our­
selves.  But it is also a fact that the 
hon. Members opposite always insist 
that all these matters should be deci­
ded after consultation with all the 
organisations concerned.

»  The hon. Member is also aware that 
very recently we have had a meeting 
of the Standing  Labour  Committee 
where this matter was considered and 
certain recommendations were made.

These recommendations have  been 
forwarded to the State Governments 
and their replies are awaited. It is 
because of this that the delay has 
occurred, but certainly that was in 
deference to the wishes of the Mem­
bers opposite.  It is not that we are 
delaying it, but our  inability  be­
cause of the things I have explained 
should be appreciated.  You  your­
self have pointed out that what hap­
pened an the last occasion is imma­
terial.  The fact remains that the re­
commendation has not even been ap­
plied for.
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17 hrs.

Shri A. K. Gopalan:  May I know
whether the Minister has any objec­
tion to the discussion of this Bill?

Shri Abid All:  I will again assure 
him that we are ourselves very an­
xious to bring forward an amending 
Bill at the earliest possible opportu­
nity.  That should satisfy the hon. 
Member. Even on the last  occasion, 
the hon. Member who moved for the 
consideration of his Bill âs  not 
satisfied and he made the House re­
ject the proposition.  That assurance 
was not accepted.

Mr.  Chairman:  The  position  is 
quite clear.  It appears that the Gov­
ernment are trying to  fulfil  their 
promise to give effect to their un­
dertaking.  But apart from that, even 
according to the  admission of  th« 
hon. Member some expenditure must 
be involved,  though it may be an 
insignificant amount.  Therefore, the 
provisions of article 117 (3) are at­
tracted and we cannot pass this Bill 
unless and until that  recommenda­
tion is here.  At the same time, the 
hon. Member in charge of the  Bill 
says that he will restrict it only to 
the private undertakings. Unless he 
gives  that  undertaking  and  says 
that he will remove such portions, I 
am unable to proceed with it. Also, 
there is another  principle involved. 
When such an objection is taken, we 
should have a reasonable expectation 
that sanction would be obtained. So, 
it will practically be waste of time 
to go on with this Bill if we are not 
sure that the recommendation will be 
coming.  It is abready five and I am

going to adjourn the  House  now. 
Therefore, I would suggest that  the 
hon. Member  may make  efforts to 
obtain the recommendation and if he 
succeeds, he can go on with the BilL 
Even if the Government is bringing 
forward a Bill, it is no bar to his con­
tinuing the discussion. The other al­
ternative can be that the hon. Mem­
ber  gives an  imdertaking to  this 
House that he will restrict himself 
to such portions of the Bill as do not 
involve any  expenditure from  the 
Consolidated Fund of India. That is 
another solution.  I leave it to his 
discretion.

Shri A. K. Gopalan:  I will restrict 
myself to the private transport and 
not the other portions involving ex­
penditure from the Consoliated Fund 
of India.  On that basis, I may be al­
lowed to continue.

Mr.  Chairman:  On the next day
he may give that undertaking to the 
House and if the House accepts it he 
may be allowed to go on.

 ̂ ft#  ̂ 

i  STPT I

Mr.  Chairman:  This Bill is not 
over.  I cannot proceed to the next 
item.  The House stands  adjourned 
tiU 11 A.M. tomorrow.

17-03 hrs.

The Lok Sabha then adjourned till 
Eleven of the  Clock on  Saturday, 
the Qth December, 1956.




