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Mr. Speaker: So, the House will 
meet again at One O'clock. 

The Lok Sabha then adjourned 
tiZl One of the Clock. 

The Lok Sabha re-as.embled at ,One 
of the Clock. 

[MIt. DEPUTY-SPEAXER in the Chair] 

The Prime Minister and Minister of 
EDemal Affairs (Shrl Jawabarlal 
Nehru): Lest there be a misundet'-
standing about what I said before we 
adjourned, about one matter, I should 
like to clear it up. I referred to the 
lady, Subhadrabai, who was shot. 1 
should like to make it clear that she 
is alive; she is not dead. She is, of 
course, seriously wounded and is in 
hospital. 

PAPERS LAID ,ON THE TABLE 
ANNuAL REPORT OF INDIAN Anu.INEs 

CORPORATION 

The Deputy Minister of Bebablll-
tatloa (Shri J. .K. BboDBle): On be-
half of Shri Jagjivan Ram. I beg to 
lay on the Table a copy of the Annual 
Report of the Indian Airlines Cor-
poration, under sub-section (2)' of 
section . 37 of the Air Corporations 
Act, 1953. (placed in the LibrlU'7. See 
No. 8-248/55.] 

DIsPLACED PERSONS COMPENSATION 
AND Rm.um.rrATION BUL18 

The Deputy MInister of Beha.blll-
tatlon (Shrl J . .K. Bbollllle): I' beg to 
lay on the Table a copy of the Dis-
placed Persons Compensation and Re· 
habilitation Rules, 1955. under sub-
section (3) of section 40 of the Dis-
placed Persons (Compensation and 
Rehabilitation) Act, 1954. [Placed in 
the Library. See No. 8-249/55.] 

PRESIDENT'S ASSENT TO BILL 
Secretary: Sir, I have to inform the 

HOuse \ that the Code of Criminal 
Procedure (Amendment) Bill, 1954, 
which was passed by the Houses of 
Parliament during the current session, 
was assented to by the President on 
the loth August, 1955. 

COMPANIES BILL-ContcI. 
Mr. Deputy-Speaker: The House will 

now proceed with further consider-
ation of the following motion moved 
by Shri C. D. Deshmukh on the 9th 
August, 1955: 

"That the Bill to eonsolidate 
and amend the law relating 1.0 
companies and certain other 
associations, as reported by the 
Joint Committee, be taken into 
consideration." 

Shri C. R. Chowdary is to continue 
his speech. But I find that he is 
absent from the House. 

Before I call upon Shri Bansal. I 
would tell hon. Members who are 
getting a chance to speak here, that 
I want an assurance from them be-
forehand. Again and again, I have 
to ring the quorum bell and We have 
become an object of criticism outside 
and inside. Therefore, I want an 
assurance that every hon. Member who 
wants to speak will continue to sit 
here ill the House and hear what 
others haVe to say. If, on the other 
hand, I find any hon. Member not 
sticking to this, I won't call him on 
the next occasion jn other debates. 

Shrl M. S. Garupadaswamy (My-
sore): Is it iron law? 

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: It is my dis-
cretion. I want to raise the level 'If 
the debate and I want the House full. 
Each of us is a representative of 71 
lakh population. In a HOUSe of 500, 
I find it very hard to get even 50 
people. If 26 people decide, they de-
cide in the name of the 360 million 
Indians. Hon. Members will kindly 
consider the responsibility that they 
have to bear in this House. There-
fore, I would urge upon every Wn. 
Member--whether he gets an oPPO!'-
tunity to speak or not-to be here 
throughout; otherwise, we will not be 
able to discharge our duty properly. 
Whichever hon. Member wants to 
catch my eye. I will allow. him to 
speak on one condition, that so far at 
least as that debate is concernd, he 
will sit here and hear what oU' r have 




