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Accident in Sudamadih 

•218. SHRI A. K. ROY: Will the Min-

ister of RAILWAYS be pleased to state: 

(a) whether bis attention bas been 

drawn to the accident at Sudamadih 
(Dh.anbad) causing death of seven con-

tractor's workmen on 15-6-82 while cons-
tructing drain along the raliway siding of 
the 1iharat Coking Coal Limited; and 

(b) if so, fact's in details and the steps 

taken thereon? 

THE DEPlJTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF RAILWAYS AND IN 

THE DEPARTMENT OF PARLIAMEN-
TARY AFFAIRS (SHRI MALLIK-
ARJUN): (a) Yes, Sir. 

-
( b) The South Eastern Railway is exe-

cuting the work of "Earth work Walling 
end Side drains" as a deposit work for 

BCCL at Sudam'adib. During the execution 
of the work by the contractor 1\1/s. Allied 
Construction Company, the earth on the 
cutting side slipped for a length of about 

25 feet at about 18.30 hrs. on 15-6-82 
trapping 17 workers of the contractor. 

Seven workers died, four were grievously 

injured and six others were discharged 

after first aid. Railway ~ paid Rs. 10001-
to each of the next of the ki'J of the de-

ceased persons, and Rs. 750/-to each of 
the four grievously injured persons. An 

amount of Rs. 1,27,400/-has further been 
deposited as· compensation to be paid to 

the next of the kin of seven deceased per-

sons with the Commissioner, Workmen 

n~ tion, Dhanbad on 29-6-82. In 
addition, civil authorities have also paid 

Rs. 1000/-each as ex-gratia payment to 
the next of kin of the deceased persons. 

Railway Administration ordered a fact 

finding inquiry by three officers. The in-

quiry committee, in their report dated 
25-6-82 concluded that the slip was a 

sudden phenomenon due ot bidden faulty 

· strata of coo.I seam and could not have 

been anticipated. 

Research on Deo-Somnath T fDlJ'1le 

*219. S.HRI BHEEKHABHAT: 

the Minister of EDUCATION 

CULTURE be pleased to state: 

Will 

AND 

(a) whether any constructional/archi-

tectural or any qther type of 'Study has 
been conducted by the Archaeological 

Survey of India with regard to Deo-Som-
nath Temple in Dangarpur District; 

(b) whether it is a fact that ,no cement 

or lime has been used in the construction 

of this temple; 

(c) if so, bow this structnre stands till 
this day; 

( d) whether Government will allow re-

novation of thi5 temple by any Charitable 

institution; and 

( e) if so, the procedure thereof? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTR TES OF EDUCATION AND 

CULTURE AND SOCIAL WELFARE 

(SHRI P. K. THUNGON): (a) to ( c). 

Yes, Sir. The temple under reference i.o:: 

built in dry masonry without using ·:rny 

mortar for binding. The heavy blockli of 
stone were laid evenly and horizontally 

one upon the other and kept in position 
by their weight and balance, aided by iron 

cramps and dowels. This was a common 

constructional feature in stone temple-; 
upto about. the thirteenth century A.D. 

throughout India. 

(d) No, Sir. 

( e) Does not anse. 
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