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Mortgage Insurance Scheme to Boost 
Housing Construction in country

*104. SHRI HARIHAR SOREN;
SHRI B. V. DESAI:

Will the Minister of WORKS AND 
HOUSING be pleased to state:

(a) whether his Ministry h?s a 
proposal to launch a mortgage in-
surance scheme to boost housing con-
struction in the country;

(b) whether such scheme is pro-
posed to be started on an experi-
mental basis and confined to certain 
selected centres;

(c) if so, the names of those 
selected centre which have been 
identified so farJ

(d) the terms and conditions pro-
posed to be laid down before the 
purchaser; and

(e) the expected time of the im-
plementation of such, proposal?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THB 
MINISTRY OF WORKS AND HOUS-
ING (SHRI MOHAMMED USMAN 
ARIF): (a) to (e). The proposal is 
under consideration of the Govern-
ment. The details are yet to be 
worked out.

SHRI HARIHAR SOREN: May I
know whether it is a fact that the 
so-called mortgage insurance scheme 
has been under the consideration of 
the Government for the last three 
years and the Housing Ministry is 
yet to give finishing touches to the 
above scheme, and if so, the reasons 
for the d elay  in implementing this 
scheme?

THE MINISTER OF PARLIA-
MENTARY AFFAIRS AND WORKS 
AND HOUSING (SHRI BHISHMA 
NARAIN SINGH): There is no
Question of any delay. We have 
received the recommendations of the 
working group only this month and 
it is under active consideration of
the Government.

News Item “Increase in Plant Disease 
Worries Farms”

*105. SHRI JTTENDRA PRASAD: 
Will the Minister of AGRICULTURE? 
be pleased to state:

(a) whether attention of Govern-
ment has been drawn to the new9 
item captioned “Increase in plant 
disease worries farmers” appeared in 
the Statesman dated 30th October, 
1981;

(b) whether the first National 
Congress of Plant Breeders held im 
Karnal recently has expressed con-
cern over the increase of the deadly 
Karnal Bunt afflicting the high yield-
ing varieties of wheat including 
Sonalika which covers 80 per cent of 
the wheat crops;

(c) what were the other points/ 
suggestions made at the Congress; and

(d) the reaction of Government
thereto? <
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THE MINISTER OF AGRICUL-
TURE AND RURAL RECONSTRUC-
TION AND IRRIGATION AND 
CIVIL SUPPLIES (RAO BIRENDRA 
SINGH); (a) to (d). A statement 
is laitd on. the Table of the Sabha.

Statement

(a) Yes, Sir.

(b) Although the Government does 
not have yet the proceedings of the 
National Congress of Plant Breeders 
held at Karnal from 12th to 15th 
October, 1981, according to the con-
vener of the Congress the subject of 
Karnal Bunt did come up for discus-
sion at the Congress, tncluding its 
incidence on high-yielding varieties 
of wheat such as Sonalika.

(c) According to the convener of 
the Congress, other points discussed 
at this forum were—

1. Development of new genera-
tion of high-yielding varieties 
through more basic research in 
genetics, plant breeding and dis-
ease resistance, •
2. Better plant types with more 
efficient utilisation of renewable 
and non-renewable resources such 
as solar energy, water and fertilisers 
for higher crop yields,

3. Development of crop varieties 
for problem areas and stress 
environments such as dry farming 
environments such as dry farming 
areas, saline and sodic soils and 
water-logged situations.

(d) The Government has been fully 
seized of these problems and has 
organized strong research centres to 
develop disease-resistant high-yield-
ing varieties, with broad genetic base 
to serve as barriers for spread of 
diseases and varieties suitable for 
stress environments such as rainfed 
areas and saline sodic soils. Based on 
researches done already a great deal 
of improved technology for the crops 
and specific situations has already 
been generated which is now being 
extended to farmers. The Govern-

ment, however, is conscious of the 
need for continuing research support 
to these areas and has accordingly 
planned its future strategies to 
strengthen research.

SHRI JITENDRA PRASAD: May
I know whether it is a fact that this 
disease was first reported in the 
1930s, w hether the wheat directorate 
under the ICAR has completely 
failed to curb this disease and 
many other diseases and whether it 
is a fact that this disease has affected 
the wheat production in the country 
very badly, as expressed by the 
National Congress of Plant Breeders 
held n̂ October?

RAO BIRENDRA SINGH.- it is a 
fact this disease was first noticed in 
1931, as the hon. member has said. 
Since then constant efforts have been 
made to try  and control it. There is 
also no doubt that the area affected 
by this disease has been increasing in 
Punjab and Haryana, Western U.P. 
and parts of Rajasthan like Ganga- 
nagar district and other places. But 
we have been trying to control the 
disease through various methods. 
But the main emphasis is on develop-
ing disease-resistant varieties of new 
wheat. That is being done. Some 
varieties have already been identified 
and we are covering larger areas with 
those varieties.

SHRI JITENDRA PRASAD: Al-
ready fifty years have passed and we 
have not been ab le t 0 bring out a 
wheat variety which is resistant to 
this disease. There are many other 
common diseases which are affecting 
the wheat crop and we are unable to 
do anything about them. May I know 
what concrete steps Government is 
taking to do something about it? The 
other question is regarding #the hybrid 
varieties of pulses and oilseeds. 
Nothing has been done in this field 
also. What action does the Govern-
ment contemplate in this connection?

RAO BIRENDRA SINGH; It is a 
very general question pertaining to 
all the diseases. With regard to one 
particular disease, I have already
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admitted that we have not been able 
to effectively control this particular 
type of fungal disease. There are 
many other diseases like that. Even 
in the case of malaria from which 
human beings have been suffering for 
hundreds of years, we have not been 
able to check it completely. So, 
efforts are going on to control it.

SHRI JITENDRA PRASAD: What
about developing of hybrid varieties 
in pulses and oilseeds?

RAO BIRENDRA SINGH: We
have developed certain high yielding 
varieties in groundnut, soyabean and 
some short duration varieties of pulses 
have also been evolved. So, very 
useful research work has been dome.
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DR. VASANT KUMAR PANDIT: 
May I draw the attention of the 
Minister to the 8th conference of the 
Asian Pacific Weed Science Society 
held recently in which weed scien-
tists from 17 countries took part. It 
has been stated ini rthat conference 
that almost one-third of the crop in 
India is lost due to weeds. The Minis-
ter has given us an answer of a very 
genera] nature. As a specific remedy 
to save loss of food from weeds, does 
the Government plan to establish a 
National Weed research body s© that 
we can develop a specific weedicide?
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