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other options available totham. Various steps 
for the development of the market and to 
protect the interest of investors aTe taken 
from time to time, which is an ongoing proc-
ess and wil continue. 

Setting up of Television Transmitters 
Unit In Rural Areas of Srlkakulam 

10426. OR. VISHWANATHAM:Willthe 
Minister of INFORMATION AND BROAD-
CASTING be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Rural Television Trans-
mitter un~ is proposed to be set up in rural 
areas of Srikakulam during 1990-91; 

(b) if so, the details of the locations; and 

(c) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF INFORMATION 
AND BROADCASTING AND MINISTER OF 
PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS (SHRI P. 
UPENDRA):(a) to (c). Whereas a low power 
TV transmitter is already functioning at Sri-
kakulam, the high power (10 KM) TV trans-
mitter at Visakhapatnam also provides serv-
ice in parts of Srikakulam district including 
rural areas. There is, however, no approved 
scheme at present to set up another TV 
transmitter in Srikakulam district. It is the 
endeavour of the Government to extend TV 
service to the remaining uncovered parts of 
the country including those in Srikakulam 
district as expeditiously as possible, depend-
ent upon the availability of funds for this 
purpose. 

Loss to ITDC from Tourist Transport 

10427. SHRI KASHIRAM RANA: Will 
the Minister of TOURISM be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether efforts are going on for 
some years to close down/reduce the trans-
port fleet of India Tourism Development 

Corporation (ITOC) on the ground that it is 
not economically viabte to run transport 
activities 1fttder1he 1100 any longer; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) the reasons for the loss in the trans-
port activity of ITDe and efforts made to 
curtaiVreduce the losses? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF TOURISM (SHAI SATYA PAL 
MALIK): (a) to (c). The role of ITDC has been 
of a catalyst in providing transportation needs 
attourist destinations. It has, therefore, been 
the policy of ITOC to withdraw from such 
places where private or other transport 
operators come forward to cater to the trans-
port needs of Tourists. Accordingly from 
1983 onwards, ITOC closed down nine trans-
port units and has further plans to reduce its 
fleet in the coming years so as to retain 
uttimately a hard core of about 50 vehicles at 
locations, commercially viable. The main 
reasons for the loss was provision of com-
petitive transportation facilities by the small 
private operatorslState Tourism Develop-
ment corporations whose wage costs and 
overheads were lower. 

Efforts are being made to reduce losses 
and improve performance by changing and 
enlarging the product mix besides laying 
more emphasis on tour and travel activity. 
For the year 1989-90, the Ashok Travels and 
Tours' profit is estimated to be of the order of 
As. 53 lakhs. 

Loan from I.M.F. 

10428. SHRI KALP NA TH RAI: Will the 
Minister of FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the amount of loan granteti by the 
International Monetary Fund to India during 
the last Financial year; 


