
MR. SPEAKER: The question is:

“That in pursuance of sub-sec-
tion (2) of section 8, read  w ith 
sub-section (3) of section 7 of the 
Customs Tariff Act, 1975 (51 of 
19^75), this House approves the 

following Notifications of the Gov-
ernm ent of India in  the D epartm ent 
of Revenue and Banking, nam ely—

(a) No. G.S.R. 870(E), dated 
the 6th November, 1976, increas-
ing the export duty on coffee 
from Rs. 300 per quintal to 
Rs. 1300 per quintal,

(b) No. G.S.R. 877(E), dated 
the 13th November, 1976, in -
creasing the export duty  on 
groundnut kernel from Rs. 800 per 
tonne to Rs. 1(500 per tonne and 
on groundnut in shell from  Rs.
600 per tonne to Rs. 112.5 per 
tonne, and

(c) No. G.S.R. 13(E), dated the 
12th January, 1977, levying an 
export duty on cardamom at the 
ra te of Rs. 50 per kilogram under 
the new Heading No. 22 in the 
Second Schedule to the said Act,

from the date of each of the notifica-
tions aforesaid.”

The motion was adopted .

16.53 hrs.

MESSAGE FROM THE VICE- 
PRESIDENT ACTING AS PRESI-

DENT

MR. SPEAKER: I have to inform 
the  House that I have received the 
following message dated the 6th 
April, 1977 from the Vice-President 
acting as President:

“I have received w ith great 
satisfaction the expression of 
thanks by the Members of the Lok 
Sabha for the Address which I de-
livered to both Houses of P arlia -
m ent assembled together on the 
28th March, 1977.”

141 Message from the CHATTRA 17,

16.53& hrs.
GOVERNMENT OF UNION TERRI-

TORIES (AMENDMENT) BILL

(w h r t t  WTO % )  :

" f a  m  T rarefa
1963 fT

'TT f^RT snrj |"

if  « v iU h  J R  fa r r  w  t  f a  sttr %

farPTt fayM T̂*TTtr |
5 ̂  f  «i'»iim 6 w  1 ?ft

if? !TN) t f w  5ft STW %
’IN  if *ft ■JWfT P ^ K ^ * T T  f a  
i f e x h r  sft ffffpr mtrrtff ^  
wt Thr HTW % ^rrq- 6 htw ^t i
%f^FT f  iff fa ?TRT Ps 'jIiH  f t  5TT 
<Jft «ft tfk  if ?T$r «ft,

f r  j  ^  «tt ?ft
c[f m f e m  %• 3rf?TT trN' qft 6 

trfw r dRdO'*! f t  fatjM ^Twnft 
f t  i fa i- sfrr w f  T

£  f  i p  i t  v n ^ n r
*r̂ t ti fVn* t^f

*ft *T Hrjai’l fT
^  *TT faiTT 3fT ^7T ^  I ^  5Tf
5T'T*T ^T'T ^  ^fa'T w iT  zfVcO'd

*rt fw 6 5 *tt?t ft 11
<I«H STTTi P̂shi *t ?nf^R¥ % 'Jlfili
s *rrw f t  6 sra- fen «rr fw
jpT ^flft 5 flW 7 *nft% f^*TT ^ 15̂  f  I 

3T*rT,y’T*rt?P*M'UM— ^  jtP fr  
2 RiClj) ^TT^ft f  | ^TRT UMM
«rrfaTftwr 3t t r , yq; if ^ t

1 23 «rt
^ f t  ’ift fftT 23 T><î
W  Pq^K «TT ^fa^T ^IT f t  KT<HH f^TT 
^ f a  tf t  f  m r w r  if  ^ rr  5 r n ^ r  

^icft ^  ^  f a  v f  ^
v n #  if  vfCTT< f H t  1

1899 (SA K K ) Vice-President 142
acting as President



143 G ovt. of Union APRIL 7, 1977 Territories (Am dt.) Bill 144

TO fTK T f W T  | fa 3% fosftTW if 
5 7 ^  T t f  ^  ift̂ T,

ST̂ TT, if 5 4 *TjftW % 5F3THT

5 <HH 7 *15!'i 5V am* 1

m \  f a  *r f ^ r  «r?r I ,  ^
5 O T 4 *T^T % *rfa^ t  ^T T̂T j? 4 ^  

*pfii> 7 tot *ntr i ^  *n*T*r ^t ^  *ra 

t  5TTT% 'TTtf ^  T^T £ )
% W^Rt 5 HTW 7 IHT5TT ^  I 

W ^ T  ?PT ^  §?TT fa  »ftWT, 3 m ,  1TO 

? f tr f}3|'TT*T— g«r ^f7zfr3r if ijf?r 
5HT*T 7 f t f t  I <R ^

% 3TC t  if tr^=RH sf"’ T^

^r^rf 1 t  *pth<tt $ ^  g p r  tfteT 
?TTTT m w  I, ^ > T W  ^  q ff

I ,  f #  Jf^n; ^rhlT I

MR. SPEAKER: Motion moved:
“That th e Bill further to amend 

the Government of Union T erri-
tories Act, 1963, be taken into 
consideration.”
DR. HENRY AUSTIN (Ernakulam ): 

The Home Minister has brought fo r-
ward a Bill which per se discrimi-
nates between State and Union 
Territory. As is well known the 
Union Territories are clamouring and 
trying to come on par with Uie rest 
of the States in the country. It has 
been the practice of the Government 
of India consistently to bring the 
Union Territories also to the level of 
the rest of the States. It is a m atter 
of surprise that the Home M inister 
is bringing in a Bill where it is said, 
for Goa it is 4 months, for Mizoram
6 months, etc. It does not fit in with 
the general ethos of the country and 
the legislation on th e subject, j  am 
not taking a partisan view. The ra -
tionale behind the proposal of in-
creasing the term  of State Legisla-
tures and Lok Sabha to 6 years has 
been discussed at length and there 
was a national dialogue. If you see 
the debate of those days you will see 
how the national dailies took a lively 
interest on this i»ue which evinced

considerable interest. Legal pandits 
and constitutional experts have
given out their views. Whereas 
Rajya Sabha has six years, a’s their 
norm al tenure, w hy should Lok 
Sabha which, according to our Cons-
titution, wield more power and 
authority, should have a lesser 
period? That was the lacuna. And our 
fram ers of the Constitution at tha t 
time had a different concept. But, 
after 25 years of the working of our 
Constitution, the public opinion felt 

differently or, if you deny tha t pub-
lic opinion was not total in proof of 
the move, at least concede th a t a 
sizeable section o* the public opinion 
favoured this change and, in the Lok 
Sabha itself, i do not think th a t 
many members even in the opposi-
tion, objected to this on principle.
17 hrs.

So, this m atter was discussed th read-
bare and I do not w ant to view the 
problem as purely partisan, I would, 
request all the hon. Members to con-
sider this aspect objectively on 
merits. Why should hon. Members on 
this side of the House have to go 
through the elections earlier? How 
hard it is to face the electorate ru n -
ning to ten lakhs of people every five 
years? It is even degrading to have 
the Lok Sabha’s tenure a little less. 
(Interruptioyis) . This was the aspect 

which was felt at that time. If you 
So please, you may bring a bill. In 
that context, if y o u  read the pro-
ceedings at that time, the situation or 
practice obtaining in different coun-
tries, in different Parliam ent, you 
will find that in certain countries, 
they have a seven year term  and 
certain others had even more tenure. 
So, it was not that only India was 
having this tenure. Many countries 
have different tenures for the legis-
latures as their lifespan. These were 
the considerations which prevailed at 
that time in m aking this suggestion. 
Later on, it was brought forth  in the 
form of a Bill before the House. But, 
it was unfortunate that the Fifth Lok 
Sabha had to be dissolved and the  
same Bill could not be introduced in 
relation to the  union territories. And,



today, instead of bringing in regu-
la r  bills, to normalise the situation, it 
is  surprising th a t the hon. Minister 
w ith  considerable experience in all 
thirf, is bringing in this Bill for the 
Union 7,errtt° r ies. Probably, it is due 
to  climatic reason. I am afraid there 
m ay be a political overtone in the 
sense that you are thinking of elec-
tions ra ther than  to normalise the 
situation. Probably, the prospects of 
elections seem to be main guiding 
factor in determ ining this thing. This 
is  repugnant to the Constitution and 
the people who had evinced some 
in terest in this m atter, j do not th ink  
th a t the people coming from Delhi 
will approve of this. I had ex-
changed views w ith members coming 
from Delhi. They were asking for 
enhancem ent of the status of the 
Union T errito ry  Jot Delhi and to  
m ake it a regular State. You are 
trying to perpetuate this thing and 
giving an inferior 'status to the Union 
Territory. I do not think the people 
of Delhi will take kindly to that 
suggestion. Therefore, I do oppose 
this move and I do believe that it is 
incum bent on the present Govern-
m ent to bring in a bill later on. And 
it may be revised—that is a different 
m atter, to a six year term  for the 
Union Territories also.

MR. SPEAKER: Government has 
an amendment. But that has not 
been circulated. I would request the 
hon. Home Minister to read it out so 
that the Members may know that the 
amendment has been £iven notice of.
It has not been circulated.

CHAUDHURI CHARAN SINGH: 
My amendment roads as rollows:

Pages 1 and 2,
/o r lines 8 to 15 and lines 1 and
2 respectively,

Substitute—
‘Provided further that the 

provisions of this section shall, 
in relation to the Legislative 
Assemblies of the Union T erri-
tories of Goa, Daman and Diu 
and Mizoram, in existence on

145 G o v t ° f  CHAITRA 17,

the 7th day of February  1977, 
apply as if for the words “five 
years”, in the two places w here 
they occur, the words “five 
years and seven m onths” had 
been substituted.'.” (3)

MR. SPEAKER: In view of this, 
I do not th ink the hon. Member Shri 
A m rut K asar need move his am end-
ment. He can speak on that.

SHRI AMRUT KASAR (Panaji): 
Mr. Speaker, Sir, first of all, I thank 
you for giving me this opportunity of 
expressing my views before this 
House. Since this is my maiden 
speech, let me, in the first instance, 
make it clear that 1 support this Bill. 
The policy of the Janata Government 
is to have a tenure of the Assemblies 
and the Lok Sabha for five years 
instead of six years. As I have p ro -
mised to my voters, I shall be sup-
p o rtin g  th e  Janata Government in 
amending the Constitution and the 
Forty-second Amendment, I support 
th is  policy of the Government to  have 
the tenure of five years both for Lok 
Sabha as well as for Assemblies.

As regards my amendment, p re-
viously it was or five year and four 
months but since the hon. Home Min-
ister has already cleared that in both 
the cases it will be five years and 
seven months, I do not think that I 
need to stress that point.

Therefore I am w ithdraw ing it. 
The Home Minister has promised 
that in both the cases, it will be 
five years and seven months. Now, I 
wanted it to be actually seven months 
because whenever legislation is passed 
we must take into consideration the 
geographical situation of that place. 
Monsoons are fast approaching. Many 
of the hon. Members here know that 
Goa is situated at the feet of 
western ghats. The rainfall there is 
more than 120 inches on an average. 
This heavy rainfall cuts the communi-
cation w ith the villages. Although the 
communication facilities are good in 
Panjim —capital of Goa—yet in the 
surrounding talukas like Parnem  and

1899 (SAKA) Union Territories 146
(Am dt.) Bill



Govt, of Union APRIL 7t 1977 Territories (A rndt) Bill 14&

[Shri Anant Kasar]

S atari the communications are cut. 
The voters are m ore in  num ber in 
these talukas and, therefore, it will 
affect them. Therefore, I happily 
accept this move of the Home M in-
ister tha t it w ill be seven m onths b o  
th a t im mediately after the monsoons 
we are ready to take up elections and 
as in the m anifesto of the Janata Party  
the aims and purposes of the Bill 
w ill be fulfilled.

Mr. Speaker, Sir, at the same time 
I extend my cooperation to the 
Jana ta  P arty  in its policy for decen-
tralisation of power and 1 would 
like to say due to the acceptance of 
the principle of decentralisation of 
power in the status of Union T erri-
tory  will be lifted up and it will be 
granted Statehood. I extend my full 
cooperation to the party  and all the 
kindness which our Home M inister 
has shown to us.

SHRI EDUARDO FALEIRO (Mor- 
mugao): Mr. Speaker, Sir, it would 
be in the interest of the Congress 
p arty  to have elections forthw ith in 
Goa because just now in Goa we 
have a non-Congress government. I t 
w ill be in the intereset of my party  
to have elections forthw ith in Goa 
b u t inspite of tha t we are opposing 
this Bill on the general principle end 
not lim iting ourselves to petty  con- 
Biderations. Though it will be in the 
in terest of our party  to support this 
B ill yet we have to oppose it as we 
w ant to be faithful to the main 
principles.

AN HON. MEMBER: W hat is the 
P rin c ip le’?

SHRI EDUARDO FALEIRO: The
principle involved is that Union Terri 
tories m ust be put on the same foot-
ing as the States.

Sir, I would like to say this much. 
I  fail to appreciate why this exten-
sion of seven months? Why seven 
m onths and why not eight months? 
W hy seven m onths and why not four 
months? If they w ant to repeal the 
Ordinance, why not they repeal the

Ordinance forthw ith? W hy not say 
th a t the Assembly stands dissolved 
immediately? W hat is the point in 
giving seven months? There is no 
legal bar to dissolve the Assembly 
im m ediately and hold the elections 
after the monsoon or before the m on-
soon. In fact, if they are serious 
about holding the elections, if they 
w ant th a t popular governm ent 
should come, they can/have elections 
in  the m onth of May itself because 40 
days are rem aining now. A notice of
40 days is enough.

The point I w ant to make is that 
the Lok Sabha elections have proved 
that the present government in the 
Union Territory does not have the 
support of the people. Out of the 30 
Assembly constituencies, 18 consti-
tuencies voted in favour of the 
Congress P arty  and only 12 voted in 
favour of the M aharashtravadi Go- 
m antak P arty . This being the posi-
tion, there is something more which 
this government and the hon. Home 
M inister can do. I would like to say 
this because it is very im portant in 
the interest of our country, in the 
interest of the Union Territory and 
in the interest of decent politics in 
this country.

There are serious allegations of 
corruption and gross misconduct or 
misuse of power against the Chief 
Minister. These charges are before 
the Home Ministry. These charges 
deserve to be enquired into. A com-
mission of enquiry should be ap-
pointed against the Chief M inister 
and then necessary action must be 
taken.

It has been proved by judicial 
authority how corrupt is the Govern-
m ent of Tamil Nadu. The people in 
the  Union Territory of Goa have 
compiled the charges against the 
present Chief M inister in Goa and 
they have made a tabular statem ent 
showing the charges proved against 
Mrs. Kakodkar and showing w hat 
are the charges prima facie ostab-



149 G ovt. of CHAITRA 17, 1899 (S A K A ) Union Territories 15a-
(Arndt.) Bill

[Shri Vijay Singh]
tlished against the present Chief 
M inister of Goa. Now, I may state 
th a t in the interests of a clean gov-

e rn m e n t in that part of the country, 
these charges m ust be enquired into? 
A comiiusision of enquiry m ust be 
appointed forthwith. And then, as 
Dr. Austin, my hon. colleague, has 
said, it is high time we put the Union 
Territories at par w ith the States 
though it may be against the interest 
of the Congress P arty  as it is in the 
present case. Though it may be 
against the interest's of Congress 
Party , we should work on principles. 
This is w hat I have got to say for the 
consideration of the hon. House and 
the hon. Home Minister.

SHRI AMRUT KASAR: He has
made serious charges. 1 want to reply 
to them.

MR. SPEAKER: You had your
chance. Some other Members can 
reply to them.

SHRI AMRUT KASAR: The Cong- 
ress Party  itself had granted one year 
extension.

MR. SPEAKER: It is not as if on 
Goa Assembly only one can reply, this 
is the Parliam ent of India.

SHRI KRISHNA CHANDRA HAL- 
DER (Durgapur): We should get our 
chance also.

MR SPEAKER: I will call you 
later. I will now call some new peo-
ple. I have not called even one from 
this side. It is becoming impossible 
for me. 1 will call you when your 
turn  comes.

•♦SHRI KRISHNA CHANDRA 
HALDER: Mr. Speaker, Sir, the hon.
Home Minister has introduced the 
Governm ent of Union Territories 
(Amendment) Bill in this House. E ar-
lier the M inister for Law and Com-
pany Affairs Shri Shanti Bhushan had 
introduced the 43rd (Constitution)

••The original speech was delivered

Amendment B ill The substance o f 
the Bill is th a t elections to the  Lok 
Sabha, V idhan Sabha and Union T er-
ritories should be held after every 
5 years instead of 6 years. We sup-
port this spirit and extend our support 
to the present amending Bill tha t is 
now before the House for discussion. 
While introducing this Bill the Hon. 
Home M inister had m ade it clear tha t 
he seeks to extend the life of the 
Governments of the Union Territories 
upto 5 years and 7 months because of 
the impending monsoon and th is is 
quite understandable. While oppos-
ing thi's Bill, Mr. Henry Austin, w ho 
has since changed his place from the 
ruling side to that of opposition, said 
that there was a national consensus 
on the 42nd Amendment of the Cons-
titution as a result of which the life 
of Parliam ent, Assemblies, and gov-
ernm ents in Union Territories were 
extended upto 6 years. For his infor-
mation I may say that when this 42nd 
Amendment of the Constitution was 
introduced in the House, we on behalf 
of the then opposition had stoutly 
opposed the legislation and the peo-
ple at large had also opposed it. The 
government of that time had solicited 
the support to their Bill through some 
conferences which were m ainly attend-
ed by their own puppets. Then the 
General Elections were held and this 
42nd Amendment of the Constitution 
was made an election issue both by the 
Janata Party  as also by us and other 
allies of the present Government. 
W hat did we see in the elections? The 
people rejected the very principle of 
the 42nd Amendment BilL by defeat-
ing the Prim e Minister, Mr. Swaran 
Singh who headed the Constitution 
Amendment Committee and finally re -
jected the Congress Party  and we see 
tha t they are in the opposition today. 
This amply proves tha t the theory of 
national consensus had no support of 
the m a sses then nor today. Why we 
support the legislation? We feel that 
in order to respect democratic princi-
ples and to fulfil peoples aspirations, 
it is necessary that elections should 
be held after every 5 years because

in Bengali.



IJI G o v t of Union APRIL 7, 1977 Territories (Am dt.) Bill 152

[Shr| Krishna Chandra Haider]

we feel that this period is sufficient 
enough to implement democratic eco-
nomic principlea If it is not done 
their will be a natural tilt towards 
authoritarianism as we had witnessed 
in the recent past. I hardly need to 
mention; Sir, that the 42nd Amend-
ment of the constitution was passed in 
this House by the Congress Govern-
ment by clamping down emergency in 
the country and puting leaders and 
workers of the opposition parties be-
hind the bar and ignoring public opi-
nion. But as soon as they went to the 
people for their opinion, they rejected 
the legislation completely. Through 
this election they gave a clear verdict 
that they are opposed to dictatorship 
and bureaucracy. They have also as-
serted their faith in individual liberty, 
right of assembly, right of trade union 
activities, right of freedom of speech 
and above all that the democratic 
norms be maintained in the country. 
They did not want to face the people.

DR. HENRY AUSTIN: On a point 
of order. How can the hon. Member 
maintain his position? Qur govern-
ment decided t0 hold the elections 
long before the expiry of the one year 
extended term. How can he say that 
we were afraid of facing the people? 
We could have waited for another 
year.

MR. SPEAKER: You are only mak-
ing a second speech. There is no 
point of order.

SHRI KRISHNA CHANDRA HAL- 
DER: I think they even did not like 
to hold the elections but because of 
external pressure and other factors 
which I dont want to go in detail 
here, they were forced to hold the 
elections.

The Congress party wanted to stick 
to power and convert this great coun-
try into a big jail. If they had agreed 
to hoM the elections it was after they 
got intelligence report from their 
police, the RAW and as is said, they 
even had gone to the astrologers to 
know about their fate in elections but 
,all their calculations went wrong and

the masses who live in villages and 
who are taken as illiterates, have pro. 
ed to the world beyond all doubt, that 
they are second to none in their poli-
tical maturity and their faith to up-
hold democracy in the country is 
absolute and unshakable. It was be-
cause of the people’s faith in demo-
cracy that the Janata Government is 
in power today.

They are trying to restore demo-
cracy in their country and as such 
support the Bill.

s i j *  : «T«rar
»Tf *r?ft % sft fetta* 

w  s * *  $  f w

«t?t §«r $ i *ft*T, 

***** ^  ^  

fatitav T i f i w r  Pt^i *ptt ^  1

■’j 'l  1 ̂  ^  w t f a

«ft, Sf Sc*T ft | I

^*11T tffaSTFT ^  I^
froffTcT SHlftT «ft, *PTFcT ft *1$ «ft I
5TTRT if cT?TTWt  ̂ H W *
% 5TTT 3ft if ffsftSFT fa*IT *WT,

W  ^t Jr flrftlR
Rft *TT I

«R5ft 5 ^  1 976 % %
f t  I 1971 if 3ft SRT*^ o o
p r r  *rr, *if 5 «?t, fa
6 ^  Him  I ’ill'*! >̂T 3ft

s fk  % *rfr ^rraT t  f a
<ft if<+ f<*J I

|  1 f*r ^rrsr jrfaq n r s rk
gtft ?rfsi9PR I  iR n h -  ^

jpntsnr fa*rc «it 1 Sf * fa 5
q?t «c*T ft 3JT% W tlR
w  *rtf frfsPFTT Rift *rr i

MlWrfl mftenr fa<IT, 
tffira rr v r  « N t  srcsr fo rr  I



153 Govt, of CHAITRA 17, 1899 (SA K A ) Union Territories 154
(Am dt.) BUI

?r% % ^rfrwchr «ft f^TT, 
r^(T viHdi 1 9 7 1  if gf^frr H^l

^PTT I 5THT ^ T T  rft 5 T̂T̂ T % f̂ TTT>3 >a *
^TT *TT, 6 HTW %' f^Q[ ^RT *TT I

?nfr-?nft ^  i r m h r  *n?w * ^ r
f a  fTTW c n ff % f a ^  ST^T N f 'd d

|  f a  sr. .-rfar, fra - sfft: fw r rw  *rr 
?*rft s fa n r  jfrrffar t ,  ^  ? r t  Ti^rf 
* *nra m  snf, ^ i r  tr^sqrar *»-nfar
oT T̂TTT | (t ^7?h <i I =f>T '3tT^9T >̂T

? rn j^ ir  v&  ^ tr? t  qr€f ^rr t o
|  I ?JTTt STfTcT w t^F t  fa  100

t  37 % ^sr w V  1 f a ^ H
~’t^ t frl 'T’ii w k . fa n  t^^'Tcn 

??  ^rr t o  w f tm r  |  ?

1967 5H> ? f fa -* m  s rk  tt h t  ?pt 
fa*TR a w 'T  % 5,5 ?TTfr %f?PT

% fa^ 1 971 if f*TO
wfa w*n r̂r ipn i
4 ?rnT 3n% % 5tt? ^ tp tt w r , t t ^w
*n<r % fa?  ^in« t t zT % ^t t '»ii <. 'i^l 
faPT i Tniff fw & Fr-trm fi %
^ T  *R 197 2 % TTT#" Jr ftr | ^  ^
% JsqcTT W < r >rf I

*rt r?rF sf>̂ r >m ?rr §t 
w ,  w  TTPfi f t  fkvvT-m nw i % ^ r r ?  
^ ff  ?tr | ?rqT tT^Frarr % ^nft f ,

t>  i 9 7 1 *r srf^r 1 972 *r *nft 
snTf % r̂ r  *rr«T-*mr t̂ t t^  ^  i 
? t j r  w >’ q-+-^Tdr % *m*fa f , ?ft

% ^ n r f  % h pt  ?rm
f w r  fom fr % ?TPf ^jf^T
«r i

STPT 3^- fVfg- JT̂ rt % <8: ffltT
Txzfv *r> nnrr w z Thr

f ’̂cT̂ T T̂r fâ TT, eft t iy*( mIc I % 
Hell % 3TT W farTS- fâ TT I ^  4i«i«icii 
184 LS—6.

^ fa ^  f w t  % T O i 1 '15),
<.l>»ldlctch ^Tq- % tnPTV ^ 1 r«(<wr

% in i % +^l fa  ^  % wlw
frtf Tnprftnr t̂ i^ tt  fe'fV ^  <n -

^  I ?TR 19 71 ^  %5fH 
?HTT % ^TTW ^  ^riw  qTZf

% 5fNT Vt Tnr^f?R> 9̂ *fhTcft >7̂ t ^ c i l  
?rnr ^tt %^w h^tt ^  *̂11 ̂

^Tl% ^fr tN lfclH
v t w  'TTJf % ^rpff % TRT ?TT# ^

€1 ?rnr sff fk d w  ’Tf tfcfr % fa’rr
<.N,ifd,T> 9^hTcft 5<9̂  *TT 

^  ?mf crh' jrpft ^Tf^r 1

Jf 'tifjHI -qi^ai ^ fa  fqOsjt %
?r?pff ffr ?t r t  fadsr vr?r ^  ^ tt

■qipQ̂  ?rtr «<5,i ^  hpO
5TTT 5̂T faSTT WT 5R> MlPd fTT TTT 
•q 1 ̂  I ^TTW ^TT% ?TffsT flfaffR 
% $IXT faoffScT »*i icTi )̂ %^?T tr̂ >
TTff % ^  q^ftr PraffTcT ^

^ I faff ffTHT fffaSTR r ti î'lER 
fâ TT ^RT, Hi Oyl q«i ^R'T ^
^ r  nr 1 srf h ^ t  ^  ?r ?r «rr 1

4imid«hRiVH f^ifcr ?rnT % 
farfsft- % ?KFff Jr
fan *FTT «TT I 5FiW  'TTHf ffTF ?T 
=t.̂ l *nJT fa vifl fffatTR ti ̂ t'ly 1 % DV't TT
iTfr TT^hr <=t 1 <?-f=i<» 1 <5 g'Mi «rr 1 ^
I  I +iy*i qrff ?ftT WTrft^T
^rnrf^T  Turf % f w  w  ^  ?  fa n t 

^  ?rr% fa^TT °^eKi ^  ̂  ̂  ^ t  
^ijii1?! f̂t" I *̂11<al cTTTK T 3*i
% % r  ?fK vnfarTf 3r?ff *r «r 1 
WWTTT V ^  CR cTW vHTT fan W  «TT I
?mT ?ptt^ ^ lr an- <ft 1 fan
■r t u t  «rr ?rk  ?> ^nr T>sr % fatT fa?fr
? «n «sft * w i+ w  % ^ fh rT  f̂r fH w r 

cTf^r >' Hftrnr tmrf^r fa n  
*TT, ^ T t i’ 9 m X  cl <,'-h % ^jTTjPT <1̂ 1
5V *rf 1 ^ r  i ^  ft^fd ^  1



1 5 5
Govt, of Union APRIL 7, 1977 Territories (Amdt.) Bill 156

T*T]

^ T T  ̂  f a  TTcTf 
3TO?TFT 3?t | TTcff T TRT̂ TPT

h IcT «fV *ftfe*r h ref % ĉrntĥ
% ^ rn r  1 j f a n  % sffar TRT^rnr 
sfV ̂ ft snr 4>ri  ̂ qrnrf ?̂t fe^jRTt 

^  ^  t  1 ^  qi€f %
SI^T f̂t fW<s t̂cTT «htiff TRff 
% ^  TRTcTFT «r>$<Mft1I t  1

*T*R ^ f f  % tffatfFT ? *TT T̂TcT
*?t snrftr cfr t o  *ft i

5̂T if eft W>BRT *TT<ff ^
5T+I\°l 3TT% * m  ^ t  HtTT H T*sT̂  %
fin? ^T 5fft ^ReTT ¥t T R  fflr
fa^TTt qrf rr̂ r t W  % fatr qf*r h m

^ft S R fil 3Ft «l<sl ^ 7  ® : fiM  T̂T feTT I

? ^  9T®2ft % *rm 7  ^ f t  srfacr % a to  
qrcf % ^ p t  sftr finrncT ^r farter

+~<e1 I ^ sftT 1̂ qd I j? fa JJ^t ^T Mfniq
?r, ? rk  srn r ^t *r% eft *r -

ttMfrl St, Hifta eft I

PROF. SHIBBAN LAL SAKSENA 
(M aharajganj): Congress party  has 
said nobody opposed the six year 
term  wTien the Forty-fourth Constitu-
tion (Amendtnent) Bill was passed. 
This is utterly false, I was the solitary 
opponent in the House who opposed 
every one of the 59 clauses of the 
Forty-fourth Amendment Bill includ-
ing the six year term. In fact I gave 
an amendment that the term  should 
be four years instead of six years. 
The term  of American Congress is 
also fcr four years. Members « f  the 
R ajya Sabha also retire every two 
years. So, it is wrong that I waxited 
six years and not four years.

17.32 hrs.
[ P a n d i t  D .  N .  T i w a r y  in the Chair]  

«ft Tm f*ro? (jm ftr) : n m -
f̂ei Hn SJTfT'RT 4̂ 1 MRf

^  % flaftf Jr cTTT
«TK 3ft fWTT «PPfT £ 5*
if ^  fw^TT T5RT î§eii fj I

^  9TTTT 6 H R  «RT
’TT T H  HT?T ^TT , ^ t  'TN' «m  

T̂RT * 1 ^  ?fVr ?nft TR' h f t

*R3T ^ f r  I  I ^TT Jj
f^rfi'T « rr rf^ r  ?fr ^  % f e n
%  ar <tAiI TOT ^TTT ^ l̂ cl ^ I 

t  *F3 flrnmn ^ tt t  %fffirtT
^ ’h! <. 'jfl h 6 tiiH vt)ticii

pTT % lTT=RT | eft
T̂cff spt f®  r̂arra- ^  I #T, f

?T|5T *Tr'fl <.oi fn ^ H  ^<.Hi
^TfcTT^ fsp 'tN ' ^  6 T O
*A 9T?T ^  H$l  ̂wT<
■̂'Ti <.iMi«l(a+ <sfW % ^  *T̂ t f+^i <1̂11 I 
W  % ^  ^rr «nrt | i
Ssrrr^rstfTTT^T f  i m’T to - tftr 
H\r*n i f'TTr ^?r % fW m  «ftr wrwsrt
=rr T̂5TTT Tie'll ^ITT >̂T ^
cf-SI ^ ^t Jl'ldl rl
zfhrnwf ?r 5>ft $ . . . .  (rt^^p t) . .
trqv^ft 3H?Tt *ft I ?TT 5TT ?ITT CC4̂ ^  
aft <t>54l eft JJ5T *TT
sp^TT 'TfTIT I % f?TtJ ^
f^TT f% rrxf3Rfr ̂ ft # 3T^ft T̂RTTcTT ^ I
■̂fgpT X(S( vjft ^  ^  T^T ^ 'TH >̂t fftr ?t

gPrtr i w  ^mr ^ tt | frrra
zfrsnrmt ^  U c w  tfhnmr ?Reft f  
5̂T % c^TR If I ?7T % ^PT ?pt *T?fEr | 

tttt *iT?r i *nrr Tt r̂ tn^ ^t eft sr̂ ftT 
’Ft ft eft eft ^  5Ft

vjR^ W 3ft «fFd SRT MTt T̂cft 
I  tJTf ?Ft f?TT?T sncTT I  I
eft 9TT9X iTTT *̂T;31 411*̂*1 I CT̂T fTFT eft
srnr % tnr^RTt % t T’s  ^  . . .  i (ezr^trR) 

*̂t «^*T> SWT : eft̂ T *TR jft̂ r«s cs
jf^t ^ft i HTrr *t jf r w  f?rt | i



Govt, of CHAITRA 17, 1899 (SA K A ) Union Territories 158
(Am dt.) Bill

| l  1

*\ O
«ft I ITjp HT5T % fat*,

*At  fa* flfft S îT cffa T̂T5T % falj I

*ft *TPJ TW : WIT+I <WH ^
^  1 v>»Niif «fV ^fr ?f *fft

?TTH % iMI+i Wl^<; ^  !^+<.
* tft *nr 1 («ymn*r)

|T f a  <t N- ^ H  if)mii im ®FT̂ ft ff i f l r
HH t(M *̂t 'TR' *f)'>HN 3TT
T| f  I 33% STT? 5 *ft fTR t Eft̂ pTT? 

I S?T ̂ T 6 T̂FT WT HTT sf^T
w  ^ n <?tsi ®tt f a  m m ?nw zft^mr 
% fair TT̂ t tT fwt<M nV sr?W  

W &  5f, Afl'jHi,wT “Ft 'tiisH'H W7 ^ t  Jf wtr 
■̂ •̂ 1 *t f*H?T STM ^ I ^  HVT
IH^T STffiT I  I q'fjpTI <TT sft # T  *TH *ft 
îPT f?>TT | ^  ?>4 HTST 3flT 'W? 3|TcIT 

I  STTfaft HFT ^  qr T TT 5H7 fan ̂ c\
WTrTT|l SPR ?TC? % HTCt
^ jf r  *Pt sffa t<T TJTt % 
f^nr f^'T smr eft qt^ *rrsr ^  f̂r̂ r̂ TT
6 *rr?r *f ?TE®y $t ^r^ft | 1
(aq*%rw) 1

#  ^f.cT TOcTT % HT«T ’T'T'TT

=5tt^tt j> fa  sn rr *rt irfhft srti 
jfarct ftjmff | fa*r% fair 5qrq-% ^  
STFT ^T 'ftfw? ITPTT ?f 5PTT im
^5TR 10  % 1 2  ?rr t  ir ^  ?

eft ^?T 5FRTT fT  STPT ^TT ^M+|<
I d ^  5TTT tii<?i 

Ti  HTJI^T ZThFTTVt^rR^r 5HTT 
?r-t>TT w\t  srrfeft ?n̂ r if ^?fat ^t t

?r îf I wf^nr t  WTpT fa  T̂FT TT3T- 
1IR1 % i w  tf R trt I 5 3PT  ̂ 6 

fTR1 '>FÎ  f  I *FR T̂PT

W R t f a r ’TNr m w  |  ?ft ^ T
f a  <rw ^ Tr^ 4 tfd »  x m m  t

ft 5T^t ^ i^d i f a  VRT T O H  V^V
«rt ^  q r  #  1 (w nw m ) t  ^  
t p f f r s i f r ^  ^ r ^ T T f a t w ' m n r
<!^<rf ^  fa^TT ^  I 7 *1̂ 1% vft VPT̂ " 
WR ^  1 ^  f  faT 4 ?f\T *T̂STf ?f Vtf 

*î l *T?% TOT ^ I « ( in % ^1? 

ftwrr ?n% ?f 5HT 3TRTT |  I *% W«T̂  

9rT T t ^ftrTTf + 7 i |I  m  HH49H 5f ^FTT I 

5 W fail ft 5|rT T O 1T % HT*T ?TPT? falCT  

1 ft* *MN 6 HT̂ T fT 
V̂fatT I ^TK 5f jptf ^  Rff

«Tf%^raT|i ?nTT5nTr%'ft®5rff 

5f TT3RV%T dl^n  ̂ Wt ^TT * f ^  %

5 T ?  t f t  ^ T R T  W ? T T  Js T l i  ^  H  H ^ l  

J5TTT faT % ^  ylrl+< m  |  I
^ r f a q ; J r f t s r r T # s ) T ^ r t  f a s r r r ^ r  <t t

TJ^rrf % r ^ K  %( T TT5T-

^ t  q-fT 1 srrT 6 Hr t 
T^fTT W  T R ’T TRT T I
3T--rTT TTff ^TTTT-TT'Tf T̂T f t  ST«®T 

5RTT TSTT I WTq HTW ^

fa ?TFT <TT iI^Trf % HPT fa^TT 
^  I

) : *T*TT-
qf?r, %v r . ?t ir t  f t  firar aft art r̂

^ f , ^ r ^ 5 r n f w p  ^ 5 % ^  ^r^Tcr 

R fr 1 1 f a f t a t  ^ r  t  

srtr ^ tr̂ r ?r̂  qgr R|f fam ^ r fa fr

IT ^T€T V t T t f  WTcT f t  ?flT \?r

t̂tt f̂t t  && m *  fe r  if sTR̂ r ift $ i

*1̂ 11 *i(5 ? rm  ?ptt $ f a
TNr M ^*t iftSFTT ^TT *̂T% r̂ ^ I ̂

q* m*r % fair srk stct ferr 
arm 1 w w ctt i  f a  «rt ?«•
ctt^  w t ?fa f^ rr  w  |  f a  5 r̂r̂ r ^ t  5r?r 

6 ?FT fan 3rr? 1 «rnr¥t stt ^«r>



159 Govt, of APRIL 7, 1977 Union Territories (Am dt.) Bill 160

«ft3RT «ft, 1% 1 9 6 9  ^  1 9 7 4  

■3^% ?tpi% 41'Jin i cT®nrt

*f 2 H R  *fT 5V S fk  K W l JTtlRT

1 9 7 6  if  ? T R § f  I 5PIT STPT ^  W

enr? |  ew  5ft ^  7 h m  ^ t t

f=r>*T ^TT W W  ^  ?PTT fll'jIHI 5 +lM 

^ rff n i i i  HTH if  5PT5Tt sft'jRT 

^T T f |  I 5TTT IT? = ^ t  f
f% 5 ^rt^RT SHif ?ftT

<jt <t  1 g q  ^r?ff t s  ^rr ift^TT if

•' r (TT r;jff CTTW | ,  fa^T

f.i i^ ic i  eir 4  srRsmq-.rrr t̂ t o r t t

^  t t r ^ t  ^  t t

7  HT?f sft 21T ^rt I  ^  ^rff TTT5T5 1% f w t  

JIT 7 HTH |  I ^ r fr  7 ?jTsr

t ^ t  sTKrt h j t s r  f  Hr f?;^ « h f t  jtt 
9 SFTT ff fft —  m i  =TTcf f f  ?

$  SHFHT g %  s*T ^  % fft rT if

3fR sr^TfT t  I ^ r  f  ?T *T
^  f a m  «n, i?T fH  s t s t r

I

: SFcIR 5TF^T p T  

“f% s t w  w r  trfyf^Fnr

1 9<s3 ^ t  s t r  h o t t e r  31% 

f« r« q ^  q-?; f a ^ R  fo q r  *ttit 1”

The motion was adopted .

WjjteS : 5R f  q̂ TRT 2 TT 
V S  *R  * R T R  % HSttER T̂rTT jf —

Clause 2— (A m e n d m e n t  of section 5).

Amendment made:

Pages 1 and 2,—

for lines 8 to 15 and lines 1 and 2 
respectively, substitute—

‘Provided fu rther th a t the provi-
sions of this section shall, in relation 
to the Legislative Assemblies of the 
Union territories of Goa, Dam an 
and Diu and Mizoram,, in existence 
on the 7th day of February, 1977, 
apply as if for the words “five 
years”, in the two places w here 
they occur, the words “five years 
and seven m onths” had been substi-
tu ted / (3).

(Chaudhuri Charan S in g h )

snrrcfa : s p r  jt ?  |  f% ^ m r
2 HSTtfSR ¥ 7  iT f N f ^  *PT ?R  I

The motion was adopted .

Clause 2, as am ended , was added to 
the Bill.

f l ^ n q f a s f ^ r r a

3 ? R  3% i

The motion was adopted.

Clause 3 was added to the Bill.

HWtfrT : SHR' |  f% T̂̂TTST

i, ^ i r f ^ r  . sfR r r ^ r  f?r
% !R  |

The motion was adopted .

Clause 1, the Enacting Formula and  
the Title was added to the Bill.

Tftspft fa ?  : t  SFcTR f  :

"f% ^  off? H5ftf£R n

t  q w  f^qr i ’’

* n n q fa  : sr^r |  :

“f^r #?nfarr ,^q

i qTH f ^ n  r̂nT i

The motion  was adopted.


