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four teams of A. F . C . and Bank 
officers to visit the cyclone affected 
districts of the State. The teams 
were also represented by officer;; 
from the concerned Departments of 
State Government and State Coopera-
tive Bank. The teams have since 
submitted their report. They have 
recommended, among other things, 
conversion of short-term loan to 

'medium-term loan, reschedulinn of 
term loan, opening of camp br~~ches 
by Banks to dispose of appli('cltions 
for 1979 kharif loans, etc. ARDC is 
being reQuested to give loans on soft 
terms. These steps will help in re-
habilitation of farmers in the affected 
areas. 

Any action taken by the Central 
Government is inadequate if the 
State Government does not come 
forward to meet the challenge lm-
pos('d by such calamities. I must say 
that the State Go\'ernments have 
acted promptly to meet the situation. 
I express my appreciation of the 
efforts made py them. 

I would also like to record a note 
of appreciation for the a$sistance 
given by the Members of the Armed 
forces in giving relief to the cyclone 
victims. The Army and Air Force 
did a splendid job in reaching the 
marooned villages and air droping 
:!ood, providing medical supplies and 
medical aid in adverse conditio!"s. We 
are indeed very grateful to them. 

Any efforts by the State and 
Central Governments cannot succeed 
unleSs there is a spontaneou~ res-
ponse from the people and other 
voluntary organisations engaged 
in relief work. I would like to e.\(-
press my appreciation for the forti-
tude and courage shown by the people 
at the affected areas in facing the 
calamity. I hope and pray that they 
will be resettled soon in their normal 
vocations and wil Ibe able to over-
come the tragedy which has befallen 
them. 

SHRI p, VENKATASUBBAIAH 
(Nandyal): Sir, this cyclone hal caWied 

.16 377 
greater havoc than the previous cyc-
lone and tho!,sands of acres have 
become unit for cultivation, These 
recurrent cyclones. are more devasta-
ting in that part of Andhra Pradesh. 
Th" State Government has proposed 
to construct a wall as a preventive 
measure So that these areas will not 
get damaged from time to time, 
whenever there is a cyclon~. This 
involves expenditure, and they have 
approached the Central Governmen~ 
for adequate financial assistance to 
prc\'ent these areas from getting 
damaged by the effect of such cyc-
lones. They have asked fOr more 
funds. I would like to know whether 
such a request has come. 

SHRr JYOTIRMOY BOSU (Diamon& 
Harbour): Sir, a caSe has b~en made 
out by the Tobacco Board . , . 

MR. SPEAKER: Now We take up 
Statements under Rule 377. 

SHRI JYOTIRMOY BOSU: I will 
take only half a minute.-

MR. SPEAKER: No, I am not 
allowing it. 

12.42 hrs. 

MATTERS UNDER RULE 377 

(i) REPORTED SHORTAGE OF POSTAL STA-
TIONERY AND STAMPS IN AGRA DISTRICT 
AND REFUSAL BY BANKS IN AGRA TO 
ACCEPT CURRENCY NOTES OF LOWER 

DENOMINATIONS. 

SHRI SHAMBU NATH CHA TUR-
VEDI (Agra): I wish to mention the 
following matter of urgent public 
importance. 

There is virtual famine of posta~ 

stationery and stamps in the Agra 
District and elsewhere because of 
which the public is very much exas-
perated and business is coming almost 
to a standstill, Envelopes and inland 
letters had been in short supply-
virtually non-available-for the last 
four months. Postcards fOllowed suit 




