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SHRI HARI VISHNU KAMATH:
Is the position now that you have
neither withheld your consent nor
given your consent? Is it Hanging
Jfre?

MR. SPRAKER: [ have not refused:
it is under consideration,

PROF. DILIP CHAKRAVARTY
(Cealcutta South): About the submis-
sion I made before you, when do I get
your permission to raise the issue?

» MR. SPEAKER: I don't know why
everybody wants to make himself
felt in the House'

PROF. DILIP CHAKRAVARTY: 1
tried to contact you yesterday wand
day before you can ask your bearer
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MR. SPEAKER' Everybody who
Gives 3 question has g right to ralse
% in the House, is it? Every ques-

CHAITRA 17, 1900’ (SAKA)

Papers Laid 266

tion is being considered in accord-
ance with the rules. If you have any
doubt about it, you can come and
discuss. After putting a question you
cannot again raise the matter here.
I don't know whether you are a new
Member or an old one, but if your
question has not been selected, it may
be that the ballo{ has not favoured
you. Or if it has not been admitted,
you will be informed. We can dls-
cubs this, but it should not be rajsed
in the House.

SHRI SHYAMNANDAN MISHRA:
Sir, I would ke to know whether
you have given any tune to the
Editor within which he should sub-
mt hig explanation.

MR SPEAKER: ] have said ‘Im-
mediately’.

SHR] SHYAMNANDAN MISHRA:
That 15, by Monday.. .

MR. SPEAKER: If we don't get jt
by Monday, we will see. But I am
sure we will be getting it before
Monday

12.14 hrs.

PAPERS LAID ON THE TABLE—
Contd. .

SHRI K P UNNIKRISHNAN
(Badagara): Sir, regarding Item No
3(2) (i) and (n), this should have
come before Parliament, as was the
normm] practice, in the last July
session itself because these accounts
relagte to the year 1975-76. Now, here
he comes before the House even with-
out a statement of ressoms for the
delay. This has become the normal
practice in this House and I am sorry
you are permitting it instead of ask-
ing him to produce the reasons for
the delay. This House cannot be
taken for granted like ¢this. This has
become the normal feature here:
they bring forward any sccount vela-
ting to any period and without even
a statement explaining the reasons
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{Shri X. P. Unnikrishnan]
for the delay. And you are permit-

ting it to be lid on the Table of the
House. I want a ruling on this,

MR. SPEAKER: Why have you not
given the reasons?

]
:
:
:

§ wrgw WX o fr wEd wemEr W
ot ok fex &1 a4

MR. SPEAKER: Even if that is go.

Wt fewa yore wegdwr : (sfm
) oo oft, g @ e
e wia # arm # oft § & wow
faanr ® A w@ £

MR. SPEAKER: Why don't you
waijt till I finish? 1 was putting a
question to the Mimster. Would you
not allow me to do that? Should
your question have a priority over
mine?

Mr. Minister, even if that is so,
under the rules you must give an
explanation. I do not know whether
your reason ig good or bad; even if
you have good reason, you must give
an explanation.

o ufes @ & wwe favyw
e §, s Quferay g s ww
AR § A GO Y W
w)

MR. SPEAKER: Mr. Unnikrishnan,
whenever you want to raise any such

objection, you must send me potice
earlier.
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SHRI K. P. UNNIKRISHNAN: But
please do direct the Minister.. .
(Interruptions)

SHRI KANWAR LAL GUPTA
(Delhi Sadar): My friend, Shsi
Unniknishnan, raised this question
and you made an observation
on that. You have made thig obeerva-
tion many times on this issue. The
rule for thig is and we have made
recommendations many times that
along with the audit report, the re-
view ghould come and the reasons
for delay, 1f any, should come. We
have given this recommendation not.
once, but at feast ten times, to every
department of the Government, but
In spite of this, neither the review
comes nor the reasons for delay come
and the delay sometimes is for five-
six years. My submission is that you
may kindly direct the Government,
not only this Mimistry. This happens
with every Ministry. We have ot of
files on this matter and our difficulty
18 how to dispose them of.

MR. SPEAKER: A number of times,
I have directeq them in the House.

SHRI KANWAR LAL GUPTA:
They even do not read the recom-
mendations of the Committee,

st fawm gore wogwe : asaw N,
& ¥ ot wgr wr fr gieT O wg
win ¢ fe et v Y w61
figrtt w1 =27 Wy oy <t v § anfr
fely wiw o @ o1 WA i W
e agt wft § vefed o, ¢ whik
30 g I & A oW ) e
% WRT XY % afe Wl w&Ee
ag §f W wEr € ¥

ot vw wedw fag (fwaiw) ¢
waw W, Au ow firder § fir e
T ww o fod o grew
agw O wifgd | wifs oar ol
¥ wg ¥ fF wrer wREET Wi
ot foi¥d oy &7 ot | afew g
¥ agm ¥ et o ot o v oY



269 Papers Laid

t & aufdid & war fomr gur §)
ot & wigw ¢ fir sa o ¢ wga
ST T AT K e ¥ W oW
fex & wgw wr atr wear § X Fowy
184 & wx AMfew WY feur

MR. SPEAKER: Mr. Singh, you
seem not to know the rules. You can
give u motion under Rule 184, you
can give a motion under Rule 193;
You cannot jump up and speak.

Wl W wwdnfeg : frm 184

¥ ¥ ifen fam A\ G A i
I¥ 9T ¥FF FEA ¥ FAAN WY Ww
Tq ¥ Aredt w1 WY wAT G X
FTHT FAIFL FAT ¥ fro war
4

MR. SPEAKER: Do not record.
(Interruptions)**

ACCOUNTS AND AUDIT REPORT OF TEX-
TILES COMMITTER, BOoMBAY FOR 1976-77,
REVIEW ON THE WORKING AND ANNUAL
REPORT OF HANDICRAFTS AND HAND-
LOOMS ExPORTS CORPORATION FOR
1975-78 &1c,

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN
THE MINISTRY OF COMMERCE
AND CIVIL SUPPLIES AND CO.
OPERATION (SHRI ARIF BEG): 1
beg to lay en the Table:—

(1) A copy of the Certified Ac-
counts (Hind: and Baglish versions)
of the Textiles Commuittee, Bombay,
for the year 1976-77 and the Audit
Report thereon, under sub-section
(4) of section 13 of the Textiles
Committes Act, 1963, [Placed in
Library. See No. LT-2080/781.

(2) A copy each of the following
papers (Hindi and English ver-
sions) under sub-section (1) of
section 619 A of the Companies
Act, 1956: —
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(i) Review by the Government
on the working of the Handi-
crafts and Handlooms Exports
Corporation of India Limited,
New Delhi, for the year 1875-78.

(ii) Annua] Report of the
Handicrafts and Handlooms Ex-
ports Corporation of India Limit-
ed, New Delhi, for the year
1975-76 along with the Audited
Accounts and the comments of
the Comptroller and Auditor
General thereon. [Placed in Lib-
rary. See No, LT-2031/78].

(8) A ‘Corrigendum’ to the Certi-
fied Accounts® of the Textiles Com-
mittee, Bombay, for the year
1975-78. [Placed in Library. See
No. LT-2032/78].

(4) A statement (1) correcting
the reply given on the 16th Decem-
ber, 1977 to supplementary ques-
tions by Dr. Vasant Kumar Pandit
and Shr) Shiv Sampati Ram on
Starreq Question No. 453 regarding
closure of Bone Mills and (ii) given
reasons for delay in correcting the
reply. [Placed in Library See No.
LT-2033/78].

SOLVENT EXTRACTED OIL DE-OILED MEAL
AND EprBLz FLOUR (CONTROL) AMEND-
MENT ORDER, 1978

atfowy wen amfows ofer ot wy-
wifem swrwg # Tow Wt (ot gowr
wnTe viaw): & uranas weq wiutem,
1955 #t &1 3 *Y I9ETq (6) ¥
vty faemae freafea dw, dorfier
Ao i g ser (fdaw) @nes
oW, 1978 (feedY oy ot gewm )
® o% afq a1 s T war § W
fawiw 18 wTY, 1978 & wiw & qwmw
| % whageem dwn aoatofto 177(¥)
% sl tar g &v )
[Placed in Library., See No. LT-
2034/78].

**Not recorded.

*The Accounts were laid on the
Teble on the 15th July, 1977.



