
~ ·14. .. (M&t) , •. QfwW) 

~ 1' lfrM ifi' 'l'M ii i1~ ~ ~ ~  

~ l~ i ~ i  Cfi1 'lfo ~ ftrq: ~~ 
i ~ ~ (if , ~ ~ I s:; ~ ~  if S:ff 
fari=f 'lfr fqofrcr ifi .... ~i  ~ 1 ~  R{i ctf'r 
~ ,  :q-rq ?f\lzif ~ ~ ~~~  it 

~ ~~ i  ifi t ~ ~ ~ l ~ ~ e i  i~ 

l ~ ~ ~  lfTrr.f ~ i 1  il ~  

~  ~ 1 1~ \3''1·-if ~, ~~ ,  ctn•rtr 

~ Cf?i' ~l  ~ l il f;;it lj\Sff ~ 
~ . 
~  'fl 1 ~ l~ ~  ~ I \3'.;clfr 

1ft'1:r q'"( 'QT-n' ;;{f tf1? ;;i ~  I 

1 ~ ijm-~ itr ~ n it6.: iim lfr 
'Ar,· i ~ li~  tt ~ i n ~ ?.f' l ~~ 

CFT ~i i ~ trr mr.f't.:r ;; i ~~ ~1 1 

. ~ ~  ~~1  liITT ~ i ~ ~~  :q1r 

it t tlll' l:f fr. ~~  tir ~~ ,  

l'f7 ~~  ~ ~  ~ , ~i  

irlli tF trg: i ,~ <1ir.rr crrr ~~  t 
1.fTl ~  B ~ 'Qf;r.r ~  ~i ~  ~ fcn 
9;4'N ~ ,~ i iifiT ~  ~  ~~ 

~ I q"To f!:'io ::;r)o ~  Cifi'f i:tT+r.:;r 

~~  ~ I ~~~ 1 if. \jfl er.i:r-\ifl·,,·, 
~ l  1~, «mITT ~ ga 1  ~ 1ie£:.ri 
~  ~ ~  ~ f;,i:t ~ ~~  74ff 

~  ~  1 ~  ~~l i ~ S'Q'i t. 
i ~ li a ~  ~  ~  ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ 

~  i ~ ~  ~ ~~ ~  ir.r,: ~, 
~  tr.;f\3l', l 1~, ~  ;;;rr•·r ~  

Veil' ~~ fC(4·r tflfT ~ I ~ ~ le a  q",· 

4'l« ~~~~ f4' ~ l  ~ , 1 ~  t 
ifrfr, grrq<tft ifif tlU ~l  1 ~ ~ I 

~ ?fl' ~ ttlft ~ efi 'frrictft 

~i i  ~ ~  ~i  ~ fti'qr ~ I 

'(;:io ~  ~~1 ~ ~4  lli~  r:f tr &1 

"· ~~  t ift1' ~ B ~ vft ~1 ~~  q'7 

~a  'fft' t W\'T ~ ~ t ~ 

~  '(ftr.rr mm m ~ ~~ ~~il l 
~ 

if ~  i ~ l ~ ct\' """1 ~ 7(1' ~, 

ngardina 
Intftan e e~a hs 

(4th Arndt) l ~  (JO 

~  ~~~ t mm ctft .Wercrr 
1 ~ \if'r ~ ~, ~  ~ ~~ l  

~ \1f'T ~  t I 

9i ~  ~  i ~  Tt ~~ ~  

cil' ~  t 1 ~ m,,, "l:{tnr"{t ;r f q-vei·m 
-.;·ITT ct;•(fr ~ 1 '7rrfTw{l' Cfi1' \itfm ~ 
~~ n  ruq,i. Cfi'T ~  ctit ~ iii~~  
~ ITTH ~ e ~  ctiT ~~ Ti' i l~ 

·"·"') ~ I 

"'M' •·r:;rrftfd<fl' 73i11rrr ~ ~ l  ~ 

Clll ~ l  ~  ~~ ~ i 6, I l«<llT fi' 
fcrtii:l Cf. ,•-:rr ~ m;· ~h  i ~i  ~ 

f<li ~ 1 ~ trN q .. rfT.ffr ~ n'ITGfi ~il  

~  ~ ~  ~ Wiif ~ fcti ~~l  ~ i  

ij G'' ~ i l  ~  C\l ~ll  ~  ~ I 

17 .08 hrl!f. 

MOTION RE: MODIFICATIONS IN 
NOTIFICATION REGARDING 
INDIAN TELEGRAPHS ( 4TH 
AMENDME·NT) RULES 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Now, we will 
take up item No. 13 of the List of 
Business. Mr. R. K. Mhalgi may 
move his Motion. 

SHRI R. K. MHALGJ (Thane): I 
beg to move: 

"That this Ho\lSe rE*iolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section (5) of 
section 7 of the Indian Telegraph 
Act, 1885 (13 Of 1885), the follow-
in'g modifications be made in the 
Notification regarding 1l1Ddian Tele-
graphs (4th Ameruhnent) Rules, 
1Q80, published in the Gazette of 

t India by Notification No. G.S.R. 
f92(E) dated the 2-7th August, 
1~  a»d laid on the Table o'f the 



403 Modifications in. Notification 
regar,ding 

[Shri R. rt Mhalgi] 
House on the 17th e~~e ,  

1980:-

(i) in rule 1, in sub-rule (2), 
for '1980' substitute '1981'; 

(ii) in rule 2 (i),-

(a) in item (a), for· 'Rs. 
150/-' substitute 'Rs. 80/-'; 

(b) in item (b) for 'Rs. 75/-' 
substitute 'Rs. 40 j-'; 
(iii) in rule 2(ii),-

(a) in sub-sectio.:i (1) (a), for 
'Rs. 75/-' substitute 'Rs. 25 /-'; 

(b) in sub-section (1) (b), for 
'Rs. 150 /-' substitute 'Rs. 50/-'; 

(iv) in ~ le 2(iii),-

(a) against entry 1 .in 
columns 2. 3, 4, 5 and 6. for 
'Rs. 125' '250'. '30 Paise, '40 

Paise', '50 Paist..l, s-ubslitute 
'Rs. 75', 300', '20 Paise,' '30 
Paise', '40 Paise'. respectively; 

(b) against entry 2, in 
columns 2, 3, 4, 5 and ti, for 
'Rs. 150', '250', '30 Pai.se, '40 
Paise,' '50 Paise', substitute 
'Rs. 100', '300', '20 Paisc, '30 
Paise', '40 Paise', respectively; 

(c) against entry 3, in 
columns, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 for 
'Rs. 175' '250', '30 ~ise , 
'40 Paise', '50 Paise', substi-
tute 'Rs. 125', '300', '20 Paise', 
'30 Paise', '40 Paise' respec-
tively; 

(d) against entry 4, in 
columns 2 3, 4, 5 and 6, for 
'Rs. 200', ''250', '30 Paise', '40 
Paise', '50 Paise' substitute 
'Rs. 150', '300', '20 Paise', '30 
Paise'. '40 Paise', respectively; 

(v) in rule 2 (iv), 

Omit 'and the first 250 Calls 
will also be charged at the rate 
shown in column 4 of the table 
applicable to measured rate 

MAY 4, 1981 Indian Tdeltrapns 404 
(4th Amdt.) Rules (M) 

systems appearing in item (a) 
of s se ~i n . (1). of ee<:tioo 
. III'; 

(Vi) in rule 3, for '100', suosti-
tute '0.20'; 

(vii) in rule 4; for '50 Kms.' 
substitute '25 Kms.' 

This House do recommend to Rajya 
Sabha do concur in this resolution." 

*Sir, I move my motion listed at 
item No. 13 in the order paper for 
today, u.1der Rule 235 of the Rules 
of Procedure and Conduct of Busi-
ness in the Lok Sabha. 

In the budget of 1980, the tai:itf 
for telephones had been increased 
and the Finance Bill including the 
·proposal to increase the rates had 
been passed by the House. The pur-
pose Of my motion is to reduce the 
rates. 

I am aware that there is little 
likelihood of the rate5 being reduced 
as they have been approved by the 
House, but the members have the 
right to move amendments to the 
rules laid on the Table of the House. 
The purpose of my moving the 
motion is to initiate discussion on the 
subject of the rates. 

The rates for installation, shifting 
and trunk calls have been increased 
by the Telepho,1e Department. An 
amount of Rs. 17.71 crores was rea-
lised by the Government as a result 
of the increase. No body knew, how-
ever, about the increase because the 
Demands for Grants in respect ot the 
Ministry of Communications were 
never discussed in the House. The 
subscribers came to know of the in-
creases when they got the bills at the 
new enhanced rates. The Govern. 
ment would, of course, retort thiil the 
·increases had been gazetted but in 
order to be known to the people the 
new rates should have been widely 

•The origilnal speech was delivered. in Marathi. 



ModitlcfltiOBa iti. V AISAKHA 14, 1903 (SAKA> Indian Teze._ 
Notification -regarding graphs (4th. Amdt.) Rules (M) 

publicised in the press, particularly 
the district level newspapers. In 
future the e ~  shou1d take 
care to do it. 
The Ministry of Communicatio.ns 
demands came to be discussed in the 
House after many years and only iour 
hours were allotted to the discussion. 
Mr. Stephen's speech was mere1y a 
jumble of facts and figures leaving 
many questions unanswered. I would 
like to seek some clarifications about 
some of the point. 

The Government has a moral right 
to increase the telephone tariff only 
if they can ensurE' efficient .serYice, 
but that they an: unable to do. That 
ii:;: why they have no moral justifica-
tion for the increased rates. Mr. 
s~ he i h:.l'..! himself admitted that 
only 52 per cent of the calls actually 
matured. Why should the subscribers 
be bt1r<l0:wd with the charges for the 
rest Of the 48 per cent calls whic11 
never matured. The hon. ).'Iinis+('r 
cornparect the performance of tile 
tell•phonc· department with those of 
England ~  Jupun but incompkte 
comparisons arc not proper. 

A committee reported that more 
than 40 PPr cent of the calls v-:ere 
'wrong numb('rs'. The subscriber is 
charged for a wrong call even if he 
has dialled properly but has got a 
wrong number. In such cases a 
complaint is only natura1. 

Mr. Stephen had visited Bhuba-
neshwar after the Prime Ministers 
visit and inspected the working of 
the te1ephones there. He had to ad-
mit that the working of the tele-
phones was in a total mess That 
being so, there is little point. in in-
creasi!ng the rates. 

Some of the officers of the tele-
phone department at Calcutta, had 
stateri at . a press conference in Sep-
tember 1980 that "our bad name is 
largely due to our 0wn faults''. In ttle -
face of this admission, how can you 

expect the subscribers to accept the 
increased charges? 

I would like to know the step:-t 
that the .Government has taken to 
realise the arrears of telephone bills 
amounting ... to almost Rs. 30 crore.41. 
What steps have Government taken 
to realise arrears of telephone biHs 
from Ex.MPs? Corruption is t>ll 
the increase in this Department. ln 
the Andheri Excha.'1ge at Bombay, 
some calls were tampered with and 
12 subscribers did not pay a smgte 
naiya paise as telephone bill for 
many years. That shows that che em-
ployees are working in collusion with 
such dishonest person:::; who cheat tht! 
Government to its just dues. 

My intention is movbg the 111otion· 
i.;; more to secure a better i ~ 

than to reduce the revenues of ! l ~ 

Government. People must feel th<tt 
they are paying for an efficient <'1'· 
vice. 

Some times, the people are ;oreed 
to pay the inflated biils before their 
eomplaints arc r·1tertained It "NOlllcf 
haVP been tolerable he~ thp nri-
tisher:" were ruling us, tut ;r1ow 
when \VC have our own Goveru-
rnent. The complaints of the subs-
crihers mmt be r€'gistered and pro-
PPr action taken. It is wrong to pre-
s u rne that a 11 subscribers are i h~ 

some of them might find it difficult 
even to meet the normal rates, not 
to .speak of inflated bills Govern-· 
ment must pay proper attei.ntion to 
the needs of the rural subscribers. 

Government must take action 01?" 
the judgment of the Gujarat High· 
Court which stated inter alia: 

''Where bills show more Lhan 
thrice the number of maximum 
calls in a quarter, the Telephone· 
Department will have to is9Ue an 

ad hoc bills equal to the average 
of the preceding undisputed bills.'., 

The Task Force Committee had 
made many short-term and long-term 



..40'1 M i l a ~ in a~ 11  

ffuardw'f. 

•Sha a K. Mahal&iJ 
recommendations, but we do not know 
what action has been taken by the 
Government in that regard. I hope 
that the Government would say what 
they plan to do about them. .,. 
.The employees do not give court-

. t}OUS and polite service. Tile subs-
cribers pay for the service and they 
must get it. 

Only 5 per cent of the telephones 
are in the rural areas: the propor-
ti.on should be increased by provid-
ing a better telephone network for 
then1. 

An early decision must be taken 
about the e1ertronic equipment for 
t.he telephones. Mr. Stephen has said 
that this is a decade of the break-
through. The Electronics Department 
on the other hand has expressed 
dissatisfaction with the 'vorking of 
the Telephone Department. 

The ail a ~  Oil and Natural 
Ga::;, Indian Oil Corportion the State 
Electricity Boards, the Police and 
the Aviation Department have de-
cided not to import any foreign 
equipment during the Sixth Phw1 
period, but the Communications Min-
istry proposes to import telephonic 
equipment of the order of Rs. 343 
crores. That would only impose :1 
fresh burden on the subscribers and 
they would not be pleased to bear 
any fresh burdens. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Motion moved: 

"That this House resolves that 
in pursuance of sub-section ( 5) o'f 
section 7 of the Indian Telegraph 
Act, 1885 (13 of 1885), the follow-
ing modifications be made in the 
Notification regarding Indian Tele-
graphs (4th Amendment) Rules. 
1980, published in the Gazette of 
India by Notification No. G.S.R. 
492(E) dated the 27th August, 1980 
, and laid on the Table of the n~e 

·on the 17th November. 1980:-

(i) in rule 1 in sub-rule (2), 
for '1980' substitute '1981'; 

lf.AY t. litl lndiff,n l ~ 
( 4 ~ A"144) .R'41" (.V) 

Ui) ill r\11& 2(i)-

(a) in item (a), for 'Rs. 
150/-' substitute 'Rs. 80/-'; 

(b) in item (b), for 'Rs. 
75/-' substitute 'Rs. 40/-'; 

(iii) in rule 2(ii),-

(a) in sub-section (1) (a), for 
'Rs. 75/-' substitute 'Rs. 25/-'; 

(b) in sub-section (1) (b), for 
'Rs. 150/-' substitute 'Rs. 50/-'; 

(iv) in i·ule 2(iii),-

(a) against en try 1, in 
columns 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6, for 
'Rs. 125' '250', '30 Paise', '40 
Paise', '50 Paise', substituted 
'Rs. 75', '300', '20 Paise', '30 
Paise', '40 Paise' respeetivC>ly; 

(b) against entrv 2 in 
columns 2, 3. 4, 5 and (i·. for 

'Rs. 150', '250', '30 Paise. '40 
Paise', 50 Paise', substitute 
·Rs. 100', '30(J, '20 Pais-e'. 'JO 
Paise',, '40 Paise'. respectively; 

(c) against entry :i in 
columns, 2, 3, 4, 5 anu 6 for 
'Rs. 175', '250' '30 ais~  '40 
Paise', '50 ~ise , substitute 
'Rs. 125', '300' '20 Paise', '30 
Paise', '40 ah~  respectively; 

(d) against en1rv 4, in 
columns 2, 3 4. 5 a Lt l 6, ior 
'Rs. 200', '250', '30 Paise', '40 
Paise' '50 Paise', substitute 
'Rs. i50', '300', '20 Paise', '30 
Paise'. '40 ~ise  respectively; 

(V) in rule 2(iv),-

omit 'and the first 250 calls 
will also be cbar.ged at the rate 
shown in column 4 of the table 
applicable to measured rate 
systems appear.Ung in item (a) 
of sub-section (1) of section 
III'; 

(vi) in rule 3, for '100' sub.ti• 
tute '0.20'; 



(\l'U) ln rule 4, tor '50 Kms.' 
sttb»titute '25 Km.-;,' 

This House do recommend to 
Rajya Sabha that ltajya Sabha do 
concur in this resolution.'' 

SlilU tE. BALANANDAN (Mukunda-
puram) : I support this MQt:on. While 
supporting it, I want to invite the 
attention of the Minister to certain 
points. 

This is a Ministry which is be'.ng 
criticized by one and all, on many 
counts. After this Minister took charge 
of this Department, I expected that 
the experience that be has had with 
the labourers would stand him in 

good stead. In this Department, there 
are lakhs and lakhs of workers. 

In order to improve the efficiency 
ot this Department, the Minister has 
to rely mainly on 2 or 3 things. One i.s 
€quipment. The equipment should be 
modern and uptodate. For that pur-
pose, proper maintenance and L'pkeep 
are necessary. Another important 
factor is the people who work in 1he 
Department. They should be kept con-
tented and sat'sfied, so that their 
efficidency can be exploited to the 
maximum. Even, then, in a country 
like India many kinds of difficulties 
will arise. I do agree that many diffi-
culties will ar:se in such a Depart-
ment. But here, after our prei::-eut 
Minister has ta'ken charge of the De-
partment, everybody-from the Prime 
Minister downwards--has got a com-
plaint. 

With regard to the technical ques-
tion, my friend has put forth one 
main point, viz. that we will have to 
go in for modern equipment. Agreed. 
But on whom are you going to rely 
for that? We are now relying on im-
ports alone. I am not saying that im· 
porls should be stopped immediately. 
:But what sh<lu1d be the emphasis? 
'I'he emphasis should be on the point 
tb!it !n6igenous · production should he 
he'lped. 

'i'llr.oullil his Mot.fun Mr. Mhalgl 
want8 fie .-.dace .file rates. Teohnically, 
we cSlloot pass a .resolution for redu· 
c'.ng them. I knaw. But this opportu-
nity is .being taken to say something 
·about the Department. Sa, I want to 
tell the Miniater that for making the 
@<luipment uptodate, whatever indi· 
get!ous 9kiU b; there, should be used 
to the mHtiimum. Relaying on impol."ts 
should be reduc.:ed to the min;mum. 
ThG second point is with regard i11 the 
approaeh t0 the workers. I k·m .v 
something is being done. I am nd 

blaming the Min~s e  f-01· everyth>1g, 
But there is a norm fixed by the De-
partmc-:-:t for everything. But :h1:) 
Department is not giving people on 
the basis of those norms. In c>edain 
placec;, they are appointing people on 
hourly basis. In India, even wi•.hout 

any payment people w·n come for· 

ward to work, if there is hope that 
employment will be given after 15 or 
20 years. But that is not a 1'1odern-
a pproarh. So, the Minister should dis· 
cuss the problem of efficiency, with 
the trade unions in a proper marmer. 
For that purpose, the Department 
should keep its word with regard to 
the exist 'ng norms agreed to e ~ll 

the management and the worket,e. 

h~n the efficiency question can bf: 
discussed with the workers and S(!me 
solution can be found out. In en 1 l~  

a'S you know, the demands for tele-
phone rf)nnections are on the high 
side. So many thousands of le n ~ 

are ttiere. Naturally. everybody wants 
to have an automatic equipment 
which is not there in stock. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: How can you 

bring in these things? 

SHRI E. BALANANDAN: l atn told 
we are having some manual excha!lges 
there in Kerala circle. If you estab-
lish those exchanges som.ewheret then 
this burden can be reduced to a cer-
tain exten1:. 1 request the hOll.. Minis· 
·ter through you to consider tht:se 

points also. 



Moditications in. Notification 
N otifica.tion regarding 

·MAY ~ 1981 1-nditni i'.-le1(Ta.pht 
c 4th Amdt.) ·autea (M} 

THE .MINISTER OF COMMUNICA· 
--:1:10NS (SHRI C. M. STEPHEN): My 
very valued friend Mr. Mhalgi and 
· 'Mr. Balan:mdan sought to stage ano-
ther budget debate under the guise of 
.this resolut ·an. As I said on the pre-
vll..,us occasion, we had a fulfledged 
i~ nssi n  N ! aspects were gone into 
.and no aspect concerning this matter 
was allowed to go in default and I 
'nH rt replied it also. 

PHOF. N. G. RANGA (Guntur>: 
·-r ou rongratulate him for having ta-
J.\en a detailed notice of the Notitlca• 

l on. 

SURI C. M STEPHEN: That is right. 
1 ~ l e \.vith my v0ry elder brother that 
'N._· rnust n~ a 1a1e them for having 
1 ak~ n note of a iii ~ , n whieh was 
· ioirl on the TabJc of the House which 
~ l al  goes urnotirc<l. If only all 
the memb0rs hw1 tnken this mnch of 
n~e es  in this, I think the position of 
'!h'.? Dcpar1.mN1t co,_1:d have impro.,·ed 

~ nsi e a l  I mu:;t congrntulate 
him, co!11pliment him and thank him 
also for this. But the scope of the 
~i n is absolutely limitE>c1. Man;-.· of 
the matters which were mentioned I 
have already ;;inswcred. I do not want 
~ o cover the \vhole ground. It is ahsol-
• 1tely limited. We had issuetl a Notiflc-

a:ttion on 1-9-1980 which was placed on 
the T<-thle of the House. This had 3-4 
·:;;edions. One was about the insta11v.-
1 ions charges. The other was about 
the ~hi ing charges. We :had increased 
the rate of charges. There were cer-
tain other sections. Mr. Mhalgi has not 
attaeked every part of it. It is not as 
11 the entire Notificrition has been 
t.•hallenged by him. Those areas where 
"Ne have increased the calling rates, 
rhat he has left completely nnchal-
.il:.'nged. Therefore, all the arguments 
that he bas now put forward fall 
i o the ground because that part 
which he has approved, he docs not 
. \;:ant to un do it. This is the simple 
part of it. 

·SHRI G. M. BANATWALLA (Pon-
nani): Do not capitalise on small slips 
hy members. 

SHRI C. M. STE!P'°.tiEN: On 1-6-1979, 
what that time when Mr. Mhalgis :Par-
ty \". -: s in power-you had notified 
certain matters. Now he wants to go 
beyond that. Certain grades which 
were prescribed on 1-6-1979 were in 
force on 1-9-1980. For example, upto 
l-fH980, for ins .. ~ la l n charges in an 
exchange a particular capacity the ren· 
'I.al was Rs. 100. He wants to red.ice 
it to Rs. 80. This is not mine. It was 
ther·e earlier. He wants to go back on 
ih,11 in the cctse of every one of these. 
E<.1rlier for casual conection, the instal-
l,itioJl. ch,tr;es w1::'rc ns. ;10. Not the one 
I h:1d brought about. He wants to go 
!1::ick ;:i:J.d make it RS. 40. For shifting 
it w::s Rs. :10 and he wants to make 
it to Rs. 25. Before L1 all the other 
cases of shiit:ng from one .position to 
1 i ~he , it was Rs. 100. He wants to 
m:il"(' it to Rs. 50. Tl"l.eicfore, the 
attud\: of the motiO!l is not against my 
Notification. the attaC'Ji:: of the motion 
is against the Kotiiicaiion that was 
placed on the Table of h~ House bv thf' 
the,1 .'.\linister at th:lt time. He. i~ 
nt1addn;; on that two years after. He 
want:; to go back on that. This is the 
simple thing about it. 

Iv1R. CHAIRMAN: Perhaps he could 
not do lt at th:1t time. 

SI!Rr C. lVL STEPHEN: He has shown 
orw act of grace: assuming that he 
c<;mcs back to this, he wnnts the date 
of th(.• liuplementat' on to be not 1980 
but 1931. He wants to take it back to 
25, 50. 6D and all that. He is very grace-
fu}}y telling me. 4Do not implement 
from 1~9 198  This reduced mass rate 
must come into fol·ce only from 
1.9.1981.' This is what he has said. 
Now, then I will certainly support the 
proposition of his that the effective 
date> should be from 1.9.1981. 

.... (Interruptions) 

SHRI R. K. MHALGI: You do not 
fo11ow the intention of the motion 
itself. 

SHRI C, M. STEPHEN: You &re a 
well intentioned man. Have I ever 
doubted it? He has raised certain 
points. One or two I will just men-
tion about. He spoke libout 



the electronics Ministry's state-
ment. The Electronics Ministry 
has stated certain facts, namely that 
the production was not built up, pro-
duction slumped in the last four or five 
years. As a result o,t-~ha  import has 
become necessary. Conversion of the 
electronic system was not accepted in 
the course of the last period. There-
fore, 1his import has become necessary. 
What I havn done is. what was kept 
undecided, for such a long time, I have 
1 aken a deC'ision, :steps a.re being taken. 

~ i n of the Rae Bareli unit was 
~heh e  I have taken a decision. The 
\·xpansion s1art now. The building is 
~ a ing  The work is beginning. The 
d\'ctronic question \Vas shelved. I 
ha ~ 1:·1:en a decision that one million 
lines must 1Je proclucccl ev1. .. ·y year. 
W c have issued global tenders and two 
ia1'1 c.r;' .. ~ \\ i1l be sci up. The Chairman 
is smiling with B~ es a  in his 
m;nrl pro!:iably. I know. Anyway, we 
havt· stnrt('d this proC'ess Whatever 
was sheh·cd is strirt0d. As a result of 
1 be sh('.h·ing we are now force:-1 to imp-
ort. Whatevf•:· ;;;hE'lYing \V<ts done in 
1he co:lfse of h~ la.:.t four or five years 
for the major pnrt of \Vhich period Mr. 
Mhalgi must Cllso share i'csponsihility. 
I ha ~ united it, decisions arc ak ~n  

step:; a ~ being tnken. the things ha ~  
started m.uving. There is no question 
of indecision ns far <is we are con-
cerned. Nov;, the supply is not able to 
· eet the d£'mand. The only alternat-
iv.es are either to import or. to tell the 
s i ~ s that until after ten years 
1hcy will not get anything at all. That 
we cannot do Therefore import has 
qot to be resorted to. We are also 
a~king the o1her public sector units as 
io whether they will be able to supply 
llS anything. They cannot supply us 
switching <:quipment. But they can 
supply som(lthing else. On that our 
<tttempts nre open. We are seeking 
thc'r assistance. That' part of it, I do 
now. With ·regard to the other matter, 
l do not want to go into them. 

SiiRI R. K· MHALGI: Why do you 
i 1ot go t1'1to that part of the other 
matters 7 They are very important. 

SHBI. C. M. STEPHEN: What are the 
other matters? 

SHRI R. K. MHALGI: I have already 
stated. 

SHRI C. M. STEPHEN: The entire 
area. as I said, we have already cov-
ered. My friend Mr. Balanandan spoke 
about the workers' role and I think he 
knows what we are talking nbout. I 
expect from the workers a sense of 
commitment. It is not a question of a 
commercial deal. There must be a 
sense of commitment to the people. 
Two hon. Members have sponsored 
this. Mr. Bannnand<ln has li~ ene  to 
whtlt Mr. Mhalgi ihas s<!i.d, as the re-
a~ n for the deterioration. He put his 
finger right against Mr. Balanandan 
who is one of the lc8ders of the unions 
thrit we have. And then Mr. Balan-
ancb11 m:J,\' nlso take this messnge and 
ensurf' that cooperation is forthcommg. 
As for ns we are ronc<."rned we are 
doing our verv best to act the best 
things through: 

0 

Now. if some Minister will stand in 
l~l  here or in the year 2000 then that 
Minister, if he is an honest Minister 
will hnve to say that things are not 
a~ sa1i ~h  as one wou1.d like, be· 
<'ause that is the nature of this Minis-
try: and that is the position in an\ 
countr ... · Not that things cannot t·;E; 
in1p1·ov("d. They can be improved sti!l, 
still i e~ , and still improved and 
st ill there will be scope to say tha·.:. 
there iE: some scope still to be improved 
anti therefore, as an honest man I go 
aboul saying h~  things are not vs 
satisfactory as they should be, but that 
does not mean that things are bad. 
Things are improving and stiil I will be 

n e~sing that things are not as good 
as one would like to be. That does 
not mean as .1)1mebody was saying, h~  

thilw;s are in shambles. That is not a 
word to be applied to this Department. 
It is not. We have got our jumble of 
different types of instruments e a~ 

ting, about two and a half lakh wo1-
kers spread out throughout the country 
of different types, different affiliations 
and of different varieties. It can 
happen and may take place here and 
there. With all that, I may state one 



~ in VASSA&ftA 14, tvta B~  ~ ,.eie .. 
N._.ti(>a ,Nf14""'7tg graphf (4th Amdt.) :ltutes (M) 

[atlri C. M. Stephen] 

thing, as I said, in Delhi, the daily 
complaints that we are receiving arc 
iSeven thousand and odd and the a l ~ 

are about 3,500. The total connections 
number two lakhs: whicl1 means two 
lakhs minus this are working Jairly all 
rig)lt. Per day the complaints only 
come to this. That means that the re-
maining telephones are working cill 
right. This is not a bad positio1i. i 
would request the hon. Me e ~ to 
have sympathy and an understan<liug 
of the entire thing of this Ministry, ol' 
the entire operation and of course, the 
human failure. All the siatI which are 
operating, are putting forth their best. 
according to me. Discipiine is comiug 
back. Things c.re improving. It will 
improve to the maximum and still there 
will be an occasion again to say that 
things c:an improve further. This is 
the nature of it. But things are imp-
roving. I am sure, Mr. Mhalgi will ue 
satisfied with my explanation and he 
will withdraw his motioo and allow the 
motion that was put on the TaHe o.t 
(he House by the Janata Government 
to remain as ameuaed by me. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Now, it is 5.30. 
And at 5.3{) we (have to take up half-
aI»-hour discussion. If the House 
agrees, we can flnish this item within 
4. 5 minutes and then take up half-an-
hour discussion. 

SOME HON. MEMBERS: Yes. 

SHltI R. K. MHALGI (Thane): The 
hon. Minister has marely repeatecl 
himself while replying to the debate. 
H,e made the same points he did at 
the time of the discussion of 1.he de-
IllWlds for his Ministry. We live in age 
of science and we must aim at in-
creasing our efficiency, An attitude of 
~ la en  would not do. Dissatis-
f,a-0tic;m ·is 'law of progress is a dictum 
which should not be lost si2ht -0f. 

A parliamentary committee should 
be aiu>ointed to go into this matter 
thoroughly so that a proper assesment 
ot ~he working ot the Ministry can be 
made. 

M~  CHAI!tMAN; The "1Ue&tion ii: 

''That this House desolves that in 
pursuance of su·b-section (S) ot sec-
tion 7 of tbe Intilan e1e~a h , ~  

1885 03 of 1885), the followinc mo-
difications be made in the Notifica-
tion regarding Indian eleg ~ s 

(4th Amendment) Rule$, 1980, pub-
lished in the Gazette of India by 
Nctiflcatiuu No. GSR 492 (£) <ided 
the 27fh August, 1Q80 and laid on 
the Table of the House on the 17th 
November. 1980:-

d) in .rule 1, in sub-rule (2), for 
· 1980' substitute '1981'; 

(ii) in rule 2 (i) :-

(a) in ttem (a), for Rs. 150/-
substitute 'Rs. 80/ •'; 

~  ~n item (b), for 'Rs. 75/-t 
substitute 'Rs. 40/-'; 

(iii) in rule 2 (ii)-

( a) in ~ se i n (1) (a), for 
'Rs. 7':i/-' substitute ·Rs. 25/-'; 

n1) in sub-sect:on (1) (b), for 
(.Rs. 150' 3Ubstitute 'Rs. 50/-; 

(iv l in Rule 2 (iii)-

(a) against entry 1, coluro11s ~

3, 4, 5 anc:l 6, JOT '&. 125', '250', '30 
Paise', '40 Paise' 'fiO Paise'. subs· 
titu.te 'Rs. 75', '300', '20 Pai.se', 
'30 Paise', '40 Paise' respectively. 

,(b) Aga'.nst entry 2, in columns 
2, 3, 4, 5 and 6 far ~ s  150'. ·250'. 
'30 Paise', 40 Paise', '50 ·Paise' 
su.bstitu.te 'Rs. 100', '300'. '20 :Paise'. 
'30 Paise', '40 Paise' ·respectively. 

(c) against entry 3, in columns. 
2, 3, 4, 5 and 6, for 'Rs. 175'; '250'; 
'30 Paise', '40 Paise', '50 Paise', 
substitu.te 'Rs. 125', 1300', '20 Palse'. 
'30 Paise', 140 Paise' re$pectively. 

(d) against entry 4, in columns 
2, 3, 4, 5 and 6; for 'Rs. 200'; 
130 ·Paise, ·'40 Palse' '50 P·aise-' 

------------------------
•The .original speech was delivered in Marathi. 



... , '. :J>Wriefl· ·.in •ridu.I 
.states «JJ!e<rtecJ · 

I ~M  •• 1181 bu draught du.ring 
1980-81 (U-AH Dis.) 

rubstitute 'lts. 150'. '300'. '20 
Paise', '30 Paise', '40 Paise• res-
pectively 

(v) in rule 2 (iv)-

omit 'and the first 250 calls v:ill 
also be charged at the rate shown 
in columns 4 of the Table applicable 
to measures rate systems appear:ng 
in item (a) of sub-section (1) of sec-

tion III'; 

(vi)in rule 3, for '100' substitute 
'0.20'; 

(vii) in rule 4, for '50 Kms' subs-
titute '25 Kms'. 

This House do recommend to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur 
in this resolution.'' 

The motion was negatived. 

11.33 hrs. 

HALF-AN-HOUR DISCUSSION 

DISTRICTS TN VARIOUS STATES AFFF.CTED 

BY DROUGHT DURING 1980-81 

SHRI G. NARASIMHA REDDY 

Adilabad): With reference to the 
answer given by the hon. Minister f(>t' 
~ i l e to Starred Question No. 
478 on 23 March. 1981. J would like to 
raise certain points arising out of the 
answer given by the hon. Minister. 

This is the t'.me when the entire 
~ a es are s e in~ from drought con-
ditions. The month of May is ~  

severe h~  this is the proper i ~ f 0r 
~ in~ sufficient relief to the ai i~ 

whkh ~ e sufferinrt from ~h  As 
l sPe th,,. ,,.ntire list which wai:; laid 
n,, tli '!' Table hy the hon. Minister, 
three Rtates i.e. Andhra a e~h  

T,qmt· Nadu and KRrnafaka are snffer· 
i l~ ! •om severe droueht conclitfnns 
H-1lt:1 : P.;ir. As you Rll know. Andhra 
Prad< 1h n na ~l , even last year, 

had ' •tiered drought and cyclonic con-
ditions The people of Andbra Pra-
desh have been facing drought and 
cyclonic conditions for the last two, 
three years. The ent'.re machinery 
· of the State Government has been 
geared up. In spite of that, the 
people in rural areas in some of the 
districts, have started migrating for 
want of employment and clri.nking 
water. AlthQugh all the MLAs, 
Ministers and the Government offl· 
cials have been trying to create confi· 
dence among the people of Andbra 
Pradesh that the Government is there 
and the Central Government is there 
to take care bf them and to give all 
the ass'stance that lhey require, the 
situation is so gr!lve that most of the 
people have alre<tdy migrated. And 
the remaining µeople who have not 
migrated, have been transporting 
drinking water on tractors, trucks and 
so on and so forth. Here I would like 
to ask certain specific questions and ex-
pect specific answers from the hon. 
Minister. It is not a fact that the States 
of Andhra Pradesh and Tamil 
Nadu are suffering almost with 
the same intensity of drought? In 
Andhra Pradesh the post-monsoon 
drought-affected area is about 22 
Iakh hectares, while in Tamil Nadu 
it is about 23.50 lakh hectares. The 
population affected by drought in 
Audhra Pradesh is about 200 lakhs 

wh'Je In Tamil Nadu it is about 2l!Ul0 
lakhs. The assistance soui?ht by 
Andhra Pradesh was Rs. 159.33 crore51 
but. on the basis of reports, a reiJing 
of Rs. ~~ crores has been fixed. 
Tamil Nadu soui;rht assistance of Rs. 
1 RO.RR crorP.s. According to reports, 
~ ceilinf! of ~  60.91 crores lrns been 
fi"-:'Pd in fhf' n~  of Tamil Nadu. Jf 

the sbth;Urs whiC'h I have !'!iven arP. 
MTTf1<'t. 1hen :t is verv f'lPar. that both 
th.,. Sti:ttec;; arP h:tv?ng almost the same 
fnterisitv of drom!ht. WhilP Andhra 
~ esh and Tamil Nadu Asked for 

Atic:isti:tflr.,,. of Rq. l l l ~ l <'rnrei:i in~ 

'fh. lAO.AR N'orpq, fhP. Gnvr.rnmPnt nl 
nni~ h~~ n1armitte.rl nnlv Re:. ~~ 

t",.orec; for nnl ~ l l~h  whil"!' H: 

"-SlR le i ~ Rs. R0.91 erorei:i tn 
Tamil Nadu. I have not been able 


