Thursday, 15th February, 1934
THE

COUNCIL OF STATE DEBATES

VoLumE |, 1934

(8th February to 27th April, 1934)

SEVENTH SESSION

OF THE

THIRD COUNCIL OF STATE, 1934

PusLisHED BY MaNAGER oF PueLicATIONS, Dmumi.
Prinep BY TRE MANAGER, GovERNMENT OF INDIa Prass, Naw Dmax
1934,



- CONTENTS,
Thursday, 8th February, 1884—

Pabrxs.

Members Sworn . . . . . . . . . 1
Death of Mr. Abdul Hamld . . . . . N . o 1
Questions and Answers . . . . . . . . . 2—11
Statements laid on the table . . . . . . . 11--13
Messages from His Excellency the Governor Genoml . . . . 13—14
Committee on Petitions . . . 1¢
Resolution re placing on record the deep sympath} of tho Council mth

sufferers in the recent earthquake—Adopted ' . . . 14—19
Governor General’s Assent to Bill . . . . . 19
Bills passed by the Legislative Assembly la.ld on the tnble . . . 19
Motion for the election of two non-offivial Muslim:Members to the Stlmd-

ing Committee on Pilgrimage to the He;az-—Adopted PR 19—20
Statement of Business . . . . . . . . . 20

Seturday, 10th February, 1884—

‘ Question and Answer . . . . . . 2122

;' Bill passed by the Legislative Assemhly ond on the table . . 92
Nominations for the election of two non-official Muslim Members to the

‘ Standing Committee on Pilgrimage to the Hejaz . . . . 22

' Resolution re Indianization of the Indian Civil Service—Withdrawn . 23—35
day, 13th February, 1884—

Questions and Answers . o . . . 97088

Reserve Bank of India Bxll——Motlon to oomuder, ad;ournod . e v 88—89
ednesday, llth February, 1084——

Members Swom . . . . . i e . ‘ . 71

Quostions and Answero .- . . . . 71178

Reserve Bank of India Bnll—-—Mouon to connder, ndophed . . < 79—111

;'!humhy, 15th February, 1834—

Rm;;;o?x::el:i of .Indm. Blll—.Consoxderaflon o.f ula.u:;es t,x.xd nﬂtmn t'n pn:;,

Friday, 16th Fepruary, 18684— '

! Bill passed:-by the Legislative Assembly lsid on the table . . . 147
Reserve Bank of India Bill—Passed, as amended . . . . 147—63
Imperial Bank of India (Amendment) Bill—Considered and pa-od e 18865

;. Statement of Business . K . . . . . . o 185

Ssaturday, 17th February, 1’84——

Question and Anawer . . . . . . . . . l67—¢8
Prosentation of the Railway Budget for 1934.35 . . . les—13

Motion for the election of two non-official Members to the Stmdmg Com-
mittee Yo advise on subjects other than *‘Indians Overseas—Emi.
gration’’ and ‘‘Haj Pilgrimage’ déalt with in the" Dopntangnt
of Education, Health and Lands—Adepted. . v . . 178



[iv

Thursday, 20th March, 1934— _—

Indian Finance Bill, 1934—-Considered and passed ‘. »
8alt Additional Import Duty (Ext,ond.lng) Bill—Considered and' psssed
Statement of Business . . .

Thursday, 12th April, 1684—

"Members Sworn

Questions and Ansawers .

Short Notice Question and Answer

Statements laid on the table

Bill passed by the Legislative Assembly la.ld on tho tsble

Motion for the election of six non-official Members to the Centrsl Ad\nsory
Council for Railways—Adopted

Motion for the election of one Muslim non- -official Member to the Smndmg
Committee on Pilgrimage to the Hejaz wvice the Honourable Mr

o

Hossain Imam, resigned—Adopted . - . .
Indian Trusts (Amendment) Bill--Considered and psssed
Statement of Business . . . . . .

Monday, 16th April, 1084—

Member 8worn . . . . . . .

Short Notwe Questions and Answers . .
Ruling re puttmg of questions standing in the names of sbsont Members
Btatements laid on the table . . . . . .

Motion for the election of one non-official Member to the Standin, Com
mittee on Emigration vics the Honoumblo 8ir Kurma enkat.o
Reddi—Adopted . . . .

Motion for the election of three non-ofﬂcm.l Members to the Sta.ndmg
) Committee for Roads—Adopted

Indian States (Protection) Bill—Motion to oonslde:. sdopted -
Election of one non-official Muslim Member to the Btnndlng Comnntbee
on Pilgrimage to the Hejaz . . e il

Nominations for the election of six non- oﬂicml Members to the bentra.l
Advisory Cquncil for Railways !

Tuesday, 17th April, 1934—

Member Sworn . . . . . . . . 0 . .
Questions and Answers .

Bill passed by the Legislative Assembiy )sid on the tsble .
Indian States (Protection) Bxll—-—Consldered and psasod . . .
Statement of Business . . . . . . .

Priday, 20th April, 1084—

Questions and Answers . » . - - - ‘e i
Statement laid on the table . . - . « .
Bill passed by the Legislative Assembly lmd on the table “ .

Election of a non-official Member to the Standing Committee on Etmg'ru-
tion vige the Honourable 8ir Kurma Venkata Reddi .

“Eleotion: of three non-ofﬂom) Members to the Bta.ndmg Commltltm for- i
Roads’

8 . . . -

Election of 8ix non- ofﬂcml Members to the Centrsl Adepry Counml for:
Railways . . . . o . ‘ .

Paans.

609-—3l1

631—35
630

637

. 83745

6845--48
646 —47
" 647

647

648
648—-49
649

651
68561—52
652—86
856—56

656

-

656
6568- 08

698

699

. 699—700

701
70}—32
782

73345
746
747

747
747

747



[v]
Paams.

Friday, 20th April, 1084—oconsd.

Congratulations to the Honourable 8ir Joseph Bhore on' the successful
termination of the Indo~Japanese Agreement . . . . 748

Indian Tariff (Textile Protection) Amendment Blll——Motlon to consider,
adjourned . . . . . . . . . ' . 748808

Appendix . . . . . . . v ' v . . 80“‘0”
Saturday, 21st April, 1834—

Questions and Answers . ' . . . . 807—08
Bill passed by the Legislative Auombly lud on the table . . ' 80p
Indian Tariff (Textile Proteotnon) Amendment Blll—-Conoldered and

passed . N R . . . 80027
Resolution re Road Dovelopment Fund—-Adoptod ' . . . 82738
S8taternent of Business . . . . . . . . 886
Appendix . . . . . . . . . . . . 887—38

Thursday, 26th April, 10834—

Question and Answer . . . ' . 839
Congratulations to the Honourable er Harry Emg on h:s appointment

as Governor of the United Provinces . . . , 889
Death of Sir Sankaran Nair . . . . . ' . . 840—44
Statement laid on the table . . . . . B44—46
Result of the election of six non-oﬁoul Members to the Oontnl Advi-ory

Council for Railways . . . . 847
Trade Disputes (Extending) Bill—Consldered and pmed . . . 84750
Sugar (Excise Duty) Bill-—Considered and passed . . . . « 851—007
Sugar-cane Bill—Motion to consider, adopted . . . . . 907--30

Friday, 27th April, 1984—

Questions and Answers . . . f . . . . 93134
Death of the Right Honourable 8ir Dmahaw Mulla . . . . 934
8ugar-cane Bill—Considered and passed . . . . . . 93465
Matches (Excise Duty) Bill—Considered and passed . . . . 955—63

Motien re Committee to enquire into and report vn the working of and
results achieved from the Ottaw& Agroemontr—-Conndentlon
adjourned . . . . . . . . . 964—48

1021D



COUNCIL OF STATE.
Thursday, 16th February, 1934.

The Council met in the Council Chamber of the Council House at
Eleven of the Clock, the Honourable the President in the Chair,

RESERVE BANK OF INDIA BILL—continued.

Tue HoxourABLk THE PRESIDENT: We will now proceed with the
detailed consideration of the clauses of the Bill, but before we proceed
I would like to point out to Honourable Members that during the last
two days I have given Honourable Members the widest latitude when
discussing the principles of the Bill in allowing them to discuss the differ-
ent clauses of the Bill in some detail and I trust there will not be needless
repetition today of the same arguments that have been advanced before.

The Question is:
“That clause 2 stand part of the Bill.”

Tne HonouraBLE MR, J. B. TAYLOR (Additional Finance Secretary):
8ir, I move:

“That in the proviso to sub-clause (c) of clause 2 for the word ‘society’ where it
last occurs the word ‘bank’ be substituted.’

Bir., this is a purely verbal amendment. In this sub-clause we are
defining ‘‘provincial co-operative banks'’, but as a result of an amendment
which was introduced in another place we did not notice that in elaborat-
ing the definition of a ‘‘provincial co-operative bank’’ we had used the
words ‘‘provincial co-operative society’’,

Bir, I move.

Tur HONOURARLE Rar Bamavur Lana MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA (United Provinces Central: Non-Muhammadan): Sir, I beg
to oppose the amendment that has been moved by my Honourable friend
Mr. Taylor. By this amendment my Honourable friend wants to restrict
!;he provisions of the Bill to provincial co-operative banks only, but as
in the definition they can be applied to big co-operative societies in the
provinces. For instance, take my province. There are a large number
of central societies which are as big as provincial banks in some provinces
and working with lakhs and lakhs of rupees. They have got smaller units
affiliated to them and they will be deprived of the benefit of the Reserve
Bank if the amendment of my Honourable friend Mr. Taylor is carried.
I may, for instance, say that there is a posts and telegraphs society in
my province. It is a very big society and it has got a number of other
societies. Then, there is the grain merchants’ society, there is the
co-operative sugar factory, which has got about a hundred societies
affliated to it. Bo all these big co-operative concerns will be deprived
?f the ‘:;neﬁt of the provisions of the Reserve Bank if this amendment
8 carried.

( 113 ) A



114 COUNCIL OF STATE. (16T FEs. 1934.

Txr HonourapLe Mr. J. B. TAYLOR: On a point of personal explana-
tion, Sir. That is not the intention at all. This is merely a verbal
alteration. We are not limiting in any way the powers of the Provincial
Government. At present we say:

“* * *the Local Government may declare any central co-operative society in
that province to be a provincial co-operative society within the meaning of this defi-
nition™’.

Those words are meaningless, because it is not a provinoial co-operative
society which is defined in the definition. What we are defining is a
‘“‘provincial co-operative bank’’. The change is purely a verbal ome.

Tne HoNouraBLE Rar Baimapur Lara MATHURA DTRASAD
MEHROTRA: A society itself consists of societies as well as banks.
Banke are nlso called societies. In fact the correct word is ‘‘society’’,
not ‘‘bank’’ so far as co-operative societies are concerned, and when we
speak of " central co-operative banks we also mean central co-
operative 'societies. This is a larger term in which all. these
focictiey . are included. This was not moved in Select Committed
as well as in the Assembly. Now at this eleventh hour in the Counecil
of State this important amendment has been brought in. I do not know,
Bir, whether this is to be treated as a verbal amendment or as an amend-
ment carrving farreaching consequences; and if this amendment is effected,
I would ke to know from the Government whether the Bill will again
have to be referred back to the Assembly or not. I would like to have
this information also from the Government, ’

Tur Hovouranre Sm KURMA VENKATA REDDI (Madras: Nomi-
nated Non-Official):  8ir, I do not see any objection at all to the
amendment proposed. There is really no difficulty in this case. If my
Hconourable friend who has opposed this améndment had seen the proviso
he would have noticed that any co-operative bank can be declared to be
a provincial bank within the meaning of this ‘Act by the Iocal Govern-
ments. The original idea was to limit.it to provincial co-operative banks,
but, Iater on, it was pointed out that there were more provincial banks
than one in certain provinces; as. for instance, in Madras we have the
ordinary provincial co-operative bank which supplies money to the central
banks in the district which in their turn supplies money to the primary
societies. In addition to these provincial banks we have also a land
mortgage bank which is also a provincial one and it was considered that
both these even were not enough. So power was granted under the
proviso for the Local Governments to declare such central banks to be
brought under this definition. It is only a matter of language and I
renlly do mot see the objection. -

Tnr. HoNourapLe TRE PRESIDENT: The original Question was:
“That clause 2 stand part of the Bill.”

Since which an amendment has been moved:

“That in the proviso to sub-clause (c) of clause 2 for the word ‘society’ where it
last occurs the word ‘bank’ be substituted.”

The Question I have to put is:
“That that amendment bo made.*’ -

The Motion was adopted.



)

Coer nnsnnuir BANK OF INDIA BILL. nsg

Trx HonourasLe THE PRESIDENT: Rai Bahadur ‘ Lala Jagdish
Prasad.
. (The Honourable Momber was absent.)

Tag HoNovrasLe Rar Bamapur Lara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHNROTRA : S8ir, if you permit me, I would like to move amendment*
No. 5?
~ Tur HovousaBLe THE PRESIDENT: I must point out that in the
Standing Orders there is no authority to permit one Honourable Member
to dciegate the moving of any resolution or amendment to another
Honourable Member. That is the usual practice, and I do not wish to
depart from it. However, when amendment No. 5 is reached, the
Honourable Mcmber may apply to the Chair to move the amendment
in his own name and the Chair, unless any objection is taken by any
Honourable Member, will consider the question at that stage.

(When amendment No. 5 was reached the Honourable the President
again called upon the Honourable Rai Bahadur Lala Jagdish Prasad.)

Tne HoNourarre Rar Bamapur Lata MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: May I have vour permission to move amendment No. 5,
Sir?

Tni HoNourABLE THE PRESIDENT : I cannot permit the moving of this
amendment. It is in entire conflict with the provisions of the Govern-
men; of India Act. The Government of India Act as it stands now does
not recognise the consultation or advice of the Ministers and therefore
this amendment is wholly inadmissible and I cannot permit it.

The Question is:

“‘That clause 2 stand part of the Bill.”

The Motion was_adopted. .

Clause 2, as amended, was added to the Bill.

lause 3 was added to the Bill.

Tar HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: The Question is:

“That clause 4 stand part of the Iill,"

Tnr HovouraBLE MRr. JAGADISH CHANDRA BANERJEE (East
Bengal: Non-Mubhammadan): Sir, I beg to move:

“‘That for clause 4 the following be substituted, namely :

‘4. The original share capital of the Bank shall be five crores of rupees which
shall be fally suhscribed by Government’." - o

8ir, I will not tire the House with a long speech as my amendment
does not require a long explanation—it being self-explanatory. My amend.
ment demands that the whole of the capital of the proposed Bank be
subscribed by the Government from the State coffers. The primary object
in proposing a Shareholders’ Bank instead of a State Bank wag to free
the Bunk from political influcnce. As I explained the other day the term
‘‘political influence’’ does not mean the influence of Indian politiciang only
but the term also covers the influence of British politiciang as well. If

*That after sub-clause (v} of clause 2 the following new clause be inserted, namely :
“(/) The Governor Genoral in Council means the Governor General acting on
the advice of the Member or Minister in Charge of Finance.”
A2




116 COUNOIL- OF STATE. [18ra Fms. 1034.
J
[Mr. Jagadish Chandra Banerjee. ] .
. %

the influence of both parties had been avoided I would have had no objection
to a Shareholders’ Bank. But, Sir, what do we find in the Bill? Ab
every step the influence of the Governor General, either in Council or at
his discretion, has been invoked. As I said the other day the Governor

General under the new constitution will be a party politician of the British

Parliament and therefore it is mnot very difficult to imagine that the

influence of the political party in power in the House of Commons will

be brought to bear on the Governor General under the future constitution

as it is proposed therein to arm him with autocratic powers as well. S8ir,

if the influence of the Ministers of the British Cabinet, namely, the

Secretary of State for India can be tolerated in this Bank, I JZ) not

understand why the influence of an Indian Finance Minister belonging to

a political party in the Indian Legislature cannot be tolerated? The

whole object in proposing a& Shareholders’ Bank is to divest the future

Indian Finance Minister, if he ever comes into being after the Greek

Kalends, of all his controlling power over the Bank. As I have already

mentioned before, the proposed Shareholders’ Bank leaves the door open

for British political influence to be brought ont the Bank while refusing

the same privilege to the Indian Finance Minister. I, for one, cannot

account for this sort of racial discrimination. In all probability, Sir, it

is due to distrust of Indians. With all the emphasis at my command and

at every opportunity available to me I appeal to Government to give up

this distrust of Indians. It is a well-known proverb that distrust begets .
distrust. The more you distrust the people of this country the more India

will distrust all your actions even if they are done with bona fide good

motives. I would therefore advise them, even at this stage, to seriously

consider whether they can still make the Bank a State Bank fully

subscribed by Government. But if ultimately this Bank is brought into

existence solely through the power that the Government have over the

conquered, I visualize that the future only will prove the failure of the

Bank for which all the responsibility will be on the shoulders of the

present bureaucrats.

With these words, Sir, I commend my amendment for the acceptance
of the House.

Tre HoNouRABLE Rar Bamapur Lata MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: Sir, there is a similar Motion in my name the object of
which is the same that is Amendment No. 7 but instead of moving thab
I would like to support the Motion moved by my Honourable friend Mr.
Banerjee. Sir, this amendment involves a very important consequence for
which we fought in Select Committee and in the Assembly and those
of us who have written notes of dissent, would like to see it discussed
threadbare on the floor of this House also. Sir, we are not opposed to a
Shareholders’ Bank if it is going to be really so. We tried to converb
gome of its sections to make it really a Sharcholders’ Bank but we failed
to do that and then we were compelled to write a minute of dissent. The
scheme as it stands, Sir, is neither here nor there. Tn name you may
call it a Shareholders Bank but if you examine it carefully you will find
that it is nothing but a State Bank in the garb of a Shareholdegs' Bank.
Out of the 59 clauses of the Bill if the Honourable Members will like to
count they will find that in no less tht_m 80 places the words ‘‘Governor



RESERVE BANK OF INDIA BILL, 117

General ' has been used. That is, the Govermor -Geners] is the ‘sole con-
trolling authority in the Shareholders’ Bank. If it is going to be so, why
not straightaway make it a State Bank and the capital that is to be
invested from the Government of India should be utilized by the State
instead of the shareholders getting a profit out of it. Sir, as the words
““Governor (teneral in Council”’ is used and not ‘‘the Governor General
in Council acting with the Finance Minister’” we do not know whether
the restrictions that have been levied on this Bank will be exercised by
the Governor Genera]l with the Finance Minister in the future constitution
or the Governor General alone.. We wanted to clear this point but it
was not cleared with the result that we are labouring under the mis-
apprehension that the Finance Minister who will be respemsible to the
Legislatures will have practically no hand in the contro] of the Reserve
Bank. Then, Sir, it has been said that the Reserve Bank should be kept
aloof from the influence of political parties. When the Governor
General, who is the leader of the biggest political party in India, comes
in in every place, why have other parties been excluded? The result
will be that the Legislatures will be helpless’ in criticising the working
of the Bank as it is to be called & Shareholders’ Bank while the Governor
General will be exercising all the powers. 8o, if it is enacted as it is
the Legislatures will have absolutely no say over this Bank. Then, Sir,
this is going to be the principal Bank, the National Bank, 1 should say,
of this country and no restriction has been placed about the purchase of
shares by non-nationals nor ahout the Directors belonging to non-nationals,
A National Bank should always have an absolute majority of nationals.
Had there been any provision that 75 per cent. of the shares should be
held by naticnals or that out of the thirteen voting directors there should
be ten directors belonging to nationals, I would have supported the scheme,
But in the absence of these two restrictions, non-nationals can hold as
many shares as they like. They will certainly have no right of giving
more than 20 votes, but they have got tons of money and will purchase
shares in any number just to sterilise votes which would have been used
by the shares purchased by the nationals. I admit that when the allot-
ment is made the shares will be allotted in a way that 75 per cent. will
go to nationals. But when there is no check, they can be purchased in
the market by the non-nationals. Giving a premium of, say, Rs. 5 per
share, they can corner and purchase almost all the shares. There is
absolutely no provision in the Act which will debar them from doing so,
and thus this Nationa] Bank will become a non-National Bank. There-
fore we were of opinion that if this Shareholders’ Bank was going to meet
with such a fate, it would be better to have a State Bank; if the capital
is put in by the State, the Legislatures shall have influence over the
Bank, the shareholders or the directors will not come from the non-
nationals and the Government shall be the sole appointing authority of the
directors, whose aotion will always be criticised in Legislatures. These
were the fundamental points on account of which we could not agree, and
do not agree, to the scheme that has been placed before us. As I said
at the very beginning, it is neither here nor there. The name is that of
8 Shareholders’ Bank but the national shareholders will have no control
over the Bank. Therefore, Sir, we are in favour of a State Bank so that
the profits out of the investment may be utilized by the taxpayers instead
of the shareholders. .

Sir, I support the amendment.



118 “* COUNCIL OF STATE. - [16TE FEB. 1084

: | . .

. Tae HoNouraBrg Sarvip RAZA ALI (United Provinces: Nominated
Non-Official): May I enquire whether the Honourable Member recordad
his dissent to thig effect in the Minority Report which I suppose he has
signed ?

. Tue 'HoNouraBLg Rai  Bamapur Lata MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: Certainly.

Tre HoNouraBLE MR. J. B. TAYLOR: Sir, this amendment, in the
form in which it stands, is of course a purely wrecking amendment because
though it purports merely to alter one sub-clause, in effect it will neces-
sitate the entire wrecking not only of Chapter II but also of the provisions
for the distribution of profits, the exemption of the profits of the Bank
from income-tax and the submission of the report of the auditors wo the
meeting of the shareholders. For that reason, Sir, 1 should have thought -
that the arguments which my friend has raised would have been more
properly raised on the genera] motion for consideration, because it is
obvious that if he intends to press them, he is really intending to wreck
the Bill.

Tue HonovraeLt Mr. JAGADISH CHANDRA BANERJEE: I have
already said that, Sir—.

Tre HoNovrasir Mr. J. B. TAYLLOR: At the same time, Sir, though
I do not wish to go again over all the elaborate arguments dealing with .
the question of a State or Shareholders’ Bank, there are one or two
raisapprehensions which I would like to have the opportunity of rebulting.
In the first place, when the Honourable Rai Bahadur ILala Mathura
Prasad Mehrotra opposed my first amendment I had a suspicion tha$
though a member of the Joint Committee he could not have studied the
provisions sufficiently carefully and T am afraid that that suspicion is
strengthened by his speech now. He says, if I understand him correctly,
that the words ‘‘Governor General’’ are used and not the words ‘‘Governor
General in Council’’ thereby apparently meaning that some mysterious
entity hitherto unknown to the Constitution is being created to upset
the ordinary position. 8ir, T do not think that there is one place in the
Bill in which the words ‘‘Governor General’’ are used. In the next place,
he used his strong imagination to conjure up a fantastic supposition that
a large part of the shares will be bought by non-nationals. He admitted
that the non-nationals would not have the right to vote but at the same
time he said that they would buy them in order to steriliss votes. T do not
quite see what object those malicious non-nationals would have in buying up
shares merely to sterilise them because the fewer sharcg that are left——

. TR HownouraLe Rar Bamapvr Lara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHR()’I‘RA: Sale investmént of b per cent. '

. .Tre Hovourarre Mr. J. B. TAYLOR——because the greater the
number of shares which are bought up in.this way., the greater would
obyiously be the voting strength left to th. remainder held by the
nationals. In addition, Sir, in clause 4, sub-clause (3), it is stated that
nobody who is not covered by (a). (b) or (c) shall be registered as a share:
holder or be entitled to the payment of any dividend. S8ir, I think that

Aaen bﬁ_,g':uwr'i ‘Hnnt;uz;“ I iﬂ:‘ 4

IREE © Reatle



A A It _RESERVE 'BANK OF INDIA BILL. ‘M9

it passes human belief that these ndﬁ-natjohuis, however maliciou§ they
were, would buy up blocks of shares of which they would obtain o
diyidend at all.

Tae HoNourabLe Sir DAVID DEVADOSS (Nominated Indian
Christians): Dog in the manger!

Tue HoNourasLe Mr. J. B. TAYLOR: A very mad dog in the
manger! But I do not think, Sir, that at this stage I am called upon to
go over all the arguments again. 1 merely wish to say that nothing that
bas been raised either in the general debate or now has altered the view
which I think that this House will confirm that a Shareholders’ Bank is in
the interests of India. T, therefore, Sir, oppose the amendment.

Tne HoNourABLE THE PRESIDENT: Amendment moved :

“That for clause 4 the following be substituted, namely :

‘4. The original share capital of the Bank shall be five crores of rupees which
shall be fully subscribed by Government'.”

The Question is:
‘“That that amendment be made.’

The Council ‘div-ided :

AYES-5.
Banerjee, The Honourable Mr. Mehrotra, The Honourable Ral
Jagadish -Chandra. ! Bahadur Lala Mathura Prasad.
Hossain Imam, The Honoarable Naidu, The Honourable Mr. Y.
Mr, Banganayakalu. :
Kalikar, The Honourable Mr,
Vinayak Vithal. )
. NOES8—29.
Buta Bingh, the Honourable Sardar. - Mehta, The Honourable Sir Homi.
Charanjit  Singh, The Honourable Miller, The Honourable Mr, E.
Raja. Mitchell, the Honourable Mr. D. G.
Choksy, The Honourable Khan Nomﬁ The Honourable Nawab Mllik
Bahador Dr. 8ir Nasarvanjji. Pad h:hammld_ Hayat Khan.
Devad ™ " bl si adshah  Bahib. =~ Bahadur, The
evadosa, e onourable ir Honourable Saiyed Mohamed.:
David, | Ray, The Honourable Maharaja
‘Ghoral,  The  Honourable Mr. | Jagadish Nath, of Dinajpur.
Jyotsnanath. Raza Ali, The Honourable Raiyid,
Glancy, The Honourable Mr. B. J. Redc{;ml"l;h; Honourable Bir _Kurmt
Glass, The Honourable Mr. J. B, gumll,‘T'I}"heHHonour;})len?ir guf‘hrie.
Habibullah, Th outer, e Honourable Mr, C, A.
lKhwa\ia. © Honol}ttable Nawab Spence, The Honourable Mr. G. H.
Hullett, The Honoursble Mr. M. G. | SProgeen. The Honourable —Major
-Hengergon, The Honourpble Mr, Stewart, The Honourable Mr T A,
e S e . Suhrawardy, The Honourable Mr,
Hubback, The Honourable Mr, J. A. Mahmood. ’
_ Jalan, The. Hpnonrable Rai Bahadur . Taylor, The ll’[qnounble l(r.’ J. B
< v.. ,Radha Knnhng.: ] N . . Ugra, The Honourable Rai .Bahib
'go]lgéon,\,'l‘hg Honourable Mr. J. N. | Pandit Gokaran Nath. .,

L v poe . ..

The Motion was negatived. L



120 | COUNCIL OF STATS. [15Te Frs. 1984.

Tz HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: I presume you do not propose to
move amendment No, 77

TaE HoNouraBLE Rar Bamapur Lara MATHURA  PRASAD
"MEHROTRA: No, 8ir. I will move amendment No, 8, which runs:

“That in sub-clause (£) of clause 4, for the word ‘Delhi’ the words ‘Punjab,
Iannpore, Karachi’ be substituted.”

The object of this amendment is to increase the centres from five to
seven places. Under the Bill there will be only five centres of the
Reserve Bank, Bombay, Calcutta, Madras, Delhi and Rangoon. If my
amendment is accepted there will be seven branches. I want to delete
Delhi and have additional centres in the Punjab, at Cawnpore and Karachi.

Tue HonovraBLe Mn. J. B. TAYLOR: Might I ask the Honourable
Member whether he means to use the word ‘‘Punjab’’ or whether he
desires to substitute ‘‘ILahore’?

Tre Honourapte Rar Bamapvtr Lata MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: I mean ‘‘Lahore’’, Sir, and if the Honourable Member will
accept my amendment I will certainly ask one of my colleagues to
substitute ‘"Lahore’’ for ‘‘Punjab’’. I meant ‘‘Lahore’’ when I put ia
“‘Punjab"’.
4

Tre HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: Do you wish to remove the word
“‘Punjab” and substitute ‘‘Lahore’?

Tae HonNovrRaBre Rat Barabur  Lara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: Yes, Sir, if you will permit me I would like to substitute
‘“Lahore’* for ‘‘Punjab’’,

(The Honourable the President signified his assent.)

Sir, this amendment 18 not without principle. I have selected these
places according to some principle, and it is thig that they have got Gov-
crnment currencies at present. These currencies will have to be main-
tained under the presént scheme, whether there is a branch of the
Reserve Bank at Lahore, Cawnpore and Karachi or not. 8o that there
will be no extra expenditure to Government if my amendment is accepted.
A little addition and alteration in these currencieg will be quite sufficient
for transforming them into branches of the Reserve Bank. Some addi-
tional staff would certainly be required, but little additions
will be required  in buildings and  etrong rooms  which
already exist, and what will cost in additional staff will be more than
compensated for in the saving of commission on business. I understand
a large amount of business is being carried on in these centres, Tf there
are no branches of the Reserve Bank the Imperial Bank will act as its
agent and will have the benefit of the business being transacted in these
places. So considering all these points the Bank will not lose anything,
rather may gain something if branches are established at these places.

- THE HoNoUrABLE MR. J. B. TAYLOR: Sir, I do not wish to interrupt
the Honourable Member, but surely he is under a misapprehension? This
elause 4(2) deals with registers of shareholders. The clause dealing with
branches of the Bank is No. 6. . ’ '



RBSERVE BANK OF INDIA BILL. 121

Tur HonouRABLE Rar Bamapur Larna MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: If the amendment is not moved at this stage and if
registers are not to be kept at these places there cannot be brt.mc_hes. I
have therefore thought it advisable to move it here, because it is only
by having registers at these places that we can have branches there. If
T had not moved my amendment at this place, my Honourable friend
would have got up and said that the Council has accepted r:glsters to be
kert at five places and therefore the amendment is out of o er—to have
brancheg at seven places. So I have anticipated his larger objection and
have moved my amendment at this place. Sir, there is another reason,
as 1 was going to say, for having branches at Lahore and Cawnpore—the
northern portion of India is mostly agricultural country and if branches
of the Reserve Bank are kept here the agriculturist will be better served.
I mav remind the House that 85 per cent. of the population of this part
of the country is living on agriculture, and so it is very necessary to have
these two branches in Northern India and as there is no extra expense
involved, I hope my Honoursble friend Mr. Taylor will gracefully come
forward to accept this amendment of mine.

Tre HonouraBLE MR. J. B. TAYLOR: S8ir, I interrupted the Honour-
able Member because I wished to clarify the discussion. I thought at
the time and still think that he is labouring under a complete misappre-
hension. This clause’ deals with the register of shareholders. It has
nothing whatever to do with branches, which ig dealt with in clause 6,
and there is nothing in clause 6 to show that it is in any way linked
up with this clause. In fact, clause 6 provides for a branch in T.ondon
without there being a share register there and without people in I.ondon
being entitled to hold shares. Also if an amendment is brought in here,
I would like to hear from the Honourable Member how he proposes to
effect the consequential alterations in the share register and what these
constituencies are to be? He said one of his objects was to increase
sgricultural representation; yet he has made no proposal for any re-
arrangement of the voting power, with the result that if there were share
registers there would be nobody to vote for.

Tue HoNouRABLE Rar Bamapur Lara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: They will all be consequential amendments.

Trr HovnouraBre MR. J. B. TAYLOR:T4 is more than consequential
because it will affect the composition of the directcrate, but I do not press
that particular point and I shall come to what I take to be the real
intention of his suggestion which is that there should be. as I understand
it, Issue Branches more than actua] share registers at these places. As
fegards that, Sir, the Bank is by no means precluded from retaining the
‘Currency Offices at these three places if it so desires or from giving them
such facilities as it likes. I am certain, Sir, that the Bank will at
first at any rate wish to continue the offices of the Issue Department
st these places, because they are conveniently situated for the distribu-
tion of notes, they are important commercial centres and facilities will
either be continued directly by the Reserve Bank or through the Imperial
Ba.nk so that from the point of view of the public they will remain
inimpaijred. At the same time, Sir, I must oppose thig particular amend-
ment because, as I said, it would upset the carefully srranged distribution
of the voting power over India. B



122 % COUNCIL OF ®TafeE: ' - [15Ts Fes. 1934.

Tue HoNoURABLE THE PRESIDENT: Xmeudment moved ;

“That in sub-clause (2) of clause 4, for the word ‘Delhi’ the word- ‘Tahore, Cawn-
pore, Karachi’ be substituted.’”’

The Question is:

“That that amendment be made.”
The Motion was negatived.

4
Tee HonouraBLe MR. JAGADISH CHANDRA BANERJEE: S8ir,
1 move my amendment which reads as follows: :

"'{'hat at the end of sub-clause (2) of clause 4 the following words be added|
namely

‘and no person shall be allowed to hold more than 200 shares’.’”’

Sir, I am not one of those who believe in the free marketing of shares
in such a scheme as the proposed Shareholders’ Bank. In the name of
free marketing of shares the capltahsts have been given the opportunity
of accumulating all the vofe carrying shares into their hands if they so
desire. I am nrot going to discuss whether in actual circumstances this
might happen or might not happen. But no one can deny that if the
capitalists combine they may do it and thereby control the Bank
to the advantage of such combines. I therefore suggest that no share-
holder should be allowed to accumulate more than 200 shares. The
Shareholders’ Bank is not an ordinary joint stock company. That being
the case the question of the free marketing of shares should not stand
in the way of limiting the accumulation of shares with an individual.
Before I conclude I would ask Government whether it is a fact or nob
that they agreed in the Joint Select Committee to reduce the value of
shares from Rs. 500 to Rs. 100? If so, T would further ask them what
was the underlying idea in doing so? Was it not the intention that the
shares may be diffused even to the masses? I admit that in .the first
allotment the shares may be diffused into all classes and sections of
people. But is it not the duty of the Government to see that the shares
diffused into all sections of people are maintained throughout in the way
in which the shares were originally "allotted. = Without limitation of
holding of the shares by individuals, I would not be surprised if, at an¥
future date, *he number of voters of the Bank is limited amongst only
a few hundreds of capitalists. I still maintain that it in the duty of the
Government to bring this measure into perfection without ]eavmg nnv
loopholes by which the object in view may be frustrated.

With these words, Sir, I commend the amendment for the acceptauce

of the House.
1

Tai HoNouraBLE Mr. J. B. TAYLOR: Sir, this is a question which
was carefully considered both by the London Committee and by the
Joint Committee and the views of the majority were that though the
nominal value of the shares should be. reduced.so as to ensure as wide
8- -distribution .as possxble and that the voting power should be limited it
was undesjrable. to impose any restriction on the maximum. holding as
such 'a restriction would most seriously impair their ‘marketability and
in effect would prevent what is the object of the. Honourable. _mover “of
this amendmient, the widest possible distribution of jtg shares’ among the
poorer clastes of the country. The reason 'ig “obvious.  Tf there ig &



RESERVE BANK: OF -INDIA BILL, 125

restriction on the total holding of shares it will not be possible. to market
them, because brokers will have to know before they can effect a sale,
hefore a share transfer can be registered, whether or not the buyer hsas.
already reached his total maximum. That, Sir, will particularly affect
the pocr holder of a share who may wish to get an advance against it
because the number of parties from whom he can obtain such an advanco
will be materially decreased. It will be quite impossible for any bank
to advance on any scale against these shares if the number of shares.
which they can take over is to be limited in this way. Therefore, Sir,
this restriction would most seriously affect the small holder in whose-
interest it is desirable that the shares should be freely marketable. It
will not at all achieve another object which the Honourable mover has
1 mind, that is, to prevent the concentration of the shares in a few
hands, because if there are one or two people who wish to sterilise shares—
I have said that is s most fantastic supposition—they will not be deterred
merely by a provision of this nature. They can easily buy
them and leave them in the hands of nominees.  The
character of these nominees could not be detected, because ex hypothesi
their object being merely sterilisation they will not register. Therefore,
Sir, it seems to me that a provision of this nature would have the opposite
effect to that which the Honourable mover intends, and I therefore-
oppose the amendment.

TreE HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: Amendment moved :

"'}‘hat» at the end of sub-clause (2) of clause 4 the following words he added,
namely : :

‘and no person shall be allowed to hold more than 200 shares’.”
The Question is:
"“That that amendment be made.’
The Motion was negatived.

THE HoNOURABLE Rar BamapvR  Lara MATHURA PRASAD-
MEHROTRA: Sir, I beg to move.
“That to sub-clause (3) of clause 4, the following proviso be added :

‘Provided that 75 per cent. shares shall always he held by the Indian
Nationals’.”’ '

Sir, the object of this amendment is quite obvious and it does not
require much explanation from me. If there is no check of this sort
we are afraid that the majority of the shares can at any time be held
by non-Nationals which is against the principles of such a national
mstitution. 8ir, if Honourable Members will look at olause (c) of sub-
section (3) they will find that..according to this sub-clause, vis.,

‘‘a company registered under the Indign Companies Act, 1913, or a society regis-
tered under the Co-operative Bocieties Act, 1812, or any other law for the time being-
m force in British India relating to co-operative societies or a scheduled bank, or a.
corporation or company incorporated by or under an Act of Parliament or any law
for the time being in force in any part of His Majesty’s Dominions’

any foreign company can purchase as many shares as they like. If the
restriction had applied to Britishers only I. would have accepted ‘it but
as non-Britishers can also purchase as many shares as they like I think
it 48 necessary to restrict the -mumber of shares. being purchased by
Nationals and hence .this .amendment. : . 8ir, thig. is not a new thing thaf
L'am pressing for in this House. .I. would like: tb iquote the: instances. of

) .-1e;ddyqf.ii! 'él;lmgquu"ﬂ’ srie ‘,n(_;_... an S ,yii:&'b'«ii.',,e



12¢ COUNCIL OF BTATE. {156Ta Fes. 1084.

1)

[Rai Bahadur Lala Mathura Prasad Mehrobra ]

other foreign countries in which there are such restrictions. I may
ibform the House that in the Netherlands, Denmark and Czecho- Slovalna,
‘the voting rights are only exercised by Nationals. In Lithuans it ig pro-
vided that foreigners may not hold more than ome-thirq of the' capital.
‘Bo, Bir, it is not a new thing that I am proposing in. the interests of my
-countrymen here by moving this amendment. I hope my friend will accept
at least this amendment.

*Tae HoNouraBLE MR. HOSSAIN IMAM (Bihar and Orissa: Muham-
madan): I wish to say a few words in favour of this amendment. The
desire of the Indians to have a part of this national institution reserved
for Nationals should not be regarded as anything unnatural. It is quite
possible that Britishers when they are in India do behave as Indians
in their broader outlook but there is no gainsaying the fact that there
are times when the interests of Indians and Europeans resident in India
clash and though we would like to think that in future such things will
not happen that should not blind us to the possibilities. It is for this
reason, Sir, that we wanted to have some provision in the Aet whereby
at least & majority of the voting strength should remain unimpaired in
the hands of Indians. For this reason, Sir, we brought forward many
amendments in the Joint Select Committee but with which I am not
going to deal. One which I described in my note of dissent wag that
we should have two kinds of shares, one of Rs. 100 which should be
available to Indians and the other of Rs. 500 which should be
.available to all without restriction. I would have divided the capital,-
8ir, into two parts but although they would have been equa] parts the
voting rights of the Indians would have been more than those of the
Europeans. I might be asked how I justify such an anomaly, that a
‘shareholder of Rs. 500 should have the same amount of voting power
.as & shareholder of Rs. 100. But I find the Imperial Bank of India has
at the moment this anomaly in its constitution. Shareholders who have
paid only Rs. 125 for their quarter shares have the same voting power
as & fully-paid shareholder. If my Honourable colleague wishes to know
what precedent we have got he will find in several American States
‘many banks——

! ! ‘

Tae HoNouraBLe THE PRESIDENT: Will you kindly confine yourself

1o the amendment before the House?

Tee HoNouraBLe Mr. HOSSAIN IMAM: I just want to remind the
House that we wanted to do this thing and that thing and as we failed
to come in by the back door we are coming in by the front door. This,
8ir, leaves 25 per cent. of the voting rights to be held by non-Nationals
and preferably by Britishers. Considering the numerical strength of the
Britishers, I think it is more than generous for us to give them 25 per
-cent. shares. Even taking into aecount their wealth, I think it is not
niggardly in any way. It gives them about their share, if not a little
‘more. For these two reasons, Sir, I support this amendment and
‘recommend it for the acceptance of the House.

|
Tar Honourarte Mx. J. B. TAYLOR: 8ir, I sincerely trust that this
“House will not support an amendment conceived in these terms. It is a
-very mdg question and I myself have no doubt that the arrangements for

"Speech not corrected by the Honourable Member.




RESERVE BANK OF INDIA BILL, 125

the initial alteration of voting power, the limitation of amount and the
distribution throughout India will in effect mean that much more than
76 per cent. of the shares will be held by pecple who satisfy the most rigid
definitior cf Indian National. At the same time, there is & very important.
principle at stake, a principle which is not only inherent in the present
constitutional discussions but which is of the utmost importance if India
is to develop in the future as it should, and that is that the European British
subjects resident in India, who have loyally co-operated in the development
of constitutional reforms in India, should be regarded as on the same foot-
ing as Indians in India itself. That, Sir, is the basis not only on which this
Buli has beep framed but the basis on whlch the whole of the constitutional
discussions are progressing and I feel, Sir, that it would be disastrous 1o
out into thas imperial conception in any way. The Honourable Mr.
Mehrotra pointed out that he did not so much object to British subjects
but that under sub-clause (3)(c) companies, even though entirely foreign,
could obtuin shares. That undoubtedly, Sir, is a difficulty; it was dis-
cussad in Joing Cemmittee but we found in practice that it was not practic-
able to exclude foreign companies without excluding companies altogether
and afrer earn™ul discussion we came to the conclusion that it would be an
unnecessarily drastic step to exclude companies altogether merely because
of the very distant possibility that foreign companies might combine to
acquire shares in the Reserve Bank. In the Joint Committee we made a
ecomment to the effect that if this remote contingency should eventuate,
Government should take steps about it. But that, Sir, is a different
question. The actual amendment brings in a definition which is not con-
sistent with the basis on which we are considering this Bill and on which:
we are considering the whole of the new constitution. I, therefore, Sir,
hope that the House will reject the amendment, '

Tur HoxourarLr TRE PRESIDENT: Amendment moved:

“That to sub-clause (3) of clause 4, the following proviso be added :

‘Provided that 75 per cent. shml shall always be held by the Indian
Nationals’.”’

The Questicn is:
‘‘That that amendment be made."”

The Motion was negatived.

THE HONOURABLE THE PRESIDENT: Tﬁe Question then is:
““That clause 4 stand part of the Bill.” '

The Motion was adopted.

Clause 4 was added to the Bill,

Clauses 5, 6 and 7 were added to the Bill. |

Tus Honovrawrr g PRESIDENT: The Question is:
““That clause 8 stand part of the Bill.”

Taz  HonouvrasLe Ratr ‘Bamapur Tiara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: Sir, I beg to move:
“That in  sub-clause (I) (a) of clause 8, for the words ‘after consideration of the

Tecomimendations mnde' the " words ‘out of a: ‘panel :of Bix men recommended’ be
substituted.”



i ] : OOGNCIE 'OF BTATE:" [15Te Fes. 1984.

/[ Rai Bahadur Lala Mathura Prasad Mehrotra. ] B '
" 'Bw. the object of this amendment is to see that the Board of Central
L‘“ No Directors may have at least some effective voice in the
« Noox. gelection of the Governor and Deputy Governors of the Bank.
After all. there will be eight elected and four nominated Directors and we
‘taust give them u voice in the selection of the heads with whom they
will havo to deal. Worded as it is, they will have a right to make recom-
mendation3 only of some names out of whom the Governor General may
or may not choose to select u« man. But, as amended by me, if my
:amend.nent is accepted, the Governor General shall have to choose out of
.6 panel of six men recommended by the Boards. I have given a wide
margin for selection and therefore have fixed the number at six. Out of
these six men recommended by the Directors the Governor General may
choose to appoint sny one whom he likes for the post of Governor and'
iI:)‘[eputy Governors. I hope the amendment will be accepted by the
ous-.

Tur HonovrasLe Mr. J. B. TAYLOR: S8ir, this is an important issue
-and it rcceived the detailed consideration which its importanee merited
‘both in London and in the Joint Committee. The resuit which appears
in the Iill was acceptable after discussion to a considerable majority both
‘in London and in India and I think that it does represent the best working
method of getting what we all desire, namely, the best possible man to
be in charge of the executive of the Bank. I am afraid that the sugges-
tion of the mover of the amendment would be in practice quite impractic-
abla. Things, as you are aware from your experience of the Imperial
Bank. Sir, are not worked in that way. An important appointment of
this character would certainly not be thrust by Government on the Board
without previjs consultation. It will be known when a Governor is about
to retire: there will be informal personal discussions with the various
members of the 13oard and it will be realized who is likely to prove accept-
abls to both. This is the form in which the procedure is indicated in the
Bill. To ask the Board to put up a panel would be not only useless but
it would be very invidious. Central Bankers are not so thick on the gfoun
that it would be possible to collect a panel of six possible men willing to
be considered and the remaining five would undoubtedly feel hurt at the
publicity of having been on the panel and then finally rejected. For these
reasnns, Sir, I oppose the amendment. | )

Tas HovouraBLe THE PRESIDENT: Amendment moved:

“That in sub-clause () (a) of clause 8, for the words ‘after consideration of the
recommendations made’ the words ‘out of a panel of six men recommended’ be
substituted.””

The Question is:

“That that amendment be made.”

The Motion waz negatived. -

Trr  HonovraBLE Rat Bamapuvr Lara MATHURA PRASAD
‘MEHROTRA: 8ir, I beg to move:
‘“That to sub-clanse (I) (a) of clause 8, the following proviso be added :
‘Provided that out of three at lemst cne shall always be a native of India’.”



s RESERVE BANK OF INDJA, BILL. 127

The object of this amendment is this. -Under the constitution three of
the higliest and the most important posts will be the Goverpor and, two
Deputy Governors. 1 wanted to move that at least two of thege:‘pqats,
should be keid by Indians, but considering that no amendment is likely
to be carried in this House, 1 have taken a ioderate course. Of course,
the Government has pledged itself in the Joint Select Committee, but I
do not belicve in verbal promises, because the Honourable Sir George
Schuster and the Honourable Mr. Taylor are here now, but they may go and
others may come and they may not abide by the promise of the present
Finance Member or the Finapce Secretary. I want to bring it under the
Act and so 1 have moved this very moderate amendment on .which the
preseat Governiment is committed. I hope they will have no objection to
briuging this under the Act in order to.give some consideration to -the
wishes of the House.

Tae HovourasLE MR. J. B. TAYLOR: Sir, I must oppose this amend-
meat. The question was discussed in the Joint Committee and I think
that it will save time if I read the comments of the Joint Commiftee on
it: - '

 ‘‘Many of us wished to add a provision that of the throe highest posts thus created
(viz., the Governor and two Deputy Governors) one at léast should be an Indian. We
have, however, been informed that the official Members in charge of the Bill are pre-
pared to give a definite assurance in the Legislature that the Government will take
account of our representations and that it will be its policy in making the first appoint-

ments and thereafter thati at lemst one of the three shall be a qualified Indian. We are
satisfied with this assurance’’. )

I trust that the House will also be satisfied. I disregard the charitable
assumption that official undertakings made to the Legislature are purely
pers>nul to the individual incumbents of the offices, and ask the House not
to bring in a provision of this sort in an actua] statutory measure. It is
obviously undesirable that words of this nature should appear when in
effect what is required can be obtained without them. I therefore ask
that the amnendinent may be opposed. :

Tue HoNovraBLe Sarvip RAZA ALI  (Ubited Provinces: Nominated
Non-Official): Sir, this is the consideration stage and I would confine my-
self to a very few remarks indeed. Time, Sir, was when we Indians
insisted on reservation of posts and seats. I believe the demand began
in 1885 and it lasted generally speaking up to 1905 when, with the change
of Government in England, Lord Morley became the Secretary of State
for India The reason why these demands were put forward was that
unless a minimum was fixed for Indians they did not succeed in getting
those appointments and posts to which they aspired. A great change
took place, as the House is aware, with the advent of Lord Morley at
‘Whitehall. The Honourable the mover of the amendment will realizo
that taking things as they are, we have got three Indians in the Exccutive
Council of the Governor General, generally speaking also we have three
Indians in the Counci] of the Secretary of State and yet no reservation has

been made in the Government of India Act about any of those posts going
to Indians.

Tae HowouraBLe Rar BamapuR Liara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: Are you satisfied with- this number?



128 COUNCIL OF BTATE. [157n Fra. 1984

Tux HoNoumaBLE Barvip RAZA ALI: As a matter of fact that is the
fault I have to find with my Honourable friend. Why does he confine
himsclf to one post? I would like all three posts to be held by Indians.
The only difference between him and me is that I think we can attain
cur object sooner by not reserving only one post for Indians. I think he
wants the right thing but in a wrong manner. If there is a reservation the
effect will be that you will be entitled to have an Indian, but they will not
care tc give you two Indians.

Tue  HoNoURABLE Rar Basapur Lara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: On a point of order. I have moved that at least one—

Tar Hoxourarre THRE PRESIDENT: Order, order. The Honourable
Member will proceed with his speech. :

Tne HoNourasLr Sarvip RAZA ALI: Sir, I have very carefully noted
the language of the amendment of my learned friend. M);v sub-
mission is that it is a question no doubt which admits of a difference
of opinion but I think the sounder and the better policy would be not to
have any reservation, and, instead of aiming at one of these posts going to
an Indian, to prepare ourselves for a position when we can rightly ask
tho Government to have two Indians among these officers or ultimately
have Indians for all these three offices. My point is simply this that
looking to tlie menner in which things are movieg in India I do not think
it would bs prudent to insist on reservation of seats for Indians. We can
attain our object sooner and better by not having any reservation.

Tne HoxovraBLE THE PRESIDENT: Amendment moved

“That to sub-clause (I) (a) of clanse 8, the following proviso be added :
‘Provided that out of three at least one shall always be a native of India’.’”

The Question is:-
“That that amendment be made.”

The Motion was negatived.

Tre Honourase Rar Bamabur Lata MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: Sir, I beg to move:

“That in sub-clause () (b) of clause 8, after the words ‘Governor General in Council”
the words ‘out of whom two shall represent the agriculture and co-operative interests’
be inserted.”

Sir, the object of this amendment is to make sure that of the four
Dircctors nominated by the Governor General two will represent the co-
operative and agricultural interests. It was said in the Committee that
the Governor General would have those interests in view in making these
appointments and if none of the elected Directors represents agricultural
and co-operative interests they will surely bear those interests in mind
in making nominations. But, 8ir, in India more than 85 per cent. are
living on sgriculture and we want that the agricultural and co-operative
interests should be adequately represented. Therefore, even if one or two
elected Directors do represent those interests, though I think their success



RESERVE BANE OF INDIA BILL, 129

iin the ebections is doubtful, it will be necessary to have at least two out
«f the four nominated Directors to represent these interests. I hope this
amendment will be accepted by the Honourable Mr. Taylor.

Tue HoNouraBLe MR. J. B. TAYLOR: Bir, this is agsin a question
.on . which the Joint Committee commented and on which the Honourable
Mr. Mehrotra wrote a note of dissent. which forms the basis of his present
.amendment. 1 would like to read what the Joint Committee said:

“We considered. whether any addition should be made to this sub-clause in the form
-of a direction to the Gavernor General in Council as to the manner in which he
should exercise his power of nomination. We have been assured that it is intended
that this power shall be used to ensure that territorial or economic interests which
have not secured adequate representation in the elections shall have such inadequacy
-corrected by this means. We do not consider it appropriate to embody in the
statute any specific provision for the fulfilment of this intention, but we consider that
in the instrument of instructions to the Governor General a passage should be inserted
making it clear that this power should be exercised in the general manner indicated
.above and in particular to secure adequate representation of the interests of agricul-
ture and co-operative banking if these interests had not secured such representation
:among the elected directors’

Sir, I think that that recommendation is obviously sound. We do not
wish to fetter the discretion of the Governor General in Council in nomina-
ting. The cbject of nomination is to see that any inadequacies in the
voting system are corrected. We are creating fresh electorates. We
-do not know who will be returned by those electorates, and it seems to
me that to fetter the discretion of the Governor General in Council in any
particular direction may have unforeseen and unfortunate results. The
ohject of securing proper representation for agricultural interests should
‘be fully obtained by the method proposed by the Joint Committee. This
amendment is therefore unnecessary and would I submit constitute an
unnecessary limitation to the discretion of the Governor General in Council,
T therefore oppose it.

Trr HonouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: Amendment moved:

“That in sub-clause (7) (b) of clanse 8, after the words ‘Governor General in Council’
lt;he_wol;g:d‘ﬁut of whom two shall represent the agriculture and co-operative interests’
‘be inserted. .

The Question is:
“That that amendment be made.”

) 'The Motion was negatived.

Trr HonNourasre Rar BamapuR Lara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: Sir, I beg to move:

“That to sub-clause (Z) (d) of clause 8, the following proviso be added :
‘Provided that out of 13 voting directors at least ten shall aways be Indian

’

Nationals’.”’;

The object of this amendment is to secure a majority of votes for
Indian Nationals. It is for that reason that I have moved this amend-
‘ment. As I know the fate of the amendment and as I have seen the
fate of other amendments, it is no use advancing any arguments for this
or other amendments. I am moving amendments just to record my vote
'glthoq? any more arguments, because that will be wasting the time of thv

-ouneil]. ’



* 130 COUNCIL OF STATE. [15tH FEs. 1934.

Tue HonouraBLe MR. J. B. TAYLOR: 8ir, I should like to say &
few words against this amendment. I think that there is an additional
disadvantage as regards this particular amendment and that is that we
have secured that in practice the shares will be held either by Indian
Nationals or by British subjects resident in India and we must assume
that the directorate will reflect the composition of the shareholders. 16
would be impossible in practice to work elections on this method because
the shareholders of a particular register could not know what ther
quota was to be. I oppose the amendment.

Tae HonouraBre THE PRESIDENT: Amendment moved:

*“That to sub-clause (I) (d) of clanse 8, the following proviso be added :

‘Provided that out of 13 voting directors at least ten shall always be Indian:
Nationals’.”

The Question is:
‘“That that amendment be made."

The Motion was negatived.

Tae HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: The Question then is:
“That clause 8 stand part of the Bill.”

The Motion was adopted. .
Clause 8 was added to the Bill.

Tre HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: The Question is:
That clause 9 stand part of the Bill.”

Tre HoNoURABLE Rar Bamapur ILata MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: Sir, I beg to move:

“That in sub-clause (I) (a) of clause 9, for the word ‘five’ the word ‘ten’ be
substituted.”

The object of this amendment is to increase the number of Directors
on the local board from five to ten. As Honourable Members must have
seen, the function of these local boards is merely advisory and they have
to ndvise only on matters referred to by the central board or any regula-
tions made by the central board and nothing else. I just want to increase
the number on these boards, because the directors of the central boards
will be elected from these boards' and if there is & larger number of
directors it will facilitate representation of all interests. We know that
according to the five divisions of India large areas have been combined
into one sentre and it will not be quite sufficient to have five directors
on these hoards. I, therefore, Sir, move this amendment.

Toe Hovourasie MR, J. B. TAYLOR: 8ir, the numbers on the local
board were arrived at after considerable discussion both in London and
in India. We considered that five elected members were enough for electoral
purposes and that a larger board would be awkward for administrative
purposes. In addition, Sir, one of the practical difficulties which T foresee
for the new Reserve Bank will be to find a sufficient number of qualified
directors or members of the local boards. To increase them unduly would
increase the difficulty. I therefore oppose the amendment.



RESERVE BANK OF INDIA BILL, 131

"Tue HonourasLe THE PRESIDENT: Amendment ‘moved:

“That in sub-clause (7) (a) of clause 9, for the word ‘five’ tho word ‘ien’ he
substituted.’’

The Question is:
“That that amendment be made.”

The Motion was ucgatived.

Tur. HonouvraBLe THE PRESIDENT:' The Question then is:
“That clause 9 stand part of the Bill.”

The Motion was adopted. «
Clause 9 was added to the Bill.
Clauses 10, 11 and 12 were added to the Bill.

THE HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: The Question is:
“That clause 13 stand part of the Bill.”

THE HoNoURABLE Rar BamapurR Lara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: S8ir, I beg to move:

“That for sub-clause (3) of clause 13 the following be substituted, namely :

‘(3) The Board shall elect its own Chairman from amongst themselves who shall
preside at all meetings and in the event of equality of votes shall have

a casting vote or second vote'.”

8ir, the object of this amendment is just to bring in the practice that
has been followed and is being followed in the Imperial Bank of India
Act. There the Board of Directors do elect their own Chairman who
presides over meetings and who has in case of equality of votes a second
vote; but under this Bill the Governor is to preside over the meetings
of the Board and in case of equality of votes he will have a second vote.
I do not think it very proper that the Governor, who will be an executive
officer of this Board, and whose duty will be only to carry out the directions
given by the Board, should preside over the elected and nominated Board
of Directors and have larger power than the Board itself. If it has worked
vory well in the Imperial Bank Act. I see no reason why it should not
work well in the Reserve Bank. As my Honourable friend just quoted
the practice of the Imperial Bank of India. so I have also quoted its
practice and hope if he has accepted one practice there he will accept

the other here also.

Tre HonovrasLe MR. J. B. TAYLOR: gir, I must oppose this amend-
ment. It is true that in the Imperial Bank a representative of the share-
holders does preside, but, Sir, the Imperial Bank is predominantly a
commercial bank which is being even further commercinlized and there
is no case so far as I know among Central Banks where the Governor
does not preside. It obviously makes for more efficient and unified

control. I therefore oppose the amendment.

Tre Honourasre tHR. PRESTDENT: Amendment moved:
“That for sub-clause (3) of clanse 13 the following be substituted, namely :
‘(%) The Board shall elect its own Chairman from amongst themselves who shall
preside at all meetings and in the event of equality of votes shall have

! a casting vote or second vote’."” )
B2



132 COUNOCIL OF STATE, [15Te Fes. 1934.

[Mr. President.]
The Question is:
‘“That that amendment be made.”

The Motion was negatived.

Tae HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: The Question then is:
“That clause 13 stand part of the Bill.”

The Motion was adopted.
Clause 13 was added to the Bill.

Tee HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: The Question is:
‘“That clause 14 vghnd part of the Bill.”

Tee HowoukaBLE Mr. J. B. TAYLOR: Sir, I move:

*‘That in sub-clause (3) of clanse 14 for the words ‘five shares shall have one vote and
on poll being demanded each shareholder so registered as having more than five shares’
the following words be substituted, namely :

‘five or more shares shall have one vote and on a poll being demanded each share-
holder so registered’.”

Sir, this is a purely verbal amendment. A change was introduced in
the Bill in another place with the intention of making it clear that until
a poll was demanded each shareholder only had one vote but that when
a poll was demanded he would exercise the same voting rights as in the
case of an election, Unfortunately, the amendment which was received
from the non-official side was not quito correctly worded and it might be
interpreted as meaning that in that event only those who held more than
five shares would be allowed to vote at all and that single votes would be
eliminated. That was clearly not the intention of the clause; we have
therefore corrected it to meet what we think to be the intention of the
Legislature in the matber,

Sir, I move.

- Tae HowouraLe  Rary Bamapuvr Lara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: §Sir, if I intervene it is only to put a question to the
Honourable Mr. Taylor—the same question which I put when he moved
the first amendment and it is this: If this amendment is carried will
the Bill be referred to the Assembly again or not?

Tne HonovrasLE THE PRESIDENT: The Honourable Member ought
to be aware that if amendments are made in this Bjll by this House of
course the Bill will have to go back to the Legislative Assembly.

Tre  HoNouraBLE Rar BaAHADUR Laia MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: I only asked the question, Bir, because my friend has
been telling us that these are purely verbal amendments.

Tae Honovrasre THE PRESIDENT: Whether the amendments are
verbal or substantial the Bill has to go back to the other House.



RESERVE BANK OF INDIA BILL, 133

Amendment moved :

“That in sub-clause ($) of clause 14 for the words ‘five shares shall have one vote and
on poll being demanded each shareholder so registered as having more than five shares’
the following words be substituted, namely :

five or more shares shall have one vote and on a poll being demanded each
shareholder so registered’."”

The Question is:
““That that amendment be made.’’

The Motion was adopted.
Clause 14, us amended, was added to the Bill. ¢

TeHE HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: The Question is:
“That clause 15 stand part of the Bill.”

Tee HonNouraBLE Rar Basmabur Lara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: Sir, I beg to move:

“That for sub-clause (3) of clause 15 the following be substituted, namely :

‘(8) The Governor General in Council will appoint a committee of five persons
in' the first instance to issue shares, make allotment of shares and carry out
elections of Local and Central Boards and as soon as the Boards are com-.
pletely elected they shall retire automatically’.’’

According to the scheme of the Bill the Governor General will make
nominations of eight Directors who will issue and allot shares and be
working as Directors till all the other Directors are elected which will take
according to the present scheme four years to get the whole Board elected,
that is eight Directors to bo elected in four years. I think, Sir, it will be
a very long time before the shareholders will have the satisfaction of
getting their representatives on the Board and therefore I have put in
this amendment. According to this amendment the Government will
have the satisfaction of nominating the first Board who will carry out the
primary work and later on when the elections are held and the Directors
have been elected by the shareholders they will retire automatically.
Thus the sharcholders will have the satisfaction of their representation
on the Board from the very beginning and I hope the amendment will
find acceptance from the Government.

TrE HonouraBLE MR. HOSSAIN IMAM: Sir, with your permissiop I
wish to intervene in the debate to put in a few points about our diffi-
cultics. When we wanted to have a State Bank it was said it would he
better for Indin to have a Shareholders’ Bank. But during the critical
period when we will have to start work without any previous experience
and without any knowledge of the technical departments, Government
would create a Board which is wholly nominated and to all intents and
purposes a Government Board. Up to the beginning of the second year
the proportion of the elected to the nominated members will be two to
ten. At the heginning of the third year there will be four elected members
to eight nominated. At the beginning of the fourth year there will he
equal numbers and at the beginning of the fifth year there will be the
majority of the members elected. So that in the first critical period when
we will be on our trial, when it will be seen whether the Reserve Bank
18 working satisfactorily or not as a condition precedent to the new re-
forms, we will he having a State Bank, if not in word at least in deed.



134 COUNCIL OF STATE. [15rn FiB. 1934.

[Mr. Hossain Imam.]

‘We, 8ir, would not have minded it; we would rather have welcomeqd it.
It is a step forward in the right direction. But our trouble arises when
we consider that all this camouflage has been made to deprive none others
but the Indians of their rights. While the Government is irresponsible
to the Legislature it will have the right to nominate those in whose hands
our destinies are going to be placed but as soon as it is feared that
Indians will come in to their own and will have—not a real power but ab
least—the shadow of power, at once this power will be taken away and
.control will be vested in the hands of people who have not tried it. There
is no advantage in having a Board created now which will carry on work
for five years. The only utility of the Board was to allot shares and for
that purpose this proposition that a tommittee should be formed which
will retire automatically after doing its work would have some real trans-
fer of power and would have allowed Indians, elected Indians, to have
some sort of control. Would it not be strange, Sir, that if the nominated
members of the Government do not let things go smoothly, the whole ot
non-official India should be taken to task and responsibility in the centre
refused? It is a wrong principle. Responsibility is placed on the people
of India to work it successfully. But those who will control its destinies
are not allowed to be elected by the people of India. The Local Boards
will be formed at once after the shares have been allotted and therefore
there will be no difficulty in electing the Central Board. There is another
aspect which we wished to place before the Joint Committee. The practice
will grow up of transferring shares from one register to another. For
instance, suppose a firm has got a branch in Calcutta as well as Bombay.
Tn one year we will have the elections in Bombay and in another year n
Calcutta according to the present plan. All the shares held in Bombay
by an important firm may be transferred to its branch in Calcutta. This
is a real danger and in effect it will mean that the elections will be con-
trolled by a coterie of important firms. All the important interests and
industries in Calcutta and Bombay can interchange their shares; and they
can influence the elections in Madras and Rangoon also which are mnear
by. This will create an anomalous position that people with the same
.shares will exercise a voting right in two places simply because of transfer
of shares from one register to another.

Trr HonouraLe Mr. BIJAY KUMAR BASU (Bengal: Nominated
Non-Official): What about clause 567

Tue HonoumraBLe Mr. HOSSAIN IMAM: It will be a real transfer
to all intents and purposes. No one knows better than my Honourable
friend himself how the big firms in Calcutta could get any number of
assistants—hundreds of them—in whose name the shares can be transferred
and it will be held by them benami. As soon as the work is finished it
will be transferred back. This sort of thing will not come under the
proviso to clause 56. My Honourable friend Mr. Taylor also said when
we wanted to have 200 shares restriction that people will get hold of
bonamidars to hold the shares. That is the real danger. Unless the
elections are held simultaneously in all parts of India this transferring
of shares from one register to another will go on and it will have a very
bad effect un the elections. Threfore, Sir, I support this amendment.



RESERVE BANK OF INDIA BILL, 135

THE HoNouraBLE MR. J. B, TAYLOR: S8ir, I have two objections to
this amendment, one technical and the other of substance. As regards
the technical point, the apparent intention of the amendment is that the
object of the Committee is to constitute the Board, and not to function
as the Board except in cortain specified matters and therefore the Bank
will not be able to function at all until the elections have been held and
until the new shareholders have been vested with those shares and held
them for six months. That would involve very considerable delay.
Becondly, Sir, Government accepted an amendment in another place
agrecing that a Committee consisting of two elected Members of the
Assembly and one elected Member of the Council of State to be elected
by the non-official Members of the respective Houses should be associated
with the Central Board for the purpose of making public issue of shares
and looking after the first allotment of shares. This is provided in the
proviso to clause 4 (5). Therefore, there will be a Committee of the
Legislature associated with the original issue and allotment.

As regurds the danger pointed out by the Honourable Mr. Hossaia
Imam, I do not think that it will, like the other dangers which Members
on the other side have been raising, amount to anything in practice because
of the fundumental fact on which I have reiterated here this morning and
on several other occasions, namely, the very wide distribution of the
shares and the allotment of the voting power. In practice, as anybody
who has experience of any Bank will know, it is essential that there should
be continuity in the Directorate. If there are general elections and an
entirely new body comes in, all continuity is lost and a difficult task is
thrown on the Executive to instil old ideas on matters of ordinary proce-
dure into the new board. In the Imperial Bank, Sir, the experience is
that it is ordinarily only after some twelve months that a nominated
Director finds that he is really sufficiently acquainted with the technique
of the business to take a useful part in the discussions. It is essential,
therefore, that there should be continuity. Also, 8ir, in the Joint Com-
mittee, Government accepted a modification of the original proposals so
a8 to secure a more even flow of election and also to secure that there
will be full popular representation at an earlier date than was originally
contemplated We had hoped that the modifications which are now em-
bodied in the Bill would have met with general acceptance. I do not
think, Sir, that the other criticism that there will be a surge of shares
Tunning from one centre to another is of any practical validity because
of the limitation of voting power and the residential qualification. If it
should have any practical validity, it will be simple enough for the Legisla-
ture in the future to take measures to combat it. But at this stage I
think that it would be very inadvisable to depart from something which
will have a practical good effect merely because of some fancied possible
danger. T therefore oppose the amendment.

Tee HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: Amendment moved :

““That for sub-clause (3) of clause 15 the following be substituted, namely :

‘(3) The Governor General in Council will appdint a committee of five persons
in the first instance to issue shares, make allotment of shares and carry out
elections of Local and Central Boards and as soon as the Boards are com-
pletely elected they shall retire automatically’.”

The Question is:
“‘That that amendment be made.”
‘The Motion was negatived.



136 COUNOIL OF BTATE. [15TH FEB. 1934..

Tre HoNouvrasLe MR. J. B. TAYLOR: Sir, I beg to move:

“That in sub-clause (4) of clause 15 for the word ‘registers’ where it first occurs.
the word ‘register’ be stituted.’’

Sir, this is purely a verbal misprint which has to be corrected.
The Motion was adopted.

Clause 15, as amended, was added to the Bill.

Clause 16 was added to the Bill.

Tae HoNourRABLE THE PRESIDENT: The Question is:
“That clause 17 stand part of the Bill.”

Tae HoNouRABLE RAl BaHaDUR Lata MATHURA PRASAD MEH-
ROTRA: Sir, I beg to move:

“That in sub-clause (2) (a) of, clause 17 after the words ‘scheduled bank’ the words-
‘or a Provincial Co-operative Bank' be inserted.” -

As the Honourable Members of this House are aware, certain facilifies
have been given to co-operative institutions, especially Provincial Co-
operative Banks. In this sub-clause certain business, that is, the
purchase, sale and re-discount cf bills of exchange and promissory notes,
drawn on and payable in India and arising out of bona fide commercial
or trade transactions bearing two or more good signatures, can be con-
ducted if one of the signatories is a scheduled bank. I want to insert
here the Provincia] Co-operative Bank also. The object is that if &
Provincial Co-operative Bank is a signatory, these transactions can be
beld. The Provincial Co-operative Bank should also have the advantage
of purchase, sale and rediscount of bills of exchange, ete., if it wants.
to do so. This is a very simple amendment and I hope Government.
will accept it.

Tue HoNourasLe MR, J. B. TAYLOR: Sir, the reason why Provincial
Co-operative Banks are not included in this particular sub-section ig a
simple one. Special facilities are granted to Co-operative Banks in the-
matter of agricultural credit. The Co-operative Banks, though they wilk
have to furnish certain returns, will be exempt from the liabilitieg of
Scheduled Banks. They will not have to make a compulsory deposit,
and for that reason it was felt that their special facilities should be
confined merely to the special object for which Co-operative Banks are
primarily designed, that is to say, agricultural credit. Co-operative Banks
are therefore given facilities in sub-clause (2) (b) and it will be seen that
that sub-clause is very widely worded and includes bills

*‘drawn or issued for the purpose of financing seasonal agricultural operations or
the marketing of crops, and maturing within nine months from the date of such
purchase or rediscount, exclusive of days of grace.”

The wording is very wide and includes all sorts of agricultural
operations. In this connection, 8ir, the Honourable Mr Hossain Imam
yesterday said that hypothecation had been excluded from the Bill. I do-
not know to what he was referring because I cannot recollect any such
exclusion and it seems to me that these words are.so widely—

Trs HoNourapLe MR. HOSSAIN TMAM: In clause 18 as it appeared
in the original Bill.



RESERVE BANK OF INXDIA BILL, 187

Tre HoNourABLE MR. J. B. TAYLOR: I am sorry, 8ir. I thought that
he was referring to clause 17. Clause 18 is only to be used on exceptional
occasions. But, Sir, as regurds -this particular sub-clause, the powers.
granted to Co-operative Societies are already very wide with reference:
to their main function, which is agricultural credit, and we do not
consider that it would be fair to extend special privileges to them in
matters in which they will come into more direct competition with
Scheduled Banks when they are not subject to the liabilities to which
those Banks are being subjected.

TeE HoxourasLe TRE PRESIDENT: Amendment moved:

“That in sub-clause (2) (a) of clause 17 after the words ‘scheduled bank’ the words
‘or & Provincial Co-operative Bank’ be inserted.’’
- The Question is: !

“That that amendment be made.”

The Motion was negatived.

Tur HonouraBLe THE PRESIDENT: The Question then is:
*“That clause 17 stand part of the Bill.”

' The Motion was adopted
Clause 17 was added to the Bill.
Clauses 18 to 39, inclusive, were added to the Bill.

Tae HoNourasLe tTHE PRESIDENT: The Question is:
““That clause 40 stand part of the Bill.”

THE HoXxouraBLE Rar Bauapur Lara MATHURA PRASAD MEH-
ROTRA: Sir, I beg to move: ’

*That clause 40 be omitted.”

Tae HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: I disallow this amendment.
because it has the effect of a negative vote only. The Honourable
Member can speak on the clause but the amendment cannot be moved.

Tae HoNoUraBLE Rai Bamapuvr Lara MATHURA PRASAD MEH-
ROTRA: Sir, I rise to oppose this clause. The Government regards
this as one of the fundamental. clauses, as they have said many times
in the Joint Select Committee ng well ag in the other House. On our
eide we also regard it as most detrimental to the interests of India. If
there is going to be any obligation on the Reserve Bank to sell sterling
at a rate not below:

Tae HonovrasLe tir PRESTDENT: May T remind the Honourable
Member that there is another amendment to the same effect by the
Honourable Mr. Banerjee, and in fact I ought not to have allowed him
to speak on this subject at this stage because he would get the opportunity
to speak when the Honourable Mr. Banerjee moves his amendment. I

erefore trust he will curtail his remarks congiderably having beer
Permitted to start his speech.



138 COUNCIL OF STATE. [156TH Fes. 1984.

Tae HoNoURABLE Rai Bamapur Lara MATHURA PRASAD MEH-
ROTRA: Sir, I will abide by your suggestion and close my remarks very
shortly. We have received representations in the Joint Select Committee
from all sections in India, agricultural, commercial and other interests,
and there is practical unanimity that so long as Government makes this
compulsory selling of sterling at a price fixed by them, India is to lose
very much.  Agriculturists and business people have suffered greatly.
I do not know what interest the Government is thinking of when in spite
of pressure from all sides they keep up this ratio. If, as I wag going
to propose, there is no mention about this in the Reserve Bank Bill, the
result will be that this Bank will not be obliged to sell sterling at the
rate fixed in the Bill and sterling will find its own level. That is our
only object. I do not know whether it should be 1s. 8d. or 1s. or 14d.
It may be snything, But we are of opinion that it should find its own
level und that will. be in the interests of India. As long as the Govern-

ment does not revise this policy, India will lose heavily as it has been
losing in the past. '

Tae HoNouraBLe THE PRESIDENT: If you go on like this you may
not catch my eye later on.

TEr HoNoURABLE Rar BamapurR Lara MATHURA PRASAD MEH-
ROTRA: Very well, Sir, with these remarks I oppose this clause.

Tre HoNouraBLe Me. JAGADISH CHANDRA BANERJEE:
1 should like to speak on clauses 40 and 41 together.

Tur HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: I would advise you to confine
yourself to clause 40 only.

Tee HoNouraBLE MRr. JAGADISH CHANDRA BANERJEE:
This amendment is moved to bring back India to the exchange level
which——.

Tre HoNouraBrLe THE PRESIDENT: You will first read your amend-
ment.

Tae HoNouraBLe Mr. JAGADISH CHANDRA BANERJEE:
8ir, I beg to move:

_ "“That in clause 40 for the words ‘one shilling and five pence’ the words ‘one
shilling and three pence’ be substituted.’

Tae HoNouraBLe THE PRESIDENT: May I remind the Honourable
Membar that he has referred to this matter very exhaustively in hig speech
yesterday and I trust he will be as brief as possible.

Tae HovouraBLe Mr. JAGADISH CHANDRA BANERJEE:
I will be brief, Sir. In clause 41— .

li'lll‘nn HonouraBLe TRE PRESIDENT: I have already given you my
ruling. -



RESERVE BANK OF INDIA BILL, 139

Tur HoNoukaBLg MRr. JAGADISH CHANDRA BANERJEE:
‘Bir, this amendment is moved to bring back India to the exchange level
1 which existed for about a quarter of a century and helped

®M.  India to advance on the road of economic prosperity. The
advocates of a higher ratio are not to be found except in the ranks of
the Government Members, Europeans and Indians, Hindus and Muslims,
industrialista and the agriculturists all have joined issue and with united
voice demanded a devaluation. The only people who could possibly
object to devaluation are the people with fixed income like the Government -
servants, because increased prices will reduce their savings. But if they
consider for a moment that the increased prices will still be lower than
the 1929 level they ought to be consoled. I do not wish to elaborate my
point as this question has been ventilated in the Press and vehemently
‘supported in several public meetings. To bring home to this -Honourable
House the advantages of lower exchange I would just cite the example
-of Japan which has flooded the market of the world with cheap goods and
in now the most prosperous country as far as industrial activity is
concerned.

*Tre HoNouraBLE Mr. HOSSAIN IMAM: Sir, I wish to oppose the
Motion about clause 40. I am not opposing the amendment moved by
my Honourable colleague Mr. Banerjee. My own standpoint is that this
Reserve Bank is not really a suitable place to fix the exchange ratio. I
should like to remind the House that in doing this we will be following in
the footsteps of the Government of Great Britain. At the present
moment the Bank of England is under no obligation to sell gold at any
fixed price. They are under obligation to purchase and in a similar
manner 1 would support clause 41 but oppose clause 40. Yesterday my
Honourable colleague, the Finance Secretary, twitted me about stable
money and said that nowhere in the central banks you find existence of
this. I quite agree. But there is no stable money at the present moment.
But the next best thing is planned money and that is the thing which
both Great Britain and the United BStates are trying to establish.
Although we may not be so advanced as England we wish to have the
same right of having a planned money. At the present mement the
pound sterling has no value except the promise of the Bank of England
to give back in different denomination of notes. We can go and ask for
exchange of five pound notes and they will give five notes of one pound.
There 18 no backing. There is neither gold nor exchange. Tt is well
known, Sir, that in the older conception of exchange there used to be
either gold or exchange backing, but the new conception of having some
sort of uniform rate of prices is emerging out of this catastrophe and we’
wish that we should have the same right to manage our currency to the
best advantage of India without being bothered to attach it to the tail
of sterling. Therefore I oppose clause 40.

~ Tre HoNouraBLE Mr. J. B. TAYLOR: Bir, I presume that I will be
in order in speaking both to the amendment and to the clause itself?

Tre HonouraBre THE PRESIDENT: Certainly.

Tre HonouraLe Mgr. J. B. TAYLOR: First of all, Sir, as regards
the amendment, I think that very little need be said. I gather that there
18 not even unity on the opposition benches as to the desirability of

*Speech not corrected. b; tjm Hon'cvil‘fnb]: Member



140 COUNCIL OF STATE. [16te Fes. 1934.

[Mr. J. B. Taylor.]

substituting 1s. 6d. by 1s. 4d. and that difference of opinion is merely a
pale reflection of the much wider .difference of opinion that exists in the
country. I therefore do not think that I need waste time on this parti-
cular amendment except to point out that that it is of course incorrect to-
say that the amendment proposed is to restore the rate which is said to
have given India so mueh economic prosperity over the quarter century
before the war. 8ir, our exchange is already nearly 50 per cent. below
that level measured in terms of gold. We are on a sterling standard and
what my Honourable friend is proposing is something which, good or bad,
is entirely different from the pre-war standard based on gold. That, Bir,
is recognized even by those who attack Government’s general policy and
T think that the view of those who oppose us is more correctly represented
by the Honourable Mr. Hossain Imam.
8ir, I do not wish to go over the whole ground again, but I would
point out that the deletion of these clauses will leave a lacuna in the Bill
which will totally wreck it. The whole object of the creation of a Reserve
Bank is to centralize the control of currency and credit by bringing them.
together. In other words, the Reserve Bank when it is considering the
question of providing finance for the marketing of India’s crops will have
to decide how far that credit will be supplied against internal bills and
how far by the method which we at present follow of buying sterling from
the exchange banks and creating currency against that sterling. If the
bank is to be precluded from dealing in sterling in that way, its whole-
basis drops out. It cannot safely give credit merely against internal
business. It must recognise the facts of the situation, which is that the
bulk of India’s erops for which finance is required are for export and we
inust therefore correlate our internal credit with our external exchange.
In other words, the omission of this clause would make the Bill quite
unworkable. I did not intend, Sir, to twit the Honourable Mr. Hossain
Imam on his suggestions about stable money. When the world curren-
cies are in such a state of chaos it is not for anybody to twit anybody who-
is thinking out new theories, because I think the one conclusive fact
which is emerging is that we will never in the future be the same as in
the past. But that does not mean that we are to do nothing until the:
future is stable. If so, we may wait indefinitely. What we must do is
to create an organization now on the existing state of affairs, not on a.
vague and hypothetical basis which may or may not come into existence
in the future, because we do not know how the future will develop; but
v the creation of a Reserve Bank we shall be better prepared to meet
the future as it comes. That, I think, is the answer to any proposal to
impose on the Bank at this stage any hypothetical scheme of keeping
money stable. I therefore for these two reasons oppose the amendment
and 1 also oppose the direct negative. In other words, I propose that the
clause do stand as it is.

Tur HoxourasLt THE PRESTDENT: Amendment moved:

“That in clause 40 for (o words 'oro shilling aud five pence’ the words ‘one
shilling and three pence’ be substituted.”

The Quostion is:
“Phat that emendment be made.”

The Motion was negatived.



RESERVE BANK OF INDIA BILL, 141

Tae HoNoUraBLE THE PRESIDENT: The Question then is:
“That clause 40 stand part of the Bill.”

The Motion was adopted.

Clause 40 was added to the Bill.

Clauses 41 to 47, inelusive, were added to the Bill.

Tae HonNoUuraBLE THE PRESIDENT: The Question is:
*““I'hat clause 48 atand part of the Bill.”

Tae HonouraBLE MR. J. B. TAYLOR: Sir, I move:

“That in sub-clause (£) of clause 48 for the figures '44' the figures ‘47" be
-substituted.’’ ’

This is a purely consequential amendment due to the introduction of
-several other clauses in the Bill.

The Motion was adopted.

-Clause 48, as amended, was added to the Bill.
Clauses 49 to 61, inclusive, were added to the Bill.
The First Schedule was added to the Bill.

The Second Schedule was added to the Bill.

TBE HovouraBrLe THE PRESIDENT: The Question is:
‘“I'hat the Third Schedule stand part of the Bill.”’

Tee HonNouraBLE Rai Bamapur Lara MATHURA PRASAD
MEHROTRA: 8ir, I beg to move:

‘““I'hat in the Third Schodule to the Bill:

(1) in paragraph 2 in the fifth line for the word ‘ten’ the word ‘five’ be sub-
stituted ;

{2) in paragraph 2 in the sixth line for the words and figures ‘first 250 crores’
the words and figures ‘first 100 crores’ be substituted;

{3) in paragraph 3 in the third line for the words ‘fifteen years’ the words
‘ten years’ be substituted;

{4) in paragraph 3 in clause (a) for the words ‘five years' the words ‘three years’
be substituted ;

{5) in paragraph 3 in clause (b) for the words ‘five years’ the words ‘three
years' be substituted; and

(6) in paragraph 3 in clause (c) for tho words ‘five years’ the words ‘four years’
be substituted.”

Sir, the terms offered to the Imperial Bank are very much on the side
of generosity which it has not justified by its deeds, and are practieally the
same as were offered in 1927-28 in spite of the fact that five years have
elapsed and the Bank has done .more both in the way of establishing its
reputation and transacting business.

Sir, when the first agreement with the Imperial Bank was ‘made in
1820 it was only for ten yvears. Under that agreement the Imperial Bank
was pledged to open 100 branches. It has done so, There is no obligation



142 COUNGLL OF STATE. [156mu Fes., 1934.

[Rai Bahadur Lala Mathura Prasad Mehrotra. ]

on the Government to do anything more for the Imperial Bank. Then,
Bir, it has exceeded the agreement by two years and taken more advantage.
Now, it would have been in the fitness of things to call for tenders from
other established banks of the first class and see what terms they had
to offer. ' ‘

Let us now examine what the Imperial Bank has done for India, and
then we will discuss the question, Sir. It has totally refused to make
advances on immovable properties and has failed hopelessly to satisfy
public expectations in the way of developing a bill market in India; it has.
not provided adequate finance to industry and agriculture ; it has practically
withdrawn its facilities to the co-operative instltutions and failed to
develap banking capital in the country. India is an agricultural country
and it was but proper to expect that a quasi-government bank whiech had
all their resources at its disposal, will do its best to render every possible
help. In support of this argument T shall quote two sentences from the
Central Banking Inquiry Committee’s Report on page 143:

“The policy of the Imperial Bank of India in regard to the grant -of -firancial
assistance to some of the provincial and central co-operative banks seems of late to:
have undergone a definite change and it is stated that it shows today a much smaller
measure of readiness to help them than it used to do in the past. We consider that
free remittance of funds for co-operative purposes is of the utmost importance to the
co-operative movement and that no attempt should be made to curtail the privileges
under the rules of the Government of India in this matter’.

Sir, that is how the Imperial Bank has treated the co-operative move-
ment which alone is meant for the betterment of the conditions of the
agriculturist, who as I said occupy the foremost position in India. If the
Imperial Bank has curtailed its account with the co-operative banks and
is not going to advance money to the agriculturist as well as to the
zumindar, the question is what it hag done for the country for which these
favourable terms have again before offered to it? When the first agree-
ment was made for ten years, why is there any reason for making the
second agreement for 15 years? I say it should not be made for more-
than ten years and if the terms were acceptable m 1927-28 there is no
reason why they should not be acceptable today. Therefore, Sir, I move
this amendment for the acceptance of the Housc.

Tae HovouvrasLE Mr. J, B. TAYLOR: Sir, I think that a good deal
of the Honourable Member’s speech would have been more suitably
directed to clause 45 of the Bill which deals with the question of entering
into an agreement with the Imperial Bank at all. He said nothing when
we were considering that section. This schedule merely deals with the-
terms of rernuneration and I shall therefore confine myself strictly to the
amendment so far as it concerns that schedule.

Sir, the terms to be given to the Imperial Bank have naturally formed
the subject of very careful consideration by Government. An elaborate
memorandum was put before the Joint Committee detailing at considerable
length the actual work which the Imperial Bank did and the cost of that
work. It seems to me it is a wrong attitude to stand on the strictly legal
jdes that because the first term of agreement with the Imperial Bank
was merely for ten years there is therefore no obligation to subsidise them
in any way for the large number of branches which they have created in
accordance with that agreement. Sir, the proper way to look on this



RESERVE BANK OF INDIA BILL 143

question is that these branches were created for the development of the
banking habit of the country and they have proved very successful in that
direction. If we withdraw that subsidy, as these branches do not pay,
we will not be in a position to object to the Imperial Bank closing them
down to the great detriment of the country. The terms have been worked
out o as to cover not only the cost to the Bank of doing Government work
but also to include a steadily diminishing subsidy towards the loss on these
branches. They were examined by the Joint Committee in the presence
of representatives of the Imperial Bank, and though the terms were provi-
sionally approved by the Joint Committee, the Government were asked
by the Committee to refer the figures to the Auditor General to conduct
a further enquiry. An officer of his department in consultation with an
officer of the Imperial Bank did actually go through the books of one branch
und examined the general basis on which the figures were calculated and
the Auditor General made a report which was quoted in another place
confirming the fairness of the bargain that had been struck, as being in
the interests of both the parties. Tn fact he expressed his view that
Government had made a very good bargain. I submit, Sir, that the
Honourable Rai Bahadur Lala Mathura Prasad Mehrotra has advanced
no arguments to show that the rate is excessive or that the basis of the
calculations are wrong though he had all the figures before him. I, there-
fore, consider that he has mnde out no case and that the amendment
should be rejected.

Tae HoNouraBLE Mr. HOSSAIN IMAM : On a point of information, Sir,
Will' the Honourable Member tell us what is the estimated amount that
.will be paid to the Imperial Bank under this Schedule? What is the
turnover that he expects?
|

Tur HoNourRaBLE MR. J. B. TAYLOR: Sir, I am afraid that I have
not the figures with me. They were all put before the Joint Committee
and T submit that this is a detailed matter in which this House can be
suitably guided by the recommendations of the Joint Committee.

Tae HonouraBL THE PRESIDENT: Amendment moved:

“That in the Third Schedule to the Bill :

(1) in paragraph 2 in the fifth line for the word ‘ten’ the word ‘five’ be sub-
stituted ;

(2) in paragraph 2 in the sixth line for the words and figures ‘first 250 crores’
the words and figures ‘first 100 crores’ be substituted ;

(3) in paragraph 3 in the third line for the words ‘fifteen years' the words ‘ten
years’ be substituted ;

(4) in paragraph 3 in clause (a) for the words ‘five years’ the words ‘three
years’ be substituted;

(6) in paragraph 3 in clause (b) for the words ‘five years’ the words ‘three
years’ be substituted; and

(6) in paragraph 3 in clause (c) for the words ‘five years’ the words ‘four years’
be substituted.”

The Question is:
‘““I'hat that amendment be made.”’

The Motion was negatived.



144 COUNOCIL OF BTATE. (16t FEs. 1984.

Tae HoNourasLe MR. J. B. TAYLOR: Bir, I move:

“That in the Third Schedule for the figures ‘1933’ wherever they occur the ﬁguﬁes
“1934' be substituted.’

The Motion was adopted. «
The Third Schedule, as amended, was added to the Bill.

The Fourth Schedule was added to the Bill.

Tue HoNouraBLe Mr. J. B. TAYLOR: B8ir, I move:
‘*“I'hat in the Fifth Schedule for the figures ‘1933’ the figures ‘1934’ be substituted.”

The Motion was adopted. .
The Fifth Schedule, as amended, was added to the Bill.

'Tug HoNourasLe MR, J. B. TAYLOR: 8ir, 1 move:

“That in sub-clause (I) of clause 1 for the figures ‘1933’ the figures ‘1934’ be
-substituted.”’

The Motion was adopted.
Clause 1, as amended, was added to the Bill.
The Title and Preamble were added to the Bill.

T'nE HoNourasre Mr, J. B. TAYLOR: Sir, 1 move:

“That the Bill to constitute a Reserve Bunk oi India, as passed by the Legislative
_Assembly, and as amended by the Council of State, be passed.’’ .

Tue Honourase MRr. VINAYAK VITHAL KALIKAR (Central
Provinces: General): Sir, I think 1 should not record my silent vote on
this Motion and therefore I rise to speak on the salient features of this
Bill. J will obey your suggestion of not repeating the arguments that
-have been made up till now both during the time of the general discussion
aud on the amendments. But some of them unfortunately will have
to be repeated and I crave your indulgence for that purpose. The condi-
tions laid down in the White Paper for the establishment of a Reserve
Bank were four, and the Honourable the Leader of my Party speaking
the other day on the general discussion said that two of these were not
tulfilled. These are that the budgetary position of India as a whole is
not satisfactory and India’s normal export surplus is not assured. It
may be said that the budgetary position of the Central Government is
not faced with difficulty, but my Leader stated facts and figures to
show that the budgetary position of the provinces in India is not so
‘satisfactory as the White Paper conditions demand. If these two condi-
tions are not fulfilled the question arises why there should be such a hurry
for the establishment of the Reserve Bank. I quite understand the
mentality of my countrymen in giving support to this Bill however much
they may not like it. They think that they will not get the reforms if
no Reserve Bank is established. The gentlemen who went a long way
to London and who are supporting this measure are working under a great
handicap. They had before them the threat that if they did not lend
their support, no reforms would be given. I can therefore quite under-
stand why even though there are certain provisions in this Bill which
they do not like, they have lent their support to the measure. T «av this



RESERVE BANK OF INDIA BILL, 1456

because. some gentlemen at least who had supported unanimously Sir
Basil Biackett's Bill for a State Bunk are now forced to support this
Shareholders’ Bank Bill.

Tue HoNouraBrE Mr. BIJAY KUMAR BASU: They have become
wiser.

Tue HonNovraBLe Sik HOMI MEHTA: How are they forced? Who
forces them? )

!
Tue HoNouraBLe Mr. VINAYAK VITHAL KALIKAR: I am glad to
know that they have become wiser. 1 am personally not convinced that
they have become so.

Tue HoNouraBLe Ste HOMI MEHTA: That is your opinion.

Tax HonouraLe Mr. VINAYAK VITHAL KALIKAR: I do not
think that is merely my opinion.

Taeg HoNouraBLE THE PRESIDENT: Order, order. The Honourable
Member will proceed with his speech.

Tae HoNoURABLE MR. VINAYAK VITHAL KALIKAR: Well, then,
Sir, if it is the intention of the Government to force on us a Bill which
nas got so many objectionable clauseg and on which there is such a differ-
ence of opinion, I submit that they should at least have supported some
of the amendments which the supporters of the Shareholders’ Bank had
tabled in the other House, but not only have they not supported those
amendments but they have carried their opposition successfully throughout.
L do not want to enter into the merits or demerits of a Shareholders’ as
ugainst a State Bank. The position put before us is that the Government
do not want to establish a State Bank because they want to avoid the
political influence of Indians; but while they have avoided the political
nfluence of Indians the political influence of England has been introduced
into it. I am not an expert in monetary policies. My Honourable friend
Sir Homi Mehta may have studied the matter. What I fail to see is
how tho political influence of the Governor General in Council which one
finds in practically every clause of this Bill is going to do good to this
country while the political influence of Indians would do harm. I find
a clause which debars Members of the Indian Legislature and the Pro-
vineial Legislatures from a place in the Bank. If on no other grounds, 1
should like to oppose the Bill on this ground alone. Men like Sir Homi
Mehta, yourself, and others who have dealt with these questions for so
many vears have been debarred from guiding the policy of the Bank. If
vou desire to come to the Legislature vou cannot act in the Reserve Bank.
That is a point which has struck me ag a layman. Men like you lead us
in this House and in the Provincial T.egislatures where monetary policies
are concerned, but if you go to the Bank yvou will be unfit to sit in this
House. If you come to this House vou ecannot go to the Bank. The
position is that we are being deprived of the great experience ang talent
of financiers like you by this clause.

Then, Sir, much has been said on the ratio question. There are argu-
ments in favour of it and against it. Sir Montagu Webb savs that the
Present trouble is not the creation of God but of man. He may be right

(o}



146 COUNCIL OF STATE. | 1oTH FEB. 1934.

[Mr, Vinayak Vithal Kalikar.]

or wrong. As g layman I want to put a straight question. Thig ratio
nas been in existence for the last five years. The prices of agricultural
produce have gone down to such a level that you cannot even meet the
cost of production. The other day my friend Sir Kurma Reddi drew a
very graphic picture of the agricultural conditions in Madras. 1 may
assure him that the conditions in my province, the Central Provinces and
Berar, which is mainly agricultural, are not better but even worse than
’n Madras. 8o, if you have tried this game for five years and stil] you
tind that prices have not gone up 1 should expect you to try other methods,
try lowering the ratio for five years and see what would be the result.
And if you are not going to do this, naturally the suspicion arises in the
minds of people like myself who have not studied the question that when
you are adamant against any change there is something wrong.
{

TrE HoNouraBLE SirR HOMI MEHTA: The depression is not only
confined to India. It is all over the world. Most other countries are in a
far worse position than Indis is in today.

Tae HonouraBLe MRr. VINAYAK VITHAL KALIKAR: S8jr Montagu
Webb says that in certain countriés where devaluation has taken place
prices have risen. Sir, 1 do not challenge the correctness of Bir Homi
Mehta's statement. I simply submit that some other method should be
adopted to increase prices and save agriculturists from rack and ruin.
Then, S, my Honourable friend Sir Kurma Reddi's suggestion that the
Reserve Bank should advance loans to agriculturists to save them from
ruin cannot be accepted under the present scheme. Then what will be
the position of the agriculturist even if the Reserve Bank be established?
The agriculturists will naturally say that they have got nothing. from this
Bank; their grievances cannot be relieved und no mathod hag been
devised to relieve them; and therefore their position will be the same
after as before the establishment of this Bank. A suggestion was made
and amendments moved in the Lower House about the early establish-
ment of the rural "credit department. But that suggestion was not
accepted. So that my submission is that even with the Reserve Bank
established the position of the agriculturist will not be in any way improved.
1, therefore, Sir, as a layman, apart from the various other objectionable
features contained in the Bill, cannot find my way to support this Bill
and therefore I oppose it.

¢

4

The Council then adjourned tili Eleven of the Clock on Friday, the
18th February, 1984.





