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Title : Issue regarding demand for formation of separate state Telengana.

offerctt arwanr Farrer (fafdom): seerer of, ...(x@emen) amu 33t @ e, & smud! & o @6 @& g ...(Awel) Fb SI5Y) 3wl Sff, s
UP JA1E A AL dcionell P I Areft JeT 3 b2 3ofl Agel &l JMIRIRE B2 33 3| Bel dolc DI WA Bol DI 36l FAdenford PHFASEY
JHSK 3T A Acel I dIe2 e o AR Toic #ff ufda 2l sr, cifcpor aIst Yol: A et 31 3 31l Yerroteicl Sft 3fi2 oldr Acal Sloll AGel 3t AS 8, 3okt
3uf3Afe] P 19 IBKI BT 91 A Dol ALl & &b ol Al 31U cIciololl DI fOEivT B2 38 8 3l of MU Sof cllell I A D2 3 3| of Sold! Ui ftele
3IGft JIT @&l BT DI & IS 3| TP Al I3} MU oo [GorT 8 ... (Raeirer) vep Al 313 3wl it 8 b Agar ot A& Fu I getrar b e
3T Uid-urd f3rele $68 dicTol I #HldI & &, Sl 34 Ugcl gl 28t 3, 3AD dIG AGol ddl SIIdl 3|

G2, 3 IXPR A Dol Aradt g, A Yerorics Sft...(xaerer)

31€R18T ABIGAT & UP fIolc, 3MUol ! Dal, SAfRTE I D6 Soll Alad! § Kb et it 3l? IR usel #ff Hol oY 3oRIe b=l o b 391 MUl dictol
I AT 33

3€| (caerror)

offercll AUAT FARIS & 31T 31U Bs Soft Al 512 A efi-3oll ard B33, cifdpor & s & g ...(xu@eret) srzrel Sft, dcioron 3 sTcAERI W
SIIcER 8l 38 3| ... (cIwEIeT) ST <lieT usel A ... (Rawrel) 316l 31 AfSCIR] 131, 3IST 6l AfSelall of scdsrn bt 8| J€,*

MADAM SPEAKER: This will not go on record.
(Interruptions) €/ *

31€AGT ABIGAT & 31U Jo SIISY|

€| (cremrot )
MADAM SPEAKER: Let us run the House.
...(Interruptions)
1RSI FABIGAT + TeAlSl, 31T TIdT AUA SIIST,
€| (cremrot )
1RSI ABIGAT = cAlSl, AUA ST
€| (ccremrot )

31ER18T ABIGAT & 312 3 TIIoT SIcToll AIE 33 &, Al 3IUD! A dlctol BT AIDT Gol
€| (aemst)
oflereil AT FTAM | 3PR IRDR $A A DI YA TID2 MW Al 1 AT A S WA BIRBY, ... (RAgerst)
MADAM SPEAKER: The House stands adjourned to meet again at 2.00 p.m.
12.10 hrs

The Lok Sabha then adjourned till Fourteen of the Clock.

14.00 hrs
The Lok Sabha re-assembled at Fourteen of the Clock.

(Mr. Deputy-Speaker in the Chair)

...(Interruptions)

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Please go back to your seats.



...(Interruptions)
14.0 Ava hrs
At this stage, Shri Rajaiah Siricilla and some other hon. Members came
and stood on the floor near the Table.
...(Interruptions)
Iurerel el | fopft bt oIS T RBoprs 3 ordl siosh

...(caaerer) *

14.0 Az hrs
At this stage, Shri Ramesh Rathod came
and stood on the floor near the Table.
...(Interruptions)
14.01 hrs

At this stage, Shri K. Chandrasekhar Rao and another hon. Member came
and stood on the floor near the Table.
...(Interruptions)

SUTERIST HBIGA + 31U TIIoT 3P dicToll AE 3 Al et 2fte Uz Sape |t

€| (caeror)
SUTERIST HAIGA + 3 31U it DY dicTor BT HIbT o,

€| (caaeror)
JUIERIST ARG : 33 S A1 3 JIDR DI foIder ordl & Ada 3

...t

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: The House stands adjourned to meet again tomorrow, the 29t March, 2012, at 11.00 a.m.

14.02 hrs

The Lok Sabha then adjourned till Eleven of the Clock

on[r2] Thursday, March 29, 2012/Chaitra 9, 1934 (Saka).



* Not recorded.

* Not recorded.
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[r21 Friday, March 10, 2000/Phalguna 20, 1921 (Saka).
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