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Will the Minister of CIVIL AVIATION be pleased to state:

(a) the details o f the major Civil Aviation projects sanctioned by the Government during the last three years for development of
infrastructure at various airports in the country; 

(b) the progress of work under these projects as on date; 

(c) whether the work on these projects is going on as per schedule; 

(d) if not, the details of the projects where the progress of work is tardy and behind the schedule; and 

(e) the steps being taken to expedite work under these projects?

Answer

MINISTER OF STATE (INDEPENDENT CHARGE) OF THE MINISTRY OF CIVIL AVIATION(SHRI PRAFUL PATEL) 

(a), (b), (c), (d) & (e): A Statement is laid on the Table of the House. 

Statement in reply to parts (a), (b), (c), (d) & (e) of the Lok Sabha Starred ( ) Question No.282 dated 23.07.2009 regarding Civil
Aviation Projects. 

(a) & (b): Airports Authority of India (AAI) has entered into an Operation, Management & Development Agreement (OMDA) with the
M/s Delhi International Airport Private Limited (DIAL) and Mumbai International Airport Private Limited (MIAL) for modernisation and
deveopment of Delhi and Mumbai airports respectively. DIAL & MIAL have undertaken all the Mandatory Capital Projects at the
airports as per schedule stipulated in the OMDA . AAI have undertaken development projects at various airports as under: 

(i) The projects completed during the last three years are: Amritsar-expansion & modification of terminal building, extension of runway,
apron technical block cum control tower, cargo complex and operational wall; Dehradun- construction of runway & control tower cum
technical block; Kangra-extension of runway, construction of apron, taxiway, terminal building, car park, operational wall, drainage, etc;
Jaipur-construction of new international terminal complex; Jodhpur-extension o f apron and allied works; Kargil- construction of new
airport; Khajuraho-extension of runway, construction of new apron & taxiway; Kullu-construction of new terminal building and pavement
works; Lucknow-resurfacing o f taxi-track & extension of apron, isolation b a y & runway a nd extension of runway, Pathankot-
development of civil enclave including residential quarters; Srinagar- expansion & modification of terminal building complex; Udaipur-
construction o f new terminal building complex, extension of apron, link taxiway & runway; Varansi- extension & strengthening of
existing runway and provision of shoulders; Bhubaneswar- extension of runway and expansion of apron, construction of additional
taxiway; Gaya-construction of new terminal building & allied structure; Cooch Behar- construction o f new terminal building; Raipur-
strengthening and expansion of apron; Agartala- expansion of terminal complex, apron and construction of new technical building cum
control tower; Dibrugarh-construction of new terminal building including land acquisition; Dimapur- resurfacing of runway; Guwahati-
extension o f runway & construction of new apron with link taxiway; Imphal- resurfacing o f runway, construction of isolation bay,
extension of apron & link taxiway; Lilabari- construction of new terminal building; Silchar-extension of runway, acquisition of land &
construction of boundary wall; Ahmedabad- construction of new departure block for domestic terminal building, isolation bay and
parallel taxi track, new arrival block, construction of new apron; Aurangabad- construction of new apron, new terminal building; Bhuj-
construction of new civil air terminal; Gondia- construction of new passenger lounge, control tower, fire station, boundary wall; Indore-
construction of isolation bay and taxiway; Surat- development work; Nagpur- expansion and modification o f terminal building for
international operations; Porbandar- construction of new terminal building and associated works; Agatti- construction o f terminal
building, fire station and control tower; Calicut- resurfacing o f runway and allied works, expansion and modification o f integrated
terminal building including electrical packages; Coimbatore- extension o f runway; Madurai- strengthening and extension of runway;
Mangalore- construction of apron; Mysore- pavement work; Puduchery- construction of runway; Tirupati- resurfacing and strengthening
o f runway, taxi track, apron, isolation bay etc.; Trichy- construction of new apron, taxi track and new terminal building; Vizag-
construction of new integrated terminal building. 

(ii) The projects where the works are in progress: Chandigarh-construction of new integrated terminal building; Dehradun- construction
of new terminal building and allied works; Jaipur- construction of new apron and taxiway; Jaisalmer- construction of new civil enclave;
Khajuraho-construction of new integrated terminal building; Lucknow-construction of new international terminal building, new apron &
taxiway; Srinagar- expansion of apron phase-II; Udaipur-construction o f control tower and technical block; Varansi- extension and



strengthening of apron and runway, construction of new integrated terminal building including aerobridge; Ludhiana- strengthening/ re-
surfacing of runway & apron/taxiway; Bhubaneswar- construction of new integrated passenger terminal building; Port Blair- expansion
of apron and additional taxiway; Ranchi-expansion o f apron and construction o f isolation bay, new integrated passenger terminal
building, resurfacing of runway; Raipur- construction of new expandable modular integrated terminal building; Kolkata- construction of
passenger terminal building, extension o f secondary runway, etc.; Agartala- strengthening o f existing runway; Barapani (Shilong)-
construction of new terminal building & expansion of runway; Bagdogra- extension of apron; Dimapur- expansion of apron &
construction of link taxiway; Guwahati- construction o f isolation aircraft parking stand; Imphal- construction o f new apron; Pakyong-
construction of new airport; Ahmedabad- construction o f new international terminal building Phase-I & II; Aurangabad- extension of
runway; Bhopal- construction of new expendable modular terminal building, new apron, extension of runway; Goa- new international
terminal, car part, extension of apron and allied works; Gondia- construction of parallel taxiway, NIATAM and two nos. o f additional
hangers; Indore- construction of new terminal building; Pune- extension and modification of terminal building; Agatti- construction of
terminal building, fi re station and control tower; Coimbatore-expansion and modification of terminal building, construction o f part
parallel taxiway and expansion of apron; Cuddapah- construction of runway, taxiway and apron; Chennai- construction of domestic
terminal and extension of existing international terminal and extension of secondary runway; Madurai- construction of terminal building
and allied works; Mangalore- construction of new terminal building; Mysore- development of building work; Rajamundary- construction
o f new terminal building including car park; Trivendrum- construction o f new international terminal building and apron; Vijaywada-
extension of runway. 

In addition to above,AAI have also undertaken major CNS projects at various airports. 

(c) & (d) Development work at most of the airports including Delhi and Mumbai are as per schedule. 

(e) A n OMDA Implementatin Oversight Committee has been constituted under the chairmanship of Secretary, Ministry of Civil
Aviation, to coordinate and monitor the development works at Delhi and Mumbai. Besides, AAI have also set up an indipendent
department, Project Monitoring and Quality Assurance Department, t o ensure regular monitoring and quality assurance o f the
development work which has been undertaken by AAI.
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