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LOK SABHA DEBATES 

LOKSABHA 

Friday, MayB,1992Naisakha 
IB,1914(Saka) 

The Lok Sabha met at 
Eleven of the Clock 

[MR. SPEAKER in the Chair] 

ORAL ANSWERS TO QUESTIONS 

[English) 

Export of Rice. 

+ 
*922. SHRI BHUPINDER SINGH 

HOODA: 
SHRI NARAIN SINGH 

CHAUDHRI: 

Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether any target has been fixed 
forthe export of rice during the current year; 

(b) If so, the details thereof; and 

(c) the measures proposed to be taken 
by the Government to achieve the target? 

THE MINISTEFi OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) and (b). The target for 

export of rice forthe the current year is yetto 
be finalised. 

(c) The existineg policy for export of rice 
is considered adequate. No further meas-
ures are proposed to be taken by the Gov-
ernment to push export of rice during the 
current year. 

[ Translation) 

SHRI BHUPINDER SINGH HOODA: 
Mr. Speaker, Sir, what is the basis for fixing 
the target? Is the surplus production consid-
ered as the basis or something else is con-
sidered as the basis? Secondly, whether the 
Government is thinking offormulating a policy 
under which the agriculturist maydirecllyget 
the benefit of export, as Is the case with 
industries? Can an ariculturist get rice plant-
ing machinery or tractor or other tools for 
himself on the same basis? The producer 
does not have any gains, so the agriculturist 
will not tlake interest in more production, 
because he does not get any direct benefit 
from export. 

(English) 

SHRI P. CHIDAMBARAM: Sir, It the 
farmer exports or farmers cooperative ex-
ports orfarmers organization exports, surely 
that exporter. be he the farmer or the 
farmers, cooperative, will get the benefit. 
Earlier, the exporter would have got 
the EXIM scrip benefit. Today, they will get 
the benefit of LERMS policy. As far as the 
quantity to be exported, the Ministry of 
ｾＺＧＡＧｖｔｬＹｲ｣･＠ goes ｢ｾ＠ the advice of the Minis-
try of AgrICulture and the Ministry of 
Food. 
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As I have repeatedly said, the Govern-
ment's opposition is, in regard to basic 
commodities, cereals, we will export only the 
surpluses. Or first duty is tothe people of this 
country. If there are surpluses, they will be 
made available for export. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI BHUPINDER SINGH HOODA: 
Mr. Speaker, Sir, is the Governmentthinking 
of forming an agriculture Product Export 
Promotion Council which will give direct 
benefit to the agriculturist for his produce? 
The targets for export may be announced in 
advance so that the agricultrist may manage 
his crop and produce accordingly. Because. 
it so happens that some times there is a good 
crop and the yield Is also high do the agric-
uttrist has to make distress sale of his crop. 
When the production is low, middle man 
buys the crop. This way the Agriculturist is a 
loser both ways. Is the Government making 
any such provision according to which the 
agriculturist can get the proper benefit of the 
Govemment policy? 

[EngliSh] 

SHRI P. CHIDAMBARAM: Sir, there is 
Agricultural and Processed Foods Export 
Development Authority (APEDA) which is 
doing precisely the work which the hon. 
Member intends should be done by the 
Council. 

As regards the target, I wich we could 
set the targets very earty, in respect of rice 
which is the subject matter of this question. 
FO( basmati rice, that is freely exportable 
beCause we have er10ugh surpluses of bas-
mati rice. For non-basmati rice, it is not 
possible to fix the target. It has not been 
possible to finalise the target because we 
are only barely marginal as far as production 
and consumption are concerned. We cannot 
take any .hasty decision. We have to fix the 
surplus and only then we can make available 
these quantities for export. Once we be-
come sufficiently surplus, then perhaps, we 
can fix the targets well in advance. It is not 
l'\.I"'W"oihf- ,.t...: - ._ 
ｾ｟＠ ... Ullti yeell. 

[Translation] 

SHRI NARAIN SINGH CHAUDHRI: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir. I would like to know from the 
hon. Minister through you the reasons for 
delay In fixing the target for export of rice, the 
details of the present policy of export of rice 
and the basis on which rice has been ex-
ported during the past three years? 

iEngiishj 

SHRI P CHIDAMBARAM: Sir, as I saId, 
there is no difficulty in indicating the quantity 
or the value of Basmati rice that will be 
exported. We expect to export Basmati rice 
of the value approxi(nalely ot RS.500·crores. 
But, in respect of non-Basmati rice, it is not 
possible to indicate any quantity or value 
targets because we must ascertain the total 
production, the total procurement and the 
total needs fordomesticconsumption. Since 
we are only barely margtnallysurplus in that, 
we cannot take any hasty decision because 
we must ensure that adequate rice is avail-
able for the domestic market and the public 
distribution system. 

SHRI SOBHANADREESWARA RAO 
VADDE: Mr. Speaker, Sir. the reply of the 
hon. Minister confirms the present policy of 
the Government. That is , only when there is 
something available as surplus. the Govern-
ment WIshes to export it. Due to thIS policy, in 
regard to our exports to other countries, we 
could not find a steady market and some 
years we are exporting and the very nest 
year, we are ncit able to export. And so, we 
are not getting enough foreign exchange 
from the countries which import these prod-
ucts from us. In view of this fact, I would like 
to know from the han. Minister, through you, 
Sir, as to whether the Government will re-
consider these present policy and come to 
an idea so as to export a certain minimum 
quantity of rice or wheat or cotton or other 
agricultural products so that we wi!! definitely 
be in a position to export and earn foreign 
exchange. In it not a fact that the present 
targets of production are b:'rely ｳｵｦｦｩ｣ｩＬＢｾＡ＠ (I) 
mae! tt,e ､ｾＡＧＡｬｧ･ｴＡＨＧ［＠ reiirbinents ｃｉＮｾＺＱ＠ iney are 
not klpt in ｶｾｷ＠ of our expo,)!'! necassitles? So, 
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will the Ministry of Commerce Interact with 
the Ministry of agriculture and see that defi-
nitely the Increase in the target is made and 
also necessary funds are made available to 
the farmers to produce that quantity of agri-
cultural products especially rice and other 
food products to meet ourforeign exchange 
commitments and achieve targets so as to 
earn more foreign exchange? 

SHRI P CHIDAMBARAM: I entirely 
share the approach of the hon. Member. In 
tact, I have said on a number of occasions 
that India cannot enter the export market in 
fits and starts. We must have a stable export 
policy so that our markets are stable and we 
can export year after year. But, this principle 
has been qualified in the case of cereals. 
There is no difficulty for non-Basmati rice. 
The policy Is very clear; we have announced 
the policy for five years. Non-Basmati rice is 
exportable and as a result of such a stable 
policy, you will find that in 1989-90, the 
export was 26,705 tonnes of non-Basmati 
rice; In 1990-91, Itwas3,13,720tonnes; and 
in 1991-92, it was 5,25,000 tonnes. 

But, this year, beca.use of lower produc-
tion and procurement and because of the 
needs of domestic consumption,-when we 
find that we are only barely marginal-we 
cannotfix the target, unless we are sure that 
the local requirements are met. 

We have said that Basmati rice is freely 
ｾｸｰｯｲｴ｡｢ｬ･＠ for five years and there is no 
difficulty at all. Anybody can export Basmati 
rice. But, I cannot indicate targets In a com-
modity where we are only barely marginal. 
Unless we are self-sufficient and that there 
are surpluses we can no indicate these tar-
gets. But, our policy Is to encourage export of 
agricultural products and I would like to say 
for the record, that our farmers must grow 
keeping In mind the fact that we can export. 
But W5 are mOiisoon-dependent. If tho; 
monsoon fails or is erratic and if ourproduc-
lion goes down. we cannot make our com-
mitmlilr'lis In advance. Then, we will starve 
the domestic market; we connot do that. 

SHRI GURCHARAN SINGH DADA-

HOOR: Punjab farmers, despite the dis· 
turbed conditions In the State, produce the 
maximum amount of food grains particularly 
rice and wheat. The best quality of rice that 
is Basmati is produced in Punjab. Sir, through 
you, I would like to know from the hon. 
Minister as to what incentives are being 
given to the farmers producing rice for ex-
port. 

SHRI P. CHIDAMBARAM: Sir, incen-
tives to farmers' must be addressed to the 
ministry of Agriculture and Ministry of Food. 
I would not be able to answer about incen-
tives given to farmers. 

As far as exports are concerned, any 
quantity i(1dicated as surplus by the Ministry 
of Agriculture and Ministry of Food Is made 
available for export. 

SHRI HARI KISHORE SINGH: Sir, farm-
ers earn foreign exchange by exporting rice. 
Nowthe Minister says that because of short-
age 0 limited amount of surplus of rice in the 
country, it is not possible to allow export of 
non-basmati rice. 

Is there any scheme of the Govemment 
to compensate the farmers who will incur 
loss by not exporting rice this year? 

SHRI P. CHIDAMBARAM: Sir, I do not 
think the farmer incurs a loss by not export· 
ing rice. As long as there is a domestic 
demand and there Is a good price In the 
domestic market, I do not think that the 
farmer incurs a loss. And I do not think It Is 
correct to compare what a farmer would 
have got had he exported because the rice 
and wheat are basic foodstuffs. They must 
be available first In the domestic market. 
Only surpluses can be exported. 

I think, the loss which thE! han. Member 
is taiKlng aboui Is a notional loss. 

DR. B.G. JAWALI: At the outset. I think, 
there is a little discrepancy in the answer 
given by the Minister. In the first part, he has 
said that the target is yet to be finalised. And 
in part (c). he says that the policy for export 
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of rice is considered to be adequate and no 
further consideration is required. However, 
whatever foreign exchange Is earned in any 
other Industry, wherein the people export, 
the people who export are benefited by the 
import of a particular item concerned with the 
industry. There is a certain percentage of 
foreign exchange earned. 

Similarly, could any foreign exchange 
earned or a portion of it be passed on to the 
farmers directly to import any item like agri-
cultural in ')lements or chicals orfertilisers or 
item of that kind? 

SHRI P. CHIDAMBARAM: After the 
partial convertibility, any item or commodity 
which IS not in the negative list of imports, is 
freely importable. There are no restrictions 
at all. One has to simply go to the bank, pay 
the rupees, get the foreign exchange and 
import whatever one likes to import as long 
as that is not in the negative list of imports. 

The benefrt of LEARMS will naturally go 
only to the exporter. Now the farmer could 
export. As I said, a farmers' cooperative 
could export. States could set up export 
agencies and procure the foodgrains orother 
agricultural products for exports. But the 
benefit of LERMS will naturally go the the 
actual exporter. For example, if a coopera-
tive exports, the benefit will go to that coop-
erative. It will be shared by the farmers. A 
bigger farmer can export directly. The bene-
fit will go to the exporter. 

MR. SPEAKER: Questions NO.923 is 
transferred from 5.5.1992. 

SHRI RAM NAIK: In spite of that, how 
can there be two questions in one person's 
name? 

MR. SPEAKER: This is a question for 
the Commerce Ministry. That is why we have 
donelt. 

SHRI RAM NAIK: It can come at the 
end. 

MR SPEAKER: This was balloted. This 

has come. This was fixed but then It was 
transferred to the Commerce Ministry. Now 
Shrl Bhuplnder Singh Hooda. 

Import of Drug. 

*923. SHRI BHUPINDER SINGH 
HOODA: Will the Minister of COMMERCE 
be pleased to state: 

(a) the details of bulk drugs imported by 
various firms having loan licance under ac-
tual user condition during each of the last 
three years; 

(b) whether the Government have taken 
slips for post -import checks of such imports; 

(c) if so, the details thereof; and 

(d) 11 not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHEDAMBARAM) (a) Firm-Wisellicence-
wise statistics of imports are not maintained. 
In terms of the Export and Import Policy for 
'992-97, import of all drugs other than those 
covered by the Negative list of Imports is 
freely allowed. Drugs covered by the Nega-
tive List are allOWed for import against spe-
cific licences and subject to conditions laid 
down. 

(b) to (c). Adequate provisions are 
available in the Imports and Exports (Con-
trol) Act, 1947, the Orders Issued thereunder 
and the Export and Import Policy to exsure 
proper utilisation of material imported against 
specific licences. 

SHRI BHUPINDER SINGH HOODA: 
Sir, this question was raised by me to the 
Health Ministry as I never wanted the policy 
but I wanted the statistical date which is 
being mainiiiineo by itiG Drug Ccntio!lBr ot 
India through its port offices as there airllot 
of discrepancies in it. The same medicine 
which is imported by one firm at til" iata c! 
Rs. 12,000 per kilogram is Imported at the 
rate of Rs. 40bQ per kilogram by another 
firm. The price restr'ictions are made by the 
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Sub-Committee of the Drug Prices review 
Commmee where the Drug Controller of 
India is also a member. The base pice is 
taken as AS.9000. So, when the medicine 
eaches the real consumers, that is, the pa-
tients, it costs very high. These firms earn a 
lot of money by manipulations at the cost of 
the poor patients. Would the hon. Minister 
tell me whether the Drought Controller main-
tains this account or not through its port 
offices? 

SHAI P. CHIDAMBAAAM: I think the 
han. Member has prefaced his question by 
saying that he Intends the Drug Controller In 
the Health Ministry to answer his question. I 
am not in a position to answer the question 
on behalf of the Drug Controller. 

SHAI BHUPINDEA SINGH HOODA: 
Then why was it transferred? My question 
was very clear. I never asked for any policy. 
I wanted !)nly the statistical data because I 
have got three names of drugs with me. 

Thioridazine was imported through loan 
licences arrangements at the rate of As. 
12,000 per kilogram by one firm and the 
same medicine was imported by another 
firm at the landed rate of As.4000 per kilo-
gram. Secondly, tripoline was imported by 
one firm at the rate of AS.40,OOO per kilo-
gram but the same was imported by another 
firm at the rate of AS.1 0,000 per kilogram. 
Thirdly, cabamezapine was imported by one 
firm at As.4S00 per kilogram and at the rate 
of As.2S00 per kilogram by anotherfirm. So, 
I want to ask the question as to whether the 
Government is forming any policy to check 
these fictitious loan Fincence importers so 
thatthe consumers are not made to pay high 
price fa life-saving drugs. This is very impor-
tant and serious question. 

SHAIP.CHIDAMBAAAM:Sir,aslhave 
said in the answer, all drugs, except those 
which are in the negative list of imports, are 
freely Importable underthe new imports and 
exports policy. I think the fact that they are 
freely importable without licences will, in the 
medium term and surely in the long term, 
iron out Irrationalities and pricing by the 

importers because after all, if somebody 
come import a drug at Rs.4000 per kilogram 
or any other unit, surely, it will not be 
advantageous to anyone eise to import it at 
five times of that price. " the suggestion of 
the hon. Member is that there Is under -
Invoicing, then that is a matter that has to be 
inquired into. " he will furnish me specific 
cases where he subjects under-invoicing, 
we will surely investigate those cases of 
under invoicing. 

SHAI BHUPINDEA SINGH HOODA: 
Sir, this is not the answer to my question. It 
should be referred to the Health Ministry. 
That fixes the price at the highest rate of 
import. 

SHAIMATI MALINI BHATIACHAA-
A Y A: I want to know whether it is true that 
transnational companies in phamaceuticals 
which are supposed to be working their 
patents In India leave their installed plants 
under-utilised and instead import their pat-
ented products from the foreign countries to 
sell them at inflated rates here. "this is what 
they are doing, then, Iwould liketoknow how 
many cases of trans national companies 
violating their patent agreements are there 
and what action is being taken againstthem. 

SHAI P. CHIDAMBAAAM: Sir, please 
refer to the question. This question deals 
with import of drugs by loan licences and 
post-import checks of such in'l>Orts. This has 
really nothing to do with patents andtransna-
tional companies setting up installed capaci-
ties here. 

SHAIMATI MALINI BHATIACHAA-
AYA: Many such transnatio'nal companies 
are working here. And it comes within the 
ambit of this question. 

SHAI P. CHIDAMBAAAM: I have no 
hesitation in answering the question put by 
the hon. Member Shrlmati Bhattacharaya. I 
am sure she knows how to ask a question. I 
have Information on a question dealling with 
loan licences and post-import checks. How 
do I suddenly give information, off the cuff. 
about the trans-national companies which 
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have Installed capacities hare and which 
have not utilised capacity and so on? 

SHRIMATI MALINI BHATIACHAR-
A Y A: I want to know whether there is any 
such information in the Ministry. And may I 
say that this is implied in Shri Hooda's ques-
tion? 

SHRI P. CHIDAMBARAM: I am sure 
there is information in the Ministry. If she 
puts a separate question,l will gather the 
Information and give it to her. 

MR. SPEAKER: Even otherwise, you 
can furnish the information to her. 

SHRI P.CHIDAMBARAM: Yes Sir. Even 
otherwise, I will give it to her. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI SHANKERSINH VAGHELA: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, please understand the spirit of 
what respected Hooda jl has said .... 

MR. SPEAKER: That question is over 
now. 

SHRI SHANKERSING VAGHELA: May 
I know about the details of the multinational 
companies In India and the quantity of bulk 
druges imported by them and the number of 
the countries from which these drugs were 
imported? A lot of our foreign seehangs in 
waited. May I know the number of such 
companies in India which have submitted 
their applications, but their applications have 
not been cleared, though are manufacture 
there along In own our country. May I know 
the umber of such multinatioal companies 
which have imported bulk drugs and the 
number of countries from which they im-
ported bulk drugs during two years? 

[Eng/ish] 

SHRI P. CHIDAMBARAM: I am sure, I 
would be able \0 give information about 
multi-nationals which nave applied for im-
port licences. Since that is not the question, 
the information is not available with name 

now. I will certainly furnish the information to 
the hon. Member. 

[ Translation] 

Legal Aid to Poor 

'924. SHRI MOHAMMAD ALI ASHRAF 
FATMI: Will the Minister of LAW, JUSTICE 
AND COMPANY AFFAIRS be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the Government have con-
stituted a committee with a view to bring 
about compreshensive reforms in the proc-
ess of providing legal aid to the poor; 

(b) if so, the details thereof: 

(c) whether the recommendations of the 
committee have been received by the Gov-
ernment; and 

(d) if so, the steps taken by the Govern-
menlto implement those recommendations? 

[English] 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENARY AFFAIRS 
AND MINISTER FO STATE IN HiE MINIS-
TRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY 
AFFAIRS (SHRI RANGA RAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM) (a) The Government 
set up the " Committee for Implemanting 
Legal Aid Schemes"(CILAS) in September, 
1980 as per the recommendations made by 
the Bhagwati Committee which was consti-
tuted in May, 1976. 

(b) to (c). A Statement is laid on the 
Table of the House. 

STATEMENT 

(b) to (d). The Committee for Imple-
menting Legal Aid Schemes (CILAS) is 
required to formulate and to 1fT1llement 
comprehensive Legal Aid Schemes, monl-
torthe scheme for legaliaid and advice in the 
States and Union Territories and to take or 
recommend such other steps &$ are neces-
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sary to secure proper working of the legar 
Aid Schemes. As recommended by the 
Bhagwati Committee, Legal Aid and Advice. 
Boards have been set up in the States and 
Union Territories besides Legal Aid commit-
tes at the District and Taluka levels in most 
of the States. people whose annual income 
does not exceed Rs. 6,0001- and RS.12,OOO/ 
- are entitled to free legal-aid upto the High 
Courts and Supreme Court respectively. 
However, the ceiling in regard to income is 
not applicable to persons belonging to the 
scheduled Castes/Scheduled Tribes, 
Vimukta Jatis, Nomadic Thlbes, women and 
children. 

Various Legal Aid Programmes, such 
as, training of para-legals, setting up of the 
Urban arid Rural Entitlement and Legal 
Support Centres, organising of legal Aid 
Camps, Lok adulates, setting up of Legal Aid 
Clinics, Legal Literacy Camps and promo-
tion of legallrteracy are some of the major 
programmes being taken up by the State 
Legal Aid & advice Boards to provide legal-
aid to the weaker sections of the community 
and to make them aware of their rights and 
duties. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI MOHAMMAD ALI ASHRAF 
FATMI: Mr. Speaker, Sir, may I know fr.om 
the Government through you that the com-
mittee constitU1j:ld underthe chairmanship of 
Justice Bhagwati in 1980 known as Commit-
tee for Implementing Legal Aid scheme 
whose objective was to provide easy justice 
to the poor, but their problems are that it 

• takes fine years, ten years, fifteen years and 
some time a geration to decide a case. Has 
the Govemment thought about these things 
so that these poor people may get justice 
within minimum number of hearings. What I 
mean to say is that a case should be deCided . 
within a period of 5 or 6 months or within a 
year. This way the poor people can get 
Justice because It Is quite Inconvenient to 
them to travel to and fro .... 

MR. SPEAKER: You have asked a very 
good question. It is a clear question. 

[English] 

THE MINISTER OF LAW, JUSTICE 
AND COMPANY AFFAIRS (SHRI K. VIJA YA 
BHASKAR A REDDY): Justice Bhagwati 
Committee was set up in 1976 and it gave its 
recommendations in 1977. Based on those 
recommendations, CILAS was formed in 
1980 and it was headed by a judge of the 
Supreme Court. In all the states, there air 
branches of CILAS uptothe Taluk level. This 
body is functioning very will to reduce the 
time taken in arriving at a decision. There is 
no question of delay in its working. Once 
they take up the legal aid matter, it is all 
decided on one day. If is not decided in one 
day, then it goes to the court. Most of the 
legal aid meetings are for one or two days 
only." is decided then and there and there is 
no question of further going back on that. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI MOHAMMAD ALI ASHRAF 
FATMI: My second supplementary question 
is that minimum income group for providing 
free legal-aid in respect of a case up to state 
level has been fixed at the ceiling of income 
6,000 and Rs. 9,000 for cases up to Su-
preme Court level and this ceiling has not 
been made applicable to persons belonging 
to Scheduled Castes and Scheduled Tribes 
as also women and children. Is the Govern-
ment taking some measures to raise' the 
ceiling? Secondly, whether the Govemment 
is considering to include the persons belong-
ing to backward classes in society and the 
minorities in it or or not? 

[English] 

SHRI K VIJAYA E!HASKARA REDDY: 
Sir, the Government is thinking of raising the 
limit from RS.6,000 and Rs. 9,000 to Rs. 
12,000 and Rs. 15,000. The Rajya Sabha 
has passed the Bill and It is pending here. " 
has come in this Session and it will be done, 
We are also thinking of raising it a little more. 
But there are other aspects. Whoever is poor 
in other communities, they also come under 
this.lfthierincomeisbetween Rs. 6,000and 
RS.9,OOO, they come under it. We are going 
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to raise It. Most of the poor people of other 
communities will also come under it. 

Even if there is some difficulty, we can 
consider It at a later date. . 

SHRI SHARAD DIGHE: Mr. Speaker, 
Sir, the question Is regarding bringing about 
comprehensive reforms in the process 01 
providing legal aid to the poor. It appears that 
this CILAS has been constituted and one of 
the functions is to recommend such other 
steps as are necessary to secure proper 
working of the legal aid. 

I would, therefore, like to know whether 
any recommendations have been made by 
the CILAS to introduce comprehensive re-
forms in this process and if so, what are 
those recommendations? 

SHRI K. VLJA YA BHASKARA REDDY: 
Sir, recently, there was a Conference held in 
Hyderabad and they reviewed the position. 
They have expressed satisfaction over the 
functioning of it. They have not yet given any 
specific comments. But, I am going to dis-
cuss with the Chairman, CILAS Mr. Justice 
Ahamadi and it he suggests some more 
recomniendatlons, I can incorporate them In 
the Bill and try to improve the position. (Inter-
ruptions) 

[Translation) 

SHRI RAM VILAS PASWAN: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, It Is a general bellefthat the law 
is blind and whosoever has the money and 
influence wins the case. Even the Verdict of 
Judges is influenced. As a result the poor are 
always deprived of justice. When the poor 
does not get justice orthe doors of justice are 
closed to him, he seeks remedy elsewhere. 
I would like to impress upon you that though 
an announcement for the constitution of the 
committee has been made, yet the proce-
dure for it is saintricate that it has not served 
any purpose. When we tried to deliver justice 
to the poorthrough the legal aid scheme, we 
could not succeed. The procedure Is so 

complex that every case is first referred to 
the legal aid committee which then appoints 
a lawyer to argue the case. Often the lawyer 
appointed, I donot say, is sub-standard but, 
Is of no standing II) comparison to lawyers 
against whom he is pitched. That is why the 
poor are deprived of justice. Therefore, I 
would like to know from the hon. Mlnlsterthe 
recommendations of the Committee. Let us 
forget about the recommendations also, but 
at least make arrangements for the direct 
disbursal of the amount given for legal aid, to 
the poor and not through the appointed . 
lawyer. This would enable them to use the 
services of best of the lawyers to plead their 
cases. I would like to know whether the 
Govemment will start direct disbursal of 
money to the poor in this regard. Will the 
Govemment also inform the number of poor 
given assistance through the legal aid cell 
and the number of cases that have been 
decided in thierfavour? 

[English) 

SHRI K. VLJAYA BHASKARA REDDY: 
Sir, paying directly for the legal aid is not 
under'lonsideration. At the Supreme Court 
level, a Judge of the Supreme Court heads 
the Committee here. At the High Court level, 
aJudge ofthe High court heads the Commit-
tee and at the District Court level, a Judge of 
the District Court heads the Committee. They 
are the best judges to choose proper advo· 
cates to look after the interests of the poor. If 
anything is to be done, it is done through 
these Committees. According to us, these 
Committees are functioning very well and 
the system is working very well. 

[ Translation) 

SHRI RAM VILAS PASWAN: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, I wanted to know whether 
Govemment will start directly disbursing 
money to the poor instead of following the 
existing procedure of providing legal aid to 
the affected persons. This was my specific 
question. 
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( Interruptions) 

[English) 

SHRI K. VLJAYA BHASKARA REDDY: 
Not at this stage. (Interruptions) 

. SHRI PAWAN KUMAR BANSAL: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, the Government is considered 
to be the biggest and the more cantankerous 
litigant today. Often we find cases where 
may officers ..... . 

( Interruptions) 

[ Translation] 

SHAl KALKA DAS: Mr. Speaker, Sir, 
the important part 01 his question was re-
garding the number of persons given legal 
aid so far which has not been replied to by 
the hon. Minister. 

MR. SPEAKER: He has already made it 
clearthat a separate notice is required as the 
information is to be collected from the State 
Govemments, the Supreme Court and the 
High Courts. 

SHRI KALKA DAS: The specific ques-
tion was about the number of persons bene-
fited through the legal aid scheme. That is 
very il1l>OJ1ant. 

MR. SPEAKER: Instead of seeking the 
information from the Minister, you are put-
ting the question to me. 

SHRI KALKA DAS: You ask the hon. 
Minister to state the number of persons 
benefitted through the legal aid scheme so 
far. 

[English] 

MR. SPEAKER: You give the total 
number of beneficiaries. 

SHRI K. VLJA YA BHASKARA REDDY: 
I am giving the total number of beneficiaries. 
The total numberofbeneiciaries is 14,90,000 
and add. 

SHRI PAWAN KUMAR BANSAL: The 
Govemment has today become the biggest 
and the most cantankerous litigant. Otter, 
we come across cases where officers want-
ing to shrug off their own responsibility, drag 
poor people to the courts and indulge in 
frivolous and most unnecessary form of liti-
gation. I would like to know from the hon . 
Minister whether he will pay attention to this 
very important aspect which can reduce the 
litigation to almost half in this country and 
there would be no need of providing aid if the 
Government were to ensure that its own 
officers do not add to unnecessary litigation. 

SHRI K. VLJA YA BHASKARA REDDY: 
It is not that way. We have been educating 
the people about the problems involved in 
this and to reduce the litigation. This aspect 
also, the Government is looking into. 

[Translation] 

Recovery of Taxes 

+ 
'925. SHRI NIT ISH KUMAR: 

SHRI SUKDEO PASWAN: 

Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether a large amount of different 
Central taxes remains unrecovered every 
year in the country; 

(b) If so, the reasons therefore; 

(c) the amount of each of the Central 
taxes outstanding at the end of 1989-90, 
1990-91 and 1991-92 against private and 
public sectors separately; 

(d) whetherthe Government have made 
some improvement In the present system of 
tax collection; . 

(e) if so, the details thereof; and 

(f) the achievements made as a result 
thereof? 
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[English} 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR) (a) to (f). A statement is laid 
on the Table of the House. 

STATEMENT 

(a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) The main reasons for non-realisa-

1989-90 

1990-91 

1991-92 

Income tax 
including Tax 

6638 

6695 

6589 

tion of outstanding tax demands are-

(i) Tax demands are disputed in 
appeals; 

(ii) Stays are granted by the Courts, 
the tribunals and the departmental 
authorities. 

(c) the amounts of tax demands of major 
Centraltaxes outstanding atthe end of 1989-
90,1990-91 and 1991-92 are as follows:-

Central Excise 
Dury 

973 

1226 

1283 

. 
(Rupees in Crores) 

Customs 
duty 

73 

67 

69 

@Figures for the year 1991-92 are as on 1.2.1992, as the figures as on 31.3.1992 
have not yet been compiled. 

Statistics of tax demands outstanding against private and public sectors are not 
maintained separately. 

(d) to (f). Improvement of the tax collec-
tion system is an on-going process. The 
system is reviewed from time to time and im-
provements wherever necessary are brought 
about. Presently, the Tax Reforms Commit-
tee headed by Shri Raja J. Chelliah is going 
into the vanous aspects of tax administra-
tion. The recommendations made by the 
committee in its interim report have been 
partially implemented. The final report of the 
Committee is likely to be received shortly. It 
is premature to assess the achievement to 
this stage. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI NITISH KUMAR: Mr. Speaker. 
Sir, in the reply it has been stated that there 
are two main reasons for non-realisation of 
outstanding tax demands. Firstly, the tax 
demands are disputed in appeals and SI'lC' 

ondly, stays are granted by the courts and 

tribunals I would like to know from the Gov-
ernment for how many years the cases of the 
value of more than Rs.l 0 lakh Central tax 
like income tax, corporation tax, customs 
duty and excise duty are pending in the 
courts, the tribunals and the departmental 
authorities? 

In the reply the figures of the outstand-
ing tax demands still unrecovered because 
of dispute appeals has not been mentioned. 
In view of the cases pending I would like to 
know whether Government propose to set 
up maximum number of tribunals and spe-
Cial courts, instead of General Courts to 
realise the outstanding tax demands? 

SHRI RAMESHWAR THAKUR: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, to have a fair extimate of the 
outstanding tax demands, it is necessary to 
know that out of the total tax demands out-
standing of RS.6,695 crore on 1 :4-91, Rs. 
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2,247 erore had been realised by 21 Janu-
ary, 1992 and by February-March approxi-
mately As. 1 ,000 erore more was realised. 
This means that nearly 50 per cent of the 
outstanding tax demand has been rearlSed. 
Out of the outstanding tax demands 01 Rs. 
8,370 crore In 1991-92 Rs. 6,236 erore has 
already been realised Le. 75 per cent in the 
current year has been realised. As far as the 
Customs Duty and the Central Excise are 
concerned, nearly 95.5 per cent of the out-
standing tax demands has been realised in 
1989-90. 

SHRI NITISH KUMAR: Mr. Speaker, 
Sir, I would like to know the number of cases 
pending in the Courts, the tribunals and with 
the departmental outhorities and the money 
unrecovered as a resultthereof and not what 
the hon. Minister has already stated in the 
reply. 

SHRI RAMESHWAR THAKUR: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir. it is better to know the basic 
thing first. r was dwelling on that. The num-
ber of cases of direct taxes pending with 
deputy Commissioner Appeal, as on 1-4-92 
was 1,37,070, with Commissioner Appeal, 
1,58,782 with Income Tax Tribunal, 2,98,000 
with the High Courts 34,000 and the Su-
preme Court it was 3,485. Of the less than 
one x year old cases out of the unrecovered 
RS.5,595 crore Rs. 3,341 crore is still out 
standing. I have the year wise break up also 
with me. There are 1291 cases pending for 
the lastthree years. It constitutes 19percent 
of the total pending cases. Similarly there 
are 558 cases pending for the last five years 
and constitute only 8 per cent of the total 
cases. Only 2 per cent cases, I.e. 192 are 
pending for the last 10 years. The hon. 
Minister of Finance in his Budget speech 
stated that efforts are being made to speed-
Ily dispose off cases pending with the depart-
mental authorities especially the departmen-
tal appeals. We are in touch with the Ministry 
of Law to set up more and more benches and 
additional benches to dispose off cases 
pending with the Commissioner Appeal and 
the Tribunal. Attempts are being made to set 

. up special benches in the High Courts. In this 
connection requests have also been made 

to the Chief Justice of the Supreme Court 
and the Ministry of law. Arrangements are 
being made for the setting up of the National 
COlJrtof direct Taxes as then hon: Minister of 
Finance mentioned in his Budget speech'. 

SHRI NITISH KUMAR: The Govern-
ment gets a revenue of more than Rs.25,OOO 
crore through the Customa Duty. The cost of 
collection of direct taxes, Including the Cor-
poraiiur. T 4)(, is 5"7 per cent while the cost Qf 
collection of the Customs Duty is nearly 0.5 
per cent. I would like to know whether the 
Government proposes to entrust the collec-
tion of the ClJjtoms duty to a foreign agency 
probably SGS International? If so, what will 
be the effect of engaging of the agency on 
the cost 0: collection of the customs duty? 

SHRI RAMESHWAR THAKUR: There 
is no proposal under the consideration of the 
Govemment to the moment. 

SHRISUKDEOPASWAN:Mr.Speaker, 
Sir, I would like to know whether It is a fact 
that maximum collection of income tax Is 
from the salaried class only? I would also Uke 
to know the categorywise collection of in-
come tax from the salaried class, traders and 
private cof1l)anies ? What is the catego-
rywlse cost of collection of income tax from 
the aforementioned categories and what 
steps does the Government propose to take 
to reduce the cost of collection? 

SHRI RAMESHWAR THAKUR: We do 
not have separate date regardilll the cate-
gorywise collection of taxes by the various 
salary circles of the department. However, 
the cost of collection is just 2 per cent of the 
total tax collection. 

[English] 

SHRISUDHIRSAWANT:Mr.Speaker, 
Sir, the Government must address to two 
issues 'if it wants to control unaccoumtd 
money. One is tax evasion and the other is 
the activities which generate black money. 
What we find he,.. is that there Is no integra-
tion in these two methods of control. Raja 
CheHIah Committee Report and also Tax 
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Administrateion addresses only to tax eva-
sion. And what is required is that an inte-
grated approach must be followed. For 
example, smuggling is the foundation of 
organised crime. The sa.te law and orde• 
machinery and the CBI are not allowed to 
prosecute the cases under the Customs Act. 

Will the Government take all the!:.e is-
.sues into consideration and adopt an inte- · 
·gr.ated approach and formulate the custom.s, 
Act and all other Acts so that all the oftend-
ers, those engaged iri the activities of gener-
ating black money and also tax evasion are 
brought under one net? 

SHRI RAMESHWAR THAKUR: Sir. 
apart from the departmental aut'1orities that 
we have got for the collection of money and 
also for the follow up of the smuggang and 
other king of cases, weake the assistance 01 
the State Governments in many areas in 
reducing and helping in the smuggling cases. 
There is an ir:itegrated approach and the~e 
has been, by and large, success in these 
various areas. We have the fullest co-opera-
tion of most of the State Governments in this 
regard. 

[Translation) 

SHRIMATI BHAVNA CHIKHLIA: Mr. 
Speaker. Sir, through you I would like to ask 
a question in regard to the reply given to ihe 
part (d) of the original question The syste:Yi 
o! collection of taxes in India is so ccmo~ i­

ca!edtha! the Government do no: receiv<? as 
much collection as it should have. In fo(e i g~ 

countries, particularly in America. taxes a~A. 

the miniIT'um as a result of which thare are a 
very few incidents of tax evasion and tr1ess 
:s a very good co!lection of taxes. In wiew of 
this, whether the Cantle Government pro-
per.es to appoint a committee to suggest a 
scientific tax ccllection system? 

SHRI RAMESHWAR THAKUR: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir. the Government had appointed 
Dr Raja Chelliah Committee in this regard 
which has already submitted the first part of 
its reo'jort to the Government. The oe:ailtd 
sugg~stion in regard to the taxation are likely 

to be given in the second and last part ol the 
report. The Government will c0nsider the 
report and take appropriate action thereon. 
The hon. Mir.ister of Finance, -keeping in 
view t~e suggestions given so far, by the 
hon. Members, the Cnambers of C6mmerce 
and the exports, has already reduced the tax 
limit from 50 per cent to 40 per cent in the 
Budget proposeds for the year 1992-93. I 

hope that this reduction in tu: limit mu help in 
,oolleotion the t :u:e.s during the current y~,ar .. 
In r1:;gard to th!! e;::ting complicated laws, 
theGovemmar.t would take action only after 
the report of Chelliah Committee is received. 
The hon. Minister t.as announced that the 
Government proposes to set up a court to 
deal with d:.irect taxes and the law will be 
simplifiedd by clubbing income tax, wealth 
tax and gift tax. The proposal will be placed 
in the House in due course of time. 

(English) 

Land Acquired for Defence Pur-
poses 

+ 
*926 SHA! ANNA JOSHI: 

SHRI MAHESH KA,~ODIA: 

Will the Minister of DEFENCE be 
pleased to s!ate: 

(a) the tota! land acquired fo defence 
purposes during each of the last three year. 
Stata-wise; 

(b) whet'1er the Goverr1ment have ar.y 
proposal to provide al:ernate la1ds :>r jobs to 
the persons whose land& were acquired; 

(c) if so. the number of such persons 
who have been provided lands or jobs in this 
regard during tha above period; and 

(d) if not, the peraons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PETROLEUM AND 
NEIURALGDAS AND MINISTER 0 STATE 
IN THE MINISffiY OF DEFENCE(SHRI f,_ 
KRISHAN KUMAR) (a) A statement indicc.-.-
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ing the total area acquired during the last 
three years, year-wise and State-wise, Is 
laid on the Table of the House. 

(d) There is no provision underthe Land 
Acquisition Act, 1984, on the requisitioning 
and AcqUiSI!IOn of Immovable Property Act, 
1952, for providing cOrf1>ensatory land or 
empioyment to the persons whose lands are 
acquired. 

(b) No, Sir. 

(c) Does not arise. 

STATEMENT 

YEAR STATE AREA ACOUIRED IN ACRES 

1989-90 1. West Bengal 3.845 

2. Orissa 92.630 

3. Assam 15796 

4. Arunachal Pradesh 2003.843 

5. Himachal Pradesh 4.505 

6. Madhya Pradesh 6.941 

7. Bihar 194.870 

8. Punjab 1219.412 

9. Rajasthan 6140.427 

10. Jammu & Kashmir 212.275 

11. Uttar Pradesh 0730 

12. Maharashtra 83.080 

13. Gujarat 32.782 

14. Tamil Nadu 86.830 

15. kamataka 5783.730 

16. Kerala 5.780 

1990-91 1. Orissa 22.000 

" Arunachal Pradesh 16.410 1:.. 

3. Assam 2.071 

4. West Bengal 1.350 
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YEAR SJ;:.TE AREA ACOUIRED IN ACRES 

5. HaryatFJ. 369.270 

6. Bihar 1.465 

7. Panjab 27.740 

8. Madhya Pradesh 3627.079 

9. Jammu & KashmIr 723.975 

10. Uttar Pradesh 1199.790 

11. Rajasthan 3661.385 

12. Maharashtra 1605.420 

13. Gujarat 932.814 

14. Tamil Nadu 153.821 

15. Karnataka 203.540 

16. Andhra Pradesh 95.125 

17. Kerala 0.020 

1991-92 1. West Bengal 5.700 

2. Orissa 2.580 

3. Assam 0.641 

4. Arunachal Pradesh 156.470 

5. Sikkim 0.710 

6. Megha\aya 0.250 

1. ｾｾｴＭＭ｜ｯＮｾ＠ ｾｾＮＨｬｏｏ＠

8. Rala.sman ｾｾＮＱＩＷＱ＠

.9. Madhya Pradesh 139.100 

10. Utlar Pradesh 4.925 

11. Himachal pradesh 4.790 

12. Jammu & Kashmir 509.976 
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YEAR STATE AREA ACOUIRED IN ACRES 

13. Maharashtra 1418.408 

14. Gujarat 941.654 

15. Tamil Nadu 150.511 

16. Goa 14.959 

17. Kamataka 266.615 

18. Andhra Pradesh 94.925 

SHRI ANNA JOSHI: Sir, the Defence 
Ministry has been acquiring thousands acres 
of lands since British RAJ. I would like to 
know whether you have exploited or uitilisad 
al\ the lands which you had acquired for 
defence purposes till 1989. 

Then, you have acquired nearly 34000 
acres of land for the last three years. May I 
ask the hon. Ministerwhetherthis is arbitrary 
acquisition or whether you have got some 
planning of expansion of defence establish-
ments and for that purpose this land is ac-
ｾｵｩｲ｡､Ｎ＠

May I also know that out of this 34000 
acres of land, how much is utilised and how 
much is lying idle? 

SHRI S. KRISHAN KUMAR: Sir, the 
Defence Ministry has under its possession, 
a total of 22,16,000 and odd acres of land. All 
these have been acqUired from time to time. 

As far as the new acquisitions are con-
cerned, we have 363 cases for 1,69,000 and 
odd acres. No acqUisition is sanctioned by 
the Defence Ministry unless the purpose for 
'he qceulsllion Is eSlablished. Jt )5 normallY 
Ｈ｜ｬｾ｜ｬ､Ｎｻｾｾｾ＠ ＨＺＺＬｾｻｾ｜｜ｾ｜｜Ｎ｜ｾｻ＠ ｾＬｾ｜ｾｾＮ＠ ｦ｜ｃｉｾＮ＠ ｾ｜｜｜ﾭ

t::uy stations. and so on. 

We ｣｜ｯｾ･｜ｾ＠ ｭｬＮＺｬｾ｜｜ｉＮＺＱｾ＠ ｾｦ［ｪ｜＠ ｉＮＺｉ｜｜｜ｾ＠ \\\e ｜ｯＮ｜｜ｾ＠
acquisHlon cases but also the utilisation of 
the land after the acquisition has taken place. 

The spirit of the han. Merrber's ques-

tion is understood. We also constantly re-
view the surplus lands which are not imme-
diately eraquired by the army, and there is a 
policy and programme for disposal of such 
surplus lands for public purposes. 

SHRI ANNA JOSHI: Sir, not a single of 
my Questions is answered. Should I repeat 
them? 

MR. SPEAKER: At the cost of losing the 
second supplementary. 

SHRI ANNA JOSHI: Sir. nearly 32.lakh 
acres of land they have acquired upto 1989. 
I have asked; do take II for granted thatthese 
32 lakh acres of land which they have ac· 
quired has been completely utilised or the 
remaining one which is not utilised has been 
ret'-lrned to the farmers ... (Interruptions). 

MR. SPEAKER: They have the Ranges 
also, you know, where lot of land is required. 
Then they have the containments and many 
other things also. unless you classify, it is not 
possible to reply. 

SHRf ANNA JOSHI: O.K, Sir. 

t..\\ ｜｜ｾ｜｜｜ｽＬＧｴＺＮ＠ ｜ＩＬｾＧｴＺＮｔ｜Ｚ＠ 'Iou have \he hon-
our that the Speaker has replied to your 
ｾ｜ｬｾｾ｜｜ｾｴ｜Ｎ＠

SHRI ANNA JOSHI: Thank you, Sir. 

SHRI S. KRISHNA KUMAR: Hon. 
Speaker was the Defence Minister also. 



31 Oral Answers MAY8,1992 Ora/Answers 32 

SHRI ANNA JOSHI: Sir, it is an estab-
lished fact that whenever the land of the 
farmer is taken away, he is rendered jobless. 
Therefore, before completing the project, 
whether it is of irrigation or defence or any-
thing else. at 'least one person from the 
family of the farmer who is rendered jobless, 
Is gl'l6n Job or his rehabilitation takes place. 
In the second part of the answer the hon. 
Minister ha said: "It is not binding on us by 
law". That is all right, but morally they are 
bound. The Govemment has already ac-
cepted that and they are acting on that. So, 

, on that line, when they have acquired this 
'34,000 acres of land during the last three 
years , to how many families they have 
provided jobs or are going to provide jobs? 

SHRI S, KR!SHAN KUMAR: Sir, the 
acquisition for the armed Forces is done 
under the land Acquisition Act or the Re-
questing and Acquisition of Immovable Prop-
erty Act for Operational purposes, In neither 
of these Acts there is any provision forgiving 
employrnent to people who have to lose the 
land consequent on the acquisition. When 
the Legislature enacted these laws, they toad 
taken into account the morality orthe practi, 
cality of giving land to the evictees. There is 
no proposal under the consideration of the 
Government to amend the legislation. But in 
certain cases, on the request of the State 
Govemments, we have given rehabilitation 
grants to enable the State Governments to 
rehabilitate the evictees. I have the details of 
the rehabiiitation grants which have been 
given in recent years. It is not practical nordo 
we want to take such a ｢ｬｾ＠ policy deviation or 
legislative deviation, giving a right to the 
evictees to alternative land or employment in 
Defence undar takings. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI MAHESH KANODIA: Mr, Speaker, 
Sir, through you, I would like to know (a) the 
names of defence projects for which land 
has been acquired in Gujarat during the last 
three years? Have those projects been 
completed and what are the reasons for 
which the acquired land is lying un utilized? 
(b) Have the Government paid compensa-

tlon for the land acquired in all cases particu-
larly in Gujarat and whether any case in 
regard to compensation is lying pending in 
court? 

[English] 

SHRI S. KRISHAN KUMAR: Sir, In the 
State of Gujara!, 32.7 acres of land was 
acquired in 1989-90 and 932.8 acres of land 
was acquired in 1990 91. In 199t-92,941.6 
acres of land was acquired. I can give the 
hon. Member the statistics regarding the 
cases pending in courts. But' have only the 
maerco picture, I do not have the figurres 
with respect to each State. There IS a con-
stant monitoring by the Ministry to ensure 
that the lands acquired are utilised and not 
kept idle unnecessarily. The progress 01 the 
land acquisition is also very closely moni-
tored in our Ministry. 

SHRI PETER G, MARBANIANG: Sir, I 
want to draw the attention of the hon, Minis-
terto the statement laid on the attention of th 
House in reply to the question, and to serial 
number 6 for ,he year 1991-92 where the 
figure of 0.250 acres is lilentioned and I want 
to ask where is the location of this land ir. 
Meghalaya and what is the same of the area. 

SHRI S. KRISHAN KUMAR: It is a small 
plot of land obviously acquired for defence 
purposes. I will require notice, 363 cases are 
pending and there are thousands of cases of 
the past years. I will require notice to answer 
this question. 

MR. SPEAKER: Yes, you can send it in 
writing. 

SHRI NIRMAL KANTI CHA TTEJEE: Sir, 
at Barrackpore, which is part of my constitu-
ency, there is a good amount of land which 
is lying vacant and which is in a very con-
gested area, We want to keep it-in these 
days of dist'Jrbing pollution-as a lung of that 
area where fresh air can be breathed. We 
want that this entire land nolto be bUi,1t upon 
andto letthat be treated as vacant plot which 
may be handed overto the municipality. We 
have been receiving representations in this 
regard. Will the hon. Minister agree to this? 
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SHRI S. KRISHAN KUMAR: Tho wMla 
question of surplus land is In the process of 
consideration. It is ostensibly a large part of 
he vacant land. The land£. are being identi-
fied. There are a large number of extensive 
plOts which are being kept open dellborately 
by the defence forces for use for public 
purposes. When any land is identifIed as 
surplus by the defence for('.es, the first option 
to purchase tllat land at market value is 
given to the State Government, then thf:-
municipaUties and then to public sectf.)( 
undertakings and $0 on. It is only then that 
the question of auction in which private 
developers can take part arises. The sug-
gesiion made by the hon. Member is worthy 
of consideration. Wa shall always disciJSS it 
with the State Government before any land 
is utilised in any manner and certainly there 
is a case for Opel1 ｾｮ､ｳ＠ being kept <IS sllch 
becai.Jse they are the lung at aas of cun.rbal' 
Hfe, 

SHRI LOKANA TH CHOUDHURY: Why 
at inarket Vi:' iue? ('nI9rruptions) 

[ Translation) 

PROF. PREM HUMAl:Mr. Speaker; Sir. 
as the hon. J.44;;;r\be( has admitTed that tile 
land for defence pi.lrposes is arv.ays i;IC-

quired under two Acts. There is a difference 
in the rates of the coll'.pensatiol'l given Wi ｾｲ＠
the land Acquisition Act and RequiS'ilkin 
nod A.cquif,itton of proparties Act due to 
Which the person from whom the lat'.d is. 
acquired may suffer loss also. Have the 
Government received any sugge&tions from 
the State Goveromant to make provisjon fo 
acquiring land u!iCier cne Ad instead of two. 
Secondly, the Cklvernment had acquired a 
vast area of land in the districts of Una, 
Hamirpur and Kullu in Himachal Pradesh 
many years ago. I would iike to know !he lima 
by Whictl Govornment proposes to S6t up 
Army Cantonments thljre? 

{English) 

SHRIS. KRISHAN KUMAR: Sir, the two 
legislations ｵＮＮｾＡ＠ which land Is acquirad for 
the defence forces have evol\l8\S ｾＢｦ＠ a 

CCl..!fS8 of time. V:a have the normal land 
acquisition Act. But the Requisitioning Act 
has been in operation and tha purpose of the 
Act is fer quick acquisition of land for opera-
tionai purposes of the defence forces. When 
the land Is immediately' required for opera-
tiona! purposes it Is requisitioned. The 3I1lOI. '11 
vI compensation is differont. (Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: It Is tef1l)orary and 
ｾｽＢｲｭ｡ｮ･ｮｴＮ＠ The requisition is temporary and 
the acquisition is p£rmanent. 

SHR! S. KRISHAN KUMAR: Accordlng 
to :he RAlP Requisition Act. only an annual 
compensation is paid to the land owner 
based on the rental till such time as Ihe ｬ｡［Ｎｾ＠
is not acquired whereas according to the 
La:;d Acquisition Act, the land value is 
determined by the Collw?r, too land acqui-
sition ValJ8 fs paid and the land bac.')mos 
part of the Government. These are two Acts 
and ｢ｯｴｬｾ＠ i}!ll necessary. thoro is no need to 
haile a single !egislation. 

DR. KARTIKESWAR PATRA: Mr. 
Sp9a!<:er, Sir. you will appreciate and the 
entire HOt,se wiU appreciate that in my con-
5tii,Jeney Balasore Chandipu( Defence es-
ＧｾＩ｢ｬｩｳｲ｜ｭ･ｲＮｴ＠ has contributed tremendously. 

MR. SPEAKER: We would like to con-
wraluiate you. 

OR. ｉｾｔｉｋｅｓｗａｒ＠ PATRA: Sir, the 
land aie a qulred by the Defence establish-
rT .. nIS; in 1 gS9-90 in Orissa is 92.630 acres 
and In :990-91 the land acquired was 22· 
acf85 and in 1991-92, only 2.58 acres of 
iane! have been acquired for the purpose of 
Defe:lCEI estabU$hments. 

Sir, I want to know categorically from Iha 
Mi,lister that at the time of accruing the land 
from the people an understanding was given 
to th& rn that for each family whose land has 
boon aQGuired, a person from that family will 
be provided ef1l)loyrnont facility. Bl:t till to-
day, sinal 1989 or even previous to that, It 
could not be provided to the people. so, there 
is much dissatisfaction amongst the piopkl. 
ThOiliC why I'WWlt to submit t.eforo the hen. 
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Minister that he should assure the House 
that erJ1)loyrnent wi" be given to the persons 
who have lost their lands on account of 
acquisition for Defence purposes. 

SHRI S. KRISHAN KUMAR: I have al-
ready explained in answerto the main ques-
tion that there is no right for employment or 
alternative land In the case of land acquisi-
tion. 

DR. KARTIKESWAR PATRA: The 
Government has assured that employment 
will be given. 

SHRI S. KRISHAN KUMAR: That is not 
possible. 

DR. KARTIKESWAR PATRA: I can 
show the letters of the Government in this 
regard. (Interruptions). 

SHRI S. KRISHAN KUMAR: The State 
Govemment promised and you may request 
the State Govem ment and we wID also put in 
a word. (Interruptions). 

[ Translation] 

SHRI AYUB KHAN: Mr. Speaker, Sir, 
through you, I would like to submit that 
maximum area of land was acquired In Ra-
jasthan as compared to aU other State for 
defence purposes. I would like to know from 
the hon. Ministerwhetherthe people aOOthe 
farmers living in backward areas of Rajast-
han, where even drtnklng water Is not aball-
able, will be given due compensation for 
their land acquired from them? Do the Gov-
ernment propose to provide the facility of 
drinking water also In those areas? 

(English] 

MR. SPEAKER: About f'8tlabilitatlon, 
ｧｾｮ･ｲ｡ｬｬｹ＠ It is replied. . 

SHRI S. KRISHAN KUMAR: Sir, I had 
already answered that along with ·the De-

fence land acquisition cases, in suitable cases 
we also give the State Govemments reha-
bilitation grants and in the rehabilitation situ-
ation, the requests such as the one made by 
the Marmer can also be accommodated by 
the ｣ｯｾ＠ State Govemment. 

MR. SPEAKER: Shri K.P. Singh Deo. I 
know the interests of the Members and 
according to their interests I am calling their 
names. (Interruptions). 

SHRI K.P. SINGH DEO: Sir,l would like 
to know from the hon. Minister whether the 
Defence Ministry has become a trading 
concern or a speculative body because In 
the figure given here, about 31000 acres of 
land has been acquired in the last three 
years and at the moment there is a move to 
sell off the prime land in Anand Parbat, Delhi 
Cantonment including the Rajputana Rifle 
Regil11Qntal Centre, Pune and Kanpur . So, 
I would like to know what is the policy of the 
Ministry of Defence In this regard and how 
much money was spent on acquire this 
31,000 acres of land in the last three years. 

SHRI S. KRISHAN KUMAR: Sir, there 
is a policy for disposal of surplus defence 
lands. A Committee is ｧｯｾＬｧ＠ into It. They 
have identified some aftha areas ｭ･ｮｴｩｯｾ＠
by the hon. Member. But;they are not going 
to be sold as such to private persons. First, 
they will be offered to the State Govern-
ments, then the Municipalities and so on at 
ITlaIbt value. Of course, you may ask: why 
are you acquf1ng when the surpluslMds are 
available. The acquisition is sIluatlon-spe-
cifc. It is depending on whera the projects 
are coming up aM these are not co-termi-
00U5. So, the acqu.ition hM to go on at 
sel8ded areas and disposal of surplus lands 
wll also going on In dlff&rent areas' as an 
ongoing proc:ers. The whole policy Is a long 
wcistlng one; We have not sold any prime 
Jand as yet 

, UR. sPeAKER: Thent II a Sht;l1 liotice 
ｏｕ･ｓｕｏａＦｯ､｡ｹｧｬｶ･ｮ｢ｹｾｍＡＢ＠ ... hrii.al.lwJII 
uk SM Keihri laI to PYl his question now. 
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SHORT NOTICE QUESTION 
[English] 

OTC au ... Chart.red by Public 
Schools 

S.N.Q.1. SHRI KESRI LAL: Will the 
Minister of SURFACE TRANSPORT be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Deihl Transport Corpo-
ration had asked all heads of schools in the 
Capital using DTC buses for transportation 
of school children to pay double the hire-
charges for Its buses chartered by such 
schools; 

(b) if so, whether DTC also conveyed to 
the heads of such schools the decision that 
the schools authorities shall not increase 
and will charge the some rates from the 
students which is being charged at present; 

(c) whether schools authritles have 
now asked the parents to pay more; and 

(d) if so, the reaction of the Govern-
ment thereto? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTLER): (a) tc (d). A 
Statement is laid on the Table of the Lok 
Sabha 

STATEMENT 

(a) and (b). Yes, Sir. 

(c) and (d). Some Instances have come 
to the notic8 of the Govemment. The Gov-
emment have discussed the matter with the 
ｐｲｩｮ｣ｩｲｾＧＮ＠ of Schools and they ha'te been 
given the folk toYing directions:-

(i) illl SChools would maintain an 
exclusive bus fee collection ac-
count, Into which all fees collected 
from the students on account of 
ｴｲ｡ｮｾ＿ＢＧＺＭ［､ｩｩｯｦＡ＠ would be be remlt-
ｾｳ､Ｎ＠

(Ii) Each school would estimate the 

total amounts required for payment 
to DTC at the new rates and on this 
basis, determine the monthly/quar-
terty slabs for bus fees which are to 
be realised from the students. 

(iii) The schools utilising the DTC buses 
would pay to DTC at the rate of Rs. 
9/- per Km. of utilisation. The 
schools would also be entitled to 
charge 50 paise per Km. Operated 
as administration charges from the 
students. 

(iv) Any surplus in the bus fee collec-
tion account of a particular year 
would be adjusted in the next year's 
estimated collection for the whole 
year by the schools and the fees to 
be realised from the students would 
be adjusted accordingly. 

(v) All schools would furnish an ｡ｮｮｵｾＱ＠
account to the Director of Educa-
tiol1, De1hiAdministration ofthetotal 
amounts collected by way of bus 
fees, the amounts paid to DTC! 
other transport operators and the 
balance avilable in the account. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI KESRI LAL: Mr. Speiker, Sir, the 
nTC had increased the hire-charges of OTC 
buses fortransportation of school children in 
the capital. It has been admitted Dy the 
Govemmentthatthe charges are very high. 
Some Instances have come to the notice of 
the Government that prtnclpals of some 
schoolS have asked the parents to pay more 
bus fee. In the light of the fact that things 
have come to the notice of the Government, 
I would like to know as to what action has 
been taken against such schools so far? 

[English] 

SHRI JAGDISH TYTLER: Some in-
stances came to our knowledge with refer-
ence to two schools stating that they were 
charging more bus fee than they were pay-
Ing to the DTe. We referred this to the 
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Director of Eduction and the Director of 
Eduction took whatever action was neces-
sary. The DTC was going in losses. We 
thought that as to why the DTC should pay 
for the school children who are going to 
public schools and so, we said that whatever 
:sthecost of the DTC, it should be paid by the 
schools. That is what we did. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI KESRI LAl: Mr Speaker. Sir the 
hon. Minister in his reply has just stated that 
the Director of Education wouid take action 
whatever was necessary. I would like to 
know whether the directions issued by the 
han. Minister to the schools are being fol-
lowed and what action will be taken by the 
Government in this ｲ･ｧ｡ｲｾｊＮ＠ Wnat effective 
measures are proposed to be taken to en· 
sure thatthe parent have not to pay more bus 
fee? In how man y schools more bus j ee h"s 
been charged? \'>Hlat action wiil be taken 
against the principals of such schools? 

SHRI JAG DISH TYTlER: Inst,mces of 
only two schools-Lady l:win Schoo! and 
ramjas Pc:blic School hascame t'J the notice 
of the Government, in pursuance of which a 
meeting of the principals of ali ｳ｣ｾｯｯｬｳ＠ and-
the ｄ［ｾ･｣ｴｯｲ＠ of Education was convened. It 
was made clear to them that it was not 
justified on the part of any of the schools to 
charge more bus fee from the students and 
pay less to DTC. Thereafter, a meeting of the 
officials of the Ministry of Surface Transport 
wa:; t,eld. This direction had to be issued 
whon the Delhi High Court gavs a verdict 
th?t to school sould charge bus fea trom the 
students as profit. The entire expendiluro will 
be borne by the DTC. This made the OTC 
realise that they had been suffaring consid-
erable losses due to this. The Government 
then deciced not to ;xtend this concessIon 
to private public schOOlS. Whtln the pamnts 
can afford to send their children to ｰｲ･ｭｩｾｈ＠
schools, then 

[English] 

It is the same thing if I look there, that 
way. 

[ Translation} 

They thought that the orc would bear 
the transportation expenses of public schools, 
but we decided notto allow this; The schools 
will ha lie to meet tha expenses that the DTC 
incurs on transportation of school children; 
So we increased the charges accordingly. 

SHRI I\ESRI LAL: In how many of 
schools more bus fee has been charged and. 
what action is being taken against them? 

MH. SPEAKER: I am calling Stiri Khur-
ana, You rncy please sit down. 

SHRI MADAN LAL KHURANA: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, earlierthe DTCcharged Rs,4.50 
per km which has now been increased to 
Rs.9.SO now. The burden of these extra 
charges ha" faih:m on the parents, As the 
citizens of Delhi these parents have to hear 
addit;onal burden of 100 percent increaseCl 
charges and aoditional burden In being put 
on them as iilcreased bus ｩ｡ｮｾｳＮ＠ In order 10 
provide the.:n some rolie' I would like ｾｯ＠

suggest two a:ternatIV9s. ! t'iOp6 the hon, 
Minister will tal<e them into consideration? 
Firstly, DTC iSS-UEls monthly sludent passt)s 
for Rs. 12.50p to ali the studants in Delni, bU! 
these small c!".ildren "ave been deprived oj 
this !acillty. Will lhs Government consider to 
prOVIde same passes to them atso? Or ;allow 
the private buses p!a1fng under DTC opera-
lion to render this service to schools at tl'Je 
rate of RsA.50. per km so that the parents 
and sl'-lden!s would not bear extra burden. 11 
DTe :s not prepared for this. the Govern-
ment may allow the private buses playing 
under OTC operation. They are prepared to 
ply their buses at the rate of Rs.4.S0 per km 
The Govemment will have just to monitor 
their operation. 

SHRi JAG DISH TYTL.ER: The sugges-
tion given in the inttJrest of the children is 
g\>od. Adequate attention will be paid to it. 
Secondly, DTC buses are primarny meant 
for public who are mostly office goers. The 
Govemment is not prepared to run them for 
schools. Those who want to avail DTC selV-
ice wUl have to bear the estimated expendi-
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ture. This is absolutely clear. Let me clarify 
this to you also. When I directed the Delhi 
Administration to Issue permits for 3000 more 
buses to provide bus facility to Delhotes, I 
know how they twisted by statoment and 
questioned as to what the Central Govern-
ment was doing in this regard. Now the 
pOSition wili become clear the day after 
tomorrow when the Delhi Administration 
issues permits for 3000 more buses; I am 
confident that this will further improve the 
bus facility in Delhi. 

[English] 

SHRI CHETAN P.S. CHAUHAN: I do 
not agree with the hon. Minister that this 
facility of the buses is being utilised by public 
schools orthe Children of rich families. There 
are nearly 50,000 students going to these 
schools and those students are not neces-
sarily rich people'schildren. There are middle-
class, salaried people also whose children 
are going and this rate which has been 
incraased from RS.4.S per km to RS.9i-, the 
parents are finding it verydifflcuit. As it is, the 
fees are very high, In the public school, the 
average fees is RS.400i- per month and no 
the top 01 it, this is an extra burden. 

MR. SPEAKER: Please ask the ques· 
tion. 

SHRI CHETAN P.S. CHAUHAN: The 
college students are paying only RS.12/- for 
their pass. If you want to increase the fare, 
will you consider their request and increase 
it gradually, that is, from Rs.4.50 per KM. to 
RS.6 or RS.6.S0 or RS.7l-instead of RS.9/-? 

[ Translation] 

SHRI JAGDISH TYTLER: I have given 
reply to the question raised by Shri Madan lal 
Khurana that the cases of bus passes will be 
taken into consideration. However, DTC will 
not, at any cost, provide buses at cheaper 
rates to any of the public 
schools ..... (lnterruptions) 

[English] 

MR. SPEAKER: Question period Is over. 

12.11 hrs. 

WRITTEN ANSWERS TO QUESTIONS 

[ Translation] 

Stock Exchanges 

'927. KUMARl UMA BHARTI: 
SHRI RAMKRISHNA 

KUSMARIA: 

Willihe Ministerot FINANCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether a number of Stock Ex-
(.hanges are operating in the country, par-
ticularly in Madhya Pradesh, without he 
approval of the Union Government; 

(b) if so, the details thereol; 

(c) whether the Union Government 
propose to ban the operation of such Stock 
Exchanges; 

(d) if so, the details thereof; and 

(e) if no, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) to (e). According to 
Sub-section 1 of Section 13 of the Secureties 
Contracts (Regulation Act 1956, no person 
shall, except with the permission of the 
Central Government, organise or assist in 
organising or be a member of any stock 
exchange (other than a recognised stock 
exchange) for the purpose of assisting in, 
entering into or performing any contracts In 
securities. In exercise of the powers con-
ferred by SUb-section (2) of Section 19 of the 
Act, the Government have issued a Notifica-
tion on 8th September, 1962 appointing the 
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8th day of September, 1962,as the date on 
which Section 19 shall come into force in 
those States and areas where that section is 
not already in force. 

(2) In view ofthe above provisions ofthe 
Ad. Stock Exchanges other than recognised 
Stock Exchanges are prohibited under the 
Pd. In case Instances of establishment and 
functioning of Stock Exchanges without the 
approval of the Government as required 
underthe Ad are brought to the notice of the 
Government appropriate action in the matter 
will be initiated. 

[English] 

Family Planning Through SETUP and 
SEEUY 

·928. SHRI BOLLA BUll I RAMAIAH: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whetherthe Government propose to 
issue directions to the commercial banks to 
give priority in disbursement of loans under 
the scheme of SeIf-Ef1l>loyment Programme 
for Urban Poor and Self-Employment 
Scheme for Educated Unemployed Youth to 
those applicants who adopt small family 
norms; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) if not, he reasons thefefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) and (c). Do not arise. 

Export Credit Growth 

·929. SHRI C. SREENIVAASAN: Will 
the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the growth of export credit 
has been sagnanVnegalve during 1991-92; 

(b) if so, the reasons therefore; 

(c) the steps taken or proposed to be 
taken by the Government 0 Increase the 
export credit; and 

Cd) he measures taken by the Govern-
ment of ensure tl'\at the exportable goods 
conform to the international standard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) and (b). According to 
the latest date available for the Reserve 
Bank of India, export credit outstandings as 
on the last Friday of December, 1991 stood 
at Rs. 10,554.93 crares as against Rs. 
9,479.98 crores as on the last Friday of 
March, 1991. This shown an increase of 
11.3% during the period March-December 
1991. The export credit outstanding as on 
the last Friday of March, 1990 was signifi-
cantly lower at Rs. 8,645.50 crores. 

(c) The Govemment have taken a 
number of steps to increase export credit 
availability by introducing new schemes like 
post-shipment export credit denominate in 
dollars and preshipment credit in foreign 
currency at lower interest rate. Export credit 
refinance facility by the RBI to commercial 
banks and running account facility for all 
export items also enable provision of ade-
quate export credit by the banks. 

(d) The Govemment recognises the 
need 0 facilitate export products adhering to 
international standards. The Export Inspec-
tion Council exists with a network of 5 Export 
Inspection Agencies for quality control 
inspection.Quality standards are prescribed 
by the Government for all notified commodi-
ties. The new Exim Policy aims at encourag-
ing a quality awareness campaign, a.ssist 
State Govemment in launching similar pro-
gramme, assist in modernisation and upgra-
dation of Test Houses and laboratories to 
bring them at par with international stan-
dards and to recognise and reward manu-
facturers who have acquired the ISO 9000 
(series), the BIS 14000 (series) or any other 
internationally recognised equivalent certifi-
cation of quality. 
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[ Translation) 

Payment for Newsprint 

*930. SHRI RAM TAHAl 
CHOUDHARY: WUI the Minister of COM-
MERCE be pleased to state; 

, (a) the quantity and value of the news-
print purchased before the devaluation of 
rupee; 

(b) whether the payment was made 
after the devaluation of rupee as a result of 
which the Government had to pay more In 
rupee; . 

(c) if so, the extra amount that had to be 
paid; and 

(d) the reaction of the Government in 
this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF HE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) to (d). Short term for-
eign currency borrowings for imports of 
newsprint were availed of by the STC. These 
liabilities were paid on the due dates, which 
were in the post devaluation period and 
consequently entailed additional rupee cost 
to the tune of Rs. 60.63 crores. 

As on 1.7.91, the loans in foreign cur-
rency outstanding amounted to US$ 91.68 
million (FOB value) 'or a quantity of 1.551akh 
MTs of newsprint. 

Pursuant to the discussions with the 
Members of the Newsprint Industry, the 
industry agreed to bear As. 29.20 crores out 
of the additional rupee cost. 

(English] 

Job. 0 Dependent. of Deceased 
Defence Employee. 

*931. SHRI JANARDAN MISRA: Will 
the Minister of DEFENCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) the number of the dependents of 
deceased Defence employees to whom 
employment has been given during 1990-91 
and 1991-92; 

(b) the number of cases outstanding 
underthis category at present and the number 
of persons likely to get efTl)loyment during 
1992-93; and 

(c) the other steps being taken by the 
Government to remove the sufferings of the 
family members of deceased Defence 
employees? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHRI 
SHARAD PAWAR): (a) 1914 and 1837 
dependents of deceased Defence employ-
eesweregiVenCOfl'l>8Sslonateappolntments 
during 1990-91 and 1991-92, respectively. 

(b) 2819 cases were outstanding at the 
beginning of 1992-93. b is not possible to 
indicate the exact number of persons likely 
to get employrnant during the current year. 

(c) Other weHare measures to reduce 
the sufferings of families of deceased De-
fence employees include sanction of family 
pension, death gratuity, group insurance, 
encashment of balance leave, and medical 
treatment under approved schemes. 

Constn.lctlon of RoadsIBridges 

*932. SHRI G: M. C. BAlA YOGI: 
SHRI V. N. SHARMA: 

Will the Minister of SURFACE 
TRANSPORT be pleased to state: 

(a) whetherthe Government have final-
ised the Schemeslprojectforconstruction of 

. roads bridges under the Central loan Assis-
tance Programme for roads of inter-State or 
economic ｾ｡ｮ｣･＠ to ｾ＠ undertaken 
during Eighth Plan; and 

(b) '10, the details thereof, State-wise? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
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(sHRI JAG DISH TYTLER): (a) No, Sir, as 
the Eighth Plan is not yet finalised. 

(b) Does not arise. 

[Translation] 

NTC Mills In M. P. 

·933. SHRI RAMESHWAR PATIDAR: 
Will the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether National Textile Corpora-
tion units in Madhya Pradesh are facing 
great difficulties in production of cloth due to 
non-supply of cotton yam; 

(b) if so, the details of the demand of 
cotton yarn made by the above units; and 

(c) the action proposed to be tal(en by 
the Government to ensure regular supply of 
cotton yarn to these units? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF MINIS-
TRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
G.EHL01): (a) AIlthe units of NTC (M. P.) are 
Composite Mills, which weave cloth from the 
yarn produced out of the respective spinning 
sections. Therefore, the non-availability of 
cotton yarn does not arise. 

(b) and (c). Do not arise. 

[English} 

Export of Electronic Goods 

·934. KUMARI UMA SHART!: Will the 
Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the value of electronic goods ex-
ported during 1990-91; 

(b) the percentage of increase likely to 
be made in the next financial year; and 

(c) the foreign exchange likely to be. 
earned therefrom? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) The value of electron-
ics goods exported during 1990-91 is Rs. 
995 crores as per the data maintained by 
Electronics & Computer Software Export 
Promotion Council. 

(b) The percentage of increase likely to 
be made In 1991-92 is 34.4%. 

(c) The total export as per Electronics 
and Compute Software ECP in the year 
1991-92 is of Rs. 1337 crores. 

Functioning of ICICI 

·935. PROF. UMMAREDDY VE-
NKATESWALU: Will the Minister of FI-
NANNCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Government have re-
ceived representations regarding the man-
agement of the Industrial Credit and Invest-
ment Corporation of India (ICICI) during the 
last two years; and 

(b) if so, the action taken to streamline 
the management of the Corporation? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) The Government has not re-
ceived any general complaints with regard to 
the mode of functioning of the management 
of the Industrial Credit and Investment Cor-
poration of India Ltd. (ICICI) during the last 
two years. 

(b) Does not arise. 

Import of CoHon 

·935-A. SHRI RAMASHRAY PRASAD 
SINGH: Will the Minister of TEXTILES be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the gap between demand 
and production of cotton has increaSingly 
widened during the last three years; 

(b) If so, theactual'demandandproduc-
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tion of cotton during each of the three years 
in the country; 

(c) whether the Govemment have re-
ported to import of cotton to meet the in-
creasing demand; and 

(d) it SC. the actual value and quantity of 
cot!en imported during each of the last three 
year? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF MINIS-
TRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 

(c) During the cotten seasons 1988 ·89, 
1989-90 and 1990-91, there was no import 
of cotton by the Government. 

(d) Does not arise. 

Trade with Asean Countries 

*936. SHRI DIGVIJAYA SINGH: Will 
the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased.to 
state: 

(a) tha present volume of trade with 
Associa[ion of ｓｯｵｴｾ＠ East Asian Nation 
countries; 

(b) the value of exports made to each of 
the ASEAN countries during the last year; 
and 

(c) the steps taken or proposed to be 
taken by the Government to increase ex-
ports to these countries? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) As per DGCI&S's 

, statistics, the present volume of Trade with 
. Association of South East Asian Countries 
during the first 10 months of the financial 
year 1991-92 (April '91-January '92) has 
been of the order of Rs. 4201.30 crores. 

(b) The value of exports made to ASEAN 
Countries during 1990-91 has been as un-
der:-

(Value in Rs. Crores) 

Country Exports 

Brunei 1.22 

Indonesia 195.44 

Malaysia 267.75 

Philippines 49.13 

Singapore 679.07 

Thailand 442.76 

(c) Besides increasing the cOO1>etitive 
strength of our industry through various policy 
measure, these include periodical review of 
bilateral trade, participation in international 
fairsfexhibitons, exchange of business dele-
gations, market surveys and the like. 

Tissue Culture In Tea Gardens 

*937. Dr. KRUPASINDHU SHOI: Will 
the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whetherthe Government propose to 
adapt tissue culture in tea gardens to ag-
men! the production; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) the project identified for tissue cul-
ture during ＱＹＹＲｾＹＳ＿＠

THE .. ilNISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) to (c). Scientists of 
premier institutes of tea research in India like 
the Tea Research Association at Jorhat. 
Assam are already engaged in tissue culture 

. research. However, the research It still al 
laboratory stage. Since the strategy for tea 
development envisages rapid increase In 
production and productivity, research in Tea, 
including the tissue culture research, has a 
significant role to play In achieving the objec-
tive of producing 1000 Million Kgs. ot tea 
annually by 2000 AD. 
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. Apart from the ongoing projects being 
conducted by TRA, UPASI and Tatas, an 
advanced scheme on Tissue Culture with an 
outlay of As. 40 lakh during 1992-93 is under 
the consideration of the Government. 

Import of DISH Antennae and Compo- . 
nents 

*938. SHRI M. V. CHANDAASHEKARA 
MURTHY: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Directorate of Revenue 
Intelligence, Bombay have recently un-
earthed a major racket in the import of dish-
antennae and components used in receiving 
satellite transmission; 

(b) if so, the facts and details in this 
regard; 

(c) whetherthe Government have taken 
or propose to take steps to check such illegal 
import of dish-antennae and components in 
future; and 

(d) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) to (d). The Hon'bla 
Member is presumably referring to the sei-
zure of 6 prices of computer synthesized 
satellite receivers with remote control valued 
at Rs.2.40 lakhs approximately, effaded by 
the Bombay Zonal Unit of the Directorate of 
Revenue Intelligence on 19.2.1992. The 
goods were Imported In 3 parcels which had 
arrived at Bombay from Hondong and were 
declared to contain one 'resaver' each to be 
delivered at an address in Bombay. On 
enquiry, this address was found to be fictl-

lious. A Show Cause Notice has already 
been Issued and the casa is pending adjudI-
cation. 

The Customs authorities are vigilant 
against smuggling including that of elec-
tronic goods. InteUigence is targeted against 
such smuggling and the Directorate of Reve-
nue Intelligence which Is the apex body for 
the colladlon, coUation and dissemination of 
intelligence on smuggling, actively assists 
Customs authorities. 

Manufacture of Textile Goods 

*939. SHRI A. CHARLES: WUI the Min-
ister of TEXTILES be pieased to state: 

(a) the total quantity of textile goods 
manufactured in the country during each of 
the last :hree year; 

(b) the percentage of these goods 
manufactured in textile mills, powerlooms 
and handlooms separately, year-wise; 

(c) the estimate number of worl<ers 
employed in thesa sectors. sador-wise; 

(d) the financial assistance given by the 
Government to each sector during each of 
the last three year; and 

(e) the minimum wages fixed by the 
Government for the worl<ers efT1>loyed in 
these sectors? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES(SHRI ASHOK 
GE.-1t.OT): (a) and (b). The quantity of cloth 
and the percentage share of Mill Sector, 
Power\oom Sector and Handloom sector in 
indicated ｾｉＮｯｷＺ＠
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(c) The estimated employment of work-
ers In these sectors during 1991-92 is as 
follows: 

Sector Employment 
(LakhsINo.) 

Mill 11.07 

Handlooll) 96.57 (P) 

Powerloom 62.92 

Total 170.56 --------------
(d) Financial assistance given to MiU 

Sectorunderthe Textile Modernisajion Fund 
Scheme fo the last three years is as follows: 

Year 

1989-90 

1990-91 

1991-92 

(Upto Feb., 92) 

Amount of assis 
tance disbursed 
(Rs. crores.) 

173.72 

185.53 

106.09 

In respect of Powerloom Sector no Ji-
nancial assistance is given by the Gover.,-
ment. 

The financial assistance givcnlo Hand-
loom Sector during the last three ye.,rs is;;5 
follows: 

Year 

1989-90 

1990-91 

1991 -92 (P) 

Amount of assis 
tance disbursed 
(Rs. in ia.irhs) 

2203212 

21540.38 

20636.47 --------------------
(e) The minimum wages forthti workers 

of there sectors are not fixed by the Centrai 
Government. 

Illegal Operations In Foreign 
Exchange 

940. SHRI R. SURENDER 
REDDY: 
SHRI GEORGE FERN-
ANDES: 

Will the Ministerof FINANCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether the Govemment are exam-
ining a package of measures to eliminate 
illegal operations in foreign exchange; 

(b) n so, the details of the measures 
pi oposed to be taken in this regard; and 

(c) the time by which final decision is 
likely to be taken? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE(SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) and (b). Measures to 
eliminate illegal operation inforeign exchange 
are countinously under consideration. Gov-
ernment has already taleen several meas-
ures which reduce the incentive for illegal 
transaction and ensure effective enforce-
ment of e)(lcting rules relating to foreign 
exchange transect ions. Liberalisat;on of 
unnecessary controls on trade and foreign 
exchange infiow/outflows is expected to 
reduce the scala of illegal operations. 

(c) Does nut arise. 

Export of Medicines 

'941. SHRI C. SREENIVAASAN: 
SHRIMATI VASUNDHARA 

RAJE: 

Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pieased to slate: 

(a; whether ｩｮ､ｩｧ･ｮｯｾｳ＠ systems of 
medicine like Ayurvedic, Unan; and Sidha 
are in great demand In European countries; 

(b) whether GovernfTlE'n! have made 
concerted efforts to increase export of such 
medicines to these ｣＿ｾｾｴｲｩ･ｳ［＠ and 
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(c) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) to (c). Although many 
of the Ayurvedic, Unani and Sidha medi-
cines have found favour with European 
Countries such as Netherlands, Switzerland, 
U. K. Germany, Belgium and Italy, etc., 
exports of these medicines have not been 
very significant, particularly due to problems 
connected with lengthy and cumbersome 
procedure for registration of drugs laid down 
by the health authorities of oversease coun-
tries. Moreover, the manufacturers of Ayur-
vedic, Unani and Siddha medicines do not 
have the same kind of clinical date to back 
their products up as is available for allopathic 
medicines. Many countries have restrictions 
on use of this group of medicines because of 
presence of metal oxides in them. 

In orderto popularise the use of Ayurve-
dic medicines in overseas countries, the 
Basic Chemicals. Pharmaceuticals and 
Cosmetic Export Promotion Council 
(CHEMEXCIL). Bombay. in association with 
a renowned Ayurvedic Research Centre have 
prepared a monograph on 'Selected Medici-
'lal Plants' for PUblicity abroad and printing 
literature a on AY:JrvE::dic med'cines in differ-
ent foreign languages. The Council are also 
undertaking all other usual export promotion 
measures sl.;ch as sending promotional 
teams abroaa and arrangiiog buyer-seller 
meets etc. to boost exports from this sector. 

Imports and Exports by MMTC 

'942. SHRIMOHAN RAWALE: Will the 
M:OIster 01 COMMERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether a large number of import 
and export items have been taken away from 
the Minerals and Metals Trading Corpora-
tion Limited; 

(b) i1 so, the details of such items; 

(c) whether this decana\isation is likely 
to cause heavy loss to MMTC and, If so, the 
estimated amount thereof; and 

(d) the number in which the Govern-
ment propose to offset loss? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) and (b). Export items, 
namely Iron ore of Redl origin, Coal and 
BaUXite and import items, namely Fluorspar, 
Platinum & Palladium. Non-ferrous Metals 
(Copper. Zinc, Lead and Nickel), Iron & 
ｾｴ･･ｬＬ＠ Asbestos, Sulphur, Rock, Phosphate, 
Ammoni3 and Phosphoric Acid are no longer 
canalised through MMTC. 

(c) and (d). The national loss in MMTC's 
turnover on account of decanalisation of 
above items during 1992-93 is estimated at 
Rs. 2.183 crores. Though decanaiised, 
MMTC may also trade in these items. Be-
sides, MMTC has plans to make up for the 
loss in turnover by increase in trace in non-
canalised items. 

Pre-Shipment Inspection of Textiles 

'943. SHRI RABI RAY: 'Ifill the Minister 
of TEXTILES be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Government have an-
nounced relaxation in the requirement re-
garding compulsory pre-shipment inspec-
tion of textile items; and 

(b) i1 so. the details thereof? 

THE MINiSTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASH OK 
GEHLOT): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) The details of liberallsation allowed 
in respect of compulsory pre-shipment in-
spection of Textiles Committee are as un-
der:-

(i) All the Star Trading Houses, Trad· 
ing Houses and Export Houses 
have been totally exempted from 
the purview of compulsory pre-ship-
ment inspection 01 Textiles Com-
mittee. 

(ii) Pre-shipment is now not neces-
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sary provided the exporter has a 
'firm letter from the overseas buyer 
staling that the overseas buyerdae$ 
not want pra-shipment iaspac::tIo1" 
from any official agency. 

(Iii) The exporter two has attained the 
aiteragelevel of exports during the 
last three years @ Rs. 1.5 crores 
per annum is now allowed to export 

. without Textiles Committees in-
spection provided Textiles Com-
mittee has not received any quality 
complaint against him from the 
overseas buyer and the exporter is 
capable ottesting this products prior 
to exports in his own premises of 
using by common testing facilities. 

(iv) In regard to units where self certifi-
cation has been allowed, Textiles 
Committee would restrict its role 
only to the level of a study. 

2. The Textiles itel1l$ manufactured by 
100% Export Ortented Units and Units 
located in Export Processing Zones have 
already been exempted from the purview 
of compulsory pr-shipment inspection by 
the Textiles Committee. 

Achievements of Rubber Board 

*944. SHRI THAYllJOHN ANJAlOSE: 
Will the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) the activities undertaken and the 
results achieved by the RubberBoardduring 
each of the last three years in Kerala; and 

(b) the action plan drawn upfordevelop-
ment of rubber plantations in Kerala during 
the current year? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 

CHJDAMBARAM): (a) The activities under-
taken during the last three years by the 
RUbber Boardfor increasing production and 
productivity from the existing mature areas 
under rubber in Kerala include:-

(i) Perfecting the rubber tapping sys-
tem by educating rubber tappers 
on the practical aspects through 
refresher courses. 

(Ii) Tapping during rainy months by 
fixing rain guards on tapping pan-
els of rubber trees. 

(iii) Persuading rubber growers to tap 
rubbertrees during summer months 
against the usual practice of rest-
ing the tres in summar. 

(iv) Popularisation of prophylactic 
spraying of fungicide for control of 
disease has particularlytAe dread-
ful disease called abnormal leaf 
fall. 

(v) Discriminatoryfertilizer application 
by testing the soil and leaf of rubber 
plants so as to ensure nutritional 

• balance and enhanced yield. 

(vi) Selected application of chemical 
yield stimulants on tapping panels 
of rubber trees for boosting yield. 

(vii) Regular transfer of technology to 
the grass-roots through rubber 
producers'societies. 

(viii) Extension of rubber plantation and 
replantation of uneconomic rubber 
holdings. 

The ｾｨｩ･ｶ･ｭ･ｮｴ＠ of new planting and 
replanting during the year 1989-90 to 1991-
92 under the Rubber' Plantation Develop-
ment Scheme in Kerala are as follow:-
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Year Replanting New Planting 
(HectolS) (Hectams) 

1989-90 4500 

1990-91 5400 

1991-92 4900 

During these yearS, the achievements' 
exceeded the target envisaged in the 
Scheme. 

(b) Rubber planting in Kerala is attain-
Ing a saturation point. Emphasis is, there-
fore, being laid on rehabilitating the old and 
unecomic units. During 1992-93, it is esti-
mated that 6000 hectares will be replanted 
and 4000 hectares will be collered under 
new planting. Further, the schemes for im-
proving production and productIVity will also 
be continued. Quality improvement of raw 
rubber by popularising the modem method 
of processing the rubber latex into sheets, 
etc. is also under operation in Kerala. 

Expressway Network 

9499. DR. AMRITLAl KAlIDAS 
PATEL: 

SHRI SHANKERSING 
VAGHELA:. 

Will the Minister of SURFACE 
TRANSPORT be pleased to state: 

(a) whether a study by the Asian Devel-
opment Bank has revealed that India would 
need an Expressway network of roughly 
10,020 kms by the year 2015. 

(b) if so, the. action plan drawn in this 
regard; and 

(c) the time schedule fixed thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRIJAGDISH TYTLER): (a) Yes, Sir. 

8400 

6000 

5400 

(b) and (c). No action plan has ｢･ｾｮ＠
drawn up pn the basis of the said study so 
far, since it would depend on finalisatlon 9f 
the 8th Plan and overall availability of re-
sources. 

Pay Scale of Joint Director Level 
OffIc .... of Indian Economic 

Service 

9500. SHRI SANAT KUMAR MANDAl: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether some Joint Dirctor level 
officers of the Indian Economic Service were 
recently given the scale of Rs. 5900-6700; 

(b) whether this was done by promotion 
or upgradation and in the lattercase whether 
the criteria of seniority etc. was followed; 

(c) whetherthese upgradatlon have been 
notHied in the OffiCial Gazettee just as is 
done in the cast of promotions to the higher 
grades, and H so, when; and 

(d) H not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) and (b). 17 officers in 
Gracie I of the Indian EconomiC Services 
were promoted to the Senior Administrative 
Grade in the pay scale of Rs. 5900-6700. 

(c) and (d). The notHicatlon H under is-
sue. 
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Central Training Centres for 
Personnels Engaged In Inland 

Navigation 

9501. SHRI MANIKRAO HODLYA 
GAVIT: Will the Minister of SURFACE 
TRANSPORT be pleased to state: 

(a) the details of the existing training 
centres and facilities being provided for train-
ing personnel engaged in inland navigation; 

(b) whether there is any Central Train-
ing Institute for advance level training of 
senior managerial as well as supervisory 
personnel engaged in inland navigation; and 

(c) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTLER): (a) There are 
three existing centres for training crew of 
inland vessels. These centres located at 
Belim (Goa), Chandbali (Orissa) and 
Guwahati (Assam) are run by the respective 
State Governments. 

(b) No, Sir. 

(c) Does not arise. 

Tax Arrears Against Industrial 
Concerns 

9502. SHRI V. S. RAJASEKHAR 
REDDY: Will the Minister of. FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the names of the top ten industrial 
concerns which are in arrears of each of the 
Central taxes; 

(b) whether the Government have de-
cided to provide investment opportunities in 
the new industrial order to only those con-
cerns which are not in tax arrears; 

(c) if'so,the details thereof; and 

(d) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) The names of top 10 
Industrial concerns against which maximum 
tax demand was outstanding, are as under: 

MaximumincofTl8-taxlWealth tax demand 
outstanding as on31. 12. 1991: 

1. Oil & Natural Gas Commission. 

2. G. T. C. Industries Limited. 

3. Peerless General Finance & In-
vestment Company Limited. 

4. Indian Oil Corporation Limited. 

5. State Bank of India . . 
6. Hindustan Cables Limited. 

7. Dunlop India Limited. 

8. Continental Construction Limited. 

9. National Organic Chemical Indus-
tries Limited. 

10. Aditya Finance and Inv. (I) Limited. 

Maximum Excise Duty demand out-
standing as on 31.1.1992 

1. Oilq".d ｾｾ｡ｴｵｲ｡ｬ＠ Gas Commission. 

2. I. T. C. Limited. 

3. Oil India. 

4. I. P. C. L. 

5. Indian Oil Corporation Limited. 

6. Burn Standard Co. 

7.' B. E. M. L. Limited. 

8. Steel AultlOrity of India Linw"d. 

9. BorrbayTyre Intemationall united 
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10. Utility Engineering India Limited. 

The information regarding top 1 0 indus-
trial concerns against which ｭｾｩｭｵＢＬ＠
, demand of Custom Duty was outstanding ,Is 
being collected and will be laid on the Table 
of the House. 

(b) Under the new Industrial Policy, 
Industrial licensing has been abolished for 
all industries except a short list of specified 
industries, irrespective of levels of invest-
ment. In the matter of licensing, industria! 
undertakings which are in tax arrears are not 
distinguished from those which are not in 
arrears. 

(c) Does not arise. 

(d) The tax demands may be outstand-
ing because the same are disputed by the 
industrial concerns in appeals, etc. or the 
recovery thereof has been stayed or the 
payment has been allowed to be made in 
instalments. 

[ Translation] 

Production of Opium 

9503. SHRI VISHWANATH SHASTRI: 
Will the Minister of FiNANNCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether there has been a decrease 
in the production of opium in the country 
during the last three years; 

(b) it so, the details thereof; 

(c) whether due to fall in the production 
of opium the foreign exchange eamed there-
from has also decreased; and 

(d) if so, the details thereof for the year 
1989, 1990 and 1991, year-wise? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WARTHAKUR): (a) Yes, Si.(, 

. (b) The detailS of production of opium In 

the country during the last three years are 
given below:-

Year 

1988-89 

1989-90 

1990·91 

Production of Opium 
In Tonnes 

AT 900 Consistence 

491. 

437 

379 

(c) There has been no decrease in for-
eign exchange eamings as India has been 
exporting opium from the stock accumulated 
over the years. 

(d) The figures of foreign exchange 
earnings (converted to Indian Rupees) dur-
ing the financial years 1989-90, 1990-91 and 
1991-92 on account of export of opium are 
Rs. 17.76 crores, Rs. 41.36 crores and Rs. 
63.56 crores respectively. 

Export of AyulVedlc Medicines 

9504. SHRI JAGMIT SINGH BRAR: 
SHRI V. N. SHARMA: 

Will the Minister COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the attention of the Govern-
ment has been drawn to the newsitem cap-
tioned, "Ayurvedic, Unani, Siddha;. drug 
export to Europe co up' appearing in the 
Eccnomic Times date February 11,- 1992; 

(b) if so, the details and the facts thereof; 

(c) whether India AyulVedic system of 
medicines is becoming popular In. other 
countries of the world; . 

(d) if so, the incentive provided by the 
Go .... ernment to promote this system of 
medicines in the country during !he last three 
years; and . 

(e) the value of Ayurvedic medicines 
exported to each of the foreign countries 
during the above period? 
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THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 

MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) to (e). Export of ayurve-
dlc. Unanl and Slddha medicines etc. for the 
perio<i 1988-89to 1991-92 April-March have 
been as under: 

(Source: EPC) 

1989-90 

1990-91 

1991-92 

(Rs. In Crams) 

As. 2.92 Crores 

As. 7.29 Crores 

As. 6.13 crores 
(Provisional) 

Ayurvedic. Unanl and Siddha medicines 
" are being exported to the European Coun-

tries like. Netherlands. Norway. Switzerland. 
U. K .• Germany. Belgium. etc. These medI-
cines have also good export potential in U. S . 

. A, uSSR, Malaysia, Srilanka, Nigeria and 
, other countries. ,_ 

Export of these medicines have not 
been very singnifcant particularly due to 
problems connecited with lengthy an cum-
bersome procedure for registration of drugs 
laid down by the health authorities of over-
seas countries. Moreover, the manufactur-
ers of these medicines do not have the same 
kind of of clinical data to back up their prod-
ucts as is available for allopathic medicines. 
Many countries have restrictionS on use of 
this group of medicines because of pres-
ence of metals Oxides In them. 

Case Compensatory SUpport at the rate 
of 5% which export of certain medicines 
wereenjoiningpriort03.7.91 hassincebeen 
suspended. After suspension of CCS and 
expansion of 111l>0rt replemshment scheme ' 
inJuly, 91 theseprodUCls'weremadeellgble 
for exim scrips at the rate of 30% At present 
export of these medicines are entailed to t!-.. ' 
benefits of the partial convertibility of rupee. 
recently announced by the Government 
underthenewpackageoffinanclalandtrade 
manns. 

In orderto popuJarisethe use of Ayurve-

die medIcInes In overseas countries. the 
Basic Chemicals. pharmaceutical and Cos-
metics Export promotion Council. Bombay, 
In assOCIation with a renowned Research 
Centre have prepared a comprehensive' 
"Monograph of Selected Medicinal Plants· , 
which Is under printing for publicity abroad, 

The Council Is undertaking all usual 
export promotion measures such as sending 
promotional tearns abroad and arranging 
buyer-seller meets etc, to boost exports from 
this sector, 

Theft of Anns and Ammunitions 
from Ordnanc:ed Depots 

9505. SHRI DEVI BUX SINGH: 
SHRI PRABHU DAYAL KATH-

ERIA: 

Will the Minister of DEFENCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether a large number of he Inci-
dents of theft of arms and ammunition have 
been reported ｾｭ＠ the various arsenals! 
Ordnance ｾｯｴｳ＠ in country during the last 
three years; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; 

(c) whether any arrest was made In this 
regard; 

(d) H so, the details thereof; and 

(e) the stepS taken or proposed to be 
taken by the Govemment to check such 
Incidents in future? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHRI 
SHARAD PAWAR): (a) and (b), Only one 
case of theft of armsIammunition has been 
reporteddurlng the last three yea .... from the 
Ammunition Depot. Bharatpur. 

(c) and (d), Yes, Sir. The officer con· 
,cerned was Intercepted while he was In 
unauthOrIsed possession of certain nema. A 
Staff Coon of_Inquiry has been instituted. 
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(e) Comprehensive Instructions exist In 
all the Depots, In the form of Depot Standing 
Security and Fire Orders, which cover all 
aspects relating to security, Incluuding 
secyruty measures against theft pilferage 
etc. These orders are periodically reviewed 
for further tightening security. 

[English] 

Linking of High Court. through Com-
p8reNetwork 

9506. SHRI DHARMABHIKSHAM: 
. Will the Minister of LAW, JUSTICE AND 
COMPANY AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Government are 
contemplating set up a national computer 
network all the High Courts in the country; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY 
AFFAIRS (SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): (a) to (c). The Na-
tional Information Centra of the planning 
Commission in pursuance of discussions of 

Conference of Chief Justices held In 1991 Is 
proposing to set up a national COfllJuter 
fletwork linking all the High Courts. The 
computer system will help dissemination of 
intromission about case dats, judgement 
etc. It is also proposed that, In the first phase, 
all the High Courts may be equipped with 
required hardware and application software 
and subsequently they may be Inter-con-
nected via nation-wide satellite-based com-
puter communication network. 

Export of Mango •• and Mango 
Product. 

9507. SHRI JITENDRA NA TH DAS: 
Will the Minister of ｃｏｍｾｅｒｃｅ＠ be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether mangoes and mango prod-
ucts are exported; and 

(b) If so, the foreign exchange eamed 
therefrom during the last three years? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
. MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MAN KHURSHEED): (a) Yes, Sir .. 

(b) The quaintly and value of mango and 
mango products exported during the last 
three years is as under: 

oty: MIs 
Value: Rs. lakhs 

Item 1988-89 ＱＲﾧＹＭｾ＠ 1990-91 
Oty. 

Mangoes 16389 

Marngp products. 26026 

Export ot, Dlamods. Gold Jewellery 
Precloua{5tones 

9508. SHRIPARASRAMBHARDWAJ: 
Will the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased 
to.tate: 

Val. Oty. Val. Oty. Val. 

2211 12008 1675 20990 3121 

3022 21423 2393 22282 3130 

(a) whether the export of diamonds, 
gold jewellery, precious and semi-preclous 
siones and pearls has almost been stagnate 
dt.;ring the last three vars and the targets 
fixed could not be achieved; 
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(b) if so, the details thereof and the 
reasons therefor; and 

(d) the steps taken or proposed to be 
taken by the Govemment to solve the prob-
lems of the trade, such as lack of strips, 
wires, necessary instruments and equip-
ments like sheet making machines, raw 
material and high rates of interests and also 
in sufficient facilities for training inspite of 

greater demand for these items abroad? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
ｾｉｎｉｓｔｒｙ＠ OF COMMEijCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a} to (c). The export of gem 
and jewellery items declined In 1990-91 vis-
a-vis 1989-90. However, there has been an 
increase in exports in 1991-92. The details of 
exports as compared to the targets set are" 
as below: 

(Rs. Crores) 
Year Exports of Gem Targets 

and Jewellery 

1989-90 5749.37 5500 

1990-91 5360.24 5950 

1991-92 7193.50 6500 

(Source: Gem & Jewellery Export Promo-
tion Council) 

The above performance has been a 
result of recession in the major markets with 
a consequent decline in demand for dia-
monds. Government has been providing 
support forthe growth of these exports. Raw 
Material is provided exporters under various 
schemes specified in Chapter VIII of the 
Export-Import Policy through, inter-alia, 
imprest, replenishment and advance licens-
ing. Machinery and Equipmentforthis sector 
is freely importable under OGL. Training 
Facilities for artisans and technical person-
nel personnel is available in Government 
supported institutes like the Indian Diamond 
Institute, Surat; Gem Artisan Training School, 
Jaipur; and Jewellery Product Development 
Centres in Delhi and Bombay. 

Overseas Civil Construction Contracts 

9509. SHRISYEDSHAHABUDDIN: Will 
the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) the total value of overseas civil 
construction contracts in hand of India par-
ties as on April 1, 1987; 

(b) the total value of additinal contracts 
socured by the India parties during the 
Seventh Five Year Plan; 

(c) the total value of works executed 
during the same period; 

(d) the value of the un-executed con-
tracts in hand as on Aprril 1, 1992; 

(e) whether any contract were subse-
quently rescinded by agreement or other-
wise, during this period; and 

(f) if so, the particulars thereof? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MAN KHURSHEED): (a) to (c). As reprted by 
the EXIM Bank of India, the total value of 
overseas civil construction contracts in hand 
on 1.4.1987 was Rs. 5,132 crores. The total 
value of additional contracts secured during 
the seventh five year plan (1985-90) was Rs. 
889 crores and the total value of contracts 
execute/short councluded during the same 
period was Rs. 4606 crores. 

(d) The value ot contracts In hand on 
1..4.1992 was Rs. 401 crores. (ThIs Includes 
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Iraqi contracts valued Rs. 575 crores which 
had to be abandoned with the onset of gulf 
crisis and would be resumed after comple-
tion of negotiations with the client on settle-
ment of claims, upon lifting of UN sanctions 
against Iraqi). 

(e) No, Sir. 

(f) Does not arise. 

[ Translation] 

Value of Rupee 

9510. SHRI BHAGWAN SHANKAR 
RAWAT: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the percentage of decline in the 
purchasing power of a rupee as per its value 
in 1960; 

(b) the comparative exchange rates of 
rupee with major foreign currencies in 1960 

and as on March 31,1992 respectively; and 

(c) the reasons for heavy decline in the 
purchasing power of rupees in comparison 
of the major foreign currencies? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) to (c). Internal value of 
Indian Rupee, measured as a reciprocal of 
the All India Consumer Price Indexforindus-
trial Workers at 1960 prices, works outto 8.9 
paise in March 1992 and reflects a decline of 
91.1 per cent over 1960 level. The external 
value of the Indian Rupee vis-a-vis leading 
currencies of the world as on end of 1960 
and end March 1992 was as Indicated in the 
table below. The decline in the internal value 
of the Rupee retlate the secular rise in the 
level of consumer prices. In a regime of 
floating exchange rate where the exchange 
value of the Rupee is linked to a basket of 
currencies, frequent adjustments in the 
exchange value vis-a-vis other currencies is 
a normal phenomenon. 

Rupees per unit of foreign currency 

Currency End As at the end of 31.3. '92 
December Market Official 
1960 Rate· Rate 

US Doliar 4.76 31.22 25.89 

Pound Sterling 13.33 53.69 44.95 

Deutsche Mark 1.14 18.85 15.73 

Japanese Yen 0.01 0.23 0.199 
Ｎｾ＠

• As indicated by Foreign Exchange Dealers Association of India. (FEDAI) 

Losses to Jewellery Industry 

9511. SHRI GOVINDRAO NIKAM: Will 
the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the jewellery industry is 
incurring heavy losses due to the Exim pol-
icy; 

(b) \'/hether a condition has been laid to 
carry out all dealings of this industry in dollar; 

(c) whether the Govemment propose to 
remove this conditIon; 

(d) if so, when; and 

(e) if not, the reasons therefor? 



75 WriltenAnsMieIS MAY 8,1992 Wrltt8n AnSWBIS 76 
THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE In this regard? 

MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) No, Sir. 

·(b) to Cd). The Handbook of Procedures 
of the Current Export and It1l)Ort Policy is-
sued on May " 1992, has clarified in Chap-
ter VIII that invoices of illl>ort and export 
shan be In USOOllars of any other convertible 
currency. 

(e) Does not arise. 

[Eng/ish] 

Changing World of Fashion 

9512. SHRI ARUN CHARAN SETHI: 
Will the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state 

(a) whether the National Institute of 
Fashion Technology is functioning well ac-
cording to the fast changing world of Fash-
ion; 

(b) if so, the details thereof? 

(c) the funds .invested during the last 
three years and propose to Invest in the 
current year for the modernisation pro-
gramme in the National Institute of Fashion 
Technology. 

(d) whether the exporters have ex-
pressed their willingness to run the industry 
itseH rather than by the Govemment; and 

(e) If so, the reaction ofthe Govemment 

1989-90 

1990-91 

1991-92 

1992-93 

(d) No, Sir. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) The National Institute of Fashion 
Technology (NIFT) offers professional pro-
grammes of relevance of the fashion Indus-
try us under:-

(1) Three years course in Fashion 
Design. 

(2) Two years course in Apparel Mer- . 
chand ising and Marketing. 

(3) Two years course In Garment 
Manufacturing Technology. 

(4) Two year course In Accessory 
Deslgn. 

(5) One yeai' certificate course in Pro-
duction Technology. 

The curriculum and leaching at NIFT 
are constantly updated to bring it at par with 
international standards. The industry is of-
fered In-service training by way of continuing 
education programmes in Delhi, Bombay, 
Tripura; Madras and Bangalore. 

(c) According lothe NIFT, lotalexpendi-
ture Incurred on procurement of machinery, 
equipments, resource centre acquestion, 
library and conducting of educationalllrain-
Ing programme Is as !o"owlng:-

ExPBndltur8 (in/Rs. lakhs) 

141.50 

69.89 

74.54 (approx) 

87.00 (estimated) 

(e) Does not arise. 
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Export of Cotton 

9513. SHRI BAPUHARI CHAURE:Will 
the ｍｩｮｬｾｴ･ｲ＠ of .TEXTllES be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whetherthe Union Government have 
received any requite from the Meharashtra 
Government for the export of cotton bdes 
abroad; 

"(b) if so, the details thereof; . 

(c) how much cotton q-uota has been 
given to the State for export purpose; 

(d) whether the Government are aware 
of the agitation led by the cotton growers for 
giving low procurement price under the Mo-
nopoly Cotton Purchase Scheme bt the 
State Government to them; and 

(e) If so, the reasons therefor and the 
steps taken/proposed to be taken by the 
Government in the matter? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF MINIS-
TRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) and (b). The Maharashtra 
State Co-operative Cotton Growers Market-
ing Federation ltd. has requested for an 
export quota of two lakh bales of cotton for 
the Federation. 

(c) No Export quota of cotton has been 
given to the Federation during the current 
cotton second. 

(d) and (e). The Maharashtra State Co-
operative Cotton ｇｲｯｷ･ｾ＠ Marketing Fed-
eration ltd. has not reported any agitation for 
higher procurement price under the Monop-
oly Cotton Purchase Scheme in the state. 

Import of Caprolactum . 
9514. PROF. K V. THOMAS: Will the 

Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the demand production of caprolac-
tum In the Country; 

(b) whetherthe Govemroent propose to 
allow the import of a limited quantity of 
caprolactum; . 

(c) If so, the details thereof; and 

(d) the steps proposed to be taken by 
the Government to ensure that the caprolac-
tum manufacturing units In the country do 
not face a crisiS? . 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF me 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
'CHIDAMBARAM): (a) During the year 1992-
93, the ｰｲｾｵ｣ｴｩｯｮ＠ of caprolactum in the 
country is expected to be of the order of 
62,000 tonnes as against the demand of 
91,000 tonnes. 

(b) to (d). In terms of the Export and 
Import Policy for 1992-97, import of caprolac- . 
tum is freely allowed which will take care of 
the gap between the demand and Indige-
nous production of the item. 

Closure of Offlce of CCE&E 

9515. SHRI RAM NAIK: Will the 
Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whethertheGovernment propose to 
close the office of the Chief Controller of 
lf1l>orts and Exports (CCI&E); 

(b) if so, the reasons therefore; 

(c) whether this move has been op- . 
posed by the officers and staff of the CCI&E; 

(d) if so, the details thereof; and 

(e) the action proposde to be taken b)l. 
the ｾｯｶ･ｭｭ･ｮｴ＠ in this ｾ｡ｲ､＿＠

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) No, Sir. However, the 
CCDI&E Organisation is being restructured 
in the light Qf the new Trade Policy. 

(b) to (e). Do not arise. 
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[Translation] 

Export of Banana and Mangoes 

9516. SHRI DAU DAYAL JOSHI: Will 
the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether India has exported banana 
and mango on arge scale during the last 
three years; 

(b) if so, the reasons therefor; and 

(c) the steps purposed to be taken by 

the Government to discourage the export of 
these fruits and make it available easily to 
the common man in the country at cheaper 
prices? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MAN KHURSHEED): (a) to (c). With a view 
to earn foreign exchange and to provide 
remunerative prices to the farmers, Govern-
ment encourages exports of fruits. However, 
a very insignificant percentage of production 
of mango and banana is exported, as indi-
cated below: 

Year %age exports of production 
Mango 

1988-89 0.15% 

1989-90 0.12% 

1990-91 0.22 

Moreover, the foreign exchange 
earned from these exports contributes to 
imports of items of mass consumption like 
edible oils, etc. 

Corruption Cases in NTC 

9517. SHRI RAM LAKHAN SINGH 
YAOAV: Will the Minister of TEXTILES be 
pleased to state the number of ca:;,es of 
corwption in the National Textile Corpora· . 
tion that came to the notice of the Govern-

Banana 

0.023% 

0.006% 

0.005% 

ment during each of the last three years 
along with the punishment awarded to the 
persons involved therein? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): There is a Vigilance set up in 
National Textile Corporation which looks ir,to 
the cases of corruption. A ｓｾ｡ｴ･ｭ･ｮｴ＠ show-
ing the number 01 cases of corruption 
alongwith punishment awarded to the per-
sons involved therein, is enclosed. 

STATEMENT 

Number of cases of corruption in National Textile Corporation and punish emen t awarded 
during the last three years 

Year 

1988-89 
1989-90 
1990-91 

Number of cases 

31 
27 
26 

Punishment awarded 

Major Penalty 

10 
10 
6 

Mir,or Penalty 

8 
5 

20 
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Streamlining of Procedure for 
Hiring Ships 

9518. SHRI N. J. RATHVA: Win-the 
Minister of SURFACE TRANSPORT be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the steps taken by the Government 
with regard to delicencing the procedure for 
obtaining ships to operate on profit earning 
routes and to streamlining the procedure of 
hiring foreign and Indian ships; 

(b) the time by which the procedure 
would be streamlined; and 

(c) the total profit likely to be earned by 
streamlining the said procedure? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGOISH TYTLER): (a) The Govern-
ment have taken the following steps to· 
streamline the procedures: 

(i> Automatic approval is accorded to 
shipping companies for acquisition 
of bulk carriers of1 0-30.000 OWT, 
if the vessels are proposed to be 
acquired by the Ship owning com-
pani8s as per the age norms pre-
scribed by the Government. This 
procedure wil! remai:1 vague for a 
period 01 one year and may be 
reviesed there alter. 

("\ II, It has been decided that if a ship-
ping company holds a v;:.'id ap-
proval for acquisition of a ship, it 
can utilise the approval for acqui-
Siring the vessel by charter-cum-
demise methoe. However, the ship-
ping company would have to ap-
proach the Reserve Bank of India 
forciearancetothepaymentterms 
as also clearance from foreign 
exchange angle. 

(iii) It has also been decided that in 
future the proposals for replace-
ment of existing tonnage would not 
be placed before Ship Acquisition 

licensing Committee, if the replace-
ment proposal is within 25% In 
excess of the tonnage to be re-
placed. 

(iv) The Government have decided as 
an experimental measure for one 
year, to dispense with the require-
ment of prior approval of Director 
General of Shipping for time char-
tering out of Indian flag vessels to 
foreign companies. In the case of 
voyage charter also, no permission 
would be required from the Director 
General of Shipping. 

(b) Streamlining of the procedures is a 
continuing process. 

(c) The earnings and profit in shipping 
operation depend upon a number of factors 
and it is not possible to segregate the effect 
of streamlining the procedures on earning 
and profit. 

[English] 

Involvement of Foreign Nationals In 
Gold Smuggling 

9519. SHRI SHRAVAN KUMAR 
PATEL: 

SHRIMATi BASAVA RAlES-
WARt. 

Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased 
to stat9: 

(a) ｷｨ･ｾｨ･ｲ＠ any foreign nalienals were 
found involved in smuggling of gold at Indira 
Gandi tnlernRTiur:a i Airport during April. 1992; 

(b) 11 so, the details thereol; 

(c) the quantity 01 gold seized; and 

(d) the action taken in the matter? 

THE MIN!STER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a}to (d). 13foreignnation-
als have been found to be involved in the 
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smuggling of gold at Indira Gandhi Intema-
tional Airport, New Deihl, by the Customs 
authorities during April, 1992. 9 of them have 
been penalised In departmental adjudica-
tions apalt from the confiscation of the gold. 
4 of them have been arrested and produced 
In tbe court for prosecution. 

Approximately 29.4 kgs. of gold has 
also been seiZed at this Airport during tbe 
same period. 

Removal of Manual Scavenging 
System In Cantonment Boards 

9520. SHRI V. SREENIVASA PRAsAD: 
Will the Minister of DEFENCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the several cantonment 
Boards including those at AUahabad and 
Kanpur,have been -avoiding to implement di-
rection of the Government in regard to re-
moval of annual scavenging system existing 
in their civilian areas on one plea orthe other; 

(b) whether any steps have been taken 
by the Government In this regard; 

(c) if so, the facts and details therefor; 
and 

(d) If not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHRI 
SHARAD PAWAR): (a) No, ｾｩｲＮ＠

(b) to (d). Do not arise. 

[ Translation] 

Salnlk Rest Ho.use. 

9521. SHRI BHUWAN CHANDRA 

KHANOURI: Will the Minister of DEFENCE 
be pleased to state: 

(a) the criteria adopted by the Govern-
ment for setting up of sainik rest houses; 

(b) the names of places where sainlk 
rest houses are situated in the country, State-
wise; 

(c) whether the Govemment have any 
proposal to set up more sainlk rest houses In 
the country including one at Kodwar; 

(d) if so, the places decided for this 
purpose; and 

(e) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHRI 
SHARED PAWAR): (a) Sainik Rest House 
are constructed by the State Governments! 
UTs either out of their own funds or with 
finanelal assistance form the Central Gov-
emment on a 50:50 sharing basis. These Rst 
Houses are generally located at District 
headquarters or other convenient places 
which have sizable population of ex-Serv-
icemen. 

(b) A list is attached. 

(c) tG (e). The proposals for setting up 
Sainik Rest House emanate from the State 
Govem ments. Only one proposal relating to 
setting up of a Sainik Rest House at Roop 
Nagar, In Punjab, was received from the 
State Government recently, for which Cen-
tral Govemment has agreed to bear its share 
of the expenditure. No proposal has been 
received from the Government of Uttar 
Pradesh for setting up of a Sainik Rest house 
at Kotdwar. 

STATEMENT 

--1.---Andhra Pradesh 

LOCATION OF SAINIK REST HOUSE 

Gunture, Kaklnada, ViSnakhapatnam, 
Ananthapur and Hyderabad: 
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2. Assam 

3. Bihar 

4. Gujarat 

5. Haryana 

6. Himachal Pradesh 

7. Jammu & Kashmir 

8. Kamataka 

9. Kerala 

10. Madhya Pradesh 

11. Maharashtra 

12. Manipur 

13. Orissa 

14. Mizoram 

15. Punjab 
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Kamrup (Gauhati), Cachar (Silchar), Karbi 
Anglong (Diphu) and Goyalpura. 

Bhojpur, Chapra, Ranchi, Gaya, Dumka, 
Danapur, Bhagalpur and Monghyr. 

Rajkot 

Ambala, Jind, Rewar! Panchkula, Bhiwani, 
Kamal, Jhajjar, Sonepat, Faridabad, 
Kurukshetra, Kosli, Gurgaon, Rohatak, 
Dado, Bhadurgarh, Hissar, Narnaul, 
Mohindargarh, Loharu and Sirsa. 

Bilsaspur, Simla (2), Solan, Hamirpur (2), 
Reckong Peo, Palampur, Una (2), NUrplol, 
Keylong (under construction), Ghumarwin, 
Dehra, Nahan, Mandi, Chamba, Chowari, 
Kullu, Kangra, Dharamshala, Jawala-Mukhi 
and Parwanoo. 

Jammu, Kathua, Rajouri, Udhampur, Dada, 
Srinagar, Leh, Sambha, Reasi, Kishtwar, 
Poonch (under construction), Baramula 
(under construction) and Kupwara 
(under construction) 

Belgaum, Karwar, Madikeri, Athani (Belgaum 
Distt) and Banglore (under construction) 

Calicu!. Trivandrum Trichur and Alleppy. 

Bilaspur, Gwalior, Indore, Jabalpur, Morena, 
Raipur, Shopal, Sagar, Bhind and 
Chhindwara; 

Ahmednagar, Ratnagiri, Shrigonda, Chiplore, 
Akola, Dipli, Amravati, Khed, Buldana, 
Kudal, Dhulia Malwan, Maded, Savantwadi, 
Mangoora, Deogad, Paladapur, Satars, 
Kolhapur, Sangola, Nasik, Kapargaon, 
Malegaon, Sangli, Pune, SOlapur and 
Gelegaon. 

Imphal 

Cuttack Berhafll>Ur 

Aizawal 

AI1'.ritsar, GUrdaspur, Bhatinda, Patiala, 
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16. Rajasthan 

17. Sikkim 

18. Tamil Nadu 

19. Uttar Pradesh 

20. West Bengal 

21. A & N Administration 

22. Chandigam, UT 

Air Accidents at Alrbase. Saremy 

9522. SHRI SANTOSH KUMAR GANG 
WAR: Will the Minister of DEFENCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether a large nUmber of air acci-
dents occurred near the airbase at Bareii!Y 
during the last three years; 

(b) if so, the details thereof and the 
rl;lasons therefore; 

Ropar, Jillundur, Kapurthala, Hoshiilrpur, 
Chandigarh and Faridkot. 

Ajmer, Jaipur. Alwar, Jodhpur, Bharatgpur, 
Shergarh Bhlm, Kola, Bikaner, Nagaur, 
8undi, Pali, Beawar, Sikar, Chufu, 
Udaipur, Jhunjhunu and Pokharan. 

Gangtok, Namchi, Geyzlng and Jorthong. 

COimbatore, Dharampuri, Madurai, Nilgiris, 
North Areo!, Sout;, Areot, Ramanathapuram. 
Madras, T'fuchirapally, Thanjavur, Selem, 
Tirunalveii, Kamarajar and Madras. 

Aligar.h, Almora, Azamgarh, Balia, Bareilly, 
Bulundshahar, Deoria, Etah, Etawah. 
Faiazabad, larrukhabad, Ghazipur, 
GOlakhpur, Kanpur, Lansdowne, Pauri 
(G"rhwai), !,1ainpuri, Meerut, Muzaffarnaqar. 
Pratapgarh: Pithoragarh, Raj-Baareli, Sahaj-
ahanpur, Sultanpur, Varanasi, Agra, Allaha-
bad, Bahraich, Banda, Barabanki, Basti, 
Badaun, Chamili, Dehradun, Fatehpur. 
Gonda, Hamirpur, Hardo!, Jalon (Orai), 
Jaunpur, Jhansi, Khri, lucknow, Mathura, 
Mirzapur, Moradabad, Rampur, Saharanpur, 
Sitapu r , Tahri Unr1a,m Uttar K3shi Nainital 
and Kundraghat. 

Calcutta. Darjeeling, Kalimpong, Burdawan 
and M,dnapur. 

Port Blair and Cambell Bay 

Sector 21·D, Chandigarh 

(c) whether hJndreds of birds are being 
killed every week by tha airmen; and 

(d) t! SO, thd steps being taken to pre· 
vent such accidents in future? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHRI 
SHARED PAWAR): (a) There was no major 
accident neor the air base at Bareilly du ring 
the lastthrea years. 1 here were, however, a 
n'Jmber of incidents, as given_beiow:-
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(a) 

(b) 

(c) 

Year 

1989-90 

1990-91 

1991-92 

Number 

11 

'05 

05 

(b) One Canberra aircraft had to land on 
its belly because its under carriage did not 
extend due to hydraulic failure. All other 
incidents were caused due to bird strikes. 

(c) All birds pose serious hazard to 
aircraft operation. In addition to several 
measures taken to prevent bird hits to the 
aircraft, the birds are shot at by specially 
authorised airmen for flight safety reasons. 

(d) The following measures have been 
takento reduce accidents due to birdstrikes:-

(i) Roosting and nesting places of 
the birds have been removed 
from within the airfield. 

(ii) Sanitary and hygienic conditions 
within the airfield have been 
improved. 

(iii) Regular observation posts are 
positioned to caution pilots of bird 
activity. 

(iv) Regular liaison is maintained with 
the civil administration to reduce 
bird menace in the areas outside 
the airfields. 

{English] 

Export of HPS Groundnuts 

9523. SHRI B. DEVARAJAN: Will the 
Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the names of the Southern States 
• which are producting HPS groundnuts in 
large quantities alongwith the manpower 
engaged in it; and 

(b) the scheme formulated to promote 
the export of HPS groundnuts? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MAN KHURSHEED): (a) Andhra Pradesh, 
Tamil Nadu and Karnataka accounted for 
over 50% of groundnuts produced In the 
country in 1989-90. Detaifs of manpower 
engaged in this production are not readily 
available. 

(b) No specific scheme hasbeenformu-
lated to promote the export of HPS ground-
nuts. However, all facilities outlined in the 
ｂｵ､ｾＮ･ｴ＠ proposals for 1992-93 and the Policy 
guidelines outlined in the new Export Policy 
announced on 1.4 1992 will be applicable to 
the export of HPS groundnuts also. 

Promotion of rES Grade I Officers 

9524. SHnt RAMA KRISHNA KON-
ATHALA: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whetherthe Union Government have 
promoted officers of the Indian Economic 
Service, Grade I to Non-Functional Selec-
tion Grade during the last three years; 

(bj if so, the reason for not changing the 
designation of Non-Functional Selection 
Grade; 

(c) whether the Government are aware 
of the anomalies in various Ministries with 
same designation but ditteran: scales of pay; 
and' . 

(d) if so, the action taken or proposed to 
be taken by the Government in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) Nochange in designation of officers 
is contemplated as the scale is given to 
officers in-situ oh a non-functional basis. 
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(c) and (d). Since IES posts are bam£. as per the requirement of the country; . 
on the strength of several Ministries ..... !·, 
no uniformity in designation. Gove,....., ｬｾ＠ (c) if not. the reasons therefor; 
looking Into these variations. 

(d) whether any steps have been taken 
[Translation] bylhe Government to increase the produc-

tion of cloth; and 
Consumption and Production of Cloth 

9525. SHRI HARI KEWAL PRASAD: 
SHRIMATI. VASUNDHARA 

RAJE: 

Will the Minister of TEXTILES be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the per capita annual demand! 
consumption/production of cloth in the coun-
try during the last three years, year-wise; 

(b) whetherthecloth is being produced 

1989-90 

1990-91 

1(;,91-92 

(b) Yes, Sir. 

(c) Does not arises .. 

(d) and (e). Government policy of liber-
allsation and modernisation of the different 
sectors of Textile Industry is expected dot 
give further l"1>8tus to the production of 
cloth to meet the requirement. The targetfor 
cloth production by the termilnal year of 
English Five Year Plan, 1996-97 has been 
fixed at 29,600 mn. sq. meters. 

[English] 

Import of Gold by State Bank of India 

9526. SHRIMATI VASUNDHARA 
RAJE: Will the Minister of FINANNCE be 
pleased to state: 

(e) H so, the details thereof and the 
target fixed for the Eighth Plan? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF MIN-
ISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) The estimated per capita 
consumption of cloth during 1987, 1988 and 
1989 (for which figures are available) is 
16.35,14.87 and 15.07 meters respectively. 

The eslimated per capita production of 
cloth during the last 3 Years is as follow-
ing: 

20.23 

21.49 

20.65 

(a) whether the propose to Import gold 
by the State Bank of India on behaH of the 
Non-resident Indians (NR)s) was under the 
consideration of the Government; 

(b) Whether the proposal has been 
approved; and 

(c) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) to (c). Suggestion for 
importing gold through State Bank of Indi" 
and other commercial banks on behaf _ .. ' 
NRIs to obviate the need for physical c.. ｾﾭ
riage of gold by the latter have been received 
and these are still under consideration. 
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rr rans/ation) 

Shortage of CUmtncy Notes 

9527. SHRI SIMON MARANol 
SHRIMARI BASAVA RAJES-

WARI: 

Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether there Is an acute shortage 
of currency notes in commercial banks; 

(b) if so. the reasons therefor; and 

(c) the steps taken by the Govern-
ment to make up this shortage? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI oALBIR 
SINGH): (a) to (c). The two existing Note 
Printing Presses at Nashik and oewas do 
not have adequate production capacity to 
fully meet the ever increasing demand of 
Reserve Bank of India for fresh notes result-
ing in shortage to fresh currency notes. To 
bridge the gap between the demand and 
supply of currencyJbank notes. following 
steps have been taken:-

(1) The existing two Note Printing 
Presses at Nashlk and Dewas have 
been put on two shifts working. 

(2) Two new Note Printing Presses-
one at Salboni (West Bengal) and 
the other at Mysore (Karnataka) 
are being set up by Reserve Bank 
of India. 

SI. No. Name of StateAJnion territories 

1. Andhra Pradesh 

2. Bihar 

3. Delhi 

4. Goa 

5. Gujarat 

(3) A decision has been taken to coin-
ise Re. 1, Rs. 2 and Rs. 5 denomI-
nation notes In a phased manner 
so as to utilise the capacity so re-
leased for printing of higher de-
nomination notes. 

[Eng/ish) 

AppOintment of Notary Public 

9528. SHRI KRISHANoUTT SUL-
TANPUTI: Will the Minister of LAW. JUS-
TICEANo COMPANY AFFAIRS be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether the Union Government have 
fixed any minimum qualifications for appoint-
ment of Notaries in the country. and 

(b) the n umber of Notaries appOinted by 
the Government so 1 ar in the country. State-
wise? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF LAW. JUSTICE AND COM-
PANY AFFAIRS (SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): (a) The qualifica-
tions for being appointed to the office of 
notary are specified in the Notaries Act. 
1952, and the rules made thereunder. 

(b) As on 30-4-92. the Central Govern-
ment have appointed 323 notaries for the 
whole country and the state-wise break-up 
of notaries Is as follows:-

No. of notaries 

3 

4 

34 

18 
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SI.No. Name of StatelUnion territories 

6. Haryana 

7. Kamataka 

8. Kerala 

9. Madhya Pradesh 

10. Maharashtra 

11. Punjab 

12. Rajasthan 

13. Tamil Nadu 

14. Uttar Pradesh 

15. West Bengal 

Total 

Steps to Protect Investors 

9529. SHRI RAJNA TH SONKAR SHAS-
TRI: Will the Minister of FINANCE be plea!;ed 
to state: 

(a) whetherthe Securities and Exchange 
Board of India propose to take steps to 
safeguard the interest of investors in capital 
market as reported in the Hindustan Times 
of April 18. 1992; 

(b) if so. the details thereof; and 

(c) the time by which decision is likely to 
be taken in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) to (c). The Securities 
and Exchange Board of India (SEBI) Act. 
19.92, stipulates. inter alia, that it shall be the 
duty of the SESI to protect the investors in 
securities. The SEBI has been attending to 
investors' guievances by pursuing their 

No. of notaries 

18 

28 

4 

4 

55 

24 

49 

8 

26 

47 

323 

complaints forquickredressal. Further, SEBI 
has also been referring serious cases of 
default to the Office of the Controller of 
Capital Issues and Department of Company 
Affairs for initiating action against erring 
companies. whether necessary. 

[Translation] 

Foreign Exchange Earnings by Expol1 
Oriented Yarn Spinning Mills 

9530. SHRI RAJVEER SINGH: Will the 
Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to state: 

(a) the amount of foreign exchange 
earned by the export oriented yarn spinning 
mills during the year 1990-91; 

(b) whether the Government are con-
templating to set up more such mills in the 
country; and 

(cl if so, the proposed location of these 
mills and the details thereof? 
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THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTilES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOn: (a) According to the information 
recer\led from the 100% Export Oriented 
Yarn Units, the exports of yam ander the 
Scheme amounted to Rs. 38 croras during 
1990-91. 

(b) and (c). 100% Export Oriented Units 
can be set up in places of the choice of 
entrepreneurs subject to locational policy of 
the Govemment. 

[English] 

0, T, C. All Route Concesslonal Passes 
for Students 

9531. SHnt TEJ NARAYAN SINGH: 
Will the Minister of SURFACE TRANSPORT 
be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the DTe has stopped issu-
ing all rout concessional passes to the school 
going children who are staying within the 
area of six kilometers from the p:ace of their 
school; 

(b) if so, wlJether this is applicable to 
college gOing students also; 

(c) if so, t,le facts and details in this 
regard; 

(d) if not, the masons fordiscriminatiofl 
in providing all route passes to coliege stu-
dents; and 

(e) the steps taken by the Govemment 
to provide ail route passes to the School 
going students? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTLER): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) to (e). Does not arise. 

Supply of Gotton Vam to Weavers of 
Andhra Pradesh 

9532. SHRI DATATRAYA BAN-
OARU: 

DR. R. MAllU: 

Willthe MinisterofTEXTllES be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether the Union Government 
propose to supply 4000 bales of cotton yarn 
to the weavers of Andhra Pradesh every 
month through the South Indian Mills Asso.-
ciailon; 

(b) it so, whether the said quantity of 
cotton yarn are available to the weavers of 
Andhra Pradesh at present; 

(c) wlfether the prices of cotton yarn, 
dyes and chemicals have increased abnor-
mally' making it impossible forlhe weavers to 
purchase these items from the open mari<et 
without the Government assistance; 

(d) it so, whether any ｳｴｾｰ＠ has been 
taken by the Union Government to assist the 
hand loom weavers of Andhra Pradesh to 
save them from the worsening situation and 
st'uvation deaths; and 

(e) (he assistance provided by the 
Government to the weavers of Andhra 
Pradesh during each of the lastthree years? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF MINIS-
. TRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 

GEHLOn: (a) No, Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 

(el Witile it is a fact that prices of cotton 
yam, dyes and chemicals have increased 
spedalty during the last year, these com-
rnoditie-s are subject to regular variations in 
pr;ces. Evel1 within yam and dyes and chemi-
cals prices vary from mill to mill. There is no 
Govemfl'lElnt regulation on the prices and 
thesa depend on market forces of demand 
ar\d ,.upply. The off -taks of these products by 
weavers also varies from season 10 season 
depending on various factors, like, demand 
for cloth otc. There are no reports of short-
age of these items nor complaints on the 
point of aVailability. 
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(d) A number of steps were taken by the 

Union Government to assist the handloom 
weaver of Andhra Pradesh as a measure of 
relief in response to reports on deaths of 
hand loom weavers. These include: 

(ij A"ocation of additional target for 
janata production of 5 million square 
metres and release of advance 
subsidy for undertaking the same 
amounting to Rs. 127.50 lakhs for 
1991-92. 

(ii) Market Development ASSistance at 
the rate of 8% for procurement of 
additional non-janata cloth over and 
above the existing procurement to 
the tune of Rs. 2 crores for which 
Govemment's share of Rs. 81akhs 
was released to Andhra Pradesh. 

(iii) Pilot scheme of Group Insuranc to 
provide an insurance cover to 
12,OOOweavers in Andhra Pradesh 
for which Govemment of India's 
share of As. 7.20 lakhs was re-
leased to Andhra Pradesh. 

(iv) A total of 12 training centres were 
opened in Prakasam and Guntur 
Districts which Involved an ･ｸｰ･ｮｾ＠
diture by the Central Government 
amounting to Rs. 10.17Iakhs. 

(e) Assistance provided for the the 
development of the handloom sector In 
Andhra Pradesh during the last three years 
is as under: 

1989-90 
1990-91 
1991-92 

(Rupees in lakhs) . 

2041.40 
24n.23 
2631.17 

(ProvislonaQ 

Coff .. .collectlon Depots In N. E. 
Region 

9533. SHRI UDDHAB BARMAN: Win 
the Minister of COMMERCE be pfeased to 
state: 

(a) the number of coffee collecting de-
pots In North-Eastern region; 

(b) whether these depots are sufficient 
for poolIng coffee produced in various states 
In that region; 

(c) if not, the steps taken by the Govern-
ment in this regard; and 

(d) the steps proposed to be taken by 
the Govemment to ensure that coffee grow-
ers are not harassed in any respect? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF HE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) There is only one 
coffee collecting depot of the Coffee Board 
functioning at HaHlong in North-Eastern 
region. • 

(b) The total production of coffee in 
North-Eastem region Is approximately 175 
to 200 tonnes per year. In addition to the 
Coffee Board's coffee collecting depot at 
Hallong, one Curing Works viz. Assamplan-
tation Crop Development Corporation at 
Guwahati is also functioning, the curing 
capacity of which is 111 0 rnetrictonnes. One 
depot and one Curing Work in the North-
Eastern region is considered adequate .for 
collecting/processing coffee. 

(c) With a view to ease the difficulties for . 
pooling coffee, the Board has introduced a 
new scheme of reimbursement of t1ansport 
charges to small growers who pool coffee 
directly to the Curing Works. 

(d) No speciflcc0lT1>laint of harassment 
has been received from the growers of North-
Easter region. 

Regional Centres for Design and 
Technology 

9534. SHRIMATI KRISHNENDRA 
KAUR (DEEPA): 

SHRI ANNA JOSHI: 
SHR1MATI RITA VERMA: 

Will the MinisterofTEXTLESbepfeased 
to state: 
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(a) the location of each regional centre 
_for design and technical development; 

(b) the total number of designs dealt 
with in each regional centre during 1990-91 
and 1991-92; 

(c) the percentage of designs accepted 
by the trade, during the above period; 

(d) whether any avaluation of technical 

wings of these centres has been made; 

(e) H so, the outcome thereof; and 

(f) it not, the reasons therefore; 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
___MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 

GEHlOT): (a) to (c). The information is tabled 
below:-
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(d) and (e). Yes, Sir. The working ofthe 
technical wing oftha Regional Design Centres 
is evaluated from time to time. An Action 
Plan is drawn up every year giving direction 
to the Technical wing in respect of ｡ｲｾ｡ｳ＠
where new tools need to be fabricated . 

. Besides, a scheme Is already in operation to 
supply improved to artisans at subsidised 
rates. In a recent seminar held in the Re-
gional Design & Technical Development 
Centre, New Delhi, a decision has been 
taken to extend the benefit of new tools 
developed to artisan'> on a laige scale and to 
ensure with r.rtisans to understand their 
needs. 

(f) Does not arise. 

Non Insuring of Properties In Silchar, 
Assam 

9535. SHRI KABINDRA PUR-
KAYASTHA: Will the Minister of FINANCE 
be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Insurance companies 
have stopped insuring the properties of trad-
ers, businessmen and other at Silchar in 
Assam; 

(b) if so, the reasons therefore; and 

(c) the reaction of the Government 
thereto? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) and (c). Do not arise. 

Way-Side Amenities on National 
Highways 

9536. SHRt R. DHANUSKODI 
THITHAN: Will the Minister of SURFACE 
TRANSPORT be .pleased to Refer to the 
reply given to UnSfarred Question No. 6853 
on April 10, 1992 and ｳｴ｡ｾ･［＠

(a) the names of the private entrepre-
neurs to whom the work of providing wayside 

amenities along the National Highways has 
been allotted; 

(b) the mode of selection of these entre-
preneurs; and 

(c) the nature of work entrusted to 
them? . 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTLER): (a) List of entre-
preneurs to whom letters of intent have been 
issued for development of these facilities 
under the private sector is given the state-
ment attached. 

(b) Selection of entrepreneurs is being 
done by an inter-Ministerial group, having 

. regard to the suitability of the site, adequacy 
of the proposal, financial soundness of the 
party etc. 

(c) Under the scheme, entrepreneurs 
are required to provide basic facilities like 
snack bar/restaurant, drinking water, toilets, 
petrol retails outlet, kiosks, rElst rooms park-
ing area, landscaping and access roads. 

STATEMENT 

List showing names of private entrepre-
neurs to whom letters of intent have been 
issued by Ministry of Surface Transport 

1. Sh. A H. Khan 

2. Sh. Ani! Out! Kaushik 

3. Sh. Vimlesh Chandra Tripathi 

4. Sh. P. K. Jain . 

5. Sh. Vinod Kumar and Ani! Kuamar 

6. Sh. Rajinder Singh Gyani 

7. Sh. R. Ravindran 

8. Sh. SUrendra Paul 

9. Sh.P.C.Sharma 
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10. Sh. K. D. Gupta 

11. MIs. Kevadia Enterprise 

12. Sh. Navin Jain 

13. Sh. Rattan Singh 

14. MIs. Motel Raigarh 

15. Sh. Janardhan Singh ( • ..th.ot 

16. Sh. Pritam Singh 

17. Sh. Shabir Ahmed Naik 

18. Sh. Bhima Pravashi 

19. Sh. Ishwar Chand Bansal 

20. Sh. Raghuvir Singh Rajendra 

21. Sh. Sugriv Singh and Vijay Kumar 

22. Sh. Dipanker Manna 

23. Sh. M. K. Mittal 

24. Sh. Balwinder Singh 

25. Sh. V. K. Singh 

26. Sh. Arun Kumar Biswas 

27. Sh. Abdul Rahim 

28. Smt. Renu Gupta and Ashok Ag-
ｧ｡ｾ｡ｬ＠

29. Sh. N. Ashok Kumar 

30. Sh. Shiv Shankar Mal and Sat ish 
Chand Verma 

31. MIs. G. M. Enterprises 

Insurance Cover Beyond 70 Years 

9537. DR. lAXMINARAYAN PAN-
DEYA: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Ufe Insurance Corpora-
tion propose to provide insurancecov.erto its 
policy holders beyond the age ot 70 years; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE(SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) to (c). LlC is already operating 
whole life plans. " the policy in respect of 
whole life plan is kept in force, insurance 
cover is available throughout life. No sepa-, 
rate plan is proposed to cover a person 
beyond the age of 70 years. 

Central Pension Accounting Office 

9538. SHRI GIRDHARI LAL BHAR-
GAVA: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whetherthe Union Government have 
decided to set up Central Pension Account-
ing Offices on each States' capital; 

(b) whether some offices have already 
been set up; . 

(c) if so, the details thereof, State-wise; 

(d) whether these offices will also deal 
with the pension cases of the employees of 
railwayslP& TI defence; 

(e) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE(SHRI SHAN-
T ARAM POTDUKHE): (a) No, Sir. There is 
no proposal to set up Central Pension ｾﾭ
counting Office In each State Capital apart 
from the Central Pension Accounting Office 
already setup in New Delhi in 1990. 

. i 
(b) to (e). No, Sir. 



109 Written A1I$IMI.5 VAISAKHA 18,1914 (SAKA) Written Answel'S 110 

{ Translation] 

Idle Coining Machines In Minta 

9539. SHRI MRUTYUNJAYA NAYAK: 
Will the Min istef of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the coining Machines in 
Bombay, Calcutta, Hyderabad and Noida 
Minuts are lying idle since long; 

(b) If so, whether the Government have 
conducted any Investigation In this regard; 

(c) if so, the details thereof; and 

(d) the action taken by the Government 
thereon? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE(SHRI DAlBIR 
SINGH): <a) No, Sir. However, 3 machines at 
the Noida Mint are out of service because of 
some defects. Manufacturers have been 

Agriculture and Rural Development (NA-
BARD) does not provide any loan to the 
State Government for development of water 
resources. However, it provides refinance to 
banks for financing minor irrigation works by 
individual/cooperatives/State Corporations. 
NABARD has reported that there Is no basic 
change in the policyforprovideing refinance 
to banks in this regard since 1988 as stated. 

Complaints About SPA Programme 

9541 . SHRI RAJENDRA AGNIHOTRI: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

<a) whether any complaints have been 
received by Rural Electrification Corpora-
tions from NABARD and other commercial 
banks participating in .Special Project Agri-
culture (SPA) Programme ｾｨ｡ｴ＠ the SPA 
Schemes ere sanctioned on the basis of 
wrong certificates on the coverage of project 
area by other schemes; 

approachedforrectificationofthesedefects. (b) if so, the number of such cases; 

(b) to (d). Does not arise. (c) whether NABARD and commercial 
banks have given notice to withdraw their 

Loan By NABARD for Water financial participation in SPA Programme; 
resources 

9540. DR. AMRIT LAl KALIDAS 
PATEL: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whetherthe government propose to 
adopt the old polley, existing ｰｾｯｲ＠ to 1988, 
instead of new for providing loan by the 
National Bank for Agriculture and Rural 
Development to the States for the develop-
ment of water resources; and 

(b) If so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DAlBIR 
SINGH):(a) .and (b).The National Bank for 

(d) if so, the reasons therefor; and 

(e) the action taken by the Govemment 
In the matter? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE(SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): <a) and (b). National Bank for Agri-
culture and Rural Development (NABARD) 
have reported that a complaint was received 
by them regarding wrong certification and 
other financial Irregularities in implementa-
tion of Special 'project Agriculture (SPA) 
Scheme, in Andhra Pradesh. 

(c) to (e). The financial support to Rural 
Electrification Corporation (REC) programme 
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has not been discontinued by NABARD. 
However. as the REC Programme is consid-
ered to be in the nature of infrastructure 
support to State Electricity Boards (SEBs). 
NABARD have decided to gradually phase 
out the refinance assistance to the pro-
gramma during the 8th Five Year Plan in 
order to lend increasing support for other 
priority sectors. 

Export of Food Commodities 

9542. SHRI SANDIIPAN BHAGWAN 
THORAT: Will the Minister of COMME RCE 
be pleased to state: 

(a) the amount of foreign exchange 
earned from the exports of good Commodi-
ties such as poultry. meat and meat prod-

S.No. Commodity 

SpICes 

2. Marina Products 

3. Meat & Products 

ucts. frozen sea foods, frog legs and spices 
during each of the last three years; 

(b) whether some of the above Com-
modities were also rejected by the importing 
countries during the above period; 

(c) if so, the details thereof and the 
reasons therefor; and 

(d) the loss suffered by the Govemment 
on this account? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRYOFCOMMERCE(SHRISAlMAN 
KHURSHEED): (a) The details regarding 
export of spices. marine products and meat 
and meat products (including poultry) are 
given below: 

(Rs. Crores) 

1989-90 1990-91 1991-92 

276.98 233.94 362.04 

687.18 960.01 1365.68 

113.70 139.84 195.00 

(NOTE: Figures for 1989·90 and 1990-91 based on DGCI&S compilation. Figures for 
1991-92 based on reports received from Spices Board, MPEDA and APEDA). 

(b) to (d). As per information received 
from the Export Inspection Council of India, 
the following table shows the complaints 

A. 1989-90 

(a) Black Pepper 

(b) Marine products 

received and the value of claims settled 
during the years 1989-90; 1990-91 and 
1991-92; 

No. of 
claims 

10 

4 

Value of Claims 
settled 

(Rs. erore) 

0.27 

0.12 
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(c) Meat and Meat Products 

B. , 990-91: 

(a) Black pepper 

(b) Marine products 

(c) Turmeric 

C. 1991·92: 

(a) Dried Ginger 

(b) Turmeric Finger 

(c) Chillies 

d. (d) Marine products 

(e) Seasarr.e seeds 

World Bank AIDED Welfare Schemes 
forSes/STs 

9543. PROF. SAVITHRILAKSH-
MANAN: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
Pleased to stal;;): 

(a) the du!ails of World Bank aided 
SCflemes 10' the upliftment of scheduled 
ｃＬＮｬｳｾ･ｳＡｓ｣ｍ､ｵｬ･､＠ Tribes in the country; 

(b) the areas iike:y to be bene1ilad by 
this assbta'1ce; 

(c) whether some States have requested 
to the Union Government for possible World 
Bank assistal)ce for their upliltment projects 
for SCs/STs; 

(d) if so, the details thereof; and 

No. of Value of Claims 
claims settled 

(Rs. crore) 

0.03 

0,10 

0.007 

0.004 

0.004 

0.004 

0.002 

5 0.17 

0.06 

(e) the action taken thereon? 

THE MINISTE OF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF FINANGE (SHRI RAMESrlWAR 
THAKUR): (a) and (b), World Bank have not 
so far extended any assistance specifically 
for the uplittmen: of Scheduled Castes ant: 
Scheduled Tribes in the country. 

(c) A Project Profile uAndhra Pradesh 
Poverty Alleviation Project"primari:y ｩｮｴ･ｾｬ､･､＠
to benefit SC&/STs and Backward/classes in 
Andnra Pradesh fer possible World Bank 
support has been received in the Ministry of 
Finance only from Andhra Pradesh. 

(d) The project propos{Jd by Govern-
ment of Andhra Pradesh includes invest-
ments in agriculture and related sectors, 
irrigation, forestry, horticulture, sericueture, 
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fisheries, education, Women and child de-
velopment, health etc. sectors. 

(e) Furtherproject processing including 
size and scope of the project, suitability, 
timing and extent of World Bank assistance 
would depend on mandatory clearances from 
the concemed administrative ministries from 
technical, feasibility angle and the Planning 
Commission from resource angle, detailed 
project preparation including preparation 
mechanism of World Bank and donor prefer-
ence and availability of committable funds 
with donor agency. 

Running of Jute Industry on 
Cooperative Basis 

9544. DR. KARTIKESWARPATRA:Will 
the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whetherthe Union Government have 
received any scheme from Orissa to run the 
jute industry on cooperative basis; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; 

(c) the action taken by the Government 
thereon; and 

(d) if no action has been taken so far, the 
reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES(SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) to (d). Do not arise. 

Opening of office of MaurHILls Export 
and Investment Authority In India 

9545. DR. RAJAGOPALAN 
SRIDHARAN: Will the Minister of COM-
MERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Maurtitius Export and 

Investment AuthOrity has opened an office in 
India recently; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; 

(c) the extent to which trade between 
the two countries has been or is likely to be 
improved by the opening of this autherity; 
and 

(d) the items identified for the trade 
between the two countries? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) Mauritius Export and Investment 
Autharity has recently opened a representa-
tive office at General Assurance Building, 
2nd Floor, 232 Dr. D.N. Road, Bombay-1. 

(c) The above autharity is expected to 
help in augmenting trade between the two 
countries though it is premature atthis stage 
to judge the extent of improvement. 

However, as an indicator it may be 
mentioned that Indian export to Mauritius 
have been increaSing. It increased by 115. 
77% in 1990-91 over 1989-90 and by 46. 66% 
during April 91 January 92 over the core-
spending period of previous year. 

ＮｾＩ＠ Area of trade cover fields like Light 
engineering goods, Chemicals and Pharma-
ceuticals, Gem & Jewellary etc 

[T rans/ation] 

Taking OVer of Appu Ghar 

9546.SHRISURYANARAYANYADAV: 
Will the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether the AppU Ghar situated at 
Pragati Maidan, New Delhi is being operated 
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(b) Inot, whether the Govemment pro-
pose to take over the Appu Ghar; 

(c) if so, the time by which it is proposed 
to be taken over; 

(d) if not, the benefits accrued to the 
Govemment in the present system of its 
operation; and 

(e) the details of the amount received 
from renting out this place? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE(SHRI SAL-
WAN KHURSHEED): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) No, Sir, 

(c) Does not arise. 

(d) India Trade Promotion Organisation 
a Public Sector Undertaking under the 
administrative control of Ministry of Com-
merce is earning revenue by way of licence 
fee, sharing of gate money etc. apart from 
saving expenditure on the maintenance and 
upkeep, electricity and watercharges,local 
taxes ect. of the area licensed out for Appu 
Ghar. 

(e) Income accrued to India Trade Pro-
motion Organisation from renting out this 
place during 1991-92 is as under:-

(i) Licence fee of RS.24.38 lakhs. 

(ii) 50% share of the gate money 
RS.25.95Iakhs. 

(iii) Rentals of shops set-up by Appu 
Ghar R.3.60 lakhs. 

(iv) Display of hoardings in Appu Ghar 
for 3 months w.e.t. 1-1-92 Rs.O.OS 
lakhs. 

Conversion of D.T.C. Depots Into 
Office/Shopping Complex 

9547. SHRI GURUDAS KAMAT: Will 
the Minister of SURFACE TRANSPORT ｾ＠
pleased 10 state: 

(.il) whether Delhi Transport Corpora-
tion i$ considering to convert its certain depots 
into office/shopping centre; 

.(b) if so, the details thereof; 

(c) ttlG number of depots to be con-
verted into office complexes; and 

(d) the revenue likely to be earned there-
from? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTLER): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) and (c). The Delhi Transport Corpo-
ration proposes to develop 40 out of 44 Bus 
Depots in Delhi as commercial complexes. 

(d) It has been estimated that the ｡､､ｩｾ＠
tional eamings to the D.T.C. would be over 
Rs.SOO crores. 

Family Courts. 

9548. SHRIMATI MALINI BHAt-
TACHARAYA: Will the Minister of LAW, 
JUSTICE AND COMPANY AFFAIRS be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the family courts set up in 
the country are functioning properly; 

(b) if not the reasons therefor; 

(c) whelherlhere is any proposal under 
consideration of the Government to review 
the working of these.courts; 
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(d) If so, the details thereof; 

(e) if not, the reasons therefor; 

(f) whether the Government also pro-
pose to amend the Family Court Act, 1984 
for better functioning of these courts; and 

Ig) if so, the details in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OFPARUAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND MINISTEROF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY 
AFFAIRS(SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): (a) to (e). Once the 
jurisdiction of the Family Courts Act, 1984 is 
extended by the Central Governmenl to a 
StatelUnion Territory through a notification. 
it is the responsibility of the State Govern-
ment/Union Territory Administration to set 
up the Family Courts in the StatalUnion 
Territory. The various State Governments! 
Union Territory AuthOrities have been re-
quested to review and assess the working of 
the Family Courts and to let the Central 
Government have suggestions, if any, for 
improving the system. We have no informa-
tion which would suggest that the family 
courts are not functioning properly_ 

(I) and (g). There is no such proposal to 
amend the Family Courts Act. 1984. 

.. 
ｒ･｣ｲｵｈｭｾｮｴ＠ of Local People In 

... Hall, Belt 

9549. SHRI K.H. MUNIYAPPA: 
SHRI C.P. MUDALAGIRIYAPPA: 

Will the Minister of DEFENCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the number and percentage of local 
people working in different units of Hindus-

tan Aeronautics limited and Bharat Elec-
tronics Limited in the Country; 

(b) whether the percentage representa-
tion is below the prescribed percentage; 

(c) if so, the reasons therefor; 

(d) whether there is a persistent de-
mand from local people for providing prefer-
ence tolhem in recruitments in these units; 

(e) if so, whether the Government pro-
pose to recruit more local people in these 
units in future; 

(f) if so, the details of the proposal in this 
regard, and 

(g) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE(SHRI 
SHARAD PAWAR): (a) A statements is 
enclosed. 

(b) and (c). Thore is no prescribed norm 
for level of representation to local persons. 

(d) Representations have occasionally 
been received for recruitment of local people 
at the various units. 

(e) to (g). Recruitment of personnel by 
HAL and BEO is dependent on order book 
position. Manpower planing and functional 
requirements ate the various units. Since 
HAL have surplus manpower, there is a ban 
on recruitment except in specialized areas. 
BEL plans to make some recruitment in the 
current year. As per Govt. guidelines. execu-
tives in Groups A & B will be recruitedthrough 
open advertisements in national dailies and 
personnel in groups open advertisements in 
national dallies and personnel in Groups C & 
D will be recruited through the local employ-
ment exchanges. 
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Rise in Price of CoHon Yam 

9550; DR. (SHRIMATI) K.S. SOUNDA-
RAM: Will the Minister of TEXTILES be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the rise in price of cotton 
yarn has been due to continuance of export 
of cotton and devaluation of rupee; 

(b) if so, the details thereot and the 
various sectors affected due to export of 
cotton at present; and 

(c) the steps taken by Government 
thereon? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
. MINISTRY OF TEXTILES(SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) No, Sir. 

(bl and (cl. Do not arise. 

NTC Run Model Mills, Nagpur 

9551. SHRI RAMCHANDRA MARO-
TRAO GHANGARE: Will the Minister of 
TEXTILES be pleased to state: 

(al whether the Government are aware 
that the chawls of the Model Mill. Nagpur run 
by National Textile Corporation are in the 
most dilapidated conditions and are likely to 
collapse at any time endangering the lives 
and property of employees and their family 
members; 

(b) if so. whether the N.T.C. have re-
ceiv,ed a nUmberof representations from the 
employees in this regard during the last 
three years; and 

(c) if so, the alternate measures being 
taken by the Government to Provide suitable 
accommodation to the employees? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TAXTILES(SHRI ASHOK 

GEHLOT): (a) to (c). Outside Modes Mills, 
Nagpurthere is a plot of about 5.6 acres with 
dilapidated chawls. There are instances of 
portions of chawls giving way in every mon-
soon. Mill management is displaying notices 
on all chawls every year informing the occu-
pants that these are in dangerous condition 
and they should vacate the same. Nagpur 
Municipal Corporation has also served no-
tice for vacating the chawls in view of the 
dilapidated condition. The chawls being 
beyond repairs and cannot be repaired nor 
can the Mill provide any alternative accom-
modation to occupants. 

The 70% of occupants of the chawls are 
not the employees of the Mill. The financial 
condition of NTC In general and this Mill in 
particulardo not ー･ｲｭｾ＠ at the present moment 
any possibility of alternate accomodation 
being provided by the Corporation. 

[ Translation] 

Export of Tobacco 

9552. DR. MAHADEEPAK SINGH 
SHAKYA: Will the Minister of COMMERCE 
be pleased to state: 

(a) the countries to which tobacco was 
exported during the year 1991-92; 

(b) the amount of foreign exchange 
earned as a result thereof; 

(c) whether the Govemment propose to 
increase its export during 1992-93; 

(d) if so, the detaiLs thereof; and 

(e) if not. the reasons therefor? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE(SHRISALMAN 
KHURSHEED): (a) The main countries to 
which tobacco was exported during the year 
1991-92 are United Kingdom, Belgium. 
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USSR, Germany, Czechoslovakia, Poland, 
Nepal, Nethenands and Libya. 

(b) The value of exports of tobacco and 
tobacco products during 1991-92 Is Rs. 
385.74 crores. 

(c) to (e). The tentative target for to-
bacco exports during 1992-93 is Rs.450 
crores. 

Repair of N.H. In Bihar 

9553. SHRI BHUBANESHWAR 
PRASAD MEHTA: Will the Minister of 
SURFACE TRANSPORT be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the Ramgarh to Sokaro, 
Ormanjhito Kodarma and Bagodarto Cham-
p.aran sections of the National Highway in 
Hazaribag district of Bihar are not in traffic-
worthy condition; and 

(b) if so, the ｾｴ･ｰｳ＠ taken by the govern-
ment to repair the aforesaid portions of the 
National Highway? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAG DISH TYILER): (a) and (b). Sec-
tions of National Highways from Remgarh to 
Bokaro (NH 23), Ormanji to 
Kodarma(comprising NH 33 & 31) and 
Bagodar to Champaran (NH 2) in Hazar-
ibagh District of Bihar are being generally 
kept in traffic worthy condition within the 
limitation of available funds. During 1989-90 
to 1991-92, flood damage/special repair 
works costing Rs.70. 455 lakhs, and Im-

(i) Joint secretary 

(ii) Addl. Secretary & above 

provement works costing Rs. 1 018.9851akhs, 
were sanctioned on these stretches. This Is 
in addition to the allocations for normal 
maintenance for which an amount of Rs. 
2053. 44lakhs was provided to Bihar Public 
Works Department during the above period 
for all National Highways put together in-
cluding the stretches referred to above. 

[English 1 

Transport Facility to Government 
Officers 

9554. SHRI HARCHAND SINGH: Will 
the Ministarof FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the officers in the rank of 
Joint Secretary and above are providedtrans-
port facility between their home and office; 

(b) if so, whether any payment is re-
quired to be made by them for it and if so, the 
details thereof; 

(c) whether there is any proposal to 
extend this facility to officers in the lower· 
ranks also; 

(d) if so, the time by which it is likely to 
be extended; and 

(e) if not, the reasons thert:for? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI SHAN-
TARAM POTDUKHE): Ca) and (b). Officers 
of the rank of joint Secretaries and above are 
permitted use of staft car lor journeys from 
residence to office and back on payment at 

. prescribed rates as under:-

- Rs. 7St-per month. 

- Rs.1 OOt-per month. 
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The above charges are to be recovered 
every month from the salary of the officers 
who avail of this facility. 

(c) At present, there is no proposal to 
extend this facility to the officials below the 
level of Joint Secretary to the Goverrtment of 
India. 

(d) Does not arise in view of reply to (c) 
above. 

(e) Senior Officers of the leved of Joint 
Secretary & above have been permitted use 
of staff car as mentioned in reply to (a) and 
(b) above keeping in view the nature of 
duties and responsibilities at that level. 

Advance Increments to Delhi 
Higher Judicial Service Officers 

9555. SHRI· ROSHAN LAL: Will the 
Min/sterof LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY 
AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Government propose to 
withdraw the irregular advance increments 
allowed with effect from January 1, 1986 to 
a few of Delhi Higher Judicial Service Offi-
cers, in pursuance of the directions issued 
by his Ministry; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) if not, the reasons therefore? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
ANDTHEMINISTEROFINTHEMINISTAY 
OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY 
AFFAIRS(SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): (a) to (c). The mar. 
ter of rectifying error involved in sanctioning 
of advance increments with effect from 1 sl 
January, 1986 to soma Delhi Higher Judiciai 
Officers has been taken up with the Delhi 
Administration and Registry of the Delhi High 
Court. A reply is being awaited from them. 

C&AG Report on Induction of. Heavy 
Transport AIrcraft in I.A.F. 

9556. SHRI JEEWAN SHARMA: Will 
the Minister of DEFENCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the Comptroller and Auditor 
General· in his Report No.11 of 1990 pre-
sented on May 10, 1990 for the year ending 
March :;1, 1990 has made some observa-
tions about the induction of heavy transport 
aircraft In Indian Air Force; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; 

(e) whether any Inquiry has been con-
ducted in this regard; 

(dl it so, the outcome thereof; and 

(e 1 the steps being taken by the Govern-
ment to improve the induction planning in-
c!uding a strong maintenance elemant in this 
regard? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE(SHRI 
SHARAD PAWAR): (a) Yes, Sir. However 
the raievent Report of C&AG relates to the 
year ending March 31, 1989. 

ib) The observations made in the 
C&AG's report relate to: 

(i) delay in the finalization of the 
contract; 

(ii\ lower utilisation rate; 

(iii) premature withdrawal of enginesl 
rotables; 

(iv) non-establishment of indigenous 
repair facilities on the basis of 
cost benefit analysis; and 

(v) non-inclusion, in the team of 
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specialists deputed by the sup-
plier;of experts to provide train-
ing ort bay-servicing of aggre-
gates ｉｾ＠ laboratory. 

(c) to (e). The observations made in the 
Report have been examined and the 'Action 
Taken Note' indicating, inter-alia, the reme-
dial measures taken, duly vetted by the 
concerned Audit authorities, has been for-
warded to the Lok Sabha Secretariat (PAC 
Branch). No inquiry was conducted, as it was 
not considered necessary to do so in the 
circumstances of the case. 

9557. 

NCCUnits 

SHRI K. PRADHANI: 
SHRIMATI OIL KUMARI 
BHANDARI: 

Will the Minister of DEFENCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the number of units of various wings 
of National Cadet Corps wor1(ing, State-
wise; 

(b) whetherthe Government propose to 
establish more units of National Cadet Corps; 

(c) if so, details thereof, State-wise; and 

(d) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE(SHRI 
SHARAD PAWAR): (a) Information is fur-
nished in the annexed Statement. 

(b) No, Sir. 

(c) Does not arise. 

(d) Raising of new units is not being 
considered due to paucity of resources. 
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[ Translation] 

Amount Provided for MaIntenance 
of National Highway No. 23 

9558. SHRI LALIT ORAON: Will the 
Minister of SURFACE TRANSPORT be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the year-wise amount provided by 
the Government for the maintenance and 
Improvement of National Highway No. 23 

during the last three years; and 

(b) the amount surrendered out of it 
during the above period? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTLER):(a) The details 
are indicated in the attached statement. 

(b) There has been no surrender of 
funds during the last three years. 
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[English] 

Llfelnsurance.corporBtlon of India 

9559.SHRIMATICHANDRAPRABHA 
URS: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whetherthe Life Insurance Corpora-
tion of India has sought exemptiol4 from the 
purview of the Consumer Protection Act of 
Karnataka; and 

(b) if so, the reasons th,erefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE(SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 

STA Pennlts 

9560. SHRI RAM ｎａｾａｉｎ＠ BERWA: 
SHRI GOVINDA CHANDRA 

MUNDA: 
SHRI RAJNATH SONKAR 

SHASTRI: 

Will the Minister of SURFACE TRANS-

General 

Scheduled Castes 

Scheduled Tribes 

Ex-servicemen 

Cooperative Societies 

Total 

PORT be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the applications forgrant of 
S.T.A permits to private buses in Deihl have 
since been scrutinized; 

(b) If so, tl1e number of applications 
received, category-wise such as Genet'al, 
SCs/STs and ex-serviceman etc; 

(c) the quota fixed for these catego-
ries; 

(d) whether there is any proposal to 
increase the number of permits; and 

(e) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF. THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTlER): (a) The grantof 
ST A permits in Delhi is done by the State 
Transport Authority in the Union Territory of 
Delhi in exercise of the powers vested in 
them by the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988. Ac-
cording to information furnished by the Delhi 
Administration, the scrutiny of applications 
has been completed, 

(b) The details are as under:-

6959 

23"11 

41 

932 

104 

'= 10347 
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(c) The Delhi Administration have fixed 
the quota of raservation for Scheduled Castes 
as 15"10 al)d for Scheduled Tribes 7.5"10. 
Otherconditions being equal preference shall 
be given to applications for permits from Ex-
servicemen and Cooperative Societies. 

(d) The Delhi Administration has inti-
mated thatthey have no proposal at present 
to increase the number of permits. 

(e) Does not arise. 

Interest on Loans Frolt\NABARD 

9561. SHRI V. DHANANJAYA KUMAR: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the payment of interest on 
loans from NABARDforfinancing the priority 
sector like horticulture and plantation crops 
during gestation period is deferred and no 
interest on deferred interest is to be levied; 
and 

(b) if so, the gestation period allowed for 
rubber plantation? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE(SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) National Bank for Agriculture 
and Ru(al Development (NABARD) has 
reported that, normally, in respect of NA-
BARD refinanced schemes deferment of 
interest is permissible on loans for schemes 
involving long gestation period and as per 
the percent policy no interest on deferred 
interest is to be levied at the beneficiaries 
level by the banks. However, in deciding the 
issue of repayment of interest during gesta-
tion period, merits of each case depending 
upon cash flow are taken into account and 
where adequate income generation during 
gestation period, is expected, banks are 
allowed to collect interest. 

(b) The gestation period allowed for 

Rubber Plantations developed with polybag 
saplings is upto 6 years and those devel-
oped with stumps is upto 7 years. 

Production of Missiles 

9562. SHRI BUOY KRISHNA HAN-
DIOUE: 

SHRI SIMON MARANDI: 

Will the Minister of DEFENCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the details of the missiles proposed 
to be produced in the country and the time-
frame fixed in each case; 

(b) the reasons for the delay in the 
production of some missiles as per sched-
ule; and 

(c) the budget allocations made for the 
production of each missile? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE(SHRf 
SHARAD PAWAR): (a) The following 4 
missile systems are being developed by 
DRDO under Integrated Guided Missile 
Development Programme (lGMDP) :-

PRITHVI- Surface to Surface missile 
with 150 km range. 

TRISHUL- Surfaceto Air missile with 
9km range. 

AKASH - Medium range Surface to 
Air missile. 

NAG - Third Generation Anti Tank 
missile. 

TRISHUL & PRITHVI missiles are in 
advanced stage of development and are 
likely to be productionised in 1992-93 after 
the completion of users trials. AKASH & 
NAG missiles are expected to be produc-
tionised in 1995. Production of anti-tank 
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missiles MILAN and KONKURSare already 
under progress, 

(b) The worK for establishing limited 
series production facilities for the produc-
tionis ation of the above missile systems is 
progressing as per schedule, 

(c) As part of IGMDP programme, As. 
246.41 crores have already been sanctioned 
for establishment of Developmental ｆ｡｢ｲｩｾ＠
cation Facilities and Limited Series Produc-
tion Facilities. Additional funds have been 
sanctioned to produce missiles in required 
numbers. H is. however, not in public interest 
to disclcse the details regarding production 
plans for each missile to meet Service re-
quirements. 

Seizure of Gold at Madras Airport 

9563. SHRI N. DENNIS: Will the Minis-
ter of DEFENCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the quantity and value of gold seized 
at Madras Airport during 1991-92 ; 

(b) the number of persons, both Indians 
and foreigners found involved in the smug-
gling of gold during the above period; and 

(c) the action taken against them? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE(SHRI AAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) to (c). About 158.3 kgs. 
of gold valued at RS.2.92 crores approxi-
mately have been seized by the Customs 
authorities at Madros Airport during 1991 "92 

1989 

1990 

1991 

and 87 Indians and 12 persons of foreign 
nationality were arrested by them for being 
involved in the smuggling of gold during the 
same period. Prosecution proceedings have 
been instituted against the arrested per-
sons. Out of the above number of persons 
arrested 18 Indians and 4 persons of foreign 
nationality were also detained under the 
provisions of Conservation of Foreign Ex-
change and Prevention of Smuggling Activi-
ties Act, 1947. 

Inland Waterways Authority 

9564. SHRI K.V. THANGKABALU: 
SHAI A. DHANUSKODI 

ATHITHAN: 
SHRI PRAKASH V. PATIl: 

Will the Minister of SURFACE TRANS-
PORT be pleased to state: 

(a) the number of meetings held by the 
Board of Inland Waterways Authority during 
each of the last three years; 

(b) whether the Government have re-
ceived any representation regarding the 
worKing of this authority; and 

(c) if so, the steps taken by the Govern-
mentto streamline the working of the author-
ity? 

THE MINiSTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE 
TRANSPORT (SHRI JAGDISHTYTLER): (a) 
The number of meetings held during the last 
three years are given below:-

Five meetings 

Four meetings 

Four meetings 
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Cycles seized, (b) Yes, Sir. 

(c) The government has been closely 
monitoring the working of the authority 
through its nominees on the authority. With 
a view to streamlining the working, among 
other things, It has been decided to abolish 
the post of Vice-Chairman and down grade 
the post of Member (FInance). 

Smuggling of Pulses .From Raxaul, 
Bihar' 

9565. SHRI KAMLA MISHRA 
MAOHUKAR: Will the Minister of FINANCE 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether cases of smuggling of pulses 
from Raxaul, Bihar have come to'the notice 
of the Government during last year and also 
in the current year; • 

(b) If so, the details thereof and the 
value and quantity of pulses seized in each 
case during the above period; 

(c) the action taken against the persons 
found guilty; 

(d) whether customs and other ｇｯｶ･ｲｮｾ＠
ment officials have also been found involved 
in the above smuggling; and 

(e) if so, the detailthereof and the action 
taken in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE(SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) and (b). Smuggling of 
pluses from Raxaul, Bihar. have been no-
ticed during last year and also in the current 
year. The casewise details of the same are 
asfollows:-

(i) DURING 1991: 

1. Seizure of 784 Kgs. of Masoor Oal 
valued . at Rs.11,450 including 

2. Seizure of 4 quintals of Khesari Oal 
valued at Rs.4,800/-. 

3. Seizure of 2 Quintals of MasoorOal 
valued at RS.2,400/-. 

(ii) DURING 1992; 

1. Seizure of 1 Quintals of Masoor Oal 
valued at RS.1 ,200/-. 

2. ｓ･ｩｾｵｲ･＠ of 4 Quintals of MasoorOal 
valued at Rs.4,000/-. 

3. Seizure of 2095 Quintals of Masoor 
Oal valued at Rs.20, 15,750/- and 
181 Quintals of Chana Oal, Urad 
Oal valued at RS.1 ,81 ,390/-. 

4'. Seizure of 142 Quintals of Masoor 
Oal valued at RS.1 ,42,500/-. 

5. Seizure of 142 Quintals of Masoor 
Oal valued at RS.1 ,42,500/-. 

6. Seizure of 11 Quintals of Masoor 
Oal valued at Rs.11 ,400/-. 

7. Seizure of 1 1 Quintals of Masoor 
Oal valued at RS.11 ,400/-. 

B. Seizure of 157 Quintals of Masoor 
Oal valued 'at RS.1,57, 700/-. 

9. Seizure of 130 Quintals of Masoor 
Oal valued at Rs.1 ,30,5001-. 

10. Seizure of 142 Quintals of Masoor 
Oal valued at RS.1 ,42,5001-. 

11. Seizure of 3 Quintals of Massor Oal 
valued at Rs.6,00O/-. 

12. Seizure of 10 Quintals of Masoor 
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Dal valued at Rs. 1,00,000/-. loaded 
on a Truck valued at Rs. 
3,00,000/-

(Quantities and value are approxi-
mate and provisional). 

(c) Offence cases have been registered 
and penal action will be taken against the 
persons involved in the smuggling of pulses 
as per the provisions of law. 

(d) and (e). Involvement of Customs or 
other Government officials have not been 
reported in the above mentioned cases. 

Export Growth Rate 

9566. SHRI ATAL BIHARI 
VAJPAYEE: 

SHRI SHANKERSINH 
VAGHELA: 

Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whetherthe collapse of the erstwhile 
Soviet Union had imposed "major Constraint" 
on India's export growth rate this year as 
reported in the 'Hindustan Times' dated 
February 2,1992; 

(b) if so the facts thereof; 

(c) the extentto which the export growth 
rate has declined; and 

(d) the remedial measures proposed to 
be taken by the Government in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE(SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) to Ccl. Yes, Sir. The disin-
tegration of the former SOViet Union had 
imposed a major constraint on India's export 
growth during the financial year 1991-92. 
According to the provisional figures, India's 
exports to Rupee Payment Area, in which 

former USSR was the major constituent, 
declined by 42.7 percent from US.$ 2871 
million during April-February 1990-91 to US 
$ 1646 million during April-February, 1991-
92. In Rupeeterms. they declined by 21.7%. 

(d) Several changes in trade policy were 
it introduced since July 1991 aimed at 
strengtnening export incentives, eliminating 
a substantial volume of import licensing and 
rationalising the import tariff structure. In the 
budget for 1992/93, rupee was made par-
tially convertible to encourage generation of 
foreign exchange and compress imports 
through the price mechanism by making 
them dearer. These have been further con-
solidated in the new Export-Import policy 
announced on 31st March 1992, which, inter 
alia, aims to promote the productivity, mod-
ernisation and competitiveness of Indian 
industry and thereby to enhance its export 
capabilities. Besides, the government has 
taken other steps which include reducing 
controls through licensing simplification of 
procedures for export. activisalion of Board 
of Trade. bilateral discussions with select 
countries, interaction with national organisa-
tion of Trade and Industry, etc. In addition, 
the Government has opened a dialogue with 
the newly formed Republic of Commonwealth 
of Independent States (CIS) and signed bi-
lateral agreements with a number of them 
already. 

National Port Authority 

9567. SHRI M.G.REDDY: 
SHRI RAMA KRISHNA KON-

ATHALA: 
KUMARI PADMASREE 

KUDUMULA: 

Will the Minister of SURFACE TRANS-
PORT be pleased to refer to the reply given 
to Unstarred Question Number 5900 on 
September 6,1991 and state: 

(a) whether the government have taken 
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a final decision to set up 'National Port Au-
thorny'; 

(b) if so, the details thereat; and 

(c) the time by which it is likely to be set 
up? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE 
TRANSPORT(SHRtJAGDISHTYTLER): (a) 
and (b). Yes, Sir. The Committee of Secre-
taries has decided not to pursue the pro-
posal to set up National Port Authority. 

(e) Does not arise. 

Import of COCO 

9568. SHRt V. KRISHNA RAO: 
SHAI C.P. MUDAlA GIRI-

YAPPA: 
SHRI K.H.MUNIYAPPA: 

Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the quantity of Coco imported during 
each of the last three years; 

(b) whether a number of companies 
have increased the import ot Coco In the 
recent times; 

(c) if so, the details thereof; 

(en whetherthis increase in the Impcrt of 
Coco has resulted in its distress sale by the 
Indian growers; and 

(e) if so, steps proposed to be taken by 
the Government to minimise or restrict its 
import? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 

MINISTRY OF COMMERCE(SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) Quantity of Cocoa Im-
ported during lastthree years for which data 
are available are as under: 

Year Qnatity(intonnes) 

1986-87 41 

1987-88 44 

1988-89 09 

(b) and (c). Foreign Trade Statistics of 
India are not maintained company-wise. 

(d) and (e). There is no increase in the 
Import of coco a as seen from the above 
lIgures. 

Seizure of Gold aod Sliver 10 Gujarat 

9569. SHRI CHANDRESH PATEL: Will 
tne Minister 01 FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the quantity and vaiue of smuggled 
goid, silver and other contraband: items 
seized in GujaJat since January 1, 1990 to 
March 31 :1992; 

(bl the details of persons involved in the· 
smuggling: and 

(e) the action taken by the Government 
to check such activities? 

THE MII-lISTER OF STATE iN THE 
MINiSTRY or FINANCE(SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) and (b). The quantity 
and value of smuggled gold, ｳｩＡｶｾｲ＠ and other 
contraband items seized in Gujarat since 
January 1,1990 to Mar_ch 31. 1992 is given in 
the table below. 260 persons were arrested 
in connection with these cases. 
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ITEM QUANTITY" 
(in kgs.) 

VALUE" 
(Rs. in crores) 

Gold 999.6 34.8 

Silver 82093.5 59.6 

Other contraband) 
items 

• Figures are provisional. 

(c) Customs authorities are vigilant 
against smuggling including that of gold and 
silver. Intelligence is targetted against such 
smugg ling and field formations alerted suita-
bly. Sophisticated equipment such as X-ray, 
baggage machines, Metal detectors, Night 
vision binoculars etc are being increasingly 
used. Close co-ordination is also maintained 
between all the agencies concerned with 
detection and prevention of smuggling. 

[ Translation] 

Export of Textiles 

9570. SHRI RAJENDRA KUMAR 
SHARMA: 

SHRI GOPI NATH GAJAPA-
THI: 

Will the Minis!erotTEXTILES be pleased 
to stale: 

Year Target(Rs/Cr.) 

1989-90 6270 

1990-91 8820 

1991-92 13202 

62.4 

(a) whether the government have 
achieved the target fixed for export of textiles 
during 1989-90, 1990-91 and 1991-92; 

(b) if so, to what extent and the revenue 
earned, including the foreign exchange, by 
the Government during the above period, 
year wise', 

(c) whether there is any scope to boost 
the expo rt of textiles; and 

(d) if so, the steps taken by the Govern-
mentto increase the limit of export of textiles 
during the current financial year? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES(SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT}: (a) and (b). Yes, Sir. Targetfixed 
and the corresponding achievement in re-
spect of export 01 Textiles (including Coir, 
Jute and Handicrafts) during 1989-90, 1990-
91 and 1991-92 were as under: 

Export(Rs/Cr. ) 

7818 

9932 

14379 (Provisional) 
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(c) Yes, Sir. 

(d) Government have taken sevei'll'" 
to boost textile exports. These Include: 

(a) Under the new Export-lrnpoIIPGIicy 
for 1992-97: 

(i) all textile machinery items have 
been placed outside Negative list. 

(ii) imports of second-hand textile 
machinery items have been al-
lowed. While Garment machines 
do not require any licensing, Import 
of textile machinery items are sub-
ject to licensing. 

(iii) Export Promotion Capital Goods 
(EPCG) Scheme liberalised. In 
addition to the original scheme of 
allowing imports with a conessioal 
Customs duty of 25% subject to 3 
times export obligation of the CIF 
value of imported machinery to be 
undertaken in 4 years, another 
scheme with concesslonal costums 
duty of 15% with export obligation 
of 4 times the vale in 5 years intro-
duced for enabling speedy mod-
ernisation of production facilities. 

(IV) EPCG scheme extended to com-
ponents of capital goods with a 
concessional customs duty of 15%. 

{v) Advance Licensing Scheme Pro-
cedure further liberallsed. 

(vi) EOU Scheme and EPZ scheme 
further liberalised. 

(vii) Definition of demedexports stream-
lined. 

(b) Under the Textile Export Entitlement 
Distribution Policy, two new system have 
been introduced. The Non-Ouota Export 
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ｾｴｩｴｬ･ｭ･ｮｴ＠ has been introduced with a view 
_encourage exports of non-quota imams to 
quatacounties and to non-quota countries. 
Pawwloom Export Entlttlement system has -
bien Introduced with a view to encourage 
exports from powerioom sector which is 
mainly concentrated in the decentralised 
MCIOr. 

(c) Partial convertibility of Rupees. 

(d) Orguniring of Buyer-Seller Meets, 
Fairs and exhibition in overseas markets etc. 

[English] 

Export of ｏｮｬｯｾ＠

9571. SHRI DHARMANNA MON-
DA YY A SADUL: Will the Ministate of COM-
MERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether as a result of bumper crop of 
onion In Maharashtra In 1991-92 season, 
the Government propose to liberalise the 
export of onion in place of canalised export 
at present to earn maximum foreign ex-
change; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) the details of the canalised export of 
the commodity made during the year and the 
countering to which exported? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MAN KHURSHEED): (a) and (b). To help 

.export of onion the procedure for export of 
this item has been simplified. Anyone desir-
ous of exporting onion Is free to do so without 
any limit on quantity. NAFED will Issue No 
Objection Certificate to registered exporters . 
across.the -counter. The exporters will also 
be free to undertake exports against lC in 
own name. The only exception would be the 
four countries of Sri Lanka, Seychelles, 
Mauritius & Maldives where the imports are· 
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regulated by their GovernmenuState agen-
cies. In case of these four countries the 
exports will be undertaken exclusively by 
NAFED. 

(c) During the year 1991-92, a quantity 
of approximately 4.16 lakh MTs of onion 
valuing around RS.180 crores was exported 
to Sri Lanka, Mauritius, Maldives, Seych-
elles, Malaysia, Singapore, Dubai, Bahrain, 
Damman,Jeddah, Muscat, Doha, Kuwait 
and Reunion. The exports were undertaken 
by NAFED and approximately 400 other 
private ･ｸｰｯｲｴｾｲｳ＠ registere with NAFED as 
associate shippers. 

Visit of high level Trade Delegation to 
US 

9572. SHRI B.N. REDDY: Will the Min-
ister of COMMERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether a high-level delegation 
headed by him visited the United States to 
create as awareness about the new Indian 
economic policy, making it an attractive 
"investment destination" as reported in the 
"Hindustan Times· dated Aprail4,1992; and 

(b) if so, the outcome of the issues 
discussed? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) and (b). In conneetion 
with India's participation at the international 
electronicfair, COMDEX SPRING '92 SHOW 
in Chicago, Minister of State·for Commerce 
visited USA from 5-1 0 April, 1992 Prominent 
Indian electronic companies participated in 
the fair. During the duress of his visit, he also 
addressed the US business community at 
several fora to explain to them the liberalisa-
tion measures being undertaken by India to 
attractforeign investment. The Iiberalisation 
l')1easures have been widely welcomed in 
USA .. 

Office of DU. CCI&Eat Baroda 

9573. SHRI KASHIRAM RANA:WilIthe 
Ministerof COMMERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether an office olthe Deputy Chief 
Controller of Imports and Exports was for-
mally opened at Baroda in March, 1991; 

(b) if so, whether the office has since 
started functioning; 

(c) if not, the reasons therefor; 

(d) whether a proposal to open the office 
of Deputy Chief Controller of Imports and 
Exports at Surat was also received by the 
Govemment; and 

(e) if so, the action taken thereon? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a)to(c). A decision to set up 
the office of Dy. Chief Controller of Imports & 
Exports at Baroda was taken, but the office 
has not yet started functioning formally due 
to non-availability of office accommodation. 

(d) and (e). Yes, Sir. However, in view of 
the decision to set up an office of the Organi-
sation at Baroda which will have jurisdiction 
over Surat District as will, it has not been 
found feasible to open another independent 
office at Surat. 

Prosecution Launched Against Tax 
Evaders 

9574. SHRI ANANTRAO DESHMUKH: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state the number of prosecutions launched 
and convictions made in respect of income 
tax, excise duty and customs evasion, sepa-
rately, during each of the last three years? 

THE MINISTER OF STAtE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
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WAR THAKUR): The Information In respect of Income tax Is as under:-

Year No. of tax evasion 
prosecutions proceedings • 
launched. 

No. of tax evasion 
convictions proceeding 
made. 

1991-92 1234 

1990-91 844 

1989-90 595 

The information in regard to excise duty 
and costumscvasion is being collected and 
will be laid on the Table of the House. 

[Translation] 

Stat. Repayment of Amount Deposited 
under National Savings Scheme 

9575. SHRIMATI PRATIBHA DEVIS-
INGH PATll: Will the Minister of FINANCE 
be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the depositors, who had 
deposited their money under the National 
Savings Scheme during the year 1988-89, 
are being paid back only the principal amount 
and not the interest thereon; 

(b) if so, the reasons thereor; and 

(c) the time by which interest money is 
likely to be paid to them? . 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DAlBIR 
SINGH): (a) to (c). Under the National Sav-
ings Scheme Rules 1987, withdrawal is 
permitted only once in a year, provided that 
the amount of such withdrawal shall not 
eXceed the balance (inclusive of interest) at 
the end of the fourth ｾ｣･･､ｬｮｧ＠ financial 
year, less withdrawal, if any, already 
made. 

63 

19 

23 

Export of Castor 011 

9576. SHRI YASHWANTRAO PATIL: 
Will the Ministerof COMMERCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether there is a heavy demand of 
Castor-oil abroad; 

(b) whether production of this oil has 
increased during this year; 

(c) if so, the steps proposed to be taken 
by the Government to increase its exports; 

Cd) the quantity of Castor-oil exported 
during the last year and the foreign ex-
change earned therefrom; and 

(e) the target fixed for its export during 
the correct year? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) The total world import of 
castor oil is around 2 lakh tonnes and with 
average price of $ 1000 per tonne, the world 
market Is around 200 million dollars. The 
market for derivatives is estimated around 
1.5. to 2.5 million US dollars. 

(b) The details of production of castor 
seeds and castor oil in India Is given below: 
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(Qty. in tonne) 

Year Production of Production of 
Castor seed 

1989-90 508.000 

1990-91 650000 

1991·92 550.00 

The slight fall in the production during 
the year 1991-92 has been attributed to a 
poor Monsoon. 

(c) In addition to the usual export pro-
motion measures, like sending Trade dele-
gations, arranging buyer-seller meets etc, 
the BasIc Chemicals, Pharmaceuticals & 

CastoroH 

200.000 

260.000 

225.000 

Cosmetics Export Promotion Council are 
planning to sponsor a high powered delega-
tion consisting of experts from Castor oil 
Industry to Brazil. USA, France and Nether-
lands for boosting exports ofthis commodity. 

Cd) The quantity of castor oil exported 
during the last two years and the foreign 
exchange earned is as under: 
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(e) Basic Chemicals, Pharmaceuticals 
and Cosmetics Export Promotion Council 
have envisaged a target of Rs.250 cores 
during the year 1992-93. 

[English] 

Rice Deal With Cuba 

9577. SHRI CHInA BASU: Will the 
Minister of COMMERCE be pleasedto state: 

(a) whether the proposed rice deal with 
Cuba has since been put off: and 

(b) if sO,t he reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MIISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 

Sale of output by Agricultural and 
Allied Units 

9578. SHRI SUDHIR GIRl: Will the 
Ministerof COMMERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Government have de-
cidedto allow agricultural and allied units set 
up under export processing zones and ex-
port oriented outs to sell 50 per cent of their 
output in the oomestic market; 

([../ if so, the details thereof and the 
reasom' therefor: 

(c) the benefits likely to be accrued 
therefrom; and 

(d) the advantages or concessions 
proposed to be provided by the Government 
to suqh units? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-

ｄａｍｂａｒａｍＩｾ＠ (a) No, Sir. 

(b) to (d). Do not arise. 

Taking up of Jobs Abroad by Defence 
Officers 

9579. SHRIIARITBARANTOPDAR: 
DR. RAJAGOPALAN 

SRIDHARAN: 

Will the Minister of DEFENCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whetherthe Govt. allow the defence 
off icials incharge of sensitive projects to take 
up jobs in foreign countries; 

(b) if so, the names of such persons who 
were allowed to take jobs in foreign countries 
during the last three years; 

(e) whether some officials have ex-
pressed their desire to take up job in foreign 
countries in near futhre; 

(d) if so, whether the Government pro-
pose to prevent such important Defence 
officials from going outside the country in 
view of national security; and 

(e) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHRI 
SHARAD PAWAR): (a) to (e). Information is 
being collected and will be laid on the Table 
of the House. 

Maintenance of N.H. No.31-A In Slkklm 

9580. SHRIMATI DIL KUMARI BHAN-
DARI: Will the Ministerof SURFACE TRANS-
PORT be pleased to state: 

(a) whetherthe stretch of National High-
way No. 31-A from Rangpo to Rorathang in 

_ Sikkim is in dilapidated condition; and 
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(b) if so, the steps taken by the Govem-
ment to repair and renovate this stretch? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGOISH TVTlER): (a) and (b). 
Govemment of India is essentially respon-
sible for development and maintenance of 
roads declared as National Highways only. 
Since the stretch from Rangpoto Rorathang 
in Sikkim does not form a part of National 
Highway 31-A, it is the responsibility of the 
State Govt. 

Centre for Advance Coffee Technology 
In Kamataka 

9581. SHRIG. MADE GOWDA: Will the 
Minister of COMME RCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whetherthe Govemment propose to 
establish a Centre for Advance Coffee Tech-
nology in Karnataka; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; 

(c) the site selected for the proposed 
Centre; and 

(d) the time by which it is likely to be 
established ? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) to Cd). In a meeting of 

Year Quantity 

*1988-89 1369 MT 

*·1989-90 365MT 

*1990-91 290MT 

Source: • OOCI&S 

various interests of the coffee industry, viz., 
plantation owners, traders, CUntrs, export-
ers, manufactures of instant coffee etc. on 
25th May, 1990 at Bangalont, the proposal 
to establish a Centre of Advance Coffee 
Technology, preferably in Karnataka was 
discussed. However, no concrete steps have 
been taken after the meeting nor is such a 
proposal under the consideration of the 
Govemment. Consequently, question of 
laying down any time frame does not arise. 

Export of Bananas 

9582. SHRI HARISH NARAYAN 
PRABHU ZANTYE: Will the Minister of 
COMMERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the quantity and value of bananas, 
both fresh and dried, exported during the last 
three years and the countries to which ex-
ported: 

(b) the steps proposed to be taken by 
the Govemment to boost the export of fresh 
and dried bananas: and 

(c) the actual price received by the 
banana producers while exporting bananas? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MAN KHURSHEED): (a) The export of 
bananas, both fresh and dried, to Nepal. 
Bahrain, Kuwait, Saudi Arabia, etc., during 
the last three years-was as under: 

value 

Rs.2171 lakhs 

As 18.991akhs 

As. 6.34lakhs 

•• Returns flied by !txporters with horticultural & Processed Food Products Export 
Development Authority (APEDA). 
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(b) For boosting -export 'Of agricultural 
products, Including banana. APEDA has a 
number of Schemes which can be a availed 
of by the exporters. 

(c) The unit value realisation of expor.tof 
banana during 1990-91 has been reported 
to be Rs. 2.18 per Kg. 

Price of Natural Rubber 

9583. SHRI P.C. THOMAS: Will the 
Ministerof C<;JMMERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the average price of different varie-
tIes of rubber in the open market and ils cost 
of production during each of the last three 
years: 

Year RMA-1 

1989-90 2264 

1990-91 2276 

1991-92 2285 

The cost of production varies from unit 
to unit depending on yield rate agricultural 
practices' adopted, etc. However, the beneh-

Year 

1989-90 and 

1990-91 

1991-92 

(b) to (d). The present Bench Mark Price 
of Rs. 21,4501- per metric tonne for RMA-IV 
was fixed on 1 st January, 1991 on the basis 
of the recommendations of the Cost Ac-

(b) whether the study on the cost of 
production of natural rubber and the study on 
its prices by the Cost Accounts Branch have 
since been examined by the Government; 

(c) if so, the details and outcomethereof; 
and 

(d) if not, the steps proposed to betaken 
by the Government to fix support or floor 
price of natural rubber at the earliest? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) The average price of dif-
ferent varieties of natural rubber during the 
las three years. is as under:-

ＨｒｳＮＯｑｵｩｮｴ｡ｾ＠

RMA-2 RMA-3 RMA-4 FMA-5 

2216 2171 2131 2057 

2225 2182 2129 2046 

2235 2179 2141 2081 

mark price fixed for RMA-4 grade of natural 
rubber during the last three years is as 
follow:-

RMA-4 

Rs. 17800 per MT 

Rs. 17800 per MT 

Rs. 21450 per MT 

counts Branch. Due to reported increases in 
the Cost of varioua inputs a fresh cost story 
has recently been carried out and the same 
is being examined by Government. 
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Narcotic cases 

9584. SHRi ANAND RATNA MAURYA: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) the number of cases registereq under 
the Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Sub-
stances Act, 1985 during the lastthree years; 

(b) the number of cases decided so far 
and the numberol those still pendingfortrial; 
and 

1989 1990 

7323 3894 

(b) Since 1989 upto March, 1992 cis 
many as 15863 persons were reportedly 
arrested all overthe country underthe NDPS 
Act, 1985. Altogether 13911 persons were 

1989 

No. 01 persons arrested 

No. of persons prosecuted 

No. of persons convicted 

No. of persons acquitted 

(c) All the States and Union Territories 
have been requested to review the ade-
quacy of existing infrast!'Ucture vis-a-vis 
pendency of cases under the Act and create 
adequate number of special courts on the 
basis of accumulation of cases ad incidence 
of drug offences, for exclusively trying nar-
cotic drugs and psychotropic substances 
cases. 

Trade agreements 

9585. SHRIVILASRAO NAGNATHRAO 

(c) the steps proposed to be taken by 
the Government for speedy trial of the pend-
ing cases? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) The details 01 numberol 
cases registered in respect of all Narcotic 
Drugs and Psychotropic Substances cov-
ered under the NGPS Act 1985 during the 
last three years by all the drug law enforce-
ment agencies in the country are as under: 

1991 1992(upto March) 

5299 680 

prosecuted, 1656 convicted and 3436 ac-
quited during the same period. Year-wise 
break-up of these since 1989 is as under: 

1990 1991 1992 
(upta March) 

5485 4302 5300 776 

3694 4299 5546 372 

255 511 855 35 

251 1160 1940 85 

GUNDEWAR: Will the Minister of COM-
MERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the countries which have trade rela-
tions with India; and 

(b) the details of the trade agreements 
made by the Government with each of these 
constries duing the last three years? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) and (b), India has trade 
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relations with almost all the countries of the 
world. 

During the last three years trade agree-
ments have been sig ned with Czechoslova-
kia, Romanis, Poland, Uzbekistan, 
Kazakhstan, Kyrghyzstan, Ukraine, Turk-
menistan, Russia and Rwanda. The trade 
agreements signed with Czechoslovakia and 
Romania provide for trade in non-convert-
ible Indian rupees. The trade agreements 
with other countries provide or trade in free 
currency. 

Supply of Imported Cotton Yarn to 
Handloom weavers 

9586. SHRI M.R. KADAMSUR 
JANARITHANAN: 

SHRI JAG MEET SINGH 
SRAR: 

SHRI N.J. RATHVA: 

Will the MinisterofTEXTILES be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether the Government have al-
lowed to import cotton under the Duty-free 
Cotton Schemeto the opining millsformaking 
yarn andto supply in tothe handloomweav-
era, 

(b) if so, the terms and conditions fixed 
by the Govemment before allowing the import 
of cotton; 

(c) the present rate of yam in the open 
market In the country; 

(d) whether the price of cotton in the 
international market has gone up; 

(e) if so, whetherthis will affect that rate 
at which it will be made available to the 
hand loom weavers; 

(I) II so, the further steps taken/pro-
posed to be taken in this regard; and 

(g) the details of agencies notified by the 
Govemmentto ensurepropersupply of yearn 
to the weavers and the number of weavers 
benefited by this scheme? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) Government has decided to 
allow import of upto 2 lakh bales of cotton 
free of import duty by Spinning Mills for 
supplying Hank Yarn to the Handloom Sec-
tor. 

(b) A statement is attached. 

(c) The prices of Hank yarn in the 
domestic market as on 24th April, 1992 were 
as follows. 

Counts Rupees per Kg. 

20s 57.25 

30s 63.24 

40s 68.23 

(d) The prices of some varieties of cot-
ton in the International market have shown a 
slight upward movement. 

(e) and (f). No, Sir. However, Govern-
ment will review the Scheme from time to 
time and make appropriates modifications 
as may become necessary. 

(g) The Notified Agencies under the 
Scheme to import upto 21akh bales of cotton 
free fa import duty are as follow-

1. The National Handloom Develop-
ment Corporation. 

2. State ｈ｡ｾ､ｬｯｯｭ＠ Development 
Corporation/ApexlReglonal Hand-
loom Weavers Cooperative Socie-
ties. 
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3. All India Hanclloom Fabrics Mar-
keting Cooperative Society. 

4. Handloom Agencies other that 
these, include primarY handioom 
societies can also qualify for this 
purpose subject to speciofic clear-
ance by DC (Handlooms), 

As the Scheme has been announced 
recently, supply of Hank Yam under this 
scheme has not yet commenced. 

STATEMENT 

Terms and conditions laid down by 
Government for import of cotton. 

(i)Spinning Mills will be allowed to im-
, port cotton for conversion into Hand 

Yarn and this yarn will be made 
available through notified agenCies 
at a price 12% lower then the pre-
vailing price on 10th March, 1992. 

(ii) For every 12 bales of cotton (each 
of 170 Kg.) imported by a spinning 
mtll, it will be required to supply 9 
bales (each of 181.6 Kg) of yarn. 

(iii) This authorisation for import will be 
allowed to the mills only after de-
positing the specified quantily of 
yarn to the notified Handloom 
Agenct9s and after the satisfaction 
of the Government that the rates 
offerea are as per the discounts 
specified. 

(iv) The entitlement will be issued on 
first-come first served basis, sub-
ject to fulfilment of above men-
tioned conditions. Issue of entitle-
ment will also take into account the 
spinning and reeling capacity of 
spinning mills, equitability of distri-
bution in the country and local 
demand from handl!,om weavers. 

(v) This supply of hank )Cam will be in 
addition to the norm. hank yam 
obligation of the mills. 

licences for-lmpart of Bectronic 
SUF-AHembtr.. 

9587. SHRI V.S. VIJAYARAGHAVAN: 
Will the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether the Government have de-
cided to grantfreely transferable licences for 
import 8f specified elecronic sub-assem-
blies against specified electronic exports: 
and 

(b) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) and (b). Yes, Sir. Details 
in this regard are confined in Ministry of 
Commerce Public Notice No. B-ITC(PN)/92-
97 dated 10.4.92, copies of which are avail-
able in the Parliament Library. 

Exodus of MNS Cadre Officers 
From Army 

9588. SHRI M. RAMANNA RAI: Will the 
Minister of DEFENCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Government are aware 
of the exodus of MNScadre officers from the 
Army to the outside the corps; 

(b) if so, the reasons therefor; 

(c) the number of ｍｾｓ＠ cadre officers 
gone out !:luring the past three years; and 

(d) the steps being taken by the Govern-
ment to check such'exodus in future? 

THE MINISTER DEFENCE (SHRI 
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SHARAD PAWAR): (a),(b) and (d). There is no exodus at MNS officers from the Army. 

(c) The number of MNS offlC8fS who were released prematurely is as under:-

Year Release on Release 0" Total 
grounds of other 
marriage grounds 

1989 11 115 126 

1990 17 157 174 

1991 8 116 124 

The release of MNS Officers on grounds of marriage is as per Service rules. 

Foreign Tie-Ups 

9589. KUMARI PUSHPA DEVE SINGH: 
Will the Millister of COMMERCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) the steps taken or proposed to be 
taken by the Governmentto widen the scope 
of foreign tie-ups; 

(b) whether the rules on foreign partici-
pation have been relaxed; 

(c) If not. the etopa taken In the matler: 
and 

(d) the details of the programme drawn 
up by the Government in this regard for 
1992-93? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a, to (d). As spaH out in the 
statement on Industriai Policylabied in both 
Houses of Parliament on 24th July, 1991:-

(i) The Reserve Bank of India accords 
automatic permission for direct 
foreign investment upto 51% for-
eign equity in high priority indus-
tries (Annes III to the Statement on 

Industrial Policy). Such clearance 
will be available if foreign equity 
covers the foreign exchange re-
quirement for imported capital 
goods. The Payment of dividends 
would be monitored through the 
Reserve Bank 01 India so as to 
ensure that outflow on account of 
dividelJds payments are balanced 
by export earnings over a period of 
time; 

(II) MaJority foreign equity holding upto 
51%equltyiealaoallowedfortrad-
ing companies pnmarily engaged 
in export activities by the Reserve 
Sa"k of India. 

(iii; The Reserve Bank of India also 
accords automatic permission for 
foreign technclogy agreements 
upon a lumpsum payment of Rs. 1 
crore. S% royalty for domestic sales 
and 8% for exports, subject to Iota! 
payments of 8% of saies over a 10 
years peri:>d from date of agree-
ment or 7 years from commence-
ment of production. 

(Iv) Ail otherproposalsforforeign equny 
participation and technology agree-
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ments require clearance of the 
Govemment according to usual 
procedures. 

(v) A special empowered board 
namely; the Foreign Investment 
Promotion Board (FIBP) has also 
been constituted to invite and facili-
tate direct foreign Investment from 
international firms. The proposals 
of such firms are considered in 
totality, free from pre-determined 
parameters or procedures. 

Closure of Dealing Centres of S_B.I. 
Overseas Branches . 

9590. SHRI HANNAN MOLLAH: Will 
the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the State Bank of India 
propose to close down the Dealing Centres 
at Bombay, Madras, and New Delhi over-
seas branches and to abolish the posts of 
Dealers by replacing them with Rate Centres 
and Rate Officers; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) and (c). Do not arise. 

Transfer of PSU'. to Bank. 

9591. SHRI pANDURANG PANKLIK 
FUNDKAR: Will he Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the total amount of loan outstanding 

sell the equity of public sector undertaking to 
commercial banks to meet the redemption 
cost of Government securities maturing th is 
year; and 

(c) whether the Govemment propose to 
transfer PSUs shares to banks in exchange 
for the matured securities orsel! equ ities and 
utilise the proceeds of the sale for redemp-
tion of the securities? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI SHAN-
TARAM POTDUKHE): (a) The securities 
have a secondary market and these can also 
be transferred no only from one bank to 
another but also to LlC, Provident Funds and 
other parties. This being so, the quantum of 
repayment to commercial banks to be made 
this year cannot be precisely determined a 
this point of time. However. the total maturi-
ties which fall due for redemption to parties 
other than Reserve Bank, namely commer-
cial banks, LlC, GIC, Provident Funds etc. 
amount to Rs. 1057.97 crores. 

(b) and (c). No, Sir. Government would 
redeem the maturing loans as already pro-
vided in the Budget for 1992-93 without 
linking them to sale of shares of public sector 
undertakings. 

CUstom. and excise Outl •• Ex-
emption to Export oriented Unit. 

9592. ｓｈｾｉ＠ GOPI NATH GAJAPATHI: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleasedlo 
state: 

(a) whether 100 'per cent Export Ori-
ented Units are exempted from Payment of 
customs day and excise duty for the im-
ported and indigenous capital goods; 

with the Govemment to be redeemed to (b) whether the customs duty on 1m-
commercial banks to this year; • ported scapula goods Is lived at the time of 

(b) whether the Government propose 
debonding on the depreciated value treating 
old plant and machinery as used cars and 
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whereas the rate of depreciation is sub-
jected to over-all limit of 70 per cent only and 
not full as per the income-tax rules thus 
requiring the 100 per cen Export Oriented 
Units to pay duty on 30 per cent of CIF value 
of Imported machinery; . 

(c) whetherthe excise duty is also levied 
at the time of deboning without depreciation; 
and 

(d) if so, the steps proposed to betaken 
by the Govemment to mitigate the hardship 
being caused to 100 per cent Export Ori-
ented Units as a result thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR lliAKUR): (a) Yes Sir. 

(b) For assessment of imported capital 
goods at the time of deboning depreciation is 
the value of the goods is permitted on a 
graduated scale depending upon the period 
of use subject to a maximum depreciation of 
70% 

(c) Excise dutY is levied on the unused 
indigenous goods at the time of debonlng 
without without depreciation. 

(d) The existing concessions applicable 
to capital goods for assessment at the time 
of debondlng are considered adequate and 
no further reliefs are considered necessary. 

Trade Agreement with USA 

9593. St-iRI JITENDRA NATH DAS: 
Will the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether any trade agreement has 
been signed with U.S.A. during 1991-92 and 
the current year; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) the details of the goods proposed to 
be expOrted to and Imported from U.S.A. ? 

THE MINISTRY OF STATE OF THE 
MINiSTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) and (c). Do not arise. 

[Translation] 

Increase in Price of Cotton 

9594. SHRIJAGMEETSINGHBRAR: 
SHRI RAJVEER SINGH: 

Will the MinisterofTEXTILESbe pleased 
to state: 

(a) the balance of cotton stock at the 
end of December, 1991 in th country as per 
the last cotton season (September, 1991); 

(b) whetherthe Government have made 
any study to find out the difference in revised 
ｾｴｩｭ｡ｴ･ｳ＠ of cotton stock;· . 

(c) if so, thecomp-arativeflguresthereof; 

(d) the number of times the prices of 
cotton were increased during the last six 
month; 

(e) whether this Increase has adversely 
affected the yarn and textile Industry; 

(f) whether the Government propose to 
reduce to reduce these prices; and 

(g) If so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHlOn: (a) The Cotton Advisory Board 
(CAB) at its meeting held on 23rd December, 
1991 estimated that the opening stock of 
cotton during the 1990-91 cotton season 
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was 33.84lakh bales against Its earlier esti-
mates of 30. 79lakh bales. Consequntly the 
closing stock at the end of 1990-91 cotton 
season was estimated at 22.B4lakh bales as 
ago-inst 19.391akh bales of earlier. 

(b) and (c). The revised estimates, as 
per details in (a) above were adopted by the 
Cotton Advisory Board on the basis of a stray 
conduced by a group constituted by the 
CAB. . 

(d) The prices of cotton are determined 
by market forces which change from time to 
time resulting in I,Jpward and downward trend 
in prices. 

(e) Yes, Sir. 

(f) and (g). It has been decided to allow 
import of upto 2 lakh bales of cotton fl'ee of 
import duty by spinning mills for supplying 
hank yam to the handloom sector at prices 
12"10 lower then the invoice price on 10th 
March, 1992. This decision is having a so-
bering effect on the domestic cotton 
prices. 

Year 

1986-S7 

1987-88 

1988-89 

1989-90 

1990-91 

1991-92 

(Upto Feb'92) 

[EngHsh] . 

Deposits underlndll'll Vlku Patl'll 
scheme 

9595. SHRI SANAT KUMAR MANDAL: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(!1) the total amount deposited underthe 
Indira Vikas Patra Scheme during each year 
since its inception ill date; 

. (b) the amount, out of the above, re-
funded or withdrawn by the depositors, year-
wise. 

(c) whether the Government have made 
any appraisal as to the element of black-
money thus invested under this scheme, 
which has been converted into 'white'; and 

(d) if so, the outcome thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) and (b). Indira Vikas Patra was 
put on sale from 19.11.S6. The total amount 
deposited and that withdrawn under this 
scheme are indicated below: 

(In crores of Rs.) 

DeP9sit Withdrawal 

834.80 

1010.80 

1707.07 

2684.57 0.04 

2468.82 0.18 

1375.69 665.69 
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(c) No, Sir, Indira Vlkas Patra is not 
intended to mop up black money and does 
not provide for any immunity. 

(d) Does not arise. 

Urban Cooperative Banks 

9596. SHRI SYEDSHAHABUDDIN: Will 
the Minister of FINANCE by pleased to state: 

(a) the total number of Urban Coopera-
tive Banks in the country as on April 1, 1992, 
State-wise; 

(b) the total number of licensed branches 
of these banks, State-wise; 

(c) the total number of banks with 
branches only in the district or metropolitan 
area of operation or within the State con-
cerned with the names of such banks and 
number of their branches, State-wise; and 

(d) the total number of banks with 
branches outside the State of origin with the 
names of such banks and the number of 
such branches? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DALBtA 
SINGH): (a) and (b). There were 1401 Urban 
Cooperative Banks functioning in the coun-
try as on 1.4 .. 1992. The total number of 
branches 01 these banks as on 30.6.1991 
were 344,3. The State-wIse break up of 
Urban Cooperative Banks and their branches 
are given in statement-I attached. 

(c) and (d). Reserve Bank of India (RBI) 
. . has reported that the area of operati?n of the 

Urban Cooperative Banks is usually limitecl 
to the dist:ict of their registration and the 
branches are permitted only In their area of 
operation. However, 13 Urban Cooperative 
Banks have 21 Branches outside their State 
of origin. the names otsuch banks are giVen 
in Statement-II attached. . 

stATEMENT-I 

State-wise number of Urban Cooperative Banks and the number of brancheses of these 
banks. 

S.No. Name of States No. of Banks No. of branches 
(as on 1-4-92) (as on 30.6.91) 

1. Andhra Pradesh 66 107 

2. Assam 8 8 

3. Bihar 5 8 

4. Goa 6 40 

5. Gujarat 293 606 

6. Haryana 8 11 

7. Himachal Pradesh '., 4 4 
I. 

B. Jammu & Kashmir 3 8 
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S.No. Nams bf States • No. til Banles No. of branches 
ta on 1-4-92) (as on 30.6.91) 

9. Kamataka 215 417 

10. Kerala 59 173 

11. Madhya Pradesh 42 65 

12. Maharashtra 386 1501 

13. Manipur 5 11 

14. Meghalaya 2 2 

15. Mizoram 

16. Nagaland 

17. Orissa 14 27 

18. Punjab 6 7 

19 Rajasthan 26 53 

20. Tamil Nadu 137 190 

21. Tripura 

22. Uttar Pradesh 47 70 

23. West Bengal 48 73 

24. Delhi 17 47 

25. Pondicherry 2 3 

Total 1401 3433 
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STATEMENT-II 

Names of the Urban Cooperative Banks 
having branches/offices outside their 
State of origin/registration. 

S. No. Name of the Urban Coopera· 
tive Bank 

1 . Saraswat Cooperative Bank Ltd., 
Bombay. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

6. 

7. 

8. 

9. 

10. 

11. 

12. 

13. 

Shamrao Vithal Cooperative 
Bank ltd., Bombay. 

Bombay Mercantile CooperatiVe 
Bank Ltd., Bombay 

Development Cooperative Bank 
Ltd., Bombay 

Jain Sahakari Bank Ltd., Bom-
bay. 

Madhavpura Mercantile Coop-
erative Bank, Ahmedabad. 

Cooperative Bank of Ahmedabad 
ltd., Ahmedabad. 

Ahmedabad Mercantile' Coop-
erative Bank Ltd. ａｾ｡｢｡､Ｎ＠

Eastern North East Frontier Rail-
way Cooperative Bank Ltd., 
Culcatta. 

ｅ｡ｳｴｾｲｮ＠ Railway Engineering 
Cooperative Bank Ltd., Culcatta. 

State Bank of India Staff Asso-
ciation Cooperative Society Ltd., 
Calcutta. 

Andhra Bank Employees Coop-
erative Bank Ltd., Hyderabad. 

North Eastern Railway Employ-
ees Primary Cooperative Bank 
ltd .. Gorkhpur. 

Investment by Financial Institutions In 
U.P. 

9597. SHRI V. N. SHARMA: Will the 
Minister of FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the amount depOSited in Uttar 
Pradesh in small savings schemes, Life 
Insurance Corporation of India, Unit Trust of 
India, Nationalised Banks and other deposit 
schemes during each of the last three year 
and upto March, 31, 1992; 

(b) the amount invested in various 
schemes Uttar Pradesh out of the deposits; 

(c) whether the Govemment propose to 
invest three-fourth of the deposits only on 
the development projects of the State; 
and 

(d) if not, the reasons therefor. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE .(SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) to Cd). Information is being col-
lected and will be laid on the table of the 
house. 

[ Translation] 

Safety Audit of Defence Organisations 

9598. SHRI GOVIND RAO NIKAM: Will 
the Minister of DEFENCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the Government are formu-
lating a scheme for the safety audit of de-
fence organisation; and 

(b) if SQ, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE {SHRI 
SHARAD PAWAR): (a) and (b). Safety Andit 
Inspection of major defence establishments 
handing explosives/ammunition is allBady 
being carried out to ensure the required 
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safety of personnel and amet! Infrastructure. 

[£ngOsh) 

OVerdraft by Government of Bihar 

9599. SHRI RAM NAIK: Will the Minis-
ter of FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the amount of overdraft by the Gov-
emment of Bihar in its accounts with the 
Aeserve Bank of India for every week during 
the moths of February and March, 1992; 

(b) whether the reserve Bank of India 

Month From To 

found out the Reasons for such overdraft; 

(c) if so, the details thereof; 

(d) the advic8, If any, tendered by the 
Aeserve Bank of India to the Govemment of 
Bihar to check overdraft? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHAI SHAN-
TAAAM POTDUKHE): (a) Government of 
Bihar was in overdraft with the R. B. I. on five 
occasions during the months of February 
and March, 1992 as indicated below: 

No. of consecutive Maximum 
working days overdraft 

(Rs. crores) 

February, 1992 22.2.92 28.2.92 4 144.75 

March,1992 3.3.92 9.3.92 6 237.28 

11.3.92 16.3.92 4 146.17 

20.3.92 25.3.92 5 82.38 

27.3.92 30.3.92 3 106.62 

The overdrafts on all he above occa-
sions were deared by the State Government 
within the time frame stipulated under the 
Overdraft Regulation Scheme. 

(b) and (c). Government of Bihar has 
been sanctioned limited of As. 39.20 crores 
am:! As. 14 crores for normal and special • 
Ways and Means advance respectively. State 
Govemment emerge in overdraft with Ae-
serve Bank of India as a result of their 
payments exceeding receipts beyond the 
sanctioned limits of Ways and Means ad-
vance. 

(d) Reserve Bank of Ind18 cautions the 

State Government as soon as its availing of 
ways and means advance exceeds 75% of 
the aggregate limit and advise the concerned 
State Government to take corredive steps to 
redify the imbalance so that the State Gov-
ernment should not emerge in overdraft, 

Under the overdraft regulation scheme 
currently in force, the State Governments 
are not allowed to remain In overdraft with 
tlfe A. B. I. for more than seven consecutive 
working days. "the overdraft persists on the 
eighth consecutive working day the Bank 
has been authorised to suspend payments 
on behaH of the State Government till the 
overdraft ｉｾ＠ cleared. As the overdrafts In 
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question were cleared by the Government of 
Bihar within the stipulated time frame, the 
question of suspending the payment did not 
arise. 

Income Tex and Excl .. Duty Outstand-
Ing Against Multl-Nstlonal Companle. 

9600. SHRI MOHAN RAW;6.LE: Will the 
Minister of FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether huge amount of Income tax 
and excise duty is Outstanding against vari- . 
ous multi-national companies operating in 
India; 

(b) if so, the names of such mulit-
national companies and the. amount out-
standing against each of these companies 
and since wheQ; 

(c) the reasons for which the amount 
due has not been recovered so far; and 

(d) the measures taken to recover the 
outstanding dues from these companies? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN Tl"fE 
MINISTRY OF FltlANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): tal to (d). As there is no 
clear uniVersally accepted definition of the 
term 'multi-national', it Is not polisible forthls 
Ministry to furnish the information sought for 
in the Question. However, if the Hon'ble 
Merrbel' is interested in information about 
any particular company or companies, the 
same can be collected and fumished. 

It may be mentioned that most of the 
outstanding excise duty demands are linked 
with Court cases and the Collectors of Cen-
tral Excise have been advised to ｭｯｮｾｯｲ＠
personally important Court cases and take 
appropriate steps for their expeditious dis-
posal. Similarty, recovery action in all cases 
of large outstanding income-tax demands Is 

periodically monitored at level of Commis-
sioner of Income-tax and above. 

[ Translation] 

Subsidy Provided to State for Janata 
Cloth 

9601. SHRI DAU DAYAL JOSHI: Will 
the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 

Ca) the amount of subsidy provided to 
the State Governments for janata cloth dur-
ing each of the lastthree years, district -wise; 

(b) the number of weavers and coop-
erative societies benefited thereby and 
whethe r is Central of State agency to review 
their working; and 

(c) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF MINIS-
TJ;lY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) Under the Janata Cloth 
Scheme, Central subsidy Is released State-
wise and not district-wise. The State Gov-
ernments for janata cloth production during 
thE' past three years are giVen in the en-
closed statement. 

. (b) & (c). Approximately three lakh 
weavers are benefited by the Janata Cloth 
Scheme. In all 46 handloom weavers ApeX} 
Regional Cooperative Societies and Corpo-
rations spread In as many as 19 State and 
one Union Territory are currently Implement-
ing the scheme. The scheme is governed by 
a comprehensiVe set of quldellnes Issued by 
the Central Govemment. The Directors-in-
carge of Handlooms In each implementing 
State are the nodal agencies responsible for 
Its effectiVe implementation and the State 
Level Implementation Committee function-
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ing under the Chairmanship of Chief Secra-
taryISecretary-ln-charge of Handlooms with 
members drawn from Department of Civil 
Supplies, Non-GovemmeOl organisations, 
consumerreprasentatives and other experts 

etc., carry out number of functions Including 
monitoring the performance of production 
and distribution arrangements in their re-
spective States. 
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Vacent ｐｯｾｳ＠ of Solicitor Genel'lll of 
Indl. 

9502. SHRI N. J. RATHVA: Will the 
Minister of ｾｗＬ＠ ｊｕｾｔｉｃ＠ AND COMPANY 
AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) since when the post of SOlicitor 
General of India is lying vacant; 

(b) the reasons for delay in filling up this 
post: and 

{c)thetime by which it is likely to be filed 
up? 

THE MINISTER OF LAW, JUSTICE 
AND COMPANY AFFAIRS {SHRI K. VUAYA 
BHASKARA REDDY: (a) to (c). the post of 
Solicitor General of India is not lying vacant. 
Shri Dpankar Prasad Gupta has been ap-
pointed as Solicitor General of India with 
effect from 7 April, 1992. 

[English] 

Isaue of Secured Premium Note. by 
TIsco 

9603. SHRI GEORGE 'FERNANDES: 
Will the Minister of LAW, JUSTIC AND 
COMPANY AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) whether Tata Iron and Steel. Com-
pany Limited (TISCO) have proposed to 
issue Secured Premium Notes (SPNs) worth 
Rs. ＳｾＰ＠ crore to its shareholders; 

(b) if so, the whether the Central board 
of DirectTaxes; Controller of Capital Issues 
and the Department of Company Affairs 
have opposed the proposal: and 

(c) If so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 

MINISTRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COM- .. 
PANY AFFAIRS (SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): (a) to (c). The 

. Controller of Capital Issues has given his 
eOl1$ent on 31.3.1992 to MIs. TATA IRON 
AND STEEL COMPANY LIMITED (TISCO) 
for issue of capital of the value of Rs. 443 
erores (nominal value) which includes issue 
of Secured Premium ｾｯｴ･ｳ＠ (SPNs) of Rs. 
300/- each with attached equity warrants for 
cash at par to their existing shareholders, for 
a total value of Rs. 330 erores. The proposal 
was not opposed by Department of Com-
pany Affairs. Central Board of Direct Texes 
have informed that as approval of CBDT 
under Direct Tax Laws is not required, the 
question of approving the proposal does not 
arise. 

[Translation] 

Export of Fruits 

9604. SHRI BHUWAN CHANDRA 
KHANDURI: Will the Ministerof COMMERCE 
be pleased to state: 

(a) the names of the fruits exported by 
India; 

(b) whether the Government have for-
mulated any scheme to encourage the ーｲｯｾ＠
ducers offruits in hilly areas_ ()fUttCir-Pradesh 
and Himachal Pradesh for promoting their 
export; 

(c) If so, the details thereof; and 

(d) If not, the reasons therefor? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MAN ｋｈｕｾｓｈｅｅｄＩＺ＠ (a) The main fruits 
exported from India are Mangoes, Grapes, 
Porryegranate, Chickoo, Cutard Apples, Bar. 
Citrus Fruits, Banana, etc. 

(b) to (d). While there are no specifIC 
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schemes for promoting exports of fru its from 
hilly areas of Uttar Pradesh and Himachal 
Pradesh, Agricultural & Processed Food 
Products Export Development Authority 
(APEDA) has a number of schemes to offer 
for development of exports which can be 
availed of by the exporters, growers, etc., 
including those from hilly areas of Uttar 
Pradesh and Himachal Pradesh. 

[Eng/ish] 

Export Targets 

9605. SHRI MANIKRAO HODl YA 
GAVIT: Will the r..iinisterof COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the export targets fixed during each 
of the last three years; 

(Q) whether the targets were achieved; 

(c) if not, the reasons therefor; and 

(d) the targets for exports fixed for the 
current year and the steps taken to achieve 
them? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) to (c). The export tar-
gets fixed for the year 1989-90 and 1990-91 
were As. 28000 crores and Rs. 36000 crores 
respectively. No export target for the year 
1991-92 was set. The export performance 
for the years 1989-90, 1990-91 and April-
February 1991-92 was Rs. 27681 crores, 
As. 32553 crores and Rs. 38930 crores 
respectively. the shortfall in achievement of 
export target set for 1989-90 was marginal. 
However there was substantial shortfall in 
achievement of the export target set for 
1990-91, which was due to slow down in the 
wortd economy, gUH crls is, recession In 
global diamond trade and tightening in im-
port licensing regime dU8'to critical balance 
Of payments situation, etc. 

(d) No export target has been set so far 
forthe current financial year 1992-93. How-
ever, with a view to enhance our exports 
several changes in trade policy were intro-
duced sine July 1991 aimed at strengthen-
ing export incentives, eliminating a substan-
tial volume of import licensing and rationalis-
Tng the import tariff structure. In the Budget 
for 1992193, rupee was made partially con-
vertible to encourage generation of foreign 
exchange and compress imports through 
the price mechanism by making them dearer. 
These have been further consolidated in the 
new Export-Import Policy announced on 31 st 
March 1992, which inter alia, aims to pro-
mote the productivity, modernisation and 
competitiveness of India industry andthereby 
to enhance its export capabilities. Besides, 
the Government has taken other steps which 
include reducing controls through licensing, 
simplification of procedures for export, act iv-
isation of Board of Trade, bilateral discus-
sions with select countries, interaction with 
national orgahisation of Trade and Industry, 
etc. 

[ Translation] 

Two-Way Traffic G. T. Road 

9606. SHRI VISHWANATH SHASTRI: 
WilHhe Minister of SURFACE TRANSPORT 
be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Government propose to 
convert one·way traffic Into two-way traffic 
on Grand Trunk Road (G. T. Road) with a 
view to facilitate smooth traffic movement on 
this road; and 

(b) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRIJAGDISH TYTLER); (a> and (b). Yes, 
Sir. Widening of G. T. Road (N. H. No.1) 
from two lense to four lanes Is being under-
taken progressively between Delhi and Jal-
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andhar. Four-landing has already been 
completed In 144 kms length and Is In prog-
ress In another 112.5 kms. Four landing in 
the balance length of 115.50 kms, from Ker)'lal 
(in Haryana) to Sirhlnd (in Punjab), is in-
cluded in 1992-93 Annual Programme for 
sanction. 

[English] 

Revltallsatlon of Tea Gardens 

9607. SHRIMATI VASUNDHARA 
RAJE: Wi" the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) ｾｨ･＠ details ｾｦ＠ the tea gardens in the 

Age group 

Below 20 years 

21 to 40 years 

41 to 50 years 

Above 50 years 

(b) to (d). The Tea Board has been 
operating various developmental schemes 
for increasing tea production and productiv-
ity. These schemes provide for long-term 
loan, subsidy and grantS-in-aid for the pur-

Name of the scheme 

Replantation Subsidy Scheme 

Rejuvenation and In f"ling 
Subsidy Scheme. 

country where the life span of the bushes 
have been either over or half crossed; 

(b) whether the Government propose to 
plant new bushe in these tea gardens there-
for; and 

(c) if so, the reasons thereforrand 
(d) the details of the steps taken to 

revitalise these tea gardens so as to in-
crease tea production in due course oftime? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF HE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) The optimum age of a 
tea bush vary between 40-50 years. The age 
profile of the existing tea area in ｴｨｾ＠ country 
is as follows: 

Percentage of the 
area under tea 

·25.50 

23.66 

8.06 

42}8 

pose. of new planting, replanting, reJuvena-
tion and inflllig creation of irrigation facilities, 
procurement of processing machineries, etc. 
The present scale of financing of some of the 
subsidy schemes are as fo"ows:-

Ra of sUtlsidy (per hectare) 

(a) Rs. 10,4001- for plains gardens 

(b) Rs. 12,4000/-forguardians in 
hills other the Darjeeling. 

(c) Rs. 15,000/- fo Oarjeeling gardens. 

(a)' Rs. 3,000/- per ha for pruning and 
Infilling. 
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Name of the scheme 

Realisation of Export Potentials 

9608. SHRIMATI VASUNDHRA RAJE: 
Will the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) the main reasons for not realiSing the 
export potentials of the country as per the 
World Bank report 'Global economic pros-
pects and the developing countries: 

(b) the reaction of the Government 
thereto; and 

(c) the steps proposed to be taken by 
the Govemment to fully realise the country's 
export potentials? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) the World Bank Re-
port entitled "Global Economic Prospects 
and the Developing Countrles, 1992" Is the 
second edition in annual serious of staff 
report analysing the global economic pros-
pects for development. H focuses on the 
main international. economic linkages, with 
an emphasis on developing countries. Ac-
cording to the Report. the key international 
variables offer a mixed outlook for develop-
Ing countries, but improved policies in devel-
oping countries themselves hold out the 
promise of highergrowth. The Report further 
stated that the export performance of devel-
oping countries wold depend on reduction of 
trade barriers in the high income economies. 
on improved growth in the Industrial coun-
tries and the ability of developing countries 
to strengthen international links to exploit 
opportunities in our invreasingly Integrated 

Ra of subsidy (per hectare) 

(b) Rs. 4,000/- per ha for pruning, 
infilling and inter rao planting. 

and competitive global business. environ-
ment. With specific reference t'o India. the 
Report imentloned that "Ind!a is expected to 
continue its reform efforts. and restore growth 
momentum inthe latter half olthe decade for 
an average growth rate of nearly 5 percent a 
yea". 

(b) The World Bank Report is based on 
certain assumptions about global conditions 
and domestic economic policies ofthecoun-
tries world over. The factors mentioned in 
the World Bank Report in respect of growth 
of exports from developing countries con-
form to the independent assessment of the 
Government in respect of global trading 
environment. 

(c) Several changes in Trode policy 
were Introduced Sine July 1991 aimed at 
srengthening export incentives, elimicating 
a substantial vOlume'of import licensing and 
rationalislng the import tariff structure. In the 
Budget for 1992-93, rupee was made par-
tially convertible to encourage generation of 
foreign exchange and compress Imports 
through the price mechanism by marking 
them dearer. These have been further con· 
solidated in the new Export-Import Policy 
announced on 31st March 1992. Which, In-
ter-alia, aims to promote the productivity, . 
modernisation and competitiveness of In-
dian industry and thereby to enhance Its 
export capabilities. Besides, the Govern-
ment has taken other steps which, Include 
reducing controls through licensing, slmpllll-
cation of procedures for export. actlvlsation 
of the Board of Trade, bilateral discussions 
with select countries, Interaction with na-
tional organisation oftrade and industry. etc. 
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Coff .. Production In North-Eaatem 
Region 

9609. SHRI UDDHAB BARMAN: Will 
the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the production of coffee in 
. the North-Eastern region has been encour· 
aging; and 

(b) if so, the steps taken or proposed to 
be taken by the Coffee Board to further 
expand the coffee cultivation In that region? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) The production of 
coffee in North-Eastem region has been 
only marginal. The total area estimated to be 
under coffee in North-Eastem region is not 
more than 8000 hectares located in all the 7 
North-Estern States. From these area under 
coffee, the production coming into the coffee 
pool has been negligible so far. This has 
been due to sever?i reasons pertaining tp 
organisational, k.':lnical and other con· 
straints. 

(b) In view of the present surplus global 
coffee stocks of coffee, the Coffee Board is 
not proposing any special scheme to bring 
more areas under coffee. However, several 
steps are being taken by the Board to con-
solidate the existing areas in the North-
Eastem States in order to improve their 
productivity atleast to reasonably minimum 
standards. These steps include provision of 
research, extension and other technical 
support as well as financial support to the 
agencies Involved in coffee cultivation In the 
North-Eastem States as well as Individual 
tribal growers. 

Sal. of Coff .. by Board 

9610. SHRI MAHESH KANODIA: 
SHRI BALRAJ PASSI: 

Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) Whether some quantity of coffee was 
sold by the Coffee Board during 1991-92; 
without auction at the price lower than the 
prevailing price in the open mat1<et; 

(b) ffso, thedetallslhereof and the price 
of the coffee so sold; per tonne; and 

{c) the action taken or proposed to be 
taken by the Government in _ this regard 
against the persons found guilty? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) to (c). The Coffee 
Board is selling coffee through export auc-
tion and internal auction. In the case of 
internal auctions, coffee are sold with re-
serve prices based on the minimum release 
price fixed from time 10 time and are not sold 
below the minimum release price. A limited 
allotment to local sale dealers and coopera-
tive Institutions at lower prices have been 
continuing for many years and limited quan-
tities only were being allotted. The Coffee 
Board r: J, however, decided in January 
1992 to allow coffee to Departmental Pool 
Sales Depots for selling to local sales-deal-
ers and cooperative societies at the average 
intemal auction prices plus 10% prises. In 
respect oltha cooperative societies, 5% and 
2,112% discount was allowed in nonradi-
tional and traditional areas respectively. 
There is, however, a stay from he Hon'ble 
High Court of Tamil Nadu against the Order 
of the Coffee Board to charge 10% over and 
above the auction prices to local sales deal-
ers of all States. 

Coffees are also sold through Promo-
tion Departmentfo the Coffee Board at pres-
ent a overall average prices plus Rs. 5.'-per 
kg. from January 1992 onwards. Earlier, the 
selling prices through the Coffee Board's 
Promotion Department outlets was at MRP 
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plus 5% overhead charges. 

Institutional Loan Agriculture 

9611. PROF. UMAAEDDYVENKATES-
WAALU: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the amount of per-hectare instltu-
tlonalloan loan extended to agriculture sector 
during 1989-90, 1990-91 and 1991 -92; 

(b) ｷｨ･ｴｨ･ｲｴｾ･＠ per-hectare institutional 
loan has not increased for compensating the 
hike in inputs in agriculture, sector during the 
recent past; 

(c) if so, the reasons therefor; and 

(d) the steps taken by the Govemment 
to . increase institutional loan facilities to 
agriculture? 

THE MINISTEA OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHAI DALBIA 
SINGH): (a) Aeserve Bank of India (ABI) 
have' reported that their "nformational sys-
tem does not generate per-hectare bank 
loans disbUrsed. The total amount of loans 
disbursed towards direct finance to farmers 
by commercial banks during the last three 
years ended June 1988 and 1 990 (latest 
available) were as follows: 

(As. in crores) 

June 1988 2,945 

June 1989 3,187 

June 1990 3,530 

(b) and (cl. Under the production ori-
ented system of lending, a technical group is 
constituted for each state/district which fixed 
the scale of finance based on the changes in 
ｴｨｩＧＭｰｲｩ｣･ｳＬｉ･ｾＱ＠ of inputs, cost of cultivation, 
etc. The scale of finance is reviewed annu-

ally, and there is a built-in system In the 
institutional credit machinery to take care of 
increase in prices, inputs, etc. 

(d) As as step towards increasing bank 
credit to agriculture a separate target has 
been fixed for agriculture. Bank ar.e required 
to actain a level of 1 8% oftheirtotal advance 
as direct finance to agriculture (including 
allied activities). Further banks were also 
instructed to provide 25 per cent of their 
priority sector advances or 10 per cent or 
that bank credit to weaker sections compris-
ing small and marginal farmers, tenant farm-
ers' share croppers, agricultural labourers, 
rural artisans, etc. In addition a number of 
steps have been taken with a view of in-
creasing the flow of credit to farmers, par-
ticularly small and marginal farmers. the 
important ones are: 

1. The interst on crop loans upto As. 
7,500/- is kept low at 11.5% p. a. 

2. The interest rate for any invest-
ment credit availed of by small and 
marginal farmers upto As. 7,500/-
is 11.5% p. a. only. 

3. In the case of crop loans availed of 
by small and marginal farmers, the 
interest debited is notto exceed the 
principal amount. 

4. In the case of crop failure, amount 
due should be rescheduled over a 
period of 3 to 5 years and fresh 
loans should be given to farmers. 

5. No third party guarantee or collat-
eral security is to be insisted upon 
for loans upto As. 10,000/-. 

6. There should be no compounding 
of interest on curent dues in agri-
culture sector. 

7. Delegation of appropriate sanction-
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ing powers to the rural Branch 
Managers so that majority of loan 
applications are santti9ned at 
branch level itself. 

Setting up of Institute of Plantation· 
Management In Kemla 

9612. PROF. K. V. THOMAS: Will the 
Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Government of Kerala 
have requested the Union Government for 
setting up of a Institute of Plantation Man-
agement in the State and have also offered 
land of the proposed Institute; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) the action taken by the Union Gov-
ernment in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) to (c). There was a 
request from the Government of Kerala for 
setting up the proposed Institute of Planta-
tion Management in the State. The Govem-
ment of Kerala has also offered all neces-
sary assistance for this purpose. However, 
the Institute is to be set up the Plantation 
Industry and not by the Government. The 
body identified by the Industry for coordi-
nating all the activities regarctlng setting up 
of the Plantation Management Institutewouid 
decide on the location of the Institute after 
taking into account all the relevant factors in 
the matter. 

Export of Iron 0 ... 

9613. SHRI R. SUR ENDER REDDY: 
Will the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether the Union Government 
propose to Introduce a fresh policy on iron 
are exports; 

(b) if so, the salient features of the 
policy; 

(c) whether the Government have also 
decided to ban the export of high grade 
Bailadilla iron ores; 

(d) if so, the manner in which Govern-
ment propose to honour the export commit-
ment with Japan; and 

(e) the amount offoreign exchange likely 
to be lost by the country is iron ore is not 
exported to Japan? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
'MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) and (b). As per the 
Exim Policy for 1992-97, export of iron are 
except iron ore of Goan and Radi origin and 
iron oreconcentrates and pellets produced 
by KIOC is canalised through MMTC. Iroil 
are on Goan origin when exported to ｊ｡ｾｮＮ＠
Taiwan, South Korea; china and Europe and 
of Redi origin to all destinations, is allowed 
directly subject to registration of constricts 
with Goa Mineral Ore Exporters Association. 
KIOCl is allowed to export its products, 
namely, iron are concentrates and pellets 
directly. 

(c) and (d). Government has deCided 
the commitments already made are allOWed 
to be honoured. 

(e) Iron are worth aboU1 Rs. 839 era res 
is estimated to have been exported to Japan 
during 1991-92. 

[ Translation] 

Export of Iron 0 ... 

9614. SHRI NITISH KUMAR: 
SHRI. MOHAMMAD All 

ASHRAF FATMI: 
DR. MAHADEEPAK SINGH 

SHAKYA: 
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Will the Minister of COMMERCE be . MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
pleased to state: ｃｈｉｄｾｂａｒａｍＩＺ＠ (a) and (b). As per Exlm 

(a) whetherthe Government propose to 
control the export of high grade Iron-ore in 
future; 

(b) If no, the reasons therefore; 

(cl whether the reserves of iron ore are 
in abundance in the country and if so, the 
total quantity assessed thereof; 

(d) the annual production of iron-ore in 
the country during the last three years and 
the export made out of total production; 

(e) the amount of foreign exchange 
earned therefrom; and 

(f) the average percentage of high grade 
iron-ore exported during the above period? 

THE MINISTEA OF STATE OF THE 

Year Production 
(In MTs) 

1989-90 55.4 

1990-91 54.8 

1991-92 39.5 
(April-Dec. 91 1 

(f) The average percentage of high grade 
iron ore exported during the !at three ve-r 
was as under:-

1989-90 

1990-91 

1991-92 
(ProvIs1on8t) 

16.27% 

15.57% 

14.51% 

policy 1992-97, export of Iron ore except Iron 
ore of Goa" and Aedl origin and Iron ore 
concentratep and pellets produced by NIOCL 
is canalised thi'o 'MMYC. Iron ore of Goan 
origin when exported to Japan, Taiwan, South 
Korea, China and Europe and of Aedl origin 
to all destinations, is allowed directly subject 
to registration of contracts with Goa Mineral 
Ore Exporters Association. KIOCL is allowed 
to export Its products, namely, iron concen· 
trates and pellets directly. 

(c) Aecoverable reserves of iron ore as 
on 1 .1 .1985 (both hematite ore and magnet-
ite ore) are estimated at 11,976.62 million 
tonnes. 

(d) and (e). Production and exports of 
iron andthe amountforeign exChange eamed 
therefrom during the last three years are 
estimated to have been' as under:-

Exports Value) 
(inMTs) (in As. crore) 

35.56 927.56 

32.49 1,049.13 

21.05 1,032.22 

[English) 

ｾｵ･ｴｬｯｮ＠ of Picture TubM by an 

9615. SHAI SANDIPAN BHAGWAN 
THORAT: WHI the Minister of DEFENCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the total production of picture tubes 
In Sharat Electronics Limited during the last 
three years vis-a-vis total production In tM,> 
country and Imports; 
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(b) the details of guidelines for distribu-
tion of picture tubes by BEL and precautions 
taken to ensure fair utilisation of picture 
tubes among small scale and other manu-
facturers of TV in the country; 

(c) the details of steps taken for equi-
table distribution of picture tubes among 
small-scale units; 

(d) whether the BEL has taken or pro-
pose to take steps for effective invoivement 

Year Production by BEL 

1989 6.4 

1990 5.8 

1991 4.4 

BEL has not imported any picture tubes. 

(b) and (c); Bulk of the Black & White 
picture tubes from BEL are directly supplied 
to the Original Equipment Manufacturers 
{OEM). Small quantities for replacement are· 
marketed through BEL's Regional Market-
Ing Centres. Cumtntly, due to the excess 
production capacity In the country, there is 
not problem of availability of tubes. 

:: (d)llnd (e). Small scale units have been 
established for the manufacture of cath-
odes, heaters & stem required for TV picture 
tubes. Complete requirement of BEL is met 
by the production from these units. 

[ Translation) 

Pen.lon of Fam"'" of Soldiers Killed 
In Opellltion Blue Star 

9616. SHRI RAM TAHAL CH-
OUDHARV: Will the Minister of DEFENCE 
be pleased to state: 

of smail scale units In the production of 
electronic goods orequipment of prescribed 
standards; and 

(e) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHRI 
SHARAD PAWAR): <a) Bharat Electronics 
limited (BEL) manufactures Biack & White 
picture tubes. The production of these tubes 
by BEL vis-a-vis total production in the coun-
try during the last three years is as under:-

TOlal production In 
thecounlry 

(in lakh) 

45.7 

38.5 

3.4.2 

(a) the total number of soldiers killed in 
the Operation Blue Star; 

(b) whether these Is any provision to 
grant pension to the families of the soldiers 
killed in this operation; and 

(c) the number of the dependents of 
deceased soldiers who have b8en provided 
with a pension on the basis of the last pay 
drawn? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHRI 
SHARADPAWAR): (a) The Total number of 
Army personnei killed In the Operation Blue 
State Is 134. 

(b) Yes, Sir 

(c) In 13P cdses the dependents of 
deceased Army personnel have been pro-
vided with a penSion equal to the last pay 

. drawn. There officers, being bachelors, their 
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parents have been given Dependent's Pen-
sion at 2J3 the last pay drawn. In one case 
the family of the deceased has been given 
Special Family Pension. 

[English] 

capital Owned Abroad by Indians 

9617. SHRI ARJUN CHARAN SETHI: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) the Total quantum of capital owned 
abroad by Indian citizens as per information 
available with the Reserve Bank of India/the 
Govemment; 

(b) the particulars of top twenty persons 
amongst them; 

(c) the quantum of property owned in 
foreign countries by exrulers of India 
alongwith their names and also the names of 
the respective countries where they own the 
property; 

(d) the particu lars oftop twenty industri-
alists who have sent theiJ capital abrad 
through proper declarations; and 

(e) the details about the quantum of 
personal capital and company's capital held 
abroad by them? 

THE ｍｉｾｉｓｔｅｒ＠ OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) to (e) Attempts are 
being made to collect the requisite informa-
tion from the concerned Agencies. 

[Translation] 

Treaties and f\. ,r,,;; with Gulf Coun-
"18S 

961S. SHP j MOHAMMAD AU ASHAF 
FA TMI: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 

pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Minister of State In his 
Ministry visited the Gulf countries recently; 

(b) if so, the names of the projects In 
respect of which treaties and accords were 
signed during the visit; and 

(c) the progress made so far In if1llle-
mentation of these projects? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) Yes, Sir. The Mlnlsterof 
State (Revenue) visited Oman and United 

. Arab Emirates. 

(b) No treaty or accord was signed during 
the visit. The visit was aimed at promoting 
the Foreign Remittances Scheme and the 
India Development Bond Scheme, 1991 
among non-restident Intlians living in the 
above mentioned countries. 

(cl Excellent progress was made in 
mobilising foreign exchange remittances in 
these two countries as a result of the visit. 
0111 of the $362.84 million worth of India 
Development Bonds ($ series) purchased 
throughout the Middle East, $273.24 mil-
lions were mobilised wom the United Arab 
Emirates and Oman. 

Import of Gold 

9619, KUMAR I UMA BHARTI: Will the 
ｾｩｮｩｳｴ･ｲ＠ of FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the quantity of gold imported during 
1990-91 ; • 

(b) whether It was supplied to the gold-
smiths in time for making omaments during 
the above period; 

(c) if so, the details thereof; and 



221 Wrlrten Answers VAISAKHA 18, 1914 (SAKA) Written Answers 222 

(d) If not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) Till the introduction of 
the scheme recently for import of gold by 

S.B.I. M.M.T.C. 

5204 900 

(b) *O(d). The gold imported during 
the above period was supplied to eligible 
units foexportproduction in accordance with 
the Schemes for Export of Gold and Silver 
Jewellery and Articles, notified by the Gov-
ernment. 

[English) 

Production of Hank Yarn by Mills 

9620. SHRI BOLLA BULLI RAMAIAH: 
Will the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whethertheGovernment propose to 
issue statutory direction that Mills must pro· 
duce hank yarn to the extent of 50 per cent 
of their marketable yarn; 

(b) If so. the details thereof; and 

(c) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a),,* (b). Government has 
already issued notification imposing Hank 
Yarn obligation on any producer of yard to 
pack not less then 50% of the total yam 
packed for Civil consumption in hank from 
and to produce 800/0 thereof in counts 40s 
and below. 

(c) Does not arise. 

NRls and returning Indians, no import of gold 
was being allowed except for export produc-
tion. The quantity of gold imported by SBI, 
MMTC and HHEC for this purpose during 
1990·91 is given below: 

(In Kgs.) 

H. H. E. C. 

957 

Nabard's Assistance to Mills In Tamil 
Nadu 

9621. SHRI C. SREENIVAASAN: Will 
the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the National Bank for Agri-
culture and Rural Development (NABARD) 
has decided to advance funds for coopera-
tive and public sector mills in Tamil Nadu 
which are facing severe liquidity crunch; and 

(b) if so, the details of such mills? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) National Bank for Agriculture 
and Rural Development (NABARD) has 
reported that it has no proposal to advance 
funds for any co-operative or public sector 
mills in Tamil Nadu facing severa liquidity 
crunch. 

(b) Does 1'10t arise in view of (a}above. 

Llberallsatlon of ｇｯｾ＠ Policy 

9622. SHRI M. V. CHAN-
DRASHEKARA MUR-
THY: 

SHRI AAJUN SINGH SETHI: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased 

to state: 
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(a) whethernewgold polICy hasevolced the Minister of SURFACE TRANSPORT be 
little Interest among Non-resident Indians pleased to state: 
especially In the Gulf countries to send gold 
to India; 

(b) if so, the reasons therefor; and 

(c) the stepa taken by the Government 
to further Ilberalise Its gold policy ? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN TJ-fE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) The latest trends in 
imports underthe scheme do not sUpport the 
view !hat the scheme has has evoked little 
interest among non-resident Indians. 

(b) Does not arise. 

(c) As a measure of liberalisation, the 
import duty on gold to be Imported underthe ' 
new gold policy was reduced from Rs. 540 
per 10 grams to Rs. 220 per 10 grams on 
30.4.1992. 

S. T. A. Permit. under D. T. C. 0pera-
tIon 

9623. SHRI JEEWAN SHARMA: Will 

No. of PermIts Issued. 

9 

8 

5 

11 

29 

27 

Total 88 

(a) the number of State Transport Au-
thority permits granted to private bus opera-
t018 to run their buses In Deihl during each 
month of the last twelve months and the 
procedure adopte In granting luch permits; 

(b) whether State Transport Authority 
has issued these permits without calling for 
applications from the general publk:; 

(c) If so, the reasOns therefor; 

(d) whetherthe S. T. A. has also Issued 
permits to some of the people who had 
applied under the scheme of issue of 3000 
permits; and 

(e) If so, the details thereof and the 
reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRIJAGDISH TYTlER): (a)to (c). The S. 
T. S. A., DeIhl Administration granted 88 per-
mits during the last 12 months May, 1991 to 
AprIl, 1992. The detaHs are as under:-

Months of Issue 

Sept. 1991. 

0cl1991. 

0ec.1991. 

Jan. 1992 

t=.b.1. 

MaJch.1992 

AprIl, 1992. 
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Normally, applications are invltedtrom 
the Public. The applications are scrutinised 
and If there are more eligible applicants than 
the number of permits available, then the 
selection is made by draw of lots. 

Except 33 permits given to ex-service-
men, on a reconsideration of their case 
ordered by the STA tribunal, all other permits 
have been issued, after public notice in 
newspapers. 

(d) No, Sir. 
(e> Dose not arise. 

Export Orde,. Received by Coff .. 
Board 

9624. SHRI K. PRADHANI: Will the 

Ministerof COMMERCE be pleased to slate: 

(a) the number and value of orders for 
export of coffee received by the Coffee Board 
during 1990 and 1991 ; 

(b) whether all these orders have been 
fulfilled; and 

(c) If not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINJSTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) The abstract of year-
wise quantity contracted, the actual quantity 
exported and the value realised are fur-
nished in the table hereunder:-
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(b) and (c). As against the quantity 
contracted entered inlo with the erstwhile 
USSRfor1990forexportofSO,OOOtonnesof 
green coffee and 5000 tonnes of instant 
coffee, only a quaintly of 40,000 tonnes of 
green coffee and SOOO lonnes of instant 
coffee was exported to the country during 
the fiscal year 1990-91. The shortfall· of 
export of 10,000 tonnes of green coffee In 
1990-91 was on account of the very poor 
crop of 1,17,000 tonnes in 1989-90 which 
was available for sale In1990. However, this 
quantity of 10,000 tonnes of green coffee 
was subsequently exported to erstwhile 
USSR of 1990'-91. 

Regardingthecontortfor1991, the entire 
quantity of 30,000 tonnes of firm contracts 
was explorted to erstwhile USSR during the 
fiscal year 1991-92. Butthe optional quantity 
of 10,000 tonnes of green coffee was not 
exported. 

As regards instant coffee, owing to the 
rea$ons that the buyers could not obtain the 
import licence for import of the contracted 
quantity of 4000 tonnes until November 1991. 
only a quantity of 676 tonnes of instant 
coffee could be expoted during the fiscal 
year 1991-92. However, in view ofthe short-
fall in exports of instant coffee an additional 
quantity of 3250 tonnes of green coffee was 
exported to erstwhile USSR making !he total 

quantity of raw coffee exports amounting to 
33,2SO tonnes in 1991-92. 

Mahlla Banks 

9625. DR. SHRIMATI K. S. SOUNDA-
RAM: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the names of the places where Mahila 
Banks are functioning at present, State-wise; 
and 

(b) the names of' places where the 
Govemment prop()se to open more such 
banks, State-wjse? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) As on 30.4.1992, Ｓｾ＠ Mahila 
Banks, which are Urban Cooperative Banks, 
were functioning in the country. The names 
()f these mahila Banks State-wiselDistrictWlSe 
are given in the Statement attached. 

(b) The Govemment or Reserve Bank 
of India (RBI) do not open such banks. The 
proposals for registration/licence of urban 
banks are received by RBI, duly tecom-
mended by the ｾ･ｧｩｳｴｲ｡ｲＬ＠ Cooperative So-
cieties of the State. RBI considers such 
proposals keeping in vie\V the extant policy 
for the opening of such banks. 
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Restructuring Pia" for Jut. Mill. . 

9626. SHRI CHmA BASU: Will the 
Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to state: 

(a) the details of the measures pro-
posed to restructure the five jute mills in the 
public sector; 

(b)thetime by which these measure are 
likely to be taken; and . 

(c) whether the Govemment propose to 
take any other specific measures10 restruc-
ture jute industry in the country including 
NationalJute Manufactures Corporation Ltd. 
mills.? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF MINIS-
TRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) and (b). Some of the meas-
ures proposed to be taken to restructure the 
six jute mills in the Public Sector relate to 
modemisation, voluntary retirement scheme 
for surplice workers, production of diversi-
fied value added products, especially yarn 
for the export market and handing over to 
workers cooperative if feasible. 

(c) Govemment have taken several 
measures for restructuring the jute industry 
in the country which include inter ana crea-
tion of Jute Modemisation Fund of Rs. 150 
crores to eaterto the modemisation require-
ments of the jute industry, establishment of 
Special Jute Development Fund of Rs.100 
crores, grant of financial support for R&D 
activities and product diversification pro-
grammes. encouragemel')t of diversification 
by providing facilities of ｾｸ｣ｩｳ･＠ exemption, 
concesslonal import duty and marketing 
support namely, Inter Marketing Assistance 
and Extemal Marketing Assistance Scheme. 

l&Sue of NRI Bonde by Andh,. 
Prade.h 

9627. SHRI DHARMABHIKSHAM: Will 

the Mlnlsterof FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Govemment of Andhra 
Pradesh has south permission fromthe Union 
Govemment to issue NRI bonds for the 
construction of irrigation projects in the State; 
and 

(b) if so, the projects which are included 
in the scheme and the total amount pro-
posed to be raised by Issue of these bonds? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) and (b). Yes. Sir. The. 
proposal has not been agreed to. 

Dumping of Foreign Goods 

9628. SHRI BUOY KRISHNA HAN-
DlOUE: 

SHRI CHANDULAL CHAN-
DRAKAR: 

SHRI SUDHIR GIRl: 
SHRI PARASRAM BHARD-

WAJ' 

Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the scope for dumping of 
goods in the country by the foreign compa-
nies in the wake of import liberalisation has 
increased; 

(b) whether the Govemment have as-
sessed Its effect on Indian industry; 

(c) if so, the details thereof; and 

(d) the steps taken or proposed to be 
taken by the Govemment to check dumping 
of foreign goods In the Indian markets? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) No, Sir. Dumping re-
fers to the sale of good at less than their 
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normal value. the Import policy doN not 
contain any provision which increases the 
scope for dumping. 

(b) and (c). Do nor arise. 

(d) The Indian Customs Tariff Act, 1975 
was amended in October, 1982 to enable 
Government to take measures against 
dumped imports by levying anti-dumping 
duties. The Act ertl)Owers the Government 
to irtl)OS8 ｡ｮｴｩＭ､ｵｾｮｧ＠ duties in those cases 
in which du"1*l imports are found to be 
causing material injury to the domestic In-
dustry. Before such a duty can be Imposed, 
an authority designated by Govemment has 
to make a finding on the existence of dump-
ing and injury. The designated authority shall 
normally Initiate an Investlngation only upon 
receipt of a written request by or on behalf of 
the affected domestic Industry. 

Government has notified the designated 
authority before whom the application has to 
be filed and has p.ut in place detailed ーｾﾭ
dures to enable the domestic industry to 
lodge complaint against dumped Irtl)Orts. 

[ Translation] 

. SUpply of Yam to W..".,. 

9629. SHRI RAM LAKHAN SINGH 
YADAV: WID the Minister of TEXTILES be 
.pleased to state: 

(a) the quaintly of yam demanded by 
handlooma and powerlooms during the last 
th .... ｹ･｡ｲｳｾ＠ year-wise; 

(b) the 8OUroes from which the demand 
was met and the guanlity thereof; and 

(C) the efforts made by the Government 
to Increue the supply of yam? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOf< 
GEHLOn: (a) and (b). In view of the decen-
tralised nature of production In Powerloom 
Sector and the handloom and the excess 
.weaving capacity In the country, the levels of 
weaving activity In this sector change from 
time to time, depending upon the prlcespow-
erfooms sector and the excess weaving 
capacity In conditions in different States. 
The .demand pattern for yarn also verse 
accordingly. It has not, however, been pos-
sible to quantify the demand for yam in the 
decentralised handloom and powerloom 
sectors as the yam in requirement Is mostly 
met by the private sector spinning mills 
scattered through out the country. During 
the year 1988-89, 1989-90 and 1990-91 the 
spun yarn delivered by spinning mills In the 
country for consumption in the decentrlised 
weaving sector was 1008 million kg',l 057 
milHon kgs and 1159 million kg' respec-
tively. As on 31st March 1991, there were 
26.53 million spindles located In different 

. parts of the country. 

(c) National Handiooms Development 
Corporation (NHOC) has been directed to 
augment yam supply and has been released 
a sum of As. 951akhs In the year 1991-92 for 
this purpose. NTC mills have been directed 
to increase production of counts of 40s and 
below and to open depots for supply of yam 
at ex-mlll rates in areas of weavers concen-
tration. Constant dialogue Is being main-
tained with apex associations of the sinning 
mUIs In private sector to Impress upon them 
to follow a policy of moderation In yamprlce8. 
Government has decided to irtl)Ort 2 lakh 
bales of cotton free -of duty for conversion 
Into hank yam supply at reduced rates to the 
handloOms weavers through apex handioom 
cooperatives; handloorn corporations and 
other notified agencies. 
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[English] 

VI .. khapatnam Export Processing 
Zona 

9630. SHRI M. G. REDDY: 
SHRI RAMA KRISHNA KON-

ATHALA: 

ＱｬﾣｦｊｉｉｉＳｔｅｈｆｓｔａｾ＠

ｆｴＮｉａｎｃｅＨｓｋｴｉｏａｌｂｒｓｴｇＭｉＩＺＨ｡ＩｴｯＨ｣ｾＱｮ｣ｉ｡ｮ＠

Banks' Association ＨｉｾａＩ＠ has reported 
that in terms of the Award given by the· 
Industrial Tribunal, Hyderabad in I. D. 14180, 
deposit collectors have to be given option to 
get absorbed in regular cadres in the bank 
after passing a selection test at part time 
employees. Those who do not for regular 

Will the Minister of COMMERCE be appointment have to be given higher com-
pleased to state: 

(a) whether any Committee has been 
. set up or Is proposed to be set up for award 
of plots and sheds to investors under the 
Export Processing Zone at 'Visakhapatnam; 
and 

(b) if so, the details thereof alongwith its 
composition? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) No. Sir. 

(b) Does not arise 

[ Translation] 

Agent. of Small Saving. Scheme 

9631. SHRI SANTOSH KUMAR GANG-
WAR: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state:' 

(a) whether the award passed In 1988 
by the High Court of Hyderabad declaring 
the persons working as agents for various 
.Small Savings Schemes of the banks as 
appointed employees of the banks, has not 
been Implemented so far; 

(b) whether the Government now pro-
PO" to Imptement the said award; and 

(c) if so, the time by which It is likely to be 
Implemented? 

mission and other benefits. The t. B. A. has 
reported that on behalf of the affected 
merrber banks, it filed a writ petition in the 
Andhra Pradesh High Court against the 
Award and has obtained a stay. At ーｲ･ｾｮｴＬ＠
the matter is subjudice. 

A.D.B.LoanforRoads 

9632. SHRI RAJENDRA ｋｕｾａｒ＠
SHARMA: Will the Minister of SURFACE 
TRANSPORT be pleased to state: 

(a) the amount sanctioned by the Asian 
Development Bank as a loan to India for the 
improvement of roads during the current 
financial year; 

(b) the terms and conditions lakfdown 
for the loans provided; and 

(c) the amount allocated for Uttar 
Pradesh out of It? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTLER): (a> Ouring cur-
rent financial year, no loan agreement has 
been signed byGovemment of Jndla with the 
Asian Development Bank. However, a loan 
amounting to·US $ 250 mIIllon.was signed 
last year in May 1991 for improvement of 
selected National HlghwayalState Roads. 

(b) The terms and conditions of the loan 
are broadly as Pf.'; the 'Ordinary Operations 
Loan Regulations' or the Asian Develop-
ment ｂ｡ｮｫｾｴ･ｳ＠ 1st July, 1986. 



243 Written AnSW91S MAY8,1992 Writtsn AnsW91S 244 
(c) An amount of US $ 30.92 million is SINGH PATll:Wlllthe Ministerof FINANCE 

earmar1<ed forwor1<s In Uttar Pradesh under be pleased to state: 
the above mentioned loan. 

[English) 

Utilisation of Services of Retired 
Judges 

9633. SHRIANANTRAO DESHMUKH: 
Will the Minister of LAW, JUSTIC AND 
COMPANY AFFAIRS be pleased 10 state: 

(a) whefherthe Govemment propose to 
utilise lhe services of retired Supreme Court! 
High Court Judges to rudece the pendency 
of cases in Supreme Court and High Court; 

(b) If so, the details thereof; ar\d 

(c) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COM-
PANY AFFAIRS (SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): (a) to (c). There is 
no proposal to utilise the services of retired 
Supreme CourtlHigh Court Judges to re-
duce the pendency of cases in Supreme 
Court and High Courts. However, the proc-
ess of consultation with concerned 
Constitutional authoritiey for fining up the 
vacancies have been expedited. 

[Translation] 

Disparity In Pay-Scales of Central 
Government Employ ... and Employ-
... of Public s.ctor Enterprl ... 

8834. SHRIMATI PRATIBHA DEVI 

(a) whetherthe Government propose to 
constitute a committee to look into the dis-
parity in the pay-scales of the Central Gov-
emment Employees and the employees of 
Public Sector Enterprises; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) the time by which the committee is 
ｉｩｾ･ｬｹ＠ 10 be set up? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI SHAN-
TARAM POTDUKHE): (a) to (c). A Commit-
tee of. Experts has been set up on the 6th 
April, 1992. A copy of the orders indicating, 
inter-alia, terms of reference, etc. is enclose 
in the statement. 

STATEMENT 

Copy of Govemment of India, Ministry of 
Finance Department of Expenditure, New 
DelhiD. M. No. F. 1 (19)191-EII(B)Dated 
6th April, 1992. 

The Government of India have decided 
to constitute,a high level Committee of Ex-
perts to study and examine the structure of 
employments. viz. pay, Dearness Allowance 
and other ailowances including perquisites 
admisSible to the employees in the Central 
Govemment, Public Sector Enterprises and 
Nationalised Banks. etc. Inter aliaforprepar-
Ing a document to enable the Government to 
take a view on the trends of wages of elT)-
ployees in these sectors and to consider 
evolving a common formula for the grant of 
Dearness Allowance. 

2. The composition of the Committee of Experts shall be as follows:"" 

(i) Shrl H. N. Ray 
(Ii) Shri V. Atal 
(iii) Shrl B. Swaminathan 

Chairman 
Member 
Member • 
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3. The terms of reference of the 
Committee shall be as follows:-

(i) To study the Deamess Allowance 
and wage structure of Central 
Govemment employees an the 
employees of the Public Sector 
Undertakings, Nationalised Banks, 
Statutory CorpOrations, etc. includ-
ing principles goveming Deamess 
Allowance and pay. 

(ii) To analyses the gap in emoluments 
of the Central Govemment employ-
ees vis-a-vis employees of Public 
Sector Undertakings etc. giving the 
weightagte to the difference in job 
contents for the posts similar in 
nature. 

(iii) Based on the study and examina-
tion, prepare a document for con-
sideration of the Govemment to 
take a view on the following as-
pects:-

(a) The trend for wage revision 
and narrowing down the gap in 
implements in the Central 
Govemment vis-a-vis employ-
ees for Public Sector Enter· 
prises keeping In view the 
economic conditions and reo 
source constrains: 

(b) To evolve a common formula 
for grant of Dearness Allow· 
ance to Co3ntral Govemment 
employees as well as employ· 

, ees of the Public Sector Un-
dertakings, Nationalised Bank 
sand Statuary Corporations, 
etc. keeping in view the wage 
structure, allowances, perks 
and terminal benefits, etc. 
available to different employ-
ees in different sectors; 

(c) The principles, policy and for-
mula for Dearness Relief to 
the Pensioners; 

(d) The periodicity of revision of 
wages, dearness Allowance 
and Dearness Relief. 

4. The Headquarters of the Com-
mittee will be at New Delhi. The Committee 
will devise its own procedure and may call for 
such information as considered necessary. 

5. The Department of Expenditure 
will provide the Secretariat for the Commit-
tee. 

6. The Committee will submit the 
document to the Ministry of Finance within a 
period of 4 months. 

-ScI-

(P. G. LELE) 

Add!. Secretary to the Government of India. 

[English] 

Statutory Statu. to the Wool Develop-
mentBoard 

9635. SHRI YASHWANTRAO PATIL: 
Will the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the Govemment have any 
proposal to give statutory to the Wool Devel-
opment Board; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) by when this is likely to be done? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) Yes, Sir. 
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(b) and (c). It is proposed to constitute a 
Wool Development Board by an act of Par-
liament for the overall promotion and devel- . 
opment of the wool sector. The function fo 
the Board would be to promote growth, bet-
ter marketings, stabilishing the price of wool, 
standardisation of woollen products, quality 
upgradation and coordinating activities of 
various agencies operating in the wool sec-
tor etc. It is expected to be finalised by 
march,1993. 

RegIoI1llI Office of Controller of I & E at 
Jalpur 

9636. SHRI GIRDHARI LAL BHAR-
GAVA: Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether there is a great demand 
from the exporters of Rajasthan to open a 
Regional Office of Controller of Imports & 
Exports at Jaipur; 

(b) if so, the details thereof and the 
reaction of the Government thereto; and 

(c) the time by which this office is likely 
to be opened? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) A regional office of 
the Chief Controller of Imports & Exports 
Organisation headed by Jt. CCI&E Is al-
readyfunctioning atJaipur in Rajasthan State. 

(b) and (c). Do not arise. 

Export of Flow .... and Frvlta 

9637. PROF. SAVITHRI LAKSH-
MANAN: Will the Minister of COMMERCE 
be pleased to state: 

(a) the details of flowers and fruits ex-
ported during 1991-92; 

(b) the amount of foreign exchange 
eamed therefrom; and 

(c) the amount likely to be earned from 
the same during the year 1992-93? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MANKHURSHEED):(a) and (b». Therequi-
site information is as under: 

Item Quantity Value 

Floricultural Products Rs.1003Iakhs 

Fruits 24800tonnes Rs.29851akhs 

(c) As per projections, the exports of 
Floriculture and Fresh fruits are estimated at 
As. 1 5crores Md As. 6Ocrores respectively. 

Pending Court c.- of IFCI 

9638. SHRI RAJNATH SONKAR SHAS-
TRI: WHlthe Minlaterof FINANCE be pktaaed 
to stat.: 

(a) the number of legal cases/petitions/ 
suits etc. Against All India Industrial Finance 
Corporation Employees' Association pend-
ing in High Courts/Supreme Court; and 

. . 
(b) the total amount of legal expenses 

Inculftd by industrial Finance Cooperation 
o_f india on these legal case. during the last 
three yeara? 
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THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI OALBIR 
SINGH): (a) The Industrial Finance Corpora-
tion of India (IFCI) has reported that there is 
only one case filed by it against the All India 
Indultrlal Finance Corporation. Employees 
Association (AIIFCEA) which Is pending In 
the High Court of Deihl. The High Court has 
granted an Injection in the case. Some 
members of AIIFCEA allegedly committee a 
breach of the court injunction against whJch 
IFCI has flied an application for Contempt of 
Court. This application is also pending. 

In addition, AIIFCEA has filed fiVe cases 
against IFCI. Of these, two cases are pend-
ing in the Delhi High Court and one each in 
the Supreme Court, Allahabad High Court 
and Central Govemment Industrial Tribunal, 
New Oelhi. 

(b) The total legal expenses incrueded 
,by IFCI, in the cases filed by it against 
ｾｉｉｆｃｅａＬ＠ during the last three years are Rs; 
ｾ＠ 14,268.25. The legal expenses incurred by 
.IFCI in the cases filed by AIIFCEA are As. 
1,36,876. 

Poaching In Indian Wa'" 

9639. OR. RAJAGOPALAN 
SRIOHARAN:Wlllthe MinisterofOEFENCE 
. be pleased to state: 

ｾＩ＠ whether poaching in the Indian wa-
ters are on the Increase In recent times; 

(b) whether the Reginal Eastern Com-
mand for coast guards has given any Infor-
mation to the Govemment In this regard; 

(c) If so, the details thereof; and 

(d) the steps being taken to meet the 
situation? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHRI 
SHARAO PAWAR): (a) 10 (c). Incidents of 

poaching by foreign fishing trawlers In the 
Indian EEZ are invariably reported by the 
respective regional headquarters to the cost 
Guard Headquarters and, thereafter, to the 
Ministry of Defence, on a regular basis. 
While there have been a number of appre-
hensions during 1992 of vessels found 
pbaching in the Indian EEZ by the Coast 
Guard, It is not possible to say whether this 
indicates an inverse in poaching activities. 

(d) Coast Guard ships and aircraft main-
tain a constant vigil in the Indian Exclusive 
EconomicZone, especially In the areas prone 
to poaching by foreign fishing vessels, to 
deter pacing activities. 

Construction of Bridges on N. H. No. 49 

9640. SHRI P. C. THOMAS: Will the 
Minister of SURFACE TRANSPORT be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the details of the bridge proposed to 
be constructed on National Highway No. 49 
particularly on Cochin to Muvattupuzha and 
Muvattupuzha to Nerlamanglam stretch 
during the current year; 

(b) the present stage of these projects; 
and 

(c) the steps taken to widen this portion 
of National Highway? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRIJAGOISH TYTLER): (a) and b). There 
Is no proposal for construction of any bridge 
on National Highway No. 49 during Annual 
Plan 1992-93. 

(c) In order to improve this National 
Highway In a phased manner, Survey and 
investigation Is being carried out. A sum of 
As. 200 lacs has also been provided in the 
Annual Plan 1992-93 for widening and Im-
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provement of selected stretches of National ties; 
Highway 49. 

Declaration of Wool as Agricultural 
Commodity 

9641. SHRI ANAND RATNA MA YRYA: 
Will the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the Government proposed 
to declare the wool as agricultural commod-
Ity as demanded by the Wool Development 
Board; 

(b) If so, the facilities to be given after 
such declaration; and 

(c) If not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOn: (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) After wool is declared as an agricul-
tural commodity, it will get all the conces-
sions given to other agricultural commodi-

(c) Does not arise. 

Arrest of Foreigners 

9642. SHRI PARASRAM BHARDWAJ: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) the number of foreigners arrested 
under Customs Act. 1962 during the last 
three years; 

(b) whether any diplomats have also 
been found involved in srT1uggling during the 
above period; and 

(c) If so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI ｒａｍｅｓｈｾ＠
WAR THAKUR): (a) The number of foreign 
nationals arrested underthe provisionof the 
Customs Act, 1962 during the last 3 years 
are given in the table below:-

Year Number of foreigners arrested 

1989 

1990 

1991 (upto 24.4.92) 

(b) and (c). Available reports do not 
indicate the involvement of any foreign di-
ploma in these cases. 

[Translation] 

Study on OrganlMtlonal StNctu ... of N. 
ｔＮｃｾ＠

96Q. SHRI TEJ NARAYAN SINGH: 

398 

496 

133 (Provisional) 

Will the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whetherthe Government have made 
any study to determine the .organisational 
structure and the requirement of manpower 
in the National Textile Cooperation; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; 
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(c) whether the Government have stud-
ied the recommendations' made in this re-
gard; and 

(d) if so, the action taken thereon? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF MINIS-
TRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOn: (a) to (d). Government have not 
made any study In this regard. However, 
NTCgot astudydoneby SITRA (South India 
Textile Research Association) which out 
excess labour employment in all NTC Mills. 
Based on the studies, various staeps have 
been taken by NTC to rationalise the labour 
force, wherever found excess, by offering 
compensation under Voluntary Retirement 
Scheme. This is applicable both to workers 
as walk as Officers and staff. 

[English] 

JapaneseCollaboration/AID 

9644. SHRI SHRAVAN KUMAR 
PATEL: 

DR. Y. S. RAJASEKHAR 
REDDY: 

Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether he visited Japan recently: 

(b) if so, the nature and extent of Japa-
nese aid, collaboration and cooperation 
sought by him during this visit; and 

(c) the outcome ofthe discussions held? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR ｔｈｾｋｕｒＩＺ＠ (a) Yes,Sir. 

(b) The Government of Japan was re-
quested to significantly increase the level of 
aid as also to give a substantial p'roportion of 
this as fast disbursing assistance. The new 

economic policies of the Government were 
explained to leading Japanese business-
men at a Seminar. 

(c) There is apprecistion in Japan, at 
both political and business levels, of Indida's 
economic reforms programe. The current 
assessment of the Japanese bUSiness 
community about India's economic pros-
pects is formable. There is recognition that 
countries implementing, major economic 
reforms may face transitional problems re-
quiring international support. Japanese au-
thorities are sympathetic of India's case for 
quick disabursing aid and are considering 
our request in this regard. They also assured 
continued support to India's case in the IMF 
a the World Bank. 

Age Limit for Appointment to Manage-
rial Posts In Companies 

9645. SHRI GURUDAS KAMAT: Will 
the Minister of LAW, JUSTIC AND COM-
PANY AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) whether age limit for appointment to 
managerial posts in companies have been 
relaxed by the Government recently;'and 

(b) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINIS'fER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
t\ND THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COM-
PANY AFFAIRS (SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): (a) and (b). Appoint-
ment of managerial personnel, i. fl. Manag-
ing or Wholtime Director or Managar (as 
defined in sub-section (24) of Section 2 of 
the Companies Act, 1956) in a public limited 
company or a private Iimitl;ld company which 
is a subsidiary of a public limited company is 
regulated by the provisions of Section 269 
read with Schedule XIII of the Act. In accor-
dance with sub-paragraph (c) of paragraph 1 
of Part I of Schedule XIII which came into 
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force on 15.6.88, no person who had not 
completed the age of 30 years or had al-
ready attained the age of 65 years was 
eligible for appointment as managerial per-
sonnel unless the approval of the Central 
Government to such appointment was ob-
tained. With a view to enlarging the scope of 
delegation of powers to companies In regard 
to such managerial appointments, the Cen-
tral Government, by Notification No. So 723 
eE) dated 18th September, 1990 published 
in the Gazette of India, revised the lower age 
limit of 30 years to 25 years and $he upper 
age limit of 65 years to 70 years. 

Perform."!» of State T"'1ng Corpora-
. tlon 

964'). SHRI ANNA JOSHI: 
DR. Y. S. RAJASEKHAR 

REDDY: 

Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a}the status of State Trading Corpora-
tion under the IMPEX Policy (April 1992-
MaICh 1997); .. 

(b) whether there Is a sharp decline In 
the performance of the State Trading Corpo-
ration as reported In the Indian Express 
dated AprIl 13, 1992; and 

(c) if so, the dataUs thereof and the 
I'NCtIon of the Government "*-101 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHtDAMBARAM): (a) to (c). The total tum 
over of STC during 1991-92 Is estImaIed at 
As. 1252 crores colf1)8red to a turnover of 
As. 1756cro,.,. for the year 1990-91. How-
·ever,exportsdurlng 19991-92are8ltimated 
at As. 623 crores as against an export 
furnover of As. 369 crores during 1990-91. 
The decline in STC'stumoverfor 1.1-92 is 
largely becau .. of • sharp deere ... in 

canaUsed imports. 

In the context Ilberallsed trade policy 
measures effected in the current EXIM Pol-
icy, wherein certain export and Import Items 
have been decanallsed, STC has refouru-
lated Its corporate objectives with the ap-
proval of Government with a view to becom-
ing an international trading house function-
ing In a competitive environment principally 
based on non-canalised trade. In the con- . 
text of recuced tum overdue to decanlisa-
tion, STC is also seeking to reduce its over-
head expense by way of redeployment of 
surplus manpower In the new areas of busi-
ness. 

Import of lroif:scrap 

9647. SHRIMATI CHANDRA PRABHA 
URS: Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pkrased to state: 

(a) whether the· Government have Im-
ported Iron scrap during 1991-92; 

(b) If SO, the quantity Imported and the 
countries from which import was made; 

(c) the amount 01 foreign exchange spent 
forthe Import of the same during the above 
period; and . 

(d) the steps taken or proposed to be 
taken to -avoid Import of Iron scarp during 
1992-93 so to sa)fe foreign exchange? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRt· P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) and (b). Metal Scrap 
Trade Corporation ltd. (MSTC), a public 
sectorenterpri .. undertheMlnistryofSt .. I, 
has Imported approx. 2.80 lakh tonne8 of 
carbon steel melting scrap during 1991-92 
for UN by the secondary st .. 1 sector. The 
scrap has been Imported from USA and , 
somecountriN in Europe Including Czecho-
Slovakia. 
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(c) These IITl>0rts have been made by 
utHiZln!) about As. 106 crores of free foreign 
exchange and As. 20 crores of RPA ex-
change from the allocation made to MSTC 
by Government. 

(d) A special thurst Is being given to 
increasing indigenous production of spongs 
Iron which is a partial substitute of scrap. 
Presently. the installed capacity for produc· 
tion of sponge iron is about 1.4 million tonnes 
and this is likely to increase to 5-6 million 
tonnes by the end of the VIII Plan. 

Share Prices 

9648. DR. KARTIKESWAR PA TRA: Will 
the Ministerol FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Government are aware 
that people desirous 01 investing in shares 
are' acing great difficulties in obtaining Infor· 
mation about share prices in differenct Stock 
Exchanges on previous day, as most of the 
newspapers report the share prices provid· 
ing long back without mentionig the date on 
which that price was prevailing; and 

(b) if so, the details taken orproposedto 
be taken by the Securities and Exchanges 
Board of India In this regard and to make the 
general public aware of various Investor 
protection measures and remedies? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH· 
WAR THAKUR): (a) and (b). Information an 
share prices in Stock Exchanges ｾｦ＠ the 

Year Target· 

1989-90 600 

1990-91 600 

450 

previous day are published In a large num-
ber of daily.newspapers. Prices of shares as 
on the previous day or as on the last day in 
which transactions took place are generally 
published by the Stock Exchanges ｡ｮｾ＠ Fi-
nancial Dailies. The Securities and Exchange 
Board 01 India has recently published a 
booklet on Investor Grievances Rights and 
Remedies". 

Production of Janata Cloth 

9649. KUMAR I PUSHPA DEVI SINGH: 
Will the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 

(a) the target fixed and achieved in the 
production of janata cloth during the each of 
last three years; 

(b) whether the Govem.roent-have pro-
posal to Increase the production of janata 
cloth during 1992-93; 

(c) if so, the target fixed for the produc· 
tion of janata cloth during the above period 
and the funds earmarked for this purpose; 
and 

(d) the steps taken by the Govemment 
to achieve Jhe target? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) The target fixed and achieve· 
ment made in the production of janata cloth 
in the country during the last three years 
have been as follows:-

• (in mUlion square metres) 

Achievement 

503.80 

4n.1S 

433.14 (estimated) 
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(b) and (c). For the year 1992-93 a 
target of 450 million square metres has been 
fixed under this scheme and a sum of Rs. 
137.91 crares has been earmarked in the 
budget estimate during the current Y&df for 
release as subsidy. 

(d) The State level Implementation 
COmmittee functioning In each Implement-
ing State regularly review the performance 
of production by the implementing agencies 
in each State with a view to achieve the 
targets set for them. 

Construction of Bridges Near Gunpur 
Town In Orissa 

9650. SHRI GOPAL NATH GAJAPA-
THI: Will the Minister of SURFACE 
TRANSPORT be pleased to state: 

(a) the work done so farforthe construc-
tion of a bridge on the river Vanasadhara 
Near Gunpur Town of Koraput District in 
Orissa; 

(b) whether the Government have al-
ready released the money for the construc-
tion of the bridge under inter-state and eco-
nomic importance programme; 

(cl If so. the fund allocated so far; and 

(d) by when the work on the bridge is 
likely to be completed? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTLER): (a) The work 
done so far for the construction of a bridge on 
the river Vanasadhara near Gunpur Tow of 
Koraput District in Orssa is about 60%. 

(b) and (c). The entire amount of As. 
108 lakhs being the share of the Central 
Govemmentforthe construction of this bridge 
under the scheme of Economic and Inter-
State IlJl)Ortance has already been re-

leased. Apart from this the State Govern-
ment have also spent and amount of about 
Rs. 401 lakhs on this bn<lge till the end of 
March. 1992. 

(d) The wor!< on the bridge is likely to be 
completed by March. 1993. 

Foreign Exchange Earnings for Textiles 
Sector 

5651. SHRI JAGMEET SINGH BRAR: 
Will the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether there is much potential in 
the country to earn huge foreign eXChange 
by promoting export in the textile sector; 

(b) whether the 20 per cent of the total 
industrial production in the country is being 
made in the textile industry sector; 

(c) If so, the details of the special facili-
ties provided to this industry for promoting 
export during the last two years; and 

(d) the additional quantity of the goods 
produced and exported as a resuh of these 
tacililes? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF MINIS-
TRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): (a) There is good potential in the 
textile sector tor Increasing exports. 

(b) Yes, Sir. 

(c) and (d). Government have taken a 
number of steps to increase textiles which 
includes: allowill§ of import of textile ma-
chinery at concessional duty. organising 
Buyer-Seller Meets and fairs abroad. provid-
ing adequate encouragement to manufac-
turer exporters and non-quota exporter:-; . 
through appropriate Quota Policy measures 
etc. Textile exports increased from Rs. 9932 
crores in 1990-91 to Rs. 14379 crores (Pro-
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visional) in 1991-92 representing an increase 
of 44.8% 

Malntalnence of India's Hold In Foreign 
Tea Market 

9652. SHRI SANAT KUMAR MANDAL: 
Will the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether according to the study 
published in Tea Time magzine China is 
likely to overtake India as the largest tea 
producer in the world by the end of this 
century and sideline India in the world tea 
markets soon; and 

(b) if so, the Government's reaction 
thereto and the steps proposed to be taken 
to maintain its hold in the foreign tea market? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) and (b). According to 
the study published in Tea Time Magazine, 
production and export of tea in China by the 
end of this century is projectecl at 700 m. 
kgs. and 250 m. kgs. respectively, as com-
pared to 1000 m. kgs. and 275 m. kgs. in 
India as worked out by the Tea Board. As 
such, China is unlikely outstip India in pro-
duction and export by 2000 AD. India has 
drawn up intensive plans to increase pro-
duction of tea not only to meet domestic 

reqUirements ·but also retain the interna-
tional market share. There include bringing 
new areas under lea plantation, repleanting 
of old tea bushes with new high yelling 
varieties, adoption of improved cultural prac-
tices, etc. 

Finance Assistance Civil Under Seeuy 

9653. SHRI SYED SHAHABUDDIN: Will 
the Ministerof FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the number of cases sanctioned by 
the banks and amount disbursed under U'le 
SEEUY scheme since its incention, 'upto 
March 31, 1992, year-wise in the C9Ulltry as 
a whole, in Bihar and Araria; aRtf 

(b) the total amount recovered under 
the scheme, for the country as a whole, for 
Bihar and for the three districts upto March, 
1992? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DAlBIR 
SINGH): (a) The number of cases sanc-
tioned and the amount sanctioned by the 
banks under the Scheme for providing Self 
Employment to the Educated Unemployed 
Youth (SEEUY) in the country as a whole 
and in the State of Bihar since its inception 
i.e., 1983-84 and upto 1990-91 (latest avail-
able) are: 
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The similar information for the districts 
named is being collected for the past yeal1i 
and will be laid on the Table ofthe House'to 
the extent possible. 

(b) The data reporting system does not 
generally recovery performance Statewise 
and Districtewise. However, the percentage 
of recovery to demand under the Scheme lor 
thecountty as whole. works out to 26. 15%at 
the end of June. 1989 and 20.82% at the end 
of July, 1990 (latest available. ) 

Settlement 'of Claim Cases by L1C in 
Usharashtra 

9654. SHRI RAM NAIK: Will the Minis-
ter of FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) the nurmer of claim cases pending 
for settlement from Maharashtra in respect 
of which ,he LHe Insurance Corporation of 
India has entered Into litigation; 

(b) the nurmer of claim cases pending 
for settlement for more than one year, two 
years and three years. separately; 

(c) the reasons therefor; and. 

(d) the steps taken to expedite the set-
tlement of these cases? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PlNANCE (SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) 203 cases are pending before 
various courts In Maharashtra of which 22 
cases are before Consumer Forums/Com-
missions. 

(b) and (c). 2.484 claims are pending for 
over one year and 1,815 claims for over 2 
years for a variety of reasons such as non-
fulfilment of procedural requirements; claim-
antsJpolicyholders not being available at the 
addresses given by them; and pending In-
vestigations and also on account of legal. 
exchange control and other matters. The 

statistics of cases pending for over 3 years is 
not maintained as such cases are very rare. 

(d) In orderto expedite the settlement of 
cases, the Corporation constantly explores 
the possibility of out-of-court settlement In 
long pending cases ... The Cooperation has 
also an In-bullt mechanism to review from 
time to time cases pending Investigations for 
over 6 months and Individual cases, where 
settlement Is not alleded within a year. 
Further, the Regional Managers during the 
tour to Divisional Offices take up review of 
cases wt)ich have been repudiated by the 
Divitional Offi(:e to ensure fair deal to claim-
ants. 

Employment to Trained Apprentices 

9655. SHRI MANIKRAO HODL YA 
GAVIT: Will the Minister of DEFENCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the names of trades in which appren-
tice-shipfacilities are available in the various 
Defence Institutes of the country; 

(b) the amount spent thereon during last 
three years, year-wise; 

(c) the number of the trainees passed 
out from these institutes dueing this period; 

(d) the number of the trained appren-
tices who were provided employment in the 
Defence Institutes during this period; and 

fI!) Govemment's plan to provide em-
ploymentto all the trainees who have passed 
the trade apprenticeship? 

THE MINISTER OF ｄｅｆｅｾｃｅ＠ (SHRI 
SHARAD PAWAR): (a) A Statement Is at-
tached. 

(b) Amounts spent during 1989-90, 
1990-91 and 1991-92 are As. 95.121akhs, 
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Rs. 107.19 lakhs and 115.071akhs respec- 14. Footwear Maker 
tively. 

15. Armature Winder 
(c) Number of trainees behind in these 

three years are 1487 in 89-90,1268 in 90-91 16. Mechanic-Sewing Machine 
& 1318 in 91-92. 

17. Finished Leater Maker 
Cd) Number of trained apprentices 

employed in the concerned undertakings 18. Plumber 
are 225 In 89-90, 393 in 90-91 & 585 in 91-
92. 19. Optical Worker 

(e) There is no obligation on the part of 20. Millwrignt Maintenance Mechanic 
the Govt. to provide employment to all the 
apprentices trained under the Apprentices 21. Boiler Attendant 
Act 1961. However subject to availability of 
vacancies, the trained apprentices are con- 22. Switch Board 
sidered for employment. 

23. Furnace Operator 
STATEMENT 

24. Steel Melting Hand 
A. Ordnance Factories 

25. Electronic Mechanic 
1. Fitter 

26. Electrician 
2. Turner 

27. Mechanic Maintenance (Cheml-
3. Machinist cal Plant) 

4. Pattern Maker B. Army Base Workshop. 

S. Moulder 1. Vehicle Mechanic 

6. Sheet Metal Worker 2. Engineering Equipment Mechanic 

7. Welder 3. Tele-Communicattons Mechanic 

8. Wireman 4. Instrument Mechanic 

9. Carpenter 5. Electrician (Vehicles) 

10. Tool & Die Maker 6. Fitter 

11. Instrument 7. Armourer 

12. Mechanic (Motor Vehicles) 8. Machinist 

13. Tailor 9. Millwrlnght 
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10. Grinder Percision 

11. Turner 

12. Tool Maker 

13. Tin & Copper Smith 

14. Welder 

15. Electrician (Power) 

16. Diesel Mechanic 

17. Computer 

18. Draughtsman 

C. Naval Dockyards & Base 
Repair Organisation of Navy 

1. Electrician 

2. Gas Turbine Fitter 

3. Fitter 

4. Turner 

5. Diesel MechaniC 

6. Crane Operator 

7. Welder 

8. Rigger 

9. Refrigaration & Air Conditioning 
Mechanic 

10. Shipwright & Maintenance 
Mechanic 

11. Engine Fitter 

12. Ship Fitter 

13. Radar Fitter 

14. Machine Control Fitter 

15. Sonar Fitter 

16. Electronic Fitter 

Issue of FouR Shares 

9656. SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased 10 
staate: 

(a) whether the Government have any 
proposal to permit the Minerals and Allied 
Machinery Corporation, the Chlttarnjan 
locomotive works and the Bharat Heavy 
Electricals ltd. to float eqUity shanes in the 
captial market; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) the time by which a final desision is 
likely to be taken in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): 

(a) to (c). The information is being 
collected and will be laid on the Table of the 
House. 

Study on Indla'8 Economic Reforms 

9657 SHRI R. SURENDER REDDY: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether the Government have 
commissioned a study on India's economic 
reforms vis-a-vis reforms of other countries; 
and 

(b) If so, the details thereof? .... 
THE MINSTER OF STATE IN THE 



271 WnYten Answel$ MAY 8, 1992 Wntten An .... ,. 272 

Export of St ... MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): . 

(a) and (b). The Government have not 
commissioned any study covering all as-
pects of India's Economic Reforms v.is-a-vis 
reforms of other countries. 

However, the Ministry of Industry (Deptt. 
of Industrial Development have commis-
sioned a Research Study titled ·Foreign 
project enviestment (FlO) Incentives and 
Restrictions·. The Study Project envisages 
study of foreign dired investment in the light 
of the policy environment in countries like 
Indonesia, MaJaysis, Thailand, Korea, etc. 

Another study on 'Liberalisation ( Eco-
nomic & Financial) to Integrate the Indian 
Economy with Global Economy has been 
commissioned by the Planning 
Commission .• would, inter- alia, study the 
experiences of the liberalisation process in 
Newly Industrialising Economies (NIEs), the 
Association of SouthEast Asian Nations 
(ASEAN) and successful Latin American 
countries and to recommend the policy 
measures to forge ctoser links with the global 
financial rnarttets and enhance India's abil-
ity to take COfl1)8titive advantage of the 
incraasing inteUlCltionai opportunities for 
trade, Industry and finance. 

Year 

ＱｾＹＱ＠

1991-92 

• uplo December 1991 
.. uplo January 1992 

Iron Ore 

330 

490" 

(e) With a view to boost export of ｳｴ･･ｾ＠
the Govl have taken the following steps:-

(I) AIcU:IIon In ｾ＠ duty on raw 

. 9658. SHRI NITISH KUMAR: 
DR. MAHADEEAK SINGH 

SHAKYA: 

Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Govemment have as-
sessed the rise in profit percentage which 
the country would eam by exporting steel 
rather than lron-ores; 

(b) If so, the details thereof and the 
percentage rise of the profit so assessed; 
and 

(c) the offorts made or proposed to be 
made by the Government to reduce the 
export of iron- ore and increase the export of 
steel? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. 
CHIDAMBARAM): (a) and (b). Export earn-
ings per tonne of export of mild steel was 
higher than that for iron ore during the last 
two years as the fOllowing figures would 
indicate: . 

Rs.l Metric tonne 

UiklSteei 

5820 

materials and intermediates for 
steel making. 

(M) Allowing In1JOI1 of modem equip-
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ment and technology for quality 
Improvement and cost reduction of 
steel producers. 

(III) Duty free imports of raw materials 
for export production through ad-
vance licensing scheme as per 
policy. 

(iv) Conversion of 60% export eaming 
at market rate of foreign exchange. 

(v) COl11)lete decontrol of all steel 
exports. ' 

(vi) Delicenslng and deregulation of 
iron and steel to create competitive 
environment leading to over all ef-
ficiency. 

Export of High Value Added Products. 

9659. SHRI MOHAMMD ALL 
ASHRAF FAllA I: 

SHRIARJUN SINGH VADAV: 

Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the percentage of the high value 
added manufactured goods in the total 
exports of the country during the last two 
years; and 

. (b) the efforts made by the Govemment 
to promote the export Of these goods during 
the above period? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): <a) The value added manu-
factured goods accounted for about 81 % of 
our total exports during the Year 1990-91 
and Aprti-January 1991-92. 

(b) Several changes In trade policy 

were introduced since July 1991 aimed at 
strengthening export incentives. eliminating 
a substantial volume Of J!Tl)Ort licens!ng and 
rationaling the import tariff structure. In the 
Budget for 1992193. rupee was made par-
tially convertible to encourage generation of 
foreign exchange and export of value added 
items. These have been further consoli-
dated in the new Export- II11)0rt Policy an-
nounced on 31st March 1992. which inter 
alia. aims to promote the productivity. 
modernisation and competitiveness of· In-
dian industry and thereby to enhance Its 
export capabilities-ties Besides. the Gov-
ernment has taken other steps which in-
clude reducing controls through licensing. 
simplification of procedures for export. 
activisatlon of Board of Trade bilateral dis-
cusions with select .countrles. Interaction 
with national organisations of Trade ｡ｮｾ＠
Industry. etc. 

[English] 

Export of Leather 

9660. SHRSI K. PRADHANI :WiII the 
Minister Of COMMERCE be pleasadto state: 

(a> the number and value of orders for 
export of leather and Its products receivedby 
the Government during 1990-91 ; 

(b) whether all the orders have been 
implemented; 

(c) if so. the amount offoreign exchange 
earned therefrom; and . 

(d) if not. the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
OAMBARAM): (a) to.(d). The export orders 
are raceJved and contracts are entered and 
executed by the individual ･ｸｰｯｲｴｩｮｧ｣ｯｾﾭ
nies contracts being entered into or exe-
cuted. However. according to information 
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received from the Council of Leather Ex-
ports all contractual obligations have been 
met on time by the exporters concemed:The 

exports of leather and leather products in 
terms of value, during 1990-91 were as 
follows: 

S.No. Item Export(in Rs. Crores) 

1. Semi Finished Leather 3.97 

2. Finished Leather 765.62 

3 leather Footwear 221.15 

4. Footwear Components 575.29 

5. leather Garments 579.20 

6. leather Goods 408.62 

Total: 2553.85 

(Source: Council for Leather Exports) 

Out of the total export of Rs. 2553.85 
crores, Rs. 2221.33 crores were to General 
Currency Area earning a foreign exchange 
to the tune of US dQllar 1233.44 million. 

Export of Jasmine Flower 

9661. DR. SHRIMATI K.S. SOUNDA-
RAM: Will the Minister of COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether Jasmine flower is being 
exported from India; 

(b) if so, the names of the countries to 
which exported; and 

(c) the value and the quantny of export 
made during the last three years, State-
wlse? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MAN KHUASHEED): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) and (c). Cutflowers and flower-buds 

including Jasmine flowers are exported 
mainly to USA. UK. France, Germany. Italy. 
Oman. Netherlands. UAE. etc. Details of 
exports during the last three years are as 
under:-

·'988-89 
··1989-90 
·1990-91 

- Rs.92.45 lakhs 
- RS.27.30 lakhs 
- Rs. 260.29 lakhs 

Source: • DGCI &5 
Returns filed by exporters 
with Agricultural & Proc-
essed Food ProdUcts 
Export Development 
Authority (APEDA). 

Export figures are not maintained vari-
ety-wise/state-wise, and hence are notsep-
arately available for ｬ｡ｳｭｬｾ･＠ flowers. 

Primary Weave,.. Cooperative Socie-
ties In Orissa 

9662. SHAI ARJUN CHAAAN SETHI: 
Will the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 
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fa) Tbe number of primary W88V8I'I bungling; 
cooperative societies In OrIssa at pntsenl; 

(b) whether any co"l>laints have been 
received regarding the non-availability of 
raw materials In the State; and 

'(c) If so, the steps taken by the G0vern-
ment to make available the raw materials to 
the societies? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTilES (SHAI ASHOK 
OEHLOT): (a) There are 774 prlmaryweav-
ers cooperative SOC?!eties In Orissa/at pras-
ent. 

(b}No. Sir. 

(c) Question does not ariSe. 

U.T.I."S Mast.rShare F'Ju8 Unit Schem. 

9663: SHRVMoHAN RAWAlE: ' ' 
SHRI MADA,flf kAL KHUR-

:ANA: 

Will the Minlstarof FINANCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether the Unit Trust of InOla Is 
Investigating a suspected As. 2.5 crore .;,-
off by S!)m8 of Its leading agents In ｳｵｾ＠
Ing to / U(e shares of Its recently concluded 
'Qrowth scheme Mastershare Plus; 

(b) If so, the details In this regard; 

(c) Wflether the investi9atlon of agents 
of the Unit Trust of India who have been 
blacklisted; 

(d) if so, the particulars of agents of the 
Unit Trust of India who have been black-
listed; 

(a) whether some employees of the 
Bank have also been found Involved In thlI 

Cf) whether It Is proposed to hand over" 
the case to the Central Bureau of investiga-
tion to find out thefaClS; and 

(g) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MlNISttR OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY C)F FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) to (g). The Unit Trust of , 
India Is Investigating the matter. The Delbl 
branch of UTI received 897 applications fOt 
the Master Plus Unit Scheme, 1991 afterthe 
closure of the scheme on the 31 st Decem-
ber, 1991. TtIe value of cheques Involved in 
these applications amounted to Rs. 2.51 
crores. The UTJ has advised all those 
whose applications were received after the 
｣ｬｯｳｵｾ＠ date that their applications , Prima 
facia, cannot be accepted. The UTI has 
terminated 45 agents who had canvassed 

. the appliCations which were received after 
the closure of the scheme. $ultable investi-
gation has been initiated against some 
employees of New DeIhl office who were 
found prima facia. Involved in the matter As 
the Vigilance cao of the Unit Trust of India Is 
already Investigating the matter, It Is not 
proposed, atpresenl, to haodoverthe matter 
to the Central Bureau of Investigation. 

ConstNctlon work At MES • Cochln 

9664. PROF. K.V. THOMAS: WlDthe 
Minister of DEFENCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether any complaints have been 
received regarding quality of civil work in 
MES at Cachin; 

(b) H so, the steps being taken to 
Improve the quality of clvU work In MES at 
Cachln; 

(c) whether any inquiry ｨｾ＠ been made 
regarding theaccldent of helicopters brought 
bera for repaIri; and 
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(d) if so, the outcome thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHHI 
SHARAD PAWAR): (a) to (d). No com-
plaints have been received regarding the 
quality of civil worKs in MES at COChlr1. 
However, there was recently an accident at 
the construction site of a Hanger at Cochin 
which Is being investigated by a Board of 
Inquiry. There have been no accidents to 
helicopters under repair at Cochin which can 
be attributed to unsatisfactory quality of civil 
works executed by the MES. 

Opium Production 

9665. SHRI BlJOY KRISHNA HAN-
DIQUE: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the opium production in the 
country generally remains in excess of the 
requirement specified by the Government; 
and 

. 
(b) if so, the steps taken or proposed to 

be taken to check the excess production? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) and (b). Opium is pro-
duced in India mainly for export purposes 
though a part of it is also used in the 
Government Opium and Alka-Ioid works for 
extraction of alkaloids. Indian exports of 
opium were adversely affected during the 
last decadedue to emergence of alternative 
cheaper raw material, i. e.concentrate of 
poppy straw (CPS). The demand for opiate 
raw material did not grow as expected in the 
international marKet resulting in a serious 
imbalnce between production and con-
sumption and consequent stockpile of opium 
in India. The area under poppy cultivation 
was therefore substantially reduced over a 
period of time. This has helped to check the 
excess prodction and we have now reached 
a situation where the annual production of 

opium In the country is not In excess lof the 
annual requirement. 

[ Translation] 

Ship TranilJPort Facility on National 
Waterway 

9666. ｾ＠ SHRI RAM LAKHAN SINGH 
YADAV: Will the Minister of SURFACE 
TRANSPORT be pleased to state: 

(a) whether ship transport facilities are 
yet to be provided on National waterway No. 
1 under the proposal of 1990-91; 

(b) if so, the details of the steps taken so 
far to make available these facilities; and 

(c) the time by which travel facilities jlre 
likely to be made available to the public? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTlER): (a) to (c). During 
the year 1990-91, navigational channel of 
1.5 metre depth and 45 metres width was 
provided in the Haldia-Ballia Stretch of the 
waterway. The navigational channel was 
marked for day navigation. Terminal facili-
ties at Bhagalpur, Monghyr and Patna were 
maintained to facilitate loadingl !Jnloadin.g of 
cargo. A scheme for construction of one 
general cargo berth at Patna at an estimated 
cost of Rs.4.90 crores was sanctioned in 
Septel'hber, 1991. The scheme is scheduled 
to be completed in a period of three years. 
However, facilities for operation of, vessels 
for shipping and navigation on the National 
Waterway are already existing. 

[English] 

Export Potential of West Bengal 

9667. SHRI JITENDRA NATH DAS: 
Will the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased ." 
to state: 
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(a) whether the Trade Fa"ir Authority 01 
India has conducted a survey on the expon 

I potentials of West Bengal; 

(b) If so, the details thereof? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MAN KHURSHEED): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 

AppolntmentsITransfer of Judges In 
Supreme CourtJHlgh Courts 

9668. SHRI GIRDHARI LAL BHAR-
GAVA: Will the Minister of LAW, JUSTICE 
AND COMPANY AFFAIRS be pleased to 
state: 

(a) the details of new appointment of 
Judges made in the Supreme Court during 
the last eleven months; and 

(b) the details of transfer of judges be-
tween different High Courts during the above 
period, court-wise? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 

S.No. Name of Judge 

SlShri Justices 

1. Gokal Chand Milal 

2. Smt. Leila Seth 

3. U.L. Bhat 

4. M.J. Rao 

5. B.P. Singh 

MINISTRYOFPARLIAMENTAAYAFFAIRS 
AND MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY 
AFFAIRS(SHRI RANGARAJAIN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): (a) and (b). The 
requisite information is given in the en-
closed statement. 

STATEMENT 

1. Appointment of judges made in the 
Supreme Court of India with effect 
from 1-6-91 (III date :-

1. Shri Justice S. Mohan 

2. Shri Justice B.P. Jeevan Reddy 

3. Shri Justice G. N. Ray 

4. Shri Dr. Justice A.S. Anand 

5. Shri Justice R.C. Patnaik 

2. Judges appointedltransferred as 
Chief Justices as well as Puisne 
Judges transferred from one High 
Courtto another with effect from 1-
6-1991 till date:-

Appointed/transferred 

From to 

P& H (CJ) Delhi 

Delhi (CJ)Himachal 
Pradesh 

'. 

Kerala (CJ) Gauhati 

Andhra (CJ) Kerala 
Pradesh 

Karnal<lka Patna 



283 . Written AnswetJ MAYS, 1992 Written AnswsIS 284 

S.No. ｎ｡ｭ･ｾｦ＠ Judge 

6. B.C. Varma 

7. M.K. Mukherjee 

S. S.P.Bhaurucha 

9. B.P. Saraf 

10. tot Rama Jois 

Violation of Ru ... by Banks 

9669. SHRI RAJNATH SONKAR 
SHASTRI: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) wheth8r soma of the nationalised 
bankS IiIve been violating the provisions of 
the Banking Regulations Act, 1949 and the 
Reserve Bank of India Act, 1934 by over-
lending without Insisting on the necessary 
cash reserve ratio and Uquldity ratio; and 

(b) H so, the details of the banks which 
have violated the said Acts during each of 
the last three years? 

"tHE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHAI DALBIR 
SINGH): ｾ＠ ang (b). Reserve Bank of India 
(RIB) hat reported that soma of the banks 
were not able to maintain the Statutory 
'liquidity Ratio (SLR) and Cash Reserve 
Ratio (CRR) as prescrbed by RBlfrom time 
to time. RBI has further indicated that It 
would not be In the public Interest to dIsdose 

ａｰｰｯｊｮｩｾｴｲ｡ｮ｡ｦ･ｲｲ･､＠

From 

Madya 
Pradesh 

calcutta 

Bombay 

Gauhatl 

(CJ): Chief Justice 

to 

(CJ) P&H 

(CJ) AUahabad 

(CJ) Kamataka 

Bombay 

(CJ)P&H 

the details of defaults Dy any individual banks 
which failed to maintain the Statutory liquid-
ly Ratio or Cash Reserve Ratio. 

DetKtlon of Fal .. Exlm Bank'. Reali •• 
tlon Certificate. 

9670. DR. RAJAGOPAlAN 
SRIDHARAN: Will the Minister of COM-
MERCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Madras office of the 
Joint Chief Controller of IfIlIOrts and Exports 
havedetectedacaserelatlngtoExlmBank's 
false f881isation certificates during March, 
1992; 

(b) I so, the details thereof; 

Cc) whether any officials have been 
found to be Involved in these transactions; 

(d) • so, the details thereOf; and 

(e) the action taken by the Govemmant 
against them? 
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THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE fOl8lgn exchange have been clln!cted thai 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (sHRIP.CHI. they shal not make any demand on the 
DAMBARAM): (a) No. Sir. Exlm Bank. as Reserve'Bank for foreign exchange except 
reported,isnotissuinganyforeisJnexchange for meeting their r:>ayment obligations for 
realisation certificates. Import of specified goods to the extent au-

(b1 to (e1. Do not arise. However. the 
Office of the JCCI&E Madras h,ve detacted 
49 cases where Exlm Scrip licences have 
been issued on basis of the documents 
J.UP$lQl'enNy found to be forged. These 
licences have been cancelled. The malter 
has also been reported to the police for 
appropriate action. 

[ Translation] 

Guldellnea for Authorlaed Foreign 
Exchange Dealera 

• 
9671. SHRI N.J. RA THVA: Win the 

Minister of FINANCE be pleased to state: 

(a) whether Reserve Bank of India has 
-issued any guidelines to ensure that the 
authorised foreign exchange dealers are 
able to run their business proficiently under 
the new liberalised Exchange Rate Man-
agement System; -

(b) If so, the main fealures thereof; and 

(c) when theseguideUnes were Issued? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) to (c). The original 
guidelines in pursuance ｯｦｾ＠ lberalised 
Exchange Rate Management system were 
issued by the Reserve Bank of India to the 
authorised dealers on 29.2.92. A number of 
supplementary Instruc;tIons have also been 
ｾｬＡ･､＠ thereafter clarifying the varioUs Is-
C!I;Ied raised by authol'isid dealers and 
ｅｬｘｰｯｯ･ｲｳｬｾＮ＠ The salient featUl8s of 
these guldelnas are as under: 

en The banks authorIsed'to deal In 

thOrised by Ministry of Finance under the 
'ollowlng heads: 

(a) Govemment departmental needs. 
specifically approved by Mlnlstryof Finance 
(DElpartment of Economic Affairs). 

(b) crude Oil, Diesel, Kerosene, 

(c) Fertilizers 

(d) Exchange for Imports against Exlm 
ScrIps and other import licences which are 
considered on par with Exlm ScrIps to the 
extent of the value thereof. 

(e) Exchange to the extent of 40% of 
vslue of Imports made advalnst dvance 
licencea impr8st licences and importa for 
replenishment of raw material for gem and 
Jewellery exports. 

(f) Imports of IHe saving drugs! equip-
·ments as approved by Ministry of Finance 
DElpartment of Economic Affairs) 

(ii) All- receipts under current 8C®unt 
transactions (both merchaclise exports and 
Invrlable receipts) will be required to be 
surrendered to banks authorised to dealtn 
foreign exchange. Of those 40% wi have to 
be surrendered aI the RBI official rate and 
60% at the Uarket determined rate. The 
aulm)rised dealer will COl'l'Mpondingly aur-
render 40% of their purchase to the RBI aI 
the official rate. The balance -80% cm-be 
retained by. them which can be sold for au 
perrntssbletransactions aI free market rail. 

(Ii) AI payments including payments for 
ｾｲｴ｡＠ (except those covered by 118m (I) 
above) wit be at the market rate. 
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(iv) All transactions relating to IMF will 
be at the officiai rate. 

(vi Receipts & Payments on capital 
account will be at the free market rate. 

(vi) All forward ccmmitments and swap 
liabilities as on 29th February 1992 would be 
honoured at contracted rates. 

(vii) Rates of Exchange for transac-
tions with ACU countries wi!! be fixed as 
hitherto. 

(viii) Transactions with countries in the 
bilateral group wili be conducted as hitherto 
in non-convertible rupees. 

(ix) The recipients of foreign exchange 
on account current transactions will be al-
lowed to retain15% of their receipts in for· 
eign currency accoLints. Balances in such 
accounts can be utilised for all current 
account purposes. 

(x) The Reser,e Bank of India may at 
its discretion undertake foreign exchange 
operations at the tree market rates. 

[English] 

Dearness Allowance to Central Gov-
ernment Employees 

9672. SHRI SHRAVAN KUMAR 
PATEL: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the percentage of Dear-
ness Allowance with relation to pay and that 
of dearness relief in relation to the quantum 
of pension payable t9 the Central Govern-
ment employees arEi 'Comparatively much 
less than that payable to corresponding 
employees or pensioners of differenf State 
Government; 

(b) if so, the details thereof and the 

reasons therefor; and 

(c) the steps contemplated to bring the 
Central Government employees at par with 
those of State Governments? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI SHAN-
T ARAM POTDUKHE): (a) to (c). The 
Central Government has its own scheme of 
grant of ｄ･｡ｲｮ･ｾＵ＠ Allowance to serving 
emplu yt"8S and Dearness Relief to pension-
ers, whlsr: IS based on the recommenda-
tions of 1M 4th C'?ntral Pay Commission. 
This scheme is independent of the schemes 
adopted by different State Governments for 
grant of D.A and Dearness Relief to their 
employees and pensioners. There is no 
mechanism for maintaining comparative 
rates oj Dearness Aliowance and Dearness 
Relief admissible to Central Government 
employees/Pensionrs viz-a-viz Employees! 
Pensioners 01 various State Governments. 

Export Orders Bagged by STC. 

9673. SHRI ANNA JOSHI: Will the 
Minister c1 COMMERCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) the details of the export orders 
bagged by the State Tarding Corporation 
during the last three Years; 

(b) whether no major export order has 
been received by the State Trading Corpo-
ration during the last six months; 

(c) if so, the reasons therefor; and 

(d) the steps taken or proposed to be 
taken by the Government to make the State 
Trading Corporation a profitable trading 
house? (..I 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE(SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) Export turn-over of STC 
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during the last three years is given below:-

Year 

1989-90 

1990-91 

1991-92 
(Estimates) 

(Rs_ crores) 

752 

369 

623 

(b) and (c). The export turnover of STC 
during the las: six month period ending March, 
1992 amounts to approximately. 

(d) By virtue of its opera.ional activities 
in the areas 01 export, import and domestic 
trading, STC is a profit making company. 

Peerless General Finance and Invest-
ment Company 

9674. SHRIMATI CHANDRAPRABHA 
URS: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to staie: 

(a) the lotal amount invested by the 
public in Ihe Peerless General Finance and 
Investment Company Limited; and 

(b) the number of Government nomi-
nees on the Board of Management of the 
above Company? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH) :(a) Reserve Bank of India (RBI) 
have reported that according to the balance 
sheet as on 31.03. 91 of the Peerless Gen-
eral Finance and Investment Company 
Limited the company has showna liability 
under the sociale Welfare Scheme Fund of 
Rs. 1134.19 crores. The total lability under 
the said Fund in the balance sheet of the 
company does not however indicate the 
total deposit liabilities of the company as it 
has been following the concept of contrac-
tual liability in 16lrms of the Calcutta High 

Court Order daled 23rd March, 1990. After 
the Supreme Court Judgement dated 30th 
January. 1992, RBI have advised the com-
pany to furnish its total deposilliability as on 
31 st January, 1992. 

(b) There is no Government nominee 
on the Board of Management of this com-
pi:lfly. 

Coll3t)oration with Foreign Shipyards 

9675. ｓｉｾｒｉ＠ GURUDAS KAMAT: Will 
the Minister 01 SURFACE TRANSPORT be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Government have in-
vited foreign Shipyards to enter into partner-
ship with Indian Shipyard; and 

(b) jf so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRIJAGDISH TYTLER): (a) and (b). The 
Government have not invited foreign ship-
yards to enter into partnership with Indian 
Shipyards. However, Mazagon Dock lim-
ited, Bombay, has signed a protocol 01 
intention in September 1991 with a Russian 
firmforthe establishment of an IndoRussian 
Joint venture for designing, building and 
exploitation of Tourist Submersibles and 
Support Ships in India. The detailed pro-
posal is still to be finanlised. The actual 
registration of the new company would be 
done only after the viability of the project is 
finally cleared. 

1 Translation] 

Export of Cars/Jeeps. 

9676. KUMARIUMA BHARTI: Willme 
Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whetherthe Government propose to 
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promote the export of cars and Jeeps; and 

(b) it so, the facuilities proposed to be 
provided by the Govemment therefor? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRJ SAL-
MAN KHURSHEED): (a) • has been the 
constant endeavour of the Government to 
promote_exports Including those of cars and 
Jeeps. 

(b) FacilitieS provided by the Govern-
ment for export of cars and jeeps Include: 

(I) making available Inputs for 
export production at interna-
tional prices under the Duty 
Exemption Scheme and Inter-
national Price Reimbursement 
Scheme; 

(ii) provision for irTllort of capital 
goods for export production 
at concesslonallmport duty in 
lieu of an export obligation; 

(iii) provision for partiai compen-
sation of high premium of prod-

- uct liability insurance to ,"'Over 
product liability of exports to 
developed mar1<ets; 

(iv) exemption of whole of income 
derived from export from levy 
of Income tax; 

(v) provision of convertibility of 
60% of export earnings at 
mar1<et rates of exchange in-
troduoedintherecentbudget 
also provides jncentive for 
export. 

{EnglISh} 

RI.. In Prlc. of Janat. cloth •• 

96n. KUMARI PUSHPA DEVtSINGH: 

Will the Minister of TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whetherthe Govern ment are aware-
of the abnormal increase in the prices of 
Janata clothes: 

(b) If so, the reasons therefor; and 

(c) the steps takenlprOposed to be 
taken by the Govemment to bring down the 
prices 01 janata cloths? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK .. 
GEHLOT): (a) and (b). Government of India 
with a view to providing greater flexibility to . 
implementing agencies of Janata cloth pro-
duction programme, only fixes the maxi-
mum ceiling price while giving flexibility to 
State Government to revise periodically the 
actual selling price which depends on vari-
ous factors like offtake of Janata cloth as 
also the yam price and periodic wage revi-
sions paid to the weavers by the implement-
ing agencies. Provision of ceiling price is to 
guard against abnormal increase in selling 
price of janata cloth of which there are no 
reports. 

(c) In view of resource constraints and 
Government's Policy to cut down subsidyin 
all areas, It may not be possible to increese 
the rate of subsidy commensurate with in-
creasing cost of production of Janata cloth. 
Govemment has, however, prescribed that 
overheads of the implementing agencies 
should not eICceed 25% of the production 
cost with a view to peg the selling price of 
janata cloth at reasonable levels. 

Export an(Llmport of nmber, 

9678_ SHRI SYED SHAHABUDDIN : 
Willthe Ministerof COMMERCE be pleasl!td 
to state: 

(a) the quantity and FOB value of 
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timber exported and CF value 0' timber 
imported during each of the last three 'Inan· 
clal years; . 

(b) the names 0' the major suppliers and 
buyers; and 

(c) the break-up 0' the imported timber 
by quality or end use? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE(SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) Data on actual exports 
and imports 0' various items (Including 
Tirmer) are published in the "Monthly Statis-
tics 0' Foreign Trade 0' India Vol. I 
(Exports) and Vol. II (1I'll'Orts) brought out by 
Directorate General of Commercial Intelli-
gence and Statistics, Calcutta copies 0' 
which are available in the parliament li-
brary. 

(b) and (c). Foreign Trade Statistics 
are not maintained by giving a break up of 
suppliers, buyers, quality or end use. _ 

Gold Smuggling 

(c) the reaction of the Government 
thereto; 

(d) whether the Government have made 
any assessment about the extent 0' check 
on gold smuggling and haw ala transactions 
after the introduction of the gold import 
policy; and 

(e) If so, the outcome thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) Government is aware of 
the news Item. 

(b) and (c). After introduction of the gold 
! import policy from 1 st March 1992, there has 

been 14 seizures ot contraband gold weigh-
ing 40.1 kgs· valued at Rs. 1.20. crores· 
during March. 1992. and 34 seizures of 
51.29 kgs_' of contraband gold valued at 
RS.1.53 crores· during April. 1992 at Indira 
Gandhi International Airport. These sei-
zures were made from Indians as well as 
from foreign r..et\.onals. 

(d) and (e). n is still too eartyto make an 
9679. SHRI SANAT KUMAR MAN- assessment about the' extent of ckeck on 

DAL: 
SHRI BRUBHUSHAN 

SHARAN SINGS: 
SHRI SATYA ｄｅｏｾｉｎｇｈＺ＠
SHRIMATI BASAVARAJES-

WARI: 

Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether his attention has been 
invited to the news item captioned "Gold 
smuggling on th, rise- appearing In -The 
Hindustan Times; New Delhi dated April 
17.1992; 

(b) If so. the details thereof and the facts 
of the matter reported therein; 

gold smuggling and hawala transact-ions 
alterthe introduction of the gold import policy 
with effect from 1.3.1992. However. a major 
step taken very recently is to reduce the 
customs duty on gold being brought as 
baggage under certain condition. from. Rs. 
450 per ten grams 10 Rs. 220 per ten grams 
In convertible foreign currency. 

Complaints Regarding Non- Refundl 
Interest on Application Money by 

Companle. 

9680. SHRI RAM NAIK: Will the 
Minister of LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY 
AFFAIRS be pleased to state: 

(a) the number of complaints received 
by the Govemment during 1989-90,1990-
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91 and 1991-92 regarding nonrefund of 
application money together with interest 
after ten weeks of the last date of application 
for shares/debentures from the investors. 
company-wise; 

(b) the number of cases in which the 
Govemment took action in this regard; 

(c) the number of cases in which the 
erring companies were prosecuted; and 

(d) if no action has been taken so far, the 
reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF LAW JUSTICE AND COMPANY 
AFFAIRS(SHRI RAGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGLAM:(a) and (b). The De-
partment of company Affairs and its field 
offices have been receiving a number of 
complaints including those relating to non-
refund of application money and interest 
tnefeon. ｈｏＧｦｯｬ･｜ｪ･ｾＬ＠ no se?na\e statistics 
are centrally maintained in respect of com-
plaints of the nature referred to. On receipt 
of complaints against any company, the 
matters were processed for ascertaining the 
factual position and for obtaining the reply of 
the companY,to initiate further appropriate 
aclion under the Companies Act,1956. 

(c) and (d). In terms of Section 73 (2A) 
of the Companies Act, action for prosecution 
in respect of companies has been under-
taken in the respective Courts by the Reg-
istrar of Companies under the directions of 
the Department of Company Affairs. 

[ Trans/ation) 

Legal Aid Assistance to Bihar 

AND COMPANY AFFAIRS be pleased to 
state; 

(a) whether the legal aid assistance 
provided by the Union Govemment 
to Biharfor the purpose of providing 
legal assistance to the poor people in 
the State during the years 1989-90 
and 1990-91 was lower than the as-
sistance provided in the Year 1988-
98: and 

(b) If so, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRYOF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS . 
AND MINISTEROF STATE INTHE MINIS-
TRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY 

. AFFAIRS (SHRI P.R. KUMARAMANGA-
LAM): (a) Financial assistance is given by 
the State Government for the purpose of 
providing legal assistance to the poor people. 
No request was made by the Bihar Govern-
ment to the Central Governmentforfinancial 
assistance in this regard during the years 
'988-89, '989-90 and 1990-91. 

(b) Question does not arise. 

Foreign Exchange Outtlow on Divi-
dends 

9682. SHRI NITISH KUMAR: 
DR. MAHADEEPAK 

SINGH SHAKYA: 

Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether there has been a sharp rise 
in foreigo exchange outflow in the form of 
divisdends on foreign investments as re-
ported in the'Financial Express' of March 17, 
1992; 

(b) if so, the total capital Invested by 
9681. SHRIMOHAMMADALlASHRAF foreign companies in the country during 

FATMI: Willthe Minister of LAW, JUSTICE each of the last three years; and 
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(c) the details of such foreign exchange 
outflow during the aforesaid period? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) to (c). The information 
is being collected and will be laid on the 
Table of the House. 

[English) 

AD. B. AID 

9683. SHRI R. SUR ENDER 
REDDY: 

SHRI SHRAVAN KUMAR 
PATEL: 

SMRIMATI BIBHU KUMARI 
DEVI: 

SHRI SIMON MARANDI: . 

Will the Ministerof FINANCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether Asian Development Bank 
has agreed to provide on billion US dollar 
project aid during 1992-93; 

(b) if so, the projects on which the aid is 
likely to be spent; and 

(c)the amount earmarked in respect of 
Andhra Pradesh out of this aid? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR):(a) to (c). The Asian Devel-
opment Bank has agreed to a total commit-
ment level of US 950 million during the 
calendar year 1992 for any four of the five 
projects under processing. All these five 
projects in 1992 pipeline are central sector 
projects, covering Power, Energy Conser-
vation Petroleum and parts Sectors and a 
possible Programme loan for financial 
sector. 

Export of fireworks/Crackers 

9684. DR. SHRIMATI K.S. SOUNDA-
RAM: Will the Minister 01 COMMERCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the government propose to 
export fireworks/crackers; 

(b) H so, the details of the exports 
proposed to be made during the current 
year; and 

(c) the foreign exchange likely to be 
earned therefrom? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMARAM): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) and (c). The estimated exports 01 
fireworks/crackers during the year 1992-93 
would be Rs. 25.0 lakhs. 

Are at Cochln Port 

9685. PROF. K. V. THOMAS: Will the 
Minister of SURFACE TRANSPORT be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the investigation into the fire 
accident which had taken place in October, 
1991 at Cochin Port due to spilling of Naph-
tha from SCI ship has since been com-
pleted; 

(b) if so, the findings thereof; 

(c) the details of Similar fire accidents 
which took place in Cochin port during the 
last three years; 

(d) the steps taken for the effective 
control of fire in Cochin Port; 

(e) the compensation paid to the trawl-
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ers of ｴｾ＠ Integrated FISheries Project which 
got damaged I the Naphtha fire In Cachin 
waters; and 

(f) the compensation ｧｩｾ･ｮ＠ to the next of 
kin of victims of this fire? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTlER): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. . 

(c) A similar fire accident had taken 
place in July 1990. The cause forthe fire was 
Naphtha which leaked from the cargo tank 
into the segregated ballasi tank of M .V. 
Dadabhai Naoroji and got discharged into 
the channel by the ship while deballasting of 
the segregated ballast tanks. The Naphtha 
so dlschargEid had flown downthe channel 
towards the $8a via Cochin Oil Terminal and 
part of It got stagnated in the waters between 
the rear of the Cachin Oil Terminal and the 
bunds connecting the sand Banks 

(d) Inspection of all oil tankers specially 
Ships carrying Naphtha or spirit has been 
intensified. APditional fire fighting equip-
ment have been provldd. Action has been 
taken to strengthen Marine Pollution De-
partment. 

(e) No compensation has been paid for 
the trawlers of the Integrated fisheries Proj-
ect. 

(f) One person died in the fire accident 
which took place in October 1991. The next 
of kin of the victim has been paid a compen· 
sation of Rs. 2S,OOOI-by the Cachln Port 
Trust on humanitarian consideration. 

Import of Wh .... oll.nd Cotton. 

9686. ｓｈｒｾ＠ GEORGE FERNANDES: 
Will the Minislerof COMMECE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) Whether the Government have de-
cided to il1l>ort wheat oil and cotton during 
the current year; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; and 

(c) the other commodities proposed to 
be il1l>Crted during the current year? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRYOF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMABRAM): (a) and (b). Although the 
Government has decided to il1l>Ort 10 lakh 
tonnes of wheat, no order has been placed 
for its procurement. Import of edible oil and 
determination of its quantity is an on going 
process based on relevant factors like availa-
bility of edible 011 locally ,Its prices etc. 2lakh 
bales of cotton has been allowed for Import 

. during the current year. 

(c) Information is being collected and 
will be laid. on the Table of the House. 

Computerlsatlon of Rajasthan 
High court 

9687. SHRI GIRDHARI lAL BHAR-
GAVA: Will the Minister of LAW JUSTICE 
AND COMPANY AFFAIRS be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the govemment propose to 
Increase the wor1dng hours of courts espe-
cially in Rajasthan and Jammu and Kashmir 
High Courts for expediting the disposal of 
pending cases; 

(b) if so, the details thereof; 

(c) whether any proposal to provide 
sophisticated co"lJUfer facllity In courts' 
especlaay In Rajasthan High Court Is also 
undarconsideration; 

(d) • so, the ｾ｡ｩｬｳ＠ thereof; and 
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(e) the steps taken by the Government 
in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AF-
FAIRS AND MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COM-
PANY AFFAIRS (SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM):(a)and (b). No Sir, 
The working hours of High courts Including 
Rajasthan and Janvnu and Kashmir High 
Courts are regulated by these courts them-
selves. 

(c) to (e). The State Governments 
have been request to examine In consulta-
tion with the High Courts, the feasibility of 
installing computers and other modern elec-
ｴｲｯｮｩ｣･ｱｵｾｭ･ｮｬｳｬｮ｣ｯｵｲｴｳｴｯｦ｡｣ｬｬｩｴ｡ｴ･ｳｰ･･､ﾭ

ier disposal of cases. This is basically a 
malter for the State Governments and the 
High Courts to decjde. 

Assistance by NBH under scheme of 
Land Development and shalter Projects 

Minister of FINANCE ｾ＠ pleased to state: 

(a) the amount distributed under the 
land Development and Shener Projects • 
Scheme (L. D. S. P.) of the National Bank 
(N.H.B.)during the last year, State-wise and 
project -wise; and 

(b) the amount distributed by the Punjab 
National Bank Housing Finance Limited 
under the said scheme In March, 1992 in 
Gujarat? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DALBIR 
SINGH): (a) The disbursement of refinance 
by Nati.,nal Housing Bank (NHB) under the 
Land Development and. Shelter Projects 
(LO&SP) through BankSlHousing Finance 
CompanIes during 1991-92 (April-March) is 
given In the statement. 

(b) PNB Housing Finance Ltd. , has 
(Translation) reported that it has not.disbursed any amount 

in March, 1992 in the State of Gujarat under 
9688. SHRI N. J. RA THVA: Will the LD &SP scheme. 

STATEMENT 

Statement showing the disbursement of refinance by National Housing Bank (NHB) 
for land Dev(llopmsnt and Sh8/ter Projects (LD &SP) through 8anksIHousing Finance 
CofTJJBIJles during 1991-92 (April- March) 

ExeCuting Agencies 

(A) Public Agencies (Project) 

1. Meerut Development Authority 

2:, Allahabad Development 
Authority (KatJu ki Bagiya) 
(Kalindlpurarn) 

Amount Disbursed 
(Rs. crores) 

3.18 

4.03 
1.77 
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Executing Agencies 

3. GorakhpurDevelopment 
Authority (Vikasnagar Scheme) 

4. Agra Deveiopment Authority 
(Kalindivihar Project) 

5. U .P. Housing and Development 
Board Ｈｖ｡ｳｵｮ､ｨｾｲ｡＠ project 

6. Karnataka Housing Board 

7. Goa Housing Board 
, (Kurti Ponda Project) 

8. 

9. 

[English) 

Ghaziabad Development 
Authority (Indrapuram) 

M.P. Housing Board 
(Hirapuri, Raipur) 
(Sultanabad) 
(Damatri, Raipur and laharpur, 

Total (A) 

(B) Rental Housing Projects Gujarat 
State Police Housing Corporation 
(Vadodara) . 

(C) Professional Developers 
Sat yam Home Private Limited 
0.70 
(Hyderabad- Andhra Pradesh) 

Total: (A) +(8) + (C) : 

Visit of Israel Business Mission. 

9689. SHRI SHRAVAN KUMAR 

visited India recently: 

Amount DIsbursed 
(Rs. crores) 

2.42 

3.00 

17.64 

2.00 

1..83 

5.00 

1.87 

42.74 

0.30 

ｾＮＷＴ＠

(b) if so, the details thereof and the 
discussions held with them; and 

PATEL: Will the Minister of COMMERCE be (c) the assessment made about the 
pleased to state: trade potential with that country during the 

ensuing year in particular and in the long run 
(a) whether an Israeli business mission in general? 
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THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MAN KHURSHEED): (a) to (c). An Israeli 
Business Mission led by Mr. David Litvak. 
Director General of Israel Export Institute 
had visisted India and were In Delhi on 30th 
and 31st March.1992 as reported by Fed-
eration of Indian Chambers of Commerce 
and Industry & Confederation of Indian 
Industry. The Business Mission had discus-
sions with .the members of above men-
tioned Industry Associations. The discus-
sions related to possible areas of coopera-
tion in the fields oftrade and industry. These 
discussions were exploratory in nature and 
at this stage it is difficulttoll11ake an assess-
ment about the trade potential with Israel 
based on such preliminary discussions. 

Loss on Sale of Shares of Public 
Sector Companies. 

9690. SHRI GURUDAS KAMAl: 
SHRI PANDURANG PUN-

DLiK FUNDKAR: 

Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to sate:-

(a) the numberof shares of public sector 
companies sold by the Unicfn Government 
so far; 

(b) whether the Government have suf-
fered huge loss thereon; 

(c) if so, the details thereat; 

(d) the criteria adopted by the Govern-
ment for evaluation of the shares of these 
public sactor companises; and 

(e) the steps proposed to be taken by 
the Government for non-recurrence of such 
losses in the future? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRYOF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-

WAR ｔｈａｾｕｒＩＺ＠ (a)to (e). The information 
is being collected and will be laid on the 
Table of the House_ 

Japanese Assistance for Various 
Projects 

9691. SHRI SANAT KUMAR MANDAL: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether a high- level meeting was 
held in Delhi during the last monthJNith the 
representatives of the Japanese Govern-
ment and the prospects of Japanese assis-
tance for various projects including the 
Bakreswar power project were discussed; 
and 

(b) if so, the outcome of the discussions 
held? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a} Yes, Sir 

(b) We had posed a long list of propos-
als forthe 1992 Japanese OECF loan pack-
age. The Japanese Govemment Mission 
short-listed 12 of these projects, including 
the Bakreshwar Project for further discus-
sion. The Mission had detailed discussions 
ｾｴｨ＠ the respective Administrative Ministries 
and Proje(.1 authorities. This Govemment 
Mission will be followed by the OECF Ap-
praisal Mission in May, 1992_ Thereafter, 
the loan package will be finalized and an-
nounced by the Government of Japan allhe 
Aidlndia Consortium Meeting to be held in 
June, 1992. 

Removal of Consumer ｧｯｯｾｳ＠ From 
Negative List of Imports 

9692. SHRI R. SUR ENDER REDDY: 
Willthe MinisterofCOMMERCE be pleased 
to state: 
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(a). whether the Government have 
decided to start the process of removing 
consumer goods from the negative list of 
Imports; 

(b) H so, the details thereof; 

(e) whether the Govemment have also 
informedthe industrialists that no request to 
Include any Item in the negative list of 
Imports will be entertained; 

(d) If so, by what time a final decision 
in this regard is likely to be taken; and 

(e) to what extent this decision is likely 
to be helpful? 

HE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) to (e). Under the Export 
and Itll)Ort Policy (1992-97). consumer 
goods are under restraint. The intention of 
the Government is to keep the Negative List 
of Imports under review and to prune the 
list from time to time as exports gather 
momenturnandtheeconomygains strength. 

Export of Handloom Garment. 
from Tamil Nadu 

9693. DR. SHRIMATI K.S. SOUNDA-
RAM: Will the Mirflster of TEXTILES be 
pleased to staet:: 

(a) whetherthe handloom garments and 
hosiery goods made In Tamil Nadu are in 
great demand in the international market; -

(b) If so. the steps taken to increase tilt 
production and export of these Items; and 

(c) the detaiis of the agencies which are 
involved in the export of these items? " 

'THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MlNrsTRY OF TEXTLES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHlOT):(a) Hoslerygoodsmanufactur8(t 

In TamB Nadu are Exported in large ｾｵ｡ｮｴｬﾭ
ties; Handloom garment expot1S are not 
very substantial. I • ' . 

(b). The Garment· Export Entllement 
Distribution Polic::r.Provides for reservation 
of certain quotas for hosiery Items and tor 
such quantities, separate floor prices are 
fixed. 

The Apparel Export Promotion Council 
has established an Apparel Training & Design 
Cantr at T1rupur (Tamil Nadu) for Imparting 
training In manufadure of hosiery Items. 
The -COuricil also runs a knitWear service 
centre in association with the South India 
Textile Research Association for testing of 
fabrics etc .. 

(e) Expert Promotion of garments in-
cluding handloom garments and hosiery 
items is handled by the Apparel ExPOrt 
Promotion Council. . 

Export of Onion. 

9694. SHRI RAM NAIK: WiD the 
Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the Government have re-
cently decided to export onion ｴｨｲｯｾｨ＠
NAFED; 

(b) If so, the countries to which onion 
export is proposed to be permitted through 
NAFED and by other exporting agencies; 

(e) whether the other eXp<?rtlng agen-
cies are proposed to be permitted to export 
onion at the r.ninlmum rate fixed by NAFED; 

(d) If so, the reasons therefor; 

(e) whetherthese agencies are required 
to obtain a no objection certificate 1roni the 
NAFED In this regard; .• 
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(f) if so, the norms to be followed by the 
NAFED before issue of such certificates? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL· 
MAN KHURSHEED): (a). The export of 
onion continues to be canalised through 
National Agricuhural Co-operative Market-
ing Federation. of India Ltd. (NAFED). 

(b) to (8). Underthe new Export Policy 
NAFED will export onion to Sri Lanka, 
Mauritius, Seychelles & Maldives exclu-
:;jyaiy. Export to all other countries is open 
for other exporting agencies as well subj(;ct 
however, to minimum export price to be 
fixed by NAFED and grant of no Objection 
certificate across the counter for which the 
procedure has been liberalised. This has 
been done with a view to maximise export 
while keeping the commodity competitive in 
the International market as also ensure 
optimum foreign exchange eamings. 

(f) Anyone desirous of exporting onion 
will have to register oneself tor the purpose 
with NAFED. This will be only a one time 
requirement. Those already registered with 
NAFED need not get themselves registered 

Name of the Mills 

1. BUDGE Budge JUTE MILL 

2. ANGLO- INDIA 

3. AGARPARA 

4. BARNAGORE 

5. SHREE HANUMAN 

6. TIRUPATI 

7. EASTERN MANUFACTURING 
COMPANY 

" 

again. The export of onion will be subject to 
Minimum Export Price as fixed by NAFED 
from time to time The exporter will have to 
obtain No Objection Cerlfilcatefrom NAFED 
for each export consignment. The exporter 
will fumish to NAFED details such as quan-
tity to be exported • the rate at which the 
export is being undertaken the port of ship-
ment. destinaiion and details ofL.C. NAFED 
will grant No Objection Certificate across 
the counter to such exporters. 

9695. SHRI GURUDAS KAAMAT: 
Will the Milnisterof TEXTILES be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether several Jute Mills in West 
Bengal have been locked out; 

(b) If so, the details thereof, millwlse; 
and 

(c) the steps taken by the Govemment 
in the maner? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ａｓｾｏｋ＠
GEHLOT): (a) and (b). Following Jute Mills 
are lying closed in West Bengal at present. . 

Date of No, of Workers 
Closure affected 

18.3.88 3400 

20.5.91 5500 

28.1.92 3400 

28.1.92 4176 

28.1.92 3675 

28.1.92 1200 

28.1.92 2100 
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Name of the Mills 

8. KANKINARAH 

Out 01 the above two Jute mills namely 
Budge Budge and Anglo- India have ｾｮ＠
under lockout since a long. period of time. 
Other five mills named Agarpara, Bnma-
gore. Shree- Hanuman Tirupati and fastern 
Manufacturing COl'J1)any were closed from 
28.1.92duetostatewisestrikein jute Indus-
try in West Bengal. After wage SettIArne ... • 
ｾＺ［ｾｾ＠ un i., .392 strike in ｊｵｴｾ＠ Mills ｩｾ＠ ｗ･ｾ［＠
Bengal was withdrawn from 17.3.92 but 
these five mills could not be reopenedin 
view of non- implementation of wage settle-
ment in their mills. Another mill namely 
Kankinarah was closed with effect from 
27.3.92 due to their inability to pay wages 
according to wage settlement. 

(c) Matter Is being looked after by the 
State Government of West Bengal and In 
so,", cases by BIFR. Several meetings 
have been held by State Government to find 
a solution on this point. 

Grant- In- aid Loan to Stat •• 

9696. SHRI SYED SHAHABUDDIN : 

Date of 
Closure 

27.3.92 

No, of Workers 
affected 

4205 

Will the Minister of F!NANCE be pleased to 
state; 

(aj the tola; giam-in aid <ind disbursed 
by the Union Government to each Statel 
Union Territory during 1991-92; 

(b) the total repayment iO the Union 
Govemment by each State/Union Territory 
including principal and interest, on accdunt 
of the outstanding loans, during 1991-92; 

(c) net flow of financial resources from 
the Centreto each See/Union Territory; and 

(d) net flow to each SatelUnion Tsrri-
tory per capita of population (mid-year esti-
mate) and per square kilometre of area? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISRY OF FINANCE (SHRI SHAN-
TARAMPOTDUKHE):(a)to(d). Statement-
I regarding informing in respect of Sates and 
Statement-II regarding Union i errltory, are 
enclosed. 
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Promotion 0' Drawing ataft 

9697. SHRI GIRDHARI LAL BHAR-
GAVA: Will the Minister of DEFENCE be 
pleasedto refer to the reply given to unstar-
red Question No. 4534 on August 31,1988 
and state: 

(a) whether the Drawing Staff eligible 
for promotion have- been promoted to the 
post of wO!i(shop officer; 

(b) If so, the details thereof; and 

(c) if not, the reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHRI 
SHARAO PAWAR): (a)to (c). As there is no 
provision In the existing ,Recruitment Rules 
torthe Promotion of Drawing Staff i.e. from 
Chief Draughtsman to Workshop Officer, 
Group 'B' a proposal has been made to in-
corporate the necessary enabling provi-
sions In the Rules. As per the Prescribed 
procedure, the Draft Recruitment Rules 
were required to be approved by the 
Department of Personnel and Training and 
the UPSC. The Draft Recruitment Rules 
have Since been approved by the Depart-
ment of personnel and Training and await 
approval of UPSC. 

Visit of Defence Minister to 
Usa 

9698. SHRI RAMCHANORA 
GHANGARE: 

SHRlMATI BIBHU KUMARI. 
DEVI: 

SHRI BHAGEY 
GOBAROHAN: 

I 
(b) Hao, the main objectaofthe visit and 

the outcome thereof? . 

THE MINISTER OF DEFENCE (SHRI 
SHARAO PAWAR): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) The primary objective of the visit 
was to promote mutual understanding and 
exchange views on the security concerns of 
both countries. This was achieved during 
meeting with US Government leaders and 
officials. 

[ Translation) 

Caving In of Nizamuddin Bridge 

9699. SHRI BRIJ BHUSHAN 
SHARAN SINGH: 

SHRI SIMON MARANDI: 
SHRI MADANLAL KHUR-

ANA: 
SHRI SA TV A OEO SINGH: 

Will the Minister of SURF.ACE TRANS-
PORT be pleased to state: 

(a) whether some portion of the Ni-
zamuddin bridge collapsed recently; 

(b) If so, whether any enqUiry has been 
conducted in this regard; 

(c) If so, the details and the outcome 
thereof? 

(d) the action taken or proposed to be 
taken against the persons found guilty; 

(e) whether the people coming from 
TransYarnuna areas are in acute distress 
due to caving in of a part of the bridge; 

WI! the Minister of DEFENCE be (f) If so, the time, Dy wnlCh the repair 
pleased to state: work Is likely to be completed and the bridge 

Is made operational for use by public; 
(a) whether he visited USA in April. 

1992;'and (g) the ImO!Jnt spent on the repair of 
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this bridge since January 1,1992; and 

(h) the precautionary measures pro-
posed to be taken by the Government to 
prevent recurrence of such incidents? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTlER): (a). No, Sir. 
only a portion of the road in the immediate 
approach of the bridge on the eastern side 
had caved in. 

(b) to Ｈ､ＩｾＧ＠ A Technical Committee has 
been set up by the Government 01 India to 
inquire into the causes 01 the mishap. The 
Committee has been asked to give its 
report by the end 01 May, 1992. 

(e) and (f). Urgent repairs to the dam-
aged portion of the approach road have 
been carried out and the bridge has already 
been opened to light vehicular traffic on the 
evening 01 23rd April, 1992. 

(g) The estimated expenditure on re-
pairs to the damaged portion of the Eastern 
approach to the bridge is about Rs. 5 lakhs. 
Apart from this an amount 01 Rs.51.37Iakhs 
has been spent since January 1,1992 on the 
rehabilitation of the bridge wllich Is in prog-
ress under a sanctioned scheme. 

(h) The leak in the bend of the water 
mains althe location where the caving-In of 
the approach road took place, has been 
plugged and is being kept under watch. 
Further measures to r.revent recurrence of 
such Incidents wUI be Inalised after1he fincl-

Ings 01 the Technical Committee are known. 

(English) 

Development Schem .. In Har-
ye..-. 

9700. SHRI BHUPINDER SINGH 
HOODA: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whetherthere are any programmes_ 
for intrOduCing development schemes with 
the assistance of the world Bank and some 
other international tional ｯｲｧ｡ｮｬｳｾｬｯｮｳ＠ in the 
t State of Haryana; 

(b) H so, the details thereof; 

(c) the estimated costs thereof; and 

(d) the time by which these are likely to 
be COl1l>leted? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTERY OF FINANCE (SSHRI RA-
MESHWAR THAKUR): (a) to (d). A list of 
development schemes likely to be intro-
duced with the assistance of the world bank 
and other Inter-national organistions In the 
State of Haryana and their estimated cost Is 
altachedas statement. 

The projects which would 'inally be tied 
up, the extent and timing Of cgmnitment 
would depend on detailed project prepara-
tion and donor preferences and commit-
ment availability. 
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EC Aided Projects and 

9701. SHRIR.SURENDERREDDY: 
SHRIMATI VASUNDHARA 

RAJE: 

Will the Ministerof FINANCE be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether the European Community 
propose to finance some major projects of 
India; 

(b) if so, the details of these projects; 

(c) the amount likely to be invested in 
each of these projects? 

THE MINISTE OF STATE INTHE MIN-
ISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESHWAR 
THAKUR): (a) Ves, Sir. 

(b) and (c). The details of the projects 
being considered for financing by the Euro-
pean Community under their Development 
cooperation Assistance Programme are: 
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Mutual Funds by State Finance 
Corporations and Industrial Dsvelop-

ment ｃｾ＿ｯｲ｡ｴｬｯｮＮ＠

9702. SHRI R. SURENDER REDDY: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased 10 

state: 

(a) whetherlhe State Finance Corpora-
tions and Industrial Development Corpora-
tions have been urged by the Union Govern-
ment 10 sel up mutual funds and to reduce 
their depe'ndence on the Industrial Develop-
ment Bank 01 India lor refinance; 

(b) if so, the othersuggeslions made by 
the Union Government in this regard; 

(c) the number 01 the SFCs and Indus-
trial Development Corporations succeeded 
in getting the credit from the foreign coun-
tries; and 

(d) to what al.lent the Union Govern-
ment have approved the proposals made by 
the State Finance Corporation? 

THE MINISTER OF S1 A 1£ \N "THE 
MINISTRY OF FINA.NC£ (SHR.1 QIIo.Lmf\ 
SINGH):(a) No. Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 

(c) The Industrial Development Bank of 
India has reported that no stat: Financial 
Corporation orStata Industrial Development 
Corporation has received any direct credit 
for its own lending operations from foreign 
countries. 

Cd) Does not arise. 

[ Translation) 

Industrial labour under Group 
Insurance Scheme 

9703. SHRI BHAGWAN SHANKAR 

RAWAT: Will the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the numberof labourers covered by 
Group Insurance Scheme, state- wise; 

(b) whether there Isany scheme to bring 
the child labourers and agncultura"abour-
ers also underthe Group Insurance scheme; 

(c) if so, the details thereof; and 

(d) It not. the reasons therefor 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI DALBIA 
SINGH): (a) to (d). Agroup insljrance scheme 
for Landless Agricultural Labourers was in-
troduced by the Government of India on tho 
15th August 1987 to cover ALL the heads of 
the landless agricultural labourers' families 
between the ages 18 and 60 for a sum 
assured of Rs.2,OOO/-. This Scheme which 
was inititlally financed by the Central ｇｯｾＮ＠
is now being financed by the lIC from the 
Social Security fund with effect from 1st 
April, 1990. Under this Scheme, the entire 
annual premium cost is borne by the L1C. 

There is no specific group insurance 
scheme to cover exclusively child labourers 
or other labourers. However, the Life Insur-
ance Corporation of India has set up a social 
Security Fund with an entail Corpus of Rs. 
100 crores and formulated various group 
insu-rance schemes to cover· the labourers 
of the unorganised sector. Under these 
schemes, 500/0 of the premium is payable by 
the beneficiary and the balance 50% is ｾｴ＠
out ofthe Social Security Fund. The Scheme 
envisages payment of Rs. 3,000/- to the 
legal heirs of the Insured on the normal 
death of the Marmer of the Scheme and Rs. 
6,0001- In case of an aCCidental death. The 
workers under various occupations. cov-
ered under these schemes include bidl 
workers, carpenters.handloom weavers. 
rickshaw pullers fishermen. Safa; Karma-
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charis, forest wof'l(ers etc. Under these 
schemes, 23,91, 927 lives have been cov-
ered upto 1 st March, 1992(the late'St figures 
available). 

[English] 

Excessive Profit by Drug Compa-
nies. 

9704. SHRI SANAT KUMAR MANDAl: 
Will the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased 
t8 ＵｾＳｴｦＳＺ＠

(a) whether the Government are con-
templating penal action and policy changes 
to prevent pharmaceutical companies from 
importing disprotionatelv larc,-' ｱｾＧ［ｬｮｴｩｴｩ･ｳ＠ of 

• Inputs lor the export 01 ｊＬｾＬｧＵＺ＠

(b) the names of companies which have 
made excessive profits by drawing heavily 
from the country's foreign exchange re-
serves; 

(e) whether the Government have by 
now been able to .quantity th(l amount of 
oonelils accruing to various companies by 
misuse 01 foreign exchange and availing 01 
excessive duty drawback; 

(d) If so, the particulars thereof; and 

(e) the nature of penal action contem-
plated to be iak6:": aga!!'!':t the earring drug 
u.,ils? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI· 
DAMBARAM): (a). The Import and Export 
Policy 1990-93, provided for a number of 
routes 10 import inputs forthe production and 
export of drugs and pharmaceuticals viz. 
Open General Licensing, Supplementary 
licensing, Replenishment licensing and 
Advancellcensing. The pharmaceutical. 
companies could make any amount of 1m-

ports allowed under open central licensing. 
Under the supplementary Licensing regime, 
the companies could procure the inputs both 
for domestoic production as weI! as export 
production. It is u nderthe Advance licensing 
regime where the duty free inputs had to 

.correlate with the export production. The 
Export and Import Policy 1992-97 has 
abilshed the Open General licensing 
Regime and supplementary licences. Im-
port; !,ave been made free except for the 
i!t'rTlS mentioned in the Negat!'{s. lizt of 
Imports. ｾＩｉｬ｡ｲｭ｡｣･ｵｴｩ｣｡ｬ＠ companies can 
import any aflluunt of inp,,!s lorlheirdumes-
tic of export production Advance licensing 
Regime has also been diVided into two parts 
viz. Value Based Advice licensing Scheme 
and Ouantity Based Advance Licensing 
Scheme. Under Value Based Advance 
licensing Regime, the exporting pharma-
ceutical company may import a particular 
input without any quantitative restriction but 
subjecttc the value of the licence. Underthe 
quantity but subject to the value 01 the li-
cence, UndAr the quantity based advance 
licensing scheme., however. the exporting 
pharmaceutical cQfT\pany has to Corela\e 
the inputs with the outputs as perthe norms 
notified. 

\b) ｾ｣＠ ｣ＨＩｭ＿｡ｦｬｾＭ ｾ｜ｳ･＠ oa\a 0\ \ffi?cns. 
and exports is main'aioed. 

(c) (d) & (e). Do not arise in view of 
poSition explained in (a) above. 

Economic freedom to the States 

9705. SHRI ANADI CHARAN DAS: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether there is any demand for 
granting monetary autonomy/economicfree-
dom to the States; and 

(b) jf so, the reaction of the Govemment 
thereto? 
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fHE MINISTRY OF STATE IN THE ers of viscose staple South India VlscQse 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH- Ltd. 
WAR THAKUR: (a) and (b). Some State 
Govemments have suggested to the 
Commission on centre- State relations as 
also in the meeting of the Inter-State Council 
that more economic powers be given to the 
States. The matter is under consideration .. 

ｾｭｰｯｲｴ＠ Duty on P. S. F. and V.S.F. 

9116. SHRI BAPU HARI CHAURE: 
Will the Minister of TEXTilES be pleased to 
state: 

Ca) the quantum of polyester staple fibre 
and viscose staple fibre being produced In 
India monthly at present; 

(b) whether there has been a growing 
demand to aHow Import of viscose staple 
fibre to bring the price of Imported fibre at par 
with that of Indigenous one; 

(c) the details of the manufacturers of 
viscose staple fibre In the country; 

(d) whether the prices of dyed viscose 
fibre have been Increased recently; and. 

ce) If so, the details thereof and the 
reasons therefor? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTILES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEI-LOT):(a) Onanaverage.11042Tonnes 
of polyester staple fibre and 13043 Tonnes 
·of viscose "apIe fibre per month was pro-
duced during 1991 ｾＹＲＮ＠

(b) In order to enaure adequate availa-
bility of viscose staple fbra to the mills at 
reasonable prices the govemment has not 
imposed any restriction on import of this 
Item. 

(c"1here are. at present 2 manufactur-

Cd) and (e). The. price of this fibre Is 
govemed by market forces. During the last 6 
moths there has been only a marginal in-
crease of Re. 1.00 per kg. In the price of 
viscose staple fibre (block dyed). 

Import of Diesel. 

9707. SHRI GURUDAS KAMAT: Will 
the Minister of COMMERCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the import of diesel again 
likely to be canaUsed; and 

Cb) if so. the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI-
DAMBARAM): (a) and (b). A Public Notice 
No. 9-ITC CPN)192-97 was issued on 20. 
4.1992 by the CCI&E canalislng the Import 
of High Speed Diesel Oil (HSD) through the 
Indian Oil Corporation Ltd. A formal amend-
ment to the Export and Import Policy will be 
made by the Government and issued sepa-
rately. 

Admlaalon In Chartered Account-
ancy 

9708. SHRI GURUDAS KAMAT : Will 
the Minister of LAW. COMPANY JUSTICE 
ANDCOMPANY AFFAIRS be pleaM!d to 
state: ' 

(a) whether qualifications for admission 
to Chartered Accountancy course have 
been altered from the cUl'I'8nt academic 
Year; and 

(b) If so. the details ther8Of? 
THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 

MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY 
AFFAIRS AND MINISTER OF 
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PARLIAMENTARY DESTATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF LAW. JUSTICE AND COM-
PANY AFFAIRS(SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): (a) and (b). A can-
didate forthe Chartered Accountancy Course 
is required to register as an articled clerk 
under a Chartered Accountant. The qualifi-
cations for such registration have been 
amended recently to enable students who 
have passed senior Secondary School 
Examination to join the Chartered Account-
ancy Course by enrolling for the newly intro-
duced Foundation Course. Such students 
after clearing the Foundation Course Exami-
nation conducted by the Institute become 
eligible to join Articleship forthe professional 
course of Chartered Accountancy. Registra-
tion for the Foundation Course has started 
with affect from 7.5.1992. Prior to the revi-
sion of the regulations. only a graduate who 
had either cleared the Entrance Examina-
tion conducted by the Institute of Chartered 
Accountants of India or v.(as exempted from 
passing the Entrance Examination on ac-
count of having secured a minimum of 50"10 
of total marks with Accountancy. Auditing. 
Mercantile or Commercial Laws as subjects 
in the case of Commerce graduates and a 
minimum of 55% of the total marks in the 
case of other graduates who could register 
themselves as articled clerks. The modifide 
regulations also exempt Commerce gradu-
ates with Accountancy. Auditing. Mercantile 
and Commercial Laws securing in the ag-
gregate. a minimum of 50% of the total 
marks in the examination or other graduates 
other than Commerce graduates who have 
passed the graduation examination with 
Mathematics as one of the subjects securing 
in the aggregate. a minimum of 60% of the 
total marks in the examination or graduates 
other than Commerce graduates who have 
Passed the graduation examination with 
subjects other than Matl\8matics securing in 
the aggregate a minimum of 55% of the total 
IT\aI1(s in the examination, from passing the 
Foundation Course' examination. These 
graduates are permittees to register them-

selves as ar1icledlavclit clerks to receive 
practical t,aining prescribed under the regu-
lations. 

Visit of High Level Team From 
Japan 

9709. SHRI R. SUR ENDER REDDY: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether a high level team fromJapan 
has visited the country to identify project 
which are likely to qualify for the quick-
dispersing assistance to India; 

Cb) if so, the projects identified by the 
team and the quantum of assistance likely to 
be provided to those projects; 

Cc) whether any project of Andhra 
Pradesh· has quaJified for the assistance; 
and 

Cd) the time by which the amount is 
likely to be provided to India for these pro)-
ects? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE(SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) A Japanese Govern-
ment mission led by a Director in ｴｨｾ＠ Loan 
Aid Division of their Ministry of Foreign Af-
fairs visited India during April 1992 to dis-
cuss the 1992-93 OECF aid package. 

(b) The mission shortsighted 12 proj-
ects, Including a request for fast disbursing 
assistance from out of the long list of propos-
als submitted by Government of India for 
further study and discussion. During the 
discussions, Government of India requested 
the Government of Japan for sizeable in-
crease in the quantum of aid as compared to 
last years also for channelling a large pro-
portion of it in the form of fast disbursing 
assistance. 
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(c) The tranche aid for Srisailam Hydro 
Electric Project and the Chilarkalurlpel-
Vijayawada section of NH-5 In Andhra 
Pradesh have been short listed by the mis-
sion fordetailed discussiops. These propos-
ais, ho.ever, do not fall in the category of 
fast disbursing assistance. 

(d) the decision o'the Government of 
Japan will be anno.unc8d during Aid. India . 
Consonrtlum meeting \0. be held In 
June,1992. . 

Training Schools for Smugglers In 
Asian Countries 

9710. SHRIPARASRAM BHARDWAJ: 
Will the Minister of FINANCE be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether the Government have any 
information regarding training schools for 
smugglers in a number of Asian countries; 

(b) If so, the details thereof; 

(c) whether some recently arrested 
smugglers have confessed to have been 
trained in some of these schools; and 

(d) the steps takenlbelng taken to rem-
edy the situation? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE(SHRI RAMESH-
WAR THAKUR): (a) to (d). Information Is 
being coilected and will be laid on the Table 
of the !-louse. 

12.00 hrs. 

( Interruptions) 

[English) 

SHRI RUPCHAND PAL (Hooghly): Mr. 

Speaker, Sir, what happened to my privilege 
notice ? 

MR. SPEAKER: I now call Dr. Arn1 LaJ 
ｾｉｩ､｡ｳ＠ Patel to speak, 

DR. AMRIT LAL KAUDAS PATEL 
(Mehsana:) Mr. Speaker, Sir, I want to draw 
the attention of the han. Finance Minista,to 
the shortage of (Srinking-water, foodgrains 
and fodder has so far been the main com-
plains from the drought-hit areas of Gujarat. 

. But Gujarat and particularly Mehsana Dis-
trict is facing a peculiar problem, that is, the 
shortage of currency notes. This shortage 
has created hurdles forthe trade, commerce 
and for payment of labour wages. This is 
because of the fact that the SBI is not giving 
currency notes to Cooperatives and the 
Scheduled Banks. During the normal days, 
they do not accept the small denomination 
notes. This has created problems. I there-
fore request the han. Finance Minister to 
direct the SBI to give currency notes freely to 
Mehsana District. 

Sir, for example, the Mehsana District 
Cooperative Bank has deposited more than 
Rs. 125 crores In SBI. Last week they wanted 
to draw only Rs. 7 crores and they couid not 
get it. Because of that, the farmers are suf-
fering. 

In this connection, I request the han. 
Finance Minister to do the needfullmmedi-
ately. 

SHRI MRUTYUNJAYA NAYAK (Phul-
bani): Mr. SpeaJ<er, Sir, the State Govern-
ment of Orissa has been very much indiffer-
ent and unfair to my Parliamentary constitu-
ency, Phulbani. h has shown step-motherly 
treatment by excluding Phulbani from being 
recommended foi'the construction of Kharda-
Bolangir line via Phulbanl railway-line. Last 
year, that is , 1991, the State Government 
has sent the proposal to the Government of 
India in which Phulbani has been excluded. 
So, I would like to request Shrl, C.K Jaffer 
Sharlef, the Minister of Railways to give 
priority to this. Further, he has already inau-
gurated a function at Kharda Division for the 
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purpose of conduding a survey of the rail: 
way-Une, that is, the Kharda-Bolangir line via 
Phulbani Railway-line. I am making this 
request because Phulbanl District Is a back· 
ward and tribal Distrid. Also, there Is no 
industry. Therefore,l.would request the han. 

_ Minister that priority should be given to in· 
clude the Phulbanl District in the Railway 
Project of Kharda-Bolangir line via Phulbani. 

Sir, I thank you very much for having 
given me this opportunity to speak. 

SHRI EBRAHIM SULAIMAN SAlT 
(Ponnani): Sir, you are aware the House is 
going top adjoum very soon and only two 
ｷｯｾｩｮｧＭ､｡ｹｳ＠ are left. You are also aware 
that a Delegation of NIC and Members of 
Parliament had gone to Ayodhya last month 
on the 7 th and that Delegation submitted a 
report to the Home Minister on the 27th of 
last month. Therefore,l would urge upon the 
Govemment and demand that keeping in 
view the opinion of the entire House the 
report should be placed on the Table of the 
House. Further, before the House adjoums, 
the matter should be discussed in Parlia-
ment. This report should 6e discussed in 
Parliament. It is very important. Effort has to 
be made to see that It is discussed in this 
House. 

MR. SPEAKER: This matter was dis-
cussed and we wanted to know from the 
Home Ministry whether this is going to be 
diSCUSSed on the floor of the House. What 
was told to me by the Home Ministerwas this 
is exactly the point on which the Committee 
had gone there and made a report- there is 
a Contempt proceedings pending in the 
Court. He wanted to know from me whether 

-_ this can be discussed <;>r not. 

We tried to solve this problem. And I 
was told that on 8th, the Supreme Court or 
High CoOrt, was going to hear the contempt 
proceedings. And if the same thing Is in-
volved in it. we ratherthat we should not take 
it up, at least, upto 8th. And after the decision 

, is given, within two days time, we can de-
cided as to what is to be done. 

SHRI CHANDRA JEET YADAV 
(Azamgarh): It is a matter ihat... 

MR. SPEAKER: I just explained It to 
you. 

SHRI CHANDRAJEET YADAV: Slr,l 
entirely agree with you. In view of this con-
tempt proceedings pending in the Supreme 
Court or High Court, one can understand 
that the issue should not be discussed on the 
floor of the House. But It does not bar the 
presentation ofthe report on the Table ofthe 
House. Atter a long discussion, on the basis 
of consensus of this House, It was decided 
that a Parliamentarians Committee along 
with the Nationallntegralion Council's Sub-
Committee should go and visit the spot. Now 
that report has been submitted. Now the 
attitude which the U.P. Government is taking 
is that they are openly coming out, almost 
every week in the press, that they do not 
attach any importance to that Committee's 
reporthey will not cooperate with that Com-
mittees. They did not fully cooperate in giv-
ing the necessary papers and map which the 
Committee wanted to know. 

Therefore, what I am requesting is that, 
today Is 8th and may be the Supreme Court 
or High Court will take a view. You should 
direct the Home Minister to place the report 
on the Table of the House, in case the House 
decides to discuss It. (Interruptions) 

SHRI CHANDRA JEET YADAV: You 
can say what you want to say. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI MADAN LA!:. KHURANA (South 
Delhi): Their allegations are politically moti-
vated ...... (Interruptions) ..... . 

SHRI CHANDRAJIT YADAV: I am not 
levelling any charges, I am stating the facts. 

SHRI BHAGWAN SHANKAR RAWAT 
(Agra): A false propaganda is being carried 
out. (Interruptions) 
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[Eng/ish] 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATTERJEE 
(BoJpur): Sir, the report had to be submitted, 
otherwise everything becomes a mockery. 
We want the report to be placed on the Table 
of the House. Otherwise, the Parliament 
becomes meaningless. 

[ Trans/ation] 

SHRI MADAN LAL KHURANA: Mr. 
Speaker Sir, that day VaJpayeeJI had said 
that they were prepared for a discussion. 
Lellheir report come and our report 
should also come and the entire deCision 
should be taken according to those ... 
/ Jnterruptions) 

ｾｾＬ＠ ｾｾｾｾ｜ＨｂｾＺＬ＠ \\ ｡Ｈ｜ｾ＠ ｾｴ｡ｴ･ｭ･Ｈ｜ｴ＠

comes al'\d it is re''Jted by 01'\& member 
then it is enough, Yc'u have done that. 

SHRI HARIN PATHAK: (Ahmedabad): 
Mr, Speaker, Sir, this house should not be 
used to make any allegation against any 
party, But this is being done repeatedly ... 
( Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: All right you have re-
futed iI. This is enough. You are complicating 
it, without any purpose. (Interruptions) 

[English) 

SHRI A. CHARLES (Trivandrum): Sir, 
on this iSflJ9. kindly give me one minute. 

SHRICHANDRAJEETYADAV:There-
fore. my request is that let the report be 
placed on the Table olthe House. And inthe 
light of the judgement of the Supreme Court, 
" necessary. we discuss it either on 10th or 
on' 'tl\.ll\efe\ote, \a\ \I\e re?Qrt be placed 
on the lable 01 the House. lhat is my de-
mand. And I am asking for the report to be 
placed on the Table of the House. . 

[ Translation] 

SHRI RAM VILAS PASWAN (Rosera): 
Mr. Speaker, Sir there was a meeting of the 
Leaders of various parties and In which it 
was decided that the Govemment will pres-
ent the report anc as far as I remember even 
the leader of the Opposition was not against 
it and it was the opinion that the report should 
be presented. 

SHRILAL KRISHNA ADVANI (Gandhi-
nagar): I said at that time that ...... 

[English] 

• " it should be laid on the Table, then 
both reports should be laid. Normally. it is not 
a Parliamentary Committee, and. therefore, 
it cannot be lal<1,' 

H was agreed that both will be 
circulated. 

( Translation] 

SHRI RAM VILAS PASWAN: I had 
put one condition, but I said that they were 
not against the laying of this report. 

SHRI L.K. ADVANI: We had an 
objection regarding holding a discussion 
on it. 

SHRr RAM VILAS PASWAN: 
Ur.Speaker, Sir, both the committees had 
given their reports in March and these have 
not been on the Table till now. It was a 
sponsored committee from the Government 
side. The report has come. The home minis-
ter has no objection to it. On that day, we had 
said that this should be decided as to how a 
discussion will take place on it, or should 
there be no discussion at all. But when the 
report has come and its gist has been pub-
fished in all the newspape(s, we do not know 
whether that gist is right or ｷｲｯｮｾＮ＠ authentic 
or 1"10\ authentic. \1'\ such circums\ances ... ," 

MR. SPr:AKER: ｐ｡ｳｷＧＳｾｬｪ［Ｌ＠ :, :,lU listen, 
to me ｬｾ･ｮ＠ ther .. will be n0 nef::!c:,:, ask all that 
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(Interruptions) whatever you are asking They have told me 
that requisite number 01 copies are being 
made and are being I\ept in tht: library also. 
These copies are being sent to all the 
members also. 

SHRI RAM VILAS PASWAN: What is 
the difficulty in presenting it here. 

MR. SPEAKER: After that. if it is neces-
sary it can be presented here as well after 8th 
of this month. 

SHRIRAMVILASPASWAN:When this 
report can be kept in the library, then what is 
the difficulty in laying it on the table of the 
House, we are not able to understand this. 
What-objection does the Government have 
in laying that report here on the table? 

MR. SPEAKER: The Report is being 
sent to all the members as well. . 

( Interruptions) 

SHRI MADAN LAK KHURANA: Mr. 
• Speaker Sir. you allow to hold a discussion, 

but such a thing should not happen. You 
should ges! both the report discussed over 
here. (Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: You may kind!y sit 
down. I have not allowed you. 

(Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: When I am on my legs 
you may sit down. All the time you do like 
thaI. (Interruptions) 

[English] 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATTERJEE 
,Bolpur): There is no doubt that the Home 
Minister has offered to place it in the Library. 
It must be placed here, on the Table of the 
house also. (Interruptions) 

Jo.o MR. SPEAKER: After 8th May, we will 
';iee, what is to be done. 

°Not recorded. 

SHRI BASU DEB ACHARIA (Bankura): 
Why can this report not be placed on the 
Table 01 ttle House? The Government should 
clarify this. 

[ Translation] 

SHRIMATI KRISHNA SAHI (8egusa-
rail: Mr. Speaker. Sir, I have your portetion 
and I would liketo make a request regarding 
one 01 our colleagues. (Interruptions). 

MR. SPEAKER: Shrimati Sahi, I am not 
. allowing this. Please take your seat. This is 

not going on record. 

( IntefTIJptions), 

SHRI BASU DEB ACHAR/A: Why can 
this report not be placed on the Table of the 
House? 

MR. SPEAKER: I am on my legs. Please 
sit down. Shri Acharia. All the time you are 
doing like this. 

( Interruptions) 

[ Translations] 

MR. SPEAKER: I am requesting you 
that I am not allowing anyone to say anything 
about any lady whether she belongs to this 
House or is an outsider and if she does not 
come within the purview of Governmental 
activities, then I would not like to say any-
thing about her. I shall made sure that the 
floor of this house is not used for such J 
purpose. It is my request to you not to raise 
this kind of a matter here. 

( Interruptions) 

[English] 

MR. SPEAKER: Madam. you can under-
stand this. Please sit down. 
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SHRI BASU DEB ACHARIA: Will the 
Parliamentary Affairs Minister clarify as to 
why this cannot be placed on the Table of 
the House? 

MR. SPEAKER: After 8th May, we will 
see, what is to be done. 

[Translation] 

SHRI RAJNATH SONKAR SHASTRI 
(Saidpur): Mr. Speaker, Sir i would like to 
draw your attention to a very big incident 
... (Interruptions) ... 

KUMARI VIMLA VERMA (Seoni): Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, I would also like to say some-
thing on this subject ... (lnterruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: This question is not 
related to any lady ... (Interruptions) ... 

SHRI RAJNATH SONKAR SHASTRI: 
The Carlappa Marg in the Varanasi canton-
ment area, which was a thoroughfare earlier 
has been closed for General pUblic. This 
path has been there Since the Vedic 
period ... (Interruptions) .. . * 

[English] 

MR. SPEAKER: This is not going on 
record. Madam, you should sn down. 

(Interruptions) • 

SHRIMATI CHANDRA PRABHA URS 
(Mysore): They are not worried about the 
safety of our colleague, a lady Member of 
this House. But, we are worried about her 

. safety. 

( Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: this is not neces· 
sary. It can necessary. It can be said 
against anybody. It should not be allowed 
Ukethis. 

·Nor recorded. 

SHRI RAJNATH SONKAR SHASTRI:' 
thIs parts has been there not only sInce 
Vedic times, but since ages ... (Interruptions} 

MR. SPEAKER: It is not as H any lady 
will get Insulted merely by your saying so. 
You try to understand this delicate matter. 
nObody knows it better than you. 

KUMARI VIMLA VERMA: Mr. Speaker, 
Sir, why don't you listen to me (Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: I know it, as you have 
come and tole me In my office what you are 
going to say, but I am not allowing you to 
raise n. You should listen to me ... (Interrup-
tions) 

SHRI MOHAN SINGH (Deorla): Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, why are you so serious at the 
fag end of the sessior. 

MR. SPEAKER: If anything is said about 
you, I must get serious. 

( Interruptions) 

SHRI RAJNATH SONKAR SHASTRI: I 
am talking about Cariappa Matg in Varanasi. 
This road has been there since the Vedic 
times. In the 'Kashl' chapter of the 'Brahma 
ｐｵｲ｡ｮ｡ｾｴｨｩｳ＠ road has been known and has 
been famous as Panchkosi and Antargrahi. 
Even today, every year, every day tOIN-there 
lakh people go through this road and they 
fulfill their religious rituals. Besides this, those 
people who come tQ Kashi from the various . 
parts ofthe country, travelthroughthisroute • 
and fulfill their religious ceremonies. 

Sir, a temple of the goddess Phooiesh· 
wari is situated here. It is the only temple of 
its kind in Uttar Pradesh. There is a pond. 
There goes a saying about the pond that If a 
man takes a bath in this pond. his skin 
diseases like leprosy are cured. Thousands 
of people come here to have a darshan. 
People from foreign countries like Mauritius, ... 
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Thailand, England come here and get rid of 
their skin-diseases. 

Sir, H is a matter of great sorrow that 
under the instructions of the Ministry of 
Defence or somebody else this pond also 
has been covered up. There was a holy sHe 
of Hindus where thousands of people visited 
through this path. There Is a holy shrine of 
Muslims, the tomb of Kharbooja Shaheed 
Nasaruddin Shaheed Shaheb where thou-
sands of Muslim brethren pay visH. They 
pass this way and offer their prayers. 

Sir, Fulwaria, lmaliadhad, Badauli, 
Deendayalpur, Barthara, Kotwa and other 
villages are located on this route. Probably 
in 1900 this was declared a military area. 
The Britishes also attached importance to 
this route and Religious activities were never 
obstructed. In Britisn time the Hindus, Mus-
lims and all others used to pass through this 
route freely. During the First World war in 
1914, the Second World War in 1945 and 
Indo-Pal< war in 1965 the most dangerous 
weapons were kept here. ｎｯｾｹ＠ had any 
objection. The military men and officers never 
closed this route. (Interruptions) 

Mr. Speaker, Sir, what I mean to say is 
that ·extremely fatal arms were used to be 
kept here and today the military people say 
that there will be a breach of cofidence so 
they will not allow four-wheelers to pass 
through here. They say that they will allow 
rickshaws, tempos, biycyclesbut not cars. 
They will not allow cars because H will en-
danger their secrecy. 

Mr. Speaker, Sir, A Brigadier who is 
posted there at present keeps this path closed 
whenever he is present there. Sir, I would 
like to Inform you that when late Shri Rajnar-
ayan was the Minister of Health he was 
prevented from going by this path. Not only 
that, just four days back, hon. Defence 
Minister ordered to pen this path Immedi-
ately .In spite of his orders the local Brigadier 
is not opening the path. The local people are 
being badly treated by him. 

*Nor recorded. 

Funds by Certain Banks 
Sir, nea rly twenty lakh people of Banaras 

are very much worried due to it. Through 
you, I would like. to urge the hon. Minister of 
Defence to issue orders again and stem 
action should be taken against the Brigadier 
if he is not obeying the orders of the Ministry 
of Defence. 

MR. SPEAKER: Toaay, I would like 10-
give a chance to many hon. Members. Now, 
Ie·t us see how H is ｾｳｳｩ｢ｬ･Ｎ＠

12.28 hrs. 

RE: MISUSE OF PUBLIC FUNDS BY 
CERTAIN BANKS 

[ Trans/ation) 

SHRI ATAL BIHARI VAJPAYEE 
(Lucknow): Mr. Speaker, Sir, the recent tur-
moil in country's share market has been 
mentioned in the House. It has also been 
mentioned as to how a notorious shar-bro-
ker'of Bombay has played a Successful tr.ick 
with the country's entire Banking system. 
But, Mr. Speaker, Sirthe incident of the 5th 
May is a novel thing in the history of banking. 
All of us know that the National Housing 
Bank is a subsidiary of the Reserve Bank of. 
India and the Life Insurance Corporation in 
which a Japanese agency 'is also associ-
ated. Its subscribed capital is Rs. 200 crore, 
but its authorised capital is As. 1000 crore. 
An unusual incident teok place on 5th May 
1992. The National Housing Bank had to 
deposit Rs. 30 crore in the Mutual Fund of 
the Canara Bank. But the National Housing 
Bank could not deposit the amount in the 
Bank. It turned into a defaulter. Such a 
situation has never been there previously. 
The money could not be deposited because 
the National Housing Bank settled a bargain 
of As. 340 crore with that very stock-broker 
and that amount was blocked there. The . 
Bank had no additional money. An amount of 
Rs. 30 crore ｣ｾｵｬ､＠ not be deposited. Mr. 
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Speaker, Sir, what .comments are being 
passed on it? . 

[English) 

"According to sources of National Hous-
ing Bank, it has caused deep embarrass-
ment in the Reserve Bank of India since this 
is probably the first time that the subsidiary 
bank of the Central Bank has. defaulted." 

[ Translation] 

The subsidiary bank of the Central Bank 
could not deposit Rs. 30crore because there 
is bungling in the Bank. The Bank is linked 
with that broker. It is a serious case. That day 
the hon. Minister of Finance said that inves· 
tigation will be made into it, but the investiga-
tion will last three months. It is impossible to 
say what will happen in the share ｭ｡ｲｋｾｴ＠ and 
the banking system in three months. There 
should be immediate investigation.' The 
outcome of th'is investigation should come 
forward within 24 or 48 hours and the most 
stringent action should be taken in this case. 

Mr. Speaker, Sir,liberalisation does not 
mean to give conceSSions to the brokers 
(Interruptions) ... If it is going on, it is wrong. 
Perhaps you will take advantage of it and 
oppose liberalisation. I am not opposing. 

[English] 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATIERJEE 
(Bolpur): It is liberalisation for the brokers. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI ATAL BIHARI VAJPAYEE: It 
cannot be liberalisation for brokers. There is 
liberalisation in America, but if somebody 
Commits such crime in the banking system, 
he is penalised. Fine upto crores 01 rupees is 
imposed on him. The hon. Minister of Fi-
nance has sought three months, time. I am in 
favour of an early investigation. The results 
should follow immediately and such black 
sheep should not be given any opportunilyto 
rob those people. 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES (Muza', 
farpur): Mr. Speaker. Sir. I have given notice 
to you on this issue. Besides, supporting the 
points raised by Atalji. I also take exception 
to this fact that while Finance Bill was being 
discussed here the day before yesterday, I 
had put up all these Issues btltore the House. 
I also urged the hon. Minister of Finance to 
give some concrete facts and in formation 
which he had about culprits, and Bank offi-
cials. I repeatedly said that he had informa-
tion. Every day we are getting information 
from the sources outside the House. We get 
information that he has the knowledge and 
we are saying it inside andoutsidethe House. 
Even then, if no action is taken in this regard, 
I feel very sorry to say that we are doing great 
injustice against those people who are still 
befOOling themselves by investing money in 
shares which you call the stock market boom. 

Today is the 8th of May. I would like to 
quote a sentence from the article about 
share-boom published in the MFortune" just 
for the information of the House. It says that 
the name of the so-called institution is 

[English] 

Morgan Stanley Investment. 

"Another 'bust' candidate is India.' 

[ Translation) 

This has been written about stock 
market. 

[English) 

•... where the 'stock market has 
doubled since the beginning of the year. 

We are now only in the fifth month of 
the year. 

• ... when the Government instituted 
major economic reforms. 

[ Translation) 

It means that i1 it is not the responsibility 
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of the Government, at least it is a liability on 
it. 

[English] 

Says MorganStanley Investment 
Strategist, Barton Biggs: 

• It is getting towards bubble 
proportions, with the 20 biggest 
stocks selling at 50 times earn-
ings. People are buying stocks 
because of their names rather 
than their valuations ... • 

For example, Tata Iron & Steel, which the 
investors have driven upto 80 times the 
earnings since Government decontrolled 
steel prices. Morgan Stanley's India expert, 
Vinod Sethi warns: 

"Import duties on foreign steel 
are also coming down and inter-
national prices are low, plus the 
company makes poor lijuality 
steel." 

[ Translation] 

Mr. Speaker, Sir, this is the position. 
In spite of all these scandals, Shri Atal ji 
supports the liberalisation policy adopted 
by the Government. 

Mr. Speaker, Sir, I have given you a 
notice this morning. I was late by two min-
utes due to traffic jam. My notice has reached 
your office at two minutes past ten. I have 
unperstood the point. So, I gave this notice. 
The State Bank of India scandal is not limited 
to Rs. 620 crore only. The Bank had paid 
sum of Rs. 620 crore to a broker. h paid Rs. 
200 crore to another broker called Pandeya, 
a mention of whose name I made yesterday. 
I am making this submission with great dis-
tress. This scam involves Rs. 2000 crore or 
Rs. 3000 crore. The Government is conduct-
ing an enquiry by people who are them-
selves involved in it. Not only the Ministry of 
Finance, but also the Reserve Bank of India 
and even the entire banking system is op-
posing the enquiry to be conducted by the 

CBI. They want to conduct the enquiry under 
their own supervision. Mr Speaker, Sir, this 
is your responsibility. I mean the House is 
responsible to take a deCision In this re-
gard ... (Interruptions) 

(English) 

MR. SPEAKER: I am very thankful to 
you. You are making me omnipotent. 

[Translation] 

SHRI GEROGE FERNANDES: Sir, 
when the matter is raised here the Govern-
ment does not give any reply to it. The hon. 
finance Minister had himself been present all 
through the debates. When I have given 
concrete information to the House he did not 
utter a single word "except that 

[English] 

"We will take effective action.· 

[ Translation] 

Today I am making this allegation be-
cause neither the officials of the Finance 
Ministry, nor the Govem ment is preparad to 
hold the enquiry by the CBI. The case of 
individual Ministers is different. I know there 
are Ministers who individually, are in favour 
of an enquiry by the CBI but the Government 
is not in its favour. The Reserve Bank of India 
and the Banking sector are also not pre-
pared for it. The National Housing Bank had 
made a promise to construct houses for the 
rural poor but the Govemment entrusted this 
work to Shri Pherwani whose records are 
well known to the world. He immediately 
invested that money in 'satta bazar.' Now 
that money is lost. Banker's receipt worth 
As. thirty crore have not been honoured. It is 
a fact well-known not only in Bombay but 
also all over the country. 

(English) 

bankers, receipts are not even worth the 
piece of paper on which they are written 
because they are aI/ bogus receipts. I aSI$ the 
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Finance Minister. Is It or Is It not a fact that 
your bankers' receipts are not worth the 
piece of paper on which they are Issued? 

[ Translation] 

The hon. Finance Minister is present 
here. I would like to seek a reply from him. 

[English] 

Is he not aware of it? Still he is not 
talking any steps. 

[ Translation] 

The Government is still allowing that big 
bull to to indulge in this dirty game. He is 
doing it every day. I was very distressed. 
That is why I said that it is the responsibility 
of the House. Poor man's money is being 
drained out from banks and fTlisappropri-
ated. Only two days are leftforthe session to 
end. A meeting of the officers of the banking 
sector and the Chairmen has been con-
vened forthe 16th. You may please ask the 
hon. Finance Minister that if possible the 
should make a statement in the House in this 
regard today. H it is not possible today, then 
it should come on Monday. Now I seek-your 
permission to raise the Bofors issue. 

MR. SPEAKER: How many matters will 
you raise? 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: This is 
not a different issue. I am raising the issue 
today which was under discussion 
yesterday ... (interruptions) 

SHRI CHANDRA SHEKHAR (BaJlia): 
Mr. Speaker, Sir, today Shri Chandrajeet or 
somebody else said just now that it is your 
responsibility. I would like to know from you 
as to who should be asked what is happen-
ings In the country. When these policies 
were being framed we had wamed that these 
will have disastrous consequences. I had 
pointed out that policies are being imple-
mented at the instance of extemal forces 
and the Government of India does not follow 
the policies which are conducive to the 

circumstances of the country. Evil effects 
have started emerging within three months. 
Let Shri Ataljl support the Ilberallsatlon pol-
icy. But the dangers apprehended at that 
time have now reached a point where bun-
gling of thowsand of crores of rupees Is 
taking place. The Govemmentsays to Inves-
tigate the matter In three months. Whyshould 
the enquiry take three months? To under-
stand this, on need not be an economist. 
Bank accounts are made upto date every-
day and one can have Information about 
these accounts daily. It is even said that this 
bungling has been going on for last six 
months or one year. H the rise and fal in 
share prices in Stock Markethas taken place 
during the last three months, It means that 
the bungling took place in three months. 
They require three months to investigate the 
matter, I am not doubting the intentions of 
the Govemment, but I am at a loss to under-
stand if Shri Atalji means it to be liberalisa-
tion. Hon. Finance Minister and hon. Prime 
Minister, I am not against corrupt people as 
Shrl George Femandes is. I am againt seil-
Ing the country. In corruption, the country 
may, at best: suffer a loss of rupees fifty, or 
hundred crores. But here the country is being 
sold. I am making this allegation ､･ｬｩ｢･ｲ｡ｴｾｹ＠
with full responsibility. It seems that a con-
spiracy has been hatched to sell this country 
and that conspiracy is being exposed today . 
. .. (Interruptions) 

[English) 

SHRI PAWAN KUMAR BANSAL (Chan-
digarh): Sir, he has used the words that· the 
Government is entering into a conspiracy-. 
That is highly objectionable. 

SHRICHANDRASHEKHAR: I am again 
saying that the Government is conspiring to 
sell away the interests of this country. 

SHRI PAWAN KUMAR BANSAL: Sir, 
this irresponsible statement is coming from 
a responsible Leader. , 

MR. SPEAKER: Mr. Bansal, I will give 
you a chance to refute It, If you want. 
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SHRI PAWAN KUMAR BANSAL: Sir, 
I am just saying that a very irresponsible 
statement Is coming from the responsible 
Leader. 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATIERJEE: 
Where are those documents? Where are 
those books? Why are they not sealed? 
( Interruptions) 

. [Translation] 

SHRI CHANDRA SHEKHAR: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, I speak in Hindi only. Those 
who do not understand Hindi will have to 
understand it, otherwise they canRot under-
stand anything about the country. 

Mr. Speaker, Sir, if it Is not a fact, why is 
the Govemment silent? I would apologist If 
my statement proves to be wrong or hurts 
anyone. They do not at all feel concemed 
when scams worth crores of rupees is taking 
place. The hon. Finance Ministershould say 
why three months are required to investigate 
the matter. You have !;>een in the Govern-
ment for quite sometime. Should the Gov-
ernment take three month's time to verify 
such a matter? In my opinion men of Eco-
nomic Intelligence or the CBI can give a 
report on this in twenty four hours. I would 
like to know as to why the Gov.ernment Is 
maintaining silence over this question? Is 
not there any conspiracy behind all this? 

[English] 

If there is no conspiracy behind the 
whole affair, then ·why the Government is not 
coming out with the facts and arrest these 
persons who are responSible for these things? 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATIERJEE: 
Where are the books and records? This is 
very important. Serious charges are being 
made on the floor of the House and there is 
no response from the Govemment except 
some sort of an assurance of an Inquiry 
which will take three months. What is hap-
pening to the books and the records? What 
about the persons? Has any case been 

lodged uptill now? These are very very 
serious matters. If those books and docu-
ments remain in the custody of these people, 
Sir, what will be the sanctity of the inquiry 
also? Cmres and crores of rupees are in-
volved. Outsiders are involved in the name 
of liberalisation which is going on. Therefore, 
these are serious matters and we expect that 
immediate response should come from the 
Govemment on these matters. We cannot 
just wait indefinitely . 

SHRI RUPCHAND PAL (Hooghly): Sir, 
on this pOint,1 have given a notice. 

SHRI NIRMAL KANTI CHATIERJEE 
(Dumdum): Sir, again and again the C&AG 
has reported thattheir bank accounts are not 
reconciled for two to three years. 

MR. SPEAKER: Nirmaljl, I will call you. 

. SHRI NIRMAL KANTI CHATIERJEE: 
Sir, on that the C&AG has made severe 
strictures. That Vajpayeeji knows. There-
fore, we demanded that the bank accounts 
be made transparent and secrecy clauses 
be eliminated. They are always ｲｾｳｰｯｮ､ｩｮｧ＠
negatively. Let them answer all these ques-
tions. 

SHRI RUPCHAND PAL: We have been 
told that a large number of ex-officials of 
several bankS and the financial Institutions 
are on the Board ot Directors of these indus-
tries and organisations run by the big bulls. 
They have been operating in the State Bank 
of India, the NHB etc. 

SHRI SOMNATHCHATIERJEE: They 
are not giving any money for the purpose of 
rural housing. 

SHRJ A. CHARLES (Trivandrum): Sir, 
we on this side of the House are equally 
concerned. (Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: We will know how they 
are responding. 

SHRI A. CHALES: We are equally 
concerned about what has happened. But 
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one unfortunate thing is, that on every issue 
the Opposition Is trying to give a message 
that we are selling out the country. That is 
rather unfortunate. 

AN. NON. MEMBER: You prove It 
through your actions. 

SHRI A. CHARLES: This House is not 
meant for the Opposition alone. Every day, 
they are trying to hijack the HQuse. (Interrup-
tions) 

MR. SPEAKER: Please sit down. Let 
me regulate. Shri Charles, you are a very 
good parliamentarian. They have made very 
valid points. You validly reply to them. Do not 
charge them like this. 

SHRI A. CHARLES: I understand. I am 
one of the Members who participated in the 
discussion on the SEBI Bill. It is on record, 
that we suggested, we recommended that 
the shareholders should be protected. That 
is our interest. I something wrong has hap· 
pened, it should be found out who exactly is 
responsible and whether some officers are 
involved. The word 'conspiracy' is unfortu· 
nllte. Anyway, we have to see what hap-
pened and want an impartial inquiry to be 
conducted. " anybody has done something 
wrong purposefully or with negligence, or 
some mistake is committed, it is a wrong 
thing. We condemn the whole matter. We 
also want an il1l>artial inquiry to be con· 
ducted and what exactly has happened, 
everything, has to be brought out. But I must 
saythatthe whole destabilisation has started 
one moming when we engaged the Fairfox. 
Our friend, Shri Chatterjee then criticised it. 
{ Interruptions} 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HUMAN RESOURCE 
DEVELOPMENT (DEPARTMENT OF 
YOUTH AFFAIRS AND SPORTS AND THE 
DEPARTMENT OF WOMEN AND CHILD 
DEVELOPMENT) (KUMAR I MAMATA 
BANERJEE): He is telling something. Please 
listen to him. 

SHRI A. CHARLES: I am totally sup-
porting all actions to find out the truth and to 
book the culprits and to start suitable action. 
The interests of the shareholders should be 
protected. We cannot imagine how one bank 
has given so many crores of rupees. We 
have to understand the truth and what ex· 
actly has happened. The official should be 
punished and we are for that. 

SHRI BAGU DEB ACHARIA (Bankura): 
How much time does the Govemment take 
to find out the truth? 

MR. SPEAKER: Shri Acharia. one of 
the members 'of the Govemment is trying to 
reply. 

. THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI P. CHI· 
DAMBARAM): A numberof issue have been 
raised. (lnterruptio(ls) Why do you listen? 
God has given us two ears to listen. We 
never listen. That is the problem. (Interrup-
tions) A number of issues have been raised. 
I am grateful to Shri Vajpayee for pointing out 
that God has given us two ears and one 
mouth. 

I have great respect for Shri Chandra 
Shekhar. In fact, he holdS me in affection and 
I have great respect for him. But I think that 
the basic differences in ideology and ap. 
proach cannot be taken- to the extent of 
charging people with inSincerity andconspir· 
acy. Let us acknowledge one thing. There 
are differences between the Congress Party 
and the Congress Party's approach to eco· 
nomic issues and the Left Parties. There are 
differences between us and I think some 
aspects of what Shri Chandra Shekhar be· 
lieves. (Interruptions) 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF SURFACE TRANSPORT 
(SHRI JAGDISH TYTLER): You can give 
your comments later on. 

SHRI P. CHIDAMBARAM: I have said, 
on an earlier occasion, when briefly replied 
to the Convn&rce Ministry'S demands ,I said 
that. despite these differences I believe that 
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there is also as consensus on some aspects 
of policy and Ithink thatthere is aconsensus 
among the major political parties.including, 
what I humorously referred to as responsible 
sections of the Janata Oal, on some aspects 
ofthepolicy. Butthe point is, there is no point 
in carrying these differences to an extent 
when you say that the Govemment is selling 
out this country. I recall what Shri Vajpayee 
had said acouple of weeks ago. He said that 
this country is too big, the people of this 
country are too proud, and too strong for 
anyone to sell out this country to anyone. 

I do not think that anybody can sell this 
country. (Interruptions) I most Sincerely and 
humbly request Shri Chandra Shekharnot to 
carry these ideological and policy differences 
to a point where he will charge that the 
Govem.ment is selling out the country. 

Sir, no this specific issue, I recall what 
the Finance Minister had said in this House. 

. I have just tried to understand exactly what 
he said. I am told, what he said was that the 
RBI being the Central Bank must first inquire 
Into this matter. And the RBI has been 
asked to Inquire into this matter. The RBI is 
dOing so. We expect he facts to be found out 
by the RBI ... ( Interruptions) 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATTERJEE: Is it 
a regular feature? .. ( Interruptions) 

SI:IRI P. CHIOAMBARAM: I cannot 
give you the details. 

If the RBI finds facts which lead to 
further inferences and further action to be 
taken, appropriate agencies will be asked to 
look into this matter. 

On the question of what is happening in 
the stock market, Sir, we are all aware of 
what is happening in the stock market. In 
fact in Bombay. I think. about three or four 
weeks ago, I said that this is very irrational 
behavior. This Is one of the reasons why, we 
think. thatthe stock market. require ourto be 
regulated. This is one ot the reasons why, I 
think, SEBI is being strenQthened. I think, a 
Bill has been passed. But to say that this 

liberalisation has a cause and effect betrays 
a poor understanding of economics and a 
poorer understanding oflhe situation in which 
we are finding ourselves. I think, what we 
have done is correct. Since last July, our 
policies have retrieved this country from the 
brink of an economic catastrophe. Sixteen 
months of non-Congress Government left 
this country on the verge do defauh. We 
have retrieved this country from the brink of 
an economiC catastrophe and there is 
growth today ..• ( Interruptions) 

SHRI SOMNA TH CHATTERJEE : Lib-
eralisation does not help. We have fed up 
with your economics .. ( Interruptions) 

SHRI P . CHIOAMBARAM: You maybe 
fed up with the country. The country was fed 
up with what you did. The country was fed up 
with what your ideology did throughout the 
world. ..( Interruptions) 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATTERJEE: Sir, 
he is giving a lecture on their economy. Here 
specific issue has been raised and he is 
giving a lecture .•. ( Interruptions) 

SHRI P. CHIOAMBARAM: The ideol-
ogy which Shri Somnath Chatterjee wants to 

. espouse has been rejected in every part of 
the world. An there Is no reason why we 
should accept this. 

I have great respect for Chandra 
Shekharji. I think. many aspects of Chandra 
Shekharji's policies are correct ... ( Interrup-
tions) 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATTERJEE: Is 
this an answer to the issue that has been 
raised here? 

SHRI P. CHIOAMBARAM: In fact I stili 
remember ｃｨ｡ｮｾｲ｡＠ Shekharji's eloquent 
reply to the Motion of Confidence, which he 
moved. where he laid down some elements, 
which every body should accept. Sir, there 
are differences? But to take these differ-
ences to a point to say that the country is 
being sold.out by liberaliration, we reject that 
charge. Sir, you will see that this kind of 
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opposition comes from a very narrow seg-
ment of this House. And that narrow seg-
ment of this House has a difference with us 
. We acknowledge that difference. But we 
do not charge them with conspiracy and 
equally they should not charge us with con-
spiracy. 

SHRI CHANDRA SHEKHAR: Mr. 
Speaker. Sir. there is nothing personal in it. 
I have been telling from the very beginning -
I would agree with my friend, Shri Chidamba-
ram, for whom I have great respect - that we 
see diametrically in the opposite direction. 
He thinks that he has been able to revive the 
countryfromtheeconomicchaos. Ithink. he 
has landed the country in a position where 
every week, three times we are getting the 
threat from a country which considers that 
they are determining the destiny of the coun-
try. This has never happened in the history 
of India nor in the history of any nation in the 
world. This is why, selling away the interest 
does not mean that you are selling the furni-
ture of Parliament House. The country is 
being threatened. not by Mr. George Bush. 
not by Mr. Baker. but by an Under Secretary 
and you are not able to answer. I shall 
request, Mr. Speaker. Sir, my GURU, Shri 
Atal Bihar! Vajpayee, that he should also 
understand where is that great country, for 
which he has the great pride that this country 
cannot be sold away by anybody. Countries 
are no sold away in furniture; in assets, in 
factories, but the country's self-respect is 
sold away and that has been ably achieved 
by my friend's party and the Government. 
not by you personally or by anyone of you 
during the last three or four months. This is 
the point. I can understand the differences 
on economic policy. I can understand your 
Iiberalisation taking the country to a point 
from Where we cannot retum. But, this 
question involves misappropriation offunds 
by the Government bank of thousand crores 
of rupees. (Interruptions) Why these offi-
cers should be protected? I know the rules 
that RBI should look into it ; that somebody 
will go from here then only CBI will come. It 
means bythattime everything will be hushed 
up I shall request. my friend, Mr. Chidamba-
ram that they should take up this matter 

urgently. They should not go into aU these 
technicalities. Technicalities do not make a 
nation nor mar a nation. You are shattering 
the will power of this country and you are 
shattering the hope in this Govemment. 
People have apprehensions all around. H 
you do not answe r these questions squarely 
in Parliament, you "do not come clean about 
these officers who are glJilty. If you say that 
they are not part of the Government. then I 
say that the Government is not selling "away 
the country • but these officers are selling 
away the country. In my understanding of 
Parliamentary Democracy, if the officers are 
selling away the Country and the Ministers 
are keeping quiet, t am well within my right 
that the Government is selling away the 
country. This is why I have said and I did not 
mean anything personal. I have great affec-
tion and regardforyou. But, again I say that 
you people are guilty of dereliction of duty, If 
you are not doing this. 

SHRI P. CHIDAMBARAM: Sir, t agree 
entirely with the last part of he observation of 
the hon. Member, Shri Chandra Shekhar. 
(Interruptions). Please listen. I assure this 
House on behalf of the Government that no 
officer will be protected. The Government 
will take action against any officer howso-
ever high he may be. (Interruptions). 

SHRI T ARIYT BARAN TOPDAR (Bar-
rackpore): Mr. Speaker ... (Interruptions) 

;SHRI P. CHIDAMBARAM: He has no 
business to shout like that. He does not 
understand the the responsibility of a Mem-
ber of Parliament. He is not only rude to me 
but he is rude to the whole House. We are not 
dogs and cats here. He has no business to 
shout like that. He must be told how to 
behave (Interruptions). I have great respect 
for Shri Chandra Shekharji. We endorse that 
last part. There will be acted upon. If any 
officer is found guilty, action will be taken and 
you will find that Govemment taken action 
against them. (Interruptions) 

[ Translation] 

SHRt ｇｾｏｒｇｅ＠ FERNANDES: The 
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question Is whether you will order an inves-
tigation or not.. (Interruptions) • 

SHRI RABI RAY (Kendrapada): Mr. 
Speaker. Sir, I would like to say one thing 
after hearing Shri Chidambaram. The whole 
House Is of the opinion that RBJ. Is inter-
ested in a cover up. Through you I wou Id like 
to remind the congressmen of a historical 
event In this House which may perhaps help 
them in understanding the gravity of the 
present situation ... (/nterruptiOlfS) 

When Shri Jawahar Lal Nehru was the 
first Prime Minister of India the Mundhra 
Scandal was exposed by Late Shri Firoze 
Gandhi who belong to congress and was a 
Member of this House. But this scandal 
exposed by Shrl George Fernandes Is far 
grave than that. Though the scandal which 
was exposed by late ｾｨｲｩ＠ Firoze Gandhi did 
not involve crores of rupees, but even then 
the Prime Minister had agreed with Shri 
Firoze Gandhi and constituted a Commis-
sion headed by most illustrious judge justice 
Chagla, who was later a Member of this 
House and also a Minister. You might be 
aware that because or the findings of the 
Chagla Commission, a leader of stature like 
Shri Krlshnamachari had to resign from the 
Cabinet. Shrl Chidambaram and other Min-
ister are present here. I would therefore like 
to submit that there should be a judicial 
enquiry into this matter by a commission 
which should be assisted by C.B.I. It is only 
then you will come to know the sincerity of 
what is being said by Shri Chidambaram 
otherwise it has no sincerity. I would like to 
conclude with this last sentence. Our coun-
try has become a colony without occupation. 
Earlier it was under the occupation of East 
India company, and now it is under the 
dominance of International Monetary Fund 
and the World Bank. This is the only differ-
ence. 

[English) 

There is no occupation but we have 
been reduced to a colony by the acts of 
commission and omission of this Ruling 
Party. • 

13.00 hrs 
-

SHRI BASUOEB ACHARIA: Sir, those 
who are responsible for this misappropria-
tion of money have been entrusted with the 
task of inquiry. Then what will be the fate of 
the Inquiry?.. (Interruptions) 

MR SPEAKER: Shri Kodikkunil 
Suresh 

SHRI KOOIKKUNIL SURESH (Adoor): 
Sir, in Kerala at Traivandrum, one of the 
public undertaking companies. that is, Hin-
dustan Latex, which comes underthe Minis-
try of Health and Family Welfare, has totally 
regretted promotions and other facilities to 
SCIST employees. The employees belong-
Ing to SC/ST categories had started relay 
satyagraha in front of the Hindustan Latex 
one months before. 

There are five hundreds SC/sT employ-
ees working in that company. The manage-
ment of the company has not invited the 
agitated employees and discussed their 
serious and important Issues so far. I request 
the Government, through you, that the Min-
Istry of Health and Family Welfare should 
intervene and give proper directions to the 
management of the company to settle their 
problems at the earliest. 

MR SPEAKER: Shri Vandayar. (inter-
ruptions) 

SHRI SRINKANTAJENA (Cuttack): Let 
me make a submission, Sir. 

MR SPEAKER: Let others also speak .•. 
( Interruptions) 

SHRI K. THULASIAH VANOAYAR 
(Thanjavur): Sir, in Tanjore, there Is a Rail-
way Colony Middle School functioning for 
the last thirty five years. This school caters 
to the need of 309 boys and 189 girls. There 
are nearly fifteen to twenty teachers. The 
Railway authorities, without rhyme or rea-
son, have abruptly asked them to vacate the 
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school before 30th April, 1992. In the interest 
of the Tanjore Railway Employees this scl:lool 
should be allowed to continue without preju-
dice. The fl ,111way Minister should take 
Invnediate aCllon forthe survival of the school 
without any delay. 

SHRI G.M.C. BALAYOGI (Amalapu-
ram): Sir, on 27th April, 1992, in Parakasam 
District of Andhra Pradesh In Chimakurth 
village, three Da/it women were allegedly 
raped and murdered and their bodies were 
found in the premises of Pallava Grante 
Company's water pond. The deceased are: 
(i) B. Ramalamma, aged thirty; (ii) Ravura 
Anjamma,agedtwenty-three; and (iii) Padhu-
layesamma, Aged fourteen. 

The Andhra Pradesh Police have so far 
not arrested the accuses involved in this 
crime and also not given any proper financial 
assistance to the victimised families. This is 
not only one incident happened against the 
Da/itsin the State of Andhra Pradesh, oftenly 
these atrocities are being committed on SCI 
ST people due to the failure of law and order 
machinery. 

Through you, Sir, I urgo upon the han. 
Prime Minister and han. Home minister, 
Government of India, to direct the Govern-
ment of Andhra Pradesh to appoint judicial 
enquiry and also entrust the case to the CBV 
CID and trial this offence in the Special 
Court. I also requesllhe han. Prime Minister 
to grant financial assiStance of Rs. five lakhs 
to each deceased family from the Prime 
Minister's Fund. 

[ Trans/ation] 

SHRI D.J. TAN DEl (Daman&Diu):Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, it is unfortunate that when the 
fishermen of Gujarat, Daman & Diu go into 
the sea to catch fish, they are arrested by the 
Pakistani police and are sent to jail as the 

. sea border line between India and Pakistan 
has not been decided so far. Similarly, we 
also arrest the Pakistani fishermen. This all 
has ｢･ｾｮ＠ going on for the last eight to ten 
years. I had raised this issue in the Ninth Lok 
Sabha also. I have also raised it day before 

.' yesterday and reported several times to the 
Ministry that due to the lack of a sea border 
line these incidents happen repeatedly. But 
the Government is taking no steps in this 
regard. Even though our fishermen have not 
committed any crime they are forced to lan-
guish in jails for two years. As a result our 
fishing business has become sick. The agro-
based industrieS have also become sick. I 
would like to inform the House that on 24th 
January the Pakistani coast guards caught 
the Indian fishermen. Our national flag was 
hoisting on that boat. They brought it down 
and took it on their boat. They played a 
cassette and forced ou r fishermen and sea-
men (Khalasi) to dance. The fishermen of 
Gujarat and Daman-Diu and otherorganisa-
tions reported this matter and made numer-
ous representations in this regard but no 
step has been taken by the Government so 
far. 

Mr. Speaker, Sir, through you I demand 
from the Government that the sea borderline 
should be decided immediately or an ar-
rangement should be made which can stop 
both the Pakistani and Indian Fishermen 
from violating the border. I demand an 
immediate action from the hon. Minister in 
this regard. 

SecondlY,1 have received many Letters 
from my constituency wherein it has been 
stated that fishermen of Daman and Gujaral 
were registered at Umargaon in Balsad dis-
trict of Gujaratfor last many years. But a new 
order has been issued recently that the 
registration would be done at Verawal In 
Saurashtra which Is 1000 Kms. away. How is 
it possible for these fishermen to reach there 
?These bureaucrats issue orders while sit-
ting In air-conditioned rooms. They have 
little knowledge of the area or the practical 
difficulties. The han. Minister of Surface 
Transport is present here, and he should 
therefore take steps to improve the situation 
by revoking this order and maintaining status 
quo. 

SHRI VISHWANT AH SHASTRI 
(Gazipur): Mr. Speaker, Sir, a grave crisis of 
petrol arid diesel has hit Eastern Uttar 
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Pradesh. This crisis can be guessed by the 
. fact that while dally average consu"l>tion of 
diesel In this region is more than 60 to 70 
thousand kiloliters, the daily supply is only 12 
thousand kilo lit res at present. The supply of 
electricity in this region is being done only lor 
name sake since last one and a half m(mltt. 
In many district headquarters of this region 
electricity is not supplied for ｓｇｖｾｩｃＺＡ＠ hOUiS at 
a stretched. Sometimes Gazipur city which 
falls In my constituency faces black out for 8 
to i 0 hours. On the one hand the pOwer 
supply, is erratic whereas on the other hand 
there is crisis 01 petrol and diesel which has 
made the farmers desperate. The crops have 
not been threshed as most of the threshers 
have closed down because of diesel crisis. 
Similarly, most of the pump sets have be-
come useless. Thus agriculture has been 
affected. Diesel operated passenger vehicles 
have also been affected. 

I, therefore, demand that immediate 
steps be taken to tackle the diesel and petrol 
crisis in Eastern U.P, particularly in Gazipur 
district and ensure the sufficient supply of 
diesel in that region so that the farming 
activity is not hampered in any way. 

[English] 

SHRI A. INDRAKARAN REDDY (Adila-
bad): Mr. Speaker, Sir, more than 1.000 
villages in my constituency in Adilabad dis-
trict are affected by severe drought. People 
are not getting even drinking water, not to 
talk of water lor irrigation. Certain borewells 
and open wells are already identified and the 
list is submitted to the Government of India 
and pending far the last one year. But, safar, 
not a single paisa has been sanctioned for 
the borewefls. The cattle and domestic ani-
mals are already dying of starvation. Our 
Zilla Praja Parishads and the Mandai Praja 
Parishads have already passed unanimous 
resolutions urging the State Govemment 
and the Central Government to come out· 
with massive assistance and programmes 
for drought relief activities in our area. There 
is no wor!< forlaouurforthe last one year due 
to drought situation. Some labourers are 
migrating to neighbouring State- Maharash-

tra - to' earn their livelihood and to save 
themselves from starvation and death. Our 
district is Inhabited mostly be tribals and 
Scheduled Castes and backward people 
and they are aii suffering because of the 
neglect of the Government. 

I request the hon. Minister of Agricul-
ture, through you, tp immediately release 
Rs. 10 crores ior the drought relief pro-
grammes like Food for Wor!< programmes 
etc. to save the starving masses from further 
sufferings. I also request the Government of 
India to ib!ease Rs. 5 crores immediately for 
the purpose of sinking bore wells and other 
wells for drinking watef:O OlJr people who 
are mostly tribals and Scheduled caste and 
backward classes. 

I urge upon the Government of India to 
swing into action immediately and to provide 
funds lor the droughl'relief works. 

SHRI K.P. SINGH DEO (Dhenkanal): 
Mr. Speaker, Sir, I wish so raise a subject of 
India's most famous wetland, which is inter-
nationally famous and which has been made 
into that of national importance. I refer to 
Chilka lake. It is the largest lagoon in South 
Asia and it is the umpire ecosystem and the 
'breeding ground for migratory and resident 
birds. Apart from that, one lakh of fishermen-
folk families numbering half-a-million draw 
their sustenance from this Chilka lake water-
body. Sir, there is a move by the State 
Govemment to widen the entrance of the 
sea water into Chilka lake to ensure that 
boats can come into a place near Magar-
mukh. 

Sir, deepening and widening of this 
channel will not only affect the carrying 
capacity and productivity of this lagoon 
because some project for prawn cultivation 
is going to come up in that area. This will 
affect half-a-million fishermen who are draw-
ing their sustenance and their avocation 
from that. Apart from that, those dealing with 
the business of aqua-<:ulture will be affected. 
Already there are agitations by the fisher-
menfolk and before an i"l>act analysis on 
ecology and environment is do by an expert 
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body, this internationally and nationally 
important wasteland shouid not be allowed 
to be destroyed by the State Government 
and since Environm.mt is a Concurrent 
subject, through you, Sir, I would like to 
move the Government of India to put a sjOP 
to this projee! before an impact analysis on 
the ecology and environment and the reha-
tl:::;;t!!)n ｾｲｾｲＺＺＡｾ＠ is taken up. The ques-
tion of rehabilitation of these fisflermer:fo!k 
will giVe rise 10 social tension which ;., hap-
pening at the moment. It has also been 
discussed in the Orissa State ｬ･ｯｩｾＡ｡ｴｩｶ＼［＠
Assembly, Sir. -

[Trans/atienj 

SHRI RAM KAPSE (Thaue): Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, a serial on the life of Ambadkar 
is telecast from 12th April at the prime time 
on every Sunday at 9 p.m. Tili now two 
episodes have been telecast and there are 
eight episodes in all. After seeing two epi-
sodes, I feel that there is a possibility of 
conflict all over the country if this serial 
continues. The facts have been distorted. 
Any person, who makes a serial on the bass 
of History in which there is distortion of time 
and place about Ambedkar is not good rnore 
so when we know certain facts about Am-
bedkar. Keeping in view !pe dress Shri 
Ambedkar has been portrayed as wearing 
half pants and shirt when he was young. 
School going children of those days have 
been shown wearing half-pant and shirts. I 
would like to tell you something about the 
screen-play of this serial. Talking to her 
brother the sister says, ., willjust now tell this 
news to brother Satpal." When Satpal is her 
brother, she will say "brother" only. How a 
boy speaks to his uncle-"uncle, I am Ramji 
Satpal". !t means the writer felt that Ramji 
Satpal is only a name. On this, uncle says, 
"You are Ramji Salpal." 

The incident which took place in Bom-
bay, when he was studying there was de-
picted to have taken place at Satara. Am-
bedkar's father was a teacher in lashkar. It 
is true. He was very sedate person but he is 
presented In such a way that not cnly oro!-

nary persons but intemationally reputed 
person like Day Pawar said he was a dacoit. 

MR. SPEAKER: Who has said so? 

SHRI RAM KAPSE: He said that in the 
serial he :GGl<s iiKe a uai:--u:i, aiiu ine peniuil 
who contributed this article in "Lok Saptah" 
says tnat he reseIT'.blas General Zia. He was 
a teacher In lashkar. It is a new thing. His 
photograph is also available, still he is ｾｩｮｧ＠
prssented in such a manner. 

MR. SPEAKER: Has it been shown and 
said on T. V.? 

SHRI RAM KAPSE: Yes Sir, a serial on 
his life is being telecast. Shri Daya Pawar 
has reviewed the serial. 

MR. SPEAKER: Daya Pawar should 
not say all these things, if her depiction is 
false. 

SHRI RAM KAPSE: The most improper 
thing is that Vas ant Moon, who edited the 
articles of Shri Ambedkar, about whom it is 
said that he is the advisor of this T. V. serial. 
In its reply he immediately said that he has 
no connection with this serial and its televis-
ing should be stopped as soon as possible. 
Savita Ambedkar was his wife. She also 
gave an ultimatum that if its telecast is not 
stopped within two days, the result would be 
a conflict. 

Not only this, the people of North India 
are shown participating in music, pop music 
and konkani music. Similar is. the position of 
writing, direction, music and photography. 
Acting in the serial leaves no impression. 
Therefore, it is a great insult and humiliation 
to Shr! Arnoodkar. This serial has 8 epi-
sodes. Out of which two episodes relate to 
the childhood and perhaps we will not find 
the real philosophy of Ambedkar, which we 
want to watch on the TV. 

MR SPEAKER: It should not be dis-
torted. He resermles a dacolt etc. 
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"{English1 

SHRI RAM KAPSE: It is the Statement 
of Oaya Pawar. 

Whatever word I have said, I stand by it. 

MR. SPEAKER: It is not ｮ･｣･ｳｾ｡ｲｹ＠ to 
refer to it. 

[Translation1 

SHRI RAM KAPSE: I feel that this serial 
is not telecast in the manner it ought to have 
been and I am speaking here because I did 
not like it. I oppose that and request the hon. 
Minister to reconsider about this serial. He 
will come to know that discontentment will 
increase among the people and if thiS serial 
continues it may give arise to conflict. There-
fore, suspend it for some days. I would like 
that the hon. Minister should make a state-
ment in this regard. 

SHRI RAM VILAS PASWAN(Rosera): 
M.r. Speaker, Sir, whatever has been said 
about the serial on the life of 8aba Sahib 
Arnbedkar is right but I am not in favour of 
suspending this serial. When we formed a 
centenary committee, we certainly wished 
that a serial should be made on the life of 
Baba Saheb Ambedkar. Assigning the jobto 
a professional in the field that serial should 
be made on the same lines as that on the life . 
of Mahatma Gandhi. Since Saba Saheb 
Ambedkarwas the father of ｯｵｲｃｯｮｳｴｾｵｴｩｯｮＬ＠
therefore, an excellent film of international 
level should be made en him. Though we 
had thought of it but it cou1d not mature. We 
agree that the Govemment made some 
selection and it is showing those episode to 
us. If once its telecast is stopped abruptly it 
will not be telecast again. I support it if it is 
retelecast after making some changes here 
and there and making it more appealing. 

SHRI RAM ｋａｐｾｅＺ＠ Shri Shyam Bene-
gal is also ready to make a serial on the life 
｣ｴＮｾ｢･ｓ｡ｨ･｢Ｎ＠

SHRI RAM VILAS PASWAN: H the tele-
ｾ｡ｳｴ＠ is suspended once It will be stopped 

permanently and it would be difficult to res-
ume, because the intentions are not good. 
Still I would like to say that we have also seen 
that serial and certain such things are there 
e.g. the way his father is presented and the 
death scene of his father are some ot the 
scenes depicted. with a high emotional im-
pact There Is no such thing that the face of 
Saba Saheb does not appear real to us. Now 
the question is of the from in which it should 
be portrayed ... 

SHRI ATAL BIHARI VAJPAYEE 
(Lucknow): How can we help if sonul one 
says that Ram Vilasji resembles a dacoit. 

SHRI RAM VILAS PASWAN: How can 
we help. at least if Atalji says so, that cannot 
be replied. Therefore, I would like to say that 
the Government should look into the objec-
tionable portions. Whatever is accepted and 
admitted by all should certainly be shown. All 
of us in the House wish that the Govemment 
ought to spend a sufficient amount of money 
on it. It is a matter of deep regret that the 
Government knew that the centenary year of 
Saba Saheb Ambedkar is at hand and we 
have been demanding in this house since 
1980 that an excellent film should be made 
on the life of Saba Saheb. But no good film 
could be made even after 1 0-12 years. Now, 
when the film is made and there are other 
lacunae, these may be rectified and the film 
may be telecast. But the telecast of the film 
should not be stopped. If the telecast of the 
serial is stopped, it may create some other 
problems. That is what I mean to say. 

{English] 

SHRI CHETAN P.S. CHAUHAN (Am-
roha): Mr Speaker, Slr,l congratulate Indian 
archer Shri Urma Ram for equalling the 
world record for the 30 metres event being 
held at Beiglng In the China International 
Archery Tournament, 1992. It is commend-
able to note that Shri Llmba Ram scored 357 
points out of the possible 360 points in the 
toumament, thereby equa\\lng \he wor\d ｮＧｉ｡ｾ＠
set by Matsushita T akaishl of Japan In 1987. 
It Is a matter of great pride that LlrTt>a Ram 
Is leading in the over-au individual qualifying 
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rounds by scoring 1,296 points out of possi-
bly 1,440. His achievement <has brought 
Indian archery on the world map. We hail the 
achievement of this young man for bringing 
laurels and glory to the nation. 

I am sure the House will Join me in 
congratulating him. 

MR. SPEAKER: Yes. We will join you. I 
am asking the dynamic Sports Minister to 
congratulate him. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HOMAN RESOURCE DE-
VELOPMENT (DEPARTMENT OF YOUTH 
AFFAIRS AND SPORTS AND THE DEPAR 
MENT OF WOMEN AND CHILD DEVEL-
OPMENT) (KUMARIMAMATABANERJEE): 
I am grateful to Shri Chetan P. S. Chauhan. 
I think the House should pass a resolution to 
congratulate Shri Limba Ram. 

MR. SPEAKER: Yes. We would con-
gratulate him. 

KUMAR I MAMATA BANERJEE: Eve-
rybody should congratulate him. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI CHUN CHUN PRASAD 
YADAV(Bhagalpur): Mr. Speaker, Sir, 
through you I would like to raise a very 
important question of public interest. In my 
State Bihar, Sasaram-Buxur road leads to 
ballia and, Gorakhpur. There is a one way 
traffic on this road. Hundreds of trucks pass 
through it and it is a very busy road. As there 
is one way traffic on it the road is very narrow, 
generally accidents take place on it. Some 
times these accidents are even fatal. I re-
quest the hon. Surface Transport Minister 
through you that this 300 kilometres long 
road should be declared as National high-
way. 

[English] 

SHRI SHRAVAN KUMAR PATEL 
(Jabalpur): I am in barnued that a most 
serlOes explosion has taken place in the 

Filling Section of the Ordinance Factory of 
Khawaria in Jabalpur. 

MR. SPEAKER: Why do not you talk to 
the hon. Minister first? Why do you depend 
on that? Are you sure about it? If you are, I 
will allow you. Otherwise, you talk to the hon. 
Minister. 

SHRI SHRAVAN KUMAR PATEL: At 
least one person has been killed so far and 
several others have been grievously injured. 

This is not the first time that this kind nf 
an incident has taken place In the factory at 
Jabalpurwhich is run by the Central Govern-
ment. The police investigations reportedly 
revealed negligence in maintaining safety 
measures. Of late, there has been increase 
in negligence on the part of officers who are 
entrusted with supervision of ammunition 
and explosive Department. In fact, seiural 
instances of lack of proper supervision and 
control have been reported in the local press. 

Many cases of pilferage of very sensi-
tive material with the connivance of superio.: 
staff have also come 0 light. 

I, therefore, urge upon the Defence 
Ministry to appoint a high-level Enquiry 
Committee to go into such negligence and 
pilferage and take appropriate action against 
the careless officers and to give compensa-
tion to the family of the deceased workmen 
and to give proper medical treatment to all 
those workmen who were injured in the 
explosion and to take adequate saftey 
measures in future. 

[ Translation] 

PROF. PREM DHUMAL (Hamirpur): Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, the Air Traffic Control Officers 
of National Airports Authority have resorted 
to work to rule from 1 st May while the hon. 
Minister has told in the House that it is not 
causing any loss, but the facts are contrary 
to it. The pilots who pilot the earoplanes are 
required to fill the journey log-book and t.;:;1 
engine log-book. They are showing this wor. 
to rule by traffic control officers as the cause 
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of delay of theirflights. The higher authorities 
.... have also admitted that one minute delay in 

flight leads to the wastage of fuel of 5 
thousand rupees. In this way, the Govern-
ment is suffering a loss of 4 crore rupees just 
onluel. 

Mr. Speaker, Sir. I want to submit through 
you to the Government that talks should be 
held with these officers. These officers had 
given due notice. They had given their char· 
ter of demands and had informed that they 
ｷｯｾｬ､＠ resort to work to.rule from 1st May. 
Even then the Government is not paying any 
heed to them and the loss of luel is being 
suffered and the air·traffic is also being de· 
layed. Therefore, my submission, through 
you is that they should be invited for talks. 

[English] 

SHRI BASU DEB ACHRIA(Bankura): I 
have given notice on this. 

SHRI PRITHVIRAJ D. CHAVAN 
(Karad): Sir, you will recall that the hon. 

. Minister of agriculture had given an assur-
ance to this House that he will send a Central 
team to Maharashtra to review the drought 
situation and to see whether Central assis-
tance is to be given or not. It is more than ten 
days. It is not on one occasion but the hon. 
Minister gave the assurance on two occa-
sions in the House. The team has not gone 
to Maharashtra yet. Maharashtra Govern· 
ment is waiting for some communication 
from the Centre. Jiowever, there is no com-
munication. It is my understanding that the 
team has not even been formulated. I also 
understand that the hon. Ministerof Finance 
is not willing to associate tJimself with the 
Central teahl. Unless the Ministry of Finance 
associates, the whole exercise will be infruc-
tuous. I also understand that the two teams 
whi'Sh have gone to Madhya Pradesh and 
Gujarat also did not have anybody from the 
Ministry of Finance. The Nine Finance 
Commission very clearly says that in case of 
severest of. severe calamities, adequate 

., Central assistance will come in the form of 
25 per cent advance from the next year's 
allocation. So, I would request that a state-

ment should come stating why the team has 
not gone to Manarashtra. This is a very 
specific assurance which has been given 
twice. I request the hon. Minister to let us 
know about it. (Interruptions) 

SHRI BASU DEB ACHARIA: Sir, about 
the air Traffic Controllers' agitation, I have 
given a notice. Please allow me to mention 
about it. 

Sir, all the flights are being delayed 
since ｾ＠ stMay. the Air Traffic Controllers are 
on agitation. They have resorted to work-to-
rule. They have been appealing to the Na-
tional Airports Authority for improvement in 
their promotional prospects and for other 
remuneration and perks commensurate with 
their job responsibility and accountability. 
The job of Ait Traffic Controllers has been 
recognised by the International Labour 
Organisation (ILO) as also by the world 
experts as unique with heavy responsibility 
and it requires instant decision-making ca-
pability. The ILO has opined that keeping in 
view the responsibility, the Air Traffic Con-
trollers more closely resemble with that of 
the Pilots and hence it recommended the 
remuneration and perks should be compa-
rable with that of the remuneration and perks 
of the professional pilots. Further, the Air 
Traffic Controllers Guild has been appealing 
to the mangement to concede their demands. 
but the management is silent on that. The 
management is not talking to Guild, to the 
aSSOCiation. 

I, therefore, appeal to the Government 
that the Civil Aviation Minister should send 
instruction to the management so that the 
management could talk to the Air Controllers 
to end the agitation, which was resorted to by 
the Air Traffic Controllers. Because of that 
agitation, aU the flights are being delayed. 
( Interruptions) 

SHRI RAM NAIK(Bombay North): Sir, I 
would like to say something on the drought 
situation prevailing in Maharashtra. The 
people of Maharashtra are waiting for the 
Central team just like to chatak' bird waiting 
for the rain. In order to protest against the 
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apathy of the centralGovemment, the people 
of Maharashtra are observing a band today. 
I have just confirmed at 12.30 p.m. There is 
a total band in Maharashtra. The people are 
worried and agitated. That Is why I demand 
that the central team must go immediately. 
It Is not only the central team but the Prime 
Minister must also go and visitthe places. As 
demanded by the State Government, Rs.SOO 
crores should be given. 

Sir, you are aware the by-elections in 
Maharashtra have been specifically post-
poned because of the drought conditions. It 
Is such a seri9us matter and stili the Govem-
ment Is not sending the team. So, I demand 
that a team must be send and the Prime 
Minister must also visit Maharashtra imme-
diately. (Inte"uptions) 

SHRI SOBHANADREESWARA RAO 
V ADDV(Vijyawada): Sir, through you, I draw 
the attention of the Gbvemment to the sad 
Plight of the sugar-cane growers in Andhra 
Pradesh. The cane-growers are not paid 
theircane-dues forthe cane supplied. Many 
of the private sugar factories as well as the 
cooperative sugar factories are not paying 
the amount and as a result of which, the 
Caue-growers, who have to pay forthe har-
vest-charges, transport-charges, are facing 
problems. Also, this is the time when the 
bankers are pressing them for the recovery 
of their loans. Moreover, the Revenue De-
partment Is pressurising these people and 
even coming to take physical possession of 
the goods In respect of the arrears relating to 
the Irrigation Cess and the revenue arrears. 
In that way, the farmers are suffering. So, I 
draw the attention of the Governmentto take 
immediate steps to see that the cane prices 
are paid by the factories. Also, the additional 
cane prices payable by the factories to the 
growers depend on a factor called "l". Until 
the Central Govemment communicates that 
factor "L" which is in ·the Bhargave formula 
for additional prices payable by the factorieS, 
the State Govemment will not take action. 

MR. SPEAKER: Please conclude. 
Today, we want to allow many members. 

SHRI SOBHANADREESWARA RAO 
VADDE: Sir, I am concluding. For the last., 
fouryears-1988-89, 1989-90, 1990-91,1991-
92- the additionai cane prices are not being 
paid to the cane growers. And I urge upon 
the Government to look into this aspect and 
take immediate steps to see that the prices 
are paid to the cane growers. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI MOHAN SINGH(Ferozepur): Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, I want to draw your attention 
towards the labourers of Punjab who are 
victims of the system of contract, The la-
bourers, whether they are In F.C.I. Labour 
Union, Punjab labour Union, or In Food and 
Supplies Union, are given wages by the 
contractors. The labourers who work from 
dawn to dusk, are not given full wages by 
these contractors. They give them wages 
according to their wish. When the labourers 
are not given full wages it means their sweat 
is not compensated for. The system of con-
tract of paying wages to labourers which Is in 
vogue in Punjab should be put to an end 
immediately. As in the other States of the 
country, the system of contract of paying. 
wages to the labourers has been abolished 
and the labourers get wages directly. like-
wise the system of contract in Panjab should 
also be abolished and the labourers should 
get wages direct. Besides it, the three F. C.1. 
depots, which are located. in Amrisar, Ajnala 
and Navansher have been made Puccaand 
the rest of 125 kuttch a depots of Punjab 
should also be made pucca. 

SHRt NAVAl KISHORE RAI(SItamarhQ: 
Mr. Speaker, Sir, I come trom Bihar. The 
regional news are not telecast by ｴｾｬ･ｶｬｳｬｯｮ＠
in our State but tese news are not telcest in . 
the whole State. There is a low power T.V. 
tower due to which this telecast does not 
reach all the districts. therefore, more pow-
erful transmitter should be set up there. 
Besides, the demand of broadcasting a news 
bulletin in Bangle-language has been tying 
pending since long. Banglaspeaking people 
are living in 10-12 districts of Bihar. Their 
demand should be fulfilled and a news bulle-
tin should be broadcast in Baugla language ..... 
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[English] 

PROF. SUSANTA CHAKRABORIY 
(Howrah): Mr. Speaker. Sir. the issue that I 
want. to raise is about the Bills passed by the 
State Legislatures, awaiting with the Centre 
for its approval and assent. 

We all know that any successful func-
tioning of this polity of ours depends on 
ｭｵｴｵ｡ｬｾｮ､･ｲｳｴ｡ｮ､ｩｮｧ＠ and cooperation and 
on the assurance of the Centre that the Bills 
that are senttothemwill be passed orassent 
will be given to them with in a specified period 
of time. Any delay in such matters causes 
disbelief. 

We would all surely agree that we should 
avoid that position. 

Many States have sent certain Bills which 
are pending with the Central GovernmeJlt. I 
do not know the details 01 Bills of other 
States. But, Sir,so far as West Bengal is 
concerned, same seven important Bills are 
pending. the Trade Union (West Bengal) 
Amendment Bill, 1983, it has been received 
by the Centre on 22.11.1983. The Calcutta 
University (Amendment) Bill, 1984. Rabin-
dra Cultural Institute (Taking over of Man-
agement) (Amandment) Bill, Howrah Mu-
nicipal Corporation Bill, (Second Amend-
ment) Bill, The Asansol Municipal Corpora-
tion Bill, Chanderanagore Municipal Coop-
eration Bill and Siliguri Municipal Corpora-
tion Bill are awaltuig approval from the 
Govemment. 

Therefore, I shall request you to direct 
the Minister to take necessary steps In this 
regard so that these Bills get the assent 
without any delay. 

SHRI JASWANT SINGH (Citorgauh): 
Mr. Speaker, Sir, earlier In the day, Shrl Atal 
Bihari Vajpayee, Shrl George Fernandes 
and Shri Chandra Shekhar raised an issue, 
lnvolving several thousand crores of ropees 
as a scam from the banking system of the 

. country, including the National Housing Bank. 
The Govemment with some alacrlty-Shri 
Chidambaram and indeed the Finance Min-

Ister-had responded and had been attempt-
ing to satisfy both Shrl Chandra Shekhar and 
Shrl Ataljl. The public utterances in Parlia-
ment was satisfied or· not, I do no know. 
Perhaps, they have managed to satisfy Shri 
Ataljl and Shri Chandra Shekhar. 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATTERJEE 
(Bolpur): You are assuming that. 

SHRI JASWANT SINGH: I am assum-
ing that. In a similar fashion, we have raised 
the issue of Bofors, forthe whole day yester-
day. (Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: Will you allow other 
Members to make the;r points please, at 
least in the last two, three days? I will allow 
you also to raise that matter at the end. 
Please take you seat now. 

( Interruptions) 

SHRI M. RAMANNA RAI (Kasaragod): 
Sir. the General Sacretary of All India Pass-
port Employees Association is on an indefi-
nite hunger strike since 22.4.1992. The 
demaJlds of the association appear to be 
just. 

Even though the Passport applications 
rose from 13 lakhs to 351akhs from 1980 to 
1992. the number of employees remain static 
at 1449. The chances of promotion is also 
almost nil. The service condition is also not 
satisfactory. 

I call upon the Minister of External Af-
fairs to interfere and settle the Issue amica-
bly and avert catastrophe. (Interruptions) 

l 
SHRI SOMNATH CHATTERJEE: Sir. I 

am constrained to-with your permission-raise 
a matter with regard to an officer of a Central 
Public Sector Undertaking who has be&n 
victimised only because I have raised an 
issue concerning that ｵｮｾ､｡ｫｩｮｧＮ＠ It has 
been suspected by the Ministry that thaf 
officer was responsible for passing on the 
information. 

Sir, for six years. Mr. A. K. Moitra was 
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the Chairman and Managing Director of the 
National jute Manufacturers Corporation. I 
am happy that the Minister is here. 

His case was approved by the Pablic 
Sector Enterprises Selection Board. The 
vigilance angle was also looked into and 
there was a clearance Irom the vigilance 
Commission. After six years, he was given 
an extension in June 1980, for another three 
years because of his outstanding service. 
The trouble began alter there was an at-
tempt by the Government of India, Ministry of 
Textiles, to sell the Major undertaking, the 
National Jute Mills, to a private industrialist. 
We got the information and I raised it in the 
House. Ultimately, the Minister had said, 
"No. there is no such proposaJ", Sir, Mr. 
Wadhwa of Chapdhani Industries seems to 
be too powerlul. What happened is this. The 
Chairman and Managing Director was di-
rected by the Ministry to .. ass on he informa-
tion particulars, records, documents of this 
Company to the proposed purchaser, a pri-
vate industrialist. After an objection was 
raised here, what happened is that, the 
Chairman and Managing Director was Di-
rected to pass on he information to the 
Ministry so that the Ministry could pass it on 
to them. The Chairman refused to do that. 
Then, the trouble started. He was being 
victimised; he was insulted; Deputy Secre-
tary and ordinary officers were giving him 
orders; money was not being released for 
this Company; he was not being given inter-
views here. He has come here expecting to 
meetthe officers. Ullimatelywhat happened? 
He got fed up; he tendered his reSignation on 
31 st January 1992, to be effective from 30 of 
April 1 ｾＹＲＮ＠ On 29th 01 April 1992-a day 
before that-he was issued a Charge-sheet. . 
The Charge-sheet was confidential. 

Sir, I will take only one minute more. The 
issue Is very important. How is the Govem-
ment functioning? 

On the 29th of April 1992, a confidential 
Charge-sheet was given and he accepted It. 
On the very same day, thai was pasted on 
the Notice Board of a multi-storlyed building, 
where he is occpying one of the upper flats. 

A confidential Charge-sheet is being pasted 
on a notice board so that everybody could 
see in that house. It Is just to humiliate him 
before the people who are occupying that 
multi-stolyed building. 

The main witness is the June Commis-
sioner. In the charge-sheet, it is mentioned 
that he is the principal witness. What is the 
charge? The charge is that you have" not 
retrenched employees. Secondly, you have 
given ESI benefits to the employees. Ac-
cording to the Government, he was not au-
thorised. 

MR. SPEAKER: Generally, we do not 
discuss these matters. 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATIERJEE: We 
have been requesting the hon. Ministerthat 
he is being victimised. This is the way. That 
Jute Commissioner has now been given this 
additional charge. He has gone to the Press. 
The charge-sheet is issued on the 29th. On 
30th, his resignation is accepted. On 30th, 
this Jute Commissioner holds press confer-
ence in Calcutta and makes out the particu-
lars of the charge-sheet. The objective is to 
humiliate the officer. This matter was raised 
in the House. After it was raised in the 
House. After it was raised in he House, the 
trouble started for him. I would like to know: 
Is this the way the Govemment behaves? 
Can't we raise any matter? Will the officers 
and employees be threatened like this? 

We requested the Minister that the Joint 
Secretary is against him. He wants his blood-
fond of flesh. He said: "I am very sympa-
thetiC .• This is the way the sympathy is being 
shown! How do we expect that the public 
sector industry would be run properly in this 
country when he is a person against whom 
no charge about personal integrity is made? 
The charge is: Why have you not dismissed 
workers? Why have you given ESlbenelits 
they were not entitled to get? 

Is this the way the Government will 
lunction? Why I am concerned is that it is not 
about'A', 'B'or'C'. Thequeslionis aboutlhe 
method., functioning. In "*'ers like th; .. , 
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they could not deny. They had to retrace 
their steps in selling a major uncKtrtaking to 
a private industrialist. 

MR. SPEAKER: We are not allowing 
such matters. 

( Interruptions) 

SHRISOMNATHCHATTERJEE:When 
the Minister is here, he should respond and 
see. His resignation has been accepted but 
his dues are not being paid. 

Have you ever heard aboul a press 
conference bel'ng held about the charge-
sheet, that a confidential Charge·sheet is 
pasted on a notice board of a multi-storied 
building? Has it ever happened? He is being 
threatened that he has 10 vacate the House. 
His telephone line is being sought to be 
disconnected just ｢･｣ｾｳ･＠ he has not now-
towed to them. just bec1:use. (Interruptions) 
he has nol agreed to the 
transfer ... (Interruptions) 

Ypu are aware that there was a jute 
strike for a number of days. He averted that 
strike in NJMC. That is why the big high-ups 
In the Ministry got annoyed because they 
wanted to show that NJMC was running at a 
loss so that they could sell ott to the private 
industrialist. This is happening. 

. I strongly protest against this. I request 
the Minister. He is here. He should at leas 
say that he would be sympathetic. I hope he 
was not misleading us. If he really intended 
to be sympathetic, he should take immediate 
action. Let him avert it. (Interruptions) 

SHRI SAIFUDDIN CHOUDHURY 
(Katwa): Sir, you said, you don't allow this 
type of matter to be raised here.lthink. it has 
a bearing on our functioning also. We raise 
matters conneded with Public sedor organi-
sations. (Interruptions} 

MR. SPEAKER: You don't raise matters 
relating to individuals-appointments, etc. 

(Interruptions) 

SHRI SAIFUDDINCHOUDHURY: Now 
we will be afraid to raise 
matters .... ( Interruptions) Time and again we 

, raise matters. Somebody will be victimised 
again. (Interruptions) 

[ Trans/ation] 

SHRI TARIT BARAN TOPDAR (BAR-
RACKPORE): Sir. I can prove. if the hon. 
Minister desires. (Interruptions) 

[English] 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATTERJEE:There 
is a newspaper report: NJMC CMD charge-
sheeted. Is this the way the Government of 
India is functioning? How does he go to the 
Press? 

[Translation) 

THE STATE MINISTEROFTAXTILES 
(SHRI ASHOK GEHLOT): Mr. Speaker, Sir, 
the officer. about whom they are talking was 
charge sheeted on the recommendations of 
the Central Vigilance Commission. As far as, 
his resignation is concerned. he has re-
signed and we have accepted his reSigna-
tion and the enquiry is being conducted /n 
regard to the charge-sheet given to him. We 
will take steps according to the reports of the 
enqUiry. We are not prejudiced against 
anyone. I will collect Information about his 
alleged victimisation ｾ｡ｦｴ･ｲ＠ the matter was 
raised in the House as the hon. Members are 
saying and I will also ascertain the in10rma-
tion in regard to convening of the press 
conference. 

SHRI TARIT BARAN TOPOAR: The 
officers of that organisation have convened . 
a ptess conference. 

[English] 

.... (/nterruptlons) ... 1 had raised It In the 
Consultative Committee meeting. (Interrup-
tions) 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATIERJEE: What 
is your rection to the Press conference? I 
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have got that newspaper. This Is not the way 
to deal with this matter. What happens If a 
charge-sheet is pasted on the notice board 
of a multi-storied building? I would like to 
know whetherthis has ever happened in this 
country. Who authorised whom to do It? 
( Interruptions) 

SHRI BASU DEB ACHARIA: This mat-
ter was raised earlier on the floor of this 
House. (Interruptions) 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATTERJEE: This 
will discourage the officers and the employ-
ees. (Interruptions) 

[Translation] 

SHRI SANTOSH KUMAR GANGWAR 
(BareiUy): Mr. speaker, Sir, the D.R.DA 
employees, are on agitation throughout India 
In supportofthelrgenuine demands. D.R.DA 
Is an organisation set up by the Central 
Govemment in which more than one lakh 
employees are working. This organisation 
has been running the programmes spon-
sored by the Centre at the district level for the· 
last many years. The Central programmes 
like IRDPWD, A.G.R.A., TRYSOME, Rural 
Development, Cleanliness Programme and 
the Jawahar Rozgar Yojana etc. are being 
run by these employees. These employees 
have been struggling hard for the last 10 
years In support of their demand to Improve 
their service conditions. They have also given 
seven pOint memorandum to the hon. Prime 
Minister and the hon. Rural Development 
Minister demanding pay scales and other 
facilities equal to the Sate Government 
employees, better promotion avenues, regu-
larisation of daily wage workers, reversion of 
deputationists to their parent departments, 
provision of full facilities for the dependents 
of the deceased employees etc. The addi" 
tional secretary, Rural Development, Gov-
ernment of India had held talks with the 
representatives of these employees two 
years ago and found that their demands 
were Justified. 

Mr. Speaker, Sir, my submissions that 
you should take personal interest in finding 

the solution to this problem Since the em-
ployees are neither considered the Central 
Govemment employees nor are they enjoy 
the facilities available to the State Govern-
ment employees. In this way the future of 
nearly one lakh people is very bleak. My 
submission is that their demands should be 
accepted immediately and a policy should 
be formed In this regard. 

[English] 

SHRI JASWANT SINGH; I have risen 
earlier to make a regl:llst . The Government 
has responded to an issue of very substan-
tial public importance raised by Ataljl, Chan-
dra ｓｨ･ｫｨ｡ｾｩ＠ and Shri George Feruaudes 
about the scam in Invalving thousands of 
crores of rupees. In a similar fashion, would 
the Government respond to whaf they are 
doing about Bofors, even with haH of that 
alertness? (Interruptions) 

[ Translation] 

SHRI BHOGENDRA JHA (MADHU-
BANE): Mr. Speaker, Sir, today, the office 
bearers, leaders and activists of All India 
Kisan Sabha are on a dharna at the Boat 
Club to lodge their protest against Gpvem-
ments policy on farmers and seek improve-
ments in it. It is a very important demand. 
The cuts made in the Budget in respect of 
rural development has put the on-going 
projects In doldrums. It is evident from re-
ports received from various States. the pro-
curement of foodgrains being made by the 
Govemment through the Food Corporation 
of India is a further more critical issue. The 
farmers complain that wheat is being sold at 
higher rates in the market than the price they 
are being paid. In this connection strike was 
held twice in Punjab. The militants have a 
hand In the strike. I am not making a demand 
to raise the price. But the trouble starts when 
we sell the foodgrains to traders at double 
the rate of what we pay 0 farmers. the 
farmers who are on a dharna demand that 
there should be a difference of maximum 
15% to 20 (a limit should be fixed) between 
the price paid to farmers and the the price the 
consumers pay. The producers as will as the 
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consumers are being looted. Mr. Speaker, 
Sir, a large part of the country Is facing 
drought. Various projects aimed at supply-
ing water, containing flood and generating 
electricity are at stake. 

It Is about Bihar, Maharashtra and 
Punjab. It S.Y.L. project is Implemented In 
Punjab, the water dispute between Punjab 
and Haryana could be resolved. Both the 
States are not is good terms over this issue. 

The Kosi barrage Dam will bring radical 
change In Bihar. It Is the biggest project in 
the world. It is to be completed by tHe Gov-
ernment of India. The Teesta project is lo-
cated in North of Bengal. After the execution 
of this project, electricity will be available in 
the area at cheaper rates. It wilt help resolve 
power crisis. The Govemment of India has to 
take initiative to accelerate the pace of worK. 
The State govemments are not capable 
enough to complete these projects. Land 
ceiling and' land consolidation should be 
implemented for the purpose of land re-
forms. With these words. I conclude. 

SHRI JASWANT SINGH: 
............ (Interruptions). 

Mr. Speaker. Sir. the hon. Minister of 
Parliamentary Affairs will count and say 
whether It is forthe tenth or eleventh time we 
are discusing the Bofors Issue in the house. 
I would like to know particularly about the 
Solanki espsiode in Bofors case. The House 
had to be adjourned thrice yesterday In 
connection with the Solanki espilsode. The 
proceedings were stalled. There were dis-
cussions on it three to four times. We have 
not taken up anything extreme with the 
Govemment during that discussion. We have 
only asked the Govemment as to what it wa!! 
doing India has become a subject of popular 
ridicule over the Solankl episode. It has 
created a sort of ilHeeling. and the proceed-
Ings of the house have been stalled. The 
business of the House should be resumed. It 
Is not thai our worries have been lessened. 
We expect that the Government should rise 
to occasion and say something. I appreciate 
the promptness shown by Atalji. Chandra 

Sekhrji and George Fernandes jl In raising 
the security scam isstJe involving Rs. 2000 to 
RS.3000 crore The' hon. Finance Minister 
came Immediately and tried to explain the 
position. He should have shown half that 
promptness in Bofors case. There Is nothing 
to hide In the Solanki episode. I want to know 
as to why the Govemment does not say 
anything In this regard. 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, when I initiated the discussion 
yesterday Itself, not much progress was 
noticed in the matter. I want to touch one of 
the points of the case. When the discussion 
was held in the House on 23rd, the hon. 
Prime Ministerwhile making a statement did 
not make any mention of this point. He said , 
that they would be giving a written reply on 
the issue. I have an objection to the Informa-
tion that has been received by me. I want to 
place It before the Government and the 
House. The hon. Prime Ministerhas given us 
In writing In a letter which Is In my possession 
now. 

( Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: There should be a 
regular discussion on it. 

(Interruptions) 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: Why 
should there be a discussion. The hon. Prime 
Minister has misled the House over this 
letter. The Editor of the Indian Express has 
written In Its front page ••.••• 
(Interruptions)These people are not aUow-
Ing me to speak. 

MR. SPEAKER: Please be brief. 

(English1 

SHRI A. CHARLES: Is there no other 
Issue for discussion? 

DR. R. MALLU (NAGAR Kumool): Sir, 
he Is taking a lot of time. The Prime Minister 
has given a reply. How many times will he 
repeat the same thing? 
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SHRI RABI RAY: I want to say that 
when Shrl George Femandes speaks, three 
M.Ps stand and Interrupt his speech. It Is not 
proper. You have allowed himtospeak. You 
should prevent them form making interrup-
tions. (Inte"uptions) 

[English] 

MR. SPEAKER: I expect senior Mem-
bers to go according to rules and not to raise 
matters only in zero hour. 

( IntelTlJptlons] 

MR. SPEAKER: Do not prolong the 
discussion. (Inte"uptions) 

DR. A. MALLU: Mr. Fernandes was 
given the maximum time (Interruptions) 

SHRI P.M. SAYEED(Lakshadweep): 
Sir, he is a senior Member, he should under-
stand this thatthere are other Memb8rs who 
also want to raise their points, 

MR. SPEAKER: Within a short time, it 
will be over. Please take your seat. 

Please be brief. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI GEORGE FERNAOES: I want to 
make a point before you That is, what hap-
pens if the matter is not fully explained. I 
received this letter the day before yesterday. 
I gave it to the press at 2.30 p.m. Several 
newspapers have published the entire text 
of the letter. Today, an English daily pub-
lished from maximum centres in the country, 
without mentioning the name of its editor, 
has written that the hon. Prime Minister was 
not shown the letter on the 25th. He was 
apprised ofthe matter on the 27th. (lnt8l'fup-
lions) You should understand my point of 
view. How the hon. Prime Minister is pre-
senting himself betore the country today? 
The truth must come out in regard to the 
question being raised by me. The entire 

Bofors case is a separate Issue while the 
ｓｯｬ｡ｾｩ＠ episode Is different. I as well as the 
entire cOuntry want to know the facts of the 
Solankl episode. The Government Is not 
prepared to reply the question raised by me 
to bring out the facts. Therefore, I suggest 
thatthe Govemment should take initiative to 
set up a Joint Parliamentary Committee. I 
have already told the Govemment this thing 
, If they don't wantto bring outthe facts, they 
should set up aJoint Parliamentary Commit-
tee. We will place the information before the 
Commit1ee. We request you to help us n he 
matter. (Inte"uptions) 

[English] 

SHRI P.M. SAYEEO: Mr. Speaker, Sir, 
your leniency has been exploited by the hon. 
Members. Sir,let there be a discussion under 
any rule for four or five hours. We are also 
hon. Members of this House. we also have 
the right to raise our points. 

SHRI A. CHARLES: We also have the 
privilege of raising the issues. This is very 
unfortunate that some of the Members are 
misusing the floor of the House everyday. 

SHRI SRIBALLAV PANIGRAHI (Oeog-
arh): Sir ... 

MR. SPEAKER: I will allow you. 

SHRI SRIKANTA JENA(Cutack): Sir, 
yesterday, we were given to understand by 
the Chair that an all-Party Meeting is going 
on in your Chamber to sort out this problem. 
When we raised ttlls' matter In the House, 
then, there was an explosion from the treas-
ury benches that this issue should not be 
raised. Then, we insisted that, let the Prime 
Minister come to this House and answer the 
queries which were raised by the opposition. 
The lalter which was sent to Shri George 
Fen;landes ... (Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: Why don't you come 
under same rule? You are all senior Mem- • 
bers. Everytime, you are cominp and raisina 
matters in the Zero Hour only. 
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SHRI SRIKANTA JENA: When the 
Deputy Speaker was In the Chair, he told the 
House that. in the Speaker's Chamber, 
meeting of all Party Leaders is going on. We 
want to know now what exactly had hap-
pened In that Meeting. 

ｾ＠ [Translation] 

SHRI LAL K. ADVANI(Gandhl Nagar): 
Mr. Speaker, Sir, yesterday, Mr. Vajpayee 
said it and it was also said by several others. 
I understand that it is our responsibility to 
brief the House abuot the discussions we 
held in your Chamber on any serious matter. 
Either you should inform the House or have 
it done in some other way. H you kindly 
permit me, I will brief the House about the 
discussions we held with you today and 
yesterday. We did not discuss anything ille-
gal. The discussions were held twice. The 
hon. Prime Minister has himseH said in the 
House. Afterthose two discussions the House 
has been convinced that the Government is 
conducting inquiry into the Bofors case and 
the Solanki episode is also linked with that 
Bofors case,. Many questions arise you of it. 
We don't have an answer to them. It i!i not 
known to us till now as towho gave this letter 
to him. Who was that unidentified and un-
known lawyer? We are not aware of it till 
today. Who told Mr. Bonant that it was given 
at the instance of the hon. Prime Minister. 
We have come to know from the discussions 
held in your Chamber that the Govemment 
still has no knowledge of it. We made a 
request that if the Government is not able to 
collect the information, it should be entrusted 
to the House which will do it through a Joint 
Parliamentary Commtiee. Going a step for-
ward, I have suggested, and many other 
have shared my view that in order to remove 
the bottleneck the hon. Prime Minister should 
assure the House that he will gathe r informa-
tion thes to who was the person who passed 
the message to Mr. Bonant and who was that 
unidentied and unknown lawyer and who 
introduced thes lawyer to Shri Solanki. 
Because I know that the hon. Prime Minister 
as well as the Government want to pursue 
the Before case. But there is some lobby 
which wants to stall the proceedings. h is the 

same lobby wh!c.'l !'.a.".d;C OY6i ioa! nots 
through Mr.lolankl. The Govemment should 
show as much eagerness as we are to 
expose the lobby and identity the lawyer. 
The inquiry to expose that lobby should be 
conducted either by a Parliamentary Com-
mittee or by the Government. 

14.00 hrs •. 

Mr. Speaker, Sir, these are the two 
suggestions I would like to make. The Gov-
ernmentshouldgive assurancetothe House. 
It seems to me that the Government is giving 
thought to the points on which we held 
discussions in your Chamber. 

[English] 

SHRI INDRAJIT GUPTA (Midnapre): 
Since ShriAdvani, with yourpermission, has 
sought to give a summary or the essence of 
what was discussed in your Chamber, and I 
also had the privilege of being present in that 
meeting, I would just like to supplement what 
he has said. I agree with him when he says 
that the proposals which were made on 
behaH of the Opposition leaders were emi-
nently reasonable. 

The main grievance of the spokesmen 
of the Government is that this matter is being 
raised to often on the floor of the House and . 
that it is leading to a great waste of time a lot 
of argument, counter argument, charges, 
counter charges, anercations and nothing is 
coming out. We are also of that view-that is 
what we stated in the meeting in your Cham-
ber-that what we wanted was to get at the 
truth relating to all these circumstances-
mysterious circumstances I should say-
concerning the Solanki episode. But what is 
happening in the House now for several 
days is not throwing any sight on these 
matters. Therefore, we had suggested-and 
the countrj..also, I believe and the public 
outside also feels-that this argumentation is 
not leading anywhere and we are accusing 
the Government of not being serious about 
pursuing the inquiry into these matters re-
garding Shri Solanki.1 am not referring to the 

. earlier main Bofors ;"vestigation which is 
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being carried on by the CBt We do not want 
to interfere in that. Let it go on. But now, after. 
this Solankl episode, we felt that If you do not 
want the matter to be raised continually here 
in the House and if proper replies are not 
given, tothe questions which had been raised, 
to which we believe the Prime Minister has 
given only partial replies in his letters to Shrl 
Georgti Fs;;r.ar.OE;S l!nd Shri Jaswant Singh, 
if those replies were to be obtained and the 
identity of those persons concerned is to be 
established, then, let the whoie matter be 
referred to a Joint Parliamentary Commit-
tee. Then the matter will not be raised here 
every day. You can proceed with your nor-
mal business. We are quite ready for that 
and the Parliamentary Affairs Ministers need 
not every day be so agitated and jumping 
about saying, that we have raised it nine 
times, ten thimes, more will not be !lowed, 
and so on. We do not want to raise it. But 
there must be some method by which we 
can get at the bottom of what has happened, 
in the matter which has cost one Cabinet 
Minister his job and which led to an unsa-
voury implication of the Prime Minister's 
name in this whole affair and although more 
than a month lias passed, nobody knows, 
who that unknown person was who handed 
over that note to Shri Solanki. 

So, we suggested that this Joint Parlia-
mentary Committee may be set up. Let its 
terms of reference be decided by consulta-
tion and agreement and let it be time-bound 
so that it does not go on for every. Let it be 
time-bound and let all parties be associated 
with that· JointParliame ntary Committee. 
We think that this is a reasonable proposal 
and to go on saying 'No' is not correct. But, 
Sir, what is this? We must have some rem-
edy. 

MR. SPEAKER: My difficulty is at thre'! 
O'Clock the Private Members Business has 
to start. 

SHRIINDRAJIT GUPTA: I know. 

MR. SPEAKER: H we are rising for 
lunch for one hour, It should be started at two 
O'Clock. I have some diffICulties. That is why 

ｾ＠

I am trying to do something. 

SHRI INDRAJIT GUPTA: Shall we 
continue our submissions on Monday? Do 
you want us to continue our submission on 
monday? 

MR. SPEAKER: If senior Members want 
to do it, who can stop them? 

SHRIINDRAJIT GUPTA: The Session 
cannot be adjourned Without something 
coming out of this, on this issue. 

SHRI A. CHARLES: I am only on a 
question of procedure. 

SHRIINDRAJIT GUPTA: How can the 
matter be -left hanging? What I am saying is 
this. Now there are two ways open. Either 
the Government should agree and Co-oper-
ate with others in agreeing to the formation of 
this Joint Parliamentary Committee or if they 
are dead against that, the only other remedy 
is-it is a sort of compromise proposal on our 
side-that the Prime Minister should come 
here and made a statement assuring the 
House about these two matters particularly 
regarding that note which was handed over 
to Shri Solanki. We do not know about that 
note except what has appeared in one daily 
paper. That note has not been recovered by 
the Government. We do not know what 
exactly are its contents. He should tell us that 
this matter is being seriously pursued and it 
will be investigated. Second is the ideatity of 
that person, of the so-called nameless law-
yer, who handed overthe note to ShriSolanki. 
Clues have also been given regarding that. 
But nothing is being followed up. It is not 
such a matter that it cannot be found out. All 
these variQus agencies are investigating and 
finding out many things and they cannot find 
out the ldeatity of that person. We believe 
that a JPC can do It. We have some clues in 
our possession. we are sure that unless 
some body is vitally interested in concealing 
the truth, It is possible to find out. H It is found 
out, then further clues will be available as to 
what was behind that man; who were the 
people who put him upto it; who wer8 the 
people interested in hiding the truth. Is It not 
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in the Country 's ｩｮｴ･ｦｾｳｴﾷ＠ Is It not in the 
Government's interest? Do thsy prefer to go 
around I.IIlder a cloud of suspicion inde11-
nitely? It is better that one proposal is objec-
tively and dispassionately considered and 
the ｇｏｉＡｾｲｮｲＺＧＮｾｭｴ＠ agree;; tv v;,;r ｰｲ｣ｰ＼Ｚ＿ｾｾＱ＠ ＧＡｾ＠

that the daily scenes in the HOuse can be 
avoided, ｗｾ＠ do noi want that to gc on . The 
alternative is the formation of aJPC. Whydo 
they not agree to this? 

SHRI SOMNATH CHATIERJEE: I 
• support this formation of aJPC. We also said 

this in the meeting. I wish to emphasise two 
things here .. (Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: Idid not say anything in 
the meeting. I just heard you. 

SHRI SOMNATH CHA TIERJEE: I said 
that it was said in the meeting. Sir. whoever 
gave that note was interested in suppressing 
the inquiry or swttlaig the inquiry and cover 
up the whole matter. And that person obvi-
ously was instrumental in making over the 
note through an unnamed lawyer to Shri 
SOlnki. Sir. this is nothing to do with Bofors. 
The whole attempt is being made as if we are 
trying to raise again and again the Bofors 
question. This is nothing to do with Bofors. 
Sir, the External Affairs Minister of this coun-
try had to resign. Is it a very simple matter? 
It is an ordinary routine matter? Now the 
story that is being said is that the Extern. 
Affairs Minister was given a document by 
somebody, whom he does not know and 
who made overthat document. This is noth-
ing but an Alice in Wonderland story. It is 
impossible for anybody to believe. There-
fore, we are saying that these two facts 
should be made known and should be ascer-
tained; as to who was the person who took 
the trouble of informing Mr. Bonaut that the 
Prime Minister has sanctioned the giving 
and handing over of the note. Sir. the coun-
try's interest and.country's good name are 
involved hore. Why Is the Government tak-
Ing up this attitUde. I do not know. 

Apart from Bofors, about which we have 
made our submissions earlier, this is a Solanki 
episode. This is a· different chapter alto-

gether. The Minister had to lose his Job. he 
had to resign. Sir, please go through the 
letter of the han. Prime Minister. I am sure 
that many eminent draftsmen were utilised 
forthis purpose in producing whatever prod-
ｾｾ＠ ﾥＺＺｾ＠ .=1 ｾ［ＺＬＺ･＠ ｾｾｯ､ｴＡｾ･､Ｎ＠ ｍｾｾｹ＠ hours 
must have been spent on this. Not a single 
word about any attempt to find out the iden-
tity of that lawyer, the idsfliity of the person 
who introduced that lawyer to Mr. Soianki, 
has been mentioned in that letter. It cannot 
be that an unknown person giving a docu-
ment in Davas or wherever it was. An Indian 
lawyer goes to Switzerland and makes over 
a document to the· External Affairs Minister 
and he very obligingly makes it over to his 
counterpart in Switzerland. This is very diffi-
cult to swallow. We can acceptthat situation. 
Therefore, we want the facts to come out. 
Now, they are not obliging. Therefore, in 
stead of leaving it to us to obtain clues from 
outside, they want that we should give them 
clues. With all their agencies, with all their 
might, Government of India, which its RAW, 
with its CBI, with its IB, foreign agenCies etc. 
etc., they cannot find out the dues .. They 
have to wait and depend on us to give them 
clues. This is nothing but a deliberate at-
tempt to suppress to truth. Therefore, we 
strongly support this'CIemand for a JPC. let 
all parties try to find out the truth in the 
matter. 

[Translation] 

SHRI VISHWANATH PRATAP SINGH 
(Fatehpur): Mr. Speaker. Sir, I support the 
demand of JPC that has just now been 
soughtbyShri IndrajitGupta,ShriSomanath. 
Shri Advani and Shri George Fernandes, it 
will help the Government as well. Keeping in 
view the manner in which questions are 
being raised in the country. it would be better 
forthe Government to concede soon with the 
demand of J.P.C. rather than allowing the 
clouds of doubt to hover. It will rather create 
an atmosphere of faith that the Government 
does not intend to hide anything. If the 
Government fails to obtain something within 
6 weeks, it should refer the matter to the 
House for their approach so that at least the 
Members and the House will ｨ｡ｶｾ＠ the con-
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solation that maximum possible is being 
done. The point is why do we raise the matter 
here again and again what should be brought 
before the House and what should not be 
brought is the question. We are being given· 
to accept that a letter was given to a Minister 
ot india by an Indian National or a lawyer or 
an advocate and the Government of India is 
so far unable te know the name of that 
person. That person is not a foreign national 
where our law does not apply, there he (the 
hon. Minister) had talk not with another per-
son: he is the citizen of this very country who 
held talks-with our hon. Minister. It is a wonder 
that Government of which the hon. Minister 
has been a part, itseH states that it has not 
been able to know the name 01 that person 
even after six weeks. Then without knowing 
his name how did you come to know that the 
said person is an advocate. a lawyer. 

It is quite surprising. That is why this 
question is raised here again and again. 
Who has introduced him? It is quite right that 
these people might be the same persons· 
who are assoicated with that person and 
they are now much interested in suppress-
ing the facts and preventing themfromcoming 
to light. 

Sir, for the first time we made an effort 
once, other than allegations and taking it as 
a case, to bring the Bofors money from the 
A.E. Services to this country and also the 
concrete documents duly sealed by the court. 
TNs is for the first time that a man has been 
traced. those document have been taced. 
this is for the first time 'thal a man came inlo 
contact of a Minister of the Government; H 
we want to show our sincerity to go to the root 
of this matter. we must catch that person and 
take action against him. 

So far as question 01 time of the House 
Is concemed, Sir, if J.P.C. is constituted, it 
will not only save the tiliB ot this House, 
rather it will also remove tlie doubts that are 
reared against the Government. It will serve 
both the purposes. SQ the demand of J.P.C. 
should soon be accepfed by the Govern-

men!. As they have ＡＡｾｉ､＠ that the Hon. Prime 
Minister come!; aomebody gives an assur-
ance that we would try to know about that 
person and about,the document, then we 
take it that what has been Published is true, 
ｾｦｊｾ＠ Ａｾｾｾｮ｣ｴ［［ｊ＠ atiuuiiii; not:ng. handwrit .. 
ing etc. through which something can be 
known. We should try to know aboutthat. but 
I do not want to indulge in any kind of 
speculations. I do not want te encourage 
that. But the J.P.C. will help in saving the 
time of the house and the.<3overnment will 
also get clearance. If you assure that you 
need time. then it is okay. let you fix a time 
period. They should bring out the name 
within that period. If they are unable to do so. 
they shouid give an assurance thattheJ.P.C. 
will be doing so because we see that we 
have arrived at a reality of the assurance in 
3 to 4 years. We have atleast reached upto 
A.E. Services andJordan till yesterday. Now. 
it is upto you how lor you push the matter 
from Jordan. Let us go ahead. 

[English] 

SHRI NIRMAL KANTI CHATIEAJEE: 
(Dumdum): Sir. only two aspects I want to 
raise ... (Interruptions). 

MR. SPEAKER: This is becoming a 
regular debate. It is not necessary. Please 
take your seat. .. 

( Interruptions) 

SHRI NIRMAL KANTI CHATTERJEE: I 
will not repeat, Sir. When the Government 
tries to convince us. at the same time. please 
admit that there are 101\ .. ,-,5 operating against 
Govemment's intention. and yet the Govem-
ment does not try to crack them down. This 
is the reason which leads us to 
say ... ( Interruptions). 

MR. SPEAKER: Now you please take' 
your seat. All the time you are imposing 
yourself on the House. You should speak 
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with the permission of the Chair. All the 
Mertbers have made the points very clearly. 

SHRI NIRMAl KANTI ｃｈａｔｔｅｒｊｅｅｾｴ＠
will not repeat, Sir. My point is that can you 
imagine a situation when a government dis-
covers that a force is working against the 
government policy, it keeps 
quiet? .. (Interruptions). 

MR. SPEAKER: Why do YOll say .an 
these things only in Zero Hour? Why don' 
you take resort to the rules? 

SHRI NIRMAl KANTI CHATTERJEE: 
Because you have raised this 'issue, on that 
question also I give the answer, Sir. " is 
repeatedly said that why raise it so many 
times. In fpct, the record is whenever we 
have raised it. we have moved forward to-
wards unravelling the mystery of Bofors. 
Ini1ially it was stated that nothing has hap-
pened. Then it was admitted th.at yes, we 
were right. Then companies were mentioned. 
Finally, because we have raised it, the Eex-
temal Affairs Minister had to go. This is the 
justification why we raise it again and again. 
There is no doubt about the fact that if 
instead of the Government enquiring into it, 
a jOint Parliamentary Committee is 
constituted ... (Interruptions). 

MR. SPEAKER: You sh.ould know that 
at three O'clock the Private Members' Busi-
ness and to start. Those people who have 
given their notices will be deprived of the 
ｯｰｰｯｲｴｵｮｾｹ＠ of discussing. The notices were 
discussed in the Committee, the time is 
fixed, and you, standing up in the Zero Hour, 
are not allowing them to take up that matter. 

SHRI NIRMAL KANTI CHATIERJEE: 
We have allowed them so long. Had the 
issue not been important, this would not 
'lave been raised. 

MR. SPEAKER: Now you please take 
yourseal. .. 

( Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: What to do Mr. Mohan 
Singh ji? you agree but he does not agree to 
sit down. 

THE MINISTER OF PARLIAMENTARY 
ａｆｆｒａｉｾｓＨｓｈｒｉ＠ GHULAM NABI AZAD): 
Sir, with great respect to hon. Leaders and 
Merrbers of this House, Those who have 
raised this question yesterday and today 
also,l would like to submit that as far as the 
Bofors case Is concemed, only one word I 
will speak of that.... (Interruptions) 

[Translation) 

It is a great problem. 

(Eng/ish] 

This Is too much. 

( Trans/ation} 

Do not force me to speak what you can 
digest 

[English) 

I will say that we have not stopped any 
investigation, nor are we interested in stop-
ping or tampering with the process of inves-
tigation. 

Yesterday, pointed questions were 
raised by hon. Members and the same 
pointed question!' were raised by the hon. 
leaders in the meeting with the hon. Speaker. 
So, I would like to come to those two pointed 
questions. 

As far as the Govemment is concerned, 
the Gdvemment has no hesitation in getting 
the copy of the note handed over by the 
former Extemal Affairs Minister of India to 
the Swiss Foreign ｍｩｮｩｳｾ･ｲ＠ . !think that should 
meet the point raised by hon. Members 
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yesterday and also today. As for the identity 
of the person is concerned, it is not only the 
hon. Members on the otherside are keen but 
the Members of this side are also keen and 
the Government is equally keen to know the 
name and identity of the person involved. 
( Interruptions) 

l Translation1 

SHRI VISHWANATH PRA TAP SINGH: 
If it is not possible to know the name ,let you 
know the physical features of that man. 
Whether he was a tall man like you or a short 
Dtationed person like Shri Kumarmanga-
lam, whether he was dark complexioned and 
fat. It becomes clear by physical features. 

[English1 

SHRI A. CHARLES: Sir, I want to know 
when the former Prime Minister ordered 
Fairfax enqUiry, did he know who were the 
officers and who were used to find out the 
economic offences. That was not even re-
corded on the file. There was no order on the 
file. It was only an oral order. Let us look into 
that matter also. (Interruptions) 

SHRI GHULAM NABI AZAD: As I have 
already stated, we are equally keen to know 
the name and identify of the person, the '50-
called lawyer-I will not say lawyer, because 
I do not know whether he was a lawyer' we 
have only read in the papers that he was a 
lawyer; I will only say the so-called lawyer. 
( Interruptions) 

SHRI SRIKANTA JENA: Shri Solanki's 
statement says he was a lawyer. (interrup-
tions) 

SHRI GHULAM NABI AZAD: Sir, ｵｲｩｾ＠
less we get any clue, it is very difficult to 
proceed. further in the matter. But 

still .. . (/nterruptions) Please let me complete. 
( Interruptions) 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES (Muzaf-
farpur): Why can you not prosecute Shri 
Solanki? You file a chargesheet against him 
today and you will get the truth tomorrow. 
Your prosecute him. (Interruptions) 

SHRI GHULAM NABI AZAD: Georgeji, 
will you please let me complete? (lnterrup-
lions) 

SHRI SRIKANTA JENA: Why do you 
not prosecute Shri Solanki? (Interruptions) 

SHRI GHULAM NABI AZAD: There-
fore, whenever we will get any information or 
any clue, we will certainly proceed with this. 
As our hon. Member, our esteemed friend, 
Shri Indrajit Gupta said that he has some 
clue, I will welcome if he passes on that clue 
to us so that we can proceed with it. On our 
part whenever we will get any information or 
any clue, I will certainly say that, we will 
proceed with it. 

I think, with this my hon. leaders and 
friends on the other side should be satisfied. 
I see that there is no reason for J.P.C. 
( Interruptions) 

SHRI SRIKANT A JENA: We are not 
satisfied with the reply of the hon. Minister of 
Parliamentary Affairs. We will raise this is-
sue again on Monday. (Interruptions) 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: We do 
not agree. We will give a notice in this re-
spect and will be raising it again on 
Monday.( Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: Let us now take up 
Papers to be laid on the Table of the House. 



409 Papers Laid 

14.22 hrs 

VAISAKHA 18,1914(SAKA) Papers Laid 410 

[English] 

PAPERS ｾｉｄ＠ ON THE TABLE 

Memorandum of understanding for the 
year 1991-92 Between the Ga rden Reach 
Shipbuilders and Engineers Ltd and the 
Department of Defence Production and 

Supplies, Ministry of Defence etc, etc. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF LAw.. JUSTICE AND COM-
PANY AFFAIRS SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): Sir, on behalf of 
Shri Sharad Pawar,l beg to lay on the Table, 
a copy each of the following papers(Hindi 
and English versions): 

(1) Memorandum of Understanding for 
the year 1991-92 between the 
Garden Reach Shipbuilders and 
Engineers Limited and the Depart-
ment of Defence Production and 
Supplies, Ministry of Defence. 
[placed in Library-See No. L T -19531 
92] 

(2) Memorandum of Understanding for 
the year 1991-92 between the 
Sharat Dynamics Limited and the 
Department of Defence Production 
and Supplies, Ministry of Defence. 
[Placed in Library See. No. L T-
1954192] 

(3) Memorandum of Understanding for 
the year 1991-92 between the 
Mishra Dhatu Nigam Limited and 
the Department of Defence Pro-
duction and Supplies, Ministry of 
Defence. 
[Placed in Library. See No. LT. 
1955192] 

(4) Memorandum of Understanding for 
the year 1991-92 between the Goa 
Shipyard Limited and the Depart-
ment of Defence Production and 
Supplise Ministry of Defenc. 
[Placed in Library. See No. LT. 
1956/92] 

(5) Memorandum of Understanding for 
the year 1991-92 between the 
Mazagon Dock Limited and the 
Department of De1ence Production 
and Supplies, Ministry of Defence. 
[Placed in Library SeeNo. L T-1957f 
721 

Natlflcatlons under Ruller Act 1947, 
Annual Report, Annual Accounts and 
Review on the Working of the Tea Board, 
Calcutta for 1990-91 and Reasons for 

Delay In Laying these Papers etc. 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRYOF COMMERCE(SHRISALMAN 
KHURSHEED): Sir, on behaH on behaH of 
Shri P. Chidambaram, 

I beg to lay on the Table:-

(1) A copy each of the following Notifi-
cations (Hindi and English versions) 
under SUb-section (3) of section 25 
of the Rubber Act, 1947:-

(i) The Rubber Board of India 
Financial Adviser and Proj-
ect Office Recruitment 
Rules, 1990 published in 
Notification No. G.S.R. 
846(E) in Gazetle of India 
dated the 16th October 
1990. 

(ii) The Rubber Board of India 
Financial Adviser and Proj-
ect Officer Recruitment 
(Amendment) Rules, 1991 
published in Notification 
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( Placed in lbary.· S. No. L T 
1960192] 

No.G.S.R. 3S8inGazette 
of India dated the 15thJune 
1991. 
{Placedin Library. SeeNo. 
U-19S8192] 

(2) A statement (Hindi and English 
versions) showing reasons tor de-
lay in laying the papers mentioned 
at (1) above. 

(3)(i) A copy of the Annual Re-
port (Hindi and Englishver-
sions) of the Tea Board, 
Calcutta, for the year 1990-
91. 

(ii) A copy of the Annual k-
counts (Hindi and English 
versions) ofthe Tea Board, 
Calcutta, for the year 1990-
91 together with Audit 
Report thereon. 

(iii) AcopyottheReview(Hindi 
and English versions) by 
the Government on the 
working of the Tea Board, 
Calcutta, forthe year 1990-
91. 

(4) A statement (Hindi and English 
versions) showing reasons for 
delay in laying the papers men-
tioned at (3) above. 
(Placed in Library. See No. LT. 
1959192) 

(5) A copy of the Annual Accounts 
(Hindi and English versions) of the 
Rubber Board, Kottayam, 'or the 
year 1990-91 together with Audit 
Report thereon. 

(6) A statement (Hindi and English 
versions) showing reasons 'or de-
lay in laying the papers mentioned 
at (5) above. 

Annual Report and Review on the 
working of the Jut. Corporation of 

India ltd., Calcutta for 1990-91 along 
with Audited Accounts and Comment. 
of the Comptroller and Auditor General 

etc. etc. 

{ TranslfJtion] 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF TEXTilES (SHRI ASHOK 
GEHLOT): I beg to say on the Table:-

(1) Acopyeachofthefollowingpapers 
(Hindi and English versions) under 
sub- section(1) of section 6l9A of 
the Companies Act. 1956:-

(a) (i) Review by the Govemment 
on the working of the Jute 
ｃｯｲｰｯｲ｡ｴｾｮ＠ of India 
limited, Calcutta, for the 
year 1990-91. 

(ii) Annual Report of the Jute 
Corporation of India lim-
ited, Calcutta, for the year 
1990-91 along with Audited 
kcounts and comments 
of the Comptroller and 
Auditor General thereon. 

:Placed in Library. S. 
No. LT-1961192' -. 

(b) (i) Review by the Govemment 
on the working of the Na-

. tional Textile Corporation 
. Limited (Holding Com-

pany). New DeIhl. for the 
year 1990-9-t-; 

(ii) Annual Report of the Na-
tional textile Crporation 
Umit8d (Holding Con.,any) 
New Deihl tor the year 
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(c) (i) 

1990-91 along with Audted 
Accounts and comments 
of the Comptroller and 
AuditorGenerithereon. 
[placed in Library. see No. 
LT-1961192) 

Review by the Govemment 
on the working of the Na-
tional Jute Manufacturers 
Corporation Limited, Cal-
cutta, forthe year1990-91. 

(iI) Annual Report of the Na-
tional Jute Manufacturers 
Corporation Limited, cal-
. cutta, for the year 1990-91 
along with audited k· 
counts anncomments of 
the Comptroller and Audi· 
tor General thereon. 

[Placed in library. see 
No_l T ·1963192) 

(2) Three statements (Hindi and Eng-
lish versions) showing reasons for 
delay in laying the papers men· 
tioned at (1 ) above. 
[Placed in library. &NNo. L T -1961-
63192) 

(3) (I) A copy of the Annual Re-
port (Hindi and English 
versions) of the Jute 
Manufacturars Develop-
ment Council, CaJcuna for 
the year 1990-91 along 

. with Audited Accounts. 
(Ii) A copy of the Review (HIndi 

and English version&) by 
the Govemment on the 
woJtclng of the jute Manu-
facturas Development 
Council calcutt., for the 
year 1990-91. 

(4) A statement ( Hindi and English 

versions) showing reasons for de-
lay in laying the papers mentioned 
at (3) above . 
[Placed in Library See No. LT-
1964192) 

(5)0) A copy of the Annual Re-
port (Hindi and English 
veslons) of the National 
Institute of Fashion Tech-
noiogy, New Delhi, for the 
year 1990-91 

(ii) A copy ofthe Review (Hindi 
and English vel'$lons) by 
the Government on the 
working of the National 
Institute of Fashion Tech-
nology, New Deihl, forthe 
year 1990·91. 

(6) A statement ( Hindi and English 
versions) showing reasons for de· 
lay in laying the papel'$ mentioneq 
at (5) above. 
(Placed in Library See No. LT-
1965192] 

(7) A copy of the Report (Hindi and 
English vel'$ions of the Comptrol-
ler and Auditor General of India-
Union Government-(No.10 of 
1991 )-(Comrnercial)· National 
Textile Corporation ( Andhra 
Pradesh, Kamataka, Kerala ｡ｾ＠
Mahe) Llmlted underartJcle 151 (l) 
of the Constitution. 
[Placed In Library see No. LT-
1966192J 

(8) A copy each of the following pa-
pers(Hlndiand Engiishversions):-

(I) Memorandum of Under-
standing forthe year 1992-
93 between the National 
Handloom Development 
Corporation Limited and 
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(ii) 

the Ministry of Textiles, 
Govemment of India. 

[Placed in Library SeeNo. 
L T -1964192) 

Memorandum of Under-
standing forthe Year 1992-
93 between the Cotton 
Corporation of India Lim-
ited and the Ministry 0 

Textiles. 

[Placed in Library. SeeNo. 
L T -1968/92) 

Notification under Major Port Trust Act 
1963 Memorandum of Understanding 
for 1991·92 between the Hindustan 

Shipyard Ltd. the Ministry of Surface 
Transport etc. 

[English) 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AF-
FAIRS AND MINISTER OF STATE IN THE • 
MINISTRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COM-
PANY AFFAIRS (SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): Sir. on Behalf Shri 
Jagdish Tyelerl bag to lay on the Table:-

(1) A copy each of the following Noti-
fications (Hindi and English ver-
Sions) under sub-section (4) of 
section 124 of the Major Port Trust 
Act, 1963:-

_i) G.S.R. 615(E) published in 
Gazette of India dated the 
4th October 1991 approv-
ing the Paradip Port Trust 
(Recruitment of Heads of 
Department) Regulations, , 
1991. 

,Ii) G.S.R. 658 (E) published 
In Gazette of India dated 

iii) 

.iv) 

.v) 

.Yii) 
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the 31st October 1991 
approving the New Man-
galore Ports Trust Em-
ployees (Recruitment, 
Seniority and Promotion) 
Fifth Amendment Regula-
tions, 1991. 

G.S.R. 40(E) published in 
Gazette of India dated the 
10th January 1992 approv-
ing the New Mangalore Port 
Trust Employees (Retire-
ment) Regulations. 1992. 

G,S.R. 52(E) published in 
Gazette of India dated the 
20th January 1992 approv-
ing the Visakhapatnam 
Port Trust Employees 
(allotment of Residences) 
Amendment Regulations. 
1992. 

G.S.R. 121 (E) published 
in Gazette of India dated 
the 24th February 1992 
approving the New Man-
galore Port Trust (Adapta-
tion of Rules) First Amend-
ment Regulations.1992. 

G.S.R.122(E)publishedin 
Gazette of India dated the 
24th February 1992 ap-
proving the Tuticorin Port 
Errv>loyees (Acceptance of 
Employment after Retire-
ment) First Amendment 
Regulations 1992. 

G.S.R. 406 (E) published 
in Gazette of india dated 
the 3rd April 1992 approv-
ing the Cochin Port and 
OockAmendment Regula· 
tions.1991 .. 
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yiii) G.S.R. 725 (E) published 
in Gazette of India dated 
the 5th December 1991 
approving the Kandla Port 
Trust Employees (Festival 
Advance) (Amendment) 
Regulations, 1991. 

[Placed in Library. See 
No. LT-1969192] 

ＬｾＩ＠ A copy of the Inland Waterways 
Authority of India (Adaptation of 
Rules) Regulations, 1991 (Hindi 
and English versions) published in 
Notification No.6-IWAI/Eslt./4-90 
in Gazette of India dated the 1 st 
November 1991, Under section 36 
of the Inland Waterways Authority 
of India Act, 1985. 

[Placed in Library. See No. L T-
1970192) 

(3) A copy of the Memorandum of 
Understanding for the year 1991-
92 between the Hindustan Ship-
yard Limited and the Ministry of 
Surface Transport (Hindi and Eng-
lish versions). 

[Placed in Library.' See No. l T 
1971192] 

(4) A copy each of there following 
papers (Hindi and English versions) 
under SUb-section (2) of section 
103 of the Major Port Trusts Act, 
1963:-

(a)(i) 

(ii) 

Annual Accounts of the 
Visakhapatnam Port Trust 
for the year 1990-91 to-
gether with Audit Report 
thereon. 

Review by theGovemment 
on the Audited Accounts 

(b)(i) 

(ii) 

(c)(i) 

(ii) 

of the Visakhapatnam Port 
Trust forthe Year 1990-91. 

[Placed in library. See No. 
LT-1972192] 

Annual Accounts of the 
Bombay Port Trust for the 
year 1990-91 togetherwith 
Audit Report thereon. 

Review by the Government 
on the Audited Accounts of 
the Bombay Port Trust for 
the year 1990-91. 

[Placed in Library. See No. 
LT-1973192]" 

Annual Accounts of the 
Paradip Port Trust for the 
Year1990-91 together with 
Audit Report thereon. 

Review by the Govemment 
on the Audited Accounts of 
the Paradip Port Trust for 
the Year 1990-91. 

[Placed in Library. See No. 
LT-1974/92] 

(5) Three statements (Hindi and Eng-
lish versions) showing reasons for 
delay in laying the papers men-
tioned at (4) above. 

[Placed in library. See No. l T-
1972-74192] 

Notification under Income tayact. 
1961; Centralexce •• and salt Act 

1944,and Customs Act. 1962 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RA-
MESHWAR THAKUR): I beg to lay on the 
Table:-
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(1) A copy ofthe Income-tax (Seventh 
Amendment) Rules 1992 (Hindi and 
English versions) Published in 
Notification No. G.S.R. 371 (E) in 
Gazette ot India dated the 27th 
March 1992 under section 296 of 
the Income -tax Act, 1961. 

[Placed in Library. See No. LT-
1978192] 

(2) A copy each of the following Noti-
fications (Hindi and English ver-
sions) under sub-section (2) ot 
section 38 of the Central Excises 
and Sah Act, 1944:-

(i) G.S.R. 3"1,' (E) published in 
Gazette of Indill dated the 31 st 
March 1992 together with an 
explanatory memorandum 
making certain amendments 
in the Notification No. 175186-
CE, dated the 1 st March 
1986. 

(ii) G.S.R....l83 (E) published in 
Gazette ot India dated the 31 st 
March 1992 together with an 
explanatory memorandum 
making certain amendments 
in the Notification No. 7192-
CE, dated the 1st March 
1992. 

{Placed in Library. See No. 
LT-1979192] 

(3) A copy each of the following Noti-
fications (Hindi and English ver-
Sions) under section 159 of the 
Custom Act, 1962:-

(I) G.S.R. 409 (E) published In 
Gazette of India datedthe 8th 
"April 1992 together with an 
explanatory memorandum 
making certain amenctmenti 
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In-the Notification No. 33/86-
Cus., dated the 7th February 
1986. 

(ii) G.S.R. 410 (E) published in 
Gazetteof India datedthe 8th 
·Aprll 1992 together with an 
explanatory memorandum 
making certain amendments 
in the Notification No. 136190-
Cus., dated the 20th 
March1990. 

(iii) G.S.R. 411 (E) published in 
Gazette of India dated the 8th 
·April 1992 together with an 
explanatory memoramdum 
seeking to prescribe the rate 
of basic customs duty on goods 

. (with certain exceptioons 
imported through the courier 
mode at 105 per cent ad val-
orem. 

( Iv) G.S. R.354{E) to G.S.R. 363 
(E) published in Gazette of 
India dated the 26th March 
1992 together with an explana-
tory memorandum regarding 
Customs Duty changes,and 
exemption in the context of 
proposals an,.ounced by the 
Finance Minister in Lok Sabha 
on the 26th March 1992. 

(v) G.S.R. 382 (E) published in 
Gazette of India dated the 
31 st March 1992 together with 
an explanatory memorandum 
extending the validity of the 
Notification No, 52185-Cus., 
dated the 4th March 1985 
upto the the 31 st March 1995. 

(vi) The Project Import (Second 
Amendment) Regulations, 
1992 published in Notifications 
No. G.S.R. 317 (E) dated the 
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10th March 1992 together 
with an ･ｾｬ｡ｮ｡ｴｯｲｹ＠ memo-
randum. 

[Placed in library. S89 No. 
L T - 1980192] 

The NotHlClltlon. under cost and 
works Accountants Act, 1959 and 

Compn •• Act, 1956 etc. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY 
AFFAIRS (SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): I beg to lay on the 
Table: 

(1) A copy of the Coat and Wort(. 
Accountant. (Amendment) Regu-
latlon.91991 Hindi aand English 
versional Published in Notification 
No.CWR(1)191 in Gazette of India 
datedthe 12theOctober1991 under 
sub-section (5) of section 39 of the 

. Cost and Wort(s Accountants Act 
1959. 

[Placed in Library. S89 No. LT-
1981192) 

(2) A copy ofthe Notification No. S.O. 
153(E) (Hindi and English versions) 
published In Gazette of India dated 
the 25th February 1992 making 
certain amendments In Schedule 
Ten of the COflll8nise Act, 1956 
under sub- section (3) of section 
641 of the said Act 

[Placed in Library. See No. LT-
1982192] 

(3) A copy each of the following Noti-
fication. (Hindi and English ver-
sionS) under sub- section (3) of 

section 642 of the Companise Act, 
1956:-

(i) The Companies (Fees on 
Applications) ａｭｾ＠
Rules, 199z-pUbtished In 
Notification No. G.S.R. 126 (E) 
in Gazette of India dated the 
25th February. 1992 

(ii) The Companise (Central 
Govemment"s) General Rules 
and Forms 
Second(Afnendment) Rules, 
1992 published in Notification 
No.G.S.R. 312(E) In Gazette 
of India dated the 6th 
March,1992. 

CIII) The Companl.. (Central 
Government's)O.neral Ru" 
and Form.(Am.ndment) 
Rules, 1992 pUblished In Noti-
fication No.O.S.R. 353(E) In 
Gazette of India dated the 
26th March.1992. 

[Placed in Library See No.LY-
1983192J 

4 (I) A copy of the Annual Report 
(Hindi and English versions) 
of the Institute of Constitutional 
and Parliamentary Studies, 
New Delhi. for the year 1990-
91. along with Audited Ac-
counts. 

(ii) A Statement (Hindi and Eng-
lish versions) regarding Re-
view by the Government on 
the wort(ing of the Institute of 
Constitutional and Parliamen-
tary Studies. New Delhi. for 
the year 1990-91. 

5 A statement (Hindi and English 
versions) showing reasons for de-
lay In laying the papers mentioned 
at (4) above. 
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(Placed in Library See No. L T 
1984/92] 

6 A copy of the Twentieth Annual 
Report (Hindi and English versions) 
pertaining to the Execution of the 
Provisions of the Monopolies and 
Restrictive Trade Practices Act, 
1969 or the period from the 1 sl 
January 1990 to the 31 st Decem-
ber, 1990 under section 62 of the 
Monopolies and Restrictive Trade 
Practices Act,1969 

[Placed in Library. See. No. LT-
1985/92] 

Report of the Comptroller and Auditor 
General of India Union Government 

(No. 12 of 1991)- Commercial Hindus-
tan Insectcldes Ltd. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AF-
FAIRS AND MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COM-
PANY AFFAIRS (Shri Rangarajan 
Kumaramangalam): Sir, on behalf of Dr. 
Chinta Mohan. I beg to lay on the Table:-

A copy of the Report (Hindi and 
English versions) of the Comptroller 
and Auditor General of India-Union 
Government (No. 12 of 1991) -Com-
mercial Hindustan Insecticides lim-
ited under article 151 (I) of the 
Constitution. 

[Placed i n Library. See No. L T -1986/ 
92J 

Notifications under general Insurance 
Business (Natlonalisation) Act, 1972 
and Life Insurance Corporation Act, 

1956,etc 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI RAMESH-

WAR THAKUR): Sir, on behalf of Shri 
Dalbir Singh. I beg to lay on the Table-

(I) A copy each of the following Noti-
fications (Hindi and English ver-
sions) under SUb-section (5) of 
section 17A of the Generallnsur-
ance Business (Nationalisation) 
Act, 1972:-

(i) The General Insurance (Ra-
tionalisation of Pay Scales and 
other Conditr·.}ns of Service of 
Off icers) (A me nd me nt) 
Scheme, 1992 published in 
Notification No. S.D. 200 (E) in 
Gazette of India dated the 10th 
March, 1992. 

(ii) The General Insurance (Ra-
tionalisation of Pay Scales and 
other Conditions of Service of 
(Amendment) Scheme, 1992 
published in Notification No. 
S.D. 201 (E) in Gaxette of India 
dated the 10th March, 
1992.[Placed in Libirary. See 
No. LT-1987/192] 

(2) A copy each of the following Noti-
fications (Hindi and English ver-
sions) under sub-section (3) of 
section 48 of the life Insurance 
Corporation Act, 1956:-

(i) The life Insurance Corpora-
tion of India (Daily Allowance 
and Hotel Charges to Employ-
ees on Tour) (Amendment 
Rules, 1992 Published in Noti-
fication No. G.S.R. 322 (E) in 
Gazette of India dated the 
10th March, 1992. 

(ii) The life Insurance Corpora-
tion of India (Special Area Al-
lowance) (Amendment) 
Rules, 1992 Published in Noti-
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flcation No. G.S.R. 23(E) in 
Gazette of India dated the 
10th March, 1992. 

(iii) The Life Insurance Corpora-
tion of India, Class-I Officers 
(Revision of Terms and Con-
ditions of Service )(Amend-
ment Rules, 1992 Published 
in Notification No. G.S.R. 324 
(E) in Gazette of India dated 
the 10th March. 1992. 

(Iv) The Life Insurance Corpora-
tion of India Development 
Officers (Revision of Terms 
and conditions of 
S e rv ice) (A me n dme nt 
Rules, 1992 Published in Noti-
fication No. G.S.R. 325 (E) in 
Gazette of India dated the 1 0 
th March, 1992. 

[Placed in library. See No. L T 
-1988192] 

(3) Acopyofthe Notification No. G.S.R. 
328 (E) (Hindi and English ver-
sions) published in Gazette of India 
dated the 13th March, 1992 seek-
ing to permit with effect from the 1 st 
March, 1992 the bringing into In-
dia, of gold in any form, including 
ornaments and articles by a pas-
senger being a person of Indian 
Nationality or origin as part of his 
baggage, while coming to India 
from any Country outside India, 
issued under section 13 of the 
Foreign Exchange Regulation Act, 
1973. 

[Placed in library See No. L T-
1989192J 

(4) A copy of the Securities and Ex-
change Board of India (Terms and 
Conditons of Service of Chairman 

and Members Amendment Rules, 
1992 (Hindi and English versions) 
published in Notification No. S.O. 
242 (E) in Gazette 0 India dated the 
27th March, 1992 under section 
31 of the Securities and Exchange 
Board of India Board of India Ordi-
nance, 1992. 

[Placed in Library See No L T -1 990/ 
92J 

(5) Acopyofthe Notification No. G.S.R. 
407 (E) (Hindi and English ver-
sions) published in Gazette of India 
dated the 6th April, 1992 providing 
permission to exporters who have 
obtained post-bid letters of approval 
from the Exim Bank on behaH of 
the Working Group on Project 
Exports orthe Exim Bank or an Au-
thorised Dealerwithin theirdeleted 
powers, in respect of export of 
engineering goods on deferred 
payment terms, execution of turn-
key projects/ civil construction 
contracts abroad or for the export 
of consultancy, technical or other 
service abroad issued under sec-
tion 16 of the Foreign Exchange 
Regulation Act, 1973. 

[Placed in Library See No. L T-
1991192J 

(6) A copy each of the following Noti-
fication (Hindi and English versions) 
undersub-section (4) of section 19 
olthe Banking Companies (Acqui-
sition and Transfer of Undertak-
ings) Act, 1970:-
(i) The Syndicate Bank (Officers) 

Service (Amendment) Regu-
lation, 1991 published in Noti-
fication No 1 0461S1901 PD:IRD 
(0) in Gazette of India dated 
the II th January, 1992. 

(ii) The UCO Bank (Officers') 
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Service (Amendment) Regu-
Iations,l991 Published in No-
tification No. PERlPCRI9l1 
5122 in Gazette oflndia dated 
the 18th January, 1992. 

[Placed in library. SeeNo.lT 
1992192] 

(7) A copy each of the following Notifi-
cations (Hindi and English versions) 
under sub- section (3) of section 15 
of the Government Savings Bank 
Act, 1973 :-

(i) The Post Office (Monthly In-
come Accounts) (Amendment) 
Rules, 1992 published in Noti-
fication No G.S.A.430 (E) in 
Gazette of India dated the 24th 
April. 1992. 

(ii) The Post Office Time Deposit 
(Amendment) Rules, 1992 
published in Notification No 
G.S.R431 (E) in Gazette of 
India dated the 24th April, 
.1992. 

[Placed in library. See No. 
l ｔｾＱＹＹＳｴＹＲ｝＠

(8) A copy of the Kisan Vikas Patra 
(Amendment) Rules, 1992 (Hindi 
and English versions) published in 
Notification No. G.S.A. 432(E) in 
Gazette of India dated the 24th 
April, 1992 under sub- Section (3) 
of sectioQ 12 of the Government 
Savings Certificates Act, 1959. 

[Placed in library See No-l T -19941 
92) 

(9) A copy each of the following Ports 
(Hindi and English versions) 

(i) Report of the Baltaranl Gra-

my a Bank, Baripada, for the 
Year 1990-91 together with 
Accounts and Auditor's Re-
port thereon. 

[Placed in library. See No. 
IT-1995192] 

(ii) Report of the langpi Dehangi 
Rural Bank, Diphu, for the 
Year 1990-91 together with 
Accounts and Auditor's Re· 
port thereon. 

[Placed in library. See No. 
l T -1996192] 

(iii) Report of the Bhojpur- Rohtas 
Gramin Bank, Arrah, for the 
Year 1990-91 together with 
Accounts and Auditor's Re-
P9rt thereon. 

[Placed in library. See No. 
IT-1997192) 

(10) A copy of the Coinage (Standard 
Wejght and Remedy of the Two 
Rupees. Eleven Sides Coins 
Containing Copper 75 percent and 
Nickel 25 percent ) Rules, 1992 
(Hindi and English versions) pub-
lished in Notification No. S.O. 281 
(E) in Gazette of India dated the 
13th April. 1992 under subsection 
(3) of section 21 oft he coinage Act, 
1906. 

[Placed in lbrary. See No ｾ＠ T-
1981192J 

Annual Report and Rrllew on the 
wortclng of the India Institute of Foreign 

Trade. New Deihl for 1990-81 and 
statement for delay In laying t ..... 

papers .. c. 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
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MINISTRY OF COMMERCE (SHRI SAL-
MAN KHURSHEEO): I beg to lay on the 
Table-

(1) (I) A copy 01 the Annual Report 
(Hindi and English Versions) 
01 the Indian Institute 01 For-
eign Trade, New Delhi, for the 
year 1990-91 along with Au-
dited Accounts. 

(ii) A copy of the Review (Hindi 
and English ｾｲｳｩｯｮｳＩ＠ by the 
Govemment on the wor1<ing of 
the Indian Institute of Foreign 
Trade, New Delhi, forthe year 
1990-91. 

(2) A Statement (Hindi and English 

Authorityof India, New Delhi, 
for the year 1990-91. 

(ii) Annual Report of the Trade 
Fair Authority of India, New 
Deihl, for the year 1990-91 
along with Audited Accounts 
and comments of the Comp-
troller and Auditor General 
thereon .. 

(6) A statement (Hindi and English 
versions) showing reasons delay 
in laying the papers mentioned at 
(5) above. 

[Placed in library. See No. l T-
2001192] 

versions) showing reasons for de- 14.23 hra. 
lay in Laying the Papers men-
tioned at (1) above. MESSAGE FROM RAJYA SABHA 

[Placed in Library. See No. LT-
1999192] 

(3) (i) A copy 01 the Annual Report 
(Hindi and English versions) 
of the Export Inspection ｾｯｵｮﾭ
cil and Export Inspection 
Agencies (Volume-U) for the 
year 1990-91. 

(4) A statement (Hindi and English 
versions) showing reasons for 

. delay in laying the papers men-
tioned at (3) above. 

[Placed in library. See No. L T-
2000192] 

(5) A copy each of the following pa-
pers (Hindi and English versions) 
under sub-section (1) 01 section 
619A oftheCompaniesAc1,1956:-

(i) A statement regarding Re-
view by the Govemment on 
the working of the Trade Fair 

[English] 

SECRETARY- GENERAL: Sir, I have 
to report the following message from the 
Secretary General of Rajya Sabha :-

"In accordance with the provisions of 
sub-rule (6) of rule 186 01 the Rules of 
Provisions of Procedure and Conduct of 
Business in the Rajya Sabha. I am directed 
to return herewith the Appropriation (No.2) 
Bill. 1992 which was passed by the Lok 
Sabha at its sitting held on the 29th April, 
1992 andtransmittedtotheRajya Sabhalor 
its· recommendations and to state that this 
House has no recommendations to make to 
the lok Sabha in regard to the said Bill.· 

14.231/2 hrs. 

ASSENT TO BILLS 

(English] 

SECRETARY GENERAL: Sir, I lay on 
the Table copies, duly authenticated by the 
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SecrelaryGeneral of Rajya Sabha, of the 
following five Bills passed by the Houses of 
Parliament during the current session and 
assented to by the President since a report 
was last made to the House on the 10th April, 
1992:-

1. The Public liability Insurance (Amend-
ment) Bill, 1992. 

2. The Destructive Insects and Pests 
(Amendment and Validation) Bill, 1992 

3. The Copyright (Amendment) Bill, 1992 

4. The Indian Red Cross Society (Amend-
ment) Bill, 1992 

5 The Securities and Exchange Board of 
India Bill, 1992 

14.24 hrs 

COMMIDEE ON PRIVATE MEMBERS' 
BILLS AND RESOLUTIONS 

Minutes 

[English] 

SHRI S. MALLIKARJUAIAH (Tumkur) 
: I beg to lay on the Table the Minutes (Hindi 
and English versions) of the Second to Tenth 
sittings of the Committee on Private Mem-
bers' Bills and Resolutions. 

14.241/2 hrs 

INFANT MILK SUBSTITUTES, FEEDING 
BODlES AND INFANT FOODS (REGU-

LATION OF PRODUCTION, SUPPl Y 
AND DISTRIBUTION) BILL' 

(English] 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HUMAN RESOURCE 
DEVELOPMENT (DEPARTMENT OF 

Supply and Distrl bution) BiD 
YOUTH AFFAIRS AND SPORTS AND THE 
DEPARTMENT OF WOMEN AND CHILD 
DEVELOPMENT) (KUMARI MAMATA 
BANERJEE): Sir on behalf of Shri Arjun 
Singh, I beg for leave to introduce a Bill to 
provide for the regulation of production, 
supply and distribution of infant milk substi-
tutes, feeding bottles and infant food with a 
view to the protection and promotion of breasl-
feeding and ensuring the proper use of infant 
foods and for matters connected therewith 
or incidental thereto. 

MR SPEAKER: Motion moved: 

"Leave be granted to introduce a 
Bill to provide for the regulation 
of production supply and distri-
bution of infant milk substitutes, 
feeding bottles and infant food 
with a view to the protection and 
promotion of breast-feeding and 
ensuring the proper use of infant 
foods and for matters connected 
therewith or incidental thereto.· 
( Interruptions) 

[Translation] 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES (Muzaf-
farpur) : Mr. Speaker, Sir, I have given a 
notice. I want to raise two objections about 
this Bill. Thoughwewelcomethis Bill but we 
have two reservations. I would like to 
request the han. Minister not to move this Bill 
today. There is a need 10 rectify two things 
in this Bill. 

[English] 

MR. SPEAKER: You talk about the 
legislative competence. 

( Translation] 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: I am 
not raising the issue of legislative compe-

·Published in the GzeUe of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 2, dated 8.5.1992. 
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tence but of discriminative provisions of the [Translation] . 
Bill. 

MR. SPEAKER: You have the com-
[English] plete Keedom to speak on this Bill but only 

at the consideration stage. 
This is a very discriminative legislation 

and I will take only one minute to show why [English] 
it is discriminatory. 

At the time of introduction stage you 
[Translation] shall have to consider only the legislative 

Still this Bill is being introduced. I have 
the copy of the code evolved by the World 
Health Assembly in 1981 regarding the 
Quality and type of milk to be made available 
10 the children. In 1985 it was also en-
dorsed by the Governments of India. 

, (Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: It will become a regular 
discussion. 

[English] 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: Sir, I 
am not discussing the merits, I am only 
pointing out how this bill discriminates the 
Indian manufacturers of the milk products ... 

MR SPEAKER: Butlhe same thing can 
be done at the time of consideration. 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: But it is 
discriminatory. 

MR. SPEAKER: Atthe time of introduc-
tion you have to discuss the legislative 
competence. 

t Interruptions) 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: They 
are the multinationals. It discriminates against 
our manufacturers. (Interruptions). The 
whole purpose of the Bill is to favour the 
multinationals. 

competence. 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: It is a 
discriminative legisla\ion. 

MR. SPEAKER: When you are discuss-
ing whether any Fundamental Right is 
affected because of the discrimination.,. 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: Sir, with 
great respect I draw your attention to Rule 
72 of the Rules of procedure, which says: 

"'I a motion for leave to introduce a 
Bill is opposed, the Speaker, after 
permitting .. ." 

Sir, your permission is necessary. 
That is always there for which we 
stand up. 

" ... if he thinks fit, a brief statements 
from the member who opposes the 
motion and the member who moved 
the motion, may, without further de-
bate, put the question. 

Provided that where a motion is 
opposed on the ground that the Bill 
initiates ｜･ｾｩｳ｜｡ｴｩｯｮ＠ outside t'ne \etlis-
lative competence 0\ the House, \he 
Speaker may permtt a full discussion 
thereon" 

That is for a full discussion. 

( Interruptions) 



43S Infant Milk Substitutes, MAY 8, 1992 (Regulation of produc1ion, 436 
Supply and Dis!r ibution) BiN Feeding Bottles and Infant Foods 

SHRI LAl K. ADVANI:(Ganshi Nagar) of this Bill and wholeheartedly favour It 
There Is no discussion here. He has the full but ... (Interruptions) 
right to coppose it on the ground that he has 
chosen and on that ground the Minister has 
to reply. So he has got every right to oppose, 
(Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: The points which you 
want to make, you can make at the consid-
eration stage. At ,,"e time of introduction you 
shall have to tell us that this House is not 
having competence. 

MR. SPEAKER: You may be a sup-
porter of this Bill, but the points that you 
have raised ca be made at the consideration 
stage also. 

•. [English) 

. You are preemptying him. 

SHRI GEORGE GERNANDES: I want 
SHRIGEORGE FERNANDES: No, Sir this Bill to be ... 

that is not the rule. (/ntfmuptions) 

SHRILAl K. ADVANi: If it is a question 
of competence of the House, then the Chair 
has to permit full discussion. But even 
without that competence issue, he can 
raise objections to the Bill on other grounds 
, to which the Minister has to reply. (Interrup-
tions) 

KUMARI MAMATA BANERJEE: Sir, I 
will reply. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, since 1968 we have been 
continuously opposing Bills of this nature. 
( Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: I have allowed you 
because, the pOints raised by you are valid. 

(English) 

But at what stage you want to raise the 
point? Now, as.a matter of fact you are 
raising It at the time of .consideratlon.by 
other also at the time of consideration. 
[Translation) 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: I 
would liketo tell you why I am raising these 
points at this stage? Indeed I am a supporter 

MR. SPEAKER: There is a discrimina-
tion between you and other Members. 
Other Members do not hav,e the same op-
portunity to raise this point. Why are you 
trying to make the point Now at this stage? 

( Interruptions) 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: I want 
to oppose the Bill because there are some 
issues suesinvoJved. Sir, I will tell any other 
Member who wants to raise, not to do it. I will 
not create any situation to discriminate any 
other Member. 

MR. SPEAKER: No, no. Now, because 
you know this procedure, you are taking the 
opportunity and you are doing it. let me 
know, and if nobody will object to you, It 
shoud be welcome and you should be con-
gratulated. But at the time of introduction It Is 
the legislative cOl1l>etence which is to be 
discussed. 

SHRILAl K. ADVANI: I am sorry, Sir. 
t respectfully submit that Rule 72 (i) says: 

-If a Motion for leave to introduce a 
Bill is opPosed, the Speaker, after 
permitting, if he thinks fit,. brief 
. statements from the member who 
moved the motion, may, without 
further debate, put the qu .. tion:-
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Now, this particular clause governs the the point is, he is saying that he Is supporting· 
present situation. After Mr. Fernandes has the Bill. 
spoken, if I want to speak on the same 
subject, I cannot, because I have not given 
you notice. He has given you notice that on 
these grounds I want to oppose. So, he is 
entitled to raise It. Then the rule further 
says:" 

"Provided that where a motion is 
opposed on the ground that the Bill 
initiates legislation outside the legis-
lative competence of the House, the 
Speaker may permit a full discus-
sion thereon:" 

If that was the basis, then I also would 
have said that I would also like to speak on 
this and participatedin the debate. But, so 
far as this pariticular point is concerned, it is 
perfectly valid that having given due notice. 
he is entitled to raise an objection to the Bill 
on the grounds he has melloned., of course, 
with your permission. 

MR. SPEAKER: He gives me the no-
tice and he presumes that I have permitted 
him. He is asenior Member. Therefore,ldo 
not object to him. 

SHRI LAl K. ADVANI: Sir, even I may 
point out that so far as the phraseology of all 
these rules is concerned, the Speaker has 
been given immense discretion, even if It 
were on the grounds of legislative co"lH'-
tence Even then. It says that the Speaker 
may permit a full discussion. 

MR. SPEAKER: I am not objecting to 
his discussion and many times we have 
allowed the discussion also. But what hap-
pens actually is, because he is making use . 
of this provision, all the points which could 
have been made aUime of consideration are 
being made now. 

SHRI RAM NAIK (Bombay North): Sir, 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: I said, 
I welcome the legislation, but I am opposing 
the introduction of this Bill unless the dis-
criminatory aspect of this Bill is removed. 
( Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: I am allowing you, but 
please hear me, You are well within your 
rights to raise this issue, but the Presiding 
Officers who are sitting here have to con-
sider other matters also. Supposing some 
item is coming up at 30' Clock and suppos-
ing we are not giving time in between, It is not 
good. It is not to shut It out, but to see that 
others also get the opportunity to discuss 
this> 

SHRIGEORGE FERNANDES: I will 
not say anything beyond the two Points that 
I want I want to make. 

MR. SPEAKER: How much time will 
you take? 

SHRIGEORGE FERNANDES: I will be 
very brief, Sir. I will nottake more than five 
minutes under any circumstances. 

[ TranslationI 

Mr Speaket. Sir. I am raising the Issue 
of discriminatory provisions on two ｾ｣｣ｯｵｮｴｳＮ＠
The Bill propose to impose some kind of a 
restriction on the advertisements of baby-
food. Most of the babyfood manufacturing 
companies In India are multinational 
companies with headquarters In America. 
Switzerland and other European countries. 
The ｰｲｯｧｾｭｭ･ｳ＠ beaned by the news 
agencies like CNN,BBC.ITB and others 
have caught the imagination of the people 
in India In preference to the programmes of 
our Doordarshan. All the multinational 
companies contrOlling the major part of the 
babyfood market In India will continue to 
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advertise their products on the international 
television network. Indian manufacturers 
like Amul are very small. There my be other 
enterprises also but only one or two names 
are worth mentioning. All these are being 
asked by the Govemment not to advertise 
their products. I am against the advertising 
of products. I am not saying toot these prod-
ucts should be advertised butthe provisionry 
of this Bill are discriminatory against the 
Indian manufacturers because whereas the 
multinational companies will continue to 
advertise through international Chain of 
agencies to influence the psyche of Indians 
the Indian manufacturers are being forbid-
den to do so. Out of the total production of 
60,000 tonnes of baby-food last year in the 
country, 40,000 tonnes of baby-food was 
purchased by the affluent people. Report 
about all this is available with the Govern-
ment. What should the Small Indian Compa-
nies and Cooperatives like Amul Dairy 
Cooperative do in this regard? They are 
being discriminated. 

Secondly, even the workers are being 
discriminaated against by the Government. 
It has been mentioned by the hon. Minister in 
the Objects and Reasons of the Bill that the 
Government of India endreses tile 1981 
cooe ot World Health Assembly. Wherein it 
was stated that-

[English] 

"Persons employed by the manufac-
turers and distributors-In systems of 
sale incentives for marketing person-
nel, the volume of sales of products 
within the scope of this code should 
not be included in the calculation of 
bonuses. Nor should quotas be set· 
specifically for sales of these prod-
ucts .. 

[ Translation] 

Now, this has been distorted. It has 
been completely changed. Mr. 
Speaker, Sir, it has been stated that-

[English] 

"No person who produces, supplies, 
distributes or sells infant milk substi-
tutes or feeding bottles for infant foods 
shall fix the remuneration of any of his 
employees, including the manufac-
turing employees or give any com-
mission to such employees, on the 
basis of the volume of sale of such 
substitutes, or bottles or foods made 
by such employees .• 

[ Translation] 

Mr Speaker, Sirwhatwill happen here 
now, the Government would do nothing 
except abolishing the system of giving salary 
on piece rate to the salesmen who take the 
material to the distribution shop. The gov-
ernment want to deprive the factory workers 
from the pice.rate salary and thus to stop all 
incentives to encourage them. The Govem-
ment had ｦｯｲｭｾｴ･､＠ world code later on 
which was rectified by the Government and 
underwhich thisAct has been brought. Here 
the matter is concerned to bonus issue and 
not salary. Discriminatory attitude has been 
adopted towards the factory workers in this. 
Hence two discriminations have done in it 
We welcome the spirit of the Bill but at same 
time we would like the Government to give 
special consideration to these two discrimi-
nations and introduce the Bill in the House 
by Monday or Tuesday after making amend-
ments into it. 

KUMARI MAMATA BANERJEE: Sir, 
My first submission is that in 1981 the 
World Heanh Code adopted a Bill. Afterthat, 
in 1983 a working Group was set up in India 
and foUowing its recommendations a Bill 
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was introduced in Rajya Sabha in 1986. But [English] 
dueto the dissolution of the Government the 
Bill could not be passed. Again during the 
Prime Ministrship of Shrl V.P. Singh the Bill 
was again introduced in Lok Sabha on 
January 10,1990 but afterthe dissolution of 
Lok Sabha the Bill could not be passed. In 
the last Parliament Shri Ram Naik brought a 
Private Member's Bill. He argued with me 
that when the intemational code can po it in 
the World Assembly then why not India. I 
admitted to him that the Government had 
committed a mistake I Shri George Fernan-
des has raised a question in this regard just 
now- I am greatly perturt bed over the 
matter. Don't you want that the children of 
our country should be healthy and get nutri-
tional food; if you really want them to get 
nutritional food, then you must support this 
Bill. 

( Interruptions) 

[English] 

This is a very serious situation. 

[ Translation] 

You must realise since the infant 
mortality rate is on the increase; it has 
become necessary to introduce this Bill. I 
would also like to submit thaI Shri George 
Fernandes has been raising the matter just 
to show how much concerned he is about the 
weHare of wOIXers, but I have been fighting 
for it sincerely. (Interruptions) Production 
has not been banned rather the Bill makes 
provision to stop the advertisements in this 
regard because this is essential to give 
protection to infant milk, infant milk bottles, 
breast feeding and also for the good future 
of the country. Therefore I would like the 
House to support this Bill and help the 
Govemment to ensure the good future of the 
coming generations. 

(Interruptions) 

MR. SPEAKER: I think you are quite 
persuasive: 

[ Translation] 

SHRI GEORGE FERNANDES: At the 
moment I would not speak over it. 

[Eng/ish) 

MR SPEAKER: It was a quite sportive 
and persuasive reply. 

The question is: 

"That leave be granted to intro-
duce a Bill to provide for the 
regulation of production, Sup-
ply and distribution of infaant 
milksubstitutes, feeding bottles 
and Infant food with a view to 
the protection and Promotion of 
breast -feeding and ensu ring the 
proper use of infant foods and 
for matters connected therewith 
or incidental thereto.· 

The motion was adopted. 

KUMAR/ MAMATA BANERJEE: Sir, I 
introduce the Bill. 

MR. SPEAKER: Should we meat at 3 
. O'Clock? 

SHRISRIKANTA JENA(Cuttack): Sir, 
if there Is no lunch break, at least tea break 
should be there. 
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14.40 hra 

M1\TTERS UNDER RULE 377 

(I) Need to take Immediate steps 
to cope with the situation arising 
out of drough at Idukkl. Kerala 

[English) 

SHRI PALA K. M. MATHEW (Idukki): 
Sir the District of Idukki in Kerala is under 
threat of total ruin and we have been re-
questing for necessary action and steps for 
the last three years to improve the situation. 
The severe drought has completely ruined 
pepperwines. tea. coffee. cocoa. cardamom. 
coconut. rubber etc. have'dried up and have 
been destroyed. All cultivations and green-
eries are facing devastation. The poor peas-
ants are panic- stricken.absolutely non-
plUSSed. This situation, if allowed to con-
tinue. will lead to an economic havoc not only 
in Idukki but also in the entire State of Kerala. 
I therefore request the Central Government 
to take steps on a war- footing to meet the 
situation. 

(II) Need for early completion of 
Jagdalpur-Nlzamabad National 
Highway No 16 

[ Translation) 

SHRI MANKU RAM SODI (Bastar): Mr. 
Speaker. Sir. Jagdalpur Nizamabad Na-
tional Highway No: 16 was approved four 
years ago. but the working staff to the full 
strength has not been posted there so far. 
Due to non-filling of the vacant posts the 
progress of the work on that project is very 
slow. As far as my information is concemed 
even the regular workers as gangment have 
not been recruited. The distance between 
JagdaJpur which Is 0 the border of Baastar 
to Bhopalpatham is about 220km. A sub-
division inBijapur should be opened in order 
to accelerate the wolt(. Recently a sUbdivl-

sion has been opened in Godam which at a 
distance of about 61 km from Jagdalpur. 
whereas the length of road towards Bhopal-
pattisnam from Godam is much more and 
the wolt( could not be expedited due to the 
lack of control. A bridge is proposed to be 
constructed on the river Indrawati near 
Bhopalpatlnam. Therefore it in necessary to 
open a sub- division at Bijapur. 

Hence. the Central Govemment is 
requested to direct the State Government to 
expedite the wolt( for the early c0IllP.'etion of 
this National Highway. 

(iii) Need to provide funds for the 
construction of flats forfamllies 
affected by the communal In 
Sundargarh Parliamentary com-
stltuency. Orissa 

[English) 

SHRI FRIDA TOPNO (Sundargarh): 
Sir. 'draw the attention of the Government 
to the miserable conditions of over fifty 
thousand Muslims residing at Nala Road in 
Roult(ela. During the communal riots which 
rocked many parts of my Partiamentary 
constituency in 1964. thousands of Muslim 
families took shelter at Roult(ela. Even after 
the riot. nay families stayed back and are 
now residing at Nala Road. Most of these 
familieshave hardly a room to accommodate 
their family members The entire Nala Road 
areas have not been provided with bare 
encessities of life like drinking -water. light. 
and sanitation. There was a proposal by the 
Govemment of Orissa to construct flats to 
accommodate them but this could not be 
materialised as most of these families live 
from hand to mouth and are unable to pay 
the housing Instalments. Sir, during the 
rainy seasons as the entire Nala Road area 
Is Iow- land area of Rourkela township and 
there is no drainage system, the areas are 
affected by flood water. Uanyof them sutfer 
from cholera. During the summer they do 
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not get water to drink as the area has of 
water supply facilitties. 

I, therefore, urge upon the Central 
Government to sanction a substantial amount 
for construction of flats for these people on 
humanitarian grounds in order to resettle 
these families affected by communal riots. 

(Iv) Need to develop Inland water-
way from Kovalam to Kochuvell, 
Kerala 

SHRI A. CHARLES (Trivandrum): It is 
reliably learnt that the Government of India 
has selected a few projects for development 
of Tourism under the Central Sector. Kovalam 
is one such project in Kerala . The Kerala 
Government has submitted a proposal for 
the development of inland waterway from 
Kovalar.n to Kochuveli where facilities are 
already available for water sports.1f the 
Kovalam- Kochuveli inland water way is 
developed it can attract tourist from all over 
the world. II thiswaterway is developed the 
the tourists who land at the Airport can easily 
reach Kovalam through the waterway in 
less thiln half-an-hour. I, therefore, request 
the Central Government to implement the 
project within a time frame. 

(v) Need to take steps for early 
completion of Daryaghat' rail-
way line through MurdbadTehsll 
of Thane district, Maharashtra_ 

SHRI RAM KAPSE (Thane): The SLK-
vey for new railway line through Murdbad 
Tehsil of Than District, Maharashtra was 
made long back. 

This railway line is not only the lifeline 
of this Tehsil but will be also a boon to 
southern India. It is reported that with the 
laying of tllfs line the distance between 
Bombay to Vishakhapatnam will be re-
duced by 250 Kms., and that between 
Bombay and Ahmednagar will be 100 Kms .• 

less than the existing railway route. The 
passengers travelling by the proposed route 
will not hjive to travel via Pune but can go 
directly from Bombay to Ahmednagar 
through Daryaghat. The poor villagers from 
Murdbad Tehsil are anxiously waiting for 
completion of this railway line called "Dar-
yaghat Railway'-

I urge upon the Central Government to 
take up the matter as it will be the shortest 
link between Maharashtra and Andhra 
Pradesh. 

(vi) Need for setting up an 
electronic telephone ex-
change ,at Pilibh it, Uttar 
Pradesh 

[ Translation) 

SA. P.A. GANGWAR: Mr Speaker, Sir, 
my whole constituency comes under Ter-
rain region, on the Borders of Nepal. This is 
a terrorist affected area. Many years ago, an 
electronic telephone exchange was approved 
for this area, but it has not been set up so 
far; due to which people have to face a lot of 
inconvenience. Besides, police force also it 
difficult to fight against terrorism due to the 
lack of communication facilitieS. 

Therefore, the Central Government is 
requested to open the aforesaid exchange 
in Pilibhit at the earliest. 

(vII) Needto Introduce direct tranlns 
between North Bihar and 
South India 

SHRI NAWAl KISHORE RAI (SI-
tamarhi): Mr. Speaker, Sir, the coaches of 
almost all the trains corrllng to Bihar, particu-
larly to North Bihar are in worn out condi-
tion. So much so that even the doors and 
windows of the toilets in these trains are 
without bolt.s. and the taps broken. It is 
difficult to assess how much Inconvenience 
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the passengers travelling on long routes 
have to face. The rates of eatables has been 
Increased but the quality of those eatables 
has not i"l>roved. Due to the non- availabil-
ity of water in the train people have to make 
their own arrangement for water. Therefore, 
these wom out coaches should be replaced 
by the new coaches at once so that the 
passengers are relieved of these difficulties. 
computerfacility should have been provided 
in Muzaffarpur . Reservation office too, but 
it has not been provided to it. Under the new 
Railway policy, though the Railway depart-
ment has linked the industrial and trading 
centres of West to those of South but North 
Bihar has not been linked. Therefore, I 
wouk:! urge the Central Government to start 
a direct train from Muzaffarpur in order to 
link North Bihar to South India. 

(vlit Need to demarcate the bound-
ary of buxarairport, Biharand to 
modernise It 

SHRITEAJ NARAYAN SINGH (Buxar): 
Mr. Speaker, Sir, in the Buxar district of 
Biharstatethere is an airport at Buxarwhich 
was made when the Brithishers ruled our 
country. The ministers make use 01 that 
airport from time to time. The airport is built 
on nearly 50 acre plot of land. In old survey 
as well as in new survey the airport land is 
shown as agricultural land. But for the last 
few days the airport land is being encroached 
by some people. That is why I make a 
demand to the Government of India that the 
boundary of the Buxar airport should be 
demarcated and after the demarcation a 
boundary we" should be costructed around 
it and the airport may be modernised. 

[English) 

MR. SPEAKER: NowtheHouse stands 

adjourned to meet again at 3.3 0 p.m 

14.50 hrs 

The lok Sabha than Adjousrmed for 
Lunch till Thirty minutes part Three of the 

Clock. 

15.35 

The Lok Sabha re-assembled alter Lunch 
at thirty-five minutes past Fourteen of the 

Clock. 

[SHRI SHARAD DIGHEin the Chair] 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The House will now 
take up Private Members' Business. Shrl-
mali Basava Rajeswari is not present. Shri 
Anna Joshi 

ALL INDIA COUCIL FOR TECHNICAL 
EDUCATION ( AMENDMENT) BILL" 

(Amendment of Section 10) 

SHRI ANNA JOSHI (Pune): Slr,l beg to 
move fbr leave to Introduce a Bill to amend 
the All India CouncilforTechnical Education 
Act, 1987. 

Bill. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 

"That leave be granted to intro-
duce a Bill to amend the All India 
Council for Technical Education 
Act,1987." 

The Motion was Adopted. 

SHRI ANNA JOSHI : I Introduce the 
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DOCTORS AND ENGINEERS ( REGU· 
LATITON OF MIGRATION TO FOREIGN 

COUNTRIES) BILL" 

[English] 

SHRI KASHIRAM RANA (Surat): Sir, I 
beg to move for leave to introduce a Bill to 
regulate the migration of doctors and engi-
neers to foreign Countries." 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 

"That leave be granted to intro-
duce a Bill to regulate the migra-
tion of doctors and engineers to 
foreign countries." 

The MotIon was Adopted. 

SHRI KASHIRAM RANA: I introduces 
the Bill. 

15.36 hrs 

SPECLAL EDUCATIONAL FACILITIES 
(FOR CHILDREN OF ECONOMICALLY 

BACKWARD PARENTS)BILL" 

[English] 

SHRI KASHIRAM RANA (Surat): Sir, 
I beg to move for leave to Introduce a Bill to 
provide for special educational facilites to 
children of economically backward parents. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 

"That leave be granted to intro-
duce a Bill to provide for special 
educational facilities to children 
of economically backward par-
ents: 

The motion was adopted 

SHRI KASHIRAM RANA: I introduce 
the Bill. 

COLLEGE EDUCATION BILL" 

[English] 

DR. P. VALLAL PERUMAN (Chidam-
baram): Sir, I beg to move for leave to 
introduce a Bill to provide forthe setting up of 
adequate number of colleges in every dis-
trict in the country. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 
"That leave be granted to introduce a 
Bill to provide forthe setting up of ade-
quate number of colleges in every dis-
trict in the country". 

The motion was adopted 

DR. P. VALLAL PERUMAN: I introduce 
the Bill. 

15.37 hr.. 
RESERVATION OF POSTS FOR 

SCHEDULED CASTES AND SCHED-
ULED TRIBES (IN GOVERNMENT SERV-

ICES) BILL" 
[English] 

DR. P. VALLAL PERUMAN (Chidam-
baram): Sir, I beg to move -for leave to 
inroduce a Bill to provide for reservation of 
posts for Scheduled Castes and Scheduled 
Tribes in higher category of posts in Gov-
ernment Services. . 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 

"That leave be granted to intro-
duce a-Bill to provide for reserva-
tion of posts for Scheduled 
Castes and Scheduled Tribes in 
higher category of posts in 
Govemment Services." 

The motion was adopted. 

DR. P. VALLAL PERUMAN: I introduce 
the Bill. 

CODE OF CIVIL PROCEDURE (AMEND-
MENT) BILL" 

(Substitution of New Section for 
section 115) 

[English] 

SHRISRIBALLAVPANIGRAHI (Deog-
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arh): Sir, I beg to move for leave to introduce 
a Bill further to amend the Code of Civil 
Procedure, 1908. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 

"That leave be granted to introduce a 
Bill furtherto amend the Code of Civil Proce-
dure, 1908." 

The motion was adopted. 

SHRI SRIBALLAV PANIGRAHI: I intro-
duce the Bill. • 

15.381/2 hrs 

CONSTRUCTION WORKERS (REGULA-
TION OF EMPLOYMENT AND CONDI-

TIONSOF SERVICE) BILL' 

[English] 

SHRI HANNAN MOLLAH (Uluberia): 
Sir, 1 beg to move for leave to introduce a Bill 
to provide for the regulation of employment 
and conditions of service of construction 
workers and for matters connected there-
with. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 

"That leave be granted to ｾｮｴｲｯ､ｵ｣･＠ a 
Bill to provide for the regulation of employ-
ment and conditions of service of construe-
tion workers and for matters connected there-
with." 

The motion was adopted. 

SHRI HANNAN MOLLAH: I introduce 

EMPLOYEES' PROVIDENT FUNDS AND 
MISCELL ANEOUS PROVISIONS 

(AMENDMENT) BILL' 

(Amendment of Section 6A) 

[English) 

SHRI KASHIRAM RANA(Surat): Sir, I 
beg to move for leave to introduce a Bill 
further to amend the Employees' Provident 
Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act. 
1952. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 
"That leave be granted to introduce to 

introduce a Bill further the Employees' Provi-
dent Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions 
Act, 1952." 

The motion was adopted. 

SHRI KASHIRAM RANA: I introduce 
the Bill. 

15.391/2 hrs 

OFFICIAL RESIDENCE FOR DIGNI-
TARIES BILL" 

[English) 

SHRI t<ASHIRAM RANA(Surat): Sir, I 
beg to move for leave to introduce a Bill to 
provide for a permanent I9sidence for per· 
sons holding high offices under the Govern-
ment of India. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 

"Pubished in the Gazatte of India Extraordinary, Part II, Section 2, dated 8.5.1992 . 
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"That leave be granted to introduce a 
Bill to provide for a permanent residence for 
persons holding high offices under the 
Govemment of India.;' . 

The motion was adopted. 

Sir. I beg to move for leave to introduce a Bill 
to provide for protection and welfare of extra 
garden . labour and for matters connected 
therewith. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 

SHRI KASHIRAM RANA: I introduce to "That leave· be granted to introduce a 
Bill. Bill to provide for protection and welfare of 

ex-tea garden labour and for matters con-
nected therewith." 

15.40 hr. 

UNORGANISED LABOUR WELFARE 
BILL· 

(English) 

SHRI DWARKA NATH DAS (Kaimganj): 
I bet to more for leave to introduce a Bill to 
provide for protection and welfare of unor-
ganized labour and for matters connected 
therewith. / 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 

"That leave be granted to introduce a 
Bill to provide for protection and welfare 
of unorganized labour and matters 
connected therewith .• 

The mation was adopted 

SHRI DWARKA NATH DAS: I introduce 
the Bill. 

15.40112 

EX-TEA GARDEN LABOUR WELFARE 
BILL" 

(English] 

SHRIDWARKANATHDAS(Karirrganj): 

The motion was adopted. 

SHRI DWARKA NATH DAS: I introduce 
the Bill. 

15.41 hrs 

AGRICULTURAL LABOUR (EQUAL PAY 
FOR MEN AND WOMEN) BILL· 

[English) 

SHRIMATI SURYA KANTA 
PATIL(Nanded): Sir,l beg to move for leave 
to introduce a Bill to provide for equal pay 
and perks for agricultural labourers. both 
men and women. and for matters connected 
therewith or incidental thereto. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 

"That leave be granted to introduce a 
Bill to provide for equal pay and perks for' 
agricultural labourers. both men and women. 
and for matters con nectad therewith or inci-
dental thereto." . 

The motion was adopted. 

SHRIMATI SURYA KANTA PATIL: I 
introduce the Bill. 
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HIGH COURT AT GUWAHATI (ESTA-
BLESHMENT OF A PERMANENT 

BENCH AT IMPHAL) BILL 

[English] 

SHRI YAIMA SINGH YUMNAM(lnner 
Manipur): Since a permanent Bench of the 
High Court at Guwahati at Imphal has been 
established and functioning, the purpose of 
the Bill has been served. Hence, I beg to 
move for leave to withdraw the Bill to provide 
forthe establishment of a permanent Bench 
of the High Court at Guwahati at Imphal. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The question is: 
"That leave be granted to withdraw the 
Bill to provide forthe establishment of a 
permanent Bench of the High Court at 
Guwahati at Imphal.· 

The motion was adopted. 

SHRI YAIMA SINGH YUMNAM: I with-
draw the Bill. 

15.43 hrs 

CONSTITUTION (AMENDMENT) BILL-
CON TO. 

... 
(Amendment of Eighth Schedule) 

[English] 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The House will Now 
take up further consideration of the following 
motion moved by Shrimati Dil Kumari Bhan-
dari on the 1Dlh April, 1992, namely:-

"That the Bill further to amend the 
Constitution 01 India, be taken into consid-
eration." 

Shri L.K. Advalil. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI L.K. ADVANI(Gandhinagar): Mr. 
Chairmen, Sir, I am starting this discussion. 
I would only like to draw the attention of the 
House to the fact that the several residents 
of Manipur are on hunger-strike for the last 
nine days on the question of the Manipuri 
language and the condition of one of them is 
serious. That is why. Though the House has 
held discussion twice on it on Friday and 
there is a consensus. I hope that the re-
sponse of the Government will be favourable 
and it will be such a response that we may 

- convey the opinion of the house to them and 
they may call off the hunger-strike. The 
condition of the one 01 them is quite serious 
a1d that is why I am rising to express my 
concern (Interruptions). 

[English] 

SHRI HANNAN MOLLAH(Uluberia): Sir, 
some Nepali people are also planning self-
immolation .. ( Interruptions) .. 

(Translation] 

SHRI MADAN LAL KHURANA: Han. 
Advani ji has raised an issue in the House, it 
is my requestthatthe Minister 01 Parliamen-
tary Affairs is present in the 
House .. (Interruptions) 

SHRI MANORANJAN BHAKTA (An-
daman and Nicobar Islands): Khurana ji, 
Advani ji has already spoken, whatelse is left 
now. 

Mr. Chairman, Sir, as I had mentioned it 
here in the last few days that by bringing this 
Bill in the House hon. Oil Kumari ji has won 
hearts 01 all of us as also won the hearts of 
the people, who are living in all those States 
where they are resorting to agitational ap-
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proach on the question of language. She has 
given u. an opportunity .. ( Interruptions) .. their 
name is not there. I would like to tell you that 
today we have got an opportunity In the 
House that we should not only confine this 
issue to Manipuri and Nepali alone, but we 
need to ponder over this issue more seri-
ously. The reason for this is that there is a 
proposal before us to give constitutional 
recognition to languages like Nepali, Manipuri 
or Konkani. There can be notwo opinions on 
this because today if the unity of the country 
has to be maintained, we shall have to think 
again on the language-policy. 

All of us know that all the major lan-
guages in this country have been included in 
the Eighth Schedule of the Constitution. All 
of us also know that Hindi is the national 
language of this country and even on this 
there are no two opinions, nor is there any 
opposition to it. But in this country, even after 
40-50 years of independence, people living 
in remote areas at different places and in 
backward areas have an attachment with 
their respective languages they speak, all of 
them want their own language to get ahead, 
but the apathy on the part of the Government 
towards those languages has created sur-
prise and resentment among the people. 

That Is why I would like to submit to you 
thatthere are many minor langugages in this 
country in each State which do not have their 
own script but people speak those languages 
and converse in them. Some languages 
such as Nicolabri language in the Andaman 
& N icobar Islands, has got no script of its own' 
but the former Member of Parliament, Late 
John Bishop Richardson, who was elected 
to this House in 1952, made an effort to write 
it in Roman alphabets. He gave the Nicobari 
language of that place a written form and in 
this way translated it into a script. You may 
find many such languages in different parts 
of the country and we have no knowledge of 
these languages completely. That is why I 
want that research should be carried out in 

respect.of all such languages and they are 
brought to light from the point of view of the 
unity and integrity of the country as well as to 
make the nation strong. We should obtain 
complete information about such languages 
and we should ponder over the ways to get 
aU those languages included in ourConstitu-
tion. 

The hon. Minister of State for Home 
Affairs is sitting in the House, he must be 
having information about many such lan-
guages. I would like to submit to him to 
constitute a Language Commission in the 
country and after Its constitution, all the 
languages spoken in the country should be 
placed In a list. After that list is prepared, we 
should find out as to which languages do not 
have their own script. A separate list should 
be prepared for such languages and those 
languages which are spoken by people, which 
figure in the list and which have a script of 
their own should be placed in a separate list. 
In this way after a list is prepared of all such 
languages, there is a need today to frame a 
policy in a proper way with regard to the 
languages spoken by tribals and others 
throughoulthe country, but which have never 
been presented before us in a proper form. 

Mr. Chairman, Sir, in the constituency 
that I represent, people belonging to every 
state and speaking all sorts languages ofthe 
country are living. We have three-language 
formula, First-Hindi, second-English and 
third-own mother tongue, all these three 
languages are also compulsory. If someone 
wants to receive education through his 
mother tongue, he has no, problem, There-
fore, language has never become a bone of 
contention. At the time when an agitation 
was going on against teaching of Hindi in 
one part of the country, the people of my 
State were studying in the medium of Eng-
lish and their mother tongue-. Thus, no 
controversy ever reged on language in my 
State. It has maintained our language 
policy. 
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Mr. Chairman, Sir, in various States of 
the country various controversies have been 
going on language issue for a long period. 
Therefore, taking all things into considera-
tion, the review of the language policy be-
comes necessary. There is a Department of 
Official languages in the Ministry of Home 
Affairs but the Government has never given 
a thought towards a number of languages in 
the country. What has it done? It has taken 
no measures to encourage the official lan-
guage. It has taken no measures to hold any 
discussion in this regard. I, therefore, realise 
that it is very essential to consider it anew. It 
is very essential for the sake of national 
integration as well. 

Mr. Chairman, Sir, if the Government 
thinks that it has fuHilled its responsibility 
merely by encouraging Hindi, that will not 
serve the purpose. It is very essential to 
encourage Hindi. Undoubtedly, it is our na-
tionallanguage and I am not saying it at all 
that Hindi should not be encouraged. Hindi 
must be encouraged, but the Government 
has to pay attention to the development and 
propagation of other 15 languages men-
tioned in the Eighth Schedule of the Consti-
tution.lt is true that every State Govemment 
is responsible for the progress of the lan-
guage of the State, but besides it, there is no 
one to pay any heed to the dialects spoken 
as regional languages in the State and spo-
ken by the majority of the people for their 
development. The Central Government owns 
the responsibility of propagating the Official 
Lang uage and State Government does so in 
respect of the language spoken in that State 
but Nobody is there to develop the regional 
languages. Therefore, it is high time that we 
examined every issue and its every aspect 
properly. I would like to urge upon the hon. 
Minister of Home Affairs to formulate a policy 
In the regard. 

Mr. Chairmen, Sir, It is my demand to 

the hon. Minister of Home Affairs that after 
the discussion is over, he should take some 
concrete steps to revise the language policy 
and also see that some steps are taken to 
encourage these languages. For doing all 

. this funds are also required for the Govern-
ment to il11>lement its plans because nothir09 
can be done without money. Similarly, work 
should be done for the development of 
Manipuri, Nepali and Konkani languages 
also. Recently, I found in Tripura that they 
have developed a separate language of their 
own. They have given certain name to it. 
They have evolved its script also. That is a 
Tribal language. The Government must pay 
attention to it. I think it is a genuine demand. 
You should make an announcement that the 
Govemment will bring forward a Bill in this 
regard by such and such date. 

Just now, Shri Advani has said that the 
Manipuri students are on the path of agita-
tion. We aU want to request them that since 
it is being discussed in the House and the 
Govemment is aware of it, they should not 
launch agitation. Their purpose of drawing 
attention has already been served. 

. I support the move and conclude. 

PROF. PREM OHUMAL: Mr. Chairman, 
Sir, I support the Constitution (Amendment 
to the Eighth Schedule) Bill introduced by 
Shrimati Oil Kumari Bhandari. Our party 
leader Shri Advani has also supported this 
Bill fully. Nepali and Manipuri were promised 
to be included in the Eighth Schedule of the 
Constitution in our election manifesto. 

The purpose of language is to one's 
feeiing and message to the other. Nepali and 
Manipuri are languages which are used to 
give expression to the feeling of many peoP.'. 
of this country. There are already 15 lan-
guages in the Eighth SchedU1e of the Consti-
tution. These two languages ShOJ,lId alSo' be 
included in II and they should be.f8Cogriised. 
In a democratic Government the Govern-
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ment itself should understand the feeling of 
the people. Unfortunately, such circum-
stances were always created which have 
compelled people to resort to violent agita-
tion to get their demand accepted. The 
Govemment has always ignored such is-
sues presened through a resolution or nego-
tiation. When it was expressed through vio-
lent agitation, the Govemment accepted It. 

l'oday, the people 01 Manipur and Sikkim 
are launding agitation to get their respective 
languages included in the Eighth Schedule 
of the Constitution. As Shri Advani said some 
people are sitting on fast and the condition of 
one of them is serious. The Nepali students 
have threatened to commit self ·immolation. 
Ithink that had the Government been vigilant 
towards the sentiments of the people, the 
moment the State Home Minister came to 
the House, he would have said that in the 
light of the support Irom every section of the 
House he accepls II and the agitation would 
have been called off at once. I fail to under-
stand as to what does the Government lose 
if it does so. 

The Govemment itself reconstituteQ 
States on the basis of language and it was 
accepted only when some of the people 
agitated lor it. The people of Punjab went on 
demanding reorganisaction of Punjab on the 
basis of Punjabi ｬ｡ｮｧｵ｡ｾＮ＠ The Government 
opposed it and the intensity of resentment 
went on increasing. Violent agistation took 
place, then they were given a small State of 
Punjab on the Basis of Punjabi language. 
Punjab was divided. At present such agita-

. tion is going on in Manipur. The people of 
Manipur are opposing the Central Govern-
ment and all other Indian languages. They 
say that unless Manipuri is included in the 
Eighth Schedule 01 the Constitution, they are 
not prepared to Schedule 01 the Constitu-
tion, they are not prepared to accept any 
other language. The Nepalese students 
threaten to agitate. They are sitting here on 
hunger-strike. After this. Since this BiU has 

been brought by on hon. Member of the 
House and the entire House has supported 
It, the hon. Minister should not make further 
delay in accepting it. 

Not only this, the legislative Assem-
blies of Manipur, Tripura, West Bengal and 
that of my own State, Himachal Pradesh 
have passed a resolution and sent It to the 
Government to include Nepali and Manipurl 
languages in the Eighth- Schedule of the 
Constitution. Recently the conference of the 
Bharatiya Janata Party ｷ｡ｾ＠ held in Gandhi-
nagar (Interruptions) 

SHRI KRISHAN DUTT SUl TANPURI 
(Shimla): let the hon. Member say that the 
conference was held in Anatyadaya Nagar-

PROF. PRaM DHUMAl: It is better lor 
the hon. Member not to speak on the issue 
which is beyond his comprehension. At that 
conference we said that not only Manipuri 
and Nepali but Konkani should also be in-
cluded in it. Since the formation of Goa as a 
new State, the people have been demand-
ing inclusion of Konkani in the Eighth Sched-
ule of the Constitution. If the Government of 
India makes lurther delay on any pretext. It 
will be taken that it is being denied as the 
saying goes-

[English) 

Justice delayed is justice denied. 

[ Translation} 

If it is delayed for long, the public resent-
ment will increase. I. therefore. urge upon 
the Government to accept the Bill. for the 
inclusion of Nepali and Manipuri as it is and 
create a history. b is a very good Bill and aU 
parties. are supporting it. You are requested 
. to treat it as Government BiU and include it in 
the Eighth Schedule of the Constitution. 

Many Members Would like to ｟ｾｫ＠ nn 
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it. So, once again I would like to say that prior 
to that the movement may turn violent you 
are urged to understand the feelings of the 
people and decide this matter respecting the 
norms of the democracy. As a member of 
your party Shri Manoranjan Bhakta has said 
that if this Bill is passed, the people will start 
believing that this Government has full faith 
in democracy and it understands the feel-
ings of the people. You are requested to 
pass this bill and try to understand the 
feelings of the people and ours. Soon the 

.good results of this Bill will come before us-
and I hope that you will adopt it. 

With these words I support this bill and 
conclude. 

[English] 

SHRIINDERJIT(Darjeeling): Mr. Chair-
man, Sir, I amgrateful to you forgiving me an 
opportunity to speak on the Constitution 
(Amendment) Bill which is of great interest to 
more than eight to ten lakhs of people of my 
constituency of Darjeeling and carries far-
reaching implications for the future of India, 
its integrity and unity. 

Manyfriends from all sides olthe House 
have already spoken on the Bill. I have heard 
all of them with much interest. and if I might 
add, in some cases, with not a little concern. 

Some here may be surprised at my use· 
of the word 'concern'. Candidly, Sir, I have-
chosen to do so deliberately, I feel con-
cerned because I find that some of the 
speeches sadly reflect what I have often 
described as the bane of present day India, 
a crisis of casualness. I get the feeling that 
adequate thought has not been given to the 
proposal to include Nepali language in the 
Eighth Schedule. Regrettably, the approach 
of some friends appears to be rathefcasual. 
Major developments have taken place in the 

ｄ｡ｾ･･ｬｩｮｧ＠ hills over the past few years. 
Surprisingly and regrettably, these have not 
been taken into accou nt. Some friends have 
also slurred over recent developments which 
must be kept in mind before we take a 
decision on the legislation before us, a Bill 
which Is not as simple as it appears to be in 
regard to the proposal forthe inclusion ofthe 
Nepali language in the Eighth Schedule. 

Mr. Cftairman, Sir, this Bill needs to be 
viewed in the first place in the light of the 
agitation launched by the Gorkha National 
Liberation Front and its leader, Mr. Subash 
Ghisingh, for the establishment of 
Gorkhaland early in 1986 and its culmination 
in the historic Darjeeling Gorkha Hill Council 

. Accord on August 23,1988. This agitation 
was not just for a separate State of 
Gorkhaland within India's borders. Sir, it was 
a battle for identity by the Gorkhas of the 
Darjee:ing hill areas who had come to India 
with the ceded land-as also a battle by the 
Gorkha National Liberation Front for forging 
a common national political platform for the 
'settled Gorkhas· all over India. 

Mr. Ghisingh and his supporters were 
not prepared to be labelled as Nepalis and, 
in effect, have the words "Reciprocal Nepalis· 
permanently inscribed on their foreheads 
under Article VII of the Indo-Nepal Treaty of 
1950. This article provides and I quote: 

"The Governments of India and Nepal 
agree to grant on reciprocal basis to the 
nationals of one country in the territories of 
the other the salT)9 privileges in the matter of 
residence, ownership of property, participa-
tion in trade and commerce and privileges of 
a Similar matter." 

They, therefore, asserted thatthey were 
Indians and not Nepalis and demanded that 
they be formally recognised as Indians. In 
other words ... (Interruptions) Mr. Chairman, 
Sir, I am not yielding. I did not object when 
Mr. Upadhyay talked in terms of "We. the 
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Nepalis .. • ... ( Interruptions) 

MR. CHAIRMAN: He has his point of 
view. Let him express. Do not disturb him. 

SHRIINDER JIT: They, therefore, as-
se rted that they were Indians and not Nepalis 
and demanded that they be formally recog-
nised as Indians. In other words, they drew 
a sharp and clear distinction between those 
who were "settled Gor1<has" of India and 
Indians and those who were Nepali nation-
als residing in India in accordance with Ar-
ticle VII of the Indo Nepal Treaty and de-
scribed as "reciprocal Nepalis". Basically thy 
were eager to maKe one thing clear. They 
were will and truly Indians and had nothing to 
do whatsoever with Nepali. 

To cut a long story short, Mr. Ghising 
and the GNLF tought hard and won their 
battie for identity. The Government of India 
acknowledged that Mr. Ghising and the 
"settled Gor1<has" of India were Indian citi-
zens. Simultaneously, the Govemment of 
India issued on August 23, 1988, a Gazette 

. Notification declaring allthe "settled Gor1\has" 
to be Indians. I quote the Gazette Notifica-
tion: 

"Whereas it has come to the notice of 
the Central Government thatthere have 
been some misconceptions about the 
citizenship atthe commencement of the 
Constitution of India of Certain classes 
of persons commonly known as 
Gorkhas, who had settled in India at 
such commencement. 

And whereas it is considered necessary 
to clear such misconceptions; it is hereby 
clarified as follows: 

(1) Asfromthecommencementofthe 
Constitution, that is as from 
26.1.1950, every Gorkha, who had 
his domicile in the territory of India, 
1t:lat is in the territories which on 

26.1.1950 became part of or con-
stituted the territory 01 India as 
defined in Article 1 (2) of the Consti-
tution of India; and 

(a) who was born in the territory of 
India; 

(b) either of whose parents was born in 
the territory of India; 

(c) who had been ordinarily resident in 
the territory of India for not less 
than five years before such com-
mencement; 

shall be a citizen of India as provided 
in article 5 of the Constituti_on of India; 

(2) No such person as is ｲ･ｦ･ｲｮｾ､＠ to in 
paragraph 

(1) above shall be a citizen of India or 
be deemed to be a citizen of India 
if he has voluntarily acquired to 
citizenship of any foreign State as 
provided in article 9 of the Constitu-
tion of India ... • 

Sir, I will not bother you with more de-
tails of this Gezette notification. But it is very 
vital for our discussion. 

Importantly and significantly the GNLF 
and its leaders did not rest at that. They 
insisted that the proposed Darjeeling Hill 
Council, which was to be an autonomous 
body and a little short of the full-fledged State 
demanded by them, be called the Darjeeling 
Gor1<ha Hill Council. The West Bengal Gov-
ernment objected to including the word 
"Gor1<ha" in the name of Hill CounciJ. Even-
tually, Shri Bula Singh, the then Home Min-
ister, and I as one privileged to play the role 
of a mediator in the thorny and highly emo-· 
tive dispute, were able to persuade both the 
then Prime Minister, Shri Rajiv Gandhi, and 
the West Bengal Chief Minister, Mr. Jyoti 
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Basu, to accede to the GNLF demand and 
give the proposed Council the name 01 
ｄ｡ｾ･･ｬｩｮｧ＠ Gorkha Hill Council, 

The GNLF and its supporters in the 
ｄ｡ｾ･･ｬｩｮｧ＠ Hill areas as also in the adjoining 
areas 01 Alipur Dooars are today proud of 
their Indian citizenship and identify. They are 
happy to rqve drawn a clear and sharp 
distinction between themselves as Indians 
and those who are "reciprocal Nepalis". They 
do not wish to be seen as having any link, 
even remotely, with Nepal and are eager to 
ensure that there is no scope for any doubt 
in regard to their commitment to their moth-
erland India 

in fact, not long ago, the Oarjeeling 
Gorkha Hill Council and its Executive took 
another significant step to assert their Indian 
identity and separateness from Nepal. Both 
formally declared ·Gorkha Bhasha" as their 
official language. This, it needs to be noted, 
was done by Mr. Ghisingh and his counci; at 
a time when some leaders in the region have 
been busy campaigning in a big way for the 
inclusion of Nepali language in the Eighth 
Schedule as one of India's National lan-
guages. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: We shall have to 
extend the time of this Bill as the time of the 
Bill is over. Shall we extend it by two hours? 

SEVERAL HON. MEMBERS: Yes. 

MR CHAIRMAN: The time is extended 
by two hours. Shri Inder Jit, please continue. 

SHRI INOER JIT: We must be clear 
'about certain fundamental while viewing the 
Conslitution Amendment bill before us. The 
Nepali language is today officially the na-
tionallanguage of Nepal even as the King-
dom has many other languages spoken by 

its various communities as the Rais, the 
Limbus and the Gurungs. I am told that 
Nepal ha.d formally no national language 
until Kathmandu applied forthe membership 
of the United Nations. Earlier, the ruling 
circles in Kathmandu used the Khas lan-
guage. Subsequently, the name was 
changed to Parbatiya or the language spo-
ken in the hills. (Interruptions) Shrimati Oil 
Kumari Bhandari can reply at the end. Please 
give me a patienf hearing. Thereafter, it was 
called Gorkha Bhasha till Nepali language in 
Newari script was formally declared as the 
Kingdom's national language. 

The Nepali language is at present not 
only the national language of Nepal, it is also 
the language of all the Nepalis abroad, in-
cluding lakhs residing and working in India in 
accordance with Article VII olthe tndo-Nepal 
Treaty of 1950. In sharp contrast, Gorkha 
Bhasha. according to the GNLF and my 
understanding of the Oarjeeling Accord, is 
the language of the ·settled Gorkahs" 01 
India who have been accepted as Indian 
citizens under the Accord and have been 
declared to be such by the Government of 
India Gazette Notification of August 28, 1988. 
(Interruptions). I am not yielding. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: No disturbance 
Please. 

SHRIMATI OIL KUMARI BHANDARI 
(Sikkim): Sir, he is misleading the House. 

MR. CHARIMAN: You can reply and 
lead the House properly. 

SHRt tNOER JIT: The distinction be-
\Vlleen them is clear and ｭ｡ｾ･､Ｍ｡＠ distinction 
which we must underline and emphasize in 
India's best national interest and that of. its 
unity and integrity. Shakespeare once said 
·What is in a name" and hastened to add:" A 
rose by any other name _ would smell as 
sweet. 
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SHRIMATI OIL KUMARI BHANDARI: 
You translate it in Gorkha language. 

SHRI INDER JIT: Alas, this does not 
hold good insofar as a language is con-
cerned! A language by any other name may 
not only not smell as sweet but could, in fact, 
turn out to be a thorny cactus. Every one in 
the ｄ｡ｾ･･ｬｩｮｧ＠ hill areas has, for instance, 
great respect-I want you to note, Sir- and 
love for the GOrKha bhasha, presently de-
scribed erroneously by some people as 
Nepali. They also have affection and regard 
for the Script. But they are not prepared to 
call it Nepali language as the name is iden-
tified with the nationality of another country, 
namely, Nepali ... (Interruptions). Sir, the 
Members are entitled to their views. I have 
my views. In fact, the GNLF strongly 
opposes ... (Interruptions). Mr. Chitta Basu, 
when have you joined the Congress Party? 
If you wanttojoin, please apply lor it. We will 
then conSider. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The Member has 
freedom of speech. 

SHRIINDER JIT: Sir, it is my privilege to 
represent Darjeeling and its Gorkha here. It 
is my privilege and my duty to put forward 
their point of view. It may be acceptable to 
people, it may not be acceptable to Mem-
bers, but I have a right to express my view 
very freely and forthrightly, and this is all I 
seek. 

In fact, the GNLF strongly opposes the 
legislative enacted by the West Bengal 
Assembly declaring Nepali as one of the 
State languages. It also opposes its demand 
that the Centre should include Nepali in the 
Eighth Schedule. They want the State Act 
amended and the words 'Gorkha Bhasha' 
substituted for Nepali language. This was, 
indeed, my own stand a/so when / success-
fully contested the Lok Sabha polls of 1989 
and 1991- the first at the invitation of the 
GNLF as Its candidate and the second as a 

Congress(I) candidate with the full backing 
of the GNLF. The point is ... (lnterruptions). 

MR. CHARIMAN: It is not proper to 
interrupt the hon. Member. 

SHRI INDER JIT: Mr. Upadhay, you 
have gone on record about your views on 
Nepali I am not goint to enter into any acr 
mony now and I. want to keep that out. 

I would like to inform the House, and 
more especially fellow-Me'mbers of the 
Congress(I), that the last poll for the Lok 
Sabha and the West Bengal Assembly was 
fought on the basis of a clear and firm under-
standing between the Congress(I), then 
heroically led by the late Rajiv Gandhi, and 
the GNLF. Both the parties backed each 
other's candidates ... (Interruptions) 

MR. CHAIRMAN: You can make your 
point at the end. 

SHRIINDERJIT: Specifically, the GNLF 
not only supported my candidature for the 
Lok Sabha but also the Congress(l) candi-
dates for the West Bengal Assembly con-
stituencies of Siliguri, Phansidewa was, Is-
lampur and Chopra in the 
plains . .. (/nterruptions). Sir, the hon. Mem-
ber, the mover, will have a chance to rebut all 
my arguments. Would the lady Member be 
generous enough and gracious enc:1ugh to 
give me a patient hearing? At the end of it 
she can spurn all my arguments. It is upto 
her, but she must give me a patient hearing. 

The Congress-', for its part, fully sup-
ported the GNLF candidates for the West 
Bengal Assembly from the hill constituen-
cies of ｄ｡ｾ･･ｊｩｮｧＬ＠ Kurseang and Kalimpong. 
The GNLF won all the three Assembly seats, 
defeating in one case a Minister in Jyoti 

Basu's Govemment. Importantly, the GNLF 
put forward in its manifesto its strong oppo-
sition to the declaration of Nepali language 
as an official language of West Bengal and 
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demanded that the name Nepali be substi-
tuted by Go!1(ha Bhasha. ; 

The crucial importance of the Indian 
identity Is basic to our argument. It Is also 
fundamental to India's integrity and unity In 
view of the fact that ourcountry Is contiguous 
to Nepal and has a long unmanned border 
with it. What Is more, the Indo-Nepal Treaty 
of 1950 is unique. We have no such treaty 
with any other country. Mercifully, we have 
not extended such reciprocal facilities to any 
other neighbouring country. Some promi-
nent leaders of Sikkim have been talking In 
terms of "Bharatiya Nepalese" and have put 
forward what Iwouldcallan absurd concept. 
Perhaps, we would also be confronted today 
with two other absurd propositions of "Bhara-
liya Bangladeshis" and "Bharatlya PakI-
stanis", had similar reciprocal facilities also 
been extended to Bangladeshis and Paki-
stanis. Please remember, we already have 
many more Bangladeshis residing illegally in 
India today than the "reciprocal Nepalese". 

This leads us to the pertinent question: 
Would it be right and proper for the Parlia-
ment of India to Include among the national 
languages listed in the Eighth SChedule of 
our Constitution the Nepali language which 
is the language of the "reciprocal Nepali" 
people in India-persons who are here today 
and could be gone tomorrow. We can in-
clude the Nepali language In the Eighth 
Schedule only if these Nepalls come to be 
declared as Indian citizens as in the case of 
the "settled Go!1(has" of India under the 
Darjeeling Accord of August 23,1988 be-
tween the GNLF and the Government of 
India. ' 

Therefore, I would like to ask the mover 
of the Resolution and an those who have 
supported the BIU,Where ia the Gazette 
Notification which confers Indian citizenship 
on the "nq,roca NepalIs"1n India? Kindly 

produce this notification and I shall promptly 
withdraw my opposition to the Bill. In fact, I 
go a step furtherm to inform the House that 
even the GNLF and its supreme leader, Mr. 
Ghlsingh, will gladly extend support to the 
BiB if you can produce such a notification. 

I know there is no such Gazette Notif.ica-
tion of the Government of India till now. 
Therefore, I would strongly plead with all my 
friends h'8re to pause and ponder. Please do 
not support the Bill. It is true that some 
parties have made certain commitments in 
their party manifestos forthe lasttook Sabha 
poll. But their stand, in my view, has been 
unfortunate, unwise and even populist. I 
would urge them to remember that two 
wrongs have never added upto a right. They 
shouid take a fresh look at the issue in the 
light of the views put forward by me on 
behald of my constituency and lakhs of Its 
people. 

There should be no question at all of 
. Including the Nepali language in the Eighth 
Schedule until and unless the "reciprocal 
Nepalis" are formally and officially desig-
nated as Indians through a Gazette Notifica-
tion of the Government of India. Declaration 
of any language as a State language does 
not necessarily give the language the status 
and acceptability of a national language. 
The mover of the Bill should try to get the 
ｾｉ＠ Nepal is· deicared as Indians first. 

Mr. Chairman, Sir, I have already taken 
a iot of time of this august House. But I seek 
your indulgence for a little longer as , am the 
only Memberpresentlng the other side of the 
coin in regard to the Nepali language. The 
entire exercise of those who are "reciprocal 
Nepalis· and are demanding inclusion ofthe 
"Nepali language" in the Eighth Schedule Is 
to enable those people to claim that they are 
.... pa .. and to that extent vlrtuaBy exercise 
dual nationality. Wouldthlsbe In our national 
Interest at a time when leftist and other 
foroes In Nepal are stridently urging Kath-
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mandu to f8CIaim the Oal'jeellng hi. areas 
uptoTeesta river as its territory? In my view, 
we cannot deal with this serious matter rightly 
or casuaUy. (Interruptions) 

Therefore, I urge with all the efT1)hasis 
at my command that H the language of the 
GOfkhas of India is to be included in the 
Eighth Schedulethenthat language will have 
to be the "Gol1tha Bhasha- and not the 
Nepali language. My suggestion would 
emphasize and underline the Indian identity 
of the Gol1tha Bhasha as against1he foreign 
identity of the Nepali language. I might add 
that the suggestion I am making is not a new 
proposition. We have in the past drawn up a 
sharp and meaningful distinction between 
various common languages spoken along • 
our northern and other borders. We have 
given these languages on our side of the 
borders Indian names and Indian identity. 

Take the case of Ladakhi, which is to-
day the language of the people of Ladakh. 
This language is identical to the Tibetan 
language across the border. The script, too, 
Is the same. But we have for long called the 
language spoken by the people of Ladakh as 
Ladakhl and the script used by them also as 
Ladakhl. This identifies the language as one 
belonging to Ladakh and, therefore, to India. 
Likewise, the Bhutias in Sikkim and the 
Darjeeling hill areas speak a language and 
use a script which is the same as Tibetan. 
But the Maharaja of Sikkimpriorto the State's 
merger with India called the language and 
the script Sikkimese to draw a distinction 
between their language and the Tibetan 
language. In the ｏ｡ｾ･･ｬｩｮｧ＠ hiD areas, the 
language has been called Bhutia to assert its 
Indian Identity. Thus, when you speak of the 
Bhutia language, you convey the clear view 
that the language is the language of the 
Bhutlas of India. as distinct from the Ian-
,guage of the Tibetans. 

That, Mr. Chairman, Is not all Every 
country is and needs must be very clear 

about the distinct identity of Its national lan-
guage. Tow other Instances may be cited. 
The people of India's emerald Islands of 
Lakshdweep speak the same language and 
use the sarna script as those of the Maldives, 
namely, OIvehl. But we ,wisely decided to 
emphasise the Indian Identity of the lan-
guage of Lakshdweep and gave the lan-
guage and script a distinct Indian name of 
Mahal. Agaln,the Bangladeshis call their 
language -Bangia Bhasha-and not Bengali, 
as we do In India. This was done with an eye 
mainly on one thing: to draw a sharp distinc-
tion between Bangladesh's national language 
and Bengali, the language of neighbouring 
West Bengal and, therefore, a language of 
India. 

Two other points require to be made In 
. this context. First, today we are proud to 

have Urdu as one of our national languages. 
It Is a fine and beautiful language which I 
chose as my Indian language for graduate 
studies. Urdu is also the national language of 
Pakistan. This enables the people of both 
our countries to share the joys of ghazals 
and mushalras. But I ask: Would we In India 
have included Urdu in the Eighth Schedule 
of our Constitution If the language had been 
called Pakistani? Hence the rationale be-
hind GNLF's strong objection to the inclu-
sion of Nepali as one of India's national 
languages in the Eighth Schedule. There 
would be no problem today if Nepal too had 
given or were to give to its national language 
the name "Gol1tha Bhasha- which, like Urdu 
or, for that matter, English is not identified 
with any nationality. (Interruptions). 

Sir, I am the only Member who is speak-
log against this Bell. So, I must have a 
chance to put across my view. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: I have given you suf-
ficient time. 

SHRIINDERJIT: Sir,l know. Just a lew 
moments mont, Sir. 
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The second point is, as we all know, the 
British Raj greatly respected the prowess 
and fighting qualities of the Nepalis. Conse-
quently, they recruited them in large num-
bers for thair Army under the Raj- and con-
tinUed to do so even after Independence. 
Importantly, however, they called these men 
Gorkhas and the troops as Gorkha regi-
ments and Gorkha troops etc. They also 
called the Nepali language spoken and writ-
ten by these GOrkha troops as Gorkhali, a 
point made by Col. Ram Singh on April 10 
last when he happened to be in the Chair. 
Why? The answer is not farto seek. They did 
this because they wanted to draw a clear 
distinction between their own Gorkha troops 
and those of Nepal! 

Mr. Chairman, Sir, I shall now wind up 
by drawing your attention to an interesting 
fact. The demand for the inclusion of Nepali 
language in the Eighth Schedule is not new. 
It has been raised time and again over the 
past many year. But Delhi has advisedly not 
acceded to it. The demand was raised ini-
tially during Indira Gandhi's time. But she 
refused to oblige. Mr. Morarji Desai as Prime 
Minister understood the problem very clearly. 
Characteristically, he bluntly told a delega-
tion of the All India Nepali Bhasha Samiti at 
Darjeeling on ｾｰｴ･ｭ｢･ｲＲＹＬＱＹＷＷＺ＠ "Nepali Is 
a foreign language.· Further, he saidlhere 
was no question of including it in the Eighth 
ScheduJe. Indira Gandhi was again ap-
proached after her return to power in 1980. 
But she diplomatically declined to oblige. 
What is the reason? The issue is not as 
simple as has been made ｯｵｴｾ＠ the mover 
and its supporters. It has serious, Indeed, 
grave implications .. 

As tI'le representative of the people of 
ｄ｡ｾ･･ｬｩｮｧ＠ in this House, I have the greatest 
regard and affection for the language and 
script of the Gorkha, who are fellow Indians. 
I strongly believethat their language, the 

Gorkha Bhasha, deserves, to be Included In 
the Eighth Schedule. But I am totally 0p-
posed to the inclusion of Nepali language as 
one of our national languages In the Eighth 
Schedule. In fact, West Bengal needs to 
amend its earlier legislation and substitute 
the words "Gorkha Bhasha· for Nepali. The 
Sahitya Academy, too, needs to review Its 
earlier decision of recognising Nepali as 
·one of the major Indian languages·: in 1975 
in the fight of the developments between 
1986 and 1988, culminating In the ｄ｡ｾ･･ｬｩｮｧ＠
Gokha Hill Council Accord. Under this Ac-
cord, the Gorkhas asserted their Indian iden-
tity and refused to be seen as having any link 
with Nepal. 

AI! that I have ventured to put forward 
also needs to be seen In the light of a 
significant but little-known experince in the 
ｄ｡ｾ･･ｬｩｮｧ＠ hills. QUiet and clandestine ef-
forts were made during the last census 
operation to get the people to declare them-
selves as Nepalis instead of 'ndians. They " 
were also sought to be persuaded through 
various fami!iar means and pressures to' 
declare Nepali as their language In prefer-
ence to Gorkha Bhasha. In fact, we discov-
ered during the last general election that 
many "reciprocal Nepalis· had managed to 
get their names included in the electoral rolls 
and had voted. This issue was subsequently 
taken up by Mr. Ghisingh with the Chief 
Election Commissioner in my presence in a 
letter personally delivered to Mr. Seshan on 
July 18,1991. 

Sri, as I said earlier, It is time to pause 
and ponder. We must avoid doing some-
thing in haste and then repent at leisure. 
Nothing must be done which goes against 
the letter and spirit of the DarjeeUng Gorkha 
Hill Conical Accord and the Gazette notifica-
tion of the Govemment of India, dated Au-
gust 23, 1988 according Indian citizenship. 
only to the ·settled Gorkhas- and not to the 
·reclprocal Nepalis. "Nothing must also be 
done which suits the surreptitious strategy of 
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those who are working for Greater Nepal 
from within our country and from across the 
border. 

Sir, the talk of Greater Nepal is not the 
figment of anyone's Imagination. The threat, 
howsoever, feebletodaY,ls very much there. 
Remember, there are powerful forces who 
have not reconciled to the merger of Sikkim 
with India. There are also powerful forces 
who wantto stop India from becoming strong 
and Playing Its due role in the comity of 
Nations. Let not history accuse this Lok 
Sabha of doing something which goes against 
our best national Interest and cou Id very well 
put a question mark over India's integrity 
along its strategic and sensitive northem 
borders. We can ignore this warning only at 
our peril. (Interruptions) I think arguments 
must honourably be met by arguments only 
and not by shouting down. 

Sir, I shall now conclude by sharing with 
the House, the text of an urgent telegram 
sent by the GNLF President, Mr. Subash 
Ghislngh to the Prime Minister yesterday 
with a copy marked to me as the Mp repre-
senting Oarjeeling. (Interruptions) 

PROF. SUSNATA CHAKRABORTY 
(Howrah ): Sir, how can he read his speech 
like this for a long time? 

(Interruptions) 

tAR. CHAIRMAN: Please do not quote 
thattelegram here. Please conclude quickiy. 

(Interruptions) 

SHRI INOER JIT: Sir, these Members 
should deal with the Chair and not with me. 
They should not Interrupt me like this. I will 
not quote the telegram, but I will give a 
summary otthattelegram. He says that !fthe 
Govemment of India is keen and deter-
mined to Include the different Indian lan-

guages In the Eighth Schedule of the Indian 
Constitution, then the GNLF party extends 
its full support except in the case of the 
Nepali language as the said language is 
spoken by the reciprocal people directly 
covered by the Indo-Nepal Treaty of 1950. 
He says that this must not be ｩｮ｣ｬｵｾ＠ In the 
Eighth Schedule. (Interruptions) 

SHRIMATI OIL KUMARI BHANDARI 
(Sikkim): Sir, he has asked for no man's 
land. Will you concede to that? (Interrup-
tions) 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Please conclude now. 
You have spoken for a long time. Shri Yaima 
singh will speak now. 

( Interruptions) 

SHRIINDER JIT: In the final analysis, I 
appeal to all the ｾ＠ on. Members and, partlcu-
larty to the Government, to give serious 
thought to all that I have said. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: You have crossed all 
limits of time now. 

SHRI INDER JIT: Only three more 
sentences. 

MR. CHAIR.MAN: No please. No . • 
SHRI INDER JIT: Three more sen-

tences. 

I say that I and GNLF can never be a 
party to accepting Nepali language which is .. 
a foreign language as one of India's national 
languages. 

MR. CHARIMAN: I have given you 
opportunity to conclude five times. 

SHRIINOER JIT: I am going to lake less 
than half-a-minute. Allow me to conclude. 
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MR. CHARIMAN: No. 

SHRI INOER JIT: I seek your Indul-
gence for half-a-mlnute. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: I have shown suttl, 
cient indulgence. 

SHRIINOERJIT:lwanttoassuretrlends 
on all sides that there is no attempt whatso-
ever to divide the people of thEr area. The 
attempt is only to draw a sharp distinction 
between those who are Indians and those 
who are not Indians but Nepalis (Interrup-
tiOns)" 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Nothing wiD go on 
record. The hon. Member may now con-
clude. Nothing will go on record now. 

SHRI YAIMA SINGH YUMNAM (Inner 
Manipur): Sir, I rise tp support the Bill in the 
name of Shrlmati Oil Kumarl Bhandari, the 
hon. Member of the House. 

Shrlmati Oil Kumarl Bhandari has spo-
ken earlier and dealt exclusively on the merits 
of the Nepali and Manlpuri for inclusion of the 
two languages in the Eighth Schedule of the 
Constitution and I would like to leave it to her 
most of the points raised by Shrl Inder Jit 
which she can clarify and refute In her reply. 

So, I would like to devote more of the 
time in the case of Manipuri of which I have 
more ideas on it and I can give more informa-
tion to the august Hose on this language. 

In respect of ｾ･ｰ｡ｬｩＬ＠ if I am allowed to 
say a few words, I think the hon. Member Mr. 
Inder Jit is very clever. He is trying to mislead 
the House by pointing out some irrelevant 
points in regard to this Indo-Nepali treaty. 
Those are irrelevant in respect of this BUI. 

I would Ilke to mention one Instance. In 

-Not recorded: 

Manlpur. there are manyGorkhalis In Assam 
RiIIea. When we ask them 'What Is your 
language, -they slf1l)ly say "Our language is 
Nepali" It Is very clear. There might be 
Gorkhalis but their language Is Nepali. II is 
very clear. In Manlpur. there are hundreds of 
thousands of Gurkhas. They say that their 
language Is Nepali. 

I do not know how Mr.lnder Jit manages 
to make treaties out of this. I leave It to the 
hon. Member In charge of the Bill to refute ali 
that. 

Now I come to Manipuri. In the case of 
Manipuri. I would like to ask why it was not 
Included at the time when the Constitution 
was drafted or passed. Manlpurwas merged 
with the Indian Union only in 1949 on 15th 
October. So, she had not got a chance of 
sending her representative to say that 
Manipuri language also must be included in 
the Eighth Schedule because Manipur was 
not with the Indian Union. At that time, it was 
a native State under the British rule. Even 
during the-British time, Manipuri was recog-
nised as a language by the Britishel'S. 

Now, I would like to come to the JustifI-
cation part that would be necessary to pres-
ent the facts before the House. There are 
one million people in Manipur who speak 
Manipuri as their mother-tongue. There are 
more than ｨ｡ｬＭ｡ｾｩｉｉｬｯｮ＠ people living In the 
hilly areas who use this Manipuri language 
as their convnon language for communica-
tion purpose. So, byvlrtue of this, Manipurlls 
the lingua franca In the State oI-Manipur. 
Secondly, Manlpurl has been the official 
language throughout. It has been the official 
language even before the ｾｲｩｴｩｳｨ＠ rule when 
Manipur w .. a native State. Manipurl was 
the official language and also the court lan-
guage. Even now. Manipuri is the court lan-

. guage in Manlpur. It Is used In the courts . 
which are subordinate to the High Court. It Is 
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the official language. It is now being codified 
by the Manipur Legislative Assembly to make 
it the official language of the State. So, for all 
practical purposes, it isJhe official language; 
it is used in the courts which are subordinate 
to the High Court. It is the medium of Instruc-
tion and examinations from primary-level 
upto the post-graduate level. These are 
produced in Manipuri in respect of Honours 
in Manipuri up to B.A. Post-graduation, M. 
Phil and Ph. D. There are provisions under 
the Manipur University Act for all these 
subjects. This language has been recog-
nised by the Universities of Calcutta, 
Guwahati, Dibrugarh, Delhi and some other 
Universities whICh I cannot mention. It is, 
therefore, a major Indian language up to the 
Degee Course. 

Sir, the Sahitya Akademi has recog-
nised it as a major Indian language since the 
year 1971. All the Sahitya Akademi Awards 
have been awarded. Uptill now,morethan15 
awardees of this language are there. It has 
its own script. We have got the Manipuri 
Script. At the moment, we use the Bengali 
script. BUI we do have the Manipuri script. It 
is being taught up to Class-VIII. Now it is 
coming upto Class 10th. The Manipuriscript 
Is very much improved now. For some time, 
it was not encouraged but now the people 
hav.e taken up this very seriously, for im-
provement of this scdpt. The doyen of lin-
guists, Dr. Suneeti ｋｵｭ｡ｲｃｨ｡ｴｴ･ｾ･･Ｌ＠ who is 
no more, be once described that this Manipuri 
language is a most developed language of 
the Tibetan-Burman speech family of India. 
And we claim that. 

At present, the languages under the 
Eighth Schedule, most of them are Dravid-
ian,lndo-Aryan and Burman languages. And 
the language of Tibato-Burman is excluded. 
Now It would be proper to include this ｍ｡ｮｾｵｲｬ＠
language from that consideration also. 

As regards the richness of this lan-
guage, I need not say much because aU the 

MelTlbths of this august House, they are very 
much acquainted with the richness of this 
language and almost all the Members, lead-
ers of all the parties In this House, they are 
also agreeable to include Nepali and Manipuri 
in the Eighth Schedule, so that these two 
languages can be given national recogni-
tion. I need not elaborate very much on that. 
In stead of that, I would like to give much 
more time to our hon. other Members to 
speak on this. I would like to give these few 
justifications in support of inclusion of 
Manipuri language. 

Now, I would like to come to the imme-
diate problems being faced in the State of 
Manipur. We have been demanding for the 
inclusion of this Manipuri inthe Eighth Sched-
ule since 1949-50 because when it was 
merged with the Indian Union. it was antici-
pated by the people that after the merger 
with the Union, it will be respected and it will 
be honoured. So, it was a great expectation 
of the people of Manipur. And they have 
been demanding for this. When they have 
lost their patience, the people of Manipur, 
they have organized themselves and they 
deputed their representatives to meet the 
hon. the Prime Minister, the leaders of the 
nation. They have met ｎ･ｨｲｵｪｩＬｬｮ､ｩｾＮ＠ Rajivjl. 
Shri V.P. Singh and then Shri Chandra 
Shekhar. All of them have given their con-
sent. Bu! they could not put up any Bill before 
this House, so that these languages can be 
included in the Eighth Schedule. It took time 
and it was unfortunate on our part. 

But now the people, they are demand-
ing and are agitated now. Earlier, the people 
including women population and people from 
all walks of life, they have resorted to hunger 
strikes. Thousands and thousands 0 people, 
they have resorted to hunger strikes and 
now the students-All Manipuri students-they 
halle taken up the task. Now what they have 
done is that they have blocked; they have cut 
on, they have blacked out. Even, they went 
to the extent that they would. not allow the 
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schools to teach Hindi. They have gone to 
the extent of even not allowing the Hindi films 
to be screened. Any cassette of Hindi or any 
other language under the Schedule is not 
being allowed to be played. They have de-
stroyed them. The whole population is sup-
porting the student community. Now what 
they have done? Taking advantage of this. 
they have now resorted to even destroy. 
damage and even burn buses. A Central 
School bus was burnt. School buses. State 
Transport buses were bumt. As a result of 
this what happened is that the prices sore 
up. In Manipur. the prices of commodities 
are so high that it cannot be imagined. These 
are the sufferings. They are prepared to 
suffer because their demands are not met. 
Earlier. here in Delhi. a batch of persons 
resorted to hunger strike; and in support of 
them. the entire Opposition walked out. 
here. Now. three persons have resorted to 
indefinite hunger strike. that is. fast unto 
death. Yesterday. I went to the hospital. I met 
the Police people also. They have declared 
that their conditions are alarming and very 
critical. I am very much afraid of them. If they 
succumb to that. then Manipur will flare up. 
There are so much fearthat people will suffer 
greatly and the law and order situation will be 
greatly affected. The extremists and the 
underground organisations like PLA. Per-
Pak take ｡､ｶ｡ｾｴ｡ｧ･＠ of this. The employees 
and youth are telling. "You have seen this. 
What is the use of merging with the Indian 
Union? So. come out and let us disintegrate 
and so on-. They have taken advantage of 
this and more harm will be done. Th at is why. 
we are very much afraid of that. 

The agitation is going on now and we 
. are only waiting forthe hon. Minister to reply 

to it. We are anticipation some positive reply 
from him so that this agitation can be called 
off and we can run smoothly. 

'lWould no take much time of the House. 

But, I would suggest one thing. A delegation 
Including myself met the hon. Home Minis-
ter. some three or four days back and the 
hon. Home Minister was very much agree-
able to the inclusion of Nepali and Manipuri 
in the Eighth Schedule. He also mentioned 
about the inclusion of Konkani also. He has 
suggested for convening a meeting of lead-
ers of all the political parties for a consensus. 
I have also mentioned that all the parties in 

. the country have agreed tothe proposal. The 
Horne Minister also replied that in principle 
he had agreed. However. to make it a con-
sensus. he would like to convene a meeting 
of all the leaders of the parties. 

Only the other day. I also with Shri 
Sontosh Mohan Dev and some others met 
the hon. Prime Minister and made a request 
forthe inclusion of Manipuri and Nepali in the 
Eighth Schedule. Hon. Prime ｍｩｮｩｳｾ･ｲ＠ also 
gave us blessir.Js. He informed that he is 
prepared for it. He is agreeable. 

Today in the Press. we have seen that 
a delegation of the National Front and Left 
parties and also leaders of the BJP met the 
Prime Minister who assured that a Bill to this 
effect would be introduced in the next mon-
soon session. So. we are very grateful to the 
Prime Minister for this assurance. I am also 
grateful to aU the.hon. Members of this au-
gust House for expf96sing their support in 
favour of the two languages. that is. Nepali 
and Manipuri. 

While concluding. I will say afew lines In 
Manipuri expressing my gratefulness '0 the 
hon. Members. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI BHOOENDRAJHA (Madhubanl): 
Mr. Chairman. Sir. on behalf of my party and 
myself I support the Bill moved by Shrimati 
.oil Kumali Bhandari. I support this bill to 
include Nepali language in the Eighth Sched-
ule of the Constitution. 
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Mr. Speaker, Sir, I do not want to argue 
but I would like to say that my friend Shri 
Inder Jit ji has raised such questions with 
hard labour, wisdom, and understanding 
which is unnecessary because Gorkhali and 
Nepali are the name of the same language. 
With the development of mankind the lan-
guages also progressed and in that process 
many languages became obscure and many 
new languages came into existence. 

One of the oldest language of the world 
which has been found written in Mahan-
jodaro could not be read upto now because 
its reader ceased to exists so the language 
has also vanished. We are fortunate that the 
most ancient language like Sanskrit still exist 
in our time and it has a history of 5-7 thou-
sand years. Several languages have devel-
oped, some have died, Hindi and been 
developing some-time before the freedom 
struggleto till now. Hindi, which we call Khari 
Boli, is the only language which is under-
stood by most of the people of our country. 
Those who do not speak, can also under-
stand it. So, our parliament has recognised 
it as a language which joins the people our 
country or as a national link language. Be-
sides it, no other language is capable to take 
its place. We have not made so much efforts 
to develop this language as it should have 
been. The pace of its development has 
remained very show. There is a need to 
excelerate it. But some people wantthat only 
the Hindi should prosper and all the other 
languages should not be given due recogni-
tion. I do not doubt on their wisdom. But it is 
like the same as If all the flowers from a 
garland have been taken away and only 
thread remains there. A country can not 
progress like this. Hindi is our most favourite 
language but India is more loved and greater 
than it. There are several ancient languages 
in India. If Hindi becomes a garland having 
the flowers of all languages and if it works to 
join the country, the country and Hindi itself 
can progress more. 

17.00 hrs. 

Mr. ChallT(l8.n, Sir, the mother tongue 
has its own importance. Which is learnt by 
the children from their childhood without aAY 
effort. So, the place of mother tongue Is first 
of all, the fact which has also been accepted 
by the Parliament and it has decided to 
accept it as a link language. Countries which 
have achieved 1 00 percent literacy have got 
it by using their mothertorigue only. We can 
also make It link language in a ce rtain period 
of time, if we have the intention to do this. My 
friend Shri Inder Jit has called Nepal a for-
eign country. Before the treaty of Sugrdl 
between Britishers and Nepal, according to 
which Britishers divided Nepal, my ances-
tors used to study there. He himself has now 
gone to Darjeeling. He made such a long 
speech which was not needed. This erudi-
tion was not needed. This erudition was not 
needed. Nepal is an independent country. 
We have to give full respect to an independ-
ent country. It Is our friendly country. Our. 
History, Geography, Nature, Culture and 
language is same. So why we should be 
afraid of Nepali language. It will work as a link 
language and as a bridge between the people 
of two countries. Why do we take it as 
language which will disunite the country? 
Even then, I do not want to be adamant on it. 
If all the people of ｄ｡ｾ･･ｬｩｧ＠ and Sikkim want 
to give it some other name, I would be happy 
but there is no need of such a erudition. 

.. 
Mr. Chairman, Sir, Maithili language 

belong to this Certagory only, which has 
been Included in the Eighth Schedule of the 
constitution. Besides it, Maithili is the first 
language which was recognised by Sahitya 
Academy. It had been recognised by Cal-
cutta University for post graduate courses in 
the beginning of this Century WhEIO Bihar 
even did not come into existence. At present 
it is taught in seven universities on post 
graduate level. Even after post graduation, 
all the students who are doing their Ph. D. 
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degree have chosen this languages as the 
medium ot their studies. In the entire teral 
area of Nepal border Maithili Is spoken by ｾｉ＠
the people there and It Is a link language of 
people living on both the sides. It helps us. All 
people know the ancient Janakpur. The Dot-
Owara which was annexed with India after 
the Sugoli treaty by the Brltishers Is now in 
my constituency . But Dot-Owara Is regarded 
as a part of Cultural heritage by the people. 
The people go round of it. We need no 
passport to enter In Nepal. So we should 
treat Nepal as a friendly country. 

Mr. Chairman, Sir, constitution amend-
meAt Bill tvas introduced in this regard in this 
House for discussion in1971. It was dis-
cussed for two fortnights, ultimately it was 
postponed on the request of Shrl Raj Ba-
hadur who was the then Minister of Parlia-
mentary Affairs. Because he assured that 
the Government would consider it. It is very 
unfortunate that the Government of India 
has adopted an anti-language attitude. This 
is not a case of opposing Maithili. It is a case 
of opposing language policy. In the census 
of 1921,1931,1951,1961, these people were 
registered as Maithili speaking people. 1941 
census was cancelled due to the Second 
World War. 

I think that the Government of India has 
violated the Constitution? The persons who 
mentioned their mother tongue as Maithily 
but It has been written as Hindi. It Is a 
different thing. The cases in which Maithili 
has mentioned as mother tongue have not 
even been pUblished. Two years back I 
came to know that Its publication had been 
stopped through a secret order. In myopin-
ion, it is a mockery with the Constitution. It is 
a crime. You are talking of providing a new 
right but In the way, you are snatching away 
the existing right too. Who has the authority 
to snatch away the right during the publica-
tion of census. H I ask tor my right. Can you 
refuse for It? I would like from the hon. 

Minister when he will reply, he should keep 
all these things In mind and clarify also all 
these things. The Government of Bihar has 
also colTVTlltted this mistake on the same 
line. The Govemment of Bihar has decided, 
not to allow the Maithili language for ttle 
examinations for Public Service 
Commission.!n the sate conference of the 
Communist Party of India, Bihar., It has been 
passed unanimously that the said decision Is 
not correct and the Govemment should with-
draw it. 

Mr. Chairman, Sir, this Maithili language 
has a rich literature since 12th century. Folk 
literature of Ludic and Shailsh is very popu-
lar. Shailsh means the Leader of the Moun-
tains. People come from far of places and 
enjoy these folk songs. The people have 
been singing these songs for centuries. As I 
have already said that Malthili is taught in 
universities at post-graduate level. In view of 
these fads how the Govemment of Bihar 
has taken such a decision? I think that it will 
impede our development. 

I hope that the Government of India as 
well as the Govemment of Bihar should 

. change their decisions with regard to Maithlll 
language. I hope that the entire House and 
the lovers of democracy will give their full 
cooperation in improving the situation. As far 
as the question ot including it In the Eighth 
Five Year Plan is concemed we had also met 
the hon. Prime Minister. Our hon. friend has 
mentioned about Manipuri. I submit that the 
hon. Minister of Home Affairs should give an 
assurance to the students who are sitting on 
hunger strike so that they may call off their 
strike. You should not give an opportunity to 
anyone to be an opponent of Hindi. On the 
name of Hindi language we should have 
Hindi as a national link languages. No non-
Hindi speaking person should feel It like a 
burden on his shoulder. As far as Maihili is 
concerned: Maithili, NapaH, Orria, Bangle, 
Assamese are aD the languages of one family. 
For example we say 'jeachr In Malthlly, 
'Janehu' In Nepali and 'Jachl' In Bangle. AD 
these languages belong to the same family. 

Mr. Chairman, Sir, the hon. P{lme MIn-
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Ister has also assured us that a decision will 
be taken early in this matter so that some 
action may be taken in this regard during the 
next session. I hope that the youths of Manipur 
who are on hunger strike, will call off their 
strike in view of this assurance, and we will 
solve that issue of language in the Eighth 
Five year Plan. I go beyond It. So I have 
given a notice regarding the Constitution 
Amendment. My Bill Is till under considera-
tion of this House. Last time it was on No.4 
in ballet but this time It is lagging behind. I 
have mentioned in this bill 20 or 25 lan-
guages are Included in the Constitution, it 
will not be a surprise for our country having 
the population of more than 85 crore, be-
cause languages are the heritage of culture 
and the backbone of social life. The inclusion 
of these languages will make our country 
more prosperous and strong. No country 
can be stronger by repressing any mother 
tongue. It will weaken our unity and particu-
larly when thera is an external thraat to our 
unity and integrityfromforeign dividing forces. 
In the end I would like to point out to Shri 
Indarjlt Gupta that there will be no objection 
If his voters from ｄ｡ｾｩＱｩｮｧ＠ and people of 
Sikkimdecide to change the name. But don't 
create a foreign phenomena towards Nepali 
by constantly saying It a foreign language. 
The language Is the same either you say it 
Nepali or Gorkhali, therefore 'foreign' world 
should not be used in It and the hon. Minister 
should assure the House about It. Again 
supporting this resolution I request that all 
the other deserving languages including 
Malthlll may be Included In the schedule. 
With these words, I conclude. 

[English) 

SHRI SRIBALLAV PANIGRAHI (DEQ-
GRAH): Mr. Chairman, at the outset, I thank 
you for giving me an opportunity to partici-
pate in this debate.l also thank Mrs. Dikumar-
III. for having moved. this Bill demanding 
inclusion of two languages-Nepali and 
Manlpuri In the eighth Schedule of the Con-
stitution. 

Sir, there has been no opposition to this 
BID In substance. Thera Is only one dissent-
Ing voice that we have heard and that is of 
our learned friend honourable Shri Ioder Jit. 
He, In fact, laboured hard to prepara his 
speech and put his argument for a different 
name. 

But, as you know, Sir, there has been no 
opposition .to this demand that these lan-
guages-Nepali or Gorkhall or Gorkha 
Bhasha-should be included in the Eighth 
Schedule of the Constitution. These lan-
guages should be Included In the Constitu-
tion as quickly as possible. It Is rather over 
due. 

You know, Sir, Dr. Sunlt Chatterjee was 
the famous linguist of our country. He was 
also the President of Kendriya Sahitya 
Akademi for quite some time. In his Report 
on the Official Language Commission, Dr. 
Sunil Kumar Chatterjee commendect Inclu· 
sion of other Indian Languages. Now, I wiD 
quote what he had said: "The other Indian 
languages are to be added in this Eighth 
Schedule following the wishes of thelrspeak-
ers and their l!'1l)Ortance, viz. Sindhl. and 
Nepali. "These two languages wera racom. 
mended to the given berth in the Eighth 
Schedule. But, in 1967, Sindhl could be 
included and Nepali was left out. I do not 
want to go into the details. Nepali has been 
given recognition by different organisations 
including the Sahltya Akademi in 1974. When 
Sahltya Akademi accorded Its recognition to 
the Nepali language as a major literary 
language and when there was merger of 
Sikkim with India, this language could also 
have been given this Constitutional status, 
visit could have been included in the Eighth 
Schedule. 

In 1911, the Allahabad University had 
introduced Nepali as a vernacular subject. In 
1921, the Calcutta University had introduced 
this. Later on the Banaras Hindu University 
Introduced it. It offers Nepali as a subject for 
Post Graduat and PhD studies. There are 
several other Boards in other places which 
have provided this facility In education Take 
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the example of Central Secondary Educa-
tion Board. Not only this, thereafter, the 
importance or significance of Nepali is well-
established by the fact that, It is the principal 
language of Gangtok and kurscong Stations 
of all India Radio. A special programme is 
being broadcast by the Guwahati Station of 
All India Radio and an internal service news 
in Nepali is broadcast by the New Delhi 
Station also. The Calcutta Doordarshan 
Kendra telecasts a 15-minute Nepali pro-
gramme every day and a few Nepali feature 
fltnes are telecost, New Delhi at times. The 
News in Nepali are broadcast by BBC, Beig-
ing, Moscow and Bangladesh Radios. So, 
the significance of this language is estab-
lished. This is an old language. We had our 
first Census in 1871. 

The predominant population of Darjee-
ling was shown as Nepali speaking popula-
tion. Sahitya Akademi, West Bengal and 
also North East University, have set Vp Nepali 
sahitya Akademi. 

About more than 1 0 million people we 
have got in our country who speak Nepali 
either as their first or second language; it has 
rich literatu reo And particularly, as you know, 
language is a very sentimental subject, very 
sentimental issue. It is spoken in our border 
areas, hilly areas; and that also has its own 
strategy and significance. Sikkim. West 
Bangal, Tripura, Himachal Pradesh, all the 
Hindi States, Assemblies have unanimous 
passed resolution for constitutional status to 
be given to this language. And I also quoted 
from ｓｾｮｩｴｹ＠ ｃｨ｡ｴｴ･ｾ･･Ｇｳ＠ Report. In this 
background, it is now overdue that Nepali 
language should find a place, should be 
included in the eighth SchedUle. 

In this connection, I would like to know 
from the han. Ministerthat, when the Consti-
tution came into being, in the Eighth Sched-
ule we had first 14 languages included; and 
later on the 15th member in this family was 
theSindhi;SindhiLanguagejolnedthisgroup 
in 1967. What was the criterion of selecting 
these languages. 

As you know, India Is a unique country; 
It is a country of very large population, large 
area and also so many communities, castes, 
religions and languages; that way, It cannot 
be Just called a country; It is much more than 
acountry; It is asutH:ontinent; it is more than 
a sub-continent; I call it a mini world; India is 
a mini world with all varieties, culture, lan-
guages, it is our prime duty, all of us, to keep 
the country together In the midst of such 
diverSity; to maintain unity, to ensure unity is 
a great problem. We have also got to ad-
dress ourselves to this. 

Language is such a sentimental issue 
that our leaders immediately after independ-
ence also had to think about it; and there was 
Reorganisation of States; on the basis of 
language. Of course, the wisdom behing it is 
now disputed by some. The wisdom that we 
should have gone for Reorgainsation of 
States or formation of States on the basis of 
language. It gives rise in certain cases to 
lingual troubles and all those things. There-
fore, the wisdom is disputed sometimes. 
But, anyway, we have given due importance 
to the language issue; and I would like to 
quote-I cannot resist my temptalon to quote-
a famous Orieya Poet of my area. Swabre 
Kavi Gangadhar Meher has written Matra 
Bhoiome Matru Bhasha Reya hlrudy Mamta 
Janaminai; Taku Yadi Giani Panara Ganlba; 
Agyana Rahibe Kanhi. Although it is in Oriya, 
It is very lucid, very clear. One cannot claim 
himself to be educated, to be leamed who 
does not develop liking ,love, respect for, (1 ) 
Motherland and (2) mother tongue: Mother-
land and mother tongue are very dear to us, 
very close to our heart. Therefore, we all love 
our mother tongue; and in a country of In-
dia's size and with so many languages, It is 
our duty to develop a spirit of tolerance to all 
languages, not only tf>J8rance but also to 
create a situation so that we respect also 
ｯｴｨ･ｾ＠ languages. • 

We respect other languages. It is a 
question of cO-8xistence of all languages. 
They should have their due place In the 
country, In the Constitution, In the Kendriya 
Sahltya Akademl, everywhere. So, I would 
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say, about the name, let us not do something 
in a hUrry. 

Shrl Inder Jit has also come forward 
with his arguments. Nepali, it is also the 
ancient name, probably it is also Gorkhali, 
but it had got momentum after this agitation. 

SHRI INDER JIT: Originally it was the 
'Khas'language. 

SHRI SRIBALLAV PANIGRAHI: The 
present nomenclature may be different. It is 
not a big thing. 

The hon. Home Minister should sort out 
his problem and this cannot be allowed to go 
on for a long time; nor can we do something 
which will distance another section of the 
community. We have aboutten million people 
who speak Nepali language. There is always 
a solution for any problem. The language 
can be Nepali, Gorkhali, or GOrkh.a 
Bhasha,anything. For language there is no 
opposition. Shri Inder Jit the hon. Member 
from ｄ｡ｾ･･ｬｩｮｧ＠ has also supported this. 
There is no question about it. This problem 
can be sorted out. 

Again, about Manipuri also there is no 
problem. It is the main language, or the 
official language of manipur. It is the first 
language of Manipur, we may say. 

Similarly, Konkani also. Although there 
is no reference to it in the Billi<onkani is the 
main language of Goa. That also deserves 
consideration for inclusion in the eighth 
Schedule. 

What was the criterion for including 
languages in the Eighth Schedule? Of course, 
the main languages are spoken by a size· 
able population. Even on that consideration 
Sindi must have been considered. But now 
neither there is a Sindh Province In India not 
Is It the official language of any State. But 
there are a large number of people who 
speak that language. 

Similarly, there. are other languages, 
which on the same analogy, deserve consid· 

eralion for inclusion in the Eighth Schedule. 

I will now conclude by mentioning one 
more point. As I said, about language, we 
should not be rigid. About the policy of the 
Govemment of India there should be some 
criteria. There should be some basis for 
conSideration. Otherwise also, I am pained 
to understand that there is an agitation being 
carried on now, to pressurize the Govern-
ment for inclusion of Manipuri. Who is sup-
porting it? But at the same, I am afraid, a 
section of the population also is for another 
nomenclature, not Manipuri, but they are 
suggesting something else. 

Therefore, there can be some discus-
sion on this question and this can be sorted 
out and this language may be included. 

Again, there are languages like Mythily. 
Our hon. friend Shri BhogendraJha had also 
mentioned it. Also about Nicobari language 
also there was a reference by our friend, Shri 
Manoranjan Bhakta. It is time now to give a 
fresh look at these Things. these things 
cannot directly go to the Eighth Schedule. 
The Kendriya Sahitya Academy and the 
concerned State Sahitya Academy have to 
accord recognition to these languages first. 
It has to go step by step, ladder by ladder, 
phase by phase. 

On Orissa, we have a language called 
"Sambalpuri language" . It may be called 
"sambalpuri language' or·Kosali language', 
Every body talks about Sambalpur sarea, 
Sambalpurl music, etc. this language has 
got a rich Literature About 10 million people 
speak nepali and we are discussing about its 
inclusion in the Eighth Schedule. The ｓ｡ｾ＠
balpurl language also spread over large 
areas, five to six districts. And about one 
crore population speak this language. This 
language is different from the standard oriya 
language. 

Now we al'8 talking about removal of 
illiteracy and universalisation of primary 
education. the child 'Is to be 

Taught, Is to be given education at the 
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primary stage, In his own mothertongue, 
which is naturally nolthe standard language 
of that place. In the taribal areas , many 
children are not attracted to schools and they 
treat the standard language as a foreign 
language. In the trbal bens, we should make 
arrangement for if1'1)arting education In their 
own mothertongue. 

The Sambalpuri language Is spoken by 
one crore population, spread over five west-
ern districts in Orissa. This language has a 
good and a rich literature. This language 
also should be treated as a separate lan-
guage. The concerned authorities should 
give recognition to this language. First to 
start with Sahltya Academy should gMt 
recognition to this language. 

I do not want to make a lengthy speech 
because several Members are Interested to 
give their viewpoints on this. 

Sir, language Is a very sensitive Issue 
and it is something which can be Instrumen-
tal to strengthen our national solidartty. tt Is 
Uke atom. If not properly ｨ｡ｾＬ＠ it can do a 
lot of harms. The language issue is a very 
emotional issue and a sensitive Issue. SO,It 
is time to give a fresh look at these things. 

According to Science of language, at a 
distance of every one hundred Kilometres, 
there Is some change In the language. Even-
though substantially the same language is 
spoken, there are some variations. you may 
call it as dialect or something Ike that. But It 
Is not the same language that Is spoken 
throughout the State. And wherever Is spo-
ken by a large number of people, but it has a 
literature behind it, it has a distance features, 
of a separate language, then II Is entitled to 
be called a separate language. Therefore, 
the concerned authorities should IlberaDy 
consider these things. And In the process, 
our Iiteratufa, our language and our I1'1Jch 
sought national solidarity. wi! be strength-
ened and not we8kened. 

WIh theses words, I support this 811. I 

--
request the Government to sort out the dif-
ferences with regard to its nomenclature by 
holding discussions ·wlth au concerned. It 
can be, as I said earlier, NepalI orGhorkall or 
It can be both or anything, which Is accept-
able to everyone. If we accept something 
which Is not liked by thousands and lakhs of 
people; then they wiD create trouble. 

17,30hrs. 

[RAO RAM SINGH In the ChaiIj 

A problem Uke this cannot be solved In 
this way. The entire approach has to be 
changed. There should be a via media solu-
tion,ln a country like India of vast dimension. 
Sometimes, we have to go through a proc-
ess of compromise In a situation like this. 
(Interruptions). As I said, people are very 
much agitated; young people are agitated. 
As a resun of the discussion today about the . 
Inclusion fo the Manipuri language In the 
eight Schedule. It is getting unanimous 
support of this House. There should be no 
reason for them to feel disappointed. I re-
quest aU those who are leading the agitation 
to end the hunger strike .• 

with these words, I conclude. . 

17.31 hra 

[English] 

RE: SHRI LlMBA RAM'S WINNING A 
GOLD MEDAl IN ARCHERY IN 

BELlING 

SHRI MANORANJAN BHAKTA (An-
daman & Nicobar Islands): Sir, a news has 
just come that In Belglng, Shri Umba Ram 
has got a Gold Medal In archery. The Minis-
ter of State in the Ministry of human Re-
source Oevelopment(Oepartment of youth 
Affairs and Sports and the department of 
Women and Child Development) Kumari 
Mamata Bane9H is here. We want to con-
gratulate him. From the ChaIr let It go to the 
country and to him that the entire Parlament 
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is one In congratulating Shrilimba Ram, a . MR. CHA.IRtAAN: Mr. Minister, the thing 
tribal, tor thla aucceaa, who has brought Is that two and a halt hours, I am to\d. Ia 
glory to India. this Is a very good news tor aHotted tor the Private Merrbers Bill. It Is 
the country. We should all congratulate him. upto the House. Shall we take up the HaIf-

THE: MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF INFORMATION AND 
BROADCASTING(SHRI AJIT PANJA): We 
must all congratulate him. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Is it an authentic 
news? Well. I must say that this is a matter of 
great honour for the country that Shrilimba 
Ram , a tribal, in a very short duration has 
achieved such proficiency and such remart<-
able standards. It is a matter of great honour 
for he country. I am sure, the whole House 
agrees with me In expending our heartiness 
congratulations to Shri Limba Ram and also 
to the Minister of State in he Ministry of 
Human Resouroe Development (Department 
of Youth Affairs and sports and the Depart-
ment of Women and Child Development) 
underwhoae able guidance, this honour has -
been achieved by the country. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND MINISER OF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF HOME AFFAIRS(SHRI 
M.M.JACOB): I think the Minister can go to 
beiglng and congratulate him. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HUMAN RESOURCE DE-
VELOPMENT (DEPARTMENT OF YOUTH 
AFFAIRS AND SPORTS AND THE DE-
PARTMENT OF WOMEN AND CHILD 
DEVELOPMENT) (KUMARI MAMATA 
BANERJEE): t have already sent congratu-
lations. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF INFORMATION AND 
BROADCASTlNG(SHRI AJtT PANJA): Sir. 
at 5.30 P.M. this H.'-M-Hour Discussion 
was fixed up. 

An-Hour Discussion and then continue with 
the private Members Bill? 

PROF. SUSANTA CHAKRABORTY -
(Howrah): The discussion was extended for 
two hours. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF HOME AFFAIRS (SHRI 
M.M.JACOB): I do not mind because this 
has started at 3.30 p.m. and they expended 
the tid. I am prepared to sit-any number of 
hours. But, I do not know whetherthe House 
will sit like that. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The Half-An-Hour 
Discussion has been fixed. Normally, the 
time forthe Half-An-Hourdiscusslons should 
not be changed. The House is supreme. 
Shri Ajlt Panja, what would you like that first 
we do Half -an- House Discussion? 

SHRI AJIT PANJA: I think, the point Is 
very short. It is regarding one AIR Station 
and delay in opening It. "thehon. Marmerls 
present here, I can Inform him that we have 
arranged to open it and here may not be any 
need of having any discussion. I think the 
han. Member is right In drawing he attention 
of the House in this matter and we have 
arranged to open It on the 15th. 

MR. -CHAIRMAN: I suggest that the 
hon. Member will say something first. Mr. 
Udaylngrao Gabard. 

SHRt UDAYSINGH RAO GAIKWAD: 
We will finish within five mlnut". 
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17.35 hI'S 

HALF-AN-HOUR DISCUSSION 

AIR Station Kolhapur 

(English] 

SHRI UDAYSINGRAO GAIKWAD 
(Kolahapur): Sir, during the last one year in 
two different sessions I had raised the ques-
tion regarding non-functioning of the All India 
Radio Station at kolhapur. On both the occa-
sions, the answers were the same, that is, 
due to non-availability of sta-ff, the A.I.R., 
Kolhapur is not functioning. I can just quote 
the answer which was given on 16.12.1991. 
The question was the same and ｴｨｾｮｳｷ･ｲ＠
given was: "Though the new Radio Station at 
Kolhapur is tehnicallyos ready, necessary 
staff required for manning the station is not in 
position. The Station is envisaged to be 
commissioned into service when the essen-
tial staff required for operation and mainte-
nance of the Station is actually in position· 
This answer was given in 1991. The same 
type of answer, not a word changed, with 
much more information, was given on 
20.4.1992.1 will read the last paragraph only 
which says: The radian station at Kolhapur is 
technically ready and is envisaged to be 
commissioned into service when the essen-
tial staff required for operation and mainte-
nance of the Station is actually in position .• 
They have also stated that As. 84.42 lakhs 
have been spent on building, including civil 
and electric works, and Rs. 176 lakhs have 
been spent on plant and machinery. So, both 
the answers are the same. 

Now I would like to put more right on it. 
It is interesting to note here that the Govem-
ment has admitted having spent about Rs 
2.5. crores on the building, machinery, etc. 

Before June, 1 991, I had visited the All 
India Radio Station at kolhapur and could 
find that the officials are taking trial between 
one to two P.M. announcing: "We are speak-
Ing from Akashvani, Kolhapur", and this Is 
stili going on. This islhestoryforthe last one 

year but nothing practical has come out so 
far. • 

The land was made available about five 
years back with the help of Local Bodies that 
is, Goku Co-operative Dairy, andrelso bun-
galows were given with the help of Mahar-
ashtra Government and also with the initia-
tive of social workers. 

Now, when the construction and instal-
lation work has been finished, the All India 
Radio Station is not being allowed to func-
tion, allegedly on account of no availability of 
staff. . 

May I also bring to the notice of this 
august House and the Government that 
Kolhapur has the poincer place for artistes. 
technicians and film directors. The Mange-
shkarfamilythat is, Lata Mangeshkar, ASha 
Bhonsale, Meana Mangeshkar and Hirdaya 
Nath Mangeshkar, they are all from Kol-
hapur. They started their carrier and les-
soned from Kolhapur.ltsetf Padma vlbhushan 
V. Shantaram is also from Kolhapur. Mr. 
Bhalji 'pendhakar, the renowned Film Direc-
toris also from Kolhapur. Mr Baburao Painter 
who manufactured the first movie carnera at 
Kolhapur is also from Kolhapur. The famous 
play-back singer, Mr. Suresh Wadekar is 
also from kolhapur. Mr Anant Mane, the 
person who has directed more than fifty 
films, besides working as producer, is also 
from Koihapur. I can name hundnKis of 
persons on art side as well as on technical 
side who beiong to Kolhapur. Some of the 
persons who are working today in A. I. R. and 
also in T. V., are also from Kolhapur. 

An idle A.I.R. station is nothing but waste 
of public funds already spent to the tune of 
several lakhs of rupees in the form of con-
struction of building, installation of machin-
ery and other things. However, there is no 
dearth of staff to start functioning the all India 
Radio Station at Kolhapur. " an advertise-
ment is issued, I myself can make available 
hundreds of highly qualified persons from 
Kolhapur and Western Maharashtra. 

The House expects from the very ! 
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cere Minister, who is keeping a close watch 
on the programmes o the A.I.R. andT.V. and 
so also has got administrative vigil which Is 
evident form the fact that In some of the 
cases of bungling even C.B.I. enquiry has 
been ordered, and efforts are being made to 
see thatthe same is c0l11>leted soon, that he 
would not allow the present AIR station to be 
kept In Idle situation, which has made the 
mark of interrogation on the working of his 
Ministry. MyseH, 0 behaH of the people of 
Westem Maharashtra, make fervent appeal 
to this House and the Govemment that due 
attention be given 10 the subject and Ihe 
functioning of A.I.R. Kolhapur must be en-
sured without further loss of time. 

I am told that our hon. Minister is going 
to Kolhapur to decorate Bhal ji Penderkar 
with Dada Suheb Phalke Award. I would like 
to urge upon the hon. Minister - if it is correct 
and he is going to Kolhapur-to kindly show a 
good gesture by announcing the radio sta-
tion and declaring it open as early as pos-
sible and on the same day of his visit. 

[T rans/ation] 

SHRISANTOSH KUMAR GANGWAR 
(Bareilly) : Mr. Chairmen, Sir, I have also 
given my name I would like to say a lot on this 
issue. That is why. I have given my name, On 
the last day of the previous session I wanted 
to raised the same issue but on the request 
of the Hon. Minister I did not raise that there 
were other reasous too, for not raising that 
question at that time but today when I saw 
that a similar question is being raised. I 
would like to ask the hon. Minister that the 
people of Bareilly are also for the last six 
months ..... (Interruptions)" ... 

MR. CHAIRMAN: No, it is about Kol-
hapur .. 

[Eng/ish] 

This is pertaining to Kolhapur. I am 
sorry, this is not zero hour. This is pertaining 
to All India Radio Station to be opened at 
Kolhapur. 

·Not recorded. 

[Translation] 

SHRlSANTOSHKUMARGANGWAR: 
Sir, I would speak about Kolhapur only. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: You are talking about 
Bareilly. 

[Eng/ish] 

This is to allotted. This will not go on 
record. 

[ Trans/ation] 

SHRISANTOSH KUMARGANGWAR: 
Sir, I have mentioned the name of Bareillyfor 
the sake of reference. How many other sta-
tions are there where construction work is . 
complete, but still they are not functioning. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: No, it will not be al-
lowed. 

[English] 

This is a question pertaining to A.I.R. 
station at Kolhapur. This is not the question 
hour that you ask the Minister about all other 
similar cases. He has not come prepared. 
This is only about Kolhapur . 

[Translation] 

If you want to raise any question about 
A.I.R. K Kolhapur as has been put by Shri 
Udaysinghrao Gaikward you can ask, other-
wise not. 

SHRI SANTOSH KUMARGANGWAR: 
Supporting Shri Gaikwad, I would like to 
request the Hon. Minister that he should 
make an announcement that the A.I.R. Kot-
hapurwiU be in operation before ShriGaikwad 
reaches Kolhapur. 

[English] 

THE MINISTER OF STATE OF THE 
MINISTRY OF INFORMATION AND 
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am grateful to the hon. Member for bringing KoIhapur and the gr4lat men who were born 
thIS hall-an-hour dl$CUsslon. 1 personally there andWOf1(ed therem thlscreatlveart we 
round, atleraramlning lt1e ,lie, that we should . are oertaiAly Joint to do so on the 15tt) and I 
have inaugurated this station much earlier, I do . not think that there will be any further 
examineditandUoundthalthedifficuhywas delay in iRagYration. But, Sir, I win only 
that as suggested by the han. Member giving request all concerned that as there 18 only 
open advertisement for taking people In all short otice notice and as all ｰｯｾｳ＠ are not in 
posts is not within the power of the Ministry our hands, we Will start with a skeleton staff 
of Information and Broadcasting. Some are and already my Ministry bas started taking 
U.P.S.C. posts, some are S.S,C. posts and steps so that other posts are advertised by 
some are to be recruited according to certain the appropriate authority and they are re-
pattem. I.found that a total of 108 posts have cruited. And, therefore, Sir, Ida not think any 
been ｰｲ､ｐｯｾ･､＠ , from Station Director upto further discussion on this would be required. 
Security Guard and others. h is also found On 15th of this month we wiH be able to 
that the total cost to be incurred for this inaugurate this station. In the month of May 
project Is Rs.3,21 ,25,000. This Is going to be the Shahdul Radio Station in Madha PradeSh 
one of the uptodate projects in All India is going to be inaugurated and in the month 
Radio. This was technically ready since of may, on the 1 st of May itseH we have been 
December, 1991. As the hon Member said, able to commission six radio Stations - -
one hour announcements are being made Kurnool Radio station in Andhra Pradesh. 
because sometimes testings are required to 
see that the radio station has settle down 
and everything is functioning well. But as 
suggested by the hon. Member, on the 15th 
of this month I am personally going to Kol-
hapur in order to decorate Shri Bhaiji 
Penderkar, who has been given the Presi-
denfs award, as announced by the presi-
dent - - the Dada Sahib Palke Award,the 
highest decoration which could be given so 
far as the information and Broadcasting 
Ministry is concerned, in this creative art. 
And, therefore, on that day, the hon. Member 
would be pleased to know, that we have 
already arranged toinaugurate the Kolhapur 
Radio Station. The great neritage of kol-
hapur is well-known. Sir,as suggested by the 
hon. Member, we have already arranged for 
the Inauguration of this very station, of course, 
with a skeleton staff as at present because 
all staff could not be recruited. But, Sir, wnh 
a skeleton staff we will be able to start the 
station and t was in favour of it. sower. my 
senior officers of Ministry of Information and 
Broadcasting; they are also in favour of 
starting this which a skeleton staff which we 
have arranged ans we are going to inaugu-
rate it on 15th along with the decoration of 
Dada Sahib Palks Award, whlch Is to be 
given to. tbis great man who worked in Kol-
hapur. as a man from Kolhapur - Bhalji 

SHRI HARt KISHORE SINGH 
(Shoehar): The home. Minister should con-
fine himself only to the question, he should 
not go beyond that. If the Minister wants to 
enlighten the House on other things .... 

SHRI AJIT PANJA: I want to make the 
point that the delay is not intentional, we 
were at it. That is why we are saying that on 
the l.st of My - - only seven daysago - - we 
have been able to commission six Radio 
stations - - one at Kumool in Andhra 
Pradesh, oneat Hospet in Karnataka, o'ne at 
Raigarhin Madhya Pradesh, one at Akola in 
Maharashtra, one at Patiala in Punjab and 
one at Sawai Madhopur Rajasthan. On 15th 
a new Radio Station at Shahdol in Madhya 
Pradesh will also be inaugurated andtomor-
row I am going to Kuroool to make a formal 
Inauguration of this Andhra Pradesh Radio 
Station, also waiting like Kolhapurfor a long 
time. 

Sir, with the inauguration of kalhaplI( 
radio station, this will became the 135th 
Radio Station. In regard. to broadcasting 
facilitie$,. thenumber of full-flagged stations 
i$ 127, rEllaying centres are auxiliary centres 
and exclUSive VBI Commercial 2, 2 ｡ｾ＠ 3. 
The Respectively the total number is 134. 
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ISh. Ajlt PanjaJ . 

With the inauguration of Kolhapur, it will be 
135. With the completion of the Seventh 
Plan schemes the total number in the coun-
try will be 205. Also I wanted to cover a little 
bit 0' my hon. 'riend'squestion as to whether 
anything is being opened. Immediately this 
is being made ready, we ｡ｾ＠ tryi'1g to inaugu-
rate it as quickly as possible for the benefit of 
the people at large. This is my submission. 

MR. CHAIRMAN (Rao Ram Singh): Mr 
Gaikad, would you like to ask for auy clarifi-
cation? 

SHRI UDAYSINGRAOGAIKWAD: Most 
of the questions are covered. I am very much 
thanderuJ to the hon. Ministerfor his gesture 
of opening of this Kolhapur Radio Slation on 
the 15th Qf this month. 

(Interruptions). 

SHRI AJIT PANJA: I will be inviting the 
hon. Member also if he is interested to come 
to the inauguraiion function of the kolhapur 
Radio Station on the 15th. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Are you inviting only 
Mi. Gaikward or are you inviting some other 
people also? 

AN. HON. MEMBER: Air ticket will be 
provided ｢ｹｴｴｾ＠ han. Minister. (Interruptions). 

17.50 hrs 

CONSTITUTION (AMENDMENT) BILL 

(Amendment of Eighth Schedule)-Contd. 

[English] 

MR CHAIRMAN: Now, we resune the 
discussion on the Private Member's SlIl. Shrl 
Hari Klshore singh. 

[ Translation] 

SHRI HARI KISHORE SINGH 

(SHEOHAR): Mi'. Chairman, Sir,l am very 
much thankfuUo you for giving me an oppor-
tunitytospeak on such. an inportaJltsubject. 
I was listening my !fiend lndrajeet ｾＮ＠ I am 
surprised that the ｾｲｩｯｵｳ＠ Member \lke hln) 
has altooether diHerent views on this suI; 
)eel. We are surprised tp know his vialNS on 
the Issue of unity andinlegrity of the country; 
We have been strengthening the bonds of 
our unity on the basis of our cultural unity 
spread over from Himalayas to IndianOcean. 
Our country is full of aU sorts of diversities. 
There are many languages and dlafecls and 
the people belonging to various ｲ･ｊｩｧｩｯｾ＠ live 
here. We have been trying to strengthen the 
unity of our country which we have gal in 
inheritance on the basis of these diven.ities. 

It is often said that the unity of our 
country has been weakened with the formu-
lation of States on the basis of language. 
Had not the States been organised on the 
basis of language the power, which wanted 
to divide the country. could have played a 
havoc and it would have been difficult to 
control those powers. 

The Bhartiya Janta Party has adopted a 
healthy approach so far as .inclusion of 
Manipuri and Nepali language in tne Eighth 
Schedule of the Constitution is concerned, 
Indrajeetji Has raised manytechmcal peints.. 
He is a leaned man. I want to tell him that the 
script of Nepalj lang uage is Dev Nag ri whiclJ 
is also the script 01 Hindi and many other 
languages of the country'. We can IlOj take 
Nepali as E; foreign language. My constitu-
ency and that of Sl"lri Bhogendra Jhaisclose 
to Nepal. A number of Nepali people live 
there and much of them are not Gorkhali 
The people of Indian origin speak Nepali 
there. The demand of giving recognitiOn to 
Hindi is being raised in the Parliament of 
Nepal. I do nol know why such sentimental 
ｩｾｳｵ･ｳ＠ are ｲ｡ｾ･､＿＠ What is the cbjectiordn 
giving recognition to the other languages 
spoken in ottler parts of the country? Why 
are they compelled to go on an agitation. 
have you ever thought about it? When the 
States were organised an the basis of lan-
guage. people had objected to that and afew 
people stili object to it. Have you ever tho ught. 
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why the man Uke Pattam Shrlramu talt •• 
necessary to invnolate himself. MIdI? Ua-
harashtra was formed, then al&0811 agb.tlot'l 
was launched for it and at least 17 people 
had lost their lives In It. Fire was opened In 
Bombay. Was that necessary? It Is a sol1 of 
challenge to ourparfiamentary syster:n. Much 
discussion is held on the question of the 
unity of the country. What Is the criteria to 
bring about unity of the country? Will we see 
the unity of the country with a narrow mind? 
Can not we find a solution to these sentimen-
tal problems by discussion under the parlia-
menary system? Why does it become nec-
essary to launch an agitation? Why some 
body feels it necessary to go on hunger 
strike? I want to go Into the polleital back-
ground of the situation In Manipur, The 
consequence of what the Congress men are 
doing will be faced by the whole country. 
They are doing the politics of horse trading 
there to save their Govemment. The recog-
nised language of that State Is not being 
included in the Eighth Schedule. You may 
call Gorkhalito Nepali, but Idonotwanttogo 
Into the history of the language. I am not a 
scholar like Indrajeet ji, but I want to make It 
clear that Nepali has now acquired a clear 
iclentlty. The Nepali people are living in India, 
they have been given the citizenship of India 
and lakhs of Indian people live in Nepal. The 
people of my own area live in Nepal and if 
they are given the citizenship of Nepal, only 
then recognition will be given to Hindi there. 
People speak Hindi In Nepal also. One should 
not adopt such a narrow attitUde. Mr. Chair-
man, Sir, I want to submit that Nepal Is our 
neighbouring country and it Is very close us. 
The world is changing very fast. It has been 
our friend for many years. The disintegration 
of Soviet Union and the process after disin-
tegration there and the changes in the world 
scenario should not be overlooked. Keeping 
that in view, and our own diversities, and 
specialities, which have been the basis of 
the unity of the country, It is necessary that 
the sentiments regarding language should 
be respected for strengthening the unity of 
our country. I want that Nepali and Manipuri 
should be included in the Eighth Scheduie of 

- , 

L"lIe Constitution. I finnly support It on behalf 
01 the Janta Oal also. 

[English] 

SHRI GOPI NATH GAJAPATHI (Ber-
hampur): Sir, the Bill to amend the Constitu-
tion of India for Inclusion of Nepali and 
Manipuri languages in the Eighth Schedule 
of the Constitution is perhaps a non-contro-
verslal as well as an il1l>0rtant Issue. The Bill 
moved by the hon.lady Member Shrimati Oil 
Kumari Bhanda·riji deals with an issue which 
has engaged the attention of all the major 
partIes of the country. 

The demand for inclusion of Nepali 
language in the eighth Scheduie took the· 
shape of a popular movement in 1972, when 
74 Members of Pariiament.Submitted ajoint 
memorandum to the Union Government in 
this regard. The demand received an added 
inputs in an All India Conference on Nepali 
held at Gangtok on 11th and 12th June, 
1990 delegates belonging to different parts 
of th90country and also Members of Parlia-
ment representing major political parties like 
to Congress-I, CPI, CPM, Janata Oal, BJP, 
Forward Bloc and some ruling regional par-
ties unanimously resolved to demand the 
inclusion of Nepali in the Eighth Scheduie 
and worked for its fulfilment. Nepali can be 
said to be the daughter language of Sanskrit 
and has also close affinity with Hindi, Ben-
gali, Gujarati and Marathi. This Modern Indo-
Aryan language in spoken by overten million 
Indians. It is an official language of Sikkim 
and West Bengal Governments also. It was 
recognised by the Allahabad and Calcutta 
Universities as early as 1911 and 1918 re-
spectively as a subject of study in schools 
and CC)llages. 

18.00 hrs 

Both Nepali and Manipuri have been 
recognised by the Sahitya Akademi as weD. 
Manipu ri is the official language of the State 
of Manipur. There has also been a consis-
tent demand for inclusion of Manipuri lan-
guage In the eighth Schedule of the Consti-
tution.1 therefore request the Govemmentto 
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. give a sYlT()athetlc consideration to this 
legitimate issue. 

BefQre concluding, I wish to subh,lt to 
this august house a couple of sentences of 
the Nepalese language forwhich I will myself 
act as the translator. 

Merokatlrlstadar hero Nepal Deshkonu 
Huncho, 

Arumoketakerl Delchun, Nepali Bolera 
AyekoChu . 

. Tesa/Iae, Molal dherai Khusi hun-thyo, ki, 
NepaltBashaPani, Harnaro Sammbidhan 

ko, AAth-wa SChedule rna, Mi/ayo Jaye. 

In other words, I h.ave quite a few rela-
tives from Napal From child-hook I have 
been speaking Nepali at home. Nothing will 
give me more pleasure than find Nepali 
Included as an official language In the Eighth 
Schedule of our Constitution. 

Finally, the controversy on the nomen-
clature of the language, whether to call It 
Nepali or Gorkhall, can perhaps be sorted 
out by carrying out a dialogue and having 
general consensus between the concerned 
groups to arrive at an amicable statement. 

With these words, I conclude. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Next, I call Prof. 
Susanta Chakraborty. 

PROF. SUSANTA CHAKRABORTY 
(Howrah): Thank you, SIi-. I rise to support 
the Constitution (Amendment) Bill. 

SHRI MANORANJAN BHAKTA (Aan-
daman & Nicobar Islands): Sir, for how long 
the House will continue to sit? 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The tlme-llmlt of two-
and-a-half hoUf'S comes to an and at 18.22 
hours. It,wlll continue up to 18.22 hours. 
. Before that, the Minister has to intervene and 

. then Shrimatl Oil Kumari Bhandari has to 
give her reply. 

(Interruptions) 

MR. CHARIMAN: If all of you speak at 
the same time. \ cannot understand. What 
are you saying. Shri Manoraian Bhakta? 

SHRI MANORAJJAN BHAKTA: I am 
saying that after him, if you allow the Minister 
to intervene, that will be all right because 
some agitation is going on now. From his 
reply, It may be possible that the people will 
be satisfied. Thereafter you can adjourn the 
House and next time the other speakers can 
speak; she can reply to it subsequently. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: That is what I said. In 
any case it is doing to be there up to 18.22 

SHRIMATI OIL KUMARI BHANDARI 
(Slkklm): Please give some more time. You 
have stated that it will go up to 18.22 hours. 
That will not do. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The time was already 
extended by two hours. And the two-hours 
period is also coming to an end. . 

SHRIMATI OIL, KUMAR I BHANDARI: I 
have to give my reply also. The minister will 
take time. (Interruptions) 

MR: CHAIRMAN: I am prepared to ad-
joum the House because there is no quo-
rum. I am prepared to adjourn the House 
now. 

SHRI YAIMA SINGH YAMNAM(lnner 
Manipur): Let the Minster intervene. (Inter-
ruptions) 

SHRIINOERJIT (OARJEELlNG):On a 
point of order. This is an extraordinary situ-
ation. Sir, you have yourself taken notice of 
Quorum. I do not know whether It was raised. 
(Interrup.tlons) 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Let the Quorum bell 
be rung. Now, there Is Quorum. Prof. Susanta 
Chakraborty to speak now. 

PROF. SUSANTA CHAKRABORTY 
(Howrah): Sir,l rise to support the Constitu-
tion Amendment Bill moved by Shrimati Oil 
Kumari Bhandari. demanding recognition 01 
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Nepali and Manlj)uri languages for Inclusion 
In the Eighth Schedule of our Constitution. 

sir, today Is 25th Valsakha and it is the 
Birth Day orShrl Rablndra Nath Tagore. In 
his famous poem "Bharat Tertha· he worte: 

-He morchitta Purma tirthe }agore dhire 
AI 8harater Mahamanver Sagar tira" 

Awaka myhaart, slowly awakabytha side of 
India's ocean of Predates. Ha Continuad: 

"Hethay AlYa Hethay AnalYa Hathay 
Dravid chin Shak, Hun, Oaf 

Pathan, Moga/, EK daha halo lin" 

n is an Inspiration to those who recog-
nizes the oneness of our country;the great-
ness of our country. And, at the same time, 
It is a IeI"$8ll for those who want our country 
to be divided, who demand and echo the 
voice of GNLF and want that the unity that Is 
there In India should be destroyed. 

Sir, In this great country of ours, there is 
a good number of Nepalis and they have 
their own language. The demand is to ex-
pres. thelTlS8lves In their mother tongue 
through India. The demand is for recognition 
Of this great language in our Constitution, 
And that Is only a natural demand because 
this Is the language in which we call our 
mother';this Is the language In which we 
express ｯｵｲｳ･ｬｶｾｳ［＠ this is the language In 
which we dream and this is the language In 
which mothers Sing the lullaby. We shall look 
at this issue In this splnt. H It Is seen in this 
spirit, the ｾｳｰｬｲ｡ｴｬｯｮｳ＠ of the people who 
speak Nepali or Manlpurl would be requested 
as a Just an aspiration; and It is because of 
this, they ore agitating outside. We all know 
that Nepali language is a recognised lan-
guage in West Bengal. EVen upto the Post-
Graduate level, education Is being imparted 
to the students in NepaUlanguage. We know 
that Nepali and Manipurl possess all the 
criteria and all the qualities that a language 
should fulfil in order to be a national lan-
guage,ln order to be included In the Eighth 
SChedule. So, It is time for us to recognise it. 

We have dilated upon it, various times Inthis 
august House; but till now,· we have not 
come to a decision, though Sanhlty Acad-
emy recommended Its recognition. The 
States of Slkkim, HImachal, Tripura and also 
the State of west Bangal have demanded Its 
inclusion In the Eighth Schedule. But,tlllnow, 
the Government is sleeping overthe matter. 
Any delay in the process will not help us in 
any way. So, I would request the Home 
Minister to resolve the issue. We may put 
forth many arguments thatthere are so many 
languages today demanding recognition I 
wan Molthly to be included; and Konkani 
should be given due attention. There are 
other languages also. But, since certain things 
are not done, we cannot delay the process. 
Now, ｴｨｾ＠ demand has ｾＮ＠ made. 

We are almost speaking In one voice I 

except Shrl tndel' JIt, who echoed the voice t 
-I have already said-of Shri Subash Ghising, 
who regarded that Nepali is a foreign lan-
guage. 1f it Is regarded In this way, then, 
Bengali which is the official language of 
Bangladesh can also be regarded as a for-
eign language in our country. That is notthe 
Care. That logic cannot go too far. That 
analogy cannot go·too far. Sir, I would re-
quest Shri Under Jitto reconsider his views. 
I would again request the Home Minister to 
give thought over thiS matter. Already the 
students are agitating and fasting. We have 
already heard that some persons are in a 
dying condition. This cannot go on. India 
cannot be divided like this. To make It united, 
we should do justice to the just aspirations of 
.the people. 

With these words, I again support the 
Bill and thank you for giving me oppartunlty. 

[frans/ation]' 

PROF. RASA SINGH RAWAT(Ajmer):I 
want to speak for two minutes. 

[English] 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Time is not there. The 
House has taken note of the iact that a 
number of people are on ahungerstrlke. So, 
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the ｍｩｮｾ＠ should speak. Tn. position is 
that the House has to adJoum at 6 .• ｾ＠ p.m. I. 
would raquest the. MinIster to kindly inter-
venenDW. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRYOFPARUAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
AND MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MiNIS-
TRY OF LAW, JUSTICE AND COMPANY 
AfFAIHS(SHRI RANGARAJAN 
KUMARAMANGALAM): Sir. may I have your 
permission to speak? I understand that a 
ｮｾｭ｢･ｲ＠ of speakers are there on aU sides 
who want to speak on this sensitive issue. I 
also understand that the time allotted fo this 
Biii is aiready getting over. If you could 
extend the time to discuss this Bill-it does not 
mean sitting late today-for two hours more, 
'hen, the next time when it comes up, it can 
be discussed further. Meanwhile the Minis-
ter may intervene, 

MR. CHAIRMAN(RAO RAM SINGH): 
The proposal from the hon, Minister for 
Parliamentary Affairs is that there are stili a 
number of speakers who wish to. participate 
in .this discussion and so the time allotted for 
this Bill may be extended. 

Initially. three hours and thirty minutes 
are allotted; then the time was extended by 
two hours. So, totally five hours and thirty 
minut8$ are allotted. Shall I suggest that the 
time forthis discussi.on may be extended by 
another one hQur ｯｮｾｯｵｬ､＠ you like to .have it 
for two hours? 

SOME HON. MEMBERS: Two nours. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: De I take it ttlat I have 
, the pleasure of the House that the time be' 

extended by two hours for this discussion? 

SOME HON. Members: Yes. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The Minister.may J;lOw 
make an intervention at ｴｾｬｩｳ＠ stage. Then; the 
debate wUl Carry 00. 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRYOFPARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 

AND MINISTER OF STATE IN THE MINIS-
TRY OF HOME AFFAIRS (5HRI M.M. 
JACOB): Mr. Chairmen, Sir, tamgratefulto 
you for permitting me to Intervene at this 
stage even though some of the ｾ｡ｫ･ｲｳ＠ are 
yettc participate. Of cOurse. 'shaH be reply-
ing to the entire gamut of problems that are 
thrown up before the House on the nexfday 
when weare spending anothertwo hours on 
this BiD. 

The Bill moved by Shrlmatl DO'Kumari 
Bhandari' has· drawn attention to a very 
important item and we all agreed that we 
sl\Ould have.an urgent consideration. At the 
same time, as you know. we have fifteen 
languages in the Eighth Schedule .. Fourteen 
ｬ｡ｮｧｾ｡ｧ･ｳ＠ were first included andthen Sindhi 
was added in 1967. The trend of thought 
came up at thai time was that if you open up 
this Eighth Schedule to other languages. 
then it may he an unending process which 
may have far-reaching col1l>lexities and 
problems. However, this matter came up 
again and again. I see very valid reasons for 
projecting the cause of Nepali. Mr. tnder Jit 
came up with another versloo for Gorkha 
Bhasha. 

Ｎｾ＠ the same time. severallriends from 
Ma:nipur came and caUed on me earlier. 
They tried to put forth powalful argument 
that Manpuri is a language of ｔｩ｢･ｴ｡ｮｾｂ｡ｲﾭ
man group and this is going to be an asset to 
India if we consider this language also as a 
majornatlonallanguage. Arguments are very 
powerful and forceful' do not say 'no'. But 
one particular situation is that there is no 
criterion laid down so far for inclusion of a 
language in the Eelght Schedule. Do we go 
by States speaking a language? I mean a 
State language. For example in Sikkim. the 
State langlJage is .Nepali. Anothenpeaker 
from Goa said that It is Konkanl in Goa. In 
Goa, people speak Konkanl. That Is ac-
cepted as a State ｬ｡ｮｧｵ｡ｧ･ｾ＠ In Manipur. they 
have accepted Manipuri as! a State ｬ｡ｮｧｵｾ＠
and so on and so forth. So, thel9 are about 
ten representations before the Go¥emment 
from various parts of the country, Including 
Rajasthani. Konkani. Dogri. Bhojpuri, Uaith-
ilt, Bodo, Nepali; GorkhaH and Ohatkl. To-
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day, Mr. Manoranjan Bhakta mentioned to 
me about the Nicobarl also. 

SHRI SRIBALAV PANIGRAHI (Deog-
arh): I mentioned about Sambhalpurl also. 

SHRI M.M. JACOB: As you know, my 
humble submission Is that luckily we are 
attending to the languages for the develop-
ment of the languages. When I reply all the 
details, lean say. Twenty-two languages are 
accepted by the Sahitya Academy. Mrs. 
Bhandari was able to bring out salient fea-
tures of all those languages, especially, the 
Nepali where the Sahitya Acad&1T1y has 
accepted that this is a language for higher 
education; it is accepted by the State. She 
was able to enumerate several. criteria. So, 
also, is with Manipuri. And three State Gov-
ernments have passed a rssolutlon. I also 
noted that. I am not opposing it. What I am 
telling is that I See the background. That is 
very important. But at the same time, you 
must allow us-'us' means this House-tothink 
about it more seriously in the sense that 
various viewpoints have come. We may be 
able to shop with two or three languages 
perhaps. There are various options, like you 
abolish th e Eighth Schedule itseH and say 
that there is no schedule. ａｬｩｬ｡ｮｧｵ｡ｧ･ｾ＠ will 
receive attention and proper care in this 
country. 

SHRIMATI OIL KUMARI BHANDARI: 
In a democracy, I hope the wishes of the 
people are honoured and more Legislative 
Assembliesmeans lot of wishes of the people 
are there representing the whole of the State. 
Sir, they are four States and not one State. 
They are all unanimously forthe inclusion of 
tl1e Nepali language. So, I ferment hope 
that... 

MR. CHAIRMAN: That is what the Min-
ister is saying, Mrs. Bhandari. 

SH.RI M.M. JACOB: What I am trying to 

... 

say is Ihallhere are various options, I you 
have to think about the final analysis. There 
Is not only one option. Some people wiD say 
to continue the same thing. Some other 
Members will say to add X,Y and Z lan-
guages also the Eighth Schedule and stop 
with it. Somebody else will say, 'After all' it is 
a trouble scrap the Eighth Schedule and 
allow every language to be developed.' This 
is a country with 1600 languages and dia-
lects. You cannot forget it. But at the same 
time, I note with seriousness and I am con-
vinced about the very genuine demands and 
the Government is also aware of it. The 
Ministry is also working at it. The immediate 
thing which we can go for now is an all-party 
meeting of leaders to discuss about the 
modalities and in ｰｲｩＮｬ｣ｩｰｾＬ＠ I agree that we 
have to actively take up the matter. Manipuri, 
Nepali and Gorkhali... 

SEVERAL HON. MEMBERS: Not 
Gorkhali. 

SHRI M.M. JACOB: You settle It then, 
that is, when we discuss. I cannot discuss 
the areas of contradiction at the moment. Let 
us all meet together and decide how best we 
can sort out the problem. At the moment, I 
also appeal to those young people from 
manipur who are on hunger strike, on the 
basis of the language demand, to withdraw 
their agitation and allow the political leaders 
of this countrY to have a mature thought 
about how best we can come to a final 
decision about this language issue. Thank 
you. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: The House stands 
adjoumedtomeetagainat 11 amonthe 11th 
of May, 1992. Wish you a very happy week 
end. 

18.21 hra 

The LaI< Sabha then adjourned tin Efeven 
of the Clock on Monday, May II, 1992/ 
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