
6333 Written A...,.,er. AUGUS'l 23. 191111 Written Aft6W6r8 6334 

Commonwealth Court of Appeal 

3001. Shri Bhagwat Jha Azad: 
Shrl M. L. Dwlvedi: 
Shri S. C. Samanta: 
Shri Subodh Hansda: 

Will the Minister of Law be pleas-
ed to state the stand of Government 
in regard to the proposal for a Com-
monwealth Court of Appeal which 
was motted in the last Common-
wealth Law Minister's Conference 
held in London? 

The Minister of State in the Minis-
try of Law (Shri C. R. Pattabhi 
Raman): India objected to the 
subject of a Commonwealth Court of 
Appeal being placed on the agenda 
of the London Conference. At the 
earlier Conference at Canberra, India 
had opposed this proposal according 
to Government's instructions. The 
majority of the Commonwealth coun-
tries supported India's stand. Con-
sequently, this subject was not 
included in the agenda of the London 
Conference but was informally dis-
cussed outside the Conference by a 
few countries interested in setting up 
such Court. India did not participate 
in this informal discussion. 

Scarcity of Ponltry Feed in Delhi 

3002. Shri Bhagwat Jha Azad: 
Shri M. L. Dwivedi: 
Shri S. C. Samanta: 
Shri Subodh Hansda: 

Will the Minister of Food, Agricnl-
ture, Community Development and 
Cooperation be pleased to state: 

(a) whether there is a great scarcity 
of poultry feed in the capital; and 

(b) whether efforts have been 
made recently to increase the avail-
ability of the feed? 

The Deputy Minister in the Minis-
try of Food, Agriculture, Community 
Development and Cooperation (Shri 
Shinde): (a) No. But the price at 
which It was available recently was 
very high. 

(b) Yes. To increase the avail-
ability of poultry feed in Delhi at 
reasonable price a poultry feed com-
pounding mil! has been set up in the 
Cooperative Sector, with Govern-
ment of India assistance and ingredi-
ents such as molasses and rice polish 
have been made available at con-
trolled prices. Besides maize receiv-
ed under World Food Programme 
has also been supplied to the mill. 
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