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U a  et I M p  Ir t t a n y  «■  I m r t i

1841, Shri V. I i U m m m W ; W ill 
the Minister o f Ita u o t  be pleased 
to state:

(a ) whether Government are aware 
that there ha* been enormous Ion  o f 
foreign exchange on exports shipped 
on consignment basis due to the res­
trictions imposed by the Reserve 
Bank of India on the repatriation of 
exchange earnings within six months; 
and

(b ) if so, whether Government pro­
pose to extend the period o f repatria­
tion?

The Deputy P r im  Minister and 
MlnWur o f Finance (Shri Morarjl 
Deeal): (a ) While foreign exchange
earnings have to be normally repat­
riated within six months. Reserve 
Bank of India allows extensions of 
time on reasonable grounds. Gov­
ernment do not agree that the 
requirement to repatriate export 
proceeds within the specified time 
lbnit has resulted in loss of foreign 
exchange.

(b ) No, Sir.
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Financial laatttntieM

IS tt. Shri 8. B. OaaMol: WiU the
Minister of Ptaanee be pleased to 
state:

(a ) the guarantee provided by the 
Central Government to various 
financial institutions against the 
advances made to specified concerns; 
and

(b ) the terms of guarantees so 
given?

The Deputy Prime Minister and 
Minister o f Finance (Shri Morarjl 
Desal): (a ) and (b ). Information ia
being collected and w ill be laid an 
the Table o f the House.

Publication of Inetrnctlons meant fee 
Income-Tax Officials

1844. Shri S. B. Damanl: WiU the 
Minister o f Finance be pleased to 
state:

(a ) whether there is any proposal 
to publish Departmental instructions 
issued to the Income-tax Officials with 
a view to enlighten public and keep 
the assessees informed of the approach 
o f Department to the various issues 
involved; and

(b ) i f  so, when?

The Deputy Prime Minister n a  
Minister o f Finance (Shri MwatJI
Deeal): (a ) and (b ). There is no
proposal to publish Departmental
instructions given to Income-tax
Officers which are o f a confidential 
nature. Circulars meant for the 
public are published in the Direct 
Taxes Bulletin. This is a priced 
publication and is available to mem­
bers o f public. The bulletin contains 
amendments made to the I.T. Utiles, 
Statutory Orders and Notifications 
issued from time to time, and the 
circular* issued by the Central Board 
o f Direct Taxes which are meant (or 
public use.




