
I2I W'ntten Answets MAGHA 29. 1896 (SAKA) Written Arswcrs I22

(b) if so, to what extent the use of 
petroleum products will be checked?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OP PETROLEUM AND 
CHEMICALS (SHRI C P MAJHI)
(a) and (b) In view of the steep
increase in the prices of petroleum 
products Government has taken, 
various measures to reduce their in­
ternal consumption Economy m con­
sumption has, however to be achieved 
in a manner that the essential re­
quirements are not i^cted and the 
industrial and agricultural activity m 
the country is not depressed on this 
account Tho extent to which con 
sumption of petroleum products can 
be reduced will therefore depend 
hrgelv upon the reduction of non- 
essential consumption as a result of 
venous measures taken and the exttnt 
to which alternative souice=; of energy 
enn be made available

Accumulation of Naphtha in Fertilirer 
Factories

87 SHRI R V SWAMINATHAN 
Will the Minister of PETROLEUM AND 
CHEMICALS be pleased to state

(al whethei theie had been ac­
cumulation of naphtha because ferti­
liser factories wcie not running even 
st 85 pet cent of then capacity,

(b) if so, what are the reasons for 
the fertiliser fact ones not running to 
their capacity and

(c) whether India had exported 1,30 
lakh tonnes of naphtha duung the 
tjst year and now there i*j a glut of 
U m the international market which 
has been lesultmg setious scarcity m 
recent months’

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF PETROLEUM AND 
CHEMICALS (SHRI C P MAJHI)-
(a) There has been accumulation of 
Naptha stocks during the year due to 
Poor off takes by fertilizer plants.

The oft takes have, howevei improved 
since November, 1974

(b) Unforeseen mechanical and 
equipment failures m the plants at 
Madras, Kota, Vizag ana Goa and 
technological problems at Cochin and 
Durgapur were mainly responsible for 
low production and consequently, low 
consumption of naphtha In addition, 
the plant at Cochm had to be dhut 
down for nearly two months due to 
labour trouble.

(c) During 1074 approximately 1.24 
lakh tonnes of Naphtha v,a® e-ported 
The present position 0t stocks is well 
under control and the requirements 
of Naphtha m the cour+~\ aic being 
met in full

Construction of Kakosi-Bhddi, Hanj-
Sami-Radhanpur and Bhavnagar- 

Tarapore Railway Line

88 SHRI K S CHAVDA Will the 
Minister of RAILWAYS be pleased to 
state

(a) \ hether Government piopose tJ 
tnkt ip  constiuction of Kakosi-Bhudi, 
H mj-Saim-Radhanpur, Bhavnagar- 
Taiupoie new lailuay line duiin^ this 
yeai or next vear, keeping m view 
the i ecommendation of the Sixth 
Finance Commission not to allot more 
than Rs 4 55 ciorej, to the scat city 
aftcv.ted States

<b> whether Government of Gujarat 
has promised to meet the losses, if any, 
if these lines become uneconomic, and

(c) the leasons for not starting the 
constiuction of these railway lines?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF RAILWAYS (SHRI 
BUTA SINGH) (a) and (c) Cong, 
truction of Kakosi-Bhildi new line has 
been linked with the Delhi-Ahmeda- 
bad MG to BG conversion project. 
The report of the traffic survey car­
ried out for this conversion is under




