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(b) what is the production cost of 
synthetic nitric acid of different grades 
in Government sponsored plants and 
(he private sector plants and what is 
their current ex-plant selling price;

(c) what is the total production of 
synthetic nitric add by these units and 
the quantity spent for captive con­
sumption lor tbe manufacture of ferti­
lizers and other products and what 
quantity is sold directly to the actual 
users and the traders for the last three 
years; and

(d) whether the price of synthetic 
nitric acid Ex-plant has recently been 
increased considerably; if so, reasons 
therefor?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OP PETROLEUM AND 
CHEMICALS (SHRI C. P. MAJHI):
(a) to (d). Information is being
collected and will be laid on the Table 
o f the House.

Number of Judges in Snpreme Court 
and High Courts

8710. SHRI P. G. MAVALANKAR: 
WiU the Minister of LAW. JUSTIC1 
AND COMPANY AFFAIRS be pleased 
to state;

(a) the total number of judges in 
the Supreme Court and in the High 
Courts of India;

(b) their full names;
(c) whether Executive and Judiciary 

«re deeply divided on the selection and 
nomination of the judges; and

(d) whether Government are aware 
Chat the volume of pending cases is 
tremendous and is growing fast and if 
so, what corrective steps are taken to 
improve the situation?

THE MINISTER OF LAW, JUSTICE 
AND COMPANY AFFAIRS (SHRI 
H. a  GOKHALE); (a) As on 1-5-14)75, 
* W e  are IS Judgess in the 
Supreme Court and 2M Judges in the 

B iA  Com**.

'(b) A statement giving the informa­
tion is laid on the Table of the House. 
[Placed in Library. See No. LT-9634/ 
75].

(c) No, Sir.

(d)'Government are aware of the 
pendency of cases in the Supreme 
Court and in the various High Courts. 
A statement indicating the various 
steps taken to reduce the pendency is 
attached,
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Change In Policy for Oil Exploration 
after oil find in Bombay High

6712. SHRI MOHINDER SINGH 
‘GILL: Will the Minister of PETRO­
LEUM AND CHEMICALS be pleased 
to state:

(a) ‘whether after the oil find in 
Bombay High, Government have made 
some radical changes m the official 
policy and approach m the search for 
indigenous oil,

(b) if so, whether earlierionj? de­
lays between discovery and exploita­
tion of oil reserves are also being cut 
considerably; and

about in the above context as wen as 
that for covering financial hurdles with 
a view to make India self-sufficient?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OP PETROLEUM AND 
CHEMICALS (SHRI C. P. MAJHI);
(a) to (c). It ha& been and is Gov* 
ernment’s policy to find more and 
more indigenous crude oil. With the 
existing oil crisis—the world o v e r - 
efforts in search of oil and to exploit 
the already discovered oil resources* 
as much as feasible, have been inten­
sified it is also Government’s en­
deavour not to allow financial cons­
trains to stand in the way of realisa­
tion of the objective to achieve self, 
sufficiency in oiL

Raids on Drag Manufacturing Com­
panies in Delhi

8713. SHRI H. K. L. BHAGAT.
SHRI N. R. VEKARIA:
SHRI D. P. JADEJA:

Will the Minister of PETROLEUM 
AND CHEMICALS be pleased to 
state:

(a) the number of raids conducted 
on Drug manufacturing companies in 
Delhi during the last year;

(b) the discoveries made in the 
raids; and

(c) action taken as a result thereof!?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OP PETROLEUM AND 
CHEMICALS (SHRI C. P. MAJHI):
(a) to (c). Information Is being 
collected and will be laid on the TflM* 
of the House.




