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partial fast undertake by Shri P. R. 
Sarkar, generally known as Shri 
Aaanda Murti, in the Bankipur Jail 
in Patna;

(b) if so, tae facts thereabout;

(c) doctors report about his condi­
tion; and

(d) whether Government will take 
a sympathetic view for giving him 
necessaxy facilities as an undertrial 
prisoner and if so, the facts there­
about?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS 
(SHRI F. H. MOHSIN): (a) to (d). 
Anand Margis and their supporters 
have been addressing communications 
to the Prime Minister and other high 
dignitaries alleging illtreatment of 
Shri Sarkar by the authorities of the 
jail and deterioration in his health. 
They have also been demanding the 
withdrawal oi the cases against him 
and his unconditional release from 
jail. Shri Sarkar has been persistently 
refusing medical check up and treat* 
ment by the Government doctors and 
even facility of medical examination 
by a non-official doctor of his choice. 
From the 9th March 1974 for a few 
days he allowed himself to be medi­
cally examined, but again refused 
medical examination from, the 13th 
March, 1974. On the 24th March, 1974 
the Civil Surgeon reported that Shri 
Sarkar looked better and cheerful 
although he did not subject himself 
to medical examination. Shri Sarkar 
and several others are facing charges 
of conspiracy and murder. He is 
being treated aa an upper division 
prisoner. The State Government have 
given him all the facilities permissible 
under the Bihar Jail Manual rules for 
prisoners of his class.

CNddotteea for news broadcast and 
talks la regard to mass agitations ia 

the coantry
702a. SHRI SAMAR GUHA; Will 

the Minister of INFORMATION AND

BROADCASTING be pleased to state:
(a) whether Government have 

outlined guidelines for news broad­
cast and various talks in regard to 
the recent mass agitations in different 
parts of the country;

(b) if so, the facts thereabout; and

(c) the talks so far broadcast on 
the subject from various stations and 
the names of the persons entrusted 
for such talks?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF INFORMATION AND 
BROADCASTING (SHRI DHARAM 
BIR SINHA): (a) and <b). All broad­
casts are guided by the general prin­
ciples of broadcasting policy, namely, 
objectivity and public interest. Taking 
note of the present situation, All India 
Radio stations have been recently 
asked to further emphasise in its 
various programmes the imperative 
need to counteract tendency of vio­
lence and discruption to social and 
economic life of the community.

(c) This broad orientation of social 
purpose is reflected in a variety of 
programmes meant for different audi­
ences. The compilation of titles and 
names would involve effort not com­
mensurate with the benefit sought to 
be derived.

Statement by the Editor of Searchlight 
regarding destruction by Searchlight 

building ia Patna

7024. SHRI SAtMAR GUHA; Will 
the Minister of HOME AFFAIRS be 
pleased to state:

(a) whether the attention of Gov­
ernment has. been drawn to the state' 
rnent issued by the Editor of Search­
light Patna in Tegard to the circum­
stances leading to the destruction of 
the ‘Searchlight’ building;

(b) if so, whether any inquiry has 
been made by  Government; and
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(c) if so, the facts thereabout?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS 
(SHRI F. H. MOHSIN): (a) Govern­
ment have seen some press report* 
about the statement made by the 
Editor of the ‘Searchlight*, Patna

(b) and (c) Facts are being ascer­
tained from the State Government
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