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by the India** party frfte* the expiry 
of the initial period of the agreement 
without the prior permission of the 
foreign collaborator. With a view t° 
maintaining a continuous and uninter­
rupted flow of industrial production 
and to avoid any hardship to the con­
cerned Indian * parties, Government 
have impressed upon the Indian part­
ies desirous of entering into foreign 
collaboration that while negotiating a 
collaboration agreement, they should 
specifically examine whether the item 
of manufacture is patented in India, 
if so, they should ensure that the col­
laboration agreement includes a clause 
to the effect that the payment of royal­
ty for the duration of the agreement 
would also constitute compensation 
for use of patent rights till the expiry 
of the life of the patent and that the 
Indian party would have the freedom 
to produce the item even after the ex- 
pirv of the collaboration agreement 
without any additional payments. A 
copy of the Press Not* dated the 8th 
June 1973 is laid on the Table of the 
House. [Placed in Library. See No 
LT-5177/73 ]
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Damage caused to production Units due 
to Power failure
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421 SHRI BHOGENDRA JHA. Will 
the Minister of INDUSTRIAL DEVE­
LOPMENT AND SCIENCE AND 
TECHNOLOGY be pleased to htate the 
estimated total damage caused to tht 
various production units due to power 
failure in the various States of the 
country during the present >earT

THE MINISTER OF INDUSTRIAL 
DEVELOPMENT AND SCIENCE AND 
TECHNOLOGY (SHRI C. SUBRA­
MANIAM) Though most of the States 
have reported existence of power 
shortage, it has not been possible to 
assess the details of loset> m production 
attributable solely due to power short­
age However, estimates of losses 
largely due to power shortage in res­
pect of some Industries mainly in the 
medium and large *.cale sectors, are 
indicated in th« statement laid on the 
Table of the Sabha. [Placed in Lib­
rary. See No LT-5178/73J




