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$ (b) and <c) Decisions for conversion of
loans into equity will be taken by public 
financial institutions m industrial cases 
after considering the circumstances of 
each case.

Review of Letters of Intent/Licences fcsocd 
to 75 Large House*.

4266 SHRI BHOGENDRA 3HA Will 
the Minister of INDUSTRIAL DEVE-
LOPMENT AND SCIENCE* AND 
TECHNOIOGY be pleased to refer to 
the reply given to Staired Question No 
56 on 15th November, 1972 regai dinu 
review of licences and letters ot intent 
issued during 1970 71 and 1971 72 and 
state

(a) the particulais of licences who have 
been warned, or whom fin*l extension has 
been given or extension refuted or whose 
licences have been revoked o** cancelled, 
and

(b) whet he 1 the position has been or is 
pioposcd to bo renewed with regud to 
the pi ogress made m cases of Letters of 
Intent or I icences given to the 75 lar&t 
houses nimed bv the Monopolies Com 
mission if so, the result thereof?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF INDUSTRIAL DEVF 
LOPMhNT (SHRI SIDDHESHWAR 
PRASAD) (a) Particulars ot licenses who 
hive been warned or to whom fin I ex-
tension has een given I refused are not 
generally disclosed The particulars of 
licences revoked or cancelled are publish 
ed reqularly in the ‘Weeklv Bulletin of 
Industrial Licences Import Licences and 
Fvpori Licences* the weekly 'Indian Trade 
Journal’ and the monthly ‘Journal of In-
dustry Hind Trade’ Copies of these publi-
cations are supplied regularly to the Par- 
lument Library.

(b) The progress made m cases of letters 
of intent and licences given to  large 
/louses is reviewed ^as m other cases, in 

manner stated in the reply given to 
•Starred Question referred by the Hon 
Member.
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