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~ THE MINISTER OF LABOUR AND 
REHABILITATION: (SHRI VEERENDRA 
PATIL): (a) to (c) The information is 
being collected and will be placed on the 
Table of the House. 
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Guidelines For Radio Advertisement 

3547. SHRI SATISH AGARWAL: 
will the Minister of INFORMATION AND 
BROADCASTING be pleased to state: 

(a) the names of advertisers, titles, 
tadio time each advertisement featuring the 
soft drinks, Goldspot, Limca, Rasika, Campa 
Cola. Appela Campa, Thril Sprint, Tripp, 
Cola Lite Campa Orange, Funday, Tingler 
and Double Seven (77) commercially broad-
cast on Delhi. Bombay, Calcutta and Madras, 
Akasbwani Stations since 1 January, 1983 

. . , . 

alongwith the dates and broadcast time of 
each advertisements als<;l the revenue earned 
from each advertisement ; 

(b) whether any guidelines are followed 
before accepting such radio advertisements 
and how is it ensured that each cigarette 
advertisement specifies danger to health from 
smoking; and 

(c) whether any recording of soft drink 
advertisement are kept , if so, the names and 
address of each officer in whose custody 
they are kept ? 

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF INFORMATION AND 
BROADCASTING AND IN THE DEPART. 
MENT OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS 
(SHRI MALLIKARJUN) : (a) The details of 
the advertisements featuring soft drinks, 
namely, Limca: Rasika, AppeJa, 'Tripp and 
Campa Orange and broadcast on Delhi, 
Bombay, Calcutta and Madras Akashvani 
Stations during the period 1-1-1983 to 30-6-
1983 are giVen in the enclosed statement. 

No advertisement of soft drinks, namely, 
Gold Spot, Campa Cola, Campa, Thril. 
Sprint, Cola Lite, Funday, Tin~ler and Dou .. 
ble Seven (77) have been broadcast during 
this period. 

(b) Yes Sir. The AIR Commercial 
Code contains elaborate guidelines. These 
are scrupulously followed before accepting 
such adverti~ements over AIR. 

Advertisements of cigarettes and tobacco 
products are not permit ted over AIR. 

(c) The recordings of all advertisements 
including those of soft drinke are kept in the 
libraries of the respective CBS Centres. 
These recordings are not kept in the personal 
custody of any CBS official. 




