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(b) and (c). A copy of the relevant 
orders is placed on the Table of the 
House. [See Appendix III, annexure 
No. 91]. 

(d) House Rent Allowance is granted 
by administrative authorities on the 
basis of 'No Accommodation' Certi-
ficate issued by the Directorate of 
Estates on an application by the Gov-
ernment servant concerned. 

T A. of the Minister of lDformatiOD 
aDd Broadcasting 

2186. Shri K. U. Parmar: Will tha 
Minister of lDformation and Broad-
casting be pleased ro state: 

(a) the travelling allowance of thEl 
Minister of Infonnation and Broad-
casting for the years 1957, 1958, 1959 
and 1960 so far; and 

(b) the places or States visited 
during these years? 

The Minister of lDformatioD and 
Broadcasting (Dr. Keskar): (a) and 
(b). A statement giving the requisite 
information is laid on the Table. [See 
Appendix III, annexure No. 92]. 
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Industrial Units 

2188. Shri S. M. Banerjee: Will the 
Minister of Commerce and Industry 
be pleased to slate: 

(a) whether a number of major and 
medium industrial units have ~n 

licenced recently; 

(b) the number and names of tho~e 
licenced during 1960; 

(c) its State-wise break-up; 

(d) the number and names of those 
to be licenced in 1961; and 

(e) whether Government's declared 
polky of avoidance of concentraticn 
of wealth in a few hands has been 
kept in view in granting them licences~ 

The Minister of Industry (Shri 
Manubhai Shah): (a) to (c). 583 
licences under the Industries (Deve-
lopment and Regulation) Act, 1951 
have been granted during January to 
November, 1960 for the establishment 
of new industrial undertakings. De-
tails of these licences showing the 
names of the units, tlheir location and 
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the items of manufacture together 
with the capacity licensed are pel"lod-
ically published in the Journal of 
Tndustry and Trade. 

(d) Licences under the Industnes 
(Development and Regulation) Act, 
1951 are granted after examination of 
applications actually made for tl,e 
purpose. It is, therefore, not possible! 
to forecast the number or the nantes 
of t!le industrial units to be licensed 
rluring 1981. 

(e) Licences under the Industries 
(Development and Regulation) Act, 
1951, are gran ted in pursuance of the 
policy laid down in the Industrial 
Policy Resolution of 1956. A large 
number of new enterpreneurs are 
being continuously encouraged. 
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Allotment of Newly Built GovemmeDt 
Sbops in New Delhi 

2190. Sbri BalakrisbDaa: Will the 
Minister of Works, Housing and Sup-
ply be pleased to state: 

(a) whether entire blocks of newly 
built shops are lying vacant in varioua 
places in New Delhi; and 

(b) if so, the reasons for the de'ay 
in allotting the shops to the applicants 
who are on waiting list? 

The Minister of Works, Housing and 
Supply (Sbri K. C. Reddy): (a) Shop-
ping centres have been constructed re-
~('ntly in six Government colonie. in 
New Delhi. The Kidwai Nagar shop-
ping Centre, which was completed in 
November, 1959, was taken over by 
the New Delhi Municipal Committee 
on the 6th April, 1960 and except 40 
shops, all have been occupied in that 
centre. The other shopping centres, 
which have been completed recently 
will soon be transferred to the local 
hodies. 

(b) Forty shops are lying vacant in 
the Kidwai Nagar shopping centre 




