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1Ju!. hihett level recordecl in October, 
1958 at Delhi, W .• 20' 22 mi~ 
eJ&ri.es per cubic metre of air and is 
well below the m,xjmum permiuibJe 
level for continuous npo8Ure. 

Publicity OfIlcerslOrpDJsers Ia 
Paujab 

18. 8hrl D. C. Sharma: 

Will the Minister of InformatiOD 
and 81'OacIeastblr be pleased to state: 

Ca) the number of Publicity 0fIi-
cerslOrganisers appointed in Punjab 
so far under the Integrated Publicity 
Programme; and 

(b) the nature of their activities in 
the State during the period endinc 
.June 1960? 

The MlDIster 01 Information ... 
Broadcasting (Dr. Keskar): (a) Four 
(Three Field Publicity Officers and 
One Publicity Organiser). 

(b) The Field Publicity Units of 
the Publicity OfficerslOrganisers 
arrange film shows, song and drama 
performances, discussion groups and 
utilise publicity material such as leaf-
lets, folders and posters for the pur-
pose of publicising and explaining the 
objectives and requirements 01 the 
Five Year Plan. 

Violation of Cease-Fire Line 

f Shrl D. C. Sharma: 11. t Shrl Ram KrishaD Gupta: 

Will the PrIme Minister be pleased 
1.0 state: 

(a) the number of times the JIII11-
mu and Kashmir cease-fire line was 
violated by the Pakistanis since July. 
1960; 

(b) in how many cases the atten-
tion of the United Nations observers 
was drawn towards these incidents; 
and 

(c) with what results? 

TIle PrIme MJntster and MbIister 01 
Bdemal Affairs (Shrl .Jawahadal 

1244 (Ai) L.S.D.-4. 

Nehru): (a) Residents of Pakistan-
occupied Kashmir have violated the 
cease-fire line on 14 occasions since 
July, 1960; 

(b) In all cases; 

(e) The U. N. Chief Military Obser-
ver has awarded violation against 
Pakistan in 2 cases and no violation 
agIlinst Pakistan in 8. His award in 
4 cases is awaited. 

Tea 

12. ShrI Morarka: Will the Minister 
of Commerce ... IDIIastrJ be pleased 
to lay a statement on the Table shaw-m.: 

(a) the production of tea in 1950-
il; 

(b) the plan target for the First 
Five Year Plan, the achievement dur-
ing the same period together with the 
financial allocation and the amount 
actually spent during the First Plan 
period; 

(C) the target fOr the Second Five 
Year Plan period, the achievement 
made so far together with the finan-
cial allocation under the Second Five 
Year Plan and the amount actually 
spent so far; and 

(d) the reasons, if any, for the 
shortfall in achieving the physical 
targets? 

The MInIster of Commerce (Shri 
KanUJlCO): (a) Production of tea in 
India in 1950 and 1951 was 613'35 
million lbs. and 629:20 million lbs. res-
pectively. 

(b) to (d). No production target or 
financial allocation was laid down 
during the First and Second Plan 
periods. It was, however, expected 
that, through the normal processes of 
development, production would in-
crease to 700 million lbs., by the end 
of the Second Plan period and thiII 
was achieved in 1958 itselt. 




