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Scheduled Castes and Scheduled 
Tribes 

%512. Shri B. C. Kamble: Will the 
Minister of Home Affairs be pleased 
to state: 

(a) which categories of Indian peo-
ple have made representations for 
being included in the list of (i) Sche-
duled Castes and (ii) Scheduled Tribes 
during the last five years; and 

(b) the decision taken thereon by 
the Government? 

The Deputy Minister of Home 
Affairs (Shrjmati Alva): (a) & (b). 
Representations have been received 
trom time to time in this regard from 
various persons or associations and 
they have been asked to approach the 
State Governments concerned in the 
matter. No list of the parties who 
made representations has been main-
tained, and the time and labour in-
volved in compiling such a list now, 
would not be commensurate with the 
result that might be achieved. 

Stenographers' Examination for S.C. 
and S.T. 

2513. Shrt Amjad Ali: Will the 
Minister of Home Affairs be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether a competitive examina-
tion for the Scheduled Caste and 
Scheduled Tribe candidates will be 
held for the recruitment of Class m 
English Stenographers during the 
year 1960; 

(b) if so, whether similar exami-
nation will be held for the non-
scheduled castel tribe candidates also; 
and 

(e) it not, whether Government 
have any proposal to hold the Steno-
graphers' Examination in the year 
1961 for the non-scheduled castel tribe 
candidates? 

The MIDJster of state In the Minis-
1ry of Home Affairs (Shrt Datar): (a) 
Yes'. 

(b) and (cl. No general examina-
tion for stenographers is proposed to 
be held in 1960. An examination is, 
however, likely to be held in 1961. 
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