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Non-production of Small Coins 

~OO 1. SHRIMATI MADHUR: 
SINGH: Will the Minister (If 
FINANCE be pleased to state : 

(a) whether Government had stop--
ped the manufacture of one, two and 
three paise coins and now also propose 
to stop manufacturing five paise coins; 

(b) if so, the reasons therefor and 
steps taken to help the public in the 
problem created by the non-produc-
tion of these coins; 

(c) whether Government propOSe to 
formulate a currency structure, com-
bind with economy, efficiency and 
security; and 

Cd) it so, the details thereof? 

TH!E DEPtrty MINISTER IN THE 
lV.:INISTJtY OF FINANCE (SHRI JA-
NARDHANA POOJARY): (a) to Cd) 
Currency structure already in vogUe 
is constantly reviewed on the basis of 
demand for and utility of notes and 
coins of different denominations, their 
cost ot manufacture and the expendi-
ture involved in the distribution, re-
trieval and destruction of Dotes. The 
metallic content of coins is determin_ 
ed from time to time taking idto 
account the cost metal and also keep-
ing in view the need both to discour-
age counter_felting and melting 0'1: 
coins. FOr instance, in view of the 

fall in the demand for low denomina-
tion coins, the minting of 1 pasla and 
3 Paise coins was discontinued from 
1973-74 and that of 2 Paise coin from 
1979'-80. It has also been decided re-
cently to reduce the dimensions of 10 
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Paise coins as a measure of econmy 
and also to r,:e-introduce a 20 Paise 
coin in aluminium-magnesium alloy so 
as to keep down the cost of manufac-
ture of small coins. Similarly, a de_ 
cision has been taken recently to 
phas out the 1 and 2 rupee notes by 
stepping up the output of one rupee 
coins (with reduced dimensions) and 
the introduction of a 2 rupee coin as 
minting of coins is found to be more 
economical in the long run. On thp 
currency side, the introduction ot 50 
rupee notes, as an intermediate ceno-
mination between 20 rupee and 100 
rupee notes, was decided upon so as 
to meet the growing requirements of 
currency. 

The production programme both for 
cur ney and coins is determined 
from year to year on the basis of the 
forecast made by the Reserve Bank 
of India and after taking into account 
the constraints on .the production 
capacity in the presses and mints. 

All elTorts are bein~ made to ste~s up 
the availability of $matl coins. There 
is no proposal under consideration to 
disoontinue the minting of 5' Paise 
coins. 
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