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(b ) W hile some sections o f the 
travelling public, who desired to avail 
o f this special train, may have been
handicapped in not having been made
aware of the publicity, referred to in
reply to part (a) o f  the question, the
fact remains that as many as 156
reservations fo r  first class were effect-
ed by this train, which was almost
equivalent to the accommodation
available.

(c )  Yes.
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Directorate of Marketing and
Inspection

133. Shri Jhulan Sinha: W ill the
Minister o f Food and Agriculture be
pleased to state the facilities afforded 
during the last 3 years by the Direc-
torate of Marketing and Inspection for

training in the marketing o f mangoes, 
lichis and oranges?

The Minister of Food and Agricul-
ture (Shri A. P. Jain): No facilities
exist in the Directorate o f Marketing 
and Inspection for imparting special 
training in the marketing o f Mangoes, 
Lichis and Oranges.

The Directorate o f Marketing and 
Inspection is, however, imparting 
theoretical as w ell as practical train-
ing in agricultural marketing ini 
general.

Transport Facilities to M.Ps. visiting
C.D. Blocks

134. Shri Jhulan Sinha: W ill the
Minister of Community Development
and Co-operation be pleased to state:

(a ) whether it is a fact that some-
time during the last year some com -
munication passed from  the Com-
munity Development Ministry to the 
State Governments suggesting provi-
sion of certain transport facilities fo r  
the Members of Parliament when 
requested by them on the occasion o f  
their visits to the Block meetings and 
other such occasions in connection w ith  
Com'munity Development w ork in. 
their constituencies; and

(b ) how far these suggestions have- 
been accepted and carried out by the 
State Governments?

The Deputy Minister of Community
Development and Co-operation (Shri
B. S. Murthy): (a) Yes.

(b ) They are generally being im ple-
mented.

Warehousing Corporations in Punjab  ̂
and Mysore

135. Shri N. Keshava: W ill the
Minister o f Food and Agriculture be
pleased to state:

(a) whether Warehousing Corpora-
tions have been set up in Mysore and 
in Punjab; and

(b ) if so, where they are located 
and what is the contribution of the 
Central Warehousing Corporation in




