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Rural Reconstruction Programmes in 
States

3613. SHRI MANMOHAN TUDU: 
Will the Minister of RURAL RE-
CONSTRUCTION be pleased to state:

(a) whether it is a fact that some 
voluntary organisations or agencies 
are functioning . in association with 
the various rural reconstruction pro-
grammes in difftrent States;

(b) if so, the name of the States 
and the name of such agencies or 
organisations which are functioning 
in those States;

(c) whether any  such organisation 
or agency is functioning in Orissa in 
association with the Central Govern-
ment sponsored rural development 
programme; and

(d) if so, the details thereof?

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN 
THE MINISTRIES OF AGRICUL-
TURE AND RURAL RECONSTRUC-
TION (SHRI BALESHWAR RAM):
(a) Yes, Sir.

(b) to (d). Information is being col-
lected and will be laid Oja the Table 
of the House.

C. and D. Type Government Quarters

3614. SHRI MANMOHAN TUDU: 
Will the Minister of WORKS AND 
HOUSING be pleased to state:

(a) whether it is a fact that there 
is a dearth of Group C ana D type 
quarters in New Delhi for the Central 
Government employees working in 
various Ministries of Government of 
India;

(b) if so. whether Government has 
taken any recent decision for step- 
ing up the construction of C and D 
type quarters for the employees;.

(c) the total number of houses of 
both C and D type expected to be 
released during 1981-82 and 1982-83;

(d) the number of such quarters 
under construction at present;

(e) the expected time 0f providing 
quarters to the entire employees en-
titled for those quarters ana placed 
under the waiting list for the last ten 
years; and

(f) the details thereof?

THE MINISTER OF PARLIAMEN-
TARY AFFAIRS AND WORKS AND 
HOUSING (SHRI BHISHMA NA-
RAIN SINGH); (a) General pool Re-
sidential accommodation for govern-
ment employees, including types C &
I> quarters is being provided within 
the constraints of resources. ■ The 
level of satisfaction in respect of 
‘general pool’ types C & D quarters 
in Delhi js much more than in other 
cities of the country.

(b) More quarters are being con-
structed in Delhi within the cons-
traints of resources. ■

(c) 1981-82 1982 83
Type C 2053 3690
Type D 56* »-

*(they have already been com pli-
ed).

.(d) *
Type III/C  6376

• Type IV/D 16
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(e)  and (f) It  is not possible to 
give a definite date as to by when 
all the employees  can be provided 
Govt, accommodation, because it de , 
pends upon the Plan  allocation in. 

future for this purpose.
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Drainage Scheme tor Orissa  ■

3616.  SHRI  CHINTAMANI JENA: 
Will the Minister 0f IRRIGATION be 

pleased to state:

(a) whether the State Government 
of Orissa has approached Central Go-
vernment with a drainage scheme for 
clearance by the CWC or by the World 

Bank;

(b) if so? the details regarding the 
time when such scheme was put up 
before Union Government as well as 
the areas going to be covered and 
the extent of production likely to be 
increased after the execution of this 
scheme; and

(c) whether the scheme has been 
cleared by the Central  Government 
and if not, the time by which it is 
likely to be approved?

THE MINISTER  OF  STATE IK 
THE MINISTRY  OF IRRIGATION 
(SHRI Z. R. ANSARI):  (a) to (c).
The State Government have reported 
that they are making model studies as 
suggested by Central Water Commis-
sion to finalise the proposals for Bata- 
gaon drainage cut scheme in Bala- 
sore District,

It will be possible to give the bene-
fits of this scheme  only after the 
State Government finalise their pro-
posal.

The State Government have further 
reported that in the Sixth Plan pe-
riod, work will be  continued on 27 
on-going drainage secheme and taken 
up on 23 new  drainage schemes. 
These will benefit 1.46 lakh acres on 

th,eir completion.




