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booked and notices issued to the un-
authorised builders under the provi-
sions of sections 343 and 344 of the 
Delhi Municipal Corporation Act, 1957 
to stop/demolish the unauthorised 
construction.

Acquired Land in South Delhi

5667. SHRI NIREN GHOSH; Will 
the Minister of WORKS AND HOUS-
ING be pleased to state:

(a) whether some or all of 200 
plots of land in South Delhi meant to 
be given to villagers from whom land 
was acquired in the years 1959, 1961 
and 1966 have been allotted to per-
sons who got clearance on the basis 
of forged papers;

(b) whether Land and Building 
Department of Delhi Administration 
has referred the case to the anticor-
ruption branch of Delhi Administra-
tion;

(c) if so, the amount involved in 
this deal; and

(d) the outcome of investigation if 
any, conducted by the anti-Corrup- 
tion Branch?

THE MINISTER Of  PARLIAMEN-
TARY AFFAIRS AND WORKS AND 
HOUSING (SHRI BHISHMA NARAIN 
SINGH); (a) No, Sir. The Delhi Ad-
ministration has reported that about 
128 forged letters purported to have 
been issued by them to the DDA have 
come to notice.

(b) Yes, Sir.

(c) It is not possible to ascertain the 
nature and quantum of consideration 
received for making forged recom-
mendations /letters.

(d) The Delhi Administration has 
reported that one of their employees 
has been arrested and the case is 
under investigation.

Extension of Operational Research
Project, Noorsarai Nalanda, Bihar

5668. SHRI VIJAY KUMAR 
YADAV; Will the Minister of AGRI-
CULTURE be pleased to state;

(a) whether it is a fact that the- 
Operational Research Project, Noor-
sarai, District Nalanda, Bihar has its 
operation limited to only two Gram 
Panchayats, Namely, Charnipar and. 
Doeya;

(b) whether Government are aware 
that due to the limited operational 
area, the cultivalors of the whole of 
Nalanda District are not getting bene-
fit of that project;

(c) if so, whether Government pro-
pose to extend the area of project to 
the whole of Nalanda District; and “*

(d) if so, whan and if not the rea-
sons therefor?

THE MINISTER Of  STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF AGRICULTURE AND 
RURAL RECONSTRUCTION (SHRI 
R. V. SWAMINATHAN): (a) Yes, Sir. 
The Operational Research Project for 
stepping up production of seed potato. 
is being implemented by the Central 
Potato Research Institute through its 
Research Station at Patna in two 
gram panchayats, namely^ Chanipar 
and Doeya, covering 8 villages in 
Nalanda district.

(b) Since the Project is a Pilot Pro-
ject where techniques for raising seed 
potato are being demonstrated and 
popularised amongst farmers, it could 
only cover a limited number of vil-
lages physically. The benefits of the 
Fi-Orject fre, however, available 
to the whole of Nalanda district as 
the farmers of the District are bein'; 
made aware of the technology for rais-
ing seed potato crop. The demonstra-
tions organised on the farmers fc^ds. 
exhibitions, kisan melas and popular 
literature published from time tQ time 
help in dissemination of the new in-
formation resultifag in benefits to the 
farming community in Nalanda dis-
trict. .. . .. j
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(c) The Council cannot layout 
demonstrations on techniques of rais-
ing seed potato in the field of each 
farmer of the District.

(d) The Council only takes up pilot
projects to demonstrate the feasibility 
and acceptability of the new techno-
logy generated from its various Insti-
tutes; thereafter, it is the State De-
partment of Agriculture which should 
disseminate the technology demons-
trated to other parts of the District/ 
State. i
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Employment Guarantee scheme in 
Rural Areas

5670. SHRI HARINATH MISRA; 
Will the Minister of RURAL RECON-
STRUCTION be pleased to state;

(a) whether it is a fact that the 
Central Government is presently 
spending nearly Rs. 1,000 crores on 
food-for-work programmes and food 
subsidy;

(b) whether Government are aware 
tbr.it the scheme is full of leakages and 
largely benefits people in urban areas;

(c) if so, whether Government pro-
pose to introduce an employment 
guarantee scheme On the lines of 
Maharashtra Government’s scheme 
throughout the country, if not, why 
not; and

(d) whether Government propose 
to introduce the employment gua-
rantee scheme at least in areas where 
rural unemployment is of a very high 
order?

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF AGRICULTURE AND 
RURAL RECONSTRUCION (SHRI 
BALESHWAR RAM); (a) to (d) The 
current year’s provision for food f° r 
work programme /national rural em-
ployment programme is Rs. 340 crores. 
The Department of Food has reported 
that difference between the economic 
cost of the grain to the Food Corpo-
ration of India and its issue price for 
Public Distribution and the carrying 
cost on Central buffer is reimbursed 
to the Food Corporation of India in 
the form of food subsidy. For this, a 
budgetary provision of Rs. 650 crores 
was made in the revised estimates for 
the year 1980-81 and the entire amount 
has been paid to Food Corporation ot 
India on provisional basis.




