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P. & T . Offices in  Orissa State

358. Shii Saaganna: Will the Minis 
ter of Commanlcations be pleased tc 
5tate the number of departmental and 
extra-departmental post offices and 
telegraph offices opened in each 
district of the Orissa State during 
1953?

The Deputy Minister of Communi' 
cations (Shri Raj Bahadur): A state­
ment giving the information is placed 
on the Table of the House. [See 
Appendix VI, annexure No. 73.]

O ver and U ndbr-B ridges on  Railways

359. Th. Lakahman Singh Charak:
Will the Minister of RaUways be 
pleased to state:

(a) the number of road over and 
under-bridges constructed by the 
Railways in 1952-53 and 1953-54;

<b) the number of such bridges 
under construction; and

(c) the names of the places where 
such construction work has been 
completed?

The Parliamentary Secretary to the 
Minister of Railways and Transport 
(Shri Shahnawac Khan): (a) Five in 
1952-53 and one in 1953-54.

(b) Four.
(c) Gwalior, Indore, Gk>ndla, Patna, 

Avanaslil Road and Satyamangalam 
Road.

VlSAKHAPATNAM PORT

360. Dr. Natabar Pandey: Will the 
Minister of Railways be pleased to
state:

(a) the daily loading and unloading 
tonnage capacity of Visakhapatnam 
Port; and

(b) what is the average annual 
total tonnage of goods loaded and 
unloaded during the last five years?

The Parliamentary Secretary to the 
Minister of Railways and Transport 
(Shri Shahnawaz Khan): (a)

Loading 
Unloading

(b) Loaded 
Unloaded

Tons 
.. 7,400 
.. 4,400 
8,35,650 
1,64^65
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The Parliamentary Secretary to the 
Minister of Railways and Transport 
(Shri Shahnawaz Khan): The infor­
mation is not readily available and is 
being collected. It will be placed on 
the Table of the House in due course.




