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should be brought to 60 per cent before 
the end of March 1979. Under the 
branch licensini policy larger emphasis 
has been laid on opening of branches 
in rural and semi-urban centres. 

Population Group 

Rural 

Semi-Urban 

.Urban/Metropolitan 

TOT4L 

Air Service between Madras and 
Visakhapatnam 

286B. SHRI V. KISHORE CHANDRA 
S. DEC: Will the Minister of TOUR-
ISM AND CIVIL A VIATION be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether air service between 
Madras and Visakhapatnam will be 
restored or not; 

(b) if not, the reasons thereof and 
why such a vital air link on the east 
coast of the country is being neg-
lected: and 

(c) if so, the details tt:ereo!? 

THE MINISTER OF TOURISM AND 
CIVIL AVIATION (SHRI PURU· 
SHOTTAM KAUSHIK): (a) to (c). 
The traffic demand does not warrant 3 

direct air service between Madras and 
Visakhapatnam, at present. 
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(b) The data relating to deposits, 
credits and credit; deposit ratio of the 
scheduled commercial banks accord-
ing to population groups is given 
below: 

(Rs. in cron's at December, 1977) 
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