
WTttrcen Answers .IWGUST 16, 1978 

country and the black marketing 
takltl'g place all over the country, 

(b) what are the steps taken by the 
Government to distribute the cement 
to the needly consumer of fixed 
pricesj and 

(c) the details thereon? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN 
THE MINISTRY OF INDUSTRY 
(SH!!IMATI ABHA MAITI): (a) 

to (c). Due to overall inadequate 
availability of cement there are re-
ports df some unsocial elements indul-
ging in black marketing. The cement 
manufacturers have been requested to 
exercise greater vigilanCe on their 
stockists/dealers. The state Govern-
ments have also been requested to 
examine whether a direct distribution 
system on the pattern proposed by the 
West Bengal o"vernment or any other 
suitable method fol' control over dis-
tribution needs to be introduced in 
every state. They have also been 
requested to direct the district autho-
rities to initiate more positive action 
against uffenders and also to take ini-
tiative and keep a vigilant look out 
:for the t.lffenders. Cement has been 
declared as an Essential Commodity 
for purposes of Essential Commodities 
Act, 1955 and adequate powers are 
available to the State Governments to 
take attion against persons indulging 
in unethical practices. 

CUrb on big Industrial Hou1es 

4266. SHRI DHIRENDRA NATH 
BASU: Will the Minister of INDUS-
TRY be pleased to state. 

(a) whether Government have 
lecided to put a curb on large indus-
~rial houses to encourage small entre_ 
preneurs and widen the scope of the 
public soctor; and 

(b) if sUo the details thereol? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN 
THE MINISTRY OF INDUSTRY 
(SH1UMATI ABHA MAm): (a) 
and (b). In the Industrial Polley 

Sta1lemerrt presented to PaTl>ament on 
2lIrd l!lIIcem1!>er, 19T7, Go'lt!l'llmtllt 
have clearly enunciated ite approach 
tow'ards 18l'ge houses. 'rhis is being 
iinPI_ented in terms of liCensing 
pOlicy and through the strict appli-
cation of the Monopolies aIld Restric-
tive Trade Practices Act. On the role 
of public sector. the Statement on 
Industrial Policy states that there 
will be an expaJlding role for the 
public sector in several fielde. It also 
emphasises t'hat not only will the 
public sector be the producer of im-
portant and strategic goods of basic 
nature, but it would also be used 
effectively as a stabilising forCe fol' 
maintaining essential supplies for the 
consurr..er. 

World Bank Aid to U.P. for construc-
tion of roads 

4267. SHRr RAJE VISHVESHV AR 
RAO: Will the Minister 01 SHIPPING 
AND TRANSPORT be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether State Government of 
U.P. received a big amount from the 
World Bank !'or the construction of 
roads in that State; 

(b) if so, whether there is any 
chance for the same Bank to help 
Maharashtra the same way for cons-
tructing roads in the rural area; and 

(C) if not, whether the Central 
Government will iive money to cons-
truct roads in the backward Chandra_ 
pur Di,gtrict of Maharashtra? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN 
CHARGE OF THE MINISTRY OF 
SHIPPING AND TRANSPORT (SHRr 
CHAND RAM): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 

(C) This apparently relates to State 
roW. Construction of such rascla is 
the -'Ponslbility 01 the state Gov-
ernment concerned. 




