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(xiv) sale of imported rejlned ra- 
peseed oil at a retail price of Rs. 7.50 
a Kg., through the public distribu­
tion system throughout the country;

(xv) supply of imported oils to the 
vanaspati industry ranging between 
75 per cent to 90 per cent of their 
requirements of oils;

(xvi) imposition of stock limits on 
traders in respect of pulses, oilseeds

. and edible oils.

(xvii) Increase in the support of 
price of wheat, paddy, gram, 
groundnut, sunflowerseed and raw 
cotton.

As a result o f these measures the 
price situation has generally remained 
fairly easy in respect of several essen­
tial commodities since August, 1977. 
Whilst in the week ending March 26,
1977 the rate of inflation, on point to 
point comparison over the year, was
12 per cent, in the week ending Feb­
ruary 11, 1978 there was a minus rate 
of inflation of 1.2 per cent. The 
wholesale price indices of several 
essential commodities like rice, jowar, 
onions, tea, coffee, groundnut oil, co­
conut oil, cottonseed oil, vanaspati, 
sugar khandsari and gur are signifi­
cantly lower than that of last year.

Development of Ooty as Tourist 
Attraction

1531. SHRI P. S. RAMALINGAM: 
Will the Minister of TOURISM AND 
CIVIL AVIATION be pleased to state:

(a) the present position regarding 
development of Ooty the queen of 
hill stations as a magnet of tourist 
attraction;

(b) the number of Janata Hotels 
proposed to be constructed and the 
time-frame therefor, indicating inter 
alia the investment proposed; and

(c) the position regarding operation 
of feeder air services to enable 
tourists to reach Ooty quickly with­
out the frustrating delay of rail 
travel?

THE MINISTER OF TOURISM 
AND CIVIL AVIATION (SHRI PU- 
RUSHOTTAM KAUSHIK): (a) The
Central Department of Tourism sub­
sidised the opening of a Tourist Bu­
reau and construction of a Tourist 
Bungalow in Ooty, Tamil Nadu, in 
the earlier Plana H ie provision o f 
additional facilities at Ooty will de­
pend upon the resources made avail­
able for the Tourism Plan (1978—83> 
in the Central and the State Sectors.

(b) A provision of Rs. 10.72 crores 
has been made in the draft Tourism 
Plan for the construction of Janata 
hotels in the 4 metropolitan cities 
(Delhi, Bombay, Madras and Calcut­
ta) and at other selected tourist cen­
tres in the Central Sector during the
1978— 83 five year period.

(c) A proposal for the operation o f 
feeder air services to connect import­
ant places of tourist and other inter­
ests not connected by the existing air 
services of Indian Airlines is under 
consideration.
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