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(b) No.

(c) Does not arise.

Transfer of Managers /Inspectors in 
Catering and Vqnding Establishments 

at Allahabad

36&8. SHftI S. K. SARDA: W ill the 
Minister of RAILW AYS be pleased to 
state:

(a) whether It is a fact that the 
sweets and other eatables items are 
being daily sent free of charge to the 
Senior officers especially belonging to 
Commercial Branch by Managers/ 
Inspectors of Catering and Vending 
Establishments;

(b) if so, whether the Railways had 
ever tried to exercise surprise checks 
through Vigilance Department to stop 
these malpractices; and

(c) whether Government would 
transfer the Managers/Inspectors em-
ployed in Catering and Vending es-
tablishments staying at Allahabad 
station over three years to root 0ut 
these corfupt practices?

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF RAILW AYS (SHRI 
SHEO NARAIN ): (a) No.

(b) Does not arise. However, Rail-
way Vigilance frequently conduct 
surprise dhecks on the working of 
the Catering Establishments with a 
view to detect malpractices/irregulari-
ties. During these checks malpractices 
of the type mentioned in part (a) of 
the question have not come to notice.

(c) There is no policy rgarding 
transfer of staff after three years. 
However, wherever cosidered neces-
sary, Catering staff are transferred in 
the interest of the administration. The 
same policy' will apply to Allahabad 
Station and any Catering staff coming 
to adverse notice there.
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