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{English} 

Agreement with Railway Workers 

2907. SHRI SUDHIR GIRl: Will the 
Minister of RAILWAYS be pleased to 
state:: 

(a) the specific terms of agreement 
reached by his Ministry with the Railway 
Officers and workers in avoiding the pro-
pQsed strike; and 

(b) the steps taken so far to comply 
with those terms of agreements? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF RAILWAYS (SHRI K.C . 

. LENKA): (a) No agreement has been 
made by the Ministry of Railways with the 
Staff side. 

(b) Does not arise. 

[Translation} 

Amenities at Stations in Maharashtra 

2908. SHRI VILASRAO NAG-
NATHRAO GUNDEWAR: Will the Minis-
ter of RAILWAYS be pleased to state: 

(a) the names of railway stations in 
Maharashtra where complaints regarding 
inadequate facilities of drinking water, 
waiting roo~, electricity and sanitation 
have been received from commuters; and 

(b) the action taken to provide ade-
quate passenger fdities on these rail-
way stations? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF RAILWAYS (SHRI K.C. 
LENKA): (a) A Statement is attached. 

(b) Provision of Passenger amenities, 
their augmentation and the rectification of 
complaints in this regard is a continuous 
process. Action to rectify the defects is 
taken up on re~ipt of the complaints and 
action to provideiaugment facilities is 
taken up in a programmed manner, sub-
ject to availability of funds and relative 
importance of various stations. Accord-
ingly, action has been taken up to deal 
with these complaints. 

STATEMENT 

Names of the stations about which 
complaints regarding inadequacies/mal 
functioning of ,such facilities have been 
received are given below:-

Ulhasnagar. 

2. Vithalwadi. 

3. Shahad. 

4. Tilak Nagar. 

5. Govandi. 

6. Mankhurd. 

7. Chembur. 

8. Kurla. 

9. Vitibyabihar 

10. Ghatkopar. 

11. Vikhroli. 

12. Kanjumiarg. 

13. Bhandup. 

14. Mulund. 

15. Thakurli. 

16. Ghorawadi. 

17. Kopargaon. 
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18. Chandrapur. 

19. Kohadad. 

20. Niphad. 

21. Burhanpur. 

22. Jalgaon. 

23. Kamptee. 

24. Kanhan. 

25. Kalumna. 

26. KuhL 

27. Birsola. 

29. Tumsar Road. 

30. Gondia. 

31. Malad. 

32. Goregaon. 

33. Bandra Terminal. 

34. VasaL 

35. Saphala. 

36. Andheri. 

37. Dahisar. 

38. Bombay Central. 

39. Elphinston Road. 

40. Umbergaon. 

41. Churchgate. 

42. Chami Road. 

43. Grant Road. 

44. Kalva 

45. Vangaon. 

46. Miraj. 
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47. Jayasingapur. 

48. Hatkangalle. 

49. Rukadi. 

50. Kolhapur. 

51. Karad. 

52. Basmat. 

53. Parli Vaijnth. 

54. Aurangabad. 

55. Chakur. 

56. Borivilli. 

Ait-Konch Railway Une 

2909. SHRI GAYA PRASAD KORI: 
Will the Minister of RAILWAYS· be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether the Govemment a[e 
considering to extend the Ait-Konch line 
beyond Konch so as to eam profit; 

(b) if so, whether a survey has been 
conducted for this scheme; 

(c) the time by which work on the 
new railway line is likely to start; and 

(d) if not, the reasons therefor? , 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF RAILWAYS (SHRI K.C. 
LENKA): (a) No, Sir. 

(b) Yes, Sir. 

(c) The work has not been sanc-
tioned. 




