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Mail, Express trains during 1st April, 
1977 to 10th June; 1977, 4,163 trips 
reached destination late.

(b) Accidents, stormy weather, 
mechanical and signal failures and 
alarm chain pulling were the main 
factors contributing to late running of 
these trains.

(c) Instructions have been issued to 
monitor the punning of trains at all 
levels.
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Victimisation of S.C./S.T. Railway 
Employees

1168. SHRl K. KUNHAMBU: Will
the Minister of RAILWAYS be pleased 
to state:

(a) whether the Scheduled Caste/ 
Tribe employees in Railways are be-
ing victimised by their respective su-
perior officers by classifying them as 
‘inefficient’ ;

(b) whether representations are be-
ing received by Government from 
their respective Unions on this matter;

(c) if so, the number of such victi-
mised employees; and

(d) the measures being taken for 
their reinstatement?

THE MINISTER OF RAILWAYS 
(PROF. MADHU DANDAVATE):
(a) to (d). Information js being col-
lected and will be laid on the Table 
of the Sabha in due course.

Unpalatable Water Supplied in long 
Distance Tralns

11C9. DR. SARADISH ROY: Will the 
Minister of RAILWAYS be pleased to 
state:

(a) whether Government are aware 
that un-palatablr; water is invariably 
supplied to the passengers who are 
served with food in the long distance 
trains and it causes health hazard 
among the passengers; an<j

(bj>_ if so, the steps taken to stop
this unhygienic water supply?

THE MINISTER OF RAILWAYS 
(PROF. MADHU DANDAVATE):
(a) and (b ). If any specific instance 
is brought to Government’s notice re-
medial action will be taken.




