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Unrest in Educational institutions

<m. SHRI S. R. DAMANI: Will the 
Minister of EDUCATION, SOCIAL 
WELFARE AND CULTURE be pleas-
ed to state;

(a) the nature of unrest in educa-
tional institutions at several places 
s i n c e  the lifting o f emergency;

(b) what are the grievances of the 
students and or teachers concerned 
and what action is taken thereon; and

(c) whether any national policy is 
being worked out to maintain peace 
in Universities and other educational 
institutions, and if so, its broad 
features?

THE MINISTER OF EDUCATION, 
SOCIAL WELFARE AND CULTURE 
(DR. PRATAP CHANDRA CHUN- 
DER): (a) to (c). There have been

several cases of disturbances in edu-
cational institutions during the last
2-3 months. At some places there 
have been violent incidents involving 
assaults, gherao, demonstrations, 
strikes etc. The demands of students 
include postponement of examina-
tions, revival of students unions, pro-
motion to next higher classes without 
examination and readmission of stu-
dents expelled during emerge* cy. 
The demands of teachers include im-
provement in service conditions and 
action against authorities who are 
alleged to have committed excesses 
during the emergency.

While the situation is being watch-
ed, the State Government have beon 
requested to look into the represen- 
tions and complaints made by the 
students and teachers and to take 
immediate action for the redressal of 
the legitimate grievances. They have 
been requested to initiate action 
immediately so that an atmosphere 
conducive for the maintenance of 
peace can be created by the time the 
educational institutions reopen after 
the summer vacation.

Productivity of Land

995. SHRI K. LAKKAPPA: Will
the Minister of AGRICULTURE AND 
IRRIGATION be pleased to state:

(a) whether Government are taking 
any steps to maintain productivity of 
land;

(b) whether any instructions have 
been issued to different agricultural 
universities of th<* country in this re-
gard; and

(c) if so, facts thereof?

THE MINISTER OF AGRICUL-
TURE AND IRRIGATION (SHRI 
SURJIT SINGH BARNALA): (a)
Yes, Sir.

(b) and (c). No specific intsruc- 
tions have been issued to the Agri- 
tural Universities. However, the




