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& Ceramic Workers’ Union of Raniganj 
Groups of Burn Standard Company Limited 
(BSCL) 1990, and on August 2b, 1990. The 
petitionns inter-alia mentioned, in passing, 
regarding non-supply of raw material, spare 
parts and manning of refractory units of the 
company.

(c) As the Raniganj Group of refractory 
units with their present installed facilities are 
in a position to supply only traditional refrac­
tories, which are oresently not used by 
modern steel plants, the demand is limited. 
In view f this, the production against avail­
able orders has not suffered due to want of 
raw materials and manpower is more than 
adequate for present level of turnover. Since 
nationalisation of thase units, the company 
has spent Rs. 256.93 Iskhd towards renew­
als and replacement of existing plant and 
machinery.

Modernisation of M/s. Bum Standard 
Company Limited

2523. SHRI HARADHAN ROY: Will the

PRIME MINISTER be pleased to state:

(a) whetherthe Government have drawn 
up scheme for the modernisation and diver­
sification of M/s. Burn Standard Company 
with new technology on its nationalisation; 
and

(b) if so, the modernisation schemes 
launched in each engineering unit and re­
fractory unit of the company after its nation­
alisation?

TH E MINISTER O F STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF INDUSTRY (SHRI P.K. 
THUNGON). (a) and (b). After the nationali­
sation of Burn Standard Company, Govern­
ment have approved a number of schemes 
modernisation, upgradation of technology 
and diversification. Unit-wise details of the 
schemes approved are given in the attached 
statement.
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