
ment it going to play vital role ia the 
country** export efforts;

(b) if go, whether engineering units 
are hampered by P°°*  technology; 
and

(c) if ao, th« gtepe taken ift this 
regard?

THE MINISTER  07 INDUSTRY 
AND CXVXL SUPPLIES (SHRI T. A. 
PAD: (a) Yes, Sir.

(b) and (c). Over a large area of 
engineering products,  there are no 
significant technological problems in 
export development and the existing 
technological practices are  adequate 
for export marketing purposes, how­
ever, wherever technology gaps exist. 
Import of appropriate  technology is 
allowed so that  these gaps can be 
adequately filled up.

war *iw if flnwft  eft m 

% wmw «rr

5477.  «Ni iw   : «»n

ss*f mft ̂  w?rr# fa :

{*)  w   *rc*r ir 

srf̂ Ff snrr*<nr**t inrmr fc,

tfft

(sr) irf*  ?rt m  ? 

s«f innrw if vnnft («ft ilt*

f "fa? *«f) :  (V) 5ft, Sf# t

(w)  snpr  *rgt i

4f Written Answers

Fteaneial AMtetaaee to Slates fa sa£b~ 
site Ueetslelfty Oenaeetie» to 
Jfeaggi-Jhoftft Dwellers

Mm SHRI RAM HEDAOO:  Will 
the Minister of ENERGY be pleased 
to gtata:

(a)  whether Government propose to 
evolve a echeme and extend financial 
whtoi*» to the States to g>iti«MI»a

electricity  eonneetions  to  Jhuggt* 
Jhopri dwellers; and

(b) if so, the main features ther* 
of?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY  OF  ENERGY  (PROF. 
SIDDHESHWAR  PRASAD):  (a)
There it no such proposal

(b) Does not arise.

Written lA«*u>ert 44

Persons arrested vMtar MESA in Orissa

5479. SHHI  SHYAM  SUNDER 
MOHAPATRA: Will the Minister of 
HOME AFFAIRS be pleased to state:

(a) how many persons have been 
arrested so far in Orissa under MISA, 
district-wise; and

(b) their names and character of 
offences?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY  OF  HOME  AFFAIRS 
(SHRI F. ft MOHSIN): (a) and (b) 
Information is being  collected  %nd 
will b»  laid on the  Table of the 
House
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