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(g) what are the steps contemplated 
by the Government of India to meet 
this shortage?

The Minister of Industry in the 
Ministry of Commerce and Industry 
(Shri Kanungo): (a) Perhaps what
the Hon’ble Member means by syn­
thetic diamonds is really synthetic 
stones like sapphires and rubies. There 
Is no shortage of synthetic stones or 
gems in the country.

(b) Does not arise

(c) They are produced within the 
country except coloured stones other 
than ruby and white, which are im­
ported under Export Promotion 
Scheme.

(d) The production of the factory 
producing these stones is nt present 
1,000 kg., per annum. The factory is 
located at Mettupalayam in Madras 
State,

(e) The requirements of the Lapi­
dary industry for white stones and 
rubies is met in full from indigenous 
production.

(f) Some traders and jewellers from 
Rajasthan have represesnted about the 
mode of distribution of the stones 
manufactured in India.

(g) Though there is no shortage as
such, tne Mettupalayam factory has 
undertaken a programme of expan­
sion. Arrangements are being made 
to distribute the synthetic stones pro­
duced at Mettupalayam to the expor­
ters at Jaipur through the Rajasthan 
Small Industries Corporation.
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Enquiry of Death of DXG., Police te 
Nagaland

1492. Shri D. C. Sharma: Will the 
Prime Minister be pleased to refer to




