
2347 Oral Answers 27 APRIL 1954 Written Ansvaers 2348

Shrl M. D. Ramasami: 2062, Sir.

Mr. Speaker: Has he fiot the autho- 
.Tity?

Shri M. D. Ramasami: Yes, Sir.
Mr. Speaker: He should produce it 

in time. He may put that question.

Selection Posts on R ailways

*2062. Shri M. D. Ramasami (on be- 
Ihalf of Shri Muniswamy): (a) Will the 
Minister of Railways be. pleased to 
state whether it is a fact that certain 
posts on the scale of Rs. 150—225 on 
Railways are to be classified as selec­
tion posts?

(b) If the answer to part (a) above 
be in the afllrmative, what are the 
posts classified as such?

(c) Is this classification power left 
to the individual Railway Administra­
tion or a uniform policy will be follow­
ed throughout Indian Railways?

The Deputy Minister of Railways and 
Transport (Shri Alagesan): (a) Yea.

(b) The matter is under considera- 
tlon.

(c) A uniform policy will be follow- 
*ed, as far as possible.
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Shri Alagesan: It is not correct. The 
Railway Board have laid down certain 

•uniform principles, and on the basis 
of those principles the various Rail­
way Administrations have been asked 
to compile combined seniority lists.
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Mr. Speaker: The Question list is
over.

WRITTEN ANSWERS TO QUESTIONS 

Shipping

•2072. Shri K. C. Sodhia: (a) Will the 
Minister of Transport be pleased to 
state the total share of the export 
trade of this country booked with the 
Indian shipping during 1953-54?

(b) What steps are Government tak­
ing to secure a greater share of the 
export trade for the Indian Shipping?

The Deputy Minister of Railways and 
Transport (Shri Alagesan): (a) Infor­
mation is available only for the 
calendar year 1953 and it shows that 
Indian shipping had carried 3,88,668 
dead-weight tons of export cargo in the 
overseas trades during that year. A'.- 
tention of the hon. Member is also in­
vited in this connection to the reply 
given to starred question No. 1870 
asked by Shri Raghunath Singh on th- 
19th April 1954.

(b) Since shipping is in the private 
sector of our economy and our export 
trade is largely in private hands, it is 
for the Indian shaping companies 
themselves to take the initiative for 
securing adequate cargo for their ships




