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tial to have an all-India outlook in 
thi* matter also. I t  u for that reason 
that a very intimate co-ordination 
between the publicity work and itt 
objective 1* necessary.

Shri 8. C. Samanta: Is It a fact that 
during the First Five Year Plan some 
State Governments pointed out to the 
Ministry of the overlapping of the 
programme? May I also know why 
the Government took so much time in 
deciding this at the last conference?

Dr. Keskar: It is not correct that it 
was pointed out some time back and 
we have done nothing about the mat­
ter. In fact, work was begun, if the 
hon. Members remember, 2i years 
after the Plan began—I am talking of 
publicity work—and as work progress­
ed it became evident to us that some­
thing parallel was being done by the 
State Governments also. Ever since 
that time we have been trying to see 
that overlapping is avoided as much as 
possible. I think such kind of over­
lapping has been reduced to the mini­
mum now, and I hope soon there 
would be no such overlapping.

Shri Shawkaraiya: Even though the 
post of a Publicity Officer has been 
sanctioned for Mysore, may I know 
why it has not been filled up? May
I also know whether it has come to 
the notice of the Government that 
publicity has not been done properly 
in regard to planning in Mysore 
State?

Dr. Keskar: I do not know to which 
particular Publicity Officer the hon. 
Member is referring.

Mr. Speaker: Mysore.

Dr. Keskar: In Mysore there is not 
one officer but there are two or three 
officers working in various regions of 
Mysore. I am not sure to which par­
ticular officer the hon. Member is 
referring. I f he w ill let me have the 
particulars I w ill look into the matter.

8hrl VUwsnatha Reddy: May I
know whether it is a fact that Plan 
publicity is not felt in the villages 
because the impact of the Plan itself 
hi not felt in Uw villages.

Dr. Keskar: That would be toe
sweeping and generalised a remark.
There is no doubt that consciousness 
of the Plan is not so great in most of 
the villages as we would like it to be. 
It is a tremendous task if you want 
the message to be carried to all the- 
villages. We have thought that, pro­
bably, the best way would be to get 
this done through the National Exten­
sion Service Blocks and the Com­
munity Development Projects. Ways 
and means are being devised to see 
that the Blocks serve as the main 
centres for bringing the Plan to the 
villages.

Shri Dasappa: May I know why the
Government does not choose to make 
use of the touring talkies, which have 
practically extended themselves all 
over the rural areas, for the purpose 
of this publicity?

Dr. Keskar: Any touring cinema, as 
far as exhibition of documentaries is 
concerned, is treated just like any 
other cinema in the State concerned, 
and it has to exhibit a certain number 
of documentaries.

Shri Yajnik: I want to know if any 
amount is set apart for publicity work. 
The hon. Minister said that it was 
difficult for him to say the amount of- 
money that is spent on this. Is bo 
amount allocated every year for this?

Dr. Keskar: There are various types 
of publicity. Whether for a particular 
Stale we have given a certain amount 
of money or we have spent a certain 
amount of money in that State would 
require a little bit of calculation. I 
am prepared to do that if the hon. 
Member tables a separate question.

Shri Nath Pal: Is the hon. Minister 
aware that the new taxation proposals 
have made the nation more conscious 
of the Plan than what our publicity 
has done?

Displaced Persons la Gangakhadar

•1507. Shri K. N. Pandey: W ill the 
Minister of Rehabilitation and Mino­
rity Alfairm be pleased to state:

(a) whether it is a fact that about 
one-third of the Displaced Persons
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settled in Gangakhadar (Meerut) have 
•Iready deserted and the rest a n  
neady to go with whatever belongings 
they have, leaving the place a* it w u ; 
And

(b ) i f  so, the reason* of their do lag 
■o and whether Government are 
taking any steps in the matter?

The Minister of Rehabilitation and 
minority Affairs (8hrl Mehr Chant 
Kfcanna): (a ) Out of 1452 displaced
tamihef settled in Gangakhadar, 1089 
families are still living there. There 
are no indications that these families 
intend to desert from their holdings.

(b) In a scheme like this some 
families are bound to desert. The 
occasional floods in the area and the 
■difficulties of disposing of their main 
produce viz. sugarcane might have 
been additional reason for desertion. 
The State Government gives all pos­
sible assistance to those cultivators 
vho suffer loss through floods. Dis­
placed cultivators are not the only 
cultivators who suffer such losses

As for the disposal of the produce, 
a sugar factory is shortly to be set up 
in Hastinapur Licence to an entre­
preneur has already been granted and 
he has taken steps to procure machi­
nery,

Shri K. N. Paadey: May I  know 
whethei it is a fact that the licence 
■was granted to the person concerned 
«  year back and yet nothing has been 
done in that regard?

Shrl Mehr Chand Khimu: I  do not
think so. I think the licence has been 
very recently granted, but I w ill look 
into the matter.
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Shriastt R ^ n  Chakravartty: The
hon. Minister said that the Govern­
ment gives these refugees all help. 
May 1 know what actually is the help 
that Government has given after these 
difficulties were experienced by theee 
people?

Shrl Mehr Chand Xbaaaa: This is a 
colonisation scheme of the U.P. Gov­
ernment. It is more than seven or 
eight years old. These families have 
been fettled there all this time. When 
the floods come whatever normal help 
can be given to a flood affected area 
is being given to the displaced persons 
there, but we are making no discrimi­
nation between a displaced agricul­
turist (tnd any other agriculturist set­
tled in a colonised colony.

Dr. Sushila Nayar: Are the Govern­
ment aware that there is a heavy in­
cidence of malaria in this area and, if 
so, what steps have the Government 
taken to make a concentrated effort 
to control this disease?

Shrl Mehr Chand Khanna: That does 
not arise out of this question.

Or. Sushila Nayar: It does arise, 
because they can run away because of 
heavy incidence of malaria which dis­
ables them.

Shri Mehr Chand Khanna: I will
pass on the information both to my 
colleague the Health Minister and the 
Government of Uttar Pradesh.

Cottage Match Industry

*1598. Shri Yajnlk: W ill the Minis­
ter of Commerce and Indusry be
pleased to state the number o f match­
boxes manufactured as a result of the 
subsidies given by Government to 
the Cottage Match Industry during 
the last five years?




