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term basis ~ have vaccination, ino-
culation and the like, which is an ela-
borate preparation. As my hon. friend 
is aware, there is no emergency in 
Calcutta, needing segregation and the 
like. 

Shri Narasimhan: Are Government 
aware that in certain areas where ""0 
or three States meet such as the bor-
der of Mysore and 'Madras, cholera 
epidemic is very frequent because of 
'Want of inter-state co-ordination? 

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: Next ques-
tion. 

Teleprinter Factory 

+ 

f Shri Subollh 118D11da: Shri Chandra Slumkar: 
·259. Shri R. C. MajhI: 
I Shri S. C. SamaDta: 
l Shri Khakt Darshan: 

Will the Minister of TraDsport and 
Communications be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the construction of the 
teleprinter factory at Madras has been 
completed; 

(b) if not, when this will be com-
pleted; 

(c) what was the Plan prOV1SIOll 
for the construction of the project; anti. 

(d) how much has been spent a. 
far? 

The Minister of Transport and Com-
mUDications (Dr, P. Subbarayan): (a) 
and (b). Madras Government are ac-
quiring land for the permanent build-
ings for the factory and the construc-
tion work will be taken up as soon as 
the land has been acquired. The fac-
tory is at present located in tem-
porary premises. 

(c) and (d). Total provision for ~ 
project was Rs. 150 lakhs out of which 
Rs. 50.2 lakhs has so far been sanc-
tioned. No expenditure has been in-
curred on construction of buildings so 
far. 

Shri Subodh 1IaDsda: The bon. Min-
ister has just now stated that the fac-
tory is located in temporary buildings. 

May I know whether production has 
already started there? 

Dr. P. Subllarayan: We have ass-
embled about 70 of them. We hope to 
produce with more of idigenous con-
tent shortly. 

Shri Subodh Hauda: The hon. Min-
ister has stated that the Madras Gov-
ernment have started acquiring lands 
for the construction of the factory. 
How long will the Government take 
to acquire these lands and when will 
the construction start? 

Dr. P. S.bllarayan: The Madras 
Government have told us that it will 
be completed shortly, .because they 
themselves promised the land free of 
cost. 

Shri Sadhan Gupta: May I know 
whether the Govei'nment have any 
idea as to when manufacture, as dis-
tinct from assembling, of teleprinter 
will commence? By what time could 
fully indigenous teleprinters be manu-
factured? 

Dr. P. Subbarayan: As I said, we are 
at present only assembling them. We 
hope to manufacture them with in-
digenous articles shortly, but how 
long it wilI take I am not able to 
say. 

Shri Joachim Alva: Almost imme-
diately, say, in the next two or three 
years the factory will go into pro-
duction and produce a large number of 
teleprinters. So, why did the Ministry 
permit the import of SO many tele-
printers for one new line of news ser-
vice when we have an indigenous 
news service, like the PI'I, doing effi-
cient service? Why did the Ministry 
not take note of this? 

Dr. P. Subbarayan: This question 
ought to be addressed to the Minister 
of Information and Broadcasting. 

Shri S. C. Samanta: May I know the 
value or percentage of the machinery 
which is yet to be imported for the 
use of this factory? 

Dr. P. SUbbarayan: We have im-
ported almost all the machinery that 
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is required. We have insalled them in 
the temporary building which has 
been offered to us by the Government 
·of Madras. 

Shri M. R. KrisIUIa: One of the con-
siderations to locate this factory at 
Madras was the fact that the Madras 
Government had assured to give land 
for the factory. How is it that it has 
taken such a long time for acquirlnll 
the land? 

Dr. P. SubbarayaD: The land that 
they gave was not suitable because 
·foundations were hard to lay. So they 
promised to acquire some other land 
:suitable for our purpose. 

Shri TangamaDi: Is it a fact that the 
Madras Government has given a plot 
of land which belongs to the Govern-
ment, namely, the Government Estate 
in Guindy? 

Dr. p. SubbarayaD: That is what I 
said. The land that they offered to 
us was examined and it was found that 
it would not be suitable for the build-
ing that we want to put up. 

IllteruUeuI SeN YMr 

+ 
S Shri Barman: 

"Z". Shri SlIbodh B ..... : 1 Shri R. C. JllaJhI: 
Shrl S. C. SaIIlaJl&a: 

Will the Minister of Foed uti AII'I-
eulture be pleased to state: 

(a) whether all the State. kava 
celebrated 19G1 as an International 
Seed Year; 

(b) if so, how this celebration was 
observed; and 

(c) what are the .chinemea. ., 
this eelebration? 

TIle Minister 01 AcricuH1lre (Dr. 
P. S. Deshm1lkh): (a) to (c). A state-
ment is laid on the Table of the Sabha. 
[Sf!e Appendix I, annexure No. 51]. 

Silri Barman: From the IltatemeDt I 
find that though the target in the case 
of West Bengal was 20Ii it had IIIIbse-
quently been redueed to 100 only and 

that also was not fully utilised. What 
are the reasons for that? 

Dr. p. S. Deshmllkh: The reason in 
most cases is non-availability of land. 
We have sometimes had to revise our 
position and resort to acquisition and 
so on. It takes time. I think it must 
have been with the 'consent of the 
West Bengal Goevr.nment that the 
number was reduced. 

Shri Barman: I find from the state-
ment that the TCM supplied us with 
further equipment but all that equip-
ment was utilised in installing three 
quality co.ntrol stations in Punjab, 
Bihar and Andhra. Ben88l being the 
most deficit State when is the question 
of Bengal going to be considered in 
regard to this vital matter of quality 
control laboratory? 

Dr. p. S. Deshmllkh: I think the pre-
vious question by my hon. friend sup-
plies the answer. Because the seecl 
farms there are not adequate we could 
not utilise this machinery in that State. 
But this is not the end of it. As we 
go on, probably there might be more 
centres. 

Shri SlIbodb llaDsda: From the sta-
tement I find t.ltat the State Govern-
ment have arranged seminars, exhi-
bitions etc. to celebrate the Inter-
national Seed Year. 

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: As the elec-
tions are approaching the voice should 
rather be higher and not lower. Here 
also we want to hear him. 

Sui SlIbodh Rall!llla: From the sta-
tement I lind that the State Govern-
ment have arranged seminars, exhibi-
tions etc. to celebrate this Interna-
tional Seed Year. May I !mow whe-
ther the cultivators and the farml!l'S 
have been associated with these semi-
nars? 

Dr. P. S. DesIua1lkh: All these pro-
grammes are meant for the farmers 
also. Unless they pay attention to it 
we can never say that our scheme has 
been successful. As has been stated i. 
the statement, it has created more 




