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(b) if so, whether it is a fact that 
this monopoly creates difficulty in ex­
port of Indian tea at cheaper rates 
which might increase demand of the 
same in other countries; and 

(c) the measures adopted by Gov­
ernment to expand auctioning and 
booking arrangement for export of 
tea? 

The Minister of Commerce (Shri 
Kanungo): (a) to (c). A statement 
is laid on the Table of the House. 

STATEMENT 

(a) and (b). There is no absolute 
monopoly of tea auctions in Calcutta 
by foreign broking firms. The North 
East Indian tea crop is handled in 
Calcutta largely by seven broking 
firms out of which three are entirely 
Indian and four are predominantly 
non-Indian. The bulk of the sales, 
however, is handled by non_Indian 
broking firms. 

No complaints or allegations have 
come to the notice of Government of 
any artificial rigging up of prices. 
The quantity of tea to be offered at 
the auctions is decided after joint 
consultation among sellers, buyers 
and brokers who are members of the 
Calcutta Tea Traders' Association. 
The price of tea at the auctions is 
settled by open bidding. 

(c) Following the report of the Tea 
Auctions Committee appointed by 
Government in 1954, Government em­
barked on the policy of encoura&in& 
the Calcutta auctions. A ceiUng has 
been fixed for each year on direct 
export of tea for London auctions 
from North East Indian crop. 

Shri Blshwauath Roy: May I knO'lil 
whether the Government has any 
idea about the value of tea exported 
last year through foreign firms? 

Shri Kanungo: We certainly have 
the figure for exports but we do not 
have the figures of the expor.ts for 
particular firms. 

Sbri Bishwanath Roy: May I know 
"whether some Indian firms are pre-

pared to undertake this work of auc­
tioning and booking of tea? 

Shri KanUDgO: A large number of 
Indian firms do it and some of them 
do it in large quantities. 

Shri Bishwauath Roy: What is the 
ratio of export through the Indian 
firms in relation to the quantity ex­
ported by the foreign firms? 

Shri Kanungo: A large bulk-al­
most two-thirds of the crop avail­
able-is auctioned in Calcutta and 
one-third is sent out by consignment. 
In the consignment, Indians also 
take part and send and in the auc­
tions anybody can offer and buy. 
There is no distinction. 

Shri R. Narayanasamy: May I know 
whether only foreign tasters are em­
ployed and if so, what steps are taken 
to take Indian tasters? 

Shri Kanungo: There are quite a 
number of Indian tasters now--{)! 
high calibre. 

MIs. Jessop and Co. Ltd. 

01026. Shri IDdrajit Gupta: Will the 
Minister of Commerce and Industry 
be pleased to state: 

(a) the degree and manner of con­
trol exercised at present by the Central 
Government over the management of 
MIs. Jessop and Co. Ltd.; 

(b) what percentage of share 
capital in this firm is held by Gov­
ernment; and 

(c) whether there is any proposal 
for na tionalisa tion of the firm? 

The Minister of Indlllltry (Shri 
Manubhai Shah): (a) to (c). A 
statement is laid on the Table of the 
House. [See Appendix III, annexure 
No. 69]. 

Shrl Indrajit Gupta: From the 
statement I find that only part (a) of 
the question has been replied to anel 
no reply is given to parts (b) and (c). 

Shri Manubhai Shah: I have tried" 
to make the statement as compre­
hensive as possible. As far as the 
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Government shares in this company 
are concerned, there has been no 
direct shareholding by the Govern­
ment as such. Therefore, we are 
silent on that point. If the Life 
Insurance Corporation is also con­
sidered as a Government corporation, 
then it holds about 20 per cent. of 
the shares. 

Shri Indrajit Gupta: Part (c) of the 
question is whether there is any pro­
posal for nationalisation of the firm. 

Shri Manubhai Shah: As it is al­
ready under the control of the Gov­
ernment and it is going to be for a 
number of years, under the Act as the 
hon. Member knows, that question 
would not arise a t this particular 
juncture. 

Shri Indrajit Gupta: As far as I 
know this control which the Govern­
ment exercises is due to the past his­
tory and financial mismanagement of 
this concern. But in view of the fact 
that this factory does very important 
works almost entirely on Government 
orders such as the supply of rolling 
stock for the railways under the Five 
Year Plan~, would it not be in our 
interest to nationalise the firm and 
take it over? 

Shri Manubhai Shah: For many 
years to come ~he order stipulates 
the company is to be held by us. In 
due course it will be for considera­
tion of the Government. For the pre­
sent, !nat question datos not arise. 

Shri Prabhat Kar: May I know 
whether the Government are aware 
that the shares of Jessops Company 
Ltd. are being purchased by Shri 
Spanti Prasad Jain from the market 
and he is mopping up shares to gain 
controlling interest? What steps do 
the Government propose to take in 
view of the fact that all the articles 
manufactured are for Government 
orders? 

Shri Manubhai Shah: As far as the 
sale of shares is concerned, under the 
Act what we do is to manage the 
company and the corpus vests in the 

Government. As far as the transfer 
is concerned, it is like the purchase 
of a commodity by one party of the 
other. We have no knowledge as to 
who is a particular holder. The hon. 
Member has given the name. It 
is difficult to identify any particular 
purchaser as an individual buying a 
share. 

Shri Basappa: May I know, Sir, 
whether the affairs of this Jessop and 
Company Limited have improved 
considerably due to the management 
by the Government? 

Shri Manubhai Shah: There is no 
doubt on that point; the production 
has increased, so also all the other 
things. 

Shri Kamaluayan Bajaj: There is a 
rumour in the market that Shri 
Mundhra hill! made considerable 
money and he is trying to buy up the 
other investments that he has other_ 
wise lost. Is there any truth in it? 
Has the Government any informa­
tion about it? 

Shri Manubhai Shah: No such in­
formation is available with the Gov­
ernment, but I can assure the House 
that we are going to hold on to this 
company, manage it well and in due 
course we shall consider all the 
aspects of the question. 

Shri Ramauathan Chetttar: May I 
know whether Mr. B. P. Singh Roy 
continues to be the Chairman of the 
Company? 

Shri Manubhai Shah: Yes, he is 
still the Chairman of the Board of 
Control. 

Shri Tridib Kumar! Chaucihuri: Is 
it not a fact that even certain well 
known financial journals remarked 
the fact that Shri Mundhra has again 
entered the market with Rs. 4 crores; 
if so, what guarantee is there that he 
would not be able to corner all the 
shares of this company as the Govern­
ment has no control over the shares? 

Shri Manubhai Shah: Rumours of 
different types would always conti­
nue. We do not have the knowledge 
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of that particular rumour. But I 
can assure the House that whatever 
shares are held by the Government­
by the Life Insurance Corporation­
are remaining intact with us. As far 
as other holdings are concerned, as 
I said, the question will have to be 
considered over a number of years 
because the management entirely 
rests with us. 

Shri Tridib Kumar Chaudhuri: May 
again point out to the Government, 

Sir, that rumours about Shri Mundhra 
and the L.I.C. were there in the 
market and well known financial 
Journals like Capital and others had 
commented that Shri Mundhra was on 
the markp.t. The Government took 
no notice of that. Then we had to 
drop one Minister at the Centre. Why 
does the Government not go into 
these facts? Why do they fight shy 
of it? 

Shri Manubhal Shah: We are fully 
aware of all the facts and what is 
going into the market. As far as 
shares of Jessops are concerned, what 
I would like to tell hon. Members is, 
as far as control and management is 
entirely vesting in Government and 
under the Act it vests uP to a period 
of three years which is renewable for 
a further period of the same time if 
the Government so desires, there is 
enough time for the Government to 
consider all these aspects during the 
course of its management. 

Shri Indrajit Gupta: May I know 
whether four out of the five whole­
time directors of the Board are per­
sons who were fellow directors of 
Mr. Haridas Mundhra? 

Shri Manubhai Shah: No, Sir. 
Firstly, there are nine members on 
the Board. Three of them, to whom 
the hon. Member refers, are the 
British experts who have had a con­
tinuoUs association with this concern 
for a long time. As a matter of fact, 
it was those persons who were help­
ful in bringing all the defects of this 
company while Mr. Mundhra was asso­
ciated with it to the Government's 
notice. So there is no reason lO 

believe that their association is at all 
detrimental to the working of this 
company. 

WRITTEN ANSWERS TO 
QUESTIONS 

PermaneDt Exhibition in New Delhi 

*10U. Shri Pangarkar: Will the 
Minister of Commerce and Industry 
be pleased to refer to the reply given 
to Starred Qu estion No. 642 on the 
4th March, 1960 and state the nature 
of final decision taken regarding the 
proposal to set up a permament exhi­
bition at the site where the "India 
1958" exhibition was held? 

The Deputy Minister of CommercII 
and Industry (Shrl Satlsh Chandra): 
Consultations with the concerned 
Ministries on the proposed Perma­
nent Exhibition have still not been 
concluded. In the meantime, due to 
the impending Indian Industrial Fair 
to be held in 1961 on the Exhibition 
Grounds, the scheme has slowed down. 
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